

Prepared By: *ew*

Verified By: *d*

ITEM	M-DCPS (Supplier Part # / Product ID)	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	EST ANNUAL QTY	UNIT	Buckeye Cleaning Center - Miami		Dora Industries, Inc., d.b.a. Gold Coast Chemical Products		Ecolab, Inc.		Envirox, LLC		Ideal Supply	
					PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.
1		Hand Soap, Liquid, Premixed	4500	1-gal container	No Bid		No Bid		\$12.72	Ecolab Clean & Smooth 15875 4/1gal	No Bid		\$7.76	NCL 3574 Smooth Green
2		Cleaner, Cream	1500	Ctn 12 per container	\$44.40	B. CERTQT	No Bid		\$43.25	Ecolab Lemon Eze 12/32 oz 13094	No Bid		\$19.00	NCL 1725 Soft-N- Creamy 12/1per case
3	20000545	Graffiti Remover	450	Case	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$39.95	Belco #0152300 12 per case Vendor did not provide sample for testing
4	20000652	Hydrogen Peroxide-Based Cleaner/Degreaser	5000	Case	No Bid		\$27.56	OXY QUEST L- 593 4 gal/case FAIL	\$103.44	Ecolab Peroxide Multi- surface Cleaner #100302 1/2.5 gallon (1 oz per gal dilution) FAIL	\$96.00	.8 oz light duty clean FAIL	\$37.50	Belco #3360400 Green Earth FAIL
5		Absorbent Control Strip	100	Case	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$44.00	Diversey #3506761 Zorba

ITEM	M-DCPS (Supplier Part # / Product ID)	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	EST ANNUAL QTY	UNIT	Janeice Products Company, Inc.		National Chemical Laboratories, Inc.		Neeld Paper and Supplies, Inc.		Rex Chemical Corporation		Wexford Labs, Inc.	
					PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.	PRICE PER UNIT	MANUF & MODEL NO.
1		Hand Soap, Liquid, Premixed	4500	1-gal container	No Bid		\$7.49	NCL 3574	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
2		Cleaner, Cream	1500	Ctn 12 per container	No Bid		\$19.00	NCL 1725	No Bid		\$24.00	Rex Cream Cleanser	No Bid	
3	20000545	Graffiti Remover	450	Case	No Bid		No Bid		No bid		No bid		No Bid	
4	20000652	Hydrogen Peroxide-Based Cleaner/Degreaser	5000	Case	No Bid		\$95.36	NCL 4072 PASSED	87.52	Spartan Chem Clean by Peroxy #4820-02 4 2 liter bottles per case FAIL	No Bid		\$62.00	Wexford Lab, Inc 11850227 Proxl concentrate H2O2- Based Hard Surface Cleaner (FAIL)
5		Absorbent Control Strip	100	Case	\$40.50	JPC WWK-100 FAIL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	



Primary



Alternate