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The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Y
053-NN0Og
intercom, Master Clock and PA Sound Systems - Tumkey Instali and Repair b e PRIMARY-
. | JALTERNATE
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
Bid No, 053-NNQS NAME OF BIDDER: NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Intercom, Master Clock and PA Sound Systems - Tumkey Install and Rauland-Borg
Buyer: Suzanne F. Lopez, CPPB American Time NDR Corporation
SAP# EST. PRICE PER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER ADDITIONAL
ITEM |MDCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTY. UNIT - UNIT INFORMATION UNIT INFORMATION UNIT INFORMATION
GROUP | (ITEMS 1 THROUGH 12): FIRM, FIXED PRICE
CTock, sefm TlUsh moUnt, 12 ToUNd, SIVer of grey, Wi Mfg. Name: American Time [ “|mia Name: Amernican Time | [Mfg. Name:
clear glass face, white dial, black numbers, 24VDC, total Mfg. Brand Name: American Time I | fg. Brand Name: American Time | Mfg. Brand Name:
current not to exceed 70ma, 2 wire, impulse reverse 1 —1]
1 | 389-0210 Polarity, 59 minute hourly correction and 12 Rour 1004594| 300 | each §109.95  |Vendor Product# BS5GHFGE04 1 513657  [VendorProduct#: BSSGHFGE04 | NOBID  [[Vendor Product #
correction at 5:00 am/pm. 1 !
Approved Brand: American Time or Equal Approved Mfg. Product #: BSSGHFGE04 : Mfg. Product #: B55GHFGB04 = Mfg. Product #:
Manufacturer Part#: BS5GHGFGE04 Other:. 1 Other: 1 Other
Clock, surface mount, 12" round, silver or grey, with clear Mfg. Name: American Time 1[ Mfg. Name: American Time | Mfg. Name:
glass face, white dial, black numbers, 24VDC, total current Mfg. Brand Name: American Time 1 Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Jl lﬁfg. Brand Name:
not to exceed 70ma, 2 wire, impulse reverse polarity, 59 I |
2 | 389-0086 :’r‘rr“/‘;ﬁ hourly correction and 12 hour correction at 5:00 | 4pn4593| 100 | each $109.95  |Vendor Product # BS4GHFGA404 | $13657  [[Vendor Product#: BS4GHFG404 | NOBID | Vendor Product#
N | [
Approved Brand: American Time or Equal Approved Mfg. Product #: BS4GHFG404 | Mfg. Product #: BS4GHFG404 I Mfg. Product #:
PP q PP
Manufacturer Partt B54GHFG404 Other 1 Other, 1 ]_Other.
) ; Mfg. Name: American Time Mfg. Name: National Time T T Mg, Name: National Time | 1
Clock, semi flush mount, 10" round, metal case, silver or " T NP Y
grey, with clear glass face, white dial, black numbers, with Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Mfg. Brand Name: National Time : Mfg. Brand Name: National Time :
red second hand, 24VAC, total current not to exceed i 1
3 | 380.0911|300ma, 3 wire synchronous, 60t minute hourly comection | o] oog each $139.95 Vendor Product #: G45BHBG 191 §14670  |{vendor Product#: I $14s7p | Vendor Product#: 030-10EX-LL 1
and 12 hour correction at 6:00 am/pm. 1 1
[ H
Approved Brand: National Time or Equal Approved Mfg. Product #: 645BHBG191 Mfg. Product #: 030-10EX-LL [ Mfg. Product #: 030-10EX-LL i
Manufacturer Part#: 030-1DEX-LL Other; Avaitable in black case only Other: ] Other; !
Mfg. Name: American Time I Mfg. Name: American Time i Mfg. Name: W
Clock, surface mount, electric, 14" round, brown or black, N : 1 N . ! N
115V, 80 HZ, red second hand. Mfg. Brand Name: American Time : Mfg. Brand Name: American Time I Mfg. Brand Name:
4 13890554 1004588| 200 each $26.95 [Vendor Product #: ESSNAAV301 | %4945 Vendor Product#: ESBNAARI0T | NOBID  livendor Product #:
Approved Brand: American Time or Equal Approved M du 56 van { I duct# ESBNAAR30T 1
Manufacturer Part#: ESSNAAR301 Replaced with g. Product#: ESBNAAVDT 1 9. Product # £ R 1 Mfg. Product #
ES6NAAVA01 Other. Original Part # discontinued Other: ILOther.
_ N . Mfg. Name: American Time Mfg. Name: a [Mfg, Name:
S;ﬁzh;:?&: ush mounl, 127 Found, 24VAC, 3 wire. Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Mfg. Brand Name: Mfg. Brand Name:
5 389-0913 ) 1004602 75 each $80.95 Vendor Product #. US5BABAS04 NO BID Vendor Product # NO 8ID Vendor Product #:
Approved Brands: Simplex #6310-9239 direct Mfg. Product #: US5BABAS04 Mfg. Product #: Mfg. Product #
replacement. No Substitute. Other: Other: I Other:
) . ) Mfg. Name: American Time Mfg. Name: lIMfg. Name:
‘r?]l;’);:.eseml flush mount, 12" round, 24VDC, 3 wire, Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Mfg. Brand Name: |[Mfg. Brand Name:
6 | 3890311 ) 1004596 | - 75 each $109.95 \Vendor Product # AS5BAJG504 NOBID  [[Vendor Product#: NOBID  |Vendor Producti#
Approved Brands: Simplex #6310-9075 direct Mfg. Product #: AS5BAJG504 Mfg. Product # (IMfg. Product #:
replacement. No Substitute. Other: Other: |LOther.
] Mfg. Name: Sapling T \Wig. Neme: Saping IMfg. Name:
Clock, semi flush mount, 12" round, 24 VAC, 3 wire, synchy Mfg. Brand Name: Sapling 0 Mfg. Brand Name: Sapling H (Mfg. Brand Name:
wire, National Time comrection code. H
7 150 each $139.95 Vendor Product #: SAM-1BS-12R-411 : $144.00 Vendor Product #: SAM-1BS-12R-411 } NO BID Vendor Product #:
Approved Brands: Sapling #SAM-11S-12R-411 direct Mfg. Produtt #: SAM-1BS-12R-411 1 Mfg. Product # SAM-18S-12R-411 | Mfg. Product #:
replacement. No Substitute. Other- | Other: 1 Other-
Mig. Name: Amencan Time™ 1§ | ﬁfg-;- I\l_arFe':—M—iaVVe—sr _____ Mfg. Name:
Rack Mount Master Clock able to provide 4 amps. Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Mfg. Brand Name: Mfg. Brand Name:
8 | 389-0915 1004803 12 each $795.95 Vendor Product # ASQMSTR-00X8E $1,302.00 nVendor Product # NO BID Vendor Product #:
Approved Brands: Midwest MTC 6000 direct replacement. Mfg. Product #: ASQMSTR-00X8E ||Mfg‘ Product #: MTC 6000 Mfg. Product #;
No Substiute. H002944 Rack Mount Kit included [other: Other.
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The Schaol Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Verified by
053-NN09
Intercom, Master Clock and PA Sound Systems - Tumkey [nstall and Repair R ig"é’;ﬁlﬂz
e _ 1
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
Bid No. 053-NN08 NAME OF BIDDER: NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Intercom, Master Clock and PA Sound Systems - Tumkey Install and . Rauland-Borg
Buyer: Suzanne F. Lopez, CPPB American Time NDR Corporation
SAP # EST. PRICE PER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER ADDITIONAL PRICE PER ADDITIONAL
ITEM [[MDCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QTyY. UNIT UNIT INFORMATION UNIT INFORMATION UNIT INFORMATION
Mfg. Name: Mfg. Name: Mfg. Name: Raujand Borg
Clock module, digital, elapsed, secondary, 24VAC. Mfg. Brand Name: Mfg. Brand Name: Mfg. Brand Name: Rauland Borg
9 | 389-0007 1004592 7 each NO BID Vendor Product #: NoBID  [[Vendor Product# $129.60  ||Vendor Product #: 2420
Approved Brands: Rauland Borg #2420 direct , Mfg. Product #: Mfg. Product #: Mfg. Product #: 2420
replacement. No Substitute. Jllrother. Other: Homen
Mfg. Name: American Time*™ Mfg. Name: Mid West Mfg. Name:
Master Time Clock, 6 circuit. Mfg. Brand Name: American Time Mfg. Brand Name: Mfg. Brand Name:
10 12 each $795.95 Vendor Product # ASQMSTR-00X8E $1,158.00 jVendor Product#: NO BID Vendor Product #:
Approved Brands: Midwest MTC 600 direct replacement. Mfg. Product # ASQMSTR-00X8E Mfg. Product #: MTC 600 Mfg. Product #:
No Subsfiiute. Jlother: Other: lotner:
Mfg. Name: Mfg. Name: Mfg. Name: Rauland Bor:
gi:ﬁ;ﬁ”@;ﬁ":i{“,@i%ﬁd&iﬂf' 12 INCH,Gray,Clear i Brand Name] qu§ Brand Name: HMf:. Brand Name: Raiand Borg
11 | 389-0817 ' 1007011 480 | each NOBID | Vendor Product#: NOBID  [Vendor Product#: $120.06  [[Vendor Product # TCCKAN12L
Mfg. Product #: Mfg. Product #: Mfg. Product # TCCKAN12L
Approved Brands: Rauland Borg # TCCKAN12L "6!: Hati HO!E
er er: er:
JMfg. Name: {Mfg. Name: Mid West l[Mfg. Name:
Minute impulse Kit. Mfg. Brand Name: ||Mfg. Brand Name: "Wg Brand Name:
12 12 each NO BID Vendor Product #: $86.00 ||V9ﬂd°f Product #: NO BID ||Vendor Product #:
Approved Brands: Midwest Minute Imptise Kit #340003- Mfg. Product #: “Mfg Product # 940003-01 “Mfg‘ Product #:
01 direct replacement. No Substitute. Other: "Othert "Other.
GROUP Il (ITEMS 13 THROUGH 26): PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT
% DISCOUNT

NAME AND EFFECITVE DATES OF
CATALOG

the current prices list with your bid.

Percentage discount off price list, preprinted or web catalog prices for purchases by schools and departments for clocks and intercom system parts other than those lines listed above, Indicate the discounts for the manufacturer on fine provided. Submit a copy of

13 |BRAND: American Time and Signal 10% American Time Master Catalog 2014 1% American Time Master Catalog 2014

14 {BRAND: Bogen

45 |BRAND: Cincinnati

16 [BRAND: Dukane 28% - 2013 PRICE GUIDE

47 {BRAND: EDCO 10% 2013 PRICE LIST

18 |BRAND: Faraday

19 |BRAND: Lathem

20 [BRAND: Midwest 5% PRICE LIST - APRIL 16, 2014

21 {BRAND: National Time and Signal 10% DEALER CLOCK PRICE 2013 10% 1/1/2013
22 [BRAND: Primex

23 |BRAND: Rapid Print N

24 |BRAND: Rauland Borg 28% 8/19/2013
25 |BRAND: SimplexGrinnell ;

26 |BRAND: Visiplex ‘

** Jtem did not meet specifications
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