Bid # 044-PP03 Milic and Dalry Products

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

Preparsd by!

Raviawad by!

BORDEN DAIRY COMPANY OF FLORIDA

DEAN DAIRY HOLDINGS, LLC DBA MCARTHUR DAIRY, LLC

Item

Condiflon/Description

LOW-FAT MILK - 1%: Fluld milk, low fal, grade A,
bulterfat 1.0% maximum, 8.5% maximum nonfat
sollds conlent, fat conlent shall be 2.5 grams/8
ounces, miik shall be free from added water,
preservallves, neuiralizers or olher foreign
subsiances, have characierislic mild odor, sweet
not sourlaste: off flavors are unaccepiable, 8
fluld ounces. Packaging opilons: pack size 1/2
pint plaslic-coated cardboard carton, plastic
conlalner or 1/2 pint pouch contalner. Approved
Brands: Borden, McArihur, Dean, T.G. Lee, or equal

Esfimated
Quantity

“GROUP1:11/2,

2,614,000

Unlt

1/2 pint

PINT MILK i

Packaging

Clrcle one:

‘CARTON

Manufacturer

/Brand

Borden

Code #/
Vendor
Iltem #

25351

e

Net Ind.| Case

8.0o0z

50

Unlt Price

$0.2536

bBExtended Price
{est gty x unlt

$662,910.40

Packaging
Circle one:

CARTON

Manufacturer

. /Brand

McArthur

Code #/
Vendor’
Item #

Net Ind.

Welght

R

17658

8oz

Case
Count

50

Unit Price

$0.2802

Extended Frlce
(est gty x unlt
price

$732,442.80

FAT-FREE REDUCED SUGAR CHOCOLATE MILK: Fluld
fat free mik, chocolaie fiavored, butterfat less
than 0.5%, non-fal solids content: minlmum 8.5%
non-fat mitk sollds, Includes wholesome chocolate
or cocoa Ingredienis being added for arich
flavor, no high fruclose com syrup, sugar content
not fo exceed 18 grams/8 oz, mik shall be lree
from added water, preservailves, neuiralizers or
other forelgn subsiances, have characierlsic miid
odor, sweet nof sour laste: off flavors are
unaccepiable, 8 fluld ounces. Packaglng optlons:
pack size 1/2 plni plasile-coated cardboard
carfon, plastic contalner or 1/2 pint pouch
contalner. Approved Brands: Borden, McArihur,
Dean, 1.G. Lee or equal .

40,277,867

1/2 pind

CARTON

Borden

25604

8.0oz

50

$0.2525

$10,170,161.42

CARTON

TruMoo

45837

8oz

50

$0.2826

$11,382,525.21

SKIM MILK: Fluld milk, butterfat less than 0.5%, shall
contaln no less than 8.25% non-fat milk solids, fat
conient shall be 0 grams, milk shail be free from
added water, preservalives, neuiralizers or other
forelgn subsiances, have characterisiic mlld odor,
sweel nof sour laste: off flavers are
unaccepiable, 8 fluld ounces. Pack size: 1/2 pini
plastic-coated cardboard carton or plasiic
contalner, Approved Brands: Velda, McArhur,
Dean,1.G. Lee, or equal

25,000

1/2 pint

CARTON

Borden

25352

800z

50

$0.2452

$6,130.00

CARTON

McArthur

17661

8oz

50

$0.2695

$6,737.50

WHOLE MILK: Fresh, Grade A, Pasteurized,
Homogenilzed, Vitamin A & D enrched. Milk shall
be free from added water, preservatives,
neufrallzers or other forelgn substances, have
characterstlc mild odor, sweet not sour jaste: off
flavors are unacceptabile, 8 fluld ounces. Faf shali
be conlalned to 8 grams/8 ounces. Pack size: 1/2
plnt plastic-coaled cardbeard carton, plastic
conlalner. Approved Brands: Borden, McArhur,
Dean, T.G. Lee orequal

75,000

1/2 pint

CARTON

Borden

25349

800z

50

$0.3095

$23,212.50

CARTON

McArthur

17657

Boz

50

$0.2987

$22,402.50

TOW=TART THILK = 27 TTUTT TTHTK, ]UyV TOT, QTOUeE X,
buterfat 2.0% maximum, 8.5% maximum nonfat
sollds contenl, fat conleni shall be 2.5 grams/8
ounces, milk shali be free from added water,
preservalives, neulrallzers or oiher foreign
subsiances, have characierisiic mild odor, sweel
not sour {asle: off flavors are unaccepiable, 8
fluld ounces. Pack slze: 1/2 pint plasiic-coaled
cardboard carion or pldstic conlainer.
Approved Brands: Borden, McArhur, Dean, T.G.

tam oraminl

25,000

1/2 pint

CARTON

Borden

25350

80 oz

50

$0.2671

$4.677.50

CARTON

MecArthur

17656

8oz

50

$0.2829

$7.072.50
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Prapared by;

Roviewsd byl

Bld # 045-PPO3 Milk and Dalry Products BORDEN DAIRY COMPANY OF FLORIDA DEAN DAIRY HOLDINGS, LLC DBA MCARTHUR DAIRY; LLC
Buyer: Vanessd Flores
it Condil /5 ot Estimated Unit Packagling | Manufacturer ?IO:Z#I/ NetInd.| Case Unit Price E(x;setnd'ec:(PJ:'e Packaging {Manufacturer (\:Ic:rj]:#r/ Netind.| Case unit P11 E)de'nded Frlcfte
em ondiilon/Description Quantity i Clrcle one: /Brand endol Welght | Count ay Circle one: | /Brand o Welght | Count nif Price | (est qly x uni
: 3 Item # price i Itemn # price

A : y e v GROUP 2: GALLON MILK o
LOW-FAT MILK, GALLON - 1%: Fluid low fat milk, :
bulerfat 1.0% maximum, milk shall be free from
added water, preservallves, neulralizers or other each 1

g |forelgn substances, have characlerisie mildi odor, | 55 055 | ggjion Borden | 25079 |12800z] 4 | $39957 | $199,785.00 McArhur | 21437 | 1280z | 4 | $400 | $200,000.00
sweel not sour faste: off flavors are f N
unacceplable, pack size 1 gallon contalner. container
Approved Brands: Velda, McArhtr, Dean, T.G. !

Lee, M&B Products or equat

WHOLE MILK, GALLON: Fresh, Grade A,

Pasteurized, Homogenlzed, Vitamin A & D

enriched. Milk shall be free from added water, each 1
preservallves, neuiralizers or olher forelgn

7 subsiances, have characlerslic miid odor, sweet 25,000 gallon Borden 25077 |12B0o0z| 4 $4.6294 $115,735.00 MeArthur 21436 128 0z 4 $4.25 $106,250.00
noft sour taste: off flavors are unacceplable, pack contalner
slze 1 gallon conlainer. Approved Brands: Borden,

McaArthur, Dean, T.G. Lee or equal

e i by e : e GROUP 3: SPECIALTY ITEMS ;!
LOW-FAT CULTURED BUTTERMILK: Fluld product ‘
resutling from the manufaciure of buiter from mikk
or cream, low fal, pastuerlized and homogenized, each 1/2
produc! shall conialn no less than 8.25% non-fal

8 milk solids, nof fo exceed1% fal conlent, grade A 23,182 gallon Borden 16189 | 6400z 9 $2.29 . $53,040.98 McArthur 21446 64 oz 9 $2.15 $49,798.30
pasteurized. Pack slze maximum 1/2 galion contalner
contalner. Approved Brands: Borden, McArhur,

Dean, T.G. Lee, Farmfleld or equal |

LOW-FAT SOUR CREAM: Fal content 3 grams or [ess

per 50 grams of product and 6% or less of total fat,

grade A paslerulzed, thick, smooth, velvely, free each 5
of lumps or graininess, bright white/ligh! cream pound

k4 color, flavor and texture must be characterstic of 4,000 contalner/ Borden $36.800.00 Dean 53396 5lb 4 $4.91 $19.640.00
sour cream. Pack size 5 pound contalner/paill. pall
Approved Brands: Borden, McAdhur, Dean, T.G.

Lee, Light N' Lively or equal

LOW-FAT 1% COTTAGE CHEESE: Low fat 1%

maximum milk fat, notural flavor, uniform slzed each 5

curd pariicles, creamy whlie color. Molsture not . ound .

10 {more than 80% of the finished food. Pack sze 5 10,132 p,r iner/ Borden 25152 51b 2 $11.61 $117.632.52 Dean 12553 5ib 4 $6.64 $67,276.48
pound container/pall. Approved Brands: Borden, container ! .
MeArhur, Daan, T.G. Lee, Dalry Fresh, Light N pall
Lively, Seallest or equal

TOTALGROUPS 1,2&3 PRIMARY VENDOR: $11,392,085.32 ALTERMATE VENDOR: $12,594,145.2%
| //GROUF 4: NON-DAIRY. MILK SUBSTITUTE : ; .
LACTOSE FREE MiLK: Musi meelthe following - )
minimum nulden] values per cup: Calclum 276 mg
- 27.6%; Protein 8 grams; Vilamin A 500 (U-10%; : each 1/2 $1.74 per

11 |Vilamin D 1001U-25%; Magnasium 24 mg-6%; 1,000 galion Lala 1173 3202 12 ) ;:t $3,480.00 64 0z 6 $2.75 $2,750.00
Phosphorus 222 mg-22.2%; Polassium 349 mg-9.7%; container qua
Ribeflavin .44 mg-25.9%; Vitamin 812 1.1 mcg-

18.3%

SOY MILK — PLAIN: Must meet lhe following

rminimum nutden] values per cup: Calclum 276 mg

- 27.6%; Proleln 8 grams; Vitamin A 500 JU-10%; each 1/2 $2.03 per

12 |Vilamin D 100U-25%; Magnesium 24 mg-6%; 500 gallon Stk 3660 320z 12 i ﬂ +$2,030.00 Slik 64 oz 6 $3.10 $1,550.00
Phosphorus 222 mg-22.2%; Pofassium 349 mg-9.7%; : confalner gua
Riboflavin .44 mg-25.9%; Vitamin 812 1.1 mcg- '

18.3% ’
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Bid # 0446-PP03 Milk and Dalry Products -

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

Propared by!

Raviawae by:

=

BORDEN DAIRY COMPANY OF FLORIDA

DEAN DAIRY HOLDINGS, LLC DBA MCARTHUR DAIRY, LLC

Item

Conditlon/Descripfion

Esimated
Quantity

Packaging

Unit Circle one:

ALMOND MILK: Must meet the following minimum
nutrlent values per cup: Calclum 276 mg - 27.6%;
Prolein 8 grams; Vilamin A 500 |U-10%; Vilamin D
1001U-25%; Magneslum 24 mg-6%; Phosphorus 222
mg-22.2%; Polasslum 349 mg-9.7%: Riboflavin .44
mg-25.9%; Vilamin B12 1.1 mcg-18.3%

500

each 1/2
gallon
contalner

RICE MILK: Musl meet the following minimum
nuirent values per cup: Calclum 276 mg - 27.4%;
Proteln B grams; Vilamin A 500 1U-10%; Vitamin D
100IU-25%; Magnesium 24 mg-4%; Phosphorus 222
mg-22.2%; Polasslum 349 mg-9.7%; Riboflavin .44
mg-25.9%; Vilamin B12 1.1 mcg-18.3%

500

each 1/2

gallon
contalner

LACTOSE FREE MILIC Must meet the following
minlmum nuident values per cup: Calclum 276 mg
- 27.6%; Prolein 8 grams; Vlilamin A 500 (U-10%;
Vifamin D 1001U-25%; Magneslum 24 mg-6%;
Phosphorus 222 mg-22.2%; Polasslum 349 mg-9.7%;
RIbofiavin .44 mg-25.9%; Vilamin B12 1.1 mcg-
18.3%

5,000

1/2pint  |PACKAGING
TYPE

Manufacturer
/Brand -

Code #/
Vendor
ltem #

Net Ind.
Welght

Case
Count

Extended Price
Unlt Price | (est gty x unit
price)

NO BID

NO BID

NO 8ID

Packaging
Circle one:

PACKAGING
TYPE

Manufacturer
/Brand

Code #/
Vendor
ltem #

Net ind.
Welght

Case
Count

Untt Price

Extended Price
(est gty x unit
price)

Silk

64 oz

$3.10

$1.,550.00

Rlce Dream

64 oz

$3.10

$1,550.00

Dalry Ease

33613

$0.50

$2,500.00

SOY MILK ~ PLAIN: Musl meef lhe following
minimum nuldent values per cup: Calclum 276 mg
- 27.6%; Proteln 8 grams; Vitamin A 500 IU-10%;
Vitamin D 100IU-25%; Magneslum 24 mg-4%;
[Phosphorus 222 mg-22.2%; Polasslum 349 mg-9.7%;
Riboflavin .44 mg-25.9%; Vilamin 812 1.1 mcg-
18.3%

3,000

1/2pint  |PACKAGING
TYPE

NO BID

PACKAGING
TYPE

Silk

64 0z

$3.10

$9.300.00

ALMOND MILK: Must meet the following minimum
nutdent values per cup: Calelum 276 mg - 27.6%;
Proteln 8 grams; Vilamin A 500 IU-10%; Vitamin D
100[U-25%; Magneslum 24 mg-6%; Phosphorus 222
mg-22.2%; Potasslum 349 mg-9.7%; Riboflavin .44
mg-25.9%; Vilamin B12 1.1 mcg-18.3%

3,000

1/2pint  |PACKAGING
TYPE

NO BID

PACKAGING
TYPE

Silk

44 0z

$3.10

$9,300.00

RICE MILK: Must meet ihe following minimum
nuldent values per cup: Calcium 276 mg - 27.6%;
Proteln 8 grams; Vitamin A 500 IU-10%; Viiamin D
1001U-25%: Magneslum 24 mg-6%; Phosphorus 222
mg-22.2%; Polasslum 349 mg-2.7%:; Riboflavin .44
mg-25.9%; Vilamin 812 1.1 mcg-18.3%

3,000

1/2pint  |PACKAGING
TYPE

NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 4

Poge 3

Vendor did not bid all items
In group.

PACKAGING
TYPE

Rlce Dream

44 oz

$3.10

$9,300.00

PRIMARY VENDOR:

$27,900.00
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