Bid # 072-NN03 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection
Services

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

SECTION I: Regular Sclid Waste Pick-Up. Evaluation Unit is per
cubic yard per pick-up.

ALTERNATE
ECOLOGICAL |GREATWASTEAND| PROGRESSIVE SUNSHINE (ASTE . RS B
PAPER RECYCLING WASTE SOLUTIONS RECYCLING 3 NA EMENT INC. FLORIDA. INC
RECYCLING, INC.| . SERVICES LLC OF FL, INC. SERVICES QFELO’RlDAg":Q T

Hem # Item Description g'f; Unit Evu:'u:.:iun Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit i Price Per Unit

Daily | per cubic Y

1 Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Group 1 - 70 locations. 712 | Cubic| yordper | $ 4.26] $ 552 % 10.76 NG BID 4.15 5.60
Yards pick-up
Daily | per cubic

2* |Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Group 2 - 52 locatiors. 548 | Cubic | yardper | $ 415 $ 552 % 10.65 NO BID 4_1.-1 5 5.88
Yards pick-up ;
Daily | percubic o : .

3 |Regular Sclid Waste Pick-Up: Group 3 - 60 locations. 452 | Cubic | yordper | S 4.85 NC BID 5 10.64 NO BID Qi s : ' 415 616
Yards pick-up
Daily | per cubic |

4  |Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Group 4 - 54 locations. 524 | Cubic | yardper | S 4,85 NOC BID $ 10.64 NO BID S 4.15 6.72
Yards pick-up
Daily | percubic

5 |Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Group 5 - 53 locations. 574 | Cubic | yardper | % 4,95 NO BID 3 10.25 NO BID S 4.15 7.28
Yards pick-up
Daily | per cubic i

6 |Regular Sclid Waste Pick-Up: Group 6 - 56 locations, 678 | Cubic | yardper { $ 4.95 NO BID ) 10.46 NO BID S 4.15 6.72
Yards pick-up !
Daily | percubic

7 |Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Group 7 - 41 locations. 378 | Cubic| yardper | $ 4,95 NO BID % 10.21 NO BID S 415 9.52
Yards pick-up

Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Groups 1 fhraugh 7 ity |, pereEtiz
8 gula Lo R g 3.866| Cubic | yordper | § 4.95 NO BID $ 10.53 NO BID s 415 6.86
Combined, 386 locations. ;

Yards pick-up

*ITEM 2 - IDENTICAL PRICING RECEIVED FROM ECOLOGICAL RECYCLING AND WASTE MANAGEMENT. TIE BREAKER WAS DECIDED BY BOARD POLICY 6320, IDENTICAL PRICES - PRIORITIES FOR AWARD - LETTER J - THE NON-

MINORITY/WOMEN BUSINESS ENTERPRISE VENDOR, WHO BECAUSE OF LOWER PRICES. RECEIVED A LARGER DOLLAR AWARD FOR OTHER ITEMS.

ITEM 8 - IS BEING REJECTED, PRICING FOR ITEMS | THROUGH 7 WILL BE USED INSTEAD.

Prepared W‘M/
Reviewed By:

Ag
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Bid # 072-NNO3 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection

& ALTERNATE
Services
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
| J-‘
SECTION II: Recycling Plck-Up. Evaluation Unit Is per plck-up and rebate R Uil ol GREAT WASTE SUNSHINE WASTE
per lon ol recycled material. Recycled material Includes: Paper, -EG'OEOGICAI'.:FAFER AND PROGRESSIVE WASTE WASTE PRO OF
Cardbeard, Plastlc Metal, Glass and other approved Items. Pricing for ‘IREC CL‘[N&-‘ NG, RECYCLING SOLUTIONS OF FL. ING RECYCLING MANAGEMENT INC. FLORIDA, INC
groups in Sectlen Il Includes 70-95 Gallon Totes with Lids to transler by R AP aReCES i ! SERVICES OF FLORIDA ’ ’
materlal to receplacle. ik it SERVICES LLC
- torm Descripti Est. oni rfrié:é Por "E,Wl'egkly‘." Prlco Por | Weekly | Price Per Weekly | Price Per | Weekly | Price Per | Weekly | FPrice Por | Weekly
el ey Deacriplion Qty m _Unit, | Rate | unn Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate
90 - 95 Gallon Toles, per bid special conditions for recycling Brand: Braihd: Various NO BID Brand: CHo Brand: Otlo Co. Brand: Rehrig Pacific
section, Modael: © 'Modelk Vatloys NO BID Model: 95e Model: msd-95e Model: ROC-95U Modlel: 5NB
Weekly . ol ]
Recycling Pick-Up Group 1: 70 396 | Cubic per:”?;i_‘l’f"d s 191[5 78636 NO BID $ 344| 5 1362245 245|%5 97020|S  240|$ 95040 F 2.48| 5 1.061.28
locations, é cubic yard conlainer per Yards REFR P Sar o T
A  |selecled localions. Includes 216 Weekly tebate. per fon L G T
-Shetldu il g | Average | recycled |:53650) 3 32850  nOBID 50 30 |3 3000|§ 27000|5 40005 360005 1000(F 5000
material to conlainer. Recycled ) B
Tons ; )
Group 1 Evalualion - Per Cuble Yard Per Pick-Up Total Minus Rebate Per Ton 1.5 427.86 $ 136224 $ 70020 $ 590.40 $ 97128
o ool e T AL [oton | ot
98 = ; el : price perfofe | S0 NO BID NOT 50 s $ 2000
carfons are allowed in the 6 cubic yard conlainer please ke ACCEPTED
enter 50 in the space provided.) per pick-up
Optional Additional 1ote for recycling pick-up of
pc |Styrefoam. [If there is no charge for this service or if milk aqdlﬂon?: i N/ NO BID NSOBTlD' O BB BLANK - $ 2000
cartons are allowed in the é cubic yard conlainer please p”ce,p':_uo 2 ACCEPTED NO BID :
enter 30 in the space provided.) perpeRtk
Opfienal Additional Cosl for pick-up of a tole. [Does nol  |additional g . BLANK -
0 |imply pick-up of all fetes. If there s no charge lor this price per pick- |'S  7.00 NO BID 3 25.00 $ 1200 NO BID - $ 2000
service please enler §0 in the space provided.) up NO BID
. " Wec!cly per cublc yard :
Recycling Pick-Up Group 2: 52 288 Cubic or plck-u 5 1.91| S - 550.08 NO BID 5 344 % 99072 % 390 % 112320 5 240|535 6912005 2468(% 77184
locations, 6 cubic yard container per Yards s P
10A |selected locations. Includes 174 Weekly rabidte perion
gallon totes with lids to transfer Average |
midtarialio: container, 8 Recycled of re?‘(-:le;d 5 3650 S 292.00 NO BID 50 50 % 3000 $240 $ 40.00| $ 320.000 % 1000 % 80.00
Tond material -
Group 2 Evaluation - Per Cubic Yard Per Pick-Up Tolal Minus Rebate Per Ton S 258.08 5 990.72 5 883.20 S 37.20 $ 691.84
COptional Additional lole lor recycling pick-up of Milk additional NO BID
108 Cartons. [l there is no charge for this service or il milk price per tole 50 NO BID NOT %0 ) $ 2000
cartons are allowed in the  cubic yard conlainer please per pick-u ACCEPTED
enter 30 in the soace oravider | B
Optional Addilional tote for recycling pick-up of o
10c |Styrofoam. (If there is no charge for this service or it milk oRcient] : NOBID: BLANK -
_ i N price pertote | § 7.00 NO BID NOT NC BID F 20,00
cartons ore allowed in Ihe 6 cubic yord conlainer please |- "oy ACCEPTED NO BID
enter §0 in the snace oravided | Panp P
Optional Additional Cost for pick-up of a lole. [Does nol  |addilional : BLANK -
10D |imply pick-up of all fotes. If there is no charge lor 1his price perpick- | § 7.00 NO BID 3 2500 $ 12.00 NO BID - $ 20.00
service please enler §0 in the space provided.) up NO BID
Weekly P
Recycling Pick-Up Group 3: 60 366 | Cubic |P c“k."i vardl s 181 |5  eev.06 NOBID $ 3445 1.259.04| 5 176|5  64416]S 240|S 878.40|5 248|% 98088
locations, é cubic yard contalner per Yards parpek-up
11A |selected locations. Includes 214 Weekly vebsate e feh
gallon tates with lids o transfer Average .
rateril to cantoinar. 7 Reesitiaet ol rec:yt?ie]d §3650| 5 25550 NO BID 30 50 30 $0 S 4000|S 280.000% 1000|% 7000
Tons materia ‘
Group 3 Evaluation - Per Cublc Yard Per Pick-Up Tolal Minus Rebate Per Ton S 44356 $  1.259.04 3 644.16 $ 598.40 $ 91088
Optional Additional fote for recycling pick-up of Milk dditi |
118 |Cartons. (It there Is no charge for this service or if milk :ri::_\hggl?iote 50 NO BID NSSI]\‘D, %0 S0 $ 2000
carfons are allowed in the é cubic yard conlainer please S . ACCEPTED '
enler 8010 the soace orovided | RERCRHR
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Bid # 072-NN03 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection

§ ALTERNATE
Services i ‘
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
SECTION I: Recycling Plek-Up, Evaluation Unlitls per pick-up and rebate il pride | GREATWASTE SUNSHINE WASTE
per fon of recycled malerlal. Recycled materlal includes: Paper, EG.O];O'GIlCAL“FﬂPER AND PROGRESSIVE WASTE WASTE PRO OF
Cardboard, Plasfic Metal, Glass and other approved llems, Pricing lor " RECYGLING "IN(.:‘- : RECYCLING SOLUTIONS OF EL. INC RECYCLING MANAGEMENT INC, FLORIDA. INC
groups In Seetlon Il Includes 90-95 Gallon Totes with Lids o franster kbt Rtz baecd * c SERVICES QOF FLORIDA ‘ .
materlal lo receptacle. ol g et L £ SERVICES LLC
Al
s Esh, " price Per | Weekly | Price Per Weekly | Price Per| Weekly | Prilce Per | Weekly | Price Per | Weekly
Item # Item Description aty Unit Unit Rote Unit Rate Unit Rale Unit Rate Unit Rate
Optional Addilional tole for recycling pick-up of additional RO NO BID,
11¢ |Styrofoom. (If there i.s no charge for lhis sor‘vic'e or I milk price per fole | § 7.00 NO BID NOT NO BID séngll(D- $ 20.00
cartons are allowed in the 6 cubic yard conlainer please per pick-up ACCEPTED
enler 80 in the soace orovided )
Optional Additional Cost {or pick-up of a fote. (Does not  |additional h 5 BLANK -
11D |imply pick-up ol all toles. !f there is no charge for this price per pick- | 'S ?.DO NO BID 5 25.00 $ 1200 NO BID - $ 20.00
service please enler $0 in the space provided.) up ' NO BID
Weekly ] RN I '
Recycling Pick-Up Group 4: 54 294 | cuble pe;f”ti’;i_‘f’d $ 191 |'s 56154 NO BID 5 3445 101136 § 307|3 0258|s 240|S 7os60| 5 308|$ 90552
locations, é cubic yard conlainer per Yards perp P
12A  |selected localions. Includes 156 Weekly Fe B ;
gallon'foms with lids fo transfer P Average ol recycled 5 35.50 s 219.00 NO BID 50 50 0 0 s 4000|5 24000| 5 1000|% 7000
material fo contalner. Recycled materal ;| :
Tons
Group 4 Evaluation - Per Cubic Yard Per Pick-Up Tolal Minus Rebate Per Ton | S . 34254 510136 3 902.58 5 465.60 $ 835.52
Opfional Additional fote lor recycling pick-up of Milk addltional NO BID.
128 |Cartons. (If there is no charge for this service or if milk price per fofe 50 - NO BID NOT %0 50 § 20.00
cartons are allowed in the 6 cubic yard contalner please per pick-up Wy ACCEPTED
coler 80 in the snare nrovided |
Optional Additional fote for recycling plck-up of R oTe] NO BID.
12c |Styrefoam. (I there is no charge for this service or if milk price per fole | § ‘7.00 NO BID NOT NO BID BLANK - % 2000
cartons are alowed in the é cubic yard container please per pick-up ) ACCEPTED NO BID
enter 30 in the snace nrovided ) P
Opfional Additional Cost for pick-up of a tote. [Does not  |additional ‘ BLANK -
12D |imply pick-up of all fotes. If there is no charge for this price per pick- | §  7.00 NO BID 3 25.00 3 12.00 NO BID - 3 2000
pi 5
service please enler 30 in the space provided.) up NO BID
R 4 ; , Weekly per cubic yard !
ecycling Pick-Up Greup 5: 53 318 Cubic 5 S 191| S 40738 NC BID 5 34413 109392135 242 % 769.56| S 240 S 763200 5 308|% 979.44
. s . - per pick-up
locations, 6 cubic yard container per Yards
13A [selected locaolions. Includes 176 Weekly rebte ek far
gallon totes with lids o franster Average | o .
matarial fo container. 7 Recycled of re::yclield S 3650 § 25550 NO BID $0 50 $ 3000| % 21000 S 4000 S 280.000 § 1000| % 70.00
i materia
Group 5 Evaluation - Per Cubic Yard Per Pick-Up Tolal Minus Rebate Per Ton $ 35188 3§ .093.92 $  559.56 § 48320 F 909.44
Optional Additional tote lor recycling pick-up of Milk additionol NO BID.
138 Cartons. (If thereis no charge for this service 9r it milk price per fofe ) NO BID NOT 50 50 $ 2000
cartons are allowed in the é cublc yard conlainer please er pick-u W ACCEPTED
enier 50 in ihe sooce orovidod | il P
Optional Additional fole for recycling pick-up of addifional NO BID
13¢ [Styrofoam. (if there is no chcrgerfor this service or if milk price parfole | § 7.00 NO BID NOT NO BID BLANK - $ 2000
cartons are allowed in the 6 cubic yard container please |-~ i ACCEPTED NO BID
enler 30 in the snace nrovided | per P! P
Optional Additional Cost for pick-up of @ lofe. (Does not  |additional BLANK -
13D [imply pick-up of all lotes. if there is no charge for his price per pick- | § 7.00 NO BID $ 25.00 $ 1200 NO BID - $ 2000
service please enler 50 In Ihe space provided.) up : NO BID
R i . : Woelfly per cubic yard| : e '
ecycling Pick-Up Group 6: 56 3z Cubic —— 5°1.91| S 59592 NO BID 3 3441 % 1073281 5 347|5 114504 S 240($ 748BO| § 308|3F 94056
locetions, é cubic yard container per Yards perpicevR |
14A [selected locations. Includes 188 Weekly rebicte per fon
gallon 1oles with lids to fransler Averoge XN Y
riaterial to ceniginer. 7 Recycled of roc;;f]lﬁl-d $ 36._50 S 25550 NC BID 50 30 $ 30.00| % 21000| $ 40.00| S 280.00| § 10.00| § 7000
Tons maene i
Group 6 Evaluation - Fer Cubic Yard Per Plck-Up Tolal Minus Rebate Per Ton 5 340.42 $ 1.07328 $ 93504 $ 4éB.BO § 89094

Fr-3738 Rev. (06-78)




Bid # 072-NNO3 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection ; 'éElMA‘RR‘ i ALTERNATE
Services e A T
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
SECTICN 1I: Reeyeling Plek-Up. Evaluation Unitls per plek-up and rebate b GREATWASTE SUNSHINE WASTE
per ton of recycled materlal. Recycled malerlal Includes: Paper, FAP'EE AND PROGRESSIVE WASTE NAGEMENT ING WASTE PRO OF
Cardboard, Plastic Metal, Glass and other approved Items, Pricing for ""ﬁECYCLlNG |NC " RECYCLING SOLUTIONS OF FL, INC RECYCLING MANAGEME . FLORIDA, INC.
groups In Section Il Includes $0-5 Gallen Teles with Lids to transfer A e 4 * SERVICES OF FLORIDA ‘
malerlal lo receplacle. e [ SERVICES LLC
’ Est. Price Per | Weeky | Price Per Weekly | Price Per | Weekly | Price Per | Weekly | Price Per | Weekly
Item # Item Description aty Unit Unit Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate Unit Rate
Optional Additional tote for recycling pick-up of Milk additional NO BID,
148 |Cortens. (If there is no charge fc‘vr this service or if milk price per fote (- T NO BID NOT ' 50 50 $ 20.00
cartons are allowed in the 6 cublc yard container please per pick-up A ACCEPTED
eninr 80in the snace orovided. ) L
Optional Additional tote for recycling pick-up of additional i d NO BID, HLANK
14C Skyrofeam. (If there i's no chcrgc'for this sorvic? or if milk price per fote | &' 7.00 Y NO BID NOT NO BID Ap EID- $ 20.00
cartons are allowed in the 4 cubic yord conlainer please per pick-up A ACCEPTED
enter 50 in the soace nrovided | CIBITETY
Optional Additional Cost for pick-up of a tote. [Does not  |addifional S e sl | BLANK -
14D |imply pick-up of all toles. If there is no charge for 1his price per pick- | $..7.00 NO BID 3 25.00 $ 12.00 NO BID - $ 2000
service please enter $0 in the space provided.) up n i NO BID
A Weekly . o ' ;
Recycling Pick-Up Group 7: 41 216 | Cubic pe’ef“?;i_‘f'd s 1915 41256 NO BID $ 34435  74304| 3 307|%  663.02]5 2405 518405 64| 5 78624
localions, 4 cubic yard conlainer per Yards REr P P )
15A [selecled localions. Includes 128 Weekly relale merton| .
gc\lon_iotes with Ilg’s fo transfer 5 Average of recycled | $.36550| § 18250 NO BID 50 50 50 $0 $ 4000 5 200000 % I1000(3F  50.00
material fo container, Recycled iataiial <F
Tons ) ;
Group 7 Evaluation - Per Cubic Yard Per Pick-Up Total Minus Rebate Per Ton - |'s - 230.06 5 743.04 $ 466312 $ 31840 $ 73624
Cptional Additional tote lor recycling pick-up of Milk additional e t NO BID.
15p |Cartons. (I there is no charge for this service or if milk price per fote 50 NO BID NOT $0 50 $ 20.00
cartons are allowed in the é cubic yard conlainer please per pick-up i ACCEPTED
enter 3010 the snare nrovided 3 &
Optional Additional 1ote for recycling pick-up of addilional 7 NO BID
i i o J K-
15¢ [Styrofeem. (i there is no charge fer his service orif milk | i oot s 700 NO BID NOT NO BID ;Lgr;m § 2000
cartons are allowed in the 6 cubic yard conlainer please per pick-up ; ACCEPTED
enter $0 in the snace orovided )
Cpflional Additional Cosl lor pick-up of a lote. [Does nel  |addifional BLANK -
15D |imply pick-up of all totes. If there is no charge lor this price per pick- | $- 7.00 NO BID 5 25.00 $ 1200 NOC BID - $ 2000
service please enter $0 in the space provided.) up ' NO BID
Weeakly .
Recycling Pick-Up Groups 1 fhrough7 | 2,190 |  Cubic pe’_cu?; ‘t’f’d s 1.91| s 418290 NO BID 5 344|§ 7.53360] 5 291|§ 437290|S 2.40|S 5256005 297| 5 6.504.30
Combined: 384 locations, é cubic yard Yards per pick-up
16A |container per selecled localions. Weekly o
Includes 1,252 gallon toles with lids 1o Average
z X 40.00 1,960.00 L 490
transter material to coniainer. | peeyelss OL:Z?;SEC' 33650 § 1,788.50 NO BID 0 o »nz §840 3 3 $ 1000( 5 470.00
Tons
Groups 1to 7 Evalualion - Per Cubic Yard Per Pick-Up Total Minus Rebate Per Ton $ 2,394.40 §  7.533.40 § 5.533.04 5 3,296.00 $ 6.014.30
Optional Additional fote for recycling pick-up of Milk eddiienal NO BID
16p |Cortons. (i there is r.wo charge fr?r this service ?r if milke price per lote 50 NO BID NOT 50 50 $ 2000
cartons are allowed in the é cubic yard coptainer please per pick-up ACCEPTED
enter 30 in the snaees orovided |
Oplional Additional {ote lor recycling pick-up of Sdlitiarsl NO BID,
16 |Styrofoem. (If there s no chorgeilor this service or if milk price perfole | § 7.00 NO BID NOT NO BID BLANK - $ 2000
carlons are allowed In the 4 cubic yard container please er pick-o ACCEPTED NO BiD
enter $0 in the snace orovided | pere P
Opftional Additional Cosl for pick-up of a tote. [Does not  |addilional BLANK
16D |imply pick-up of all fotes. If there is ne charge for this price per pick- | §  7.00 NO BID 5 2500 $ 1200 NO BID- $ 20.00
sarvice please enter §0 in the space provided.) up

ITEM 9C - IS BEING REJECTED, NO BIDS FROM AWARDED VENDORS WERE RECEIVED.

FM-3738 Rov, (04-78)




Bid # 072-NNO03 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection

i ALTERNATE
Services
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
| ECOLOGICAL  |GREAT WASTE AND|PROGRESSIVE WASTE|  SUNSHINE WASTE T
SECTION lil: Compactors. Evaluation Unit is per pick-up. L BAPER RECYCLING SOLUTIONS CF FL, RECYCLING  |MANAGEMENTINC.| ' —o .\~
'RECYCLING, INC.| SERVICES LLC INC. SERVICES OF FLORIDA e
Item # Item Description Est. Qty| Unit : Price PerUmf Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
perpick-up [-$ - vl 49.99 NO 8ID 3 87.79 NO BID ] 74.70( § 201.60
Regulor Compactor Pick-Up: Groups 1 through 7 : o
17 Combined, 3846 locations. é cubic yard volume. 1 Daily Ey e
Approved brand: Marathon Vert--Pack or Egual. ' ‘Brand: Marathon; Brand: Marathon Brand: Marathon; .
Model: Wide Mouth e Model: Verli-Pak — Model; Vert-l-Pack | 2'Ond:Morathon
perpick-up |$ ‘ S 72.00 NO BID % 1250.00 NO BID $ 99.40| § 268.80
Regular Compactor Pick-Up: Groups 1 through 7 s ! )
18  [Combined, 384 locations. 8 cubic yard volume. 1 Daily . _
Approved brand: Marathon Verl--Pack or Equal. Brand: Marathon;’ Brand: Marathon Brand: Marathon; ;
Model: Verfl-Pac R BI Model: Verti-Pak hsHBIE Model: Verl-1-Pack BfORG e dainel
additional o
19 |Opticnal Solar Powered Unit for eoch compactor. 1 Daily |price per pick- | § 131.00] NO BID 3 25.00 NQ BID BLANK - NO BID 3 25.00
up 2 ;

Iterm 19 to be awarded to the vendor awarded the regular compactor pick-up. Both items work

in comrelation.

FM-3738 Rov, [06-98)




Bid # 072-NN03 Recycling and Solid Waste ALTERNATE
Collection Services
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
" ECOLOGIGAL | GREATWASTE AND| PROGRESSIVE SUNSHINE WASTE
X s ; s ‘ >1C W
e wHikilis, Beluahion L mwe L PAPER: RECYCLING ~|WASTESOLUTIONS| RECYCUNG  [manacementinc.| “IYASTE PO OF
’ RECYCLING, INC.|  SERVICES LLC OF FL, INC. SERVICES OF FLORIDA ’ ’
tem ltem Description Est. Qty Unit P'ri(:é':Ee-r;Un'r{. Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
perdelivery e . gy 00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 593.00| 3 5.04
and pick-up | Ly i )
Asbestos Roll-Off: Groups 1 through 7 Combined, As . ;
20 . | Container e 2
386 locations. 10 cubic yard volume. Needed Brand: Marathon: Brand: Wastequip;
Model: Roll-Off NOBID S ORI Model: RBSD2210
perdelvery 1o . 49800 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 742.00| § 616
and pick-up st vk 1%
Asbestos Roll-Off: Groups 1 through 7 Combined, As ) i
21 . . Container %,
386 locations. 20 cubic yard volume. Needed ‘Brand: Marathon: Brand: Wastequip:
" Model: Roll-Off NO BID NO BID HEEIR Model: RBSD2220
adbics o U 598.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 1,039.00| § 7.28
ond pick-up
Asbestos Roll-Off: Groups 1 through 7 Combined, As .
22 = f Conlainer :
386 locations, 30 cubic yard volume., Needed Brand: Marathon: Brand: Wastequip;
‘Model: Roll-Off NOBID e R Bk Model: RBSD2230
perdelivery | ¢ 660,00 NO BID NO BID NO BID BLANK-NOBID | $ 784.56
y and pick-up )
23 Asbeslos Roll-Off: Groups 1 through 7 Combined, AS Contai
386 locations. 40 cubic yord volume. Needed onfainer - Brand: Marathon: Brand: Wastequip:
- Model: Roll-Off NGLBID HCRIR HQBID Model: RBSD2240

*Vendor incorrectly
submifted pricing
foriterns 20 - 22,

FM-3738 Rov. [04-98)




Bid # 072-NNO3 Recycling and Solid Waste Collection
Services

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

SECTION V: Roll-Off Pick-Ups. Evaluation Unit is per delivery
and pick-up. Pricing for groups in Seclion V includes a 20 or
30 cubic yard roll-off as listed. Evaluation will be based on
price per ton.

L PRIMARY |

ALTERNATE

ECOLOGICAL |GREAT WASTE AND| 'PROGRESSIVE. ||  SUNSHINE WASTE R
PAPER RECYCLING  |WASTE SOLUTIONS" | RECYCLING |MANAGEMENT INC. FLORIDA. ING
RECYCLING, INC.|  SERVICES LLC | OFFLANC. .|  SERVICES OF FLORIDA B

tem # Iltem Description Est. Qty Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit ﬁrice‘ Per !Jnrl ~ | Price Per Unit Price Per Unit Price Per Unit
24 |RoICHf Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 1-70 10 | Container | Pe delivery $ 279.00| s 275.00| 5, 122633 NO BID $ 357.00| § 364.00
locations. 20 cubic yard. and pick-up RO i ] .
TN i s i Sl 1| Container | Pereeivery o 379.00| $ 375.00|'3" 270,41 NO BID 3 f219.00( $ 476.00
locations, 30 cubic yard. and pick-up ot St
Total Group 1 (20 and 30 cubic yard) % 658.00| 5 650.00 sﬁ_‘ : ‘49'5.74 NO BID 3 776.00| % 840.00
gy, ||RolbitDelivenans Flckup: Groupa -2 10 | Container | Perdelivery 279.00| $ 275.00]'$ 22245 NOBID $ 357.00( 3 392.00
locations. 20 cubic yard. and pick-up y i
g7 |Rol-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 2- 52 1 Container | Perdelivery 3 379.00| $ 375.00{ $ 26578 NO BID $ 419.00( $ 504,00
locations, 30 cubic yard. and pick-up _ !
Total Group 2 (20 and 30 cubic yard) 3 658.00] § 65000 '$ '488.23 NO BID $ 776.00| 896.00
28 Rotl-C?ﬁ‘ Delivery gnd Pick-Up: Group 3 - 60 10 Container | P dghvc—:ry s 279.00 NO BID 5 234.99 NO BID $ 357.00| $ 392.00
locations, 20 cubic yard. and pick-up ;
29 Roﬂ-C?ff Delivery c.md Pick-Up: Group 3 - 40 1 Coniginer per d?llvery 5 279.00 NO BID .5' 27970 NO BID $ 419.00| $ 504.00
locations, 30 cubic yard. and pick-up
Total Group 3 (20 and 30 cubic yard) 5 558.00 NQ BID % 514.69 NO BID $ 776.00| $ 8%96.00
30 |ROIHOff Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 4 - 54 10 | Container | Perdelivery | ¢ 279.00 NO BID ES 223.30 NO BID $ 357.00| § 420.00
locations, 20 cubic yord. and pick-up | :
37 |ReI-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 4 - 54 1| Container | PErdelivery | ¢ 379.00 NO BID g 265.80 NO BID 3 419.00| 3 532.00
locations, 30 cubic yard. and pick-up : :
Total Group 4 (20 and 30 cubic yard) s 658.00 NC BID S 490.10 NO BID $ 77600| % $52.00
a2 [Pol-CiDeivery-ond Pick-Up: Group 5~ 53 10 | Container | Perdelivery | ¢ 279.00 NO BID s 222,14 NO BID $ 357.00| $ 420.00
locations, 20 cubic yard. and pick-up !
33 [Rel-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 5 - 53 1 Container | Perdelivery | 379.00 NO BID 245.41 NO BID 5 419.00] $ 532.00
locations, 30 cubic yard, and pick-up
Total Group 5 (20 and 30 cubic yard) S 658.00 NQ BID s 487.55 NO BID 3 776.00| % 952.00
|-Of ive ick-Up: - 5 i
34 Rol O f Delivery gnd Pick-Up: Group 6 - 56 15 Container rer dghvery s 279.00 NO EID 5 224.00 NO BID $ 357.00] § 420.00
locations, 20 cubic yard. and pick-up d
Roll-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 6 - 56 i per delivery
35 : A s .50 - i
locations, 30 cubic yard. 1 Container end plek-up S 379.00 NO BID 5 267.5 NO BID $ 419.00| § 532.00
Total Group 4 (20 and 30 cubic yard) $ 658.00 NO BID S 491.50 NO BID $ 776.00( % 952.00
Roll-Cff Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 7 - 41 3 per delivery
36
locations, 20 cubic yard. 15 Container — S 279.00 NO BID .5 217.25 NO BID $ 357.00( % 448.00
Roll-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Group 7 - 41 ’ per delivery
37
locations, 30 cubic yard. 1 Container ol pick-up 5 379.00 NO BID S 259.50 NC BID $ 412.00( $ 560.00
Total Group 7 (20 and 30 cubic yard) S 458,00 NO BID s 476.75 NC BID $ 776.00| $ 1.008.00
Roll-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Groups 1 through 7 ¢ per delivery
38
Combined, 386 locations, 20 cubic yard. 80 Conlainer and pick-up S 27¢9.00 NO BID s 224.31 NO BID $ 357.00| § 420.00
Roll-Off Delivery and Pick-Up: Groups 1 through 7 ; per delivery
39
Combined, 386 locations, 30 cubic yard. 7 Conlainer and pick-up S 379.00 NO BID s 247.89 NO BID 3 419.00| $ 532.00
Total Groups 1 through 7 (20 and 30 cubic yard) S 658.00 NO BID $ 492.20 NO BID 3 77600 % 952.00

ITEMS 38 AND 39 - ARE BEING REJECTED, PRICING FOR ITEMS 24 THROUGH 37 WILL BE USED INSTEAD,

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




