The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida 8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNO5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

‘ DABOTER dba SMITH g-{soﬁ:ﬁ
ITEM | DCPS# [DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFPIND, PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER IEPHIMER;
QTYS | UNIT 1 sUPPLY ilTause
'
|IGRCUP ! Itoms 1 and 2 are to be awarded on n total
low bld basis, Vandor must bid all ltems In this Group, LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE :
W : r X MFGRIBRA
o - MFGRIBRAND > MFGRDRAND A ND NAME &|
S e Y it o ssororaes | e ot o s M e B
: i
1 Construction Paper: 12" x 10", 25 plg per case ! bio NOT SUBMIT ADD
1 NOR REVISED "B"
Paron Tru-Roy" Sulphite BEST AND FINAL | DIDNOT MEET SPECS.
.
Calor Color#  Brand ID# !
- e TTOr Y o
BID ON APP'D BID ON APP'D BRAND I APP'D APPD
2000499||Black 575C 103061 275 Crao 547.04|  513,156.00 54623 $12,713.25|oRAND AND COLOR|  $46.25| 1271875 mvOcOLOR¥SAS , 847.00( 12925000 MPRO || sssos|  sisi4150) APPD
5 AS INDICATED INDICATED 1 i 4 il
BID ON APPD DD ON APF'D BRAND + ‘:\I;P‘D" “;\‘;P.E‘.“
2000458 Sky Blun 215¢ 103048 220 Coan 54267 30,387.40 541,23 £9,070,60|RAND AND COLOR|  $41.25|  $0,075.00 ANDCOLOR WS AS | $41.90 so21a00| (FRB | s4sai|  stopo4z0f APRD
#'5 AS INDICATED INDICATED . £ i
BID ON APP'D nID ON APP'D DRAND | et Ly
2000597 B 3356 103054 275 Cone 547.07|  S12071.75 145.49 $12,509,75 |BRAND AND COLOR|  $45,50|  512,512.50 aMOcoLonweAs | $46.05|  s1zesars| APPD | gsaze|  s1402075) APPD
15 AS INDICATED INDICATED | ERAND D
BID ON APF'D B0 ON APP'D DRAND | jretniy by
2000771 (Cark Brown 505C 103056 220 Cage 552.24 511,482.80 550,46 511,105.60 [BRAND AND COLOR|  $50.50|  $11,110.00 ANDCOLOR #5 AS , 551,28 §11.275.00 (oo $60.12 $13,226.40 BIAND
5 AS INDICATED INDICATED 1 2
3 BID OGN APP'D AI0 ON APP'0 DRAND i WL LY
2000456]|Slnle 568C 103060 55 Cnae 54663 5256465 544.09 52,474.45|oranD anD coton|  545.00|  s2.475.00 ANDCOLOR #GAG | $45.75 sas1625| aeD | ssaer|  sassies| APPO
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED . el Wi
BID ON APP'D BIO ON APP'0 BRAND | ot kel
2000583 Turquolne ssc 103039 165 Cano 35026 $8,262,90 548,49 £8,000,86 | BRAND AMD cOLOR| 548,50  $8,002,50 ANDCOLOR #5AS | $49.35 ss.14275| ATE || ss7.a4 s9.54360| APPD
G AS INDICATED INDICATED ¥ . DRANL
: BID ON APP'D BIO ON APP'D BRAND | sl I
2000418 /@rlliant Lime 10sc 103425 220 Cose 552.24|  %11,492.80 550,60 $11,132.00|oRAND AMD COLOR|  550.62  §11,136.40 ANDCOLOR #3AS ,  $61.25 st127e00] APRD l se0.qz|  s1azzedo| APPD
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED 1 il ity
BIC ON APP'D BID ON APP'D BRAND ¢ el WIE LY
2000601 [[Festiva Grean 75C 103038 275 Case 35366  $14,756.50 $51,74 $14,228,50|nraND AND cOLOR]  §51.75[ 51423125 ampocotoricas | 85270 st44o250] PR || sei7s|  sicesras| APPO
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED ' SRANE  DRANG:.
. BIC ON APP'D 0ID ON APP'D BRAND | b g
2000457||Orange asc 103034 215 Caso $50.39|  $14,671.25 551,48 $14,157.00(8RAND AND COLOR|  %51.50]  514.162.50 ANDCOLOR WS AS | 35235  314396.25 AP I se1.38|  s1c.882.28] ATO
I'S AS INDICATED INDICATED | BRAND PRAND,
DID ON APP'D BI0 ON APP'D BRAND | i st
2000501 Ughl Red 13s8C 102043 220 Cnne 545,79 $10.073.80 544,24 $9,732.80|DRAND AND COLOR,| 544,25 $9,735.00 AND COLOR #'5 AS o 344,05 58,889,00 APP'D 36269 $11.591.00 APRD
'5 AS INDICATED INDICATED | BRAND BRAND,.
BID ON APF'D BID ON APP'D BRAND * it kol
2000594 Fastive Red 83sC 103442 330 Cano 550,85  516.780.50 349,24 $16.249,20|BRAND AND COLOR|  $49.25|  516,252.50 aNDcoLOR #sAs | 540.95)  steamasol PP | ssssa2|  s19911.80| APO
W5 AS INDICATED INDICATED ! REAND BRAD.
BID ON APP'D BID ON APP'D BRAND | ity el
2000500 Vialal 11sc 103041 165 Case 550,54 $8,339.10 848,73 $8.040.45BRAND AND COLOR|  548.75| 58,0475 ANDCOLOR #'SAS | 4965 s8,10225) P | 55818 $9.506.40| AP0
'S AS INDIGATED INDICATED \ RRANO ORALE,
0ID ON APF'D DID ON APP'D DRAND | g oty
2000794 White 535C 103050 330 Cane 542.67|  514,081.10 341,24 $12,009.20{DRAND AND COLOR|  $41.25|  513.812.50 ANDCOLOR #'5 A5« 54180  s13,827.00] PO | 54041 51820600 APPO
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED 1 BAAND BRAND.
0ID ON APF'D BID ON APP'D DRAND * of!Br W
2000596 Light Yellow 175¢ 103046 220 Caao 544,65 £0.023.00 242,99 $9.457.80|DRAND AND COLOR|  $42.00|  $9,460,00 aMDcoLOR wsAs | 54385 sosaz00] PO | ss138  s11.00300 APPO
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED : QRAND .Eﬁl\N.D‘
| BID ON APP'D BID ON APP'D BRAND | st b
20004 56| Shocking Pink 155C 103045 110 Cnae 552,81 £5,930.10 351,08 35,717.80[0RAND AND GoLoR| 55200 $5,720.00 AND COLOR Wi Ag | §52.95 ss.a24.80] PO | 56204 s36,824.40| AP0
'S AG INDICATED INDICATED i bl aRARD
DID OM APP'D RID OM APP'D DRAND | s b5
2000643 Gold 48sC 102998 165 Case 54831 $7,071.15 346,48 $7669.20|aRAND AND colon]  S46.50|  87,672.50 ANDCOLOR 5 AD +  §47.45 s7.02025| PO || gs5se|  saur2as| APPD
L '3 AS INDICATED. INDICATED I BRANG BRAND




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida 8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNC5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

_ i T TR
ITEM | DCPS# |[DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFP IND. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER
QTYS || UNIT : SUPPLY
+
.
2 Construction Papar: 18" x 24", 15 pkg per casa 1
b
Pacon Tru-Ray' Sulphite I
Color Calor % Brand 10 # !
BIDONAPFD [ ID ON APP'D URAND | ety APPD
2000325|[Binck 575C 102003 110 Cans 361.27 56,739,70 559,08 55,450,80 DRAND AND COLOR]  $50.10|  56,501,00 ANDCOLORWZAS | $20.10 sz21t00 JEOC | $70.60 $7.763.00| 200
S AS INDICATED INDICATED o
: - ey a
- BID ON APFD o BID O APPD DRAND | . ity . st
2000395/ Sky Blun 215 103080 55 Case §55.05 $3,077.25 552.83 $2,960,65 BRAND AND coLoR|  $53.85 $2,061,75| ANCCOLORW'SAS . 51835 s1009.25| Tooe || #6438 sasdo00 SRR
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED ] il AN
) BID ON APPD DIDON ARPID BRAND | APPD APPD
2000648 Blis 138 103086 55 Cose 559.42 $3,268.10 557.28 $3,150.40 |BRAND AND COLOR|  $57.30|  33,151.50 AND COLOR 'S AS $19.50 s107280] S0 | 568,45 sazeats| ST
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED ! ARy Py
BID ON APPD BID ON APF'D DRAND | ety ety
2000646 Dnrk Brown 508C 103088 28 Cnee 566.57 $1.863.96 564.04 $1,793,12 |BRAND AND COLOR|  564.05|  $1,793.40 AND COLOR #5AS | 521.80 se1040 Jon0 | s7ss0 s2.144.00) [PRO
5 AS INDICATED INDICATED by b
: : ot B Wi
IO ON APPD BID ON APP'D DAAND | g sl
2000714 Gray 5556 103091 28 Cone 35712 $1,569.36 555,04 51.541.12|oRAND AND coLor|  555.05]  $1.541.40 AND COLOR#5AG » 318,70 ss23.00) oo | sesa $1040.44| JEEE
5 AS INDICATED INDICATED I s S R
BI0 ON APF D BID ON APP'D BRAND * provil oo
2000652| Tuirqucke 8s5C 103071 28 Coae 363,70 11,782.60 . 56133 $1,717.24|eranD AND cotor| 36135  $1,717.80 ANDCOLOR 5 A6 | 520,85 583,80 o0e | 87329 $2052.42| ot
1S AG INDICATED INDICATED £ il -
0ID ON APF'D 0ID ON APP'D DRAND & oy AP
2000420| Brlilant Limn 105€ 103427 28 Con 367.08 $1,678,24 564.03 51,800,64|0RAND AND CaLOR| 564,65  $1.810.20 ANDCOLOR#GAS | $21.95 se1a60) SPR0 | 8778 s2,161.04) JPED
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED ; s LA
BID ON APP'D D ON APF'O BRAND | s e
2000363 Festive Green 78C 103070 55 Case 366,06 $3,633,30 163,59 £3,497.45|oranD aND coLor| 36350  53.488.00 ANOCOLOR WG AS + 52165 stas07s) APRR 1 s7a.01 54,180.56 ;;:N%
#'S AS INDICATED INDICATED ] AL e ™
ID ON APPD 0D ON APP'O DRAND | N APEE
2000364 Qrnnga asc 103006 55 Case 567.50 $3,716.80 365,00 $3.570,40 | DRAND AND COLOR| 305,10 $3,500.50 AND COLOR K'S AS 1 522,18 51,218,250 BRAND . 5427735 BRAND
'S AS INDICATED INDICATED : 3 hiilpacy
T : } e St
sl . , BID ON APPD nID ON APPDIER.’\ND 3 APPD APPD
Ink 14sC 103076 55 Caso 559.02 13,200.10 857.58 33,166.90|pRAND AND COLOR|  §57.60|  $3,108.00 ANDCOLORNG AS | §10.60 sto7a.00] (RO | 56a.84 s378620) RO
I'S AS INDICATED INDICATED i h Pyl
BID ON APFD "OI0 ON APP'O BRAND | e ABRE
2000222|Festive Red sasc 103433 28 Cane 363,03 31,781,604 361,33 31.717.24|orAND AND cOLOR|  561.35|  $1.717.80 ANDCOLOR 'S AS *  $21,10 ssoo.n0| APR0 I s73.20 s205212| JPRD
I'S A5 INDICATED INDICATED | pihh P
BIC ON APPO BIO ON APF'D DRAND | Ty ity
2000023 [ Violet 118¢ 103073 28 Caso 562,87 $1,780.06 161,48 $1,721.44|nRAND AND color| 56150  51.722.00 ancolonssas | 22000 sseszo| GFPRD || sTaas|  saesnza| APRD
'S AD INDICATED INDICATCD 1 PV N AL
- : iz R
- - BID ON APPD - BI0 ON APPD BRAND | i ey
2000527 |While 535C 103090 165 Caao 856,78 $9,200.70 $53.84 38,082.60|BRAND AND COLOR|  552.85|  $8,885.25 ANDCOLOR #'SAS | $18.30 s3.01950| [0l | se4.18  sioseszol [EOE
'S AS INDIGATED INDICATED . ) i
DID ON APF'D DID ON APP'D 0RAND | i) ol
2000650 Light Yellow 178G 102078 55 Caso 159,65 $3,280.75 57,44 3,150,20| BRAND AND COLOR|  $57.45|  $2,150.75 ANDCOLOR 'S AS ' §19.52 $1,073.60 ”::D $68,64 $3,776.20 T’D
N5 AL INDICATED INDICATED I BEAND BEAND
TQTAL 1218,089.76 3211,06485 3211,128.50 3103,970.25 §251,662,54
GROUP [I: Items 3 and 4 are lo be awarded on a total
low bld basls, Vandor must bid all items In this Group.
Constructlon Paper shall e {70 1b basia weight minus 5%
tolerance, (500 @ 24" ¥ 36°), 100% sulphile, 50% racycled content,
MIN. CRDER OF 50 CASES OF ALL
COLORS/SIZESATEMS 3 & 4 FULL CASE
— e - o e
Construct] 1 18" % 24" 4 TID ON APP'D DRAND APPD
3 2000727|[7 " rERen Rapeiiitom Eolor nesgnmeal 124 165 Cano $64.20|  $10,593.00 $61.79 $10,195.35 g’,?,\gﬁ':"f" B 61.00 s10,467.00] ANpeoLonwoas | scaos| 51040125 om0 || ssoas|  stazeeo| emmo
INDICATED [ LA P AND Bas#
. il 804621




The School Beard of Miami-Dade County, Florida 8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNOS5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

o e ——— e e St g
H OABOTER dbn SMITH
ITEM || DCPS# |IDESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFP IND. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER
QTYS UNIT . suPPLY
S o L —
y BID ON
" 18" 5 5 8D ON APPR'D SIC DN APRL BAAND, | APPD .
4 2000707{|Construction Papar. custem color sssoriment, 12°x 18°, || 275 Case 15008 £13,983.75 $48.99 513472250 08 F) 548,00 31347600 ANDCOLORFSAS o 35000|  $13,750.00| bRAND | 363.64|  517.501.00| eRanD
INDICATED I m AND AND G&EN
. COLOR IS, BD4514
Custom Color Assortmant !
Flve (5] Sheets of each color as follows |
Pacon Paacock” Sulphila Assortad 1
Color 1
Red 1
Black !
t
Orange .
Brown i
Plnk ]
Blue !
T
Shy Blue .
H
T
Hollday Grean i
Yellow i
Brlgh White |
PR PR R ——
TOTAL $24,576,75 323,667 60 523,672,00 $24,153,25 530,757,10
dég’ qu I E-Homu Eilﬂ;nu’gih 11 are Io’?:ﬁrnimrg;di onal
total low bid basls. Thase items may be mixed In any
icolor comblnation for minlmum erder requirament,
[Vendor must bld all terns In this Group,
Leane -
IArt Paper shall be In 50 1h Rolls 30" vade ¥ 1000 lang {50 Ik basis
lweight minus 5% lolerenca, (500 @ 24" x 30"
o i i e e i ; i e b o —
5 2000751{|Art Paper, Brite Groen. 220 Roll | 544.87 59,892,40 R 543,39 59,545,800 ONAPPRODRAND - 543,60 $0,570,00 |APPRD $51,75|  $11.305.00| APPD
: i
T o - A
6 2000525{|Art Papar, Whita, 220 Roll | &33.94 §7.406.80 e 13255 57.161.00&“ APPRDBRANO | £3335 $7,357,00 £39,06 $8,593,20| APPD
" " BIOUN
7 2000785(|Art Papar, Aqua, 220 Rolt II 41,44 $0.116.80 BIDONAPRRG 40,06 58,011,000 ONAPPROBRAND 1 54070 6,954.00 54768  310,401.80| ArPD
ARAND
8 2000663(|Art Paper, Black. 220 Roll ! 534,04 57,664.80 e hRD $32.59 57.309.80] 1 0" APPROBRAND | 534,25 $7.535.00 54000 sa.82200 SO
- - m oo
9 2000651{|Art Papar, Canary. 220 Relt | 53880 $8,778.00 g',?,\:’;ff"" 53845 8,450.00) EE ONARPEDBANG: | snpias 36,613.00 L‘L $45.82|  $10,10240| apPD
y AEAND
} - -
10 2000528{|Ant Papar, Flome . 220 Rol | 348.84| 51074480 e 342,85 s0,440.00(21) ON APPROBRAND | g4p00 | 31050000 [ s5621|  512,306.20 :'fFFL’“
i, BID DN
11 2000517 ||Art Papar, Orange. 165 Roll : 14409 5742335 o 540,39 30.604.36(7'y ONAPPREBAAND | 54 25 $7.301.25 55100 38,547.00) APPD
i B ARAND
I
TOTAL [ 561,087.95 J $57,479,95 150,870,25 $70,307.60 | [




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida 8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNO5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

i . DABOTER dba SMITH TNON-RESPONSIVE]
ITEM | DCPS# |DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFP IND. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER MMERC|AL AR
QTYs | UNIT ; A j
| ]
GROUPIV; Items 12 and 13 ara ta be awarded on a 1 |
total low bid basis, i i
T - — —
| e AREIMEE 4 IAMERICAN PAPER it
12 2000703 ||Manila Drawing Paper shall be 18" X 24", {50 Ib, 220 Cone | $19,79 5$4,353.80 ng'ELLErnn'EARTI 313,73 $3,020.60||r510M 1] %1500 $3,300.00 110 $0.00 M0 i
| B0 ] Fenafc. 1173+ 2740 (EaQuAL)
T l PACON
13 2000775 ':";”““ Orawing Papaty samis o Hem #12:axcapt 127X 1,100 Cane : 52023 532,153,00 :Sgi:"ﬁ"“""‘r"“ml 326,16 s20,776.00|7 % ONAPPROPRAND | 55672 | 520,302,00 |warrareau 50.00{14m nin
o ALY
_..———‘I — L =
TOTAL [ 536,506.80 1 £31,796.60 $32,692,00 50,00
GROUP V: Itoms 14 through 16 nre to be owarded on a r
total low bld basis. Vendor must bld a|l itams In this i E
Greup, i v
T I
Orawing Paper shall bo Whits, Blenched Sulphile, (80 1h, : .
basls welght minus 5% lolerance, (500 @ 24" X 36™). ! !
; H
1 ' GROUP V CAN BE INCLUDED IN- NS= AS
| | MIN. ORDER. FULL CASES, SHOWN
— - : v 2 * HiD ON
14 2000731|White Drawing Paper, 24* X 26", 83 Case | 545.20 $3,758.24 Z&ﬁ;‘ﬁf?ﬂ” I s4660 $3.875.27 E‘ﬁ' PRAFFRAPRANG: | s20m0 52,141,40 |APPRD 520,02 52,4B3.36|PACON A/G
i H oRAND & 1 ’
v TREAMET W . | i, SAS
15 2000498{[While Drawing Paper, 18" X 24°. 385 Gase | 82221 38.550.85 ROSELLEWOR | $23.25 B85, 28 e, | 824.50 5243250 [T szmes| 511 ,045.65| TEANIEAY
001024 G 1ALy u, . . : v
i 1[ APRRD ALS,
ROSELLEWOP 51D ON APPR'D BRAND ! ol oN
16 2000770{White Drawing Paper, 12" X 187, 1.100 Cnse | 53032 536,652.00 e, | 33468 538,115,000 | $11.80| 51298000 [apPRD 341,46 $45606,00 |PACON A/S
20k I : BRAND & #
TOTAL $48,961,00 ! ssoansz[ : 324,563.90 $69,135.01
|l e AR R T - T
GROUP VI; Iterns 17 through 24 are (o bo awarded on . '
o tolal low bid basis, 1 |
Ralirond Board Paper shall ba 6 plv_ colornd bolh aldes, ! !
22" X 28%,
1 ) _
ROSELLE | BID ON APPR'D BRAND HIFeN NGTE: |
17 2000469|Raliroad Bosrd, Black, 110 || Packages | 52147 $2,061.70 320,86 s2ao00f 00t tE 520,89 52.297.90( ' | 52508 52,755.50|APPR'O $29.36 $0,229.60 |Plrssics
I .1 i i BRAND & ¥ PACON AJS)
iR . i . BID ON
18 2000407||Rallrond Board, Azure Blua. 55 || Packnges | 521,47 $1.180.05 20,86 s730foe ke ] 32089 $1,145,95(0'% ONAPPRD BRAND 1 595,05 $1.377.75|aPPRD $20.36 $1.614.80 |PACON AT
0 ) . ' BRAND & I
3 | ; I
19 2000458\ Rallrond Board, Buff, 110 || Pagkages | s21.47 $2,361.70 $20.80 $2,204,60) SOSELLE + 52089 52,297,90{0'0 ON APPRD ORAND NOBID  ||DISCON|MO BID
RREOAEQUAL) I L I
ROSCLLE 1 BID ON APPR'D DRAND BIG ON
20 2000642{|Rallrond Boord Kelly Greon. 55 || Packages | 521,47 51,180.85 20,86 LIRLAL (ot tiPON 1 52008 51,1485/ | 52505 $1.377.75|apPR'D $20.06 5161480 |PAcoN w15
Al
ROSELLE . BID ON APPR'O BRAND : e
21 2000599 Raliroad Board, Red. 110 || Pockages | 52147 $2,361.70 $20.80 sz204 00000 Suay | $2009 52.297.90(p 5 ONAPPROBRAND 1 525,05 $2,765.50|APPR'D 520,00 12,220.60|PACoN A8
ROSELLD I DiD ON APPR'D DRAND l aib on
22 2000324 ||Raliroad Board, White. 385 Packnges 519,29 5742665 518.68 s7.191.804 - 318,70 §7,190.50 « $19.80 $7,623,00|APPR'D $23.20 58,932.00|PACON A/S
RRODIEQUAL) ‘ . 623, ]
1 1 BRANG & 4
; .
) 2000792||Railroad Board, Goral. 20 | Packnges | 52147 5601.10 520,86 ssoaoofTPELE | se0a 353452/ 00 ONAPPRID BRAND. [ so00/Nooio  DIscoNiNG BID
| L
24 2000258 Ralirond Bonrd, Canary, 55 | Packages | 32147  $1.180.85 520.88 14700 100ELLE 1 52090 81, ms WD ONAPRRDERAND, 1 5000{NomD  [[DISCON #VALUEI [Paconas
B I [ UEOUAT (AL L FI ]
TOTAL 518,655.46 518,101.58 516,124.97 : £15,080.50|Y READ #VALUE] |V READ
b et e b L o Naie |




The Scheol Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida B8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNC5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER
TThTtTr T T T T DAROTER dba SMITH TNON;RESRONSIVE]
ITEM || DCPS# |DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFP IND. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER OMMEHGI;}L AR‘IT
QTys | UNIT . SUPPLY LISURPLYIING,
([cROUP Vil: ltems 25 and 26 are to ba awarded on a
total low bid bosis,
: i S, o et e i ! e
4170 = 2502 BID i olp ON APP'D
25 260059512 Board shall bo While (150 fb. basis welghl minus 5% | o cose | 52502 $8,256.60 onaerrporann | 52404 18,107,20{[1'% ON APPRD BRAND | 596 35 £0,695.50 |APPR'D $20,97 $9,880,10| DRAND
(olarance, (500 @ 24" X 36" 127 X 187, 1 A 1 BRAND & ¥ AND G&5H
‘I ] PACS214
| 1 1PACK/CA REAN‘:IC.’\"
Tag Boord shall be While, snme as flem #25 excepl 18" X 1 BID ON APPR'D 1 1, AN PAPER GC BID ON - »
26 20005934 220 Casa | 5857 $1.885.40 Braax gy | 303 11.832560( 00T e, 59.20 $2.024.00 |0 oon $10.76 52,367.20 I:IE;[:,%M
| 1 BRAND & # ki
TOTAL I $10,142.00 I $10,020.80 $10,719,50 $12,257.30
GROUP VII; Items 27 through 31 wlll be awardad on an
Ingvatun? ling o, Vendor does not naed bid all
lterns In this Group.
oo
N B} a0 ON :
2 2000406(Tissue Paper shlt be 20 asnorted colors, 20° X 30, 300 Cree $35.20)  $10,560.00 BE DN APPRID 533,30 39.900,00|"'9 OVATFROORMNG 53400 | 31020000 [appre || s3078|  sti93400| SO
BRAND & e
Watarcolor Paper, While, acid (rae, rough rurface, 25% et AMERICAN WC -
28 20004061 2 30 1B° K 24 550 | Packnges || WO RID Mo B H Tt 516,95 89,322,801 L, 50,00 |NO BID MO BID W
[ e ]t et Agelt
1 BID ON APFRD BID ON APF'D
29 2000510/{Brown Kraft Wrapping, In rolls 36", 220 Rolla 525,62 $5,638,60 kel 524,10 $5,321,80{|APPROVED DRAND 524.75 $5,445,00 |APPRD 33,58 57,389.80| DRAND
| DRAND & AND GaH
o e ol o S s oot ey v i 5 i i A e i oL
BID ON
0ID OM APPR'D 1 i PRGN ARRD
30 2000588](White Newsprint, amosth, 12° X 18", 550 Case s18.22|  $10,021.00 1 stec0 $10,230.00 | APPROVED BRAND 522,10 $12,155.00 [APPR'D $28.85|  $15,867.50| BRAND
B ORAND 3 # . .
l I BRAND & # AND SABH
PAC 3400
3t 2000508|[Matbonrd, 30" X 40", 275 Pnckngen B BIO WG B [IISRLIA] 100.00 527,225.00 [APPROVED BRAND NO BID Ho o
TOTAL 526,219.60 $62,080.20 $27,800.00
GROUP [X: ltoms 32 through 38 ara to be awarded on n
total low bld basis,
Paper shall be While nowsprint, { 30 [b. baals walght minus
5% lnlerance { 500 @ 24" ¥ 36" ) Shre: 8° X 10-1/2",
o g o i
32 2000526 |Paper, Manuserlpt, Firal Grade, Grovelon Ruled, 110 Cose 520,41 52,245.10 P InrGit * 524,00 $2,673.00/0ID ON APPR'D BRAND ] NOBID
LIALY
POSELLE I 1
33 2000190||Paper, Manuscrlpl, Second Grade, Grovelon Ruled. 55 Cnso 52041 $1,122.55 IRVWMZIAPR{E G i 326,10 $1,415.50|010 ON APPR'D BRAND i NO BID NO BID
ALY
34 2000532||P. 5 ROIGELLE ] BID ON APFR'D DRAND |
apor, Manuscripl, Klndergarian, Zaner Bloser Ruled, 55 Cose 12041 31,122,585 irli!\."fN..P\'lﬂIF,’JW-LI: $19,90 $1,004,50 i g NO BID NC BID
'
t t
35 2000249 [Papar. Manuserlpl, First Grado, Zaner Bloser Ruled, 165 Cana 520,41 $0,367.05 T‘;i‘\["’ IRAWHZOT 419,90 $3,200.50| 010 ON APPRD DRAND i NOBID NO BID
26 2000530||Fapar, Manuscript, Sacond Grada, Zaner Bloser rulad, 1o Conn 320,41 32,245.10 Wi omemzvel o0 52,109.00(7'7 OV APPAT BRAND ! NO BID NO BID
S I 1

Lo




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida 8/9/2013
Bid #048-NNO5
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

T O Y e —— e ——— 4w e R AR e A i DABOTER dba SMITH
ITEM | DCPS# |[DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST AFP IND. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS | OFFICE & COMPUTER
QTYS UNIT ' SUPPLY
AT ’ '
a7 2000248[|Paper. Manurcrlpl, Third Grade, Zaner Bloner Ruled, 1o Chane 52041 $2,245,10 EF::;:’::F R km; $10.00 $2.189,00 EID ON APPR'D BRAND i NO BID
IO T TC T TOT Y, TUp TN O, DUTTOTT I O Ty i i
7{10" alternate braken, reverse slde ruled completa 7/0" x ROSGELLE
2 05 . A48, . ' ; X { 0 B NO BID
a 2000530 716" aliernnte broken, oved Brards:. American 440 Cago i 12147 $0,446.80 BRI 19 i 520,70 $0,108,00{ 01D ON APPR'D DRAND i N [lo} Bl
I |
TOTAL 5§21,794.85 . $21,872.50 . NO BID NO BID
| 1
e ———— e
QROUP X: Itams 38 through 41 nre to be swarded ona
total low bid basls, Vendor must bid all ltems in tls
Croup,
Paper chall be Grade D lablet paper, alze 8" X 10-1/2",
33 2000353 (|Paper, Penmanshlp, lined 5/167, 165 Casn I 526,24 34,329.60 16610 525,90 54,273,50|0|D ON APPR'D BRAND NO BID NO BIO
I UL
I nercL
40 2000769 ||Paper, Penmanshlp, linad 318", 165 Casn | 32624 54,329,60 IRV aft 520,70 $3,415,50|DI0 ON APPR'D BRAND NC BID NO BID
1 ' (EOUAL)
1 i
4 2000282 ||Paper, Penmanship, lined 1/27, 165 Caso | 52857 54,714.05 fita $25.00 54,125.00|BI0 ON APPR'D BRAND NO BID NO BID
1
1
TOTAL 1 $13,372.28 $11,014.00 NC BID NO BID

Praparad By, _ %>

Verilled By:




