THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

020-NNO4

Petroleum Products - Oils, Lubes, Grease and Derivatives

Blaylock Qil Company

Cummins Power

Florida Fleet

M & J Sunshine

Osher Qil

Santex Corporation

Tropical Qil Company

South Corporation
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EQSJ.:\&:.IJ";]TTEYD UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT
4A  |Hydraulic Oil, In 55 Gallon Drum 300 Gallon No Bid No Bid $17.11/gal. $6.84/gal, $.485.00/gal. No Bid
5A  |Mineral Spirits, In 55 Gallen Drum 550 Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $.375.00/gal. No Bid
6A |Multipurpese Oil, 400-lbs Drum 4,000 Pound No Bid Ne Bid $5.87Mb $.609.00/b §$1.21/b $1.481b
6B |Multipurpose Oil, 120-lbs Drum 12,000 Pound Ne Bid No Bid $ 6.00/b, $180.00 /Ib. §$1.63 /b, $1.74 /b,
7A  |Hydraulic Fluid, 5 Gallon Pail 50 Gallon No Bid No Bid $19.21/gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid
BA  |Multipurpose Lithoplex, 120-Ib keg 2,400 Pound No Bid No Bid $2.86/Ib § 220.00/b $2.32/b $2.30/b
8B |Multipurpose Lithoplex, 400-Ib drum 4,800 Pound No Bid No Bid 52.41/1b $ 685.00/b No Bid $2.171b
9A |Fleetguard Antifreeze, 55 Gallon Drum 5,000 Gallon $7.12/gal No Bid No Bid $482.81/gal. Ne Bid $.6.23/gal
1A 3?:':}3"'2"' Texaco Long:Lite, 35:Gallen 3,000 Gallen No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 465.00 /gal. No Bid No Bid
12A |Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 2.5 Gallon Centainer 3,000 Gallon Ne Bid $.4.82/gal. No Bid No Bid $10.50/ gal. 80/ gal. }!j No Bid
128 |Diesel Exhaust Fluid, 330 Tote Container 3,000 Gallon No Bid $3.88/gal No Bid No Bid $1,166,50/gal by ‘ i /gal.
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