BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)  Type or print in this box the complete name of the bidder:			Completed	Hi Esca	hbra	h se						
Bid No.: 033-NN04 Title: E10 AND DIESEL NO.2 FUEL NORTH AND SOUTH OF FLAGLER STREET TRANSPORT DELIVERY			Verified	9)00	115/							
Buyer: Harry Eschbach, Buyer												
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET										JC 0110		
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items 1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):			Mansfie	Md Oil Co.						RESPONSIVE Traders Corpor	ation	
Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42th Avenue , Miami, FI 33054     Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	-\$0.0057	\$0.3336	\$3.7710	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.5952
Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Miami, FI 33142 Tank Capacity: 60,000 Gals.	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	-\$0.0044	\$0.3336	\$3.7723	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	s	\$3.5952
Transportation Department, Northwest 9900 NW South River Drive, Medley, Florida 33166, Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	-\$0.0020	\$0.3336	\$3.7747	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	s	s	\$	\$3.5952
Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2755 NW 122 St. Miami, Fl 33167 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals.	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	-\$0.0011	\$0.3336	\$3.7756	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.5952
5. Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 St. Marni, FI 33182 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0057	\$0.3336	\$3.7824	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	s	\$3.5952
6. Additional freight charge for emergency deliveries in less than transport loads		Each				\$75.00		Each				\$250.00
GROUP II (Items 7 through 10): Provide E10 Uni, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: E10 Unleaded minimum of 87 Octane, shall at all times pass all inspection and testing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit. Note: Items 7 through 10 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st afternate. Item 11 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and afternate vendors for items 7 through 10. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unleaded, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:												
7. Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42nd Avenue Miami, Florida 33054 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal	44,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	-\$0.0071	\$0.3647	\$3.5339	44,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.3318
Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2755 NW 122 Street Miami, Florida 33167 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	-\$0.0030	\$0.3647	\$3.5380	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.3318
Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Miami, Florida 33142     Tank Capacity: 20,000 Gals.	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	-\$0.0017	\$0.3647	\$3.5393	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.3318
10. Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 Street Miami, Florida 33182 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	-\$0.0009	\$0.3647	\$3.5401	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	s	\$	\$	\$3.3318
11. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				\$75.00	1	Each				*****

Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
		Mansfie	ld Oil Co.							tion	
								,			
3500.00	delivery)	\$3.4431	-\$0.0005	\$0.3336	\$3.7762		(transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.6050
82,500	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0082	\$0.3336	\$3.7849	20000	(transport delivery)	\$	s	s	\$3.6050
		\$3.4431	\$0.0025	\$0.3336	\$3.7792	759,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.6050
660,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0149	\$0.3336	\$3.7916	660,000	Gallon	\$	\$	\$	\$3.6050
1	Each				\$75.00	1	Each				\$250.00
	338,250 82,500 759,000	338,250 Gallon (transport delivery)  82,500 Gallon (transport delivery)  759,000 Gallon (transport delivery)  660,000 Gallon (transport delivery)	### Topics   Salatin   Salatin    ### Topics   Salatin    ### Topi	Salar   Sala	Mansfield Oil Co.   White Taxes	Sample   Column   C	Salar   Units   Average   De added to OPIS   Unit Taxes   Total Unit Price   Est Qty	Sale	Est Qty	Est Qty	Service Charge to be added to OPIS   Unit Taves   Total Unit Price   Est City   Units   OPIS   Average   Charge to be added to OPIS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average		Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET												
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):			Mansfie	eld Oil Co.						-RESPONSIVE Traders Corpor	ation	
GROUP IV (Items 17 through 20): Provide E10 Unl, South of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service.  Specifications: E10 Unl minimum of 87 Octane, shall at all times pass all inspection and testing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit. Note: Items 17 through 20 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unl, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:												
17. Department of Transportation, Central East 7011 SW 4th Street Mami, Florida 33144 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal		Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	-\$0.0021	\$0.3647	\$3.5389	114,400	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.3396
18. Department of Transportation, Rediand 24601 SW 160 Avenue Miami, Florida 33031 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal		Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	\$0.0059	\$0.3647	\$3.5469	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	\$3.3396
19. Department of Transportation, Vehicle Maintenance, Southwest 11601 SW 160 Street Miami, Florida 33157 Tank Capacity: 15,000 Gal		Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	\$0.0006	\$0.3647	\$3.5416	176,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	s	\$3.3396
20. Department of Transportation, New South 660 SW 3rd Avenue Florida City, Florida 33034 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gal	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1763	\$0.0119	\$0.3647	\$3.5529	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	s	\$3.3396
21. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				\$75.00	1	Each		1		\$250.00
FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY	Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Uni)	ľ				Diesel #2	E10 (Uni)				
							(uls)	18 17				
A) Federal Taxes	\$0.0029	\$0.0027					0.0029	0.00271				

E) Minimum Quantity Required For Bulk Transport	7,000 gal	8,000 gal
D) Applicable Terminal	Port Eve	rglades
C) Local Taxes	- \$0.1410	\$0.1710
B) State Taxes	\$0.1897	\$0.1910
A) Federal Taxes	\$0.0029	\$0.0027
FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY	Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Unl)

E10 (Uni)
0.00271
0.19096
0.171
ious
8500 gal

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)	
Type or print in this box the complete name of the bidder:	
Bid No.: 033-NN04	
Title: E10 AND DIESEL NO.2 FUEL NORTH AND SOUTH OF FLAGLER STE TRANSPORT DELIVERY	REET
David Harry Carleton David	

TIONING ON DELIVERT												
Buyer: Harry Eschbach, Buyer												
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET												
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge tid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items 1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):	*		Petroleum T	raders Corpora	tion				Hightowers P	etroleum Company		
Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42th Avenue , Miami, FI 33054     Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	3.4433	0.0131	0.3336	\$3.7900	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0487	\$0.33361	\$3.82541
2. Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Miami, Fl 33142 Tank Capacity: 60,000 Gals.	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0158	\$0.3336	3.7927	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0470	\$0.33361	\$3.82371
Transportation Department, Northwest 9900 NW South River Drive, Medley, Florida 33166, Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0164	\$0.3336	3.7933	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0470	\$0.33361	\$3.82371
Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2755 NW 122 St. Miami, FI 33167 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals.	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0185	\$0.3336	3.7954	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0433	\$0.33361	\$3.82001
5. Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 St. Miami, FI 33182 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0255	\$0.3336	3.8024	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4431	\$0.0415	\$0.33361	\$3.81821
Additional freight charge for emergency deliveries in less than transport loads		Each				\$250.00		Each				\$150.00
GROUP II (Items 7 through 10): Provide E10 Uni, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: E10 Unleaded minimum of 87 Octane, shall at all times pass all inspection and testing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit. Note: Items 7 through 10 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st afternate. Item 11 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and afternate vendors for items 7 through 10. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unleaded, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:						÷						
7. Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42nd Avenue Miami, Florida 33054 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal	44,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	\$	\$	NO BID	44,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.04621	\$0.36486	\$3.58737
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2765 NW 122 Street Mami, Florida 33167 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals</li> </ol>	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	\$	NO BID	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.04330	\$0.36486	\$3.58446
Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Milami, Florida 33142 Tank Capacity: 20,000 Gals.	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	<b>\$</b>	NO BID	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.04700	\$0.36486	\$3.58816
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 Street Miami, Florida 33182</li> <li>Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	\$	NO BID	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.03994	\$0.36486	\$3.58110
11. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				NO BID	1	Each				\$150.00

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est. Qty	Units	OPIS Averaga	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Averaga	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET												
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):			Petroleum 1	Traders Corpor	ation				Hightowers Po	etroleum Company		
SOUTH OF FLAGLER STREET												
GROUP III (Items 12 through 15): Provide Diesel No. 2 ULS (ultra low sulfur) South of Flagler Street, to the various below Fided besterns in exercisean with the specifications herein. Venders are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service.  Specifications: Diesel No. #2 (Utra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade say prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35.  Note: Items12 through 15 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 16 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 12 through 15. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur) required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):												
12. Transportation Department, Central East 7011 SW 4th Street Miami, FI 33144 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.		(transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0182	\$0.3336	\$3.7951	338,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44310	\$0.04150	\$0.33361	\$3.81821
13. Transportation Department, Redland 24601 SW 160 Avenue Marni, FI 33031 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.		(transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0253	\$0.3336	\$3.8022	82,500	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44310	\$0.05750	\$0.33361	\$3.83421
14. Transportation Department, Southwest 11601 SW 160 Street Miami, Florida 33157 Tank Capacity: 15,000 Gals.	759,000	(transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0235	\$0.3336	\$3.8004	759,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44310	\$0.05420	\$0.33361	\$3.83091
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, South 660 SW 3rd Avenue Florida City, Florida 33034</li> <li>Tank Capacity: 20,000 Gals.</li> </ol>		Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.0335	\$0.3336	\$3.8104	660,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44310	\$0.04700	\$0.33361	\$3.82371
16. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				\$250.00	1	Each				\$150.00

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Averaga	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est. Qty	Units	OPIS Averaga	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET								,	<i></i>			IL
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel Nei shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items 1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):			Petroleum	Traders Corpo	ation	,	-	0	Hightowers Pe	etroleum Company	15:	
GROUP IV (Items 17 through 20): Provide E10 Unl, South of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service.  Specifications: E10 Unimminum of 67 Octane, shall act all times pass all inspection and testing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit.  Note: Items 17 through 20 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unl, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:												
17. Department of Transportation, Central East 7011 SW 4th Street Marrii, Florida 33144 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal	114,400	(transport delivery)	\$	\$	s	NO BID	114,400	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.03994	\$0.36486	\$3.58110
<ol> <li>Department of Transportation, Redland 24601 SW 160 Avenue Miami, Florida 33031 Tank Capacity.</li> <li>12,000 Gal</li> </ol>	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	\$	NO BID	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.05381	\$0.36486	\$3.59497
<ol> <li>Department of Transportation, Vehicle Maintenance, Southwest 11601 SW 160 Street Miami, Florida 33157 Tank Capacity: 15,000 Gal</li> </ol>	176,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	s	NO BID	176,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.05096	\$0.36486	\$3.59212
20. Department of Transportation, New South 660 SW 3rd Avenue Florida City, Florida 33034 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gal	70 1525	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$	s	\$	NO BID	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17630	\$0.04466	\$0.36486	\$3.58582
21. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				NO BID	1	Each				\$150.00

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY	Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Unl)
A) Federal Taxes	\$0.0029	\$0.0027
B) State Taxes	\$0.1897	\$0.1910
C) Local Taxes	\$0.1410	\$0.1710
D) Applicable Terminal	vari	ous
E) Minimum Quantity Required For Bulk Transport	7500 GAL	8500 GAL

Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Uni)	
\$0.00290	\$0.00290	
\$0.33071	\$0.29996	
N/A	\$0.06200	
Port Ever	rglades	
7500 gal	8500 gal	

## BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)									58			
Type or print in this box the complete name of the bidder:												
Bid No.: 033-NN04												
Tille: E10 AND DIESEL NO.2 FUEL NORTH AND SOUTH OF FLAGLER STREET TRANSPORT DELIVERY	1											
Buyer: Harry Eschbach, Buyer	1											
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est. Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to b added to	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	e Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET	-1		JL	OPIS						Average	<u></u>	
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):		La	nd & Sea Petro	leum Holdings,	Inc.				ī	ropic Oil Company		
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42th Avenue, Miarri, FI 33054 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1141	\$0.3336	\$3.8910	602,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.02610	\$0.57662	\$4.04602
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Mami, FI 33142 Tank Capacity: 60,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1084	\$0.3336	\$3.8853	486,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.02610	\$0.57662	\$4.04602
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Northwest 9900 NW South River Drive, Medley, Florida 33166, Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1034	\$0.3336	\$3.8853	330,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.02610	\$0.57662	\$4.04602
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2755 NW 122 St. Miami, Fl 33167 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1122	\$0.3336	\$3.8891	536,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.02610	\$0.57662	\$4.04602
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 St. Miami, FI 33182</li> <li>Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1069	\$0.3336	\$3.8838	255,750	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.02610	\$0.57662	\$4.04602
6. Additional freight charge for emergency deliveries in less than transport loads		Each				\$100.00		Each	\$3.44330	\$0.06000	\$0.57662	\$4.07992
GROUP II (Items 7 through 10): Provide E10 Unl, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: E10 Unleaded minimum of 87 Octane, shall at all times pass all inspection and testing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit. Note: Items 7 through 10 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 11 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 7 through 10. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unleaded, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:										*		
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, North 16150 NW 42nd Avenue Miami, Florida 33054</li> <li>Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal</li> </ol>	44,000	Gailon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0586	\$0.3649	\$3.5972	44,000	Gallon (transport	\$3.17370	\$0.01920	\$0.54787	\$3.74077
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, John H Schee Center 2755 NW 122 Street Miami, Florida 33167</li> <li>Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gals</li> </ol>	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0532	\$0.3649	\$3.5918	237,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.01920	\$0.54787	\$3.74077
Transportation Department, Northeast 5901 NW 27th Avenue Miami, Florida 33142	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0571	\$0.3649	\$3.5957	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.01920	\$0.54787	\$3.74077
Transportation Department, Central West 13775 NW 6 Street Miami, Florida 33182     Flank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.      Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0544	\$0.3649	\$3.5930	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.01920	\$0.54787	\$3.74077
The second of the second control of the seco	1	Each				\$100.00	1	Each	\$3.17370	\$0.06000	\$0.54787	\$3.78157

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est. Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET									JL			
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, ultra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):		Lan	d & Sea Petrol	eum Holdings, I	nc.		9		Tro	opic Oil Company		
SOUTH OF FLAGLER STREET												
GROUP III (Items 12 through 15): Provide Diesel No. 2 ULS (ultra low sulfur) South of Flagler Street, to the verieus below beted leaden in accordance with the epocifications herein. Vendere are to indicate the service. Specifications: Diesel No. #2 (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel), Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35.  Note: Items12 through 15 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 16 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 12 through 15. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur) required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):						S)						
12. Transportation Department, Central East 7011 SW 4th Street Mami, FI 33144 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.	338,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1027	\$0.3336	\$3.8796	338,250	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.04300	\$0.57662	\$4.06292
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Redland 24601 SW 160 Avenue Miami, FI 33031 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	82,500	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1253	\$0.3336	\$3.9022	82,500	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.04300	\$0.57662	\$4.06292
<ol> <li>Transportation Department, Southwest 11601 SW 160 Street Miami, Florida 33157 Tank Capacity. 15,000 Gals.</li> </ol>	759,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1227	\$0.3336	\$3.8996	759,000	Gallon (transport	\$3.44330	\$0.04300	\$0.57662	\$4.06292
Transportation Department, South 660 SW 3rd Avenue Florida City, Florida 33034     Tank Capacity: 20,000 Gals.      Additional Essiebt Charge for Engreese and all units in Land the Additional Essiebt Charge for Engreese	660,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.4433	\$0.1075	\$0.3336	\$3.8844	660,000	delivery) Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.44330	\$0.04300	\$0.57662	\$4.06292
<ol> <li>Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads</li> </ol>	1	Each				\$100.00	1	Each	\$3.44330	\$0.04300	\$0.57662	\$4.06292

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price	Est. Qty	Units	OPIS Average	Service Charge to be added to OPIS Average	Unit Taxes	Total Unit Price
NORTH OF FLAGLER STREET	1											
GROUP I (Items 1 through 5): Provide Diesel No.2 ULS, utra low sulfur, North of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: Diesel No.2 ULS (Ultra Low Sulfur Motor Fuel). Diesel fuel shall, at all times, pass all inspection and test standards for the grade as prescribed by applicable State of Florida and Federal specifications. Gravity reading not to exceed 35. Note: Items1 through 5 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Item 6 will not be used in the bid evaluation, but will be awarded to the primary and alternate vendors for items 1 through 5. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. Diesel No.2 ULS required for delivery to the following locations (transport delivery):		Lan	d & Sea Petrol	eum Holdings, l	nc.		8		Tro	opic Oil Company		
GROUP IV (Items 17 through 20): Provide E10 Unl, South of Flagler Street, to the various below listed locations in accordance with the specifications herein. Vendors are to indicate the service charge bid to provide this service. Specifications: E10 Unit infinition of 87 Octane, shall at all times pass all inspection and tessing standards for the grade as prescribed by the State of Florida. Billing to be adjusted to 60 degrees Fahrenheit. Note: Items 17 through 20 to be awarded, as a group, on a total low bid basis to a primary and 1st alternate. Vendors must bid all items to be considered for award. E10 Unl, minimum of 87 Octane, delivered in bulk transport load as called for to the following:						_						
17. Department of Transportation, Central East 7011 SW 4th Street Mami, Florida 33144 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal	114,400	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0477	\$0.3649	\$3.5863	114,400	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.02510	\$0.54787	\$3.7467
18. Department of Transportation, Redland 24601 SW 160 Avenue Miami, Florida 33031 Tank Capacity: 12,000 Gal	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0693	\$0.3649	\$3.6079	79,200	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.02510	\$0.54787	\$3.7467
<ol> <li>Department of Transportation, Vehicle Maintenance, Southwest 11601 SW 160 Street Miami, Florida 33157 Tank Capacity: 15,000 Gal</li> </ol>	176,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0668	\$0.3649	\$3.6054	176,000	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.02510	\$0.54787	\$3.7467
20. Department of Transportation, New South 660 SW 3rd Avenue Florida City, Florida 33034 Tank Capacity: 10,000 Gal	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.1737	\$0.0598	\$0.3649	\$3.5984	17,600	Gallon (transport delivery)	\$3.17370	\$0.02510	\$0.54787	\$3.7467
21. Additional Freight Charge for Emergency deliveries in less than transport loads	1	Each				\$100.00	1	Each	\$3.17370	\$0.06000	\$0.54787	\$3.7816

FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY	Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Unl)			
A) Federal Taxes	\$0.0029	\$0.0029			
B) State Taxes	\$0.3307	\$0.29996			
C) Local Taxes	\$0.0000	\$0.0620			
D) Applicable Terminal	Port Everglades				
E) Minimum Quantity Required For Bulk Transport	7000 gal	7500 gal			

Diesel #2 (uls)	E10 (Unl)					
\$0.2731	\$0.1859					
\$0.2400	\$0.2400					
\$0.0700	\$0.1000					
Port Eve	erglades					
7500 gal	8500 gal					