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GROUP 1: Cerberus Pyrotronics Systems

ltems 1 through 107 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. I[tems 108 to 130 will not be used to calculate bid award; however, awarded vendors shall honor these prices if
additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.

1 ||Angelou, Maya Elem. 24 ‘ Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
2 ilAurburndale Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
3 ||Beckford, Ethel F./Richmond Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
4 ||Bell, Pau! W. Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
5 |[Biscayne Elem. 24 ‘ Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1Q Month I
& ||Brentwood Elem. PLC 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro F§-250 Month
7 ||Broad, Ruth K./Bay Harbor Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
8 [[Brownsville Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
9 ||C O P E Center North Alternative Education 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
10 ||Campbell Drive Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotfronics Pyro MXL-1Q Month |
11 ||Citrus Grove Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
12 ||Citrus Grove Middle 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
13 ||Citrus Grove O.T. C. 24 Cerbertus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
14 ||Cooper, Neva King Educational Center 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1Q Month
15 ||Coral Gables Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
16 ||Coral Reef Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
17 ||Coral Way Elem / K-8 Center 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL / F$-250 Month |
18 ||Crestview Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
19 |iDevon Aire K-8 Center 24 Cerberus Pyrofronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
20 ||Doolin, Howard A. Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2 Month |
21 |[Earlington Heights Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrofronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month |
22 ||Evans, Lillie C. Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
23 |[Eve, Christina M. Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
24 ||Fairchild,David Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month ‘
25 ||Fascell, Dante B. Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrofronics Pyro MXL Month
26 ||Ferguson, John A. Senior 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2 Month
27 ||Fienberg/Fisher K-8 center 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
28 ||Flamingo Eem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1Q Month |
29 ||Franklin, Benjamin Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
30 (|Golden Glades Elem 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
31 ||Goleman, Barbara Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
32 ||Good, Joella C. Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month
33 ||Gordon Manatee Elem. /PLC (1) 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month |
34 ||Gordon, Jack D. Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
35 ||Graham, Ernest R. Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
34 |Hall, Joe Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month |
37 F—iorfner, Eneida Massas Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2 Month |
38 H—iioleoh Gardens Elem. / PLC 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
39 |Hialeah-Miami Lakes Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
40 |[Hibiscus Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month |
41 |F—|o|mes Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month
42 "Homesiead Middle 24 Cerberus Pyroironics Pyro MXL Month |
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||Bid Titte: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT
43 |Hoover, Qliver Elem. PLC 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
44 |Hopkins, Lindsey Technical 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2
45 |[Hurston, Zora Neale Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
46 ||Jefferson, Thomas Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1Q
47 |Kensington Park Elem./ PLC 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
48 ||[Krop, br. Michael M. Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
49 |lLake Stevens Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
50 ||Lake Stevens Middie 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
51 ||Leisure City K-8 Center / MLC (DD) 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
52 ||[M.AS.T. Academy/Maritime & Science Technology 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
53 ||Mann, Jann Opportunity Education 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
54 ||Martin, Frank C. K-8 Center 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
55 |[Matthews, Wesley Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
56 [|Mays Middle 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
57 [[McMillan, Howard D. Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
58 [[Meek, Carrie P./Westview Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
59 [[Melrose Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1Q
60 ||Memitt, Ada K-8 Center 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
61 |[Miami Beach Senior 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2
62 ||Miami Central Senior 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
63 ||Miami Douglas Macaurthur Senior South 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
64 ||Miami Edison Middie 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
65 ||Miami Senior 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
66 [Miami Shores Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
67 |\Miami Springs Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
68 |[Miller, Phyllis Ruth Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyroironics Pyro MXL
69 ||Morningside Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
70 |[Moton, Robert Russa Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2
71 |Myrtle Grove Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
72 |[Natural Bridge Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
73 "NQUﬁlUS Middle 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
74 "Norlcnd Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
75 "Norih County Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-1IQ
76 |[North Miami Beach Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
77 ||O T Warehouse 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
78 ||Oak Grove Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
79 |[Opa Locka Elem./Dr. Robert ingram 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
80 |Palmetto Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
81 "Pcnther, Gordon Elem. /PLC (S) 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
82 "Redlcnd Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
83 "Redlcnd Middle 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
84 "Redondo Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
85 "Reeves, Henry E. S. Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL
86 "Region Maintenance Center ! Instructional 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
87 "Region Maintenance Center IV Instructional 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro System 3
88 "Riverside Elem. Clinic 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro SXL
89 "Riviercl Middie 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ
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||Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT ' BASS UNITED **ADDENDUM
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Buyer: Vanessa Flores - o PROPOSAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT | PSS;::R PSSE::R P;:'g;::"
90 |Rockway Middle 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month $340.00 $ &0
21 |Santa Clara Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-2 Month $275.00 $35969 -
92 [Scott Lake Elem. 24 | Cerberus Pyrotronics | Pyro MXLIQ || monih [EEEPYERNI 535960
93 |sivley, Hubert O. Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ W s275.00 $359.60
924 |ISkyway Elem. 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month | $275.00 $35;9:sg":
95 |lsmith, Lenora B. Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Y s275.00 $359.60
96 ||South Pointe Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL lelMal  $275.00 $'35§.60 :
97 ||Southwest Center Transportation 24 || Cerberus Pyrofronics Pyro MXL Month SEEEY¥IXil] : $3’59~;60\
98 |Thomas, Eugenia B. K-8 Center 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month $275.00 |- $359:40
99 |[fropical Elem. 24 | Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month $275.00 3,35960
100 |[Varela, Felix Senior 24 | Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL IVl $450.00 $35960
101 ||Vehicle Maintenance 24 Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month | $275.00 $35960
102 |[Vilage Green Elem. 24 | Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month YN $3596@
103 ||Walters, Mae M. Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL-IQ Month \ $275.00 ‘$%3‘5‘9.60.‘
104 ||Washington, Booker T. Senior 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month [ i $3596® -
105 |[Wheatley, Phillis Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month Y] . $35 60 5
106 |[winston Park K-8 Center 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month § $275.00 ) $35960
107 ||Wyche Jr., Charles David Elem. 24 || Cerberus Pyrotronics Pyro MXL Month $275.00 ,$35j2.‘.60 i
TOTAL GROUP 1 $32,650.00 i _538,477.20 $0.00
Group 1: Additional Cerberus Pyrotronics Systems
In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretion to add servicing o
108 ||these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain
additional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.
108A||Elementc1ry Schools - Cerberus Pyrotronics N/A Month $325.00
1088 ||Primary Learning Centers - Cerberus Pyrotronics N/A Month $225.00 $ 90 :
108C||Middle Schools - Cerberus Pyrofronics N/A Month $425.00 $35960 »
108D||Middle Learning Centers - Cerberus Pyrotronics N/A Month $400.00 $359,.{5(‘)
108E||Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Cerberus Pyrotronics N/A Month $550.00 $359.60 .
Group 1: Cerberus Pyrotronics Systems Miscellaneous Peripheral Material incuding labor o
109 ||Addressable Smoke Detector 200 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Sl $191.00
110 [|Addressable Heat Detector 50 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $177.00
111 [|[Addressable Manual Station 100 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $210.00
112 |Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $110.00
113 |[Non-Addressable Heat Detector 50 Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $110.00
114 |[Non-Addressable Manual Station 100 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $80.00
115 |[Protective Cover Manual Station 100 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $150.00
116 ||Protective Cover Horn/Strobe 300 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $150.00
117 ||Visual Strobe 100 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $125.00
118 |[Horn 100 | Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $75.00
119 |[Horn/Strobe 500 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $160.00
120 {Magnetic Door Holder 50 Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $200.00 $1é9.77
121 ||Detector Base Assembly 30 Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $30.00 $45.13 -
122 |Back Box Manuat Station 25 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $45.00 EEECIREN
123 ([Back Box Horn/Strobe 25 Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each $45.00 ) $51]1; 18 -
124 |Wire/Cable Indoor 2500 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each PN LER 5200 -
125 ||Wire/Cable Outdoor Wet Location - West Penn 2500 || Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each 50 PER FT
126 Input A/C power surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-120 HW, 75 Cerberus Pyrotronics i Each $g:;:_5@

EDCO-HSP121BT-1RU or equal.

$225.00
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(Bid #032-NNO3

uBid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT
Initiating Device Circuits (IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits

127 ||(SLC) surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLY, EDCO-PCé42, | 360 | Cerberus Pyrotronics - Each
EDCOQ series SLCP-30 or equal.

128 Nofification Appliance Circuits [NAC) surge suppresser, 360 || Cerberus Pyrotronics ) Each

DITEK-DTK2LVPLV, EDCO-PHC-043 or equal.

Group 1: Cerberus Pyrotronics Systems Labor Rates

METRO
CONTRACTORS
BA D *“*ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL
PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
MONTH MONTH MONTH
0.00
0.00 $77:50

129

Provide additional support functions or modifications to new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance
with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.

129A

hour.

Alarm Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per

- Cerberus Pyrotronics

N/A

1298

Installer labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. -

Cerberus Pyrotronics

N/A

Group 1: Percent Discount off List

For additional support functions or modifications to new or existing Cerberus Pyrotronics Fire Alarm Systems OEM pcris
130 [[may be reqguired. Bidder(s) shall indicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price

list. A minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required.
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“Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Qry

MANUFACTURER

MODEL

UNIT

MONTH

" PRICE PER

METRO
stmpiex. || CONTRACTORS
GRINNELL | - ADDENDUM
- 4| MISSING FROM
‘ PROPOSAL
PRICE PER PRICE PER
MONTH MONTH

GROUP 2: Simplex Grinnell Systems

Items 131 through 265 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. Items 264 to 288 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors shall honor these prices

if additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.

131 ||Alonso & Tracy Morning Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
132 ||Allapattah Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-800t Month
133 ||American Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
134 ||Arch Creek Elem / North Miami Middie 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
135 ||Arcola Lakes Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simptex 4020-8001 Month
136 |Arvida Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
137 ||Aventura Waterways K-8 Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
138 |Baker, George T. Aviation 24 Simplex Grinneil Simplex 4010 Month
139 |Barreiro Manual C Dr. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
140 |Bent Tree Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
141 |Bethune,Mary Mcleuod Head Start 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002 Month
142 |Biscayne Nature Center 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
143 |Blanton, Van E. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-8001 Month
144 |[Biue Lakes Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
145 ||Boone, Virginia A./Highland Oaks Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simptex 4100 Month
146 |[Boussard, Norma Butler Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 U Month
147 |Braddock, G. Holmes Senior 24 Simplex Grinnelt Simplex 4100U Month
148 |[Broadmoor Eiem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
149 [Bunche Park Elem. 24 Simptex Grinnell Simplex 4100ES Month
150 ||Campbell Drive Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
151 ||ICanosa. Jorge Mas Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 U Month
152 ||Caribbean Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
153 ||Carol City Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002-8001 Month
154 ([Channel 17 Transmission Tower 24 Simplex Grinnell Simptex 4020 Month
155 |[Chiles, Lawton Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simpelx 4020 Month
156 [|[Coconut Palm K-8 Academt 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
157 ||Colonial Drive Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4004 Month
158 ||Coral Park Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
159 ||Coral Reef Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
160 ||Coral Terrace Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
161 |Corporate Academy North 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
162 ||Country Club Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
163 [[Crowder, Thena C. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
164 ||Culter Ridge Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
165 ||Cutler Ridge Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
166 ||Dario, Rubin Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
167 ”De Diego, Jose Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
168 ”Design & Architecture Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002-8001 Month
169 ”Douglcss, Frederick Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex Month
170 HDorol Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
171 ”Dorsey, D. A. Educational Center 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
172 ”Dn’ve,Howcrd Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 || Month
173 ”Dunbcr, Paul Lawrence Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-804 Month
174 ||Dupuis, John G. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex Month
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ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL

175 [Emerson Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
176 |[Espinosa,Rolando Dr.K-8 Cir 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
177 |F. D. L. R. S. at Blue Lakes Elem 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplelx 4100U
178 |[Fairlawn Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simpiex 4020
179 |[Filer, Henry H. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
180 ||Finlay, Dr. Carlos J. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
181 ||Flagier, Henry M. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
182 (|Flagmi Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
183 |[Florida City Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
184 |[Floyd, Gloria Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
185 |([Fulford Elem. 24 Simplex Grinneli Simplex 4010
186 ||Gateway Enviromental K-8 Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100
187 ||Glazer Zelda Middie 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex4100
188 ||Goulds Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnelf Simplex 4100
189 ||Gratigny Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex4010
190 |[Hammocks Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100V
191 "Heodsfcrt Transition 24 Simplex Grinnell

192 "Hicleoh Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
193 "Howcrd Drive Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
194 |intemational Studies H.S. (Madruga Building) 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100€S
195 [[Johnson, J. W. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
196 ||Kendale Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100U
197 |Kennedy, John F. Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
198 |[Key Biscayne Elem./ K-8 Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
199 |Key Biscayne Nature Center 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
200 |[Kinfoch Park Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100
201 [Lehman, William Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
202 ||Lentin, Linda K-8 Center 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
203 |[Liberty City Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
204 ||Lorah Park Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
205 ||L'ouverture, Toussaint Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
206 |[Maintenance & Operations 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
207 |[Mann, Horace Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
208 ||Mandarin Lakes K-8 Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex
209 ||[M.A.S.T. Academy/Medical Academy {Homestead) 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100u
210 ||Miami Carol City Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-8001
211 |[Miami Gardens Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4005
212 ||[Miami Heights Elem. &Pre K 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-8001
213 ||Miami Jackson Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
214 |IMiami Lakes Educational Center Tech / Sr 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-8001
215 [[Miami Lakes Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020
216 [[Miami Norland Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
217 [[Miami Northwestern Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100u
218 [|Miami Park Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010
219 IMiami Southridge Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100-800)
220 [|Miami Springs Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001
221 [|Miami Springs Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020

Page 6

| BASS UNITED

~ PRICE PER

MONTH
$296.00
$325.00
$296.00
$294.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$325.00
$355.00
$296.00
$296.00
$355.00
$325.00
$296.00
$296.00
$325.00
$296.00
$296.00
$355.00
$325.00
$325.00
$296.00
$296.00
$325.00
$296.00
$296.00
$296.00
$325.00
$355.00
$325.00
$325.00
$454.00
$296.00
$296.00
$454.00
$454.00
$355.00
$454.00
$454.00
$296.00
$454.00
$296.00
$454.00

SIMPLEX
GRINNELL

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER
MONTH

$371.25

PRICE PER
MONTH

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.95

§371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

. $371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$871.25 |

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25~

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25.

$371.25

$371:25

$371.25

$371.25

$37125

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25
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|Bid # 032-NNO3

IBid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores
ITEM DESCR!PTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT
222 ||Miami Springs Student Services 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
223 ||Naranja Elem. YMAACD @ MacArthur South 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4001 Month
224 |[Norland Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
225 ||North Beach Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
226 ||North Dade Middle/ Ctr For Modern Language Elem 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
227 ||North Hialeah Elem. 24 Simplex GrinnellJ Simplex 4020 Month
228 ||North Miami Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4001U Month
229 ||North Twin Lakes Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100U Month
230 ||Norwood Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002-800! Month
231 ||Parkway Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
232 ||Pepper, Claude Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
233 ||Pharr, Kelsey L. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
234 |IPine Villa Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
235 |(|Poninciana Parks Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002 Month
236 |[Rainbow Park Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
237 |Region Maintenance Center V 24 || Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 || Month
238 |Riverside Elem. 24 | simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 || Month
239 ”Roycl Green Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
240 [Royal Palm Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
241 |S. B. A.B. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100U Month
242 ||Schee, John H. Transportation 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
243 ||Seminole Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
244 ||Shenandoah Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
245 ||Snapper Creek Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simpiex 4020 Month
246 |South Dade Middle School 24 Simplex Grinneli Simplex 4100 U Month
247 ||South Dade Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
248 |[South Hialeah Elem., 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
249 ||South Miami Heights Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
250 ||Stirrup. E. W. F. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
251 ||Sunny Isles Beach K-8 Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex4020 Month
252 ||Sunset Park Elem., 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
253 ||Sweetwater Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
254 |[Thomas, W. R. Middie 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
255 ||Treasure Island Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 Month
256 |lTucker, Frances S. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020-8001 Month
257 |[Turner, William H. Technical / Miami Agricultural Ctr. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4100 U Month
258 |[Twin Lakes Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
259 [W.L.R. N. Channel 17 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4010 Month
260 ||West Miami Middle 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4005 Month
261 ||Westland Hialeah Senior 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
262 ([Whigham Dr, Edward Elem. PLC {E) 24 Simplex Grinnett Simplex 4100-8001 ([ Month
263 [[Whispering Pines Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4020 Month
264 |[Young. Nathan B. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002 Month
265 [[Young, Nathan B. Elem. 24 Simplex Grinnell Simplex 4002 Month

TOTAL GROUP 2

GROUP 2: Additional Simplex Grinnell Systems

PRICE PER
MONTH

SIMPLEX
GRINNELL

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER
MONTH

$371.25

PRICE PER
MONTH

$371.25

$371:25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

- $371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$a71:25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371,.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$371.25

$871.25

| $371.25

$371:25.

$a71.25

$371.25

$371.25.

$371.25

$371.28

$371.25

$371.25 -

$371.25 _ |

$371.25

337125

$a71.25

$371.25

PRLON . $50,118.75

$0.00

In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretion to add servicing to
266 |these systems, the vendor shail: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain
ladditional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.
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||Bid #032-NNO3

||Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL
266A|Elementary Schools - Simplex Grinnell N/A
2668 |Primary Learning Centers - Simplex Grinnell N/A
266C|Middle Schools - Simplex Grinnell N/A
266D|[Middle Learning Centers - Simplex Grinnell N/A
266E|Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Simplex Grinnell N/A
GROUP 2: Simplex Grinnell Systems Miscellaneous Peripheral Material Including labor
267 ||Addressable Smoke Detector 200 Simplex Grinnell -
268 ||Addressable Heat Detector 50 Simplex Grinnell -
269 |[Addressable Manual Station 100 Simplex Grinnelt -
270 ||[Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 Simplex Grinnell -
271 ”Non-Addresscble Heat Detector 50 Simplex Grinnell -
272 HNon—Addressable Manudal Station 100 Simplex Grinnell -
273 ||Protective Cover Manual Stafion 100 Simplex Grinnell -
274 ||Protective Cover Hom/Strobe 300 Simplex Grinnell -
275 ||Visual Strobe 100 Simplex Grinneli -
276 |Horn 100 Simplex Grinnell -
277 |Horn/Strobe 500 Simplex Grinnell -
278 ||Magnetic Door Holder 50 Simplex Grinnell -
279 |Detector Base Assembly 30 Simplex Grinnelt -
280 [IBack Box Manual Station 25 Simplex Grinnell -
281 [[Back Box Hom/Strobe 25 Simplex Grinnell -
282 ||Wire/Cable Indoor 2500 Simplex Grinnell -
283 [[wire/Cable Qutdoor Wet Location - West Penn 2500 Simplex Grinnell -
284 :Enlggto,i\:'(s:;])g;/;ir]s;lrjg; ;ucfupgfsser, DITEK-DTK-120 HW, 75 Simplex Grinnell R
Initiating Device Circuits {IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits
285 ||SLC) surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLV, EDCO-PCé642, | 360 | Simplex Grinnell -
EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal.
286 Notification Appliance Circuits (NAC) surge suppresser, 260 simplex Grinnell )

DITEK-DTK2LVPLYV, EDCO-PHC-043 or equal.

Page 8

PRICE PER
MONTH
$325.00
$325.00

$400.00

$300.00
. $525.00

$275.00
$250.00
$250.00
$165.00
$165.00
$100.00
$150.00
$150.00
$150.00
$100.00
$190.00
$310.00
$125.00
$40.00
$40.00
.40 PER FT
.50 PER FT

$225.00

$150.00

$150.00

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER
MONTH

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




‘Bid #032-NN03

METRO

CONTRACTORS
|Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT **ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
Buyer: Vanessa Flores PROPOSAL
PRICEPER | PRICEPER PRICE PER
TEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT MONTH MONTH " MONTH
GROUP 2: Simplex Grinnell Systems Labor Rates
287 Provide additional support functions or modifications to new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance
with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.
287A :(I;:J?w Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per ) simplex Grinnell N/A Hour
2878 [[Installer labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. - Simplex Grinnell N/A Hour

Group 2: Percent Discount off List

For additfional support functions or modifications to new or existing Simplex Grinnell Fire Alarm Systems OEM parts
288 [[may be required. Bidder(s] shall indicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published pricel

list. A minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required.

30%
DISCOUNT

Page 9
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||Bid #032-NNO3

||Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QrY

MANUFACTURER

MODEL

UNIT

' BASS UNITED

PRICE PER
MONTH

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER
MONTH

PRICE PER
MONTH

GROUP 3: Edwards Systems

Items 289 through 327 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. ltems 328 to 350 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors shall honor these prices
if additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.

$463.50

| $463:50

. $46350 .

946350 |

$46350

| §46350

$463.50

289 |[Andover Middle J 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 40.00
290 |[Calusa Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST 2 Month 0.00
291 |[Carol City Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST 2 Month 0.00
292 |[Carver, George Washington Elem. 24 Edwards ECI 7100 Month 0.00
293 |[Cenntennial Middle 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 40.00
294 ||Curry, Lamar Louise Middle 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 40.00
295 ||Edison Park Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards IRC-3 Month 40.00
296 ||Greenglade Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
297 |[Hawkins, Barbara Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards IRC-3 Month 0.00
298 |[Hialeah Gardens Middle 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 40.00
299 |[Hialeah Gardens Senior 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 480.00
300 ”Homesteod Senior 24 Edwards Edwards IRC-3 Month 480.00
301 ”Hoover, Oliver Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards IRC 3 Month 0.00
@|Kruse, Ruth Owens Educational Center 24 Edwards Edwards 57218 Month 00.00
303 “Lowrence Jr., David K-8 Center 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 00.00
304 [|Ludlam Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
305 ||Mack, Dr. Henry W./West Little River Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
306 |[Merrick Educational Center 24 Edwards Edwards 5721 B Month 00.00
307 ||Miami Douglas Macaurthur Senior North 24 Edwards Edwards IRC 3 Month 480.00
308 |[Miami Edison Senior 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 00.00
309 |[North Center Transporfation 24 Edwards Edwards EST-29234 || Month 00.00
310 |[Northeast Center Transportation 24 Edwards Edwards EST-QSC Month 00.00
311 |[Olinda Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
312 ||Orchard Villa Elem. 24 - Edwards Edwards 5721B Month 0.00
313 ||Parkview Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
314 ||Perine Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
315 |[Pine Lake Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
316 ||Reagan, Ronald W./Doral Senior 24 Edwards Edwards EST-3 Month 480.00
317 ||Renick, Robert Educational Center 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 00.00
318 |[S B A B - Jefferson Administration Building 24 Edwards Edwards IRC 3 Month 00.00
319 |[S B A B - Jefferson Garage 24 Edwards Edwards EST 226 Month 00.00
320 |[Shadowlawn Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards IRC 3 Month 0.00
321 |[Southside Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards IRC 3 Month 0.00
322 (|Southwood Middle 24 Edwards Edwards EST 3 Month 40.00
323 ||Vineland Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
324 ||West Homestead Elem. 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
325 |Westview Middle 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 0.00
326 ||Young Mens Academy 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 00.00
327 |lYoung Womens Academy 24 Edwards Edwards EST-2 Month 00.00
TOTAL GROUP 3 490.00
Group 3: Additional Edwards Systems

In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretfion to add servicing to

328 |[these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain

additional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.

328A||Elementcry Schools

1 -

Edwards

N/A

Page 10
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$0.00
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“Bld # 032-NNO3

HBid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER

PRICE PER
MONTH

ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT P,alg:::k
328B ||Primary Learning Centers - Edwards N/A Month 0.00
328C|Middle Schools - Edwards N/A Month 400.00
328D|Middle Learning Centers - Edwards N/A Month 400.00
328E | Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Edwards N/A Month 00.00
Group 3: Edwards Systems Miscellaneous Peripheral Material Including labor
329 |[Addressable Smoke Detector 200 Edwards - Each 60.00
330 ||Addressable Heat Detector 50 Edwards - Each 40.00
331 ||Addressable Manuai Station 100 Edwards - Each 00
332 |[Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 Edwards - Each 02.00
333 |[Non-Addressable Heat Detector 50 Edwards - Each 90.00
334 ||Non-Addressable Manual Station 100 Edwards - Each 00.00
335 ||Protective Cover Manual Station 100 Edwards - Each 0.00
336 ||Protective Cover Hom/Strobe 300 Edwards - Each 0.00
337 ||Visual Strobe 100 Edwards - Each 00
338 |Homn 100 Edwards - Each 00.00
339 |[Horn/Strobe 500 Edwards - Each 0.00
340 |[Magnetic Door Holder 50 Edwards - Each 00
341 ||Detector Base Assembly 30 Edwards - Each 41.00
342 ”Bock Box Manudl Station 25 Edwards - Each 43.00
343 [[Back Box Horn/Strobe 25 Edwards - Each 43.00
344 (\wire/Cable Indoor 2500 Edwards - Each 40 PER
345 (|Wire/Cable Outdoor Wet Location - West Penn 2500 Edwards - Each 0 PER
344 :Ergag:)x(s:;])gmirls&g; seu(;au;zfsser, DITEK-DTK-120 Hw, 75 Edwards } Each "
Initiating Device Circuits (IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits
347 ‘\[SLC) surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLY, EDCO-PCé42, || 360 Edwards - Each
EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal. 0.00
S e e e s by 7 | a0 | oo e
Group 3: Edwards Systems Labor Rates
349 Pr.ovide gdditionol support functions or mo'dificoiions o new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance
with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.
349A ::Jr:n Technician labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per A Edwards N/A Hour
3498 [[Installer labor rate not to exceed $55.00 per hour. - Edwards N/A Hour

Grou

a

Group | Additional Cerberus Pyrofronics Systems

For addifional support functions or modifications to new or existing Edwards Fire Alarm Systems OEM parts may be
350 [required. Bidder(s) shaliindicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price list. A

minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required.

DISCOUNT
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[Bid #032-NN03

METRO
CONTRACTORS
[Bid Tilte: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT *ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
[Buyer: Vanessa Flores PROPOSAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT P;;Ig;::ﬂ PSSE::R P;;'g;::"
GROUP 4: Notifier Systems
ltems 351 through 391 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. ltems 392 to 414 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors shall honor these prices
if addifional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.
351 |[Air Base Elem. J 24 ‘ Nofifier J Notifier AFP 1010 [ Month 00 |3 $435.17 .
352 ||Ammons, Herbert A. Middle J 24 Nofifier 4) Notifier AFP—40ﬂ Month 0.00 $435.17 Il
353 ||Avocado Elem. Jﬂ Notifier 4{ Notifier AFP 1010 1 Month 00 $435}7
354 |[Beckham, Ethel Koger Elem. J 24 Notifier J Notifier AM 2020 ‘ Month Y 543517
_C%Q Bel-Aire Elem. \ 24 Nofifier 4‘ Notifier AFP 1010 \ Month 00
356 |[Biscayne Gardens Elem. ‘ 24 Notifier J Notifier AM 2020 [ Month 00
357 ||Bright, James H. Elem. J 24 Notifier J Notifier AFP-400 } Month 00
358 ||C O P E Center South/Wallace,Dorothy M. J 24 Notifier Nofifier AFP 1010 Month 00
359 ||Central East Transportation & Gas J 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP-200 Month 00
360 ||Chapman, William Elem. 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP <4(M Month 00
361 ||[Earhart, Amelia Elem. 24 Notifier Notifier AFP 20g Month 00
362 ||[Food and Nutrition Building 2 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP-2C£) Month 00
363 ||Gulfstream Elem. 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP \OL) Month 00
364 |Hialeah Middle 24J Nofifier || Nofifier AM 2020:| Month 00
365 ||Hiighland Oaks Middle 24 | Nofiier || Nofifier AF 1010 || Month 00
366 ||Jane Roberts K-8 24 Nofifier T Notfitier NFS 640 Month 0.00
367 |Kendale Lakes Elem. 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP-400 Month 00
368 |[Lakeview Elem. 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP 1010 Month 00
369 ||Leisure City Mobile {HEAD START) 24 N Nofifier J Notifier AFP 100 Month 00
370 ||Little River Elem. | 24 Nofifier J Nofifier AFP 1010 Month 00
371 |IMatericls Mgmt. Central Stockroom J 24 Notifier Nofifier AFP-200 Month 00
372 ||Miami Coral Park Senior J 24 Nofifier Notifier AM ZOZOJ Month 0.00
373 |[Miami Douglas MacArthur South Kitchen J 24 Notifier J Notifier AFP—2(M Monih 00
374 ||Miami Palmetto Senior J 24 Notifier \ Notifier AFP IOQ Month 0.00
375 ||Morgan, Robert Educational Center Sr. J 24 Notifier J Notifier ONXY NFS—6¢ﬂ Month 0.00
North Glade Elem BIE Nofifier | noiier | Mont 00
Olympic Heights Elem. J 24 Notifier 4[ Noitifier AFP 1010 Month 00
Palm Lakes Elem. Jm Nofifier J Nofifier AFP-400 Month 00
Palm Springs Elem. 24 Notifier Notifier AM 200 Month 00
Palm Springs Middle | 24 Nofifier Notifier AM 2020 Month 0.00
Paimetto Middle 24 Notifier Notifier AFP 1010 Month 0.00
382 |lParkway Middle 24 Notifier | Notifier ONYZ NFS-M Month 0.00
383 ||Peskoe, irving & Beatrice Elem. 24 Notifier J Nofifier APF 1010 Month 00
384 |[Pinecrest Elem. 24J Notifier J Nofifier AFP-400 Month 00
385 ||Region Maintenance Center IV 24 Notifier Notifier SFP 10 Um Month 00
386 |[Rockway Elem. 24 Notifier FNoﬁfier AFP 1010 Month 00
387 ||S & D Stores and Mail Distribution 24 Notifier Notifier AFP-200 Month 00
388 |[Stiver Bluff Elem. 24 Notifier Notifier AFP 1010 Month 00
389 [|Springview Elem. 24 Notifier Nofiifier AFP 1010 Month 00
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|;id #032-NNO3

|;id Tile: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT

390 ||Sylvania Heights Elem. 24 Nofifier Notifier AFP 1010 Month

391 [[whithers,Issac A @ Goulds Elem (Head Start) 24 Notifier Notifier AFP 1010 Month
TOTAL GROUP 4

Group 4: Additional Notifier Systems

r METRO
CONTRACTORS

**ADDENDUM

MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL
PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
MONTH MONTH MONTH
00
00
415.00 $0.00

In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretion to add servicing to
392 ||these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain

addifional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.

ITEK-DTK2LVPLY, EDCO-PHC-043 or equal.

392A |[Elementary Schools J Notifier j N/A Month
|
392B||Primary Learning Centers - Notifier N/A Month
392C||Middie Schools - Nofifier - N/A Month
392D||Middle Learning Centers - Notifier N/A Month
392E||Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Nofifier N/A Month
Group 4: Nofifier Systems Miscellaneous Peripheral Material Including Labor
393 |[Addressable Smoke Detector 200 J Nofifier - Each
394 ||Addressable Heat Detector SOJ Notifier | - Each
395 ||Addressable Manual Station lo(ﬂ Nofifier :} - Each
396 ||Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 Notfifier J - Each
397 ||Non-Addressable Heat Detector | 50 Notifier J - Each
398 ||Non-Addressable Manual Station J 100 Notifier J - Each
399 ||Protective Cover Manuail Station 100 Notfifier - Each
400 ||Protective Cover Horn/Strobe 300 Notifier - Each
401 |[visual Strobe 100 Notfifier - Each
402 ||Hom 100 Notifier - \ Each
403 ||Horn/Strobe J 500 Notifier - Each
404 ||Magnetic Door Holder J 50 Notifier J - Each
405 |[Detector Base Assembly J 30 Nofifier - Each
406 ||Back Box Manuail Station J 25 Notifier - Each
Back Box Horn/Strobe J 25 Notifier J - Each
Wwire/Cable Indoor J 2500 Nofifier J - Each
Wire/Cable Outdoor Wet Location - West Penn J 2500 Notifier ‘ - ‘ Each
Input A/C power surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-120 HW, 1 - ;
EDCO-HSP121BT-1RU o equal. 75 Nofifier Fach
Initiating Device Circuits {IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits |
(SLC} surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLV, EDCO-PCé642, || 360 Nofifier - Each
EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal.
412 ”gohﬁcchon Appliance Circuits {NAC) surge suppresser, 260 Nofifier ; Each

Group 4: Notifier Systems Labor Rates

413

with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.

413A Alarm Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per ; Nofifier T N/A Hour
hour.
413B |[Installer labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. - Notifier N/A Hour

Group 4: Percent Discount off List

For additional support functions or modifications to new or existing Notfifier Fire Alarm Systems OEM parts may be

minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required.

414 |required. Bidder(s} shallindicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price list. A

Page 13
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||Bid # 032-NNO3

"Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Qry MANUFACTURER

MODEL

UNIT

PRICE PER
MONTH

PRICE PER
MONTH

PRICE PER

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

MONTH

GROUP 5: Faraday Systems

Items 415 through 433 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. items 43 to 455 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors shall honor these prices if
additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.

415 ||Banyan Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
416 ||Coconut Grove Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
417 |[Comstock Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
418 ||Edelman, Gertrude K./Sabal Palm Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000A
419 ||[English Center 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
420 ||Fire Prevention Shop 24 Faraday Faraday Firewalch Il + 2
421 ||G. I. U. M-DCPS Police Dept. 24 Faraday Faraday Firewatch i + 2
422 ||Henry, S./ West Laboratory Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
423 j|Lee, J. R. E. Educational Center 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
424 |[Madison Middle 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
425 ||North Miami Elem. 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000
426 |[Northwest Center Transportation 24 Faraday Faraday Firewatch Il + 2
427 ||Plant Operations 24 Faraday Faraday Firewatch Il + 2
428 ||Police Dept. MDCPS 24 Faraday Faraday Firewatch Il + 2
429 (Readlands Learning & Labor Camp 24 Faraday Foraday 2+2
430J Region Maintenance Center lll Building #2 24 Faraday Faraday Firewatch Il + 2
431 fRegion Maintenance Center it Instructional 24 Faraday Faraday Firewalch fi + 2
432 [[The 500 Role Model Academy 24 Faraday Faraday MPC 2000A
TOTAL GROUP 5

Group 5: Additional Faraday Systems

$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$300.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00
$275.00

$275.00
$300.00

In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretion to add servicing to
433 (these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain
additional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.

433A||Elemenic|ry Schools - Faraday N/A Month
433B||Primary Learning Centers - Faraday N/A Month
433C||Middie Schools - Faraday N/A Month
433D|Middle Learning Centers - Faraday N/A Month
433E||Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Faraday N/A Month
Group 5: Faraday Miscellaneous Peripheral Material Including labor
434 ||Addressable Smoke Detector 200 Faraday - Each
435 | Addressable Heat Detector 50 Faraday - Each
436 ||Addressable Manual Station 100 Faraday | - Each
437 |[Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 Faraday - Each
438 | Non-Addressable Heat Detector 50 Faraday - Each
439 [Non-Addressable Manual Station 100 Faraday - Each
440 ||Protective Cover Manual Station 100 Faraday - Each
441 ||Protective Cover Horn/Strobe 300 Faraday - J Each
442 ||Visual Strobe 100 Faraday - Each
443 |[Horn 100 Faraday - Each
444 |Horn/Strobe 500 Faraday - Each
445 |IMagnetic Door Holder 50 Faraday - Each
446 ||Detector Base Assembly 30 Faraday - Each
447 ”Bock Box Manuail Station 25 Faraday - Each
448 ||Back Box Horn/Strobe 25 Faraday - Each
449 |Wire/Cable Indoor 2500 Faraday - Each
450 [[Wire/Cable Outdoor Wet Location - West Penn 2500 Faraday - Each
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METRO
. CONTRACTORS
H;id Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT © BASS UNITED . **ADDENDUM
> :|| MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

H;id #032-NNO3

I;uyer: Vanessa Flores

PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT MONTH MONTH

Input A/C power surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-120 HW, 75

451 EDCO-HSP121B8T-1RU or equal.

Faraday - Each $225.00

Initiating Device Circuits {IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits
452 ||(SLC} surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLY, EDCO-PC642, || 360 Faraday - Each \

EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal. $150.00

Notification Appliance Circuits (NAC) surge suppresser, 360 Faraday ) Each

453 DITEK-DTK2LVPLY, EDCO-PHC-043 or equai. $150.00

Group 5: Faraday Systems Labor Rates

Provide additional support functions or modifications to new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance
with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.

454

454A|Alarm Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per hour. - Faraday N/A Hour
4548 [[Installer labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. - Faraday N/A Hour ‘
Group 5: Percent Discount off List

For additional support functions or modifications to new or existing Faraday Fire Alarm Systems OEM parts may be
455 |[required. Bidder(s} shallindicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price list. A
minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required.
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lBid # 032-NNO3

UBid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QrY

MANUFACTURER

MODEL

UNIT

PRICE PER
MONTH

PRICE PER

METRO
CONTRACTORS
*“*ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

MONTH

PRICE PER
MONTH

GROUP &: Multiple System Locations One Price Per School

[Ash Bowmen F. Elem. Simplex 4100
456 24 Multiple Systems
/Ash Bowmen F. Elem. PLC {N] Pyro MXL IQ
Bryan W. J. Elem. Notifier AFP 1010
457 24 Multiple Systems
Bryan W. J. Elem. PLC ] Pryo MXLIQ
Carver, G. W. Middle MLC [NN] Pyro MXL-IQ
458 24 Multiple Systems
Carver, George Washington Middle Faraday MPC 2000
De Leon, Ponce Middle Simplex 4100-8001
459 24 Multiple Systems
De Leon, Ponce Middle MLC [JJ) Pyro MXL-IQ
Everglades Elem. MLC [BB) Pyro MXL-IQ
460 24 Multiple Systems
Everglades K-8 Center Notifier AFP-400
Greynolds Park Elem. Simplex 4020
461 24 Multiple Systems
Greynolds Park Elem. PLC Pyro MXL-1Q
Hialeah Annex{GGG) Senior Edwards EST-2
462 24 Multiple Systems
Hialeah Senior Simplex 4002-8001
lves, Madie Elem, Pyro MXL
24 Multiple Systems
”Ives, Madie Elem. PLC (M) Simplex 4010
hKenwood Elem. Simplex 4020
464 24 Multiple Systems
Kenwood Elem. M L C {CC) Pyro MXL-IQ
Kinloch Park Elem. MLC (MM) Pyro MXL-IQ
465 24 Multiple Systems
Kinloch Park Middle Nofifier AFP 1010
Leewood K-8 Center Pyro MXL
466 24 Multiple Systems
Leewood Modular Kitchen Simplex 4100U
Marti, Jose Middle Pyro MXL 1Q
4467 24 Multiple Systems
Marti, Jose Middle Clinic Faraday Firewatch i + 2
Miami Killian Senior Notifier AFP 1010
468 24 Multiple Systems
Miami Killian Senior (New Building) Pyro MXL
Miami Lakes Elem. PLC L Simplex 4020-8001
469 24 Multiple Systems
Miami Lakes K-8 Center Pyro MXL
Milam, M. A, K-8 Center Notifier APF 1010
470 24 Multiple Systems
Milam, M. A. K-8 Center MLC Pyro MXL
Ojus Elem. Pyro MXL
471 24 Multiple Systems
Ojus Elem. {New Building) Simplex 4100
Porter,Gilbert Elem. Simplex 4100
472 24 Mulliple Systems
Porter,Gilbert Elem. PLC (Q) MXLIQ
Roberts, Jane K-8 Center Notfifier
473 24 Multiple Systems
Roberts, Jane S. Elem. M L C (EE) Pyro MXL-IQ
Shenandoah Middle Notifier AFP 1010
474 24 Multiple Systems
Shenandoah Middle MLC (HH) Pyro MXL-IQ
South Miami Senior Pyro MXL
475 24 Multiple Systems
South Miami Senior (New Building) Simplex 4100
Southwest Miami Senior Edwards EST 3
476 24 Muitiple Systems
Southwest Miami Senior (New) Pyro MXL
TOTAL GROUP &

GROUP 4: Additional Multiple System Locations

items 455 through 476 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. ltems 477 to 499 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors hall honor these prices if
additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid alt items.

$310.00

$310.00

$400.00

$400.00

$310.00

$310.00

$450.00

$310.00

$310.00

$400.00

$310.00

$400.00

$450.00

$310.00

$400.00

$310.00

$310.00

$400.00

$400.00

$475.00

$475.00

$7,750.00

$0.00
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|Bid # 032-NNO3 METRO
CONTRACTORS
IBid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT **ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
MONTH MONTH MONTH

{TEM DESCRIPTION QrTY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT

In the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses at its sole discretion to add servicing to
477 |these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain
additional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.

477A[Elementary Schools - || Muttiple Systems N/A Month lm ' $350.00
4778 ||Primary Learning Centers - Multiple Systems N/A Month KO
477C||Middie Schools - Multiple Systems N/A Month JEEEFLI]
477D ||Middle Learning Centers - Multiple Systems N/A Month $375.00
477E||Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Multiple Systems N/A Month § $500.00
GROUP 6: System Locations Miscellaneous Peripheral Material Including labor ' -

478 ||JAddressable Smoke Detector 200 Multiple Systems - Each S EAR
479 |[Addressable Heat Detector 50 Multiple Systems - LW $177.00
480 |[Addressable Manual Station 100 Mulliple Systems - Each . $177.00
481 ||Non-Addressable Smoke Detector 100 Muttiple Systems - Each $125.00
482 |INon-Addressable Heat Detector 50 Multiple Systems - Each | $100.00
483 ||Non-Addressable Manual Station 100 Multiple Systems - Each $100.00
484 ||Protective Cover Manual Station IOOJ Multiple Systems B - Each $150.00
485 ||Protective Cover Horn/Strobe 30(ﬂ Multiple Systems - Each ST
486 ||Visual Strobe 100 Multiple Systems - Each - $125.00
487 ((Hom 100 Multiple Systems - Each $100.00
488 ||Horn/Strobe 500 Multiple Systems - Each $175.00
489 |[Magnetic Door Holder 50 Multiple Systems - Zelchl  $225.00
490 ||Detector Base Assembly 30 Multiple Systems - Each ;‘ $45.00
491 |Back Box Manual Station 25 Multiple Systems - Each | $45.00
492 |[Back Box Horn/Strobe 25 Multiple Systems - Each $45.00
493 ||Wire/Cable Indoor 2500 Multiple Systems - Each .40 PER FT
494 |\Wire/Cable Cutdoor Wet Location - West Penn 2500 || Multiple Systems - Zelel) .50 PER FT
495 g‘gggﬁ;‘]’;m_’.f&g; seu(;’uporfsser' DITEK-DTK-120 HW. 75 || Multiple Systems - Each (NS

Initiating Device Circuits (IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits i
496 ||{SLC) surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLY, EDCO-PCé42, || 360 Multiple Systems - Each |

EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal. | $150.00
17 ttcomoseptoce crean ) wge oot | g | oo | | coon [

GROUP 6: Muitiple System Locations Labor Rates

Provide additional support functions or modifications to new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance

478 with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.

498A |[Alarm Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per hour. - Multiple Systems N/A Hour §

4988 |[Installer iabor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. - Multiple Systems N/A Hour |

GROUP é: Percent Discount off List

For additional support functions or modifications to new or existing Two System Locations OEM parts may be
499 |([required. Bidder(s) shallindicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price list. A :
minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required. | DISCOUNT

Page 17 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)



IBid # 032-NNO3

“Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Qry

MANUFACTURER

MODEL

UNIT

PRICE PER
MONTH

METRO
CONTRACTORS
**ADDENDUM
MISSING FROM
PROPOSAL

PRICE PER

MONTH

PRICE PER
MONTH

GROUP 7: Miscellaneous Systems

additional support functions or modifications are requested by M-DCPS. Vendors must bid all items.

NO BIM

Items 500 through 516 to be awarded on a total low bid basis. items 517 to 539 will not be used to calculate bid award however, awarded vendors hall honor these prices if

NOBD |

additional fire alarm systems in accordance with the attached specifications.

517A|[Elementary Schools T - 1 wisc. systems NA || Month|
517B|[Primary Learning Centers - Misc. Systems N/A Month 1
517C||Middle Schools - Misc. Systems N/A Month 1
517D||Middle Leaming Centers - Misc. Systems N/A Month |
517E||Senior-Vocational Technical Schools - Misc. Systems N/A

Month 3

GROUP 7: Miscellaneous System Locations, Miscel

llaneous Peripheral Material including Labor

518 |[Addressable Smoke Detector ‘ 200 Misc. Systems - Each
519 ||Addressable Heat Detector 50 Misc. Systems - Each
520 ||Addressable Manual Station m Misc. Systems - ‘ Each
521 JNon-AddressobIe Smoke Detector 100 Misc. Systems - 1 Each
522 |[Non-Addressable Heat Detector j 50 Misc. Systems - W Each
523 ||Non-Addressable Manual Station [ 100 Misc. Systems - Each
524 |Protective Cover Manual Station o 100 Misc. Systems - Each
525 ||Protective Cover Horn/Strobe 300 Misc. Systems - Each
526 [|Visual Strobe N 100 Misc. Systermns - Each
527 |[Hom 100 Misc. Systems - Each |
528 ||Homn/Strobe T 500 Misc. Systems - Each
529 ||Magnetic Door Holder 50 Misc. Systems - Each
530 ||Detector Base Assembly 30 Misc. Systems - Each §
531 ||Back Box Manuai Station 25 Misc. Systems - Each
532 ||Back Box Horn/Strobe 25 Misc. Systems - Each |
533 ||Wire/Cable Indoor 2500 Misc. Syslerns - Each |

534

Wire/Cable Outdoor Wet Location - West Penn

DSOO

Misc. Systems

Page 18

500 ||Carver, George Washington Elem. 24 ‘ Misc. Systems ‘ FC1 7100 Month 00.00
501 ||Central West Transportation .i‘ Misc. SysfemsT FCI 7100 Month 00
502 ||Coral Gables Sr. 25 Misc. Systems FCIE-3 Month 0.00
503 ||Cypress Elem. 24 Misc. Systems FCI 7100 Month 00.00
504 ||Drew, Charles R. Elem. 24 Misc. Systems FCIES Month 00.00
505 ||Drew, Charles R. Middle 24 Misc. Systems ’7 FCIE3 Month 0.00
506 ||Glades Middle 24 Misc. Systems FCI17200 Month 0.00
507 |[King, Martin Luther Elem. 24 Misc. Systems \ Silent Knight 5820 || Month 00.00
508 [Meadowlane Elem. 24 Misc. Systems FCI7100 Month 00.00
509 ||Miami Sunset Senior 24 Misc. Systems FC! 7100 Month 450.00
510 ||Redlands Zoo Magnet T Misc. Systems Fci Month 00.00
511 ||Region Maintenance Center V Instructional j 24 Misc. Systems Firelite MS-5210 Month 00
512 |Richmond Heights Middle Magnet 24 Misc. Systems Firelite MS-2 Month 00
513 ([South Center Transportation 24 Misc. Systems Napco Magnum 6024 || Month 00
514 |iSouth Dade Adult Educational 24 Misc. Systems Silent Knight 5207 || Month 00
515 [Sunset Elem. 24 Misc. Systems FC-7100 Month 00.00
516 |ffitle | Facility 24 Misc. Systems Bosh Month 00
TOTAL GROUP 7 0.00
GROUP 7: Additional Miscellaneous System Locations
in the event M-DCPS increases the fire alarm systems or number of facilities, and chooses ot its sole discretion to add servicing to
517 ||these systems, the vendor shall: Provide all labor, materials and equipment necessary to test, service, inspect and maintain

$350.00
$300.00
$400.00

$375.00
$450.00 !

$160.00
$140.00
$125.00 ‘
$100.00 |
$80.00
$100.00
$150.00
$150.00
$100.00
$90.00
$175.00
$225.00
$45.00
$45.00
$45.00
40 PER FT

.50 PER FT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID |

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$0.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID |

NOBID |

NO BID 1

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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|Bid # 032-NN0O3

METRO

CONTRACTORS
“Bid Title: FIRE ALARM SERVICES CONTRACT BASS UNITED **ADDENDUM
5 MISSING FROM
Buyer: Vanessa Flores ‘ PROPOSAL
i ! ;
PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
EM DESCRIPTION QrY MANUFACTURER MODEL UNIT MONTH MONTH
Input A/C power surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-120 HW, . B
535J EDCO-HSP121BT-1RU of equdl. 75 Misc. Sysiems BRall  $5225.00 NO BID
Initiating Device Circuits (IDC)/Signaling Line Circuits
536 ||(SLC) surge suppresser, DITEK-DTK-2LVLPLV, EDCO-PC642, || 360 Misc. Systems - Each
EDCO series SLCP-30 or equal. $150.00 NO BID
Nofification Appliance Circuits (NAC]) surge suppresser, . 3
337 | DITEK-DTK2LVPLY, EDCO-PHC-043 or equdl. 360 || Misc. Systems Mgl 515000 NO BID
GROUP 7: Miscellaneous System Locations Labor Rates
538 Provide additional support functions or modifications to new or existing systems that may be requested by M-DCPS, in accordance
with section 3.6 of the attached specifications.
Alarm Technician labor rate not to exceed $75.00 per . .
538AJ hour. - Misc. Systems N/A Hour § $75.00
5388 [|Installer labor rate not to exceed $65.00 per hour. - Misc. Systems N/A Hour : $65.00
GROUP 7: Percent Discount off List
For additional support functions or modifications to new or existing Miscellaneous System Locations OEM parts may
539 (lbe required. Bidder(s} shall indicate the percent of discount off the manufacturer's most recent published price list. 30% | 30%
A minimum of 30% off the most recent OEM published list price is required. DISCOUNT

Bidder should use the following checklist to assist in bid
submission including but not limited to:

Bid Proposal Form Price Sheets Completed

Bidders Qualification Form Signed

Addendum Form

Local Vendor Affidavit

Valid M-DCPS Contractor Prequalification Certificate

Fire Protection System Contractor | or Il Cerlificate

Insurance Documentation

List of emergency telephone numbers

List of technicians with qualifications and training certificates

Occupational License

Two (2) Reference Letters

Vendor Information Sheet
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DISCOUNT |
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