Verified By: M. Larger

				AFP INDUSTRIES, INC			ALLIED PAPER CO.			DADE PAPER & BAG CO			DAXWELL			
					Unit = Case			Unit = Case			Unit = Case			Unit = Case		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Estimated Quantity	lawaya -	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Priçe	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	
1	Toilet tissue, paper, 1 ply,	12,240	Case	\$32.72	\$400,492.80	STEFCÖ 11233 1000SHTS/96 ROLLS	10 10000	1 1212 2	ROSES A R- 91197 1000SHTS/96 ROLLS/40%CW/	\$29.76	\$364,262.40	SCA TS1636S DP#372012 Does Not Comply	\$29.95	\$366,588.00	DAXWELL #D10002191 Does Not Comply	
2	Towels, paper, singlefold	54600	Case	\$0.00	20.00	NO BID	\$16.88	\$921,648.00	WAUSA 01-2117 47000	\$12.40	\$677,040.00	SCA SKI850A DP#345999 Does Comply	\$0.00	00.02	NO BID	
3	Towels, paper, bath	3000	Case	\$0.00	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	NO BID	S48.86	\$146,580.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	иови	

		1		EDWA	RD DON COM	PANY CO	EXCESS PAPER TOWELS, LLC			FAY	CROFT INT	ERIOR	IDEAL SUPPLY, INC		
		1	1		Unit = Case			Unit = Case		Unit = Case			Unit = Case		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	UNIT	UNIT	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model
1	Toilet tissue, paper, 1 ply,	12,240	Case	\$32.07	\$392,536.80	SCA TS1636S Does Not Comply	\$33.75	\$413,100.00	As specified USI/Gen XS Paper 215 Does Not Comply	\$35.51	\$434,642.40	SCA TS1636S DP#372012	\$31.05	\$380,052.00	ATLASPAPE R Green Heritage #125 Does comply.
2	Towels, paper, singlefold	54600	Case	\$12.47	\$680,862.00	SCA SK 1850A	S12.42	\$678,132.00	As specified EPT/PENNY LANE PNL #115138210Does Comply	\$14.50   	\$791,700.00	SCA SKI850A DP#345999	\$12.94	\$706,524.00	
3	Towels, paper, bath	3000	Case	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	\$53.37	\$160,110.00	As specified	\$52,98	\$158,940.00	GEORGIA PACIFIC# 80540	\$0.00	\$0.00	NO BID

			IDEAL SUPPLY, INC Alternate			LACE FOOD SERVICE CORP.			REX CHEMICAL CORP.			TOTAL PACK INC			
	2			Unit = Case			Unit = Case			Unit = Case			Unit = Case		
ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM		UNIT	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model
1	Toilet tissue, paper, 1 ply,	12,240	Case	\$30.38	\$371,851.20	CASCADE TISSUE #4024 Does Not Comply			SUBMITTED WRONG PRODUCT FOR THIS ITEM	\$35.48	\$434,275.20	BAY WEST #14000	\$38.00	\$465,120.00	STEFCO HEAVENL Y SOFT #11233
2	Towels, paper, singlefold	54,600	Case	\$0.00	\$0.00	NOBID	\$17.72	\$967,512.00	GEORGIA PACIFIC #26301	\$12.52	\$683,592.00	BAY WEST #47000	\$0.00	\$0.00	NOBID
3	Towels, paper, bath	3,000	Case	\$0.00	\$0.00	NOBID	\$47.42	\$142,260.00	GEORGIA PACIFIC# 80540	\$0.00	\$0,00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	NOBID

Page 1

## The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Bid #001-NN05 Paper Goods, Custodial

Verified By: M. Larger

**********				ARCHE	M INTERNA Unit = C	TIONAL CORP	EXPRESS PAPER CO Unit = Case			
ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Est. Qty.	UNIT	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	
1	Toilet tissue, paper, 1 ply,	12,240	Case	\$38.50	\$471,240.00	HEAVENLY SOFT SOFIDEL AMERICAL #11233	\$39.95	\$488,988.00	BT 145	
2	Towels, paper, singlefold	54,600	Case	\$17.40	\$950,040,00	#55602		\$0.00	LEFT BLANK	
3	Towels, paper,	3,000	Case		\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	LEFT BLANK	

				CEN	ITRAL POLY	BAG CORP	DISTRICT HEALTH CARE Unit = Case				
r					Unit = C	ase					
ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	Estimated Quantity	UNIT	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model	Unit Price	Total Price	Manuf & Model		
1	Toilet tissue, paper, 1 ply,	12,240	Case	\$33,99	\$416,037.60	WHITEOFF	\$31.18 I	\$381,643.20	ATLAS PAPER MILLS #125		
2	Towels, paper, singlefold	54,600	Case	\$14.88	`\$812,448.00	PUTNEY #P600		\$0.00	NO BID		
3	Towels, paper,	3,000	Case		\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	NO BID		

PRIMARY

ALTERNATE