BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

*iiem 5 will be rejecled due o blds subm#ted nol meeling specificafions ond olternate submiflals with
excessive pricing. llem will be quoled out lo preapproved vendors on this bid.

FIA-3733 Rev, [05-55)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Containers
ALL FLORIDA PAPER - M/WBE and Local Vendor DADE PAPER & BAG CO. - Local Vendor
Buyer Vanessa Flores
seclion I: For llems 1 fhrough 8 an award wil be made per ltem as Esled below. The bid may be awarded o two [2) responsive and respensible vendors (Primary and Allernate), offering the lowest price and meeling allrequrements. The
Esl. Qty Manuf Location . § Direct 2 S Direct
| Manuf- Total Qty | Delivery S Defivery - Manuf- Manuf Locafion (Us | Total Qty | Delivery S Delivery
Item#| M-DCPS# Item Desciription for2 | Unit Model # (US manuf Delivery lo Model # Delivery to
Tii W " uf pref )
Years acturer prefened) Per Case | Timelame | o SSDWH | 0 - L o aclurer manuf preferred) | Per Case | Timeframe | fo SEDWH [ . 5 00
Tray. | compartment, Polyshtene.
Insulated Base, Color black
. N . HOPEHULL, AL
v | 20003a1 [ApProsmately 8778 x 105787 x1- 3200 | O BID NO BID GENPAK | Z00T-3L | o ARLOMIE, NC; 250 | 7-14DAYS NO BID
1/4", Case of 250 recommended. Cases DP#244024 SEBRING, FL
Approved Brand|s): Genpak 50010-3L !
or Equal
Tray. 3 compartment, Polyshyrene,
Insutated Base, Color black HOPEHULL, AL:
Approxmately 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x 1- 5.500 50030-3L !
2| 2000429 |0 Case of 250 recommended. Cases 5500 HO BID HOBIE GENFAR | ppgzas0z0 CHSJ:::]‘LT:;:C 250 7+14 DAYS KO-8ID
Approved Brand|s): Genpak 50310-3L )
or Equal
Ud, cleor fits item #1 and #2
Approximately 9-3/8" x 7-3/8" x 1-1/4", 7.000 74500 HOPEHULL, AL
3 2000342 |Case of 250 recommended. C.nses Each HO BID HO BID GENPAK DPE246022 CHARLOTIE, NC; 250 7 - 14 DAYS HO BID
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 94500 SEBRING. FL
Clear fd or Equal
Dish Tray, Polyshrene construction,
square, overol lengih and width corz:j\ffg?&(;&
4 | 2000114 |oPProxmalely % notto exceed 4- 1200 | o | pactiv | orF10150 | covinGTON, HJ 1000 1-2 WEEKS 0.01530 [ 0.01530 | PACOV OTF10150 | CANANDAGUA, RY;| 1000 7- 14 DAYS NO BID
1/2", Color white, Case of 1000 Cases FRANKFURT, IL:
FECOmimeriden. BAKERSFIELD, CA
Approved Brand|s): Genpak 1001 or
Container, no compariment,
Polyslyrene foam. No compariment, COVINGIOHN, GA:
Kedium with Hinged [id. To be used TEMPLE, TX;
800 -
s | 2000307 |for hot or cold tems, Appraximately §- | - * | Each| PACTIV Yrmagnwuu COVINGION, HJ | 150 1-2wEEks | § o.0ssso| s 005890 | PACTIV "D‘;::;;’m CANANDAGUA NY;| 150 | 7-14DAYS |5 0.0634 NO BID
1/2" x 8-3/4", Case of 200 - FRANKFURT, I
recommended. BAKERSAELD, CA
Approved Brandl(s): Genpak SN240 or
Tray. 5 compariment. Polystyrene with
a minimum .140" gauge. Approxmate
weight 10.2 groms per fray. Color COVINGTON, GA:
lack, Clear of imprints, Approximately| 194,000 YTHEOS00MM Y180500DP382 TEMPLE, TX:
'3 2000411 10° x 8" x 1", Packed in cardooard Cases Each | PACTIV K COVINGTOHN, NJ 500 1-2 WEEKS 0.03050 0.03050 FACTIV 015 CANANDAGUA, NY; 7 - 14 DAYS NO BID
carfons, Case of 500 recommended. FRANKFURL IL
BAKERSFIELD, CA
Approved Brond(s): Pachv
YTHEOS00NMLK or Equal.
Tray, 3 Comporiment wilh Hinged Ud, COVIHGIOHN, GA;
Polyshrense Foom, Side Closed, 8.050 YID1$903EC TEMPLE, TX:
7 | 2000293 |psactium Size. Approximately 7 x9.4°x | cores | Eoch | PACHYV |V NEEE | covingTon Ny [ 150 | 12 WEEKS 5 oos7as| eacmv [TOITOSOF| cananDAGUA NY;| 200 | 7-14DAYS D.04 HO BID
3'_Case of 200 recommended FRAMKFURT, IL;
Approved Brand(s): EC Pock 93200 or BAKERSFIELD, CA
Breakiost Tray - 6" x 7.5 x .875"; 16~
poinl Clay Coated Board, printed
8 HEw  [one/iwo color, Imprnt to read 10090 1eaen| sar 8412 SCOTIA, NY 500 1-2 WEEKS 00502 0.0502
“Breakfasi — Fuel for School” Case of Cases 3 ’ b OBl HO Bl
M0 re~amrasnded
Approved Brond(s): Cedar Grove or
Pog=1




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Conlainers

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

Section I: For ltems 1 through 8 an award wil k pimary awardee wil be conlacted for all orders. If the primary awardee fols lo perform under the terms and condifions of the contract, the Allemale awardee will then be contach

RESPONSIVE

DISTRICT HEALTHCARE & JANITORIAL SUPPLIES - M/WBE and Local Vendor ***NON-

EDWARD DON COMPANY - Local Vendor

item#

M-DCPS#

Itemn Descripfion

Est. Qby
for 2
Years

Unit

Manuf-
aciurer

Model #

Manuf Localion
(US manul
prefemed)

Tolal Qly
Per Case

Delivery
Timeframe

§ Direct
Delivery fo
Each Localion

$ Delivery
lo S&D WH

Manul-
aclurer

Model #

_Manut Llocation
(US manul
preferred)

Total Qly
Per Case

Delivery
Timeframe

2000341

Tray. 1 comporiment, Polyshyrene,
Insulated Base, Color black
Approximately 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x I-
1/4", Case of 250 recommended.

3,200
Cases

Approved Brond(s): Genpak S0010-3L
or Equal

Each

GEHPAK

50010-3L

48 HOURS

$ 0a280(% 0.2320

GENPAK

50010-3L

UsA

250

2 -3 WEEKS

2000429

Tray. 3 comporiment, Polyshyrene,
Insuioted Base, Color black,
Approxmalely 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x 1-
1/4", Case of 250 recommended.

5.500
Cases

Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50310-3L
or Equal

Eoch

GENPAK

50310-3L

48 HOURS | §

0.1280

w

0.2320

GENPAK

50310-3L

USA

250

2 -3 WEEKS

2000342

Lid, clear fits ltem #1 and #2.
Approximately 9-3/8" x 7-3/8" x 1-1/4",
Case of 250 recommended.

7.000
Cases

Approved Brond(s): Genpak 94500
Clear id or Equol

Each

GENPAK

94500

48 HOURS | §

01770 | $ 0.2800

GENPAK

74500

USA

2 - 3 WEEKS

2000114

Dish Tray. Polyshrene construction.
square, overal length and widih
approximately 4", not o exceed 4-
1/2", Color white. Case of 1000
recommended.

1,200
Cases

Approved Brond(s): Genpak 1001 or

Each

HO BID NO BID

GENPAK

1001

USA

4 WEEKS

$ Delivery
to S&D WH

S

0.0193

$ Direct
Delivery to

Each Localion

HO BID

HO BID

HO BID

HO BID

5*

2000307

Conla'ner, no compartment,
Polyshyrene foam, No compartment,
Medium with Knged lid. To be used
for hot or cold Hems, Approximately 9-
1/2" x 8-3/4", Case of 200
recommended.

Cases

Approved Brand(s): Genpak $N240 or

Each

GENPAK

SH240

4B HOURS | §

0.0868 | 5 0.2148

GENPAK

SH240

USA

2 - 3 WEEKS

$

0.0748

KO BID

2000411

Tray. 5 compariment. Polyshyrene vilh
a minfmum .140" gauge, Approxmate
welght 10.2 grams per fray. Color
black. Clear of imprinls, Approxmately
10" x 8" x 1", Packed in cardboard
carfons. Case of 500 recommended.

196,000
Cases

Approved Brond(s): Pactiv
YTHBOSO0ONMLK or Equal

Each

HO BlD HO BID

NO BID

HO BID

2000293

Tray, 3 Compartment with Hinged Ud,
Polystyrene Foom, Side Closed.
Medium Sze, Approximately §* x9.4"x
3" Cose of 200 recommended

8,050
Cases

Approved Brand(s): EC Pack $3200 or

Each

PsT

010395

DOMINICAN
REPUBLIC

200

48 HOURS | §

0.0700 | § 0.2000

HO BID

RO BID

HEW

Breakfast Tray - 6" x 7.5" x .875"; 18-

point Clay Coated Boord. printed

one/hwo color, Imprint to read

"Breakfast — Fuel for School” Case of
Aard

10,000
Cases

500
Approved Rrand(s): Cedar Grove or

Each

RO BID HO BlD

HO BID

HO BID

Pog=2

FM-3733 Rev. {0458]



BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid # 034-NN03 Food Service Trays and Contalners

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

FAYCROFT INTERIOR & PURCHASING, INC. - M/WBE and Local Vendor

PEMICA, INC. - Local Vendor

seclion I: For llems 1 through 8 an award will Bd. Eslimaled Quanlities noted below are for a 2 year period and ore fisted for bidder's guidance only. Please refer to Spaciol Cenditions £15 for further detats.

Est. Qly Manuf Localion $ Direct Manuf Localion $ Direcl
: Manuf- Total Qty | Delivery S Delivery 5 Manut- Total Qty | Delivery |5 Delivery to|
e M-DCPSE lenyDgscrpiion :,:::s Uni aclurer Modet# g:;:::; Per Case | Timeframe | to S&D WH Echi:Toegu;l?on aclurer Hedel s g:'?;:; Per Case | Timehame SLD WH Eaiilf{:&:l%n
Tray. 1 compartment, Polystyrene,
opraimordy &7/ s 10.5/6"x1. | 3200 HOPERALL AL
1 2000347 |APProYimately 8-7/8" x 10-5/8° x i Each | GENPAK | 50010-32 | CHARLOTIE, NV; 250 7-14DAYS [§  0.1300 NO BID GENPAK | 50010-3L |GLENS FALLS, NY| 250 $ 01780 § 0.1980
1/4", Case of 250 recommended. Cases SEBRING, FL
Approved Brond|s): Genpak 50010-3L
of Equal
Tray. 3 comporiment, Pelystyrene,
Insulated Base. Color black,
s s . . . HOPEHALL, AL;
2 | z00042¢ ';"zﬁl“::";':‘::’f';;ifc % 'D'Sfd:d‘.' é:?; fach | GENPAK | 5031032 c:;?:;ﬁeréa;:v; 250 7-14DAYS |5 0.1300 HO BID GENFAK | 50310.3L [GLENS FAUS, NY| 250 s 01720 5 0.1850
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 50310-3L '
or Equal
Ud, clear fits ltem #1 ond #2
Approxmalely 9-3/8" x 7-3/8" x 1-1/4", 7.000 HOPEHALL, AL
3 2000342 |Case of 250 recommended. C'clses Each | GENPAK 4500 CHARLOTIE, HV; 250 7-14DAYS | § 0.1800 NO BID GENPAK 74500 GLENS FALLS, NY 250 -] 0.2030| § 0.2z210
Approved Brand(s): Genpak 94500 SERRING, FL
Clearid or Equal
Dish Tray, Polystyrene construction.
, OVe - and widih
suf;:m-?-.alﬂ . | vam COMNETON, GA;
4 | 2000114 [PPPIORT . Eoch [ PACTIV | 07F-Y015D TEMPLE, TX: 1000 | 7-14DAYS |5 0.1928 HO BID GENPAK | 1001 | GLENS FALLS, NY| 1000 s 003925 0.049%
1/2", Color white, Case of 1000 Cases BAKERSFIELD, CA
recommendad.
Approved Brand|s): Genpak 1001 or
Contoiner, no comportmenl,
Polyshrene foam, No compartment,
dedium with Hinged Ed. To be used 800 YID1880 COVINGTON, GA;
§* | 2000307 |for hot or cold items. Approxmalely 9- | o ° | Boch | PACTIV [ i oo, | TEMPLE TX; 150 7-14DAYS | §  0.0800 NO BID GENPAK [ 23000 | GLENS FALS, NY| 200 $  0a7so| § 0.2320
1/2" x 8-3/4*. Case of 200 BAKERSFIELD, CA
recommended.
Approved Brond(s): Genpak SN240 or
Tray, § compartment, Polyshrene with
a minfmum .140" gauge, Approxmate
welght 10.2 groms per tray, Color
black, Clear of imprints, Approximately| 194.000 g HOFEHALL AL
& 2000411 10" x 8" x 1", Packed in cardooard Coisk Each | GENPAK 10500PH CHARLOTIE, NV; 500 7-14DAYS | § 0.039¢ NO BID PACIHV | YTHB-0500 | LAKEFOREST, IL 500 $ 0.0701 | § 0.0707
cartons, Case of 500 recommendad. SESMNG,EL
Approved Brand|s): Paciiv
YTHBOSOONMLK or Equal.
Tray, 3 Compariment wilh Hnged Lid.
Polystyrene Foam, Side Closed, 8,050 YiDigsoop |COVINGION. GA:
7 2000293 |predum Stze. Approximalely ' x 9.4" x Cases Each | PACTIV 234543 TEMPLE, TX; ] 0.059% HO BID GENPAK 23300 GLENS FALLS, NY 200 $ 01120 § 0.1230
3" Case of 200 recommandad - BAKERSFIELD, CA
Approved Brand|s): EC Pock 93200 or
Breakfost Tray - 6" x 7.5" x B75" 18-
point Clay Coaled Boord, printed S
one/hwo color, Imprint to read 0.000
. NEW | erecifost Fuel for School” Case of | Cases | 0" HE M Howe Ll NO:BID
SN0 ren ndad
Approved Brand(s): Cedar Grove or
Fog=3

FI-3738 Rev. (04-58)




BID PROPOSAL FORM _(FORMAT B) _
Bid # 034-NNO3 Food Service Trays and Containers

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

**NON-RESPONSIVE

' F N ; DISTRICT
Bidder's checklls:,:(f]|fe:1;iiehda:’:?]fjllrd:iasiﬁrmlne award of ALL FLORIDA PAPER DADE P.T:P(ER & BAG HEALTHCARE & E%\‘éﬁ?}\?ﬁfﬁ &F}:;:Zg(:;g::;ﬁllgg PEMICA, INC.
preapp § ; ’ ;
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
Bidders Qualification Form Signed v v v v v v
Vendor Information Sheet v v MISSING v v v
Bid Proposal Form Price Sheets Completed v’ v v v v v
Valid Occupational License/Business Tax License v v MISSING v v v
Valid e-mail address for SAP system communications (i.e. PO's) v v v v v v
Local Business Affidavit of Eligibility YES YES YES YES YES YES
A letter indicating the following: delfivery contact, hoursin
which orders may be placed, deadlines to place orders, and v v MISSING v v v
any other pertinent ordering information
Three (3) commercial references from food service and/or
retail rade customers. This list shall contain contact persons at
each location by name, position and phone number. The v v MISSING v v v
District reserves the right to contact or visit these locations
and/or customers fo evaluate bidder's qualifications.
Proof of volume production capability. list of production & v MISSING 7 v &

location(s), list of warehouse location(s).

Page 1

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




