B10 PROPOSAL FORM [FORMAT B)

Bid No 013-KNJS

Te'e PAINT

Manager || Suzanna F. Lopez

-1 "
. | Akzrnate

Verifed By:

ITEM

M-DCPS
#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.
Qany.

UNIT

Prepared By
/
v

Femmich Inz dba The Pant Spot

0O-Gez Pairt Co

Palmatio Hardware

Urit Price

Tetal Price I Marnd & Madel

A /4

Unit Price

Total Price

Msnuf & Model

Urit Price

Total Price

Maruf & Modsl

Urit Price |

Tetal Price

Manuf & Modz!

'VENDOR SHALL IMDICATE UNIT PRICE, PRODUCT
MANUFACTURER'S HAME AND NFG PART # OF ONE
OF THE LISTED APPROVED BRAND(S) QUOTED IN THE
DESIGHATED SHADED AREA.

'ALSO, INDICATE HERE THE MAKUFACTURER'S
PRODUCT WARRANTY IF GREATER THAN ONE

YEAR

6-Years

2600307

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, YELLOW,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 6, 1 GUCN.
|APPROVED BRANDS: FSPKA MP-9 6 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT htp/imatenia’s dadeschoo!s net
(setect FSPRA Paint Products’ and then "Approved Pant
Produnt Lish)

Approved Brand:
COROHADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC
PAINT # 66

CH

§7245

$4354245
Tra%c Pont 1000 #390
Acryic

s1127

$6,77327

Coronado-Superkote
5000 Acrytic Tra®c
Yetow

51343

$3,07143

Cerenado Pant 66-155

$1077

647277

Coronado 651561

280-0315

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, WHITE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-96, 1 GUICN.
IAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-96 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT hiip imaterials dadzschoo's net
(select FSPMA Paint Products’ and then "Approved Paint
Product List)

|Approved Brand:
(CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC
PAINT # 66

192

CH

HO BID

$11.50

$2.208 00

Coronado-Superkcia
5000 Acryic Tra®c Whis

$1383

$265536

Coronado Pant 65-101

$11.10

$2,13120

Corenada 65.101.1

2800584

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULS!ON BASED, BLUE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-96 1 GLICN.
|APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-96 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT hep Amatenia's dadeschools net
(sefect FSPMA Pard Produtts’ and then ‘Approved Paint
Product Listy

\Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC
PAINT # 65

57

CH

$7245

Tra%e Pont 100% #3940

$4,12965 Acrye

$1030

$587.10

Coronado Superkole
5000 Acrytc Tra%e Blus

$1218

$594 83

Coronado Pamt €6-5160

$978

§557.45

Cerenado 65 5160.1

280-5923

PAINT, PRIMER COATING, LATEX CONDITIONER FOR
CHALKING EXTERIOR SURFACES, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-147,5 GLICN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-14.7 CERTIFIED
BRANKDS LISTED AT hitp /'materia’s dadeschools net
(selzct FSPMA Paint Products’ and then ‘Approved Part
Preduct List)

Approved Brands:

1. CORONADQ ELASTITE 100% ACRYLIC MASONRY
SURFACE CONDITIONER 105511 SEREES

2 FLEX BOM PANTS FLEX-PREP EXTERIOR LATEX
ICHALK CONDITIONER 140 SERIES

3. PPG EXTERIOR ACRYLIC MASONRY SEALER
UCEDD13

CH

KO BID

$56.39

$1691.70

1068-11 Coronado

$57.04

§203320

Corenado Panl 1065-11

$54 61

260-0161

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, EXTER:OR/NTERIOR,
PRIVER/SEALER, FLAT, VWHITE, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER WP-22.4, 5 GLICN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX.
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-22 4 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT http Iimateniz's dadeschoo's net
(select FSPMA Pant Products’ and then "Approved Paint
Presduct List)

Approved Brands:

1. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. LANCO WALL-PREP
ACRYLIC LATEX MOD'FIED PRMER INT/EXT ULTRA
VWHITE VWP-823

2 RICHARD'S - PPS 100% ACRYLIC FSPMA UNIVERSAL
PRIVER/SEALER STA'N KILLER WHITE 7-44
I-SHERVAN-WILLIAMS PREPRITE PROBLOCK INT/EXT
LATEX PRIMER /SEALER VWHITE 851 VW20
4MASTERCHEM INDUSTRIES KILZ PREMUM PRVER
SEALER STA'M BLOCKER INT/EXT \WATER BASE WHITE
B 13041

203

CH

Ti-Gard Pigmented

BH00 Condtionar

$95.60

$2007200

Richards PPS 100% 7-44

$125663

$26,349.44

Richards Paint Mfg Co, Inc
744 \Whie

$1.63530

$19655 00

Coronado 1055115

Richards 7-44

FRLIT35Pey (15-53)



lcomptets name of ti biddae: [ ] P
|Bsd bo._ 013 s
Tita: PANT Prepared By Verfzd By
Wanager | Suzanne F Lopsz
Color Wheel Pants Ferrich Inc. dba The Paril Spot 0-Gez Part Co Pa'metto Hardaare
men | MOEPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM S| v
Urit Price Totsd Price Maruf & Model Una Prica Total Prica Marf & Modzl Unit Price | Total Price Maruf & Maodet Urit Price Tetal Price Maruf & Mods!
PAINT, ACRYLIC BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
WETAL, BLACK, FSPMA CERTIFIED UNDER MP-26 6, 1 1 Coronads Rust Seat B0-1
GUCH LISTED AT htp¥ matena's dadeschodls net &5 cn $000 KO BIO s1872 $1.02960 e B‘;;. 1 szzo4 $121220 Coronado Part £0-2 $17.70 $97350 Ceronado 80 2.1
( sel=ct "FSPMA Pant Products” and then "Approved Paint
Product List)
6 2600142 1
1
Approved Brands:
1.CORONADO - RUST SCAT & £0-1
2 PPG-PITT-TECH # 90-374
3. SHERWIN-WWILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC BSSW10D I
SERIES GLOSS
I
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE. ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO- |
WETAL, OXFORD BROWHN, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER 1 1
MP-26.6.1 GLICH #1600 Agustech DTM Rust Seat §0-1 Oxferd Caronado 1 :
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-266 CERTIFIED 3 cn §24 50 §$931.00 1007 Ac ,.': Eramal $17.39 $460 82 Biown i §$2069 §785.22 §0.178 i 31660 $530 82 Ceronado 801781 I
BRANDS LISTED AT hiip fimateria's dadeschoots net Lictais i i 1
(setect FSPMA Paint Products’ and then ‘Approved Paimt 1 ]
7 | ze0s5787 [Productiisn 1

[Approved Brands:

1. CORONADO - RUST SCAT # £0-1

2. PPG - PITT-TECH # £0-374

3. SHERV/MN-AWILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC BESW 100

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27925, FSPMA CERTIFIED UNDER
LIP-23 6, 5 GLICN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 6 CERTIFIED 224 CH 8000 KO BID KO BID $000 KO BID $000
SRANDS LISTED AT h&p imateria’s dadeschoo!s net
(se'ect TSPMA Pant Products’ and then "Approved Pard
Produst List)

KO BID

. [Approved Brands:

8 260-1958 11 BEHR PREM.UM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER IN
ONE ULTRA PURE WHITE # 6850

2 IBEHR PREM/UM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #5050

3. PPG SPEED HIGH EXTERIOR SEM!-GLOSS LATEX
(WHITEG-S00X)

4 PPG ACRI-PRO 100 S/G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE
RESISTANT PP6030 WHITE

5. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXOA ULTRA PREMIUM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX S/G ENANEL
EXT ULTRAWHITE MA-ES5

PAINT, ALKALI-RESISTANT STA'N BLOCK UNIVERSAL
PRMMER/SEALER, ACRYLIC-BASE, WHITE. FSPMA-
CERTIFIED UNDER MP-33 5, 5 GUICH.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-33 5 CERTIFIED 55 cN 1925 stsars | ZORBUERA23 L gqror | sezeass | SO EmEANISI g0z | ssa0s70 Exitrade past $10530 $5.70150 Coronado 410.155
BRANDS LISTED AT hitp fimateria's dadzszhoo's nel

(se'sct FSPMA Paint Produsts’ and then ‘Approved Pamt

Product List)

9 260-1533 [ Approved Brands:

1. CORONADO - CRYLICOTE GOLD COLLECTION # 410-
1

2 CORONADO - GRIP & SEAL LATEX STAIN KILLER #
116-11

3. LANCO & HARRIS - STAIN KILLER PRIVER INT/EXT 55
ULTRAVWHITE 100% ACRYLIC WP-039

4, PPG -SEAL & GRIP INT/EXT 100% ACRYLIC
UNIVERSAL # 17-921

R S Tty

METAL SURFACE TREATMENT, CONDITIONER, 1 GUICN.

53 cN $18%5 $1,092.10 Sak Rust Primer 52060 1,194 80 OSPHO-0504 $2228 | $120224 DREHO $1590 §92220 %5:"':?

01275
10 5243521

Approved Brand:
OSPHO - 0504 OR EQUAL

MEESES

FMATIS Rey (2554

08-53)




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid No. 013-NNOS

Tre: PAINT

Wanager || Suzarna F Lopez

Prepaced By

Verifi=d By,

ITEM

K-DCPS
#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.
Qary.

T

Color VWhael Parits

Fernich Inc dba The Paint Spot

0-Gee Paint Co

Palmztio Hardware

Urit Price

Tetal Price

Manuf & Model

Urit Price Total Price

Wanuf & Modzl

Unit Price

Total Price

Maruf & Modsl

Urt Price

Total Price

Maruf & Model

260-1214

PAINT, CONCRETE. FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, SEMI
GLOSS GREEN ., 5GUCN

|Approved Brand:

1-COLOR \WHEEL ULTRACRETE HYDROSTRAMN # 3200
CONCRETE STA'N GREEN

2-SHERWAN WILLIAMS MARNE INDUSTRIAL Co. TUF-
TOP WC GREEN /SHERWIN VWILLIAMS #735-3527
3-TUF-TOP - WC 10-XX OR EQUAL

CH

$0.00

KO BID

510459 $3,137.70

TuT Top WC Green

§$14247

$4274.10

Tul-Top
10-045 Green

$12860

$3.853.00

Tuf-Tep
WC 10-045

260-1133

SEALER, MASONARY PATCHING, KN'FE GRADE,
TEXTURED GRADE, NMUST BE MERCURY & LEAD FREE,
1 GUCH.

Approved Brand:

1-SHERWN WILLIAMS MOMENTIVE LIGHTHOUSE
PRODUCTS KOVER KRACK L-400 TEXTUREDSHERWYN
WILLIAMS #125-2663

403

CN

$16.50

$5,649 50

Kerver Krazk
L-400 Lighthouse
Tertured

$14 57 $5871.71

Kover Krack
L-400

HOBID

NO BID

260-0668

SEALER, PRIMER, STA'N BLOCK PIGMENTED, ALKYD,
FLAT, WHITE, 12 OZ SPRAY CH

Approved Brand:
SHERWIN WILLIAMS PROBLOCK PRIVER 141-1659 OR
EQUAL

2459

CH

$000

HO BID

$400 $9,876 00

Kiz Stan Block Alyd
Speay Cans

$0.00

KO BID

$0.00

MO BID

280-1222

PAINT, SPRAY EMAMEL, CHOCOLATE, GLOSS, 10-13 0Z
CH_MMUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

Approved Brand:
1-SHERWNAWILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST #140-05563
2-RUST-OLEUM 249102 OR EQUAL

CN

§280

$24080

Ruslolzum #243102

$1.45 $12470

#55277830 Touch n Tone,

$382

$30272

Rustoteum
249102

$289

$24854

Rusteleun
249102

280-1176

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, CHROME ALUNCRUM, 101302
CM.MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE

Approved Brand:
1-SHERVEN-WILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST # 140-0530 2-
FIXALL 1307 OR EQUAL

CcH

HROBID

$1.45 $377.00

Derusto Touch n Tene
#55273330 Chrome
Alrrinum

$000

KO BID

260-11638

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, GRAY, 10-130Z CN MUST BE
WERCURY AND LEAD FREE

Approved Brand:
1-SHERWMN-WILLIAMS CONTROL RUST # 140-0521
2-FIXALL 1315 OR EQUAL

CN

$717.50

Rustcfeum #187453

$1.45 $28725

Teuch n Tone #5528330
Grey

$000

HOBID

2801257

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, LACQUER, GLOSS, RED, 10-13
OZ CH MUST BE MERCURY AKD LEAD FREE

Approved Brand
1-SHERVAIMN-AWILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST # 140-0543
2-RUST-OLEUM 243525 OR EQUAL

13

CN

KO BID

§$145 $16385

Touch n Tore #35270330)
Ctrry Red

$45556

Rustoleum
243326

$371.77

Rustafeun
243328

260-1231

PANT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, PRIVER, RED , 10-130Z CN
UST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE

Approved Brand:
1-SHERWIN-WILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST 1400553 2-

FIXALL 1319 OR EQUAL

613

CH

$372

$228035

Rustclsun #187439

$314 §1.92482

Rustoteum Parter Touch
Utra 2¢ #249185

HO BID

$0.00

HO BID

FILI73 Pev (25-55)



BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

.r:omp-\ete name of the biddar

Bad No. D13-KNDS

Tite: PAINT

Manager || Suzanre F. Lopez

r===="1
| SrS—— |

Prirnary

Aremate

Prepared By

Verfed By

ITEM

W-DCPS
#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.

Qrny.

uniT

Cclor VWheel Parits

Fernich Inc dba The Pant Spot

O-Gee Part Co

Pa'mzts Hardware

Urid Price

Tetal Price

Manuf & Modl

Uret Price.

Tatsl Price

Manuf & Made!

Urit Price

Tetal Price

Maruf & Modsl

Unit Price

Total Price

Manof & Maodel

260-1249

PAINT, SPRAY ENAMEL, \WHITE, GLOSS, 10-130Z CN
WMUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

'Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1301 OR EQUAL

CN

NOBID

$1.49

$55 52

Teuch n Tons B55274830
Ghass VW

$269

$1.743.12

Rustoleumn
V2403330

HO BID

2601192

PAINT, SPRAY ENAMEL, BLACK, GLOSS, 10-130Z CH.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

iApproved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM V2402 830 OR EQUAL

CH

$270

$2.40030

Rustoleun 87779

$149

$1.324 61

Touch n Tone #55276330,
Gloss Black

$263

$233252

Rustoleun
V2402830

193

$1.769.11

Rustoleun
V240233

21

2606185

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAVEL, DARK BLUE, 10-13 0Z CH,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

Approved Brand:
1-SHERWIN-WILLIAMS KRYLON 816-8779
2-FIXALL 1305 OR EQUAL

67

CH

3000

KO BID

$1.49

Touch n Tore #55200330)
Dark Blue

KO BID

KO BID

22

2800433

PAINT, SPRAY, MARKING, FLOURESCENT ORANGE, 15
‘OZ CN MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

Approved Brands:

1. SHERWANANILLIAMS KRYLON APWWA BRIGHT
(ORANGE #234-6377

2-RUST-OLEUM 2355

3 GRAINGER 6A373 OR EQUAL

443

CHN

$2,01565

Rustoteun §203027
Orange

$1.350.01

Seymour Flourescent
Oranga 17 oz Can #20-
657

$575

§254725

Rustaleun
V2355833

$359

$1.52037

Rustolzum
2355

23

630-0154

PAINT, SPRAY, ZINC-RICH, COLD GALVAN'ZING, 16 0Z
CH. 12 CN'CASE

Approved Brand:

1. SHERWIN-WWILLIAMS PRO-INDUSTRIAL ZINC-CLAD
41430255

2-SPRAY ON 740 OR EQUAL

747

CH

KO BID

$520

$3824 40

Industnal Choic-Cotd
Gatvanized 160z

NO BID

KO BID

24

2806283

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,

FEDERAL COLOR # 27830, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER

WP-236, 5 GUCN, 24 CNSPALLET MAX.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP.23 6 CERTIFIED
NDS LISTED AT hitp Aimateria’s dadeschoots net

(sefect FSPMA Part Products' and then ‘Approved Part

Product LisD)

Approved Brands:

1. BEHR PREMUM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER 1IN
ONE ULTRA PURE WHITE # 5850

2 BEHR PREMUM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #5050

3 PPG SPEED HIGH EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS LATEX
\WWHITEG-S00X)

4. PPG ACRI-PRO 10 8/G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE
RESISTANT PP&030 WHITE

5. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXAMA ULTRA PREMUM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX S/G ENAMEL
EXT ULTRAVWHITE MAB35

100

CcN

$5,850 00

320 Tropicoal S/G
Latex Exterior

NOBID

$000

KO BID

25

2806211

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27780, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
WP-28 6. 5 GL/CN. 24 CNSPALLET MAX.

'APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA L'P-28 6 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT htp Amatenia’s dadeschoots net
(selzct FSPMA Pamt Products’ and then ‘Approved Part
Product List)

Approved Brands:

1. BEHR PREMLUM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER IN
OME ULTRA PURE WHITE # 5850

2 |3EHR PREMLUM EXTER:OR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #5050

3 PPG SPEED HIGH EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS LATEX
WYHITES-Q00X]

4. PPG ACRI-FRO 100 8/G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE
RESISTANT PRGO30 WHITE

5 LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXIVA ULTRA PRENUM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX S/G ENAMEL
EXT ULTRAWHITE MA-655

CN

KO BID

HOBID

KO BID

$000

KO BID

FU733 R (2

3



,c-omﬂenmo{ﬂnbm

Bid Mo, 013-hNOS

Title: PAINT

Manager | Swzanne F. Logez

Primary

Aternate

Prepared By

Verifed By

ITEM

M-DCPS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.
ary.

uRIT

Colo Wheel Pairits

Femich ne dba The Pant Spat

0-Gea Parit Co

Pa'metto Hardware

Urit Price

Total Price

Karuf & Nodel

Un Prica

Total Price

Maruf & Model Urit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mod=l

Tetsl Price

Manuf & Mozl

2606278

PAINT, LATEX, SEMI-GLOSS, INTERIOR, ENAMEL,
FEDERAL COLOR #27925 (WHITED, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-32.4, 5GLICN, 24 CHS/PALLET MAX
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 6 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT hiip fmateria's dadeschocts net
(select FSPMA Pant Produsts’ and then ‘Approved Paint
Product List)

Approved Brands:

1. PPG SPEEDH DE INTERIOR ENAMEL SEMI-GLOSS
ACRYLIC LATEX 6-500.

2. INSL-X/CORONADO SUPERKOTE 500 ACRYLIC SEMI-
(GLOSS 32-1.

24

CN

$5345

$1.232¢80

#420 INTERIOR Latet
SIC Enamel
Cotor Whesl

$7367

$1.763.03

INSL-XCorenado
Superkots 500 Aceyic $3004
Seimigloss 32-1

$213595

Coronado Part

$7150

27

2806220

SEALER, MASONRY PATCH NG, KN'FE GRADE,
SMOOTH GRADE MUST BE MERCURY & LEAD-FREE, 1
GL/ICN

APPROYED BRANDS:
THER ARE CURRENTLY KO APPROVED BRAKDS
UNDER THIS CATEGORY

{=]]

$1624

$074.40

3

2608217

PANT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, BLACK TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEM, 5 GLICN

(Approved Brand:

1. SHERWINAVILLIAMS MARINE INDUSTRIAL CO. TUF-
TOP WC BLACK / SHERWIN WILLIAMS #735-4425

2. TUF-TOP WC 10-XX OR EQUAL

3. COLOR WHEEL ULTRACRETE HYDROSTATIN #3300

CONCRETE STAIN BLACK.

CH

$37.50

$4,37500

Color Wheel Unitracrela
Hydrosatn #3500
Concreta Stain, Black

$10459

Kover Krack
L-411

Mot Apgraved Brand

$1.71600

$000

Coronzdo
15

TutTop Black 814247

§7,123 50

TukTep
10-101

$117.60

§5.82000

TurkTop
WIC-10-105

FALITI Rer (3553)



thb PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid No. 013-NNGS

Titee: PAINT

Manager L Suzanne F. Logez
o

PPG Architectural Firishes ¥ Ronmie's Hardware Sherwin Witams Sten Parit Co

M-DCPS EST.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM URIT
¥ ary. Unt Price

Maruf & Made! Uni Price Manuf & Model

Tetal Price I Marof & Modal Unit Price I Total Prica

Total Price I Naruf & Model Uni Price | Total Price

JWENDOR SHALL INDICATE UNIT PRICE, PRODUCT
MANUFACTURER'S HAME AND MFG PART # OF ONE
{OF THE LISTED APPROYVED BRAND(S) QUOTED IN THE
DESIGHATED SHADED AREA.

ALSO, INDICATE HERE THE MANUFACTURER'S
PRODUCT WARRANTY IF GREATER THAN OME

YEAR.

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULS!ON BASED, YELLOWY, 1
FSPMA-CERTIFIEQ UNDER MP-96, 1 GUCN
APPROVED BRANOS: FSPMA MP.9 6 CERTIFIED Coronado
BRANDS LISTED AT httpimateria's dadeschoots net oot cN 000 HOBID S L 651551
2600307 [{sel2ct FSPMA Pard Produsts’ and then "Approved Panmt
Product List})

KO BID KO BID KO BID $11.13 $65.659.13

Approved Brand:
COROMADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC
PAINT # 65

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, WHITE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 8, 1 GUCN

OVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-96 CERTIFIED - ~ Comado
BRANDS LISTED AT htp fimateria's dadsschoa's ne 192 CH $000 HO BID 51182 5220944 Coronada 66.101.1 KO BID KO BID KO BID $1138 $2.18455 6
(select FSPMA Pamit Products’ and then ‘Approved Paint I
Product List)

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC
PAINT 8 €5

2800315

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULS!ON BASED, BLUE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-96 1 GUICN. 1
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA LP-96 CERTIFIED

BRANDS LISTED AT hiip Fimateria’s dadeschoa's el 57 CH $000 KO BID $10.45 359585 Ceoronado 66 51801 KO BID RO BID HO BID $1007 $57393
(setzct FSPMA Paint Products’ and then ‘Approved Part
Product List)

Cemado
5

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 ACRYLIC TRAFFIC

PAINT, PRIMER COATING, LATEX CONDITIONER FOR
CHALKING EXTERIOR SURFACES, FSPMA-CERTIFIED Sherwin
UNDER MP-14.7, 5 GL/ICN WisamsFlex Ban
|APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-147 CERTIFIED 30 ch $000 KO BID $5805 $1.74150 | Coronado 1066115 | $7455 $224350 Flex-Prep Ext Latex
BRANDS LISTED AT hitp iimateria’s dadeschoots net Chalk Cond
(setect FSPMA Part Products’ and then 'Approved Pant CVIDI40IF
Producd List)

Approved Brands:

1. CORONADO ELASTITE 100% ACRYLIC MASONRY
SURFACE CONDITIONER 1055-11 SERIES

2 FLEX BON PAINTS FLEX-PREP EXTERIOR LATEX
CHALK COMDITIONER 140 SERIES

3. PPG EXTERIOR ACRYLIC MASONRY SEALER
UCEDD13

I
I
I
I
PAINT # 65 I
I
I
I
I
I

Comado

$55.25 $1637.50 F05811

280-5923

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, EXTERIOR/ANTERIOR,
PRIMER/SEALER, FLAT, \WHITE, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-22 4, 5 GUCH, 24 CNSPALLET MAX.

PROVED BRANDS: FSPMA KP-22 4 CERTIFIED 203 CH 000 KO BID $105.10 §21,650 80
BRANDS LISTED AT htfp fimateriz’s dadeschoo’s net
(select FSPMA Pant Products’ and then ‘Approved Pant
Product List)

Sheswin Wiams

Kitz 13000 Preprie Problock
5 gat¥on s1oLo0 $21.008.00 InVExt PrimesiSeaier

#B51W20

Richards

= 2
§56 00 $17.83300 8744

2600161 |Approved Brands:

1. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. LANCO WALL-PREP
ACRYLIC LATEX WMODIFIED PRMER INT/EXT ULTRA
WHITE WP-823

2. RICHARD'S - PP5 100% ACRYLIC FSPMA UNIVERSAL
PRIMER/SEALER STAN KILLER WHITE 7-44

3-SHER WALLIAMS PREPRITE PROBLOCK INT/EXT
LATEX PRIMER /SEALER VWHITE 851 W20
4-MASTERCHEM INDUSTRIES KILZ PREM/UM PRIVMER
SEALER STA!N BLOCKER INT/EXT WATER BASE WHITE
#13041

FALI733 P2y (15.53)



810 PROPO!
Frysaore

SAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bad No. 013-NNXS

Telw: PAINT

Manager I Suwzaqne F. Lopez

ITEM

M-DCPS
&

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.
Qry.

uNiT

PPG Archizctural Firishes

Ronirée's Hardaare

Sherwin Wiliams

Sten Parnt Co

Urit Price

Tetal Price

Manuf & Model

Urit Price

Tolal Price

Manuf & Model

Urit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modzl

Urit Price

Tetal Price

Manuf & Model

2600142

PAINT, ACRYLIC BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, D'RECT-TO-
METAL, BLACK, FSPMA CERTIFIED UNDER MP-266, 1
GL/CN. LISTED AT hitp// materia's dadeschod's net

( set=ct "FSPMA Painl Products™ and then "Appeoved Paint
Product List)

Approved Brands:

1.CORONADO - RUST SCAT # £0-1

2 PPG- PITT-TECH # 90-374

3. SHERWAN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC BGW100
SERIES GLOSS

CH

HOBID

$1885

810375

Coronado 8021

$2751

$1.51305

Sherwin VWikams
DTM Acryic Gloss
EBESWI0D

$19.50

$1,07250

Coronado
Black
&0-1

260-5767

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
VETAL, OXFORD BROV/N, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
WP-253 6,1 GUCH

(APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-266 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT http/imateria's dadeschoo's nat
(sefect FSPMA Painl Products’ and then "Appeoved Paint
Product List)

Approved Brands:

1. CORONADO - RUST SCAT # 801

2. PPG - PITT-TECH # 20-374

3. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC BESW 100

$16.10

$611.60

PG PITT TECH
©0-374

$17.70

$67260

Coronado 80.178.1

2751

$1.04533

Sherwin Witkams.
DTM Acrylc Latex
Gloss #BESWI0D

$19.60

$75240

Covonado
Qford Brown
E0-1

260-1958

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR.
FEDERAL COLOR # 27925, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
WP-28 6, 5 GL/ICN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 6 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT http /'materia’s dadeschon's net
(setect FSPMA Paint Products' and then ‘Approved Paint
Product LisT)

Approved Brands:

1. BEHR PREMUNM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER IN
ONE ULTRA PURE WHITE # 5350

2 |BEHR PREMIUM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #5030

3 PPG SPEED HIGH EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS LATEX
WHITEG-900X)

4. PPG ACRI-PRO 100 S/G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE
RESISTANT PPEO30 VWHITE

5. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXMA ULTRA PREM.UM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX S/G ENAMEL
EXT ULTRAWHITE MA£95

224

CHN

KO BID

KO BID

$97.50

$27.690.00

Sherain Wilams A-
100 Ext Latex S'G
#AEW151

Not an Approved
Brand

260-1583

PAINT, ALKALI-RESISTANT STAN BLOCK UNIVERSAL
PRIMER/SEALER, ACRYLIC-BASE, WHITE. FSPMA-
CERTIFIED UNDER MP-33 5, 5 GLICH.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 5 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT hitp.iimateria's dadeschoo!s net
(setect FSPMA Paint Products’ and then ‘Approved Parnt
Produst List)

Appeoved Brands:

1. CORONADO - CRYLICOTE GOLD COLLECTION # 410
11

2 COROMADO - GRiP & SEAL LATEX STAIN KILLER #
116-11

3. LANCO & HARRIS - STAIN KILLER PRIVER INT/EXT
ULTRAVVHITE 100% ACRYLIC \"P-039

4. PPG -SEAL & GRIP INT/EXT 1005 ACRYLIC
UNIVERSAL # 17-921

CH

§7800

$4.20000

PPG Seal and Grip
InVExt 100% Acrylie
Universal 17-921

$5939

$11299

$491645

$6214 45

Coronado 116 115

Coronada 410115

KO BID

NOBID

KO BID

$2357200

$4675.00

PPG
6-800%)

Coconado
#116-11

534-3521

SETAL SURFACE TREATMENT, CORDITIONER, 1 GUCN

Approved Brand:
(OSPHO - 0504 OR EQUAL

CN

HOBID

$1689

SKYCO
OSPHO
#13558

$1850

$1.07300

Sherwin
Witams/futo Kare
PH-OSPHO-Ric Pius
#0132

$1325

$763 50

OSPHO-0504

FUITISPey (15-55)



BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

complete name of the

Bid No. 013-NNGS

Tr'e: PAINT

Managec | Suzanne F. Lopez

PPG Architectural Firishes Rorrés's Hardaae Sten Panl Co
mem | MOCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM = T
# A Urit Price Total Price WMznuf & Modz] Urit Prica Total Price Marof & Mods! Unit Price Totsl Price Marf & Nodel Unit Price Total Price Wanuf & Modsl
1 Sherain
PAINT. CONCHETE, FLOOR, LATEX. WATER BASE. SEM 155 cn 000 NOBID $11320 | $3.30500 T | $117.50 $152500 prioriegi $106.00 $3.180.00 Rehargs
GLOSS GREEN . 5 GLICN ‘ 10xx ' ol ' e
as527
11 2601214 | Approved Brand: I
1-COLOR WHEEL ULTRACRETE HYDROSTRAIN # 3300
CONCRETE STAM GREEN
2-SHERVAN WILLIAMS MARINE INDUSTRIAL Co. TUF-
TOP ViG GREEN /SHERWIN WILLIAMS #735-3527 i
3TUF.TOP - WG 10-XK OR EQUAL
SEALER, MASONARY PATCHNG, KNFE GRADE, PPG Permacrets e i o i
TEXTURED GRADE, MUST BE MERCURY & LEADFREE, | 403 o $2500 | $1007500 | Tedredpawha- | $1815 $751445 | Ausectsted Pa $1505 $5,065.15 RamsMomeniive s1400 $5,004.70 KoverKrack |
£00.400-1 Korver Krack 1400
1 GUCH . 1001 #125-2063
12 | 20413
Approved Brand: 1
1-SHERVAN WILLIAMS MOMENTIVE LIGHTHOUSE
PRODUCTS KOVER KRACK L 400 TEXTURED/SHERVZN
ILUIANS #125-2663
a Z Sherwn Witams o i -
SEALER, PRIMER, STAIN BLOCK PIGMENTED ALKYD, | 559 e s000 HO BID 000 NO BID $235 $580215 Pretiock Primet s205 s72sass | Zreseen CoverStan
FLAT, WHITE, 12 OZ SPRAY CN #141.1659 ¢
13 | 2000888
(Approved Brand:
SHERV/N WL LIAMS FROBLOCK PRWER 141-1652 OR
EQUAL 2
i Sherwin Vs
] wrwin Wisams
FAINT, SPRAY ENAMEL, CHOCOLATE, GLOSS. 1013 02| N - Rustoleun
2 2 # & ' 4
Pttt & cn $0.00 O BID $354 s004 | Russsemezenez | 5275 $235.50 Corts R Glss $175 $15050 e
14 260-1222 :
Approved Brand:
1-SHERWIWILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST #140-0553
2. RUST-OLEUM 248102 OR EQUAL
T
i
Sherwin Wilams
PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, CHROME ALUMNUM, 10-13 02 a Rustaleun ] . ¥ Rustaleun
el s S el 260 cn 5000 KOBID $479 $1.24540 peirrepsi B N 2 sise | CovsRat 175 545500 e
15 260-1176
Approved Brand:
1-SHERWM-WILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST# 140-0530 2- !
FIXALL 1307 OR EQUAL :
1
1 Sherain Wikams
PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, GRAY, 10-13 OZ CN. MUST BE Rustleum | . . Rustaieum
PART, SPRAY, ENANEE.OR 205 cN 000 1O BID $3.47 64985 | e $56375 CortilsRust. Grey $175 35875 ey
6 | 260-1188 !
Approved Brand: 1
1-SHERWIN-WILLIAMS CONTROL RUST # 140-0621 I
2-FIXALL 1315 OR EQUAL !
T
1
I Sherain Witams
PAINT, SPRAY, EMAMEL, LACQUER, GLOSS, RED, 10-13 Kry'on Divers®ed o E Rustaeum
B e 113 cn 0.0 NOBID s269 $33787 s I s $31075 Corros Rust - e $175 $157.75 o
17 | 260428 1
I
|Approved Brand ]
1-SHERWINWILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST # 1400548 |
2. RUST.OLEUM 243525 OR EQUAL !
i
PANT, SPRAY ENAMEL, PRIVER RED , 10-130ZCHL o Vot e Rustaleun
A A CTUER AL 613 cn 000 o BID 5205 stass3s | Rusweumsnesoss | 5276 $1.68575 sk $175 s107275 i
18 2€80-1231 1 #140-0559
I
Approved Brand: I
1-SHERV/N-VILLIAMS CONTROLS RUST 140.0589  2- !
FIXALL 1319 OR EQUAL S S
8

FUL 3N Res (1559



BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

B o 013-0%05

Tite PAINT

ianager | Suranne F. Lopez

PPG Archtectural Finishés Ronnia's Hardware Sherwin Wilars Sten Pani Co

en | MOCPS DESCRIPTION OF TEM e T
: Uitprice | TowPrce | ManfaModel | UetPree | TosiPrice |  Mandamesst | untPrice Tetal Price Mz & Model Unit Price Total Price Manud & Macel

Sherwin Witiams
PAINT, SPRAY ENAMEL, WHITE, GLOSS, 10-13 0ZCH " Contro's Rust Gloss
\UST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE 643 CH $0.00 KO BID $245 $1,587.60 Krylon'Acs #17001 275 $1.78200 Nrite

19 || 260-1248 ! £120-0552

$1.75 $1.13400 V2403330

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1301 OR EQUAL

Cortro's Rust Gloss |
PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL. BLACK, GLOSS, 10-13 0ZCH Kry'an b7
\UST BE MERGURY AKD LEAD FREE. £33 CH $0.00 HO BID $159 $1.41351 421213 §275 $2.44475 Black 8175 $155575 V2402830

20 | 2801192 #140-0508

\Approved Brand: 1
RUST-OLEUM V2402 830 OR EQUAL

Sharwin
PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, DARK BLUE, 10-13 0Z CN, . . itams/Krydon Rusioleun
\FUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE. 67 CH $000 HO BID §205 $197.65 Rustoleum 249114 5265 519765 Regal Blus #316- $1.75 §11725 oty
21 2606186 8779

Approved Brand:
1-SHERWIN-VWILLIAMS KRYLON B16-8779
2-FIXALL 1303 OR EQUAL

Sherain
Witams/Krylon
APVA Bright Orangz|
#2M4-6377

PAINT, SPRAY, MARKING, FLOURESCENT ORARGE , 15

07 CN MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE. 443 CN $000 KO BID $355 $1567265 | Knjon'Ace 81262070

§3.15 $1.39545

1
i
1 $265 $1.305 85 Rustcleum 203035
1

2 2600439
Approved Brands:

1. SHERWINAWILLIAMS KRYLON APWA BRIGHT
(ORANGE #234-6377 1
2-RUST-QLEUM 2355

1 GRAINGER 6A373 OR EQUAL

Sherain Wisams
PAINT, SPRAY, ZINC-RICH, COLD GALVANIZING, 16 OZ Rustoleun 5365 $265065 Krylon (}a‘.‘ar\'qed
CN, 12 CH'CASE. #7785-830 Primer

23 | ew00158 arsTes

747 cn 000 KO BID §$545 $4.071.15 $385 $2.950 65 Rustoleun 1635330

Approved Brand:

1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS PRO-NDUSTRIAL ZiNC-CLAD ,
51430255 Not Approved Brand

2-SPRAY ON 740 OR EQUAL

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE. SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27850, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
LIP-236, 5 GLICN, 24 CHS/PALLET MAX.

IAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 6 CERTIFIED 100 CH $75.00 $7.500 00
BRANDS LISTED AT htp /imateriz's dadeschoo’s net
(setzct FSPMA Pard Products’ and then 'Approved Parl
Product List)

PPG Speedhide

Ext 100% Acryfc
SemiGloss NOBID KO BID KO BIO $97.60 $9,750 00

6-C00XF BAENIBT

$5300 $3.300.00

Approved Brands:

24 2605269 1. BEHR PREMN:UM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER IN
ONE ULTRA PURE WHITE # 5350

2. BEHR PREM/UM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #5050

3. PPG SPEED H:GH EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS LATEX
(VY HITEE-900X)

4. PPG ACRI-PRO 100 /G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE
RESISTANT PP5030 WHITE

5. LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXIMA ULTRA PREMUM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX SiG ENAVEL
EXT ULTRAVVHITE MA-655

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27760, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
IP-28 8, 5 GLICN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX 100 Exterior Acryic
| APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 6 CERTIFIED 100 CH $0.00 KO BID HO BiD KO BID HOBID $9750 $9,750 00 LE:JEt &G b $3300 $8.300.00
BRANDS LISTED AT hp/imaleria’s dadeschoo's nel Pé'.'1151
(set=ct FSPMA Pairt Products’ and then ‘Approved Paint

Product List)

Approved Brands:

1. BEHR PREM.UM PLUS ULTRA PAINT & PRIMER I
25 2806271 [ONE ULTRA PURE WHITE # 5850

2 IBEHR PRERMSUM EXTERIOR SEMI GLOSS ULTRA
PURE WHITE #3050

3. PPG SPEED HIGH EXTERIOR SENI-GLOSS LATEX Hotan Appeoved
IWWHITEG-200X) Brand

4. PPG ACRI-PRO 100 8/G 100% ACRYLIC AND FADE 9
RESISTANT PPo03) WHITE

5 LANCO & HARRIS CORP. MAXIMA ULTRA PREM UM
ULTRADURABLE, 100% ACRYLIC LATEX S/G ENAMEL
ig)ﬂ' ULTRAVWHITE MA-695

Sherwn Wisams A-
PPG
6-000XJ

FM-1733 R




Bid No. 013-NNG5

Titie: PAINT

Manager L. Suwzanne F. Lopsz

TEM

M-DCPS
#

DESCR:PTION OF ITEM

EST.
QaTy.

UNIT

PPG Aschitechural Finishes

Ronniz’s Hardaare

Sherain WiaTs

Sign Paint Co.

Urit Price Tolal Price.

Marud & Mods!

Urit Price

Totsl Price

Marif & Model

Urit Price

Total Price

4anuf & Madel

Urit Price

Tetal Price

Manuf & Model

2606278

PAINT, LATEX, SEMIGLOSS, INTERIOR, ENAMEL,
FEDERAL COLOR #27925 (WHITED, FSPMA.CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-32.4, SGUCH, 24 CNSPALLET MAX

| APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-23 6 CERTIFIED
BRANDS LISTED AT htp imateria’s dadeschodls net
(select FSPMA Parnl Products’ and hen "Approved Part
Product List)

IApproved Brands:

1. PPG SPEEDHIDE INTERIOR ENAMEL SEMI-GLOSS
IACRYLIC LATEX 6-500.

GLOSS 32-1.

2 lHSL-XiCORQ‘lADd SUPERKOTE 500 ACRYLIC SEMI-

24

CH

$£3.00 $1.63200

PPG SPEED HDE

INTERQR SEMI-

GLOSS ACRYLIC
LATEX AB-500

$73.70

$185380

Coronado #3215

HO BiD

HO BID

KO BID

$74 80

$1.76520

Corcnada
321

27

260-6280

SEALER, MASONRY PATCH NG, KN FE GRADE,
S4LLO0TH GRADE MUST BE MERCURY & LEAD-FREE, 1
GUICN.

IAPPROVED BRANDS:
THER ARE CURRENTLY HO APPROYED BRANDS
UNDER THIS CATEGORY

CH

NOBID

$19.30

$1,158.00

Associated Paml
#00.100.1

$1505

$903.00

Sherain Willams
Concrets & Masanry
Patch Knife Smooth

#7331368

$1885

§1,131.00

Tower Sealarl
00055

28

2605277

PAINT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, BLACK TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEN. 5 GLICN

Approved Brand:

1. SHERWAN-VALLIAMS MARINE INDUSTRIAL CO. TUF-
TOP WG BLACK I SHERV/IN WALLIAMS §735-4426

2 TUF-TOP WG 10-XX OR EQUAL

3 COLOR WHEEL ULTRACRETE HYDROSTATIN #3500
CONCRETE STAIN BLACK

CH

NO BID

$11320

$5,660 00

Tuf-Tep
#10-xx

$117.50

$5.87500

Sharwin Wikams
Marine Industrial Tuf-
Top WC Black
H1354420

$106 00

$5.300 00

Richards
#4510

FULITM Ry (T




