The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bld No. 035-f1.105

FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Buyer: S. Lee Yee r’—-\‘%)

VeriﬁedBy;I‘d.Largermé%

EVERYTHING MEDICAL D.B.A. UNITED HEALTH

GODDESS PRODUCTS INC.

HENRY SCHEIN INC.

SUPPLIES
CASE
apcps | ITEM DESCRIPTION EST
MBGES (| EW CASE PACKING IF
Unit MFGR& | VENDORS | FAKING IF MFGRE | VENDOR'S |ChoC PACKING TOTAL wrcre | venpors | DTEERENT
arty UNIT PRICE|TOTAL PRICH | DIFFERENT |JUNIT PRICE| TOTAL PRICE| IF DIFFERENT |(UNIT PRICE ; THAN
MFGR # CAT. #. THAN MFGR # CAT.#. THAN PRICE MFGR # CAT.#. | specieieol
SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDI
2000754 | 1 |Aleohollsopropyl 7O%GT. | 4 peg sige8 | sers2z00 | SN | xacsase R 1822 | s30ps3o0 | MEDLINE Backing: $13.20 | $21.780.00 | CUMBERLANY i iomg0g1 |Cas® Pecking
& oz. Botlle. ' case £15.68 822 #50848 - e $18.22 08300 11ps 0980032 R - 90 D SWAN
- T g Reckit Case
200859 | o |AnusenticDisinfectant 1100  case S71.40 | $78.540.00 | Bencklser | W20-95029 |Packaging: nB i N8 NB  |Case Packaging $42.48| HREFI LYSE?L assa7ig (€%
Cleaner, Multlpurpose. Lysol Brand SPECS #95524 Packaging:
Applicator, wooden, 6" length, Case
cotton lipped on one end. non- MEDLINE Case Packing: Packing:
2000659 | 3 |steris. 165 box | WHITEOFF [WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF $2250 | $3.712.50 | MDS 202000 |LEFT BLANK WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF |WHITEOFF ||
— — et B T e I
Cold Pack, Inslant, disposable, case EQUAL Packing:24__ MEDLINE Packing:, COLDSTAR Case
2000753 4 nylon poly pack, 5 x 10" 2,750 §£8.20 $22,55000 | DMI1234010 | T89-ICEG3 $16.66 $0.00 | MDS 138000 [LEFT BLANK |_ §7.28 | $20,020.00 2004205 9004205 Pacidng,_ 7
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated EQUAL Casa MEDLINE NO Case Packing: DYNAREX Case
2000438 | & [gauze with superstick, 1"x3", | 3,326 box $1.06 $3.625.66 ASO A22:2019 |Packing:12__ $17.38 | $57,805.88 | MFG/MPRO |LEFT BLANK |100/8X1200 5145 | $4,822.70 ik 2670028 |Packing:___
slerite. WC02019 #none 24/18X%-
1 S B B e e S ]
1 I Case Packing:
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coaled ! ASO Case I 3000 HSICARNMO Case
2000649 6 gauze with super stick, 3/4"x 3", 2,218 box §0.96 $2,129.28 A22-2018 |Packing:_ 12 $31.10 $68.979.80 |MEDLINE LEFT BLANK [2000/100= £0.98 $2.173.64 - 9004503 |Packing:
z Weo1018 N 2004503 —
steifle. 30bxs $31.10/30 54
= $1.04/per bx
S D e B TS R —
Bandage, Sheer. Teflon coated EQUAL Case . DERMA Case
2000772 7 gauze with super slick. 1-1/2"x 4 880 box 1.88 $1.654.40 ASO A22-1669 |Packing: $38.61 $33,976.80 |CURAD LEFT BLANK 12bxs £3.49 $3,071.20 |FABAA BPCSS 1017268 Packing:
172", sterite. WCO 1669 - A boi2 12
$3B.61/12 = —
$3.22
KENDALL Pt ese Gass
2000000 | 8 |cotion Balls, medum, non-ster{ 88 box/bag 12.59 stiorez | T, K10-2600 5192'@8 $1326| $1.165.88 LEFT BLANK |Packing; $1.61| $141.68 |KENDAL 2600 8909467 | Packing:
o 13,26/8 = $1.66 8
=3157 = -
Case Case
EQUAL ‘ AMERICAN , )
917-0155 | 9 |Wash-Eve 4oz, 35 case | s7152 | s250320| mMEOIQUE | mea-tgste [PREMISB N giq03l  s4pt05| HEALTH  |LEFT BLANK |Packing._5/CS 54824| sigsggo |ALTAREATE | yipq0pg|Case
_ 7152/48= 14.03/5 = -3 Packing: 36
18818 SAFETY -
$1.49_ 2.81
Case Case Packing.__ Case
Sponges, Gauze, general use, & DYMNAREX - Packing:__ 3 3000 3000 HSI/ DUKAL —
2000296 10 Sferte. 2pprox 2 x 2" 550 si27 569850 [ © o or03362 [ " s $0.74 $407.00 LEFTBLANK |05 | $0.93 [ $511.50 ot 1047897  [Packing:
T 44.12/60 = $0.74 SOIB0K
box 1 -
Case i T T CF ’’’’’
Sponges, Gauze, general use. DYNAREX Packing: 24 _ Case Packing: DYNAREX =
2000301 1 M_A_—-d—hﬁsmme, orr $1.71 $1,128.60 sl D703384 | Sl - 543.81| $26.914.60 LEFT BLANK | 20 $1.69 | $1.115.40 s, 4990647  |Packing:
650 box 5007 2dBXsies
Case
- Case A Case
Paper, Examining Table. TIDH ai- : Packing. 6RL/C
o 4 |Paper, Examining Table : . ; 9. =
2000531 2 | ool foleh. 4080k ok 550 |case 61.9 $34,045.00 _— 124-1243 |Packing: $80.40 | $43.170.00 LEFT BLANK | ik $59.18 | $32.549.00 [TIDI 1911243 1016708 | Packing:
_ SPECS___ {mo
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Flarida

Bid No. 035-111105
FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Buyer: S. Lee Yee

VerifiedBy:M.Larger

HOME AID HEALTH CARE HYBRID HEALTHCARE STAFFING AGENCY LLC KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.
X s
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST CASE
Unit TOTAL MFGR & VENDOR'S UASE PACHING MFGR & VENDOR'S GHIE EACKING MFGR & MFGR | VENDOR'S CAT PACKHD I
i ! IF DIFFERENT X * IF DIFFERENT || UpIT PRICE| TOTAL PRICE| " 6 DIFFERENT
ary UNITPRICE|  ppice | MFor# | caT.#. UMTPRICE | TOTALPRICE | pecry | cats, RIce n #.
THAN THAN THAN
SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDI
Case . Case CUMBERLAND Case
1 [Alcchollsopropyl 70% 18 1. | 4 oep | o 16.62| s27.423.00 [MECPAK Packing: s1505| s24.83280 | ANTAS Packing: si7.08| sz950200|  swan KSVOB4S  |Packing: 12
oz, Bottla. 23000022 SPECIFIED
L - HSVO848
2 |Anlisealic Disinfectant 1100 a6.13| 350.743.00 |RECKITT 639574|Packsgig: .-‘—ga ;;3 ~";é|’ ;;;’P’:“;:;-P’P’P’P’F—é;‘;;;:gtng Ine NB NB N3 O
Gleaner, Multipurpose. Faze S o 95524 9 g'—i - TR SPECIFIED ¢ i Packaging:_
[
Applicator, wooden, 6" length, Case Case Case
cotion lipped on ene end. non- DYNAREX Packing: ANY AS Packing: Packing: |
3 |sierile. 165 box 4.58 $755.70 #4302 440734 $4.08 $673.20 SPECIFIED 2= NB NB NB NB _
Case Case Case
Cold Pack, Instant, disposable, case Packing; ANY AS Packing: KENTRON Packing:
4 |nylon poly pack, 5"x 10", 2,750 $16.57 | $45567.50 | CMP 169703 476732 _ $8.87 $24,392560 | SPECIFIED _ $8.85| 52461260 |561111 661111 e
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated P Case Case
= : TSy DERMA Case Packing:_ ANY AS - KENTRON -
5 Etael:,-ln: with super stick, 1" x 3", 3,328 box $1.89 | $6,618.74 EABAAB 2400 - $1.60 $4,989.00 SPECIFIED Packing: §0.99 $3,292.74 880013 880013 Pacxing:
Bandaqge, Sheer, Teflon coated Case ANY AS Case KENTRON Case
' " " - . 1 1, .
6 g:eun'zr: with super sick, 3/4"x 3".| 2,218 box NB N8 NB Packing: $1.29 $2.86122 SPECIFIED Packing: $0.87 $1.920.66 880075 880075 Packing:
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated Case Case Case
E : MOORE . ANY AS < KENTRON 7
i giji;z;\;ﬁh'nasupersﬂck, 1172 x 1 880 box $2.49 | $2.191.20 68223 499336|Packing:1200__ $3.08) $2.710.40 SPECIFIED Packing:, $1.1¢9 $1.047.20 881615 881515 Packing:
SEPUEPID SE—— SIS ISP I——
Case Packing: Case Packing:
4000 4 ANY AS KENTRON 14.39/8 =
8 il 5 = %
Collon Balls, medium, non-steri! 88 boxibag $14.78 | $1.30064 KOL 2600 ) 235257 000/500 = Bbxe. $1.37 $120.56 SPECIFIED $14.38 $1.266.32 440010 440010 $1.80
14.78/8 =5 1.85
Case T ) Case Packing:
MAJOR Packing:_36_89. ANY AS MEDIFIRST 48/CS
Yash- 3 ek g SLALE
9 |Wash-Eye 40z 35 case $89.28 | $£3.124.80 537720 450701 28125 = ,4_9.?9 31,735.55 SPECIFIED $76.32 $2,671.20 10818 Kigs1s 76.32/48 =
$2.48 ) B : i g $1.69
Sponges, Gauze, general use ANY AS KENTRON
1 —p——“—q—‘—‘j—-’ & . .00 ¥ 1 § &
sterile. approx. 2°x 2°. 550 $2.98 | 51.639 MEDPAK 635942 $1.23 676.50 SPECIFIED $1.25 $687.50 KS2280 Ksz2z280
box
Sponges, Gauze, general use, MEDPAK ANY AS KENTRON
i Sterte. 4"x 4", $2.80 | $1.848.00 164242 762703 $2.46 $1.623.60 SPECIFIED $1.55 $1.023.00 444251 444251
660 box |
i - -
c Casz Case
Paper, Examining Table, BANTA . i ANY AS % .
12 smoolh fintsh, 24° x 260" rofl. 550 |case $62.66 | $34,463.00 4911243 63465 Packing: ! £60.48 $33,264.00 SPECIFIED Case Packing: |NB NB NB NB Packing:
= |
‘oo 4] S-S




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bfd No. 035-111105
FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Buyer: S. LeeYee

VerifiedBy:M.Larger

MAJID GLOVE & SAFETY MFG. CO. LLC. RF SCHOOL BUS PARTS INC. SCHOOL HEALTH CORPORATION
5 5
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST CASE CASE
- ) CASE PACKING v & mror | venbors |PASKIG 1 urera | venors | PACKING F
ary UniT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE| MFGR & MFGR [VENDOR'S CAT.| ¢ piFFERENT || upit PRICE |TOTAL PRICE] ™ ME DIFFERENT| UNIT PRICE |TOTALPRICE| " RS | DIFFERENT
# i # CAT.#. MFGR # CAT. #.
THAN THAN THAN
SPECIFIED] SPECIFIED; SPECIFIEDI
. —_— Case CERTIFIED Case CUMBERLAN Case
1 [|Alcchol lsopropyl. 70% 161 | 4 s9 case $15.36] $25.344.00 | Packing: $21.12] $34.848.00 |SAFETY MGT. |#2008 Packing, | s$15.24| $25.146.00 [D sWAN #34042  |Packing:
oz. Bottle, ' LTY 1202
R R221-005 50848
2 2 W Case CERTIFIED Case o B . |Case
2 [|Antisentic Disinfectant 1100|  case NB NB NB NB Packaging: $45.24) $49.764.00 [SAFETY MGT. 2006 . 3552 $30.072.00 |LysoL 95624 34233 | Packaging.__
Cleaner, Multlpurpose. —== R221012 Packagng:
Applicator, wooden, 6" length, CERTIFIED Case Case
cotton tipped on one end. non- MEDIQUE Case SAFETY MGT. Packing. Packing:
3 |sterie. 165 box $5.91 $976.15 [MP83015 Packing: $1000]  $1,650.00 |R224-206 2006 33.19 S§H 90852 ooss2|
CERTIFIED Case
Cold Pack, Instant, disposable, case Case Packing: SAFETY MGT. Packing. Case Packing:
4 |nylonpoty pack, 5°x 10", 2,750 $9.33 50.00 |BAXTER KK107 16 51230 50.00 | R734-005 2006 WHITEOFE | WHITEOFF | WHITEOFF | WHITEOFF
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coaled CERTIFIED Case Case
5 |qauze with super stick, 1" x 3", | 3,326 box szes| ss1ago (M0 basg $2.40 $7,982.40 [SAFETY MoT. 2006|Packing,__ s1.38|  g4,580.88 |DYNAREX 32243|Packing:
i Packing: 3602 —
sterite. — R220-103 e
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated 1 CERTIFIED Case Case
6 |gauze with superstick, 2/4"x 3".| 2,218 box s240| 532320 |MAJD Gase 52.30]  $5,101.40 | SAFETY MGT. 2006 |Packing;__| s120]  s2.661.60 [DYNAREX 32242 |Packing:
BDGWI4X3 Packing: 3601 —
sterie, R220-100 .
e e e
Bandage, Sheer. Teflon coated Gata CERTIFIED Case Case
7 |gauze with super stick, 1-172"x 4 880 box N8 NB NB NB ) $200] 176000 |SAFETY MGT. |#2006 Packlng: $1.43|  $1.258.40 |SH32043 32043|Packing;
; o Packing: —
172", sterie. E— R224-014 | -
DR FERPESE RIS ISe. LS S SN IS P
g:;fm - 12 Case Case Packing:
8 Cotlon Balls. medium. non-steril 88 boxibag £0.68 £59.84 |[NORTH 117818 Sﬂgﬁ"lzj NB NB NB NB Packing;___ $13.62 $1,936.00 [KENDAL 2800 30011|13.62/8 =
P 51.69
Casa Case
9 |\iash-Eve 4 0z 35 case $58.50|  $2.047.50 |FENDALL FE452 Packing. $1.80 $63.00 gisgﬁlir?m 2006 S:z:mg- $63.36]  51.936.00 |ORTECH 34105|Pacing___
402 5850124 = . g — - 38001 as 175-35 63.36/36= 5
R508-016 i
$243 1.76
CERTIFIED
Sponges, Gauze, general use KENDALL DYNAREX
10| ESIEECSZE Ue e, i 550 s166]  $902.00 | orote $3.60| $1.980.00 [SAFETY MGT. 2006 si21| si93600 010 27443
R231-209
box
CERTIFIED
11|3ponaes, Gauzs, gereral use. s2.73]  s1.801.80 |KENDALL s5.88|  $3.880.80 |SAFETY MGT. 2006 s2.08| s1.936.00 |DYNAREX 27556
slerita, 4"x 4. KENBD44 3343
= R231-213
660 box
. Case Case Cas2
Paper, E a Table. ) . 2
2 r:f;:’“;: s i 550 |case NB NB NB NB Packing: NB NB N8 $NB Packing.__ [NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID  |Packing:
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

B81d No. 035-Mh105

Buyer: S Lee Yee

FIRST AID SUPPLIES VerifiedBy:M.Larger,
ALERT SERVICES INC AMFAK INC GEORGE BAFFOE DBA THE WHITEHALL GROUP
CASE
IPTION EST
FRER DESTR PACKING IF CASE CASE
Uni ) DIFFERENT v | PACKING IF wrera | venors | PACKNGIF
ary uNIT PRICE| TOTALPRICE | MFGR & MFGR| VENDORS THAN [l unT Price | ToTaL price | MPGR& | VENDOR'S | oyepepent || i price ToTaL PrIcE | MFG DIFFERENT
# CAT. #. SPECIFIEDI MFGR # CAT.#. THAN MFGR 1t CAT. #. THAN
S S P A S SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDI
Case | MORE Case CUMBERLA| ., Case
4 |Alcchal lsopropyl TOA G M. |y g5 | oqe §14.52  $23.958.00 |VI JON 4700067| Packing: I 18.25 $30.112.50 |NDC 81043 |MEDICAL  |Packing: $1462]  524.12300 [NDSwaN |CUMBERLAND o ing:
oz. Bollie. — Biih s SWAN 81043
s e s e e
Antiseplic Disinfectant : LEGASSE DICA! Case B NB Case P; I
2 c—'%leaner TRy 1100| case |NB N8 NB NE Packing: $45.75 $50.325.00 | e ?Fssv L |packegig: I N8 NB ase Packaging
SESISPYS (ISR [PPSR SIS, RO R
100/8G_10BG/
Applicator, vooden, 6" length, Case MORE Case BX
cotton lipped on one end, non- DYNAREX Packing:; DAKAL MEDICAL  |Packing: DUKAL 10BX/CS
3 |sterie. 165 box $354 $584.10 |#4302 2458069 _ $5.25 $866.25 (69620 51557 o £376 $620.40 |#o006 DUKAL #9006
S e S D e e — = —=
Cold Pack, Instant, disposable, case Case Packing: MEDLEOST |CUSTOM Packing: HEALTH Packing:
4 [myon poty pack, 57 x 10", 2,750 NB NB NB HB 5234 $6,435.00 |0-01 KIT10-01 | $20.55 $0.00 | 10104 10104_
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coaled Case Case DERMA Case
Bancage, wheer, ¥ -
6 |gauze with super stick, 1"x 3", | 3,326 box $1.69 $5,260.34 | DYRAREX 682019| Packing: $2.45 58,4870 |DYNAREX CUSTOM o ing: $2.25 §7.48350 [SCIENCE  |NUT 1200033 [Packing:
z #3602 KIT 10-01 _100/BX
slerile. 1230033
pl— i2B8X/CS
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated BVARER Case e lasren  [Eos= DEIRMA g:::l )
6 |gauze with superstick, 3/4"x 3",| 2,218 box $1.26 $2,794.68 682018|Packing: $2.40 $5,323.20 = Packing: $2.00) $4,436.00 |SCIENCE  |NUT 1275033 ng:
= #3601 #360 KIT 360 — 100/BX
sterile. 1275033 iy
L — 128X/CS
Bandage, Sheer, Teflon coated Case \ORE Case DEIRMA Eas'el .
7 |gavze with superstick, 1-1/2'x 1 880 box  NB NB NB NB Packing; $3.45 $3,035.00 |ASO 1420 [MEDICAL  |Packing: $3.77 $3.317.60 |SCIENCE  |NUT 1302033 |"2INg:
112", sterile. 68223 1309039 _100/BX
. — 12BX/CS
Gasn MEDLINE |cusTom  |C358 Packng: DUKAL ga::l :
8 |Gotton Balls, medium. non-steri{ 88 boxibag |NB HB NB NB Packing; $22.00 $1,936.00 | *' l4000_ 22.00/ $1.63 $143.18 KEN 2600 acking._____
11701 KIT b 2600 500/8G
= 5275 =
8BGICS
Case Case
MORE MAJOR
o Case ALTAIRE Packing;_ 36 Packing:
3 -Ey : NB s} g ; ! — s ! ! f 9
Wash- Eye. 4 0z 35 case NB NB PEEO: 90.50 $3.167.80 |7 ;;ES?QCAL iy $1.66 $58.10 ;ﬂw;{gg\ MAJB377-20 |
36 = 5251 EACH_
KENDALL [MORE AMD
Sponges, G q 1 =
10 Q:pr::‘;,xez'le'a U281 550 nNB NB NB NB 52.25 $1.237.50 [COVIDENSD |MEDICAL $1.17 $643.50 |RITMED  |AMD A2338 3';’:2%_50 -
i ) 43 74005 A2338 ’ SR
box
JOHNSON
Sponges, Gauze, general use, DYNAREX &
1[2ponges, G
] ey NB NB NB NB $2.76 $1,816.00 |10 CUSTOMKIT $5.97 $3.94020 [ o [IC005531  |18BX/CS
860 box - 005531
_ Case Case Case
Paper, Examining Table. i
2 smooth finish, 24" x 260° roll. 550 |case NB NB NB NB Packing: $ NB NB NB NB Packing;__ $62.53 $34,391.50 ;2?1243 TIDI#911243  |Packing:____
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The Schoal Board of hiami-Dade County, Florida

CMC GROUP INC DBA DAYMARK SAFETY SYSTEM

ITEM DESCRIPTION EST
CASE
Unit MFGRE& | VENDOR |hroero
J § DIFFERENT
ary UNIT PRICE| TOTAL PRICE MFGR # SCATA [ Tran
SPECIFIED,
: Case
Al prapy A 8 i
5 |Alechol, Isopropyl 70R 1610, | 4 gs9 case |NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |Packing:
oz. Boltle. =
niiseptic Disinfectant —
Anliseptlic Disinfectant . gt
2 |Cieanar Mullipurpose. 1100[ case [NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID |Packaging,_
Applicator, wooden, 6" length, Case
cotton Upped on one end. non- Packing:_ |
3 |slerle. 165 box NO BID NO BID HOBID NOBID
Case
Cold Pack, Instanl, disposable, case Packing:___
4 |nylon poiy pack. 5"x 10~ 2,750 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bandaqe, Sheer, Teflon coated
- Lo 40y o FIRST AID Case
5 gauz‘e with super slick, 1" x 3", 3,326 box $7.55 $25,111.30 ONLY Hi75 IT114445 Packing:
sterl'a.
Bandaqge, Sheer, Teflon coaled oy
6 |gavze with super stick, 3/4"x 3",| 2,218 box NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID )
s Packing:
sterile.
Bandaqe, Sheer. Teflon coated Case
7 |gauze with superslick, i-1/2"x i 880 box NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID  |Packing___
112", sterile.”
8 |Cotton Balls, medium, non-ster! a8 box/bag |NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Case
Packing:
9 |Wash-Eye, 4 oz. 35 case HVALUE! FIRSTAID IT114461 |36/CS__ $1
ONLY 6011 e
63.08/36 =
$4.53
2ponges, sauze, general use,
jp|Seonges. Cauze, generaluse, | g NOBID  [NOBID NO BID NOBID
sterf'a. approx. 2'x 2"
box
11|{Sponges, Gauze, general use. HoBID  |NOBID HO BID NO BID
sterite. 4" x 4",
660 box
1z |Paper Examining Table. 550 NOBID  |NOBID NO BID NO BID gas; :
smooth finish. 24" x 260' roll. canp acking:

Bid No. 035-11M05
FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Page 6

Buyer: S.Lee Yee

VerifiedBy:M.Larger




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Bld No. 035-/11405 Buyer: S Lee Yee
FIRST AID SUPPLIES VerifiedBy.M.Larger,
.B.A.
EVERYTHING MERIGAL D B.A, UNIERHEALTH GODDESS PRODUCTS INC. HENRY SCHEIN INC.
SUPPLIES
CASE |
I ! DE
MDCPS | ITEM SCRIPTION EST — i
Unit MFGR& | VENDOR'S RACKING I MFGR& | VENDORS kel DG TOTAL MFGR& | VENDORS DHFFERENT
arty UNIT PRICE|TOTAL PRICH | DIFFERENT (lUpiT PRICE| TOTALPRICE| IF DIFFERENT | UNIT PRICE ki THAN
MFGR # CAT. 4. THAN MFGR # CAT. #. THAN PRICE MFGR # CAT.# | speciFiED!
SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIED
2000297 | 13 |S2fely Pins, assorled sizes. 550 K 0.85 5467.50 soENC;’\UALSP U12-5P125 P“i:’s:" 24 lyogn  |HOBID NO BID NO BID .g::::n : \WHITEOFF |WHITEQFF |WHITEOFE |wmiteore |7%°
stainless steel PRa §0.85 : 125 ASSORTED 9 T Packing: 240
125/PKG i
Caszs
EQUAL Case Pacwing;___ 144 ANDOVER Case
2000701 | 14 |Tape, Adhesive, 1"x 10yds. 100 |earton $8.45 £845.00 | _ - D22-C110 |Packing; 12 || 810037 | $10.037.00 LEFT BLANK |/CS, $7.85 $765.00 |7 00 1005387 |Packing:
DUKAL G110 0T 44 = THS| 200WHI s
70 —
— S I NS — s :
Packing:_12 | B - reNa R ANDOVER i
15 |Tape, Adhesive, 1/2'x 10yds | 110 |carton $8.45 §929.50 | DUKAL C50 | D22C50 |_ 6.45/f2= | $5.58 $613.80 LEFTBLANK [ —mn | §7.65 $841.60 |/HSI 200WH 1005334| " e?r'i'z _
07024 = - . T, =
Ju.70:24 f : $0.23'24 Lt $0.64
— s i N I S itz A=SA BR
Case
) Case Packing: Packing:20
Thermometer, Ciinlcal, single ¢ - MNEX TEMP . MEDICAL = - —=
200001 16 [\ oo Storie. Indhidusty wrapped| 117 box $8.69 $955.00 | oS0 | M4o-1112 $23.12 | $2.543.20 || n oo o |LEFT BLANK | 2000/CS £8.82 $970.20 |3M #5122 2208346 Eéﬂiff's
— I W S M = | o S
Tissue, White Facial, two-pt tespond i MARCAL Lonse
2000719 | 7 [1iEsue.¥ihile Faclal twoply. | 5 544 case MA  [Na NIA N/A §17.47| $44.39127 email re verify $44.64 [s113.43024 | " 3955317 Packing:
single sheet 9" x 7.5" 3305
30 or 36 bxs 36
per case.
case of 36 case of 30 !bxs, 44.64/36 =
bxs bxs 17.47/30=$.58 |$44.64736 = $1.24
Tongue Depressar, wood, 5 DYNAREX EQUAL Case
Tongue Depressar, W
2000264 | 18 |t taEes s;e) J 264 box $3.20 $844.80 | 4311 D70 38.62 $10,195.68 38.62/10 $3.86 $4.38 | $1.166.32 | HIS DALIAN 1000758 |Packing:
U : 4311 1000768 108X
box of 500 vase Laasi box of 500
Packing.__10 || box of 500 Packing.__
9171508 | yq|First Ald Kit, Ten (10) Person- 70|each NB B HB N |62 NOBID  |NOBID NO BID NO BID el NoBID  |NOBID  [NOBID NO BID Cass
MMM Kit. i HB L BB packing: o —— Packing:
S{7-1555 First Aid Kit
M 20 |Industria¥Contractor 12/pack 168 box NB NB NB NB NQ BID MO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10 BID NO BID
o Metal Vehlcte Truck Kit.
Case Case Casz
Packing. Packing: Packing:
21 |Bio-Hazard Cleanup Kit. 220 |box NB NB NB NB NOBID  [NOBID No 81D NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bach irammerent || €3N It gerent than || 2N than
than specfied: specfied: specfied:
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The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 036-GG05
FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Buyer. Suzanne Lee Yee

HOME AID HEALTH CARE HYBRID HEALTHCARE STAFFING AGENCY LLC KENTRON HEALTH CARE, INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST S
Unit TAL MFeRe | venoors |Shor PACKING MFGR& | VENDOR'S CASE HACKING MFGR & MFGR |VENDOR'S CAT, ERLRROIL
TOTAI ! 1 ! :
u ICE ! IF DIFFERENT || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE IF DIFFERENT || UNIT PRICE | TOTAL PRICE DIFFERENT
ary NITPR PRICE | MFGR# | cAT.Z s MFGR# | CAT.% A # . i
SPECIFIED! SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDI
Safety Pl orted stz LEONARD Zase ANY AS e
=alely Fins, assorledsizes, ing: Case Packing: _ |[NB NB NB ing:,
13 laness slasl 550 pkg 52561 $1,435.50 LEGS34 615559 Packing: £1.89 $1,039.50 SPECIFIED ase Packing: _ |[NB NB NB Packing.
Case
Packing: 144 Case
. . MEDPAK — ANY AS Case KEMTRON .
14 |Tape, Adhesive, 1" x 10 yds. 100 |carton $5.98 $593.00 16473 455531 i £9.52] $952.00 SPECIFIED Packing: $5.50 $550.00 705311 705311 Packing:
50.42 e
Case
Packing;___288 Case
MEDPAK — , ANY AS :
15 |Tape, Adhesive, /2" x 10 yds. 110  |carton £6.54 $719.40 455530 288/24 = $952 $1,047.20 Packing: ~
i 164730 s SPECIFIED e
12.6.54/12 = L.
$0.24
2000/100 =
Thermometer, Cinfcal, sing'a MEDIND 20BXS ANY AS
, ; ; i
16 i, 216, KOOy Wrippt: 110 box $1212| s1333z0| oo o0 ELLLE I e s $10.36 §1,139.60 | (oo omn INB NB NB NB
53.60
Tissue, While Facial, two-ply, ANY AS
17 cinga shesl 8" x 7.5, 2,541 case |NB ne N8 NB ] $26.20f  $66574.20 | ool NB N8 NB NB
case of 36 case of 36 26.20/36 = case of 36
bxs b>s$26.20/36 50.73 bxs
1g [fonaue Depressor, wood, 5- 264 bo 54.34| §1,277.76 | MEOPAK 24- 508717 g:cs:fn ;10 4,14 s100206 | ANYAS $37s 990,00 |KENTRON 450525
112" x 5/8" (junlor size). LS : skt 201 9T Rl SPECIFIED Y 450528
box of 500 box of 500 Lase box of 500 Uase
Packing: Packing:
. T Case Case Cass
First Aid Kil, Ten (10] Person- 3
1g|EisL Ald KL, Ten [10) Person 70|each SNB B B N8 Packing: 5936 sess.20 | _MNYAS Packing: ) ne e [iL:} Packing;
Kit. SPECIFIED —
FirsLAid K1 FIRST AID 98.00/5 =
20 |IndustrialiContractor {2/pack 168 |box SNB NB NB NB 99.00 $16,632.00 3 NB NB N NB
; DIRECT $16.50 = o=
Mslal Vehicle Truck KIL
Case EQUAL
Packing;, ANY AS Cass KEMNTRON Cass Packing:
21 |Bio-Hazard Cleanup Kit. 220 |box $NB N8 ) NB L $113.40 $7,273.20 | SPECIFIED Packing. $19.14]  $4,210.80 |311113 311119 6IBX
gact iFaifferent than || &M iraifierent then || 25" I different
spechied: specfed: than spacfisd:
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 035-MM05

FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Buyer: S. Lee Yee

VerifiedBy-M Larger

MAJID GLOVE & SAFETY MFG, CO., LLC. RF SCHOOL BUS PARTS INC. SCHOOL HEALTH CORPORATION
4 S
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST SRR CASE
Unit MFGR |VENDOR'S cAT.| SAoE PACKING FGR & MFGR | VENDOR'S | otinG IF MFGR& | vENDORs | FACKING IF
ary UNIT PRICE |TOTAL PRIcE| MPER & MFGR |VE SCAT.| IF DIFFERENT | uniT PRICE |TOTAL PRICE| MPCR & M DIFFERENT|| UniT PRICE [TOTAL PRICE| ™ DIFFERENT
# it. # CAT.#. MFGR # CAT. #.
THAN THAN THAN
SPECIFIEDI SPECIFIEDS| SPECIFIEDI
Case Case Case
Safely Pins, assorted sizes. S i 3 ina: DYNO o -
13 | et 550 pkg  |nB NB NB NB Packing; N8 NB NB NB Packing: $1.12 $E16.00 |\ eect 0026 20618 |Packing:
JOHNSON & Case CERTIFIED Case PRO Cass
14 |Tape, Adhesive, 1"x 10yds. 100 |carten $12.98 $1,742.40[ JOHNSON Packing; $15.26|  §1.526.00 |SAFETY MGT. 2006 | Packing; _ $7.58 $758.00 |ADVANTAGE 28281|Packing:;
14564 L R504-022 P163010 .
JOHNSON & g:;ffn . 13 CERTIFIED Casz PRO Case
15 |Tape, Adhesive, #/2'x 10yds. | 110 |carton $12.98|  §1,427.80 |JOHNSON g_le $15.26)  $1,678.60 [SAFETY MGT. 2006 | Packing: $7.58 §833,80 |ADVANTAGE 28280| Packing:,
$12.98/ 12 = e
JJ563 R504-021 P153005 i
$108__ J
Thermometer, Clinlcal, single NEX TEMP
LR e =i ol I box $12.34)  $1,357.40 |MMMS122 NB NB NB NB $8.79 $966.90 |30 13052
17 |Ussue White Faclal twoply. | o000 | o0 |na NB NB NB B NB NB NB WHITE OFF [WHITE OFF |WHITE OFF  |WHITE OFF |WHITE OFF
single sheet 9" x 7.5" ¥
case of 36 case of 36 Icase of 36
bxs bxs lbxs
CERTIFIED
Tongue Depressor, wood, 5- HAROWOOD . % DYNAREX
18 |12 5/6" (unlor size) 264 box s6.60f 5174240 | o000 $7.4D|  $1,953.60 |SAFETY MGT. 2006 $3.58 $945.12 |, #90866
R235-056
box of 500 Lase box of 500 LnEe box of 500 Zage.
Packing: 10___ Packing. __ Packing.!
EQUAL
EQUAL
. e Casa Case Case
First Aid Kit, Ten {10) Person- ) CERTIFIED CERTIFIED  |NS017- =
9 X 1,40360 [MasD . ; 3 : . ; :
19) it 70{each $2005| S AJID FAKGP Packing; 20___ $9.96 $697.20 |sareTY HoT. 2006 Packing:__ $9.71 $679.70 [ oo 1608 1 | Packing:
— S17-1609 Mim MMMO17-1500 —
EQUAL
Zirel AL Eit CERTIFIED S R W 917-  |158.046 =
20 |IndustrialContractor 12/pack 168 |box NB NB NB NB $26.81 $4,504.08 [SAFETY #917- 2006 $158.04| $26,550.72 SAFETY 1525 ”;!” 525'34 b
Metal Vehlcle Truck Kit. 1525 MMM MMMI17-1525 o )
CUSTOM b
Case CERTIFIED Packing: 1 CERTIFIED [MSBIO-  |case
Packing: SAFETY #HSB 0BXS SAFETY BIO- |HAZARD Packing:
21 |Bio-Hazard Cleanup Kit. 220 |box NB NB NB _ $896|  $1.971.20 [cUSTOM 2006 | EACH, 7.86|  $1,720.20 |HAZARD KIT |KIT
A
each if diterent than || ©2<P than w3t it diferent
spedied: specfied: than specfied.
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 035-K11105

Buyer: S. Lee Yes

FIRST AID SUPPLIES VerifiedBy:M.Larger
ALERT SERVICES INC AMFAK INC GEORGE BAFFOE DBA THE WHITEHALL GROUP
CASE
y 10 EST
ITEM DESCRIPTION G CASE CASE
Unit pors | DIFFERENT MFGRA | VENDOR'S | FACKING IF MFGR& | venDors | DACKINGIF
ary uniT PRICE| ToTaL pRice | MPGR& MFGR | VENDOR'S THAN  lluniT pRICE| ToTAL PRICE | MFG DIFFERENT [LiNiT PRICH TOTAL PRICE | DIFFERENT
# CAT. #. MFGR# | CAT.# ! MFGR # CAT. i,
SPECIFIED! THAN THAN
SPECIFIED! | SPECIFIEDI
[4
- . Cass 5 Case ! CARDINAL Cass
13 |3afely Pins, assorted sizes, 550 pkg  [nB NB N8B N8 Packing: NB NB NB Packing,___| 0.85 $473.00 |HEALTH Packing:
stalnless steel. NB
i L C18700-020 I
Case
MORE 3M HEALTH Casa
N JOHNSON & e ANDOVER Packing: 24 i . ; L
14 |Tape, Adhesive, 1"x10yds. | 100 |cartan $10.84 stoagm (RS 2705104|Case Packing: ||  $11.45 s1.145.00 [FHO0 ::;gme iy $7.62 $762.00 1CARE 1630 MMM 15301  |Packing:
$0.48 =
Case
MORE Cass
; ) JOHNSON & o ANDOVER . Packing!
15 |Tape, Adhesive, 12'x 10yds. | 110 |carton $10.84 st.19240 |10 ooN S s 2705103|Case Pacting: || 511.45 $1.259.50 (5000 MEDICAL  |Packing: 24 58.49 $933.20 | DUKAL C50 |DUK G50 e
8214
12cTv/ES.
) MORE MMM
s TZBEETBT;S};T:‘;:WEEG 110 box  |NB NB NB NB $12.95 5142450 |\ =XT TEMP epical $10.57]  $1.16270 [HEALTH  |Mmyt 5122
use. slerve, lnd LRt i3 62776 CARE 6122
o _ EQUAL _
17 [lissue.Vihite Fagial. twoply. | 00 | g NB NB NB s.NB N8 NB NB 2242302 | watuer |unzL  |sun 15702030 |22:9200 =
single sheet 9" x 7.5" 3 J0.62
- 16702930
casa of 36 case of 36 |case of 36 100/8X-
bxs | bxs bxs 30BXS/CS
i
Tongue Depressor, wood, 5- * i DYNAREX [cusTOM DUKAL
B s gL, 264 box $3.42 $902.88 | DYNAREX 4311 245711 j $4.75 $1.254.00 [ VIS ki $377 $995.28 | DUKAL #9001
[
box of 500 Laserackng: | pox of 500 vase box of 500 Lase
§ S N . — Packlng: Packing:
= " EQUAL
irst Aid Kit, T 2 e, ase FIRST AID
19;'__: Ajd Kit, Ten (10] Person 70| each NB NB NB Na Packing: .76 s54250 |COUAL  lokg.03  [packing: $13.47 $942.90 oLy NG, |FAQ 9300-10P |Case Packing:
L : . FAQ 9300-
Case
First Aid Kit, EQUAL 1275006 = iDHNSON Packing:
20 (IndustrialContractor 1Z/pack | 168 |box NB NB NB NB 127.5 $21,42000 |CUSTOM  |cKazstes | 27500 $61.02)  $10.25136 | o o |Jic008tE2  |scamx
Metal Vehlele Truck Kit. KIT 225165 " 61.02/6 =
JJC 008162
e e ] 310 17
Case Case
Case Packing: Packing:6 Packing:
21 |Bio-Hazard Cleanup Kit, 220 |box NB NB B NB _ 55 $1.210.00 NB NO BID NOBID  |NOBID
s =g eE
e If difereat than £ach than pach If dtterent than
specfied: spedizd: spacfied:
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

CMC GROUP INC DBA DAYMARK SAFETY SYSTEM
ITEX DESCRIPTION EST
CASE
% PACKING IF
Unit ] 4
ary " |umTeRice| ToTALpRIcE [ MFOR® | VENDOR |pyececeny
MFGR # SCAT. &
THAN
SPECIFIED;
Safety Pi ted siz Lase
13 |22leY Flns assorled sizes. 550 pkg  [NoBID  |MoOBEID NO BID NOBID  [Packing:
stainless steel.
14 |Tape, Adhesive, 1"x 10yds. 100 |carton NOBID #ALUEl  |[NOBID
Case
Packing: 2
. 5 FIRST AID 4/CTN_38
15 |Tape, Adhesive, 1/2"x 10 yds, 110 |carlon §85.44 $9,395.4C.) ONLY 6000 1T113397 54404
=§1.71.
Themmometer, Cinleal, sing'e X
16 use, steri'e, Indvidually wrapped 110 box NG 8ID NO BID NOBID HNO BID
Tissue, White Facial, two-ply,
17 single sheel 9 x 7.6" 2,541 case NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
Jongue Depressor, wood, &
18 112" x 5/8" (Junlor slze). 284 box |SNOBID [NOBID NO BID NO BID
box of 500 Gase
Packing:
EQUAL Giia
First Aid Kit, Ten (10) Person- FIRST AID =
19 Kit, 70{each §16.43 $1,150.10 oNLY Inc,  |T114381 [Packing:
FAO 5084
First Aid Kit
20 |IndustriafContractor j2/pack 168  |box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Melal Vehlcle Truck Kt
FIRST AID Casa
ONLY INC. Packing:
21 |Bio-Hazard Cleanup Kit. 220 |box $45.44 $9.996.80 [5534 IT14708
each TomEEm
than
spedfied:

B/d No. 035-114105
FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Page 10

Buyer: S. Lee Yee
VerifiedBy.M Larger




