Title: Automotive Industrial Balteries: Bid 021-NNGS

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #021-NN06

Autoimotive Industrial Batteries

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Important Bid Notes

Required Warranty: 1B months, free replacement period.

for against item 3)

={ — COld ATr DGTrEUIors Yarensuse (Non-Responsive: Ui not reel IRE specilicanions called

Deseription Of ltem

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Plus FL. Excise
Tax

Less Junk Trade
la {Allowance)

Net Unit Price

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Plus FL.
Excise Tax

Less Junk
Trade-In

Net Uait Price

ltems | theough 12 will be awarded on 2 tota] low bid basis.
Vendor must bid all items.

In the everd that the NET PRICE Per Unit is iscorrectly
calculated, the individeal companents of the price shall prevail.

The awarded verdor rvst pick up old bakeries 2ad issue eredit

Foreign products will not be corsidered if a domestic supply is
available. IF product is rot available as produced in the US A all
ifouign produsts mst be submined es an alternaze 2nd couny of
origin must be specified

1. Baxery, Mzirtenssce Free, BCI Group 31, 12-Volt Wet Banery
Top Mowt. Threadzd Post. Minimum 925 Co!d Cranking Amperes
{CCA) with Stabl-Lek or equal insulation between the plates and the
negative straps and Subl-Lok or equal bottom anchored plates and
heavy doty gnids.

200

§50.98

5150

51800

57448

$118.50

524,00

$2450

2. Banery, Mainterance Free, BCI Groap 27, 12-Volt Battery,
Minimam 700 Co'd Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lek or equal
insulation between the plates and the rezative streps 2nd Stabl-Lok or
equal bottom aschored plates end heavy duty grids

Minimen Order | Each

140

573.69

$1.50

51200

$53.19

Ez:h

140

579.00

510.00

$69.00

3. Banery, Mzinzenance Free, BCI Group 318, 12-Yolt Baaery,
Miaimem 1125 Cold Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal
insulstion between the plates and the nagative streps and Subl-Lokor

cqual botom anchored plates end hitavy duty grids

Minimum Orders | Ezch

1400

111879

5150

SI18.00

510229

Ea:h

1400

$13438

$40.00

19438

4. Battery, Maintezasce Free, BCI Group 78, 12-Voli Side

oost, M m 770 Cold Cranking Ampezres (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or
equal insulation between the plates and the negative saps and Stabl-
Lok equal bentom anchored plates and heavy daty gnds

Minirrom Order: | E2ch

2]

56847

51.50

$57.97

19745

515.00

$84.45

5. Batery. Maintenznce Free, BCI Group 64. 12-Volt Tep

st Minimem 575 Cold Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Subl-Lek o
2qoal fnselation between the plates end the negative smraps and Stabl-
Lok eqeal bottom anchared plates and heavy doty grids

Minimum Ordarc | Each

Each

57846

5150

1200

587.10

515.00

7210

§. Batery, Mafnzecance Free, BCI Group 63, 12-Volt Top

past. Mirdmern 850 Cold Crenking Ampares (CCA) (Police Units)ith
Stab! Lok or equal iasulation banveen the plazes and the negative sreps
2rd Stabl-Lok equzl bottom anchored plates and hzavy duty grids

Minimesa Order: | E2zh

Each

400

87.97

Sis50

$12.00

§67.27

Ezxch

si00.40

§$85.40

7. Batery. Maintesance Free. BCI Group 34. 12-Veh Top Fost,
Minimam 630 Cold Crenking Amperes (CCA) (For Walk-ln Vans with
Srabl-Lok or equal insulation between the plates 2nd the negative strps
2nd Sezbllok or eqea! bottom anchored plates and heavy daiy grids.

Miniran Order: | Exch

300

569.50

5150

S12.00

$59.00

300

52090

575.80
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Title: Aulomotive Iedustrial Batteries: Bid 021-NN0§

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #021-NN06
Autoimotive Industrial Batteries

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Important Bid Notes

Required Warranty: 18 months, free reglacemant period.

aters

arehouse (INoA-Respoasivér Did wol meet the spetificanions called

lor against item 3)

Prepared By:
Verified By:

Deseription OF Item

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Ples FL. Excise
Tax

Less Junk Tradey
In (Allowance)

Net Unit Price

Unit

Q.

Rate/Price Per
Uit

Plos FL.
Excise Tax

Less Junk
Trade-la

Net Unit Price

8. Banery, BCI Grosp 8-D West, 12-Vok Top Post, Minimum 1400
'Cold Crarking Amperes (CCA) with Stable-Lek or equal insulatica
Tetween the plates 2nd the negative straps 2nd StsbELok or equal
bottom anchored plates asd heavy doty grids.

Minimem Order: | Each

200

$177.83

s150

$48.00

$131.33

Each

5179.50

$40.00

$139.60

9. Batiary, Maintscance Free, BCI Growp 38, 12-Volt, Miaizam 340,
Cold Crenking Amperes (CCA) with Stzbl-Lok or equal insulztion
behween the plares 2od the regative s7ps ard Stabl-Lok or egaal
‘bottom anchared plates and heavy duty grids.

Minimem Order: | Exch

Ezch

100

16753

5150

51200

$57.03

Ezch

160

58140

$15.00

§66.40

10. Bzttery, Muintenarce Frec, BCI Growp 75, 12-Volt, 630
Cold Crarking Amperes (CCA) with StzblLok or equal insulation
between the plites end the regative straps and Statl-Lok or equal
ottom anchored plazes and beavy duty grids.

Miairram Order: | Each

Each

£

56337

s1.50

$12.00

$35287

§69.00

510.00

$59.00

L 1. Baktery, Mairtesarce Free, BCl Groap 24, 12-Volt, Top Post, Wet
Battery, 615 Cold Crazking Amgeres (CCA) with Szbl-Lok or equal
insulation between the plates and the negative streps and Stabl-Lok or
=qual botom aschoced plates asd heavy dety grids.

Miaimem Order; | E2<h

Ez:h

§68.04

S150

1200

357.54

50

£92.50

$15.00

$75.90

12. Battery, Maintenarce Free, BCI Group 36R, 12-Velt. Top Post
550 Cod Cranking Amgeres (CCA) with Stbl-Lek or equzl
insulaticn behween the plates and the nezative streps and Stabl-Lok or
equal betlom ancheored plates and heavy duty grids.

Miaimom Order: | E2ch |

$7L18

3150

$12.00

$60.68

50

§75.00

51000

13. Additional Baneries (This item will be amarded 1o both primary end
2lrermative venders)

Manufacturer:

MN/A

510

NA

40%
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Title: Automotive Indastrial Batleries: Bid 021-NN&§

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL

Bid #021-NN06

Autoimotive Industrial Batteries

Important Bid Notes

Required Warmanty: 18 months, free replacement period.

TPH Acquisition D.B.A. The Parts House (Total: $351,750.90)

Prepared By:
Verifizd By:

Dieseltron Pacific D.B.A. Battery Sales (Total: $557,016.70)

Description O Item

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Ples FL.
Excise Tax

Less Juak
Trade-Tn

Net Unit Price

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per Unit

Plus FL.
Excise Tax

Less Junk
Trade-In

Net Unit Price

liems | throuzh 12 will bz awzrded on @ toral low bid basis.
Yendar must bid all items.

In the event that the NET PRICE Per Unis is incormectly
lealoutated, the individeal components of the price shall prevail.

The awardzd vendor rust pick 1p old batteries and issee credit

Foreiga products will rot be considered if a domestic supply is
svailable. IFproduct is not availzhlz as produced inthe US.A all
fereizn products must be submitted a5 e eliermate and comtry of
arigin must b2 specified.

1. Bahtery. Mainzenance Free, BCI Group 31, 12-Vok Wet Batiery
Top Mownt, Threaded Post, Miaimam 925 Cold Cranking Ampeies
{CCA) with Stzbl-Lok or equal insulztion batween the plates and the
- sgative straps and Stbl Lok or eqea) battem anchored plates 2nd
heavy dety grids.

Ezch

538.08

51950

$68.58

Eech

200

s11035

5150

$22.50

$87.85

ES

2ry, Mamienzace Free, BCI Group 27, 12-Volt Bazery,

L m 700 Celd Crasking Amperes (CCA) with Stbl-Lok or equal
bisulation benveen the plates end the nagative streps end Subl-Lokor
+qual bottom 2schored plates 2nd heavy duty grids

Miaimum Order: 1 Each

140

£43.82

S120

57182

140

39124

S1.50

£15.00

57624

Bakery. Maistenance Free, BCl Group 315, 12-Volt Bazery,
Minimzm 1125 Cold Crenking Ampsres (CCA) with Stzbl-Lok or eqeal
insulation batween the p'aies and the nezative straps and Sabl-Lok or
equal bottom anchored plates ard heavy duty grids

Minimum Orders | Ezch

1400

517695

$15.00

5161.95

1420

344 49

5150

1. Batery, Mainterance Free. BCI Group 78, 12-Voit Side

past, Minimum 770 Cold Cranking Ampeces (CCA) with Seabl-Lok or
eqeal isulation between the phates and (he negative swaps end Subl-
Lok equal bottom anchored plazes and heavy duty grids

Niniremn Order: | Ezcl

58657

§12.00

$74.57

Esch

5E5.98

51.50

§15.00

$70.98

5. Beitery, Mainterance Free, BCl Grogp 84, 12-Volt Tep

post, Min g Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lek or
qat! insalation benween the plates and the regative swaps 224 Stabl-
Lek equal bottom enchored plates and heavy duty grids

Minimemn Order: | Ezch

Eech

5572

51200

$6372

583.60

$1.50

$15.00

$58.60

6. Banery, Mairsenance Free, BCI Group 65, 12-Vok Top

post. Minimam 850 Cold Crerking Amgperes (CCA) (Pelice Units)with
Smbl-Lok or egual insulation benween the plates and the regative strps
3nd Stabl-Lok equal banom anchored plares and heavy duty grids

Mink=um Order: 1 Ezch

Each

400

£90.03

S1200

$78.03

Ezch

400

587.99

5150

$15.00

7299

7. Banery, Mainterance Free, BCl Groop 34, 12-Volt Top Post.
winirum 630 Cold Craaking Aniperes (CCA) (For Welk-In Vars with
SrabL ok or eqal insulztion bahween the plates and the riegative st=ps
274 Subl-Lok or equal botiom anchored plates 2nd heavy duty grids.

MiniTem Ordzr: | Each

300

574.10

$62.10

Ezch

5823

5150

$15.00

6721

Page 3of6



Title: Automotive Industrial Batteries: Bid 021-NN0§

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The Scliool Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid £#021-NN06
Autoimotive Industrial Batteries

Important Bid Notes

Required Warreasy: 18 mocths, free replacement period.

) TPH Acquisition D.B.A. The Parts House (Totak §351,790.50)

Dieseltron Pacific D.B.A. Batltery Sales (Total: $3§7,016.70)

Prepered By:
Verified By:

Description Of llem

Unit

Rate/Price Per Plus FL. Less Junk
Usit Excise Tax | Trade-ln

Qty.

et Unit Price

Unit

Plus FL. Less Junk

Qty. Rate/Price Per Unit Excite Tax | Trade-n

Net Unit Price

£. Battery, BCI Grozp 8-D West. 12-Volt Tep Post, Minimem 1400
Cold Cronking Amperes (CCA) with Smble-Lok er eqzal instlation
between the plates and the rezative strzps and StabtLek or equal
torom anchored plates 2ad heavy duty grids.

Miniman Order: | Each

Each

00 S16d.50 0 $33.50 $131.40

Each

200 $214.95 $150 S£0.00 $154.25

9. Battery, Mairienance Free, BCI Groop 58, 12-Vokt, Minimam 340,
(Cold Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal insulztion
tepwzen the plates and the eegstive streps and Stebl-Lok or egual
tottom anchered plates and heavy duty grids.

Ot

Ezch

10 57074 i} S12.00

$58.74

Each

100 §75.65 $1.50 515.00 $62.15

10. Banzry, Maisterance Free, BCl Growp 75, 12-Volt . 630
Cold Crerking Amgeres (CCA) with Subl-Lok or equa! insalation
tetween the plates and the negative stzps and Smbl-Lek or equl
toflom aachored pistes and heavy duty grids.

Minimum Order: | Each

() §75.72 0 S12.00

$6372

&0 57829 1150 $15.00 $53.29

11. Betiery, Msirterance Free, BCI Growp 24, 12-Yolt, Top Post, Wet
|[Bamery, 675 Cold Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal
imsul=tion between the plates and the pzgetive streps and StabHlok or
equal bottom anchored plates end heavy duty grids.

Minimemn Orderz | Exch

Each

50 $81.14 0 £0.12

§59.14

Each

50 581.65 $1.50 $15.00 $£6.65

12. Banery, Mainterance Free. BCI Group 36R. 12-Vekt, Top Post,
550 Cold Craakirg Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal
nsalation bevween the plates and the regative straps 22d SubMleok or
eqeal botiem anchored plates and beavy duty prids.

Minimem Order: | Each

Ezch

50 58152 0 512.00 $59.83

Ezch

30 $9334 5150 $15.00 $80.34

13. Additianal Bztteries (This item will be awarded to both prirary and
1hermative verdars)

Manufacturer

Eich

WA

Ezch

WA L

Pzge40f6



Title: Autemotive lndustrial Batteries: Bid 021-NNOE

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #021-NN06
Autoimotive Industrial Batteries

Important Bid Notes

Prepersd By:
Verified By:

Required Wamrarty: 18 months, free replacement pricd.

TP Imvestmeal O.B-A. Reaworin (Wor-Respoasive: s 0ot quele ail iiems
as requested ia the Bid)

Trockmax Inc (No;—ﬁupons'ru: Did not quote all items 25 requested in the Bid)

Descripticn OF lem

Uait

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Plus FL. Less Juak
Excise Tax | Trade-lo

Net Unit Price

Uait

Qty.

Rate/Price Per Unit

Plus FL.
Excise Tax

Less Junk
Trade-ln

Net Unit Price

Items | through 12 will be avardad oa 2 total low bid basis.
Vendor mast bid 21l items.

In the event that the NET PRICE Per Uit is incorrectly
L calculated. the individeal companeats of the price shall prevail

The awardsd vendor must pick vp old batteries and issue credit

Foreiza prodects will not be considered if a domestic supply is
available. 1f product is rot available as produced in the US A all
foreizn prodacts must be sbmitted as 2a phamate and country of
origin must be specified.

I. Bamery, Maistenance Free, BCI Group 31, 12-Volt Wet Battery
Top Mount, Threaed Post, Mirimum 925 Cold Cranking Amperes
(CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal insulation berween the plates and the
reaative straps and Stebl-Lok or equal boniom anchored plates 2nd
heavy duty grids.

ch

10265

510.00

59413

5108.00

5150

517.00

9250

3 Banery. Mamterance Free, BCI Grozp 27, 12-Vok Banery,
Minien 700 Co'd Crasking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or eqzal
insuation between the plates and the negative straps and Sbl-lok or
equal bottom anchored plates 2nd heavy duty grids

Minimum Order: | Each

Each

§59.85

15%

$10.00

89135

Each

140

Mo Bid

3. Banery, Maicterance Free, BCI Group 315, 12-Vok Banery,

inimam 1125 Cold Cranking Amgeres (CCA) with Stzbt-Lok or eqal
lation batween the plates and the negative straps and Sebl-Lok or
sqzal bottom anchored plates end heavy duiy grids

Minimum Order: | Ezch

510.00

3293.65

1450

$110.00

5150

$17.00

59450

4, Battery. Maintenance Free, BCI Group 78, 12-Volt Side

et TH0 Co¥d Crankicg Amperes (CCA) with Subl-Lokor
sl insulation baiween the plates end the regative sraps and Stzbl-
Lok equal bottom enchored plales and beavy duty grids

Minimeen Order: | Ezch

559.85

s10.00

$91.35

No Bid

5. Battzry, Maistenance Free, BCI Groop 64, 12-Vok Tep

pest, Mintnum 575 Cold Cranking Ampares (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or
squal insulztion beoween the plates and (he pagative sweps end Stabl
Lok equal bottom anchored plates 2nd heavy duty grids

Min'rrn Order: | Each

Ez:h

No Bid

No Bid

Ho Bid

'5. Batiery. Maintenanae Free, BCI Groap 65, 12-Volt Top

post, Minknn 850 Cold Crenking Amperes (CCA) (Police Urits)with
Stabl-Lok oc equal insulation between the plates end the regadve smps
ard Stzbl-Lok eqeal bottom anchored plates end hravy duty grids

Minimum Order: 1 Each

Ezch

S$132.80

15%

51062

§124.30

Ezch

400

Ho Bid

7. Banery. Mainzerance Free, BCI Groop 34, 12-Voi Top Post
Minimam 630 Cold Crerking Ampzres (CCA) (For Welk-In Vans with
Stabl-Lok or equal insutation between the plazes and the negative sraps
1rd Stabl-Lok or equal bottom aachored plates and heavy duty grids.

Minimasm Orders | Each

Ez<h

593.85

$10.03

591.35

Eazh

300

550,50

s1.50

$17.00

$75.00




Title: Aotomotive Industrial Batteries: Bid 021-NNO§

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #021-NN06
Autoimotive [ndustrial Batteries

Important Bid Noles

Required Warrarty: 1§ macths, free replacement pericd.

TP iavestment D.BZAL KenwortE{NoO-Respoasive: Did nol quote all iiems
- asrequested in the Bid)

Trockmax loc. {(Non-Responsive: Did not quote all items as requested ia the Bid)

Prepared By:
Verified By:

Description Of ltem

Rate/Price Per Plus FL. Less Junk

Unit Excise Taz | Tradedla | NetUait Price

Unit

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per Uait

Plus FL.
Excise Tax

Less Junk
Trade-In

Net Unit Price

§. Bartery, BCI Groop B-D West, 12-Volt Top Post. Minim=n 1400
Cold Crenking Ampzres (CCA) with Stzble-Lok or equal insulation
between the plates and the negative straps and Stabl-Lek or eqeal
bottem anchared plates and heavy duty grids.

Minimum Order: | Exch

Each No Bid No Bid

Ezch

520100

$24.00

$178.50

(9. Battery, Maintenance Free, BCI Group 58, 12-Volt, Minimum 540,
Cold Cranking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal insulztion
between the plales and the razative streps and Stabl-Lok or equal
bottom enchored plates and beavy duty grids.

St Ot T

Each 58250 13% $10.00 $74.30

100

$50.00

$1.30

5017

$74.50

10. Baftery, Maintesance Free, BCI Group 75. 12-Voki, 630
Cold Cresking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal insulation
Letween the plates and the pzgative straps and SteblLek or equal
“ottom archored plates and heavy duty erids.

Minimum Order: | Each

Each 55925 13% $10.00 $79.75

No 8id

11. Banery. Mairterarce Free, BCI Group 24, 12-Volt, Top Post, Wet
Bastery, 675 Cold Crasking Amperes (CCA) with Stabl-Lok or equal
|msutation between tie plates and the cegative smeps asd Subl-Lok or
equal bottom anchored plates and bravy doty grids.

Minimum Order; | Each

Ezch Mo Bid No Bid

Ezch

50

No Bid

12 Banery, Mainterance Free, BCI Group 35R. 12-Yolt, Tep Post
550 Cold Crankirg Amperes (CCA) with Stzbl-Lok er equal
insulation betwzen the plates and the negative streps and Subl-lokor
equal botiom enchoced plates and beavy duty gids.

Minimum Ordar: | Ezch

Ezch Mo Bid HNoBid

Esch

No Bid

13. Additional Bareries (This item will be awarded to both primary 2nd
Jltermative vendors)

Manofecbrer

Ezch 15%

Exch

WA

$0.10
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