Miami- Dade Countly Public Schools Bid # 031-MM05

File Cabinets

OCPS#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UHIT

PRICE

YOUR OFFICE, INC.

PRICE PER UNITI[EXTENDED

e
MANUFACT]

URER &
MODEL

ERJCE PER U

EXTENDED PRICE

BiKO ENGINEERING SERVICE, INC.
AL AL

MANUFACTURER &
MODEL MUMBER

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S WARRA

IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR

Lines 1 through 22, will be awarded on an individual
basis for Low Unit Price.

Cabinet; File. vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
1/2"-30" D X 171/2"18 1/2" W X 28 3/4™- 29 3/8" M, 2-
drawer. Without fock; color: Putty . Approved Brands:
HON 212CP or Equal.

75

Each

NO BID

$184.44

$13.833.00

Per Format B

2000542

Cabinet: Fils, verlical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
1/2"-30" D X A7 172" -18 1/2" W X 28 3/4” .29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Light
Gray, Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal..

250

Each

NO BID

$184.44

$46,110.00

Per Format 8

Cabinet; File, vertical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
HR"30" D X 17 /2" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" -29 3/8" H, 2-

drawer, with fock to be keyed individually, Color: Black.
Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal.

250

Each

NO BID

$184.44

$48.110.00

Per Format 8

2000393

Cabinet: File, vertical, melal, legal size, approximately 28
12"X30"D X (17 1/2" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" -29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock (o be keyed individually, Color; Putty.
Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal.

500

Each

NO BID

$184.44

$92,220.00

Per Format 8

Cabingt; File, vertical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
1228 3(4" D X 17 /2" 18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H.- 4

drawer, without lock. Color: Light Gray. Approved Brands:

Hon 214CP or Equal

30

Each

NO BID

§235.32

$7.059.60

Per Format B

Cabiney; File. vertical, metal, legal sizs. approximately 28
127 -28 3/4" D X 17 142" -18 172" W X 52" -52 3/8" H. 4-

drawer, without lock, Color: Black. Approved Brands:

Hon 214CP or Equal

30

Each

NO BID

$235.32

$7.059.80

Per Format B

Cabinet; File. vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" -28 3/4" D X 17 172" -18 112" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, without lock, Color: Tan, Approved Brands: Hon
214CP or Equal.

130]

Each

NO BID

$235.32

$30,591.80

Per Format B

20003681

Cabinet; File. vertical, metal. legal size. approximately 28
12" - 28 3/4" D X 17 142" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, with lock to be keyed indivdually, Color: Light
Gray. Approved Brands: Hon 214CP or Equal,

400

Each

NO BID

$235.32

$94,128.00

Per Format 8

2000416

Cabinet. File, vertical, metal. tegal size. approximately 28
172" -28 3/4" D X 17 1/2" 18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4~
drawer. with lock 10 be keyed individually. Color: Putty.
Approved Brands: 214 CP or Equal.

750

Each

NO BID

§235.32

$176.490.00

Per Format B

Cabinet: File, metal. 30-33 drawer organi tler

size approximately 30" Wx 11" D x 33" H. Color to be
chosen al lime of order. Approved Brands: Tennsco #2085,
or Equal

Each

5299.64

§7.491.00

$280.90]

$7.022.50

Cabinet: File. metal. 30-33 drawer organizer. legal
size approximalely 30" W x 14" D x 33" H. Color to be
chosen. Approved Brands: Tennsco #3085, or Equal,

25

Each

$331.80

$8.285.00

$292.56

§7.314.00

Per Format 8

Per Format B

Page 1 of

12

Reviewed by,
Prepared by

L




Miami- Dade County Public Schools Bid # 031-MMO05

Reviewed by
File Cabinets Prepared by,
EMPIRE OFFICE ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES JC WHITEOFFICE FURNITURE STAPLES‘C
PRICE PER UNIT|EXTENDED PRIGE]  MANURACTURER & JPRICE PER EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & || PRICE PER UNIT [EXTENDED — [WANUFACTURERE ——| FRCE e e e
ESTIMATED MODEL NUMBER UNIT MODEL NUMBER PRICE MODEL NUIMBER UIT PRIGE
DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S WARRA
IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR
Lines 1 through 22, will be awarded on an individual
basis for Low Unit Price.
Cabinet; File: vertical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
172" 30" D X 171/2"-18 1/2" W X 28 3/4"- 26 3/8" H. 2-
drawer. Without lock, color: Putty Approved Brands:
HON 212CP or Equal. 75 NO BID|INQ BID NO BID $158.00 $11.850.00 HON 212CP.L §154.81 $11,610.75|HON 212C.L $302.52|  $22.689.00
Cabinet; File. vertical, metal, legal size. approximalely 28
12" -30" D X 17 172" -18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" 29 3/8” H, 2-
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Light
2000542||Gray, Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal.. 250 NO BID||NQ BiD NO BID $158.00 $39.500.00 HON 212CP.Q $154.81]|  538,702.50[HON 212CP.Q $319.82|| $79,955.00
Cabinet: File. verlical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12"30" D X 17 142" - 18 1/2° W X 28 3/4” .29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock to be keyed individually. Color: Black.
Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal. 250 NO BIDJ[NQ BID NO BID $158.00 $39,500.00 HON 212CP.P $154.81] $38,702.50/HON 212CP.P $302.52]  $75.830.00
Cabipet: File, vertical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
12" X 30" D X {17 112" - 18 142" W X 28 3/4" .29 3/8" H,2-
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Putty.
2000393 |Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal, 500 NO BID||NO BID NO BID $158.00 §79,000.00 HON 212CP.L $154.81)  $77,405.00[[HON 212CP.L $319.82| $159,910.00

Cabipgt. File vertical. melal. legal size. approximately 28
1/2"-283/4" D X 17 1/2"- 18 1/2" W X 52" .52 3/8" H.- 4

drawer. withoullock, Color: Light Gray. Approved Brands:
Hon 214CP or Equal 30 NO BIDINO BID NO BID $201.00

$6.030.00 HON 214CP.Q $5195.52 35,865 80)HON 214C.Q $385.28]  $11,558.40
Cabipet. File, vertical, metal. legal size. approximately 28
V2728 374" D X 17 12" 18 172" W X 52" -52 3/8" H. 4-
drawer. without lock, Color: Black Approved Brands:
Hon 214CP or Equal. 30, NO BID||NO BID NO BID §201.00 $6,030.00 HON 214CP.P $1985.52 $5.865.60HON 214C P $385.28]|  s11.558.40

Cabingt; File. vertical, metal, legal size. approximately 28
V2" -28 3447 B X 17 102" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H_ 4-
drawer, without lock, Color: Tan, Approved Brands: Hon

214CP or Equal 130

NO BID[INO BID NO BID $201.00 $28.130.00 HON 214CP.T5 $195.52 $25,417 80fHON 214C $385.28]l  $50,086.40

Cabinet; File. vertical, matal, legal size. approximately 28
12"-283/4"D X 17 172" -18 1/2" W X 52" .52 3/8" H. 4-
drawer. with Jock o be keyed indivdually. Color: Light

2000361 Gray. Approved Brands: Hon 214CP or Equal. 400 NO BID[INO BID NO BID $201.00 $80,400,00 HON 214CP.Q $198.52)l  $78,208.00)|HON 214CP.Q

$402.58{ $161,032.00
Cabinel: File, verlical, metal. legal size, approximately 28

1/2°-28 3/4" D X 17 1/2" 18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually. Color: Putty.
2000416 |Approved Brands: 214 CP or Equal, 750

NO BIDINO BID NO BID §201.00 $150.750.00 HON 214CP.L $195.521  $146.640.00(HON 214CP | $402.58/1 $301,935.00

Cabinel: File_ metal, 30-33 drawer organizer. letter
size approximately 30" W x 11" D x 33" H. Color to be

¢hosen at time of order. Approved Brands: Tennsco #2085,
or Equal 25

36.825 001 TENNSCO 2085 $334.18]_ $8.354.00

$254.50 $6.362.50 Tennsco #2085, 15365 00 $9.125.00 Tennsco #2085, $273.00

Cabinel: File. metal. 30-33 drawer organizer. legal
size.approximalely 30" W x 14" D x 33" H. Color to be
chosen. Approved Brands: Tennsco #3085, or Equal 251$273.90

$6.,847.50 Tennsco #3085.$403.00 $10.075.00 Tennsco #3085, $293.80] $7.345.00) TENNSCO 3085 $355.35|

38.883 75
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Miami- Dade County Public Schoals Bid # 031-MM05

Reviewed by
File Cabinets

Prepared by____

ONTR.&COMM.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL
ESTIMATED  |[NUMBER

DCPSH# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S WARRA,
IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR

Lines 1 through 22, will be awarded on an individual
basis for Low Unit Price,

Cabinet; File. vertical. metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" 30" D X 171/2"18 1/2" W X 28 3/4™- 29 3/8" H. 2.
drawer. Without lock, color: Putty, Approved Brands:

1 HON 212CP or Equal. 75iH212CPL

Cabinet File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
1/2"-30" D X 17 1/2" -18 172" W X 28 3/4" -29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer. with lock lo be keyed indjvidually, Color: Light
2 2000542(Gray, Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal. 25

=]

H212CPQ/HF24

Cabingt: File. vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12"30" D X 17 1/2" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" -28 3/8" H, 2-

drawer, with lock to be keyed individually. Color: Black.
3 Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal 250lH212CPP

Cabinet. File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" X 30" D X (17 1/2" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" -29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock 1o be keyed individually, Color: Putty.
4 2000393 lApproved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal 50

s

H212CPL/HF24

Cabinet: File. vertical, metal, lgqal sjze. approximately 28
1/2"-28 314" D X 17 1/2"- 18 172" W X 52"-523/8"H.-4

drawer. without lock, Color: Light Gray. Approved Brands:
5 Hon 214CP or Equal, 30

H214CPQ

Cabinet; File. vertical, meta!, legal sizs, approximately 28
12" 28 3/4" D X 17 12" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, without lock, Color: Black. Approved Brands:

6 Hon 214CP or Equal. 30jH214CPP

Cabinet: File. vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
1727 -28 314" D X 17 1/2" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, without lock, Color: Tan, Approved Brands: Hon

7 214CP or Equal. 130IH214CP

Cabinet: File, vertical, metal. legal size, approximately 28
12" - 28 3/4" D X 17 1/2" -18 1/2" W X 82" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, with lock to be keyed indivdually, Color: Light

8 2000361} Gray. Approved Brands: Hon 214CP or Equal. 400 H214CPQ/HF24

Cabinet: File. vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12728 347D X AT 1/2"-18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4~
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Putty,
9 2000416 /Approved Brands: 214 CP or Equal.

~
<
o

H214CPL/HF24

Cabinet: File, metal, 30-33 drawer orqanizsr, lstter
size.approximately 30" W x 11" D x 33" H._Color to be

chosen at time of order. Approved Brands: Tennsco #2085,
10 or Equal, 2

f
[

Tennsco #2085

Cabinet: File. metal. 30-33 drawer organizer legal
size.approximately 30" W x 14" D x 33" H. Color o be
11 chosen. Approved Brands: Tennsco #3085, or Equal 25 Tennsco #3085
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Miami- Dade County Public Schools Bid # 031-MMO05

File Cabinets

DCPS#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

SCHOOLHOUSE PRODUCTS,
FRICE PER UNIT |[EXTENDED

FRICE

MAHUFACTURER & MODEL |

NUMBER

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S WARRA

IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR

Lines 1 through 22, will be awarded on an individual
basis for Low Unit Price.

Cabinet: File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" 30" D X 171/2"-18 1/2" W X 28 3/4"- 29 3/8" H. 2~
drawer. Without lack, color; Putty | Approved Brands:
HON 212CP or Equal.

75

$265.86

$19.,939 50

TENNSCO

2000542

Cabinet: File. vertical, metal. legal size, approximately 28
172" -30"D X 17 1/2" -18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" -29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Light
Gray, Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal..

250

$265.86;

$66,465.00

ENGV282C-MF-NL

TENNSCQ v282C-
MF

Cabinet; File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
1/2"30" D X 17 172" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" 29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Black.
Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal.

250

$265.86

$66,485.00

TENNSCO v282C-
MF

2000393

Cabinet: File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
/2" X30"D X (17 1/2" - 18 1/2" W X 28 3/4" 29 3/8" H, 2-
drawer, with lock to be keyed individually, Color: Putty.
Approved Brands: HON 212CP or Equal.

§265.86

$132,930.00

TENNSCO v282C-
MF

Cabinet: File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximalely 28
1/2°-28 34" D X 17 142" 18 1/2" W X _52"-52 3/8" H.- 4

drawer. without lock, Color: Light Gray, Approved Brands:
Hon 214CP or Equal,

30,

$401.14

$12.034.20

TENNSCO
ENGV284C-MF-NL

Cabinet: File. vertical, metal. legal size. approximately 28
1/2"-28 3/4" D X 17 1/2" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-

drawer, without lock, Color: Black. Approved Brands:

Hon 214CP or Equal.

30

$401.14

$12.034.20

Cabinel: File, vertical. metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" 283/4" D X 17 142" -18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" M, 4-
drawer, without tock, Color: Tan, Approved Brands: Hon
214CP or Equal.

130

$401.14

$52,148.20

TENNSCO
ENGV2842C-MF-NL

TENNSCO
ENGV284C-MF-NL

2000361

Cabinet. File, vertical, metal, legal size, approximately 28
12" -283/4" D X 17 1/2" 18 1/2" W X 52" -52 3/8" H, 4-
drawer, with lock to be keyed indivdually, Color: Light
Gray. Approved Brands: Hon 214CP or Equal.

400)

5401.14

$160,456.00

TENNSCO v284C-
MF

2000416

Cabinet. File. vertical, metal. legal size, approximately 28
1/2"-28 3/4" D X 17 1/2" 18 1/2" W X 52" .52 3/8" M, 4-
drawer. with lock to be keyed individually. Color: Putty.
Approved Brands: 214 CP or Equal.

$401.14

$300.855.00

TENNSCO v284C-
MF

Cabingl File. metal. 30-33 drawer organizar, letler
size.spproximately 30" W x 11" D x 33" H. Color to be

chosen al lime of order, Approved Brands; Tennsco #2085,
or Equal.

25

$274.20]

$6,£55.00

TENNSCO 2085

Cabinet: File. metal, 30-33 drawer organizer, legal
size.approximately 30" W x 14" D x 33" H. Color to be

chosen. Approved Brands: Tennsco #3085, or Equal

25

TENNSCO 3085
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Miami- Dade County Public Schools Bid # 031-MMO05

File Cabinets

OCPS#

DESCRIPTION OF [TEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

PRICE

YOUR QFFICE, INC,
FRICE PER UNIT|[EXTENDED

URER &
MODEL

EXTENDED PRICE

BIKO ENGINEERING SERVICE, INC. J

MANUFACTIPRICE PER UM

MODEL NUMBER

Cabine! File, tateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size approximately 18" - 18 1/4 "D x ( 30" ‘W) x 27 1/2" - 28
3/8"H, \with lock. Color: Putty or Black. Approved
Brands: Steeicase 2LF18302F. Hon #K572LL, or Equal

25

each

NO BID

$187.48

$4.187.00

Per Format B

Cabinet File. lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (36" W ) x 283/8" H,
with fock Color Putty, or Charcoal. Approved Brands:
Sleelcase 20.F18362F, Hon #K682L, or Equal.

Each

NO BID

$189.74

$4,743.50

Per Format B

Cabinet File, lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (42" W) x 27 1/2" - 28
1/2" H, with lock, color Putty or Charcoal. Approved '
Brands: Steelcase #2L.F18422F, Hon KB92L, or Equal.

30

Each

NO BID

$224.72

$6,741.60

Per Format B

Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, melal, legal
size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D x (30" W) x - 51 3/16" ~

53 9/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved
Brands: Steelcase 2LF18304F, Hon #K74L, or Equal,

25

Each

NO BID

$279.84

$6,996.00

Per Format B

Cabingt File, tateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximalely 18” - 19 1/4" D x (36" W) x 51 3/16" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved
Brands: Steelcase 2LF18364F, Hon #KB4L. or Equal.

100

Each

NO BID

$312.17

$31.217.00

Per Format B

Cabinel File, vertical with five drawer. metal legal size,
approximately (28 1/2" X 307 D X (17 1/2"-18 1/2") W X (60
-61 1/2") H, five drawer with lock. Colors: Putty, Light Gray
or Biack. Approved Brands: Hon 215 CP. Or Equal.

100

Each

NO BID

$314.29

$31,429.00

Per Format B

Cabipet File, lateral with five drawers, melal. legal size,
approximately ( 19 1/4") D x (30" W ) x (67") H, with lock.
Color: Tan , Gray, Charcoal or Black. Approved Brands:
Hon #6751, or Equal

100

Each

NO BID

$400.68

$40,068.00

Per Format 8
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Miami- Dade Counly Pukiic Schools Bid # 031-MM05

Reviewed by

File Cabinets Prepared by
EMPIRE OFFICE ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES JC WHITEQFFICE FURNITURE | _STAPLES C
PRICE PER UNITI[EXTENDED PRICE| MAHUFACTURER & PRICE PER EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED [MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER [[EXTENDED
ESTIMATED MODEL HUMBER UNIT MODEL NUMBER PRICE MODEL HUMBER UNIT PRICE
DCPSH# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY
Cabinel Eila_lateral with twa 12" hinh drawers meial lsgal
size approximately 18" - 19 1/4 "D x ( 30" W) x 27 1/2"- 28
3/8"H, with lock. Color; Putty or Black. Approved HON 872L.P OR
12 Brands: Steelcase 2LF18302F Hon #K572LL, or Equal 25[15239.23 $5.980.75 Steelcase 2LF18301$150.00 $3.750.00 872L.L $139.55 $3.488.75/(HON 5721 L $273.53 $6.838.25
Gabinel File. lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 1819 1/4” D x (36" W ) x 283/8" H,
with Iockamor Putty, or Charcoal. Approved Brands: HON 682L.L OR
13 Steelcase ZLF18362F. Hon #K682L. or Equal. 25|1$274.48 $6,862.00 Sleelcase 2LF183d/5162.00 54.050.00 682.L.8 5159.49 53,987.25HON 882L.L $310.00| $7,750.00
Cabinet File, lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximalely 18"-19 1/4" D x (42" W) x 27 1/2" - 28
12" H, with fock, color Putty or Charcoal. Approved HON 692L.L OR
14 Brands: Steelcase #2LF18422F, Hon K692L, or Equal, 3015307.21 $9.216.30 Steelcase #2L.F184(8191.00 $5.730.00 69215 $186.32 $5.589.60){HON 692LL/LS $366.57|__$10.997.10
Cabinet File. lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D x (30" W) x - 51 3/16" -
53 9/32" H, with lock, Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved HON 874178
15 Brands: Steelcase 2LF18304F, Hon #K74L, or Equal. 2511342917 $10.729.25 lSteelcase 2LF183(|$257.00 $6,425.00 OR 674L.Q $231.40 $5,785.00)HON 574LQ $458.22]1 $11,455.50
Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
sizee, approximately 18" - 18 1/4" D x (36" W) x 51 3/16" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray, Approved HON 884L.TS
16 Brands: Steelcase 2LF18364F, Hon #K84L, or Equal. 100//S488.89 $48.889.00  ||Steelcase 2LF183§/5282.00 $28.200.00 OR 684L.Q $281.39|  $26,139.00fHON 584L.Q $511.05] $51,106.00
Cabinel File, vertical with five drawer. metal legal size
approximately (28 1/2" X 30") D X (17 1/2"-18 1/2") W X (80 HON 215CP.L
-61.1/2") H, five drawer with lock. Colors: Putty, Light Gray OR 215CP.Q OR
17 or Black, Approved Brands: Hon 215 CP. Or Equal, 100INO BID $269.00 $26.900.00 215CP.P 5259.48 $25.946,00)|HON 215CP $515 26) 551.526.00
Cabinel File. lateral with five drawers, metal, legal size. HONG75L. TS
approximately ( 19 1/4") D x (30" W )'x (67") H, wilh lock, OR675L.Q OR
Color: Tan , Gray, Charcoal or Black. Approved Brands: 875L.8 OR
18 Hon #6751, or Equat, 100]NO BID $353.00 $35.300.00 875L.P §329 48]l $32,945,00[HON 675L $665.53]  $65,553.00
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Miami- Dade Counly Public Schools Bid # 031-MM05
File Cabinels

ONTR.&COMM,

DCPS#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

PANUFACTURER & MODEL
NUMBER

Gahinel File Iateral with two 12" high drawers_mstal lagal

size approximately 18" - 19 1/4 "D x ( 30" W) x 27 1/2" - 28
3/8"H, with lock. Color: Putty or Black. Approved
Brands: Steeicase 2LF18302F, Hon #K572LL. or Equal

)
u

SIHS72LL

Cabinet File, lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (36" W ) x 283/8" H,
with lock Color Pulty. or Charcoal. Approved Brands:
Sleelcase 2LF18362F. Hon #KBB2L, or Equal.

He82LL

Cabinet File, lateral with two 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (42" W) x 27 1/2" - 28
1/2" H, with lock, color Putty or Charcoal. Approved
Brands: Steelcase #2LF18422F. Hon KB892L. or Equal.

w

0

HE92LL

Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D x (30" W) x - 51 3/16" -
53 8/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved
Brands: Steelcase 2LF18304F, Hon #K74L, or Equal.

H574LP

Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers. metal, legal
size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D x (36" W) x 51 3/16" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved
Brands: Steelcase 2LF18384F, Hon #K84L, or Equal.

100,

H584LP

Cabinet File, vertical with five drawer. metal legal size,
approximately (28 1/2" X 30"} D X (17 1/2"-18 1/2") W X (60
61 1/2") M, five drawer with lock. Colors: Putty, Light Gray
or Black. Approved Brands: Hon 215 CP, Qr Equal

100

H215CPL

Cabinet File. lateral with five drawers, metal, legal size,
approximately { 19 1/4") D x (30" W ) x (87"} H. with lock.
Color: Tan , Gray, Charcoal or Black. Approved Brands:

Hon #6875, or Equal.

100

HE75L

Pags 7 oat 12
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Miami- Dade County Public Schools Bid # 031-MM05

File Cabinets

SCHOOLHOUSE PRODUCTS,

PRICE PER UNIT |[EXTENDED

MAMUFACTURER & iMODEL

ESTIMATED PRICE NUMBER
DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY

Cahinet Fils laleral with twn 127 high drawers_malal {aqal

size approximately 18" - 19 1/4 "D x ( 30" W) x 27 1/2"- 28

3/8"H. .with lock, Color: Putty or Black. Approved R GROUPE LACASSE
12 Brands; Stezelcase 2LF18302F. Hon #K572LL. or Equal 25 $221.03 $5.525.75|LPR-0230D

Gabinel File, lateral with two 12" high drawers. metal. fegal

size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (36" W ) x 283/8" H,

with lock Color Putty, or Charcoal. Approved Brands: GROUPE LACASSE
13 Steelcase 2LF18362F, Hon #K882L, or Equal, 25 524884 $6,246.00(LPR-02360

Capinet File, iateral with two 12" high drawers. metal, legat

size, approximately 18"-19 1/4" D x (42" W) x 27 1/2"-28

1/2" H, with lock, color Putty or Charcoal. Approved GROUPE LACASSE
14 Brands: Steelcase #2L.F18422F Hon K692L, or Equal 30 $282.05 $8,461.50]LPR-02420

Cabinel File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, lzgal

size, approximalely 18" - 19 1/4" D x (30" W) x - 51 3/16" -

53 9/32" H, with lock. Color Tan or Light Gray. Approved GROUPE LACASSE
15 Brands: Steelcase 2L F18304F, Hon #K74L. or Equal. 25 $364.76 $9,119.00||LPR-04300

Cabinet Filg, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal. legal

size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D x (36" W) x 51 3/18" -

53 9/32" H, with lock, Color Tan or Light Gray Approved GROUPE LLACASSE
16 Brands: Steelcase 2LF18364F. Hon #K84L. or Equal. 100 $387.141  $38.714.00[[LPR-0438D

Cabinet File, vertical with five drawer. metal legal size.

approximately (28 1/2" X 30") D X (17 1/2"-18 1/2") W X (80

61 1/2") H, five drawer with lock, Colors; Putty, Light Gray TENNSCO v285C -
17 or Black, Approved Brands: Hon 215 CP. Or Equal, 100 $469.55)  $46,955 00){MF

Cabinel File. lateral with five drawers. metal. legal size.

approximately { 19 1/4") D x (30" W ) x (87"} H, with lock.

Caolor: Tan , Gray, Charcoal or Black. Approved Brands: GROUPE LACASSE
18 Hon #675L, or Equal. 100 $413.24 $41,324,00/EP LPR - 0330D

Page & o112
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Miami- Dade County Public Schools Bid # 031-MM03
File Cabinets

Reviewed by,
Prepared by,

DCPSH

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

YOUR OFFICE, INC.
UNIT |[PRICE PER UNITIEXTENDED MANUFACTIPRICE PER UNJ

PRICE URER &
MODEL.

EXTENDED PRICE

BIKO ENGINEERING SERVICE, INC. J

MANUFACTURER &

MODEL NUMBER

Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size. approximately 18" - 19 1/4”" D x (42" W ) x 51 3/18" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color: Putty or Lght Gray,
Approved Brands: Steelcase #2L.F18424F, Hon #6941, or
Equal.

100,

Each

NO BID

$391.14

$39,114.00

Per Format B

approximate dimension of 36"W x 241/4" D x 72 3/4" H.
Color Putty, Black or Light Gray. Approved Brands:
Tennsco 7224302, Hon $C2472, or Equal,

Cabinet, Storage. includes five adjustable shelves with lock,

200

Each

$325.31

$65,062.00 $266.59

$53,318.00

Per Format B

21

Cabinet. Storage, includes five adjustable shelves , with
lock, approximate dimensions of 36" W x 18 1/4" D x 72" H.
Colors Putty,, Light Gray or Black. Approved Brands:
Hon #SC1872, Tennsco 7218301, or Equal.

Each

§281.24

$42,186,00 $227.90

$34,185.00

Per Formal 8

22

Flat File, 5 drawer flat file, heavy gauge steel. drawer size
37' x 26’ x 2'. available colors. Tan. gray, charcoal or Black

Mavyline 7867C. Safco 4994 or Equal, Myst include a
closed flush base. 4'. Mayline 7867W. 6' Safco 4895. or

Equat,

Each -

$944 .16

$9,441.60 $908.42

$8.084.20

Per Format 8

23

Flat File. Art and Blueprint File, 5 drawer. inner drawer size

50" x 38 3/4' x 2", colors. Tan, Gray, Charcoal or Black,

24

Mayline 7869C. Safco 4998 or Equal. Must include a
closed flush base, 4' high. Mayline 7869W. Safco 4999 &'
high or Equal.

Each

$1.302.18

$13,021.80 $1.263,52

$12.635.20

Per Format B

BALANCE OF Ll

4% TENNSCO35%

NQ BALANCE
OF LINE

Page ¢ ol
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Miami- Dade County Public $Schools Bid # 031-MMOS

File Cabinets

Reviewed by,
Prepared by,

EMPIRE OFFICE

ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES

JC WHITEQFFICE FURNITURE

STAPLES ¢

~ PRICE PER UNIT|[EXTENDED PRICE| MANUFACTURER & |[PRICE PER | EXTENDED PRICE [MANUFACTURER & ||  PRICE PER UMIT  JEXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER J[EXTENDED
ESTIMATED MODEL NUMBER  JlUNIT MODEL NUMBER PRICE MODEL NUMBER UNIT iPRICE
DCPS# DESCRIPTION QOF {TEM QUANTITY
Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal
size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4"D X (42" W) x 51 a716" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color: Putty or Lght Gray.
Approved Brands: Steelcase #2LF18424F, Hon #5941, or HONB94L.L OR
19 Equal. 100{8555.80 $55,580.00 Steslcase #2LF18{$334.00 §33,400.00 694L.Q $319.87 $31.987.00||HON 68941 $640.10] $64,010.00
Cabinetl, Storage, includes five adjustable shelves with lock,
approximate dimension of 36"W x 241/4" D x 72 3/4" H, HONSC2472.L
Color Putty, Black or Light Gray. Approved Brands: OR 8C2472.Q
20 Tennsco 7224302, Hon SC2472, or Equal 2001$253.05 $50,610.00  [Tennsco 7224302.($217.00 543,400 00 OR 8C2472.P $209.48}  541,896,00] HON $C2472 $398.37|| $79.674.00
Cabinel, Storage, inciudes five adjustable shelves , with
lock, approximate dimensions of 36" W x 18 1/4“ D x 72" H. HON1872.L OR
Colars Putty,, Light Gray or Black. Approved Brands: 8C1872.Q OR
21 Hon #8C1872, Tennsco 7218301, or Equal. 150/1$211.36 $31,704.00  |[Tennsco 7218301.[1$186.00 $27.900.00 SC1872.P 5180.68|  $27.102.00|HON $C1872 $342.26]| $51.339.00
Flai Eile. & drawer flal file. heavy gauge steel. drawer size
371 x 26' x 2', available colors, Tan. grav, charcoal or Black
Mayline 7867C. Safco 4994 or Equal. Must include & SAFCO 4994
closed flush base. 4'. Mayling 7867W. &' Safco 4995, or . WITH 4995
22 Equal, 10§8793.85 $7.936.50 Mayline 7867\W[5996.00 $9.960.00 BASE $863.94 58,639,40|MAYLINE7887W $967.99)  $9.679.90
Elat File, Art and Bluepriol File, 5 drawer, inner drawer size
50' x 38 3/4' x 2', colors, Tan, Gray, Charcoal or Black.
Mavline 7869C, Safco 4998 or Equal. Must include a SAFCQ 4998
closed flush base. 4' high. Mayling 7869W, Safco 4989 &' WITH 4999
2 high or Equal._ 101$1.027.49 $10,274.90 Mayline 7860V | #afsss $13.260.00 BASE $1.191.54 $11.915 40fMAYLINE 7869W | 51 322 86} $13.228.60
HONG1.7%, PER'STATE OF
Tenhscoiy FLORIDA
) S NO BALANCE OF 26.1% Safco CONTRACT
24 BALANCE OF LINE %{Otlier Dimensicns/Col LINE 26:1%: 5 e #425-001-06-1

Page 10 0112




Miami- Dade County Public Schoals 8id # 031-MMO5
File Cabinels

ONTR.ECOMM.

DCPSH#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

MANUFACTURER & MODEL
NUMBER

Cabinel File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal

size, approximalely 18" - 18 174" D x (42" W) x 51 a6 -
53 8/32" H, with lock. Color: Putty or Lght Gray.
Approved Brands: Steelcase #2LF18424F, Hon #8941, or
Equal.

100

HBY4L

20

Cabinet. Storage, includes five adjustable shelves with lock,
approximate dimension of 36"W x 241/4" D x 72 3/4" M.
Color Putty, Black or Light Gray. Approved Brands:
Tennsco 7224302, Hon SC2472, or Equal.

200]

H8C2472LP

Cabinel. Storage, includes five adjustable shelves , with
lock. approximate dimensions of 36" W x 18 1/4" D x 72" H.
Colors Putty,, Light Gray or Black, Approved Brands:
Hon #5C1872, Tennsco 7218301, or Equal.

HSC1872L

Flat File, 5 drawer flat file. heavy gauge steel_drawer size

37' x 26 x 2" available colors, Tan, grav, charcoal or Black

Maviing 7867C. Safco 4994 or Egual. Must include a
closed flush base, 4'. Mayling 7867W. 6 Safco 4995 or

Equal,

Q

SAFCQ4995/4994

23

Elal File, At and Blueprint File. 5 drawer. inner drawer size
50' x 38 3/4' x 2. colors. Tan, Gray, Charcoal or Black.

Mayline 7869C, Safco 4998 or Egual. Must include a
closed flush base. 4' high, Maviine 7869W. Safco 4999 &'

0

24

high or Equal,

SAFCO4998/4999

Page 11 ol 12
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Miami- Dade Counly Public Schoals Bid # 031-MMO5

File Cabinets

SCHOOLHOUSE PRODUCTS.

DCPS#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

PRICE PER UNIT

EXTENDED
PRICE

e E e I RNNPHUEI
IAANUFACTURER & MOBEL

INUMBER

Cabinet File, lateral with four 12" high drawers, metal, legal

size, approximately 18" - 19 1/4" D X (42" W} x 51 a716" -
53 9/32" H, with lock. Color: Putty or- Lght Gray.
Approved Brands: Steelcase #2LF18424F . Hon #6594L. or
Equal.

100

$437.31

$43,731.00

GROUPE LACASSE
LPR-04420D

20

Cabingt, Storage. includes five adjustable shelves with lock,
approximate dimension of 36"W x 241/4" D x 72 3/4" H.
Color Putty, Black or Light Gray. Approved Brands:
Tennsco 7224302, Hon SC2472, or Equal,

200]

$272.84

$54.528.00

TENNSCO 7224302

21

Cabinet, Storage. includes five adjustable shelves |, with
lock, approximate dimensions of 36" W x 18 1/4" D x 72" H,
Colors Putty,, Light Gray or Black. Approved Brands:
Hon #8C1872, Tennsco 7218301, or Equal.

150

$227.73

$34,159.50

TENNSCO 7218301

22

Flat File. § drawer flat file, heayy gauge steel, drawer size

37' % 28' x 2', available colors. Tan, gray. charcoal or Black
Mavyling 7867C. Safco 4994 or Fqual Must include a

closed flush base. 4. Mavline 7867W. 6 Safco 4995_or
Equal,

NO 8ID

NO 8ID

NO BID

23

Flat File. At and Blueprint File, 5 drawer. inner drawer size

50'x 38 3/4' x 2'. colors, Tan, Gray, Charcoal or Black,

Mayiline 7869C. Safco 4998 or Equal, Must include a
closed flysh base,_4' high. Mavline 7868W. Safgo 4999 &'

high or Equal,

NQ BID

NO BID

NQ BiD

NQ BALANCE OF

LINE
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