Tha Schaol Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-L1.04

Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-0.1L.04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

A Pius Computer, Services (Non-Responsive)

Buyer: H. Eschbach

ATCi Communications inc.

PRICE PER FLAT RATE PRICE PER FLAT RATE
PRICE PERFLAT-RATE |  SERVICECALLSC | o0 TARte Fon | HOURLY LABORRATE | PRICE PER FLATRATE |  SERVICE CALL -SC e ::RREE(;‘(';T HOURLY LABOR
SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED 8Y P {FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY e At O | RATE (FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS () [SCHOOLS ?BN)D orsices| T ) MATERIALS) (D) | REQUESTED BY ITS (A) | scHOOLS (ABN)D OFFICES| \ TemaLey () | MATERIALS) )
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
GROUP I Desktop Computers
1 Acer $195.00 $185.00 0% Off List $47.50
2 Dell $7195.00 $195.00 PR T
3 Gateway $195.00 $195.00 om0
4 Hewlett Packard/Compaq $195.00 $195.00 0% Off List $47.50
5 IBM / LENOVO $195.00 $195.00 PP [T) 1)
5 Sony $195.00 795,00 omie e
7 Toshiba $195.50 3195.00 PR
8 Desktop Computers NOT Listed $195.00 $196.00 $47.50
Above 0% Off List
PRICE PER FLAT RATE | PRICE PER FLAT RATE | ,
GROUP II: Laptop and Tablet PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | SERVICE CALL-SC | 7 OF i:;;?(:(‘)? HOURLY LABOR RATE. | PRICE PER FLAT-RATE |  sERvics caLsc | %O ';:RR'TCSE(;'(’)SJ HOURLY LABOR
Computers SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND (FOR TiME AND SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND RATE {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS (A} [SCHOOLS (ABN)D OFFICES MATERIALS) {C} MATERIALS) (D) REQUESTED BY ITS {A} | SCHOOLS AND OFFIiCES MATERIALS) (C) MATERIALS) (D)
ITEM
S Acer $210.00 $210.00 honLee 5550
$210.00 710.00 3500
10 Dell B 0% Off List N
11 Gateway $310.00 $210.00 $55.00
0% Off List
210.00 210. X a
12 Hewlett Packard/Compag $: $210.00 0% Off List $55.00 % o
SRS
40,01 X
13 |IBM/LENOVO $210.00 $216.00 honet  5Ea0
10.4 . !
14 |Sony $210.00 $770.00 ronier 58
15 Toshiba $210.00 T$210.00 0% Off Lot $55.00
16 Laptop and Tablet Computers $210.00 $210.00 $55.00
NOT Listed Above 0% Off List
PRICE PER FLAT RATE PRICE PER FLAT RATE
) PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | SERVICECALL-SC | ‘2 r ;::}‘;E(:és; HOURLY LABORRATE | PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | SERVICE CALL-s¢ | % OFEPRICELIST | youp v agor
Group i - PC Monitors SERVICE CALL - 5C REQUESTED BY TIME AND {FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AN“] RATE (FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS (A} {SCHOOLS (ABN)D OFFICES. MATERIALS) (C) MATERIALS) (D) REQUESTED BY ITS (A} [ SCHOOLS (ABN)D QFFICES MATERIALS} (C} MATERIALS) (D)
ITEM
$119.50 $118.50 5500
17 |Acer osomtm [
119.50 X X
18 Delt § $119.50 0% Of List $55.00
$118.50 $119.50 $55.00
19 Gateway 0% Off List

e

~




The Schoot Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04
Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED APlus Computer, Services {Non-Responsive) ATCI Gommunicatigns Inc.
Buyer: H. Eschbach
$119.50 119.50 55.00
20 Hewlett Packard/Compag $ 0% Off List $
21 IBM / LENOVO $119.50 $115.50 0% Off List $55.00
$119.50 $119.50 55.00
22 Sony wwontist |
i 118, 19, .
23 Toshiba $113.50 $118.50 % Off List $55.00
24 PC Monitors NOT Listed Above $113.50 $115.50 $55.00
0% Off List
PRICE PER FLAT RATE PRICE PER FLATRATE | ,
PRICE PER FLATRATE |  SERVICECALL-SC | R OF ;::;CSE(;SJ HOURLY LABOR RATE | PRICE PER FLATRATE | SERVICECALL-SC | % OF ;::;‘;‘E(FL")S; HOURLY LABOR
Group 1V; Servers SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY T AND (FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL -8C REQUESTED BY TIME AND RATE (FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS (A) {SCHOOLS (ABN)D OFFICES| o rroial®) (€) MATERIALS) (D) REQUESTED BY ITS (A) [SCHOOLS AND OFFICES| \, Thp II0 MATERIALS) (D)
ITEM
Delt $525.00 $525.00 0% OFf List $95.00
25 SERVER FARM: Located at $525.00
Information Technology Services $525.00 0% Off List
$95.00
26 School Sites $525.00 N R
$525.00 0% Off List 55.00
Gateway $525.00
$525.00 0% Off List
$95.00 o
27 |SERVER FARM: Located at §525.00 T
Information Technology Services v %gf;f%‘”%
o
$525.00 0% Off List .
o
595.00 - . e
28 School Sites $525.00 i !
$525.00 0% Off List 585,00
Hewlett Packard / Compaq s $
0% Off List
i_ 3
29 SERVER FARM: Located at $525.00 $525.00
Information Technology Services
0% Off List
$95.00
30 School Sites $525.00 $525.00
0% Off List
$95.00
IBM/ LENOVO M $
0% Off List
s
31 SERVER FARM: Located at $526.00 $525.00 $95.00
Information Technology Services 0% Off List
32 Schooi Sites $525.00 $525.00 $95.00
0% Off List
Servers Not Listed Above A M $
0% Off List
33 SERVER FARM: Located at $525.00 5525.00 $95.00
information Technology Services
0% Off List




The School Board Of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

A Plus Computer, Services Non-Responsive)

ATCi Communications inc.

Buyer: H. Eschbach

School Sites

’5525 00

2 .00
$525.00 0% Off List $95.




The Schoal Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LLO4
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

A Plus Computer, Services (Non-ResEcnsive)

Buyer: H. Eschbach

ATCi Communigations inc,

PRICE PER FLAT RATE | PRICE PER FLAT RATE |
% OFF PRICE LIST % OFF PRICE LIST
i PRICE PER FLAT-RATE |  SERVICE CALL -SC HOURLY LABOR RATE | PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | SERVICE CALL -SC HOURLY LABOR
I R
Group V - Network Connectivity SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY mix‘gﬂg oR (FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED 8Y F°'§mgﬁg°a RATE (FOR TIME AND
Devices REQUESTED BY ITS (A) |SCHOOLS AND OFFices| RS, MATERIALS) (D) REQUESTED BY ITS (A} [scHoOLs AN oFFIcES| ), tibidiO | MATERIALS) (D)
(8} (8)
ITEM
35 3com $ s 0% Off List $55.00
36 o
Cisco Switches and Hubs - o
(Exctuding Catalyst 5000 .
Series) All Cisco equipment “i/g
{must be picked up for service at N
0% Off List $55.00
the M-DCPS 1SS Annex. Any y
service outside of the M-DCPS
1SS Annex must be authorized by
M-DCPS personnel.
37 Shiva $ $ 0% Off List $55.00
38 Acer s % Off List $55.00
38 APC Back-up Power Supply {(Not | {$ s
Including Battery) WhOffList  |$55.00
40 Fortinet g $ 0% Off List $55.00
41 Hewlett Packard $ 0% Off List $55.00
42 Hewlett Packard - Tipping Point s s
0% Off List $55.00
43 Oneac (Not including Battery) s s
0% Off List $65.00
44 M86 Technologies M M 0% Off List $55.00
45 Network Connectivity Devices $ s .
NOT Listed Above Ok OffList 185500
Group VI - Printers - Lasers and | | PRICE PER FLATRATE | PRICE PER FLAT RATE | % S PRISELET | iounLy LABOR RATE | PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | PRICE PER FLAT RATE o areon | HouRLY LasOR
; SERVICE CALL-SC | SERVICE CALL -SC PR (FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL-SC | SERVICE CALL -SC e Au | RATE (FOR TIME AND
Inkjets REQUESTED BY ITS (&) REQUESTED BY MATERIALS) (C. MATERIALS} {D) REQUESTED BY ITS (A) REQUESTED BY MATERIALS) (C) MATERIALS) {D}
SCHOOLS AND OFFICES HE SCHOGLS AND OFFICES
ITEM (B) {B)
Lasers i $ % Off List s
46 |Brothers $145.50 $145.50 o ofiList |70
47 Canon $145.50 $125.50 0% Off List $47.50
48 Deil $145.50 $145.50 0% Off List $47.50
49 Epson $145.50 $145.50 0% Off List $47.50
50 Hewlett Packard $145.50 $145.50 0% Off List $47.50
51 Lexmark $145.50 $145.50 0% Off List $47.50
52 |Xerox $169.50 $189.50 hOH LSt |565.00
53 Laser Printers Not Listed Above $145.50 $145.50 $47.50
0% Off List
Inkjets & $ 0% Off List $
54 Brother $99.00 $99.00 0% Off List $47.50
55 Canon $99.00 $05.00 0% Off List $47.50
56 Dell $99.00 $99.00 0% Off List $47.50
A7 EpsQn $89.00 $99.00 0% Off List $47.50
58 Hewlett Packard $99.00 $99.00 0% Off List $47.50
59 Lexmark $99.00 $99.00 0% Off List $47.50
30 Kerox $99.00 $35.00 0% Off List $47.50




The Schoot Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-L.L.04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

A Plus Computer, Services {Non-Responsive} ATCi Communications Inc.

Buyer: H. Eschbach

61

Inkjet Printers Not Listed Above

$99.00

$99.00 $47.50
0% Off List




The School Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LLO4

Computer Equipment Service Repais

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

A Plus Computer, Services Non-Responsive)

ATCi Communications Inc.

Buyer: H. Eschbach

) PRICE PER FLAT-RATE won ﬁ::;gi oy | wourLy Lasor raTE | Price PR FLAT-RATE rom ::T";E( oot | HourLY Lasor
Group Vil - Apple Devices SERVICE CALL - S§C TIME AND (FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL - §C TIME AND RATE {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY (7S (A) | PRICE PERFLATRATE | yaTermar. $146) MATERIALS) (D} REQUESTED BY ITS (4) | pRICE PER FLATRATE | yaremiaLs) © | MATERALS)®)
SERVICE CALL -SC SERVICE CALL -$C
REQUESTED BY REQUESTED BY
TEM SCHOOLS AND OFFICES SCHOOLS AND OFFICES
8} {8)
62 Desktops $425.00 $425.00 0% Off List $55.00 No Bid INo Bid
63 I-Pads and Tablets $179.50 $179.50 % Off List $55.00 No Bid No Bid
64 L aptops 5205.00 $205.00 9% Off List $35.00 No Bid No Bid
65 Monitors $119.50 $119.50 0% Off List $47.50 No Bid No Bid
66 Servers §525.00 $625.00 0% Off List $95.00 No Bid No Bid
67 Apple Devices Not Listed Above | [$205.00 $305.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
0% Off List
PRICE PER FLAT RATE o PRICE PER FLAT RATE | ,
) ) PRICE PER FLATRATE | SERVICECALL s | #OF ;::;‘;'i:és; HOURLY LABOR RATE | PRICE PER FLAT-RATE | SERVICE CALL S | % OFF PRICELIST] oupiy Lasor
Group VIl - Wireless Devices SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND (FOR TIME AND SERVICE CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME ANé RATE {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS (A} |SCHOOLS (ABN)D OFFICES|  yxreriars) () MATERIALS) (D} REQUESTED BY ITS (4} |SCHOOLS ;(a;o OFFICES| arenials) (c) MATERIALS) (D)
ITEM
Controilers % Off List s
68  |Hewlett Packard [5500
s $56.00
69 Menu 9% Off List
70 Controllers Not Listed Above 358.00 ;
0% Off List ;‘}5
- " 5
Acccess Points (AP's) % OFf List
71 Hewlett Packard 0% Off List
72 Menu s
% Off List
73 Access Points (AP's) Not Listed . $55.00
Above 0% Off List
Group IX - Laptop and Tablet PRICE FOR ORIGINAL PRIGE FOR THIRD All REPLACEMENT BATTERIES ARE REQUIRED | PRICE FOR ORIGINAL PRICE FOR THIRD All REPLACEMENT BATTERIES ARE
Batteries (Supply and Deliver EQUIPMENT PARTY MANUFACTURE | TO HAVE AT LEAST A ONE YEAR WARRANTY OR EQUIPMENT PARTY MANUFACTURE |  REQUIRED TO HAVE AT LEAST A ONE
Only) MANUFACTURE BETTER MANUFACTURE YEAR WARRANTY OR BETTER
ITEM
74 Acer $110.00 $89.00 >< >< >< ><
75 |Be s o — —
76 |Gateway $145.00 $99.00 = | P P
77 [Hewlett PackardiCompag ST $10500 e Pl e
78  [iBM/LENOVO 5185.00 $105.00 | P | |
78 |Sony $185.00 $108.00 | = | > e
8 [Toshiba e 310590 el Pl T
81 Batteries for any Laptop and $189.00 $105.00 - ><

Tablet Computers NOT Listed
Above




The Schoo! Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

BLM Technologies Of Florida, LLG C&C International Comeu!ers & Consultants PC Solutions & |n(egmh’on, Inc.
Buyer: H. Eschbach
PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT
PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT- . PRICE PER FLAT- | PRICE PER FLAT RATE|,
RATESERICE | RATESERVICE | %OFFPRICELIST | HOURLYLABOR | "oyrc (iRl | RATESERVIGE | OFFPRICELIST [\ 0o o oo | PRICEPER FLAT. | PRICE PERF L se |BOFFPRICELIST] |00 o ate
CALL C FOR PARTS (FOR | RATE (FOR TIME CALL -SC FOR PARTS (FOR FOR PARTS (FOR
CALL-SC CALL - 5C (FOR TIME AND CALL-SC REQUESTED BY {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY 18| REQUESTED BY TIME AND ANDMATERIALS) | oequesTeD By ITs] REQUESTED Y TIME AND MATERIALS) (D) | REQUESTED BYITS|  SCHOOLS AND TIME AND MATERIALS) (D)
() SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C) {D) A SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS} (C) (A} OFFICES (B) MATERIALS) (C)
QFFICES (B} OFFICES (B)
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
GROUP I: Desktop Computers
1 Acer s %OffList s
2 Dell $159,00 20% Off List | 58500
3 Gateway M}ﬁ;&ﬁ“;ﬁ N womList g
4 Hewlett Packard/Compag 3 $155.00 20% Off List {58500
5 IBM/ LENOVO $158.00 20% Off List_|505.00
6 Sony s %offList g
7 Toshiba s % OFf List s
8 Desktop Computers NOT Listed
Above % Off List
s s
PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FILAT
PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT- |PRICE PER FLAT RATE
RATESERVICE | % OFF PRICELIST | HOURLY LABOR RATE SERVICE | % OFF PRICE LIST % OFF PRICE LIST
GROUP 1I: Laptop and Tablet | RATE SERVICE CALL -5C FORPARTS (FOR | RATE (FORTIME | TATE SERVICE CALL -SC FOR PARTS (FOR | HOURLYLABORRATE | RATE SERVICE | SERVICE CALL-SC [ poypreteng | HOURLY LABOR RATE
Computers CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND AND MATERIALS) CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND (FOR TIME AND CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND (FOR TIME AND
REQUES(TAE)D BY TS SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C} ©) REQUESTAED BYITS SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C) MATERIALS) (D) REQUES‘T;E)D BYITS Sg’;glgléi (A;D MATERIALS} (C) MATERIALS) (D}
OFFICES (8) " OFFICES (B)
ITEM
9 Acer s %wotfList g
£
10 Deit $200.00 PR )
11 Gateway
% Off List
$ s
.4 85..1
12 Hewlett Packard/Compag $200.00 Zo%offList 20500
13 iBM/LENOVO $200,00 20% oftList 58500
14 Sony s % Off List 5
15 Toshiba s % Off List s
16 Laptop and Tablet Computers :
NOT Listed Above - % Off List
-
. 5 $
PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT
PRICE PER FLAT- RATE SERVICE % OFF PRICE LIST HOURLY LABOR PRICE PER FLAT- RATE SERVICE % OFF PRICE LIST PRICE PER FLAT. | PRICE PER FLAT RATE % QFF PRICE LIST
RATE SERVICE RATE SERVICE ROURLY LABOR RATE RATE SERVICE SERVICE CALL -SC HCURLY LABOR RATE
. CALL -5C FOR PARTS (FOR RATE {FOR TIME CALL -8C FOR PARTS {FOR FOR PARTS {FOR
Group 1H - PC Monitors CALL - SC CALL-SC ({FOR TIME AND CALL -SC REQUESTED BY (FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY 15| REQUESTED BY TIME AND AND MATERIALS) | oequesTeD By fs| "CQUESTED BY TIME AND MATERIALS) (D) | REQUESTED BYITS|  SCHOOLS AND TIME AND MATERIALS) (D)
A SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C} (DY A SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS}HC) ) OFFICES (B} MATERIALS) (C)
OFFICES (B) » OFFICES (B)
ITEM
X X 85.00
17 Acer onofLst | $150.00 $150.00 0% oftList |°
X X 85.00
18  [Dell 0% Off List $160.00 $160.00 2o%ofLst |0
No Bid $
19 Gateway 0% Off List r % Off List




The School Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LL.04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-L104
Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair {On Site) -
REVISED BLM Technologies Of Florida, LLC C8C international Computers & Consultants PC Solutions & integration, tnc,
Buyer: H. Eschbach
$ $ 160.00 85.00
20 Hewlett Packard/Compag v e 0% Off List § 20% Of List B
21 IBM/ LENOVO 9000 . » e s o%offList | $180.00 20% Ofs List | 565:00
- T -~ T <
22 |Sony . 0% Off List s wotst |0
23 |Toshiba $ owofList | ® wosust  |°
24 PC Monitors NOT Listed Above $ $ s B
0% Off List % Off List
PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT
PRICERERTLAT | maTESERVICE | %oPFPRiCELIST | HouRLYLaBOR | P e o PLAT- | RATE SERVICE | % OFF PRIGE LIST HOURLY LABOR RATE | | RATE CERVZE . || oomen FoaT RATE 5% OFF PRICE LIST HOURLY LABOR RATE
. CALL -SC FOR PARTS (FOR | RATE {FOR TIME CALL .SC FOR PARTS (FOR FOR PARTS (FOR
Group 1V: Servers CALL - 5C REQUESTED BY TIME AND AND MATERIALS] GALL - $C REQUESTED BY TIME AND {FOR TIME AND CALL - SC REQUESTED BY TIME AND {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS ) REQUESTED BY iTS MATERIALS) (D} REQUESTED BY ITS SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS} (D)
(A} SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C) Dy A SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C) A OFFICES (B} MATERIALS) (C)
OFFICES (B) OFFICES (B)
ITEM
Dell M osofList | No Bid s woffList  |*
25 SERVER FARM: Located at S $ NB H s
Information Technology Services 0% Off List %, Off List
26 i s B 0] s g
Schooi Sites 0% Off List % Off List
Gateway o $ s N/B g B
g/ 0% Off List % Off List
27 SERVER FARM: Located at = s s NB B B
Informaticn Technology Services
0% Off List % Off List
i 3 $ N/B $ $
28 Schoot Sites 0% Off List % Off List
Hewlett Packard / Compag $ $ N8 i s
0% Off List % Off List
29 SERVER FARM: Located at %/5 s $ N/B s $
Information Technology Services .
.
> o 0% Off List % Off List
S
30 School Sites g B N8 3 i
0% Off List % Off List
IBM / LENOVO s s $375.00 $375.00 §125.00
0% Off List 20% Off List
31 |SERVER FARM: Located at s B $375.00 $375.00 $725.00
{nformation Technolagy Services 0% Off List 20% Off List
32 Schoot Sites s s $375.00 $375.00 $125.00
0% Off List 20% Off List
Servers Not Listed Above $ s NB $ $
0% Off List % Off List
x;)/‘);éx
33 SERVER FARM: Located at s s N/B M s
information Technology Services
0% OH List % Off List




The School Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

8id 054-LL0d
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

PC Solutions & Integeation, Ing.

BLM Technolagles Of Fiorida, LLC

Buyer. H. Eschbach

School Sites

o5

CA&C International Computers & Consultants

s 0% Off List

% Off List

il




The School Board Of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid 054-LL04
Gomputer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED

Buyer: H. Eschbach

BLM Technologies Of Florida, LLC C&C Internationat Computers 8 Consultants

PG Solutions & Integration, Inc.

PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT
PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT- {PRICE PER FLAT RATE
RATE SERVICE % OFF PRICE LIST % Vo
Group V- Notwork Comnecivty | Resiret | MESEISE | Sorraceiar | v son | TSN | TSNS | o et oy usom e | "R Y ["SERAen S e srromceus s son
Devices REQUESTED By s REQUESTED BY TIME AND AND MATERIALS) REQlj:EAsL'Il:E-DS gv irs| REQUESTED BY TIME AND ::srRE:!‘:LESANS Rsa::sl#énsgv s Rsil:«xésosgsii v TIME AND AR O
s SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C} © SCHOOLS AND | MATERIALS) (C) ) (D) ND MATERIALS) (C) ATERIALS) (D)
OFFICES (B) & OFFICES (8) W OFFICES (B)
ITEM
35 [3COM s o onus |5 [io B B worList |5
36 $ $ $ $ $
Cisco Switches and Hubs -
{Excluding Catalyst 5000
Series) All Cisco equipment
{must be picked up for service at % Off Li N B
the M-DCPS ISS Annex. Any 0% OffList h OffList
service outside of the M-DCPS
1SS Annex must be authorized by
M-DCPS personnel.
37  |Shiva v $ osofilist |0 * $ woftList  |°
38  {Acer i o%offList  |® A $ %offList  |°
39 APC Back-up Power Supply (Not $ $ $ 3 s
Including Battery) 0% Off List % Off List
40 [Fortinet $ wsofist | $ $ wofruist  |®
41 Hewlett Packard s o%ofList 1S B s % Off List i
42 Hewlett Packard - Tipping Point s s H g s
0% Off List % Off List
43 Oneac (Not including Battery) $ s s $ s
0% Off List % Off List
44 M86 Technologies $ 0% OF List $ $ $ % Off List $
45 Network Connectivity Devices $ s s s s
NOT Listed Above 0% Off List % Off List
PRICE PER FLAT- | PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT- | PRICE PER FLAT PRICE PER FLAT- .
% OFF PRICE Li! K.
Group VI - Printers - Lasers and RA;E isk;/écs RAzi Lsskvn:s ’;OR £ ARTSE(;'OS}: :2}’;}-:0;“:;: RATE SERVICE | RATE SERVICE ﬁoo: i::‘iés(:ésg HOURLY LABOR RATE |  RATE SERVIGE | PRICE PER FLAT RATE ";OORF i:s,}ii;‘éi' HOURLY LABOR RATE
Inkjets - L-sC TIME AND AND MATERIALS) CALL - 5C CALL -8C TIME AND (FOR TIME AND CALL-SC SERVICE CALL -SC TIME AND {FOR TIME AND
REQUESTED BY ITS| REQUESTED BY MATERIALS) (€} © REQUESTED Y ITs| REQUESTEDBY | TiifME o MATERIALS) (D) | REQUESTEDBY TS| REQUESTED BY AT c MATERIALS) (D)
TEM (a) SCHOOLS AND A SCHOOLS AND © @) SCHOOLS AND MATERIALS) (C)
OFFICES (B) OFFICES (B} OFFICES (B)
Lasers . s $ 0% OffList  |° NB $ %OfList  |°
46 |Brothers No Bid s 0% Off List NiB i worList  |°
47 Canon $ $ onomList  |* Nig s %oftList  |*
48 [Dell g A owofttist | NiB $ womList |5
49 Epson s M 0% OffList % N8 g % Off List
50 Hewlett Packard s g 0% Off List 3 $199.00 $199.00 20% Off List {38500
51 Lexmark ¢ $ onoftList | e s %offlist  |°
52 Xerox i $ oworList  |° e M wottList  |°
53 Laser Printers Not Listed Above $ s s N/B s s
3 0% Off List % Off List
inkjets s 5 0% OffList [$ IN_/B $ %offList |8
54 |Brother s $ o%offlist  |° nig i wottlist  |®
55  iCanon s s oworList | B $ worList  |*
56 Dell s $ owofflist | NIB $ woteList  |®
57 Epson $ $ worLst  |® N8 $ wotrList  |°
58 Hewlett Packard g § o%offList |5 NiB $ w%ottList  |*
59 Lexmark i o%oftlist | NiB 3 wotrList  [*
60  [Xerox ¢ o%ofList | F’E $ wotrtist ¥




The Schooi Board Of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-LL04

Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair {On Site) -
REVISED

BLM Technologies Of Flerida, LL.C

PC Solutions & Integration, Inc.

C&C internationa ComEuters & Consuliants

Buyer: H. Eschbach

61

Inkjet Printers Not Listed Above

"0% Off List

Nig

% Off List




The Schoot Board Of Miami-Dade County, Flarida

Bid 054-LL04
Computer Equipment Service Repair

Bid: # 054-L.1.04
Title: Computer Equipment
Service & Repair (On Site) -
REVISED BLM Technologies Of Florida, LLC C&C International Computers & Consultants PC Solutions & Integration, Ine.
Buyer: H. Eschbach
PRICE PER FLAT- s, PRICE PER FLAT- PRICE PER FLAT-
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