Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MMO04

Page | of 24
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WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.600
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

3 Star Atlantic Radiator, Inc.

Title: Automative, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and AWARDED
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles VENDOR #
Buyer Nume: Harry Eschbach
Important Bid Notes Name of Bidder: Name of Bidder:

ABC Radiator & Air Inc.

Description Of Item

Unit

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount (Minus)

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List name
and issue

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
{Minus)

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List name and
issue

I. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.

la. Labor rate

Hr.

NOBID

Hr.

NO BID

t. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor's facilities.

{a. Labor rate

NO BID

NO BiD

1. Discount on Parts

NO BID

Y

NO BID

1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost pius only. Proof of cost may be required)

NOBID

Y%

NO BID

[Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 1a..

2. Specialized Repairs/T: Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's. To furnish
all labor, materials and parts as required, and equipment for repair

service at vendor's facilities.

2a. Labor rate

NO BID

Hr.

NO BID

2b. Discount on Parts

NO BID

%

NO BID

2¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

NO BID

%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a,

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Sirea-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To fumish al} fabor, materials
and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or
more brand).

Hr.

NO BID

Hr.

NO BID

3b. Whelen Engineering Co, Inc.

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or

NOBID

%

NO BiD

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

NO BID

NO BiD

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c.1 Discount on Parts

%

NO BID

%

NO BID

3c.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

NO BID

NO BID

3d. Sound Off
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Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Beard Vehicles

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

1

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

AWARDED
VENDOR

3

7

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name of Bidder:
3 Star Atlantic Radiator, Inc.

Name of Bidder:
ABC Radiator & Ajr Inc.

Description Of Item

Rate/Price Per

Mark-up

Parts List name

Rate/Price Per

Discount

Parts List name and

s . - Mark-up
J )i Unit 1y. B
Unit Qry Unit Discount (Minus)} 5y ) and issue o Qg Unit (Minus) (Plus) issue
3d. | Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NOBID
3e. Showme Equipment
Je.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID Yo NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID Y% NO BID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3F.} Discount on Parts and/or % NOBID % NO BID
312 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NOBID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 {any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans. SUV's ete. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
4a. Labor rate Hr. NOBID Hr. NO BID
4b. Discount on Parts % NO BID Yo NO BID
4c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only, Proof of cost may be required) - % NO BID % NOBID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or de¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a,
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, fight and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities.
5a. Labor rate Hr, NOBID Hr, NO BID
5b. Discount on Parts Y% NO BID Yo NO BID
5¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NOBID % NOBID
Sd. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr, NO BiD
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. Yo NO BID Yo NO BID
SF. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
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Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

I I AWARDED
VENDOR

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Important Bid Notes Name of Bidder: Name of Bidder:
WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000 3 Star Atlantic Radiator, Inc. ABC Radiator & Air Inc.
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST
Description Of Item . s 5 . : .
Unit Qv Rate/Price Per Discount (Minus) Mark-up Parts List name Uait Qty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up |Parts List name and
- Unit (Pius) and issue - Unit {Minus) {Plus) issue
Note: Vendor must bid Sb. or Sc. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes alf charges (travel,
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid all sub-items (6a, 6b and
6c)
6a. Windshield Y% NO BID % NO BID
6b. Back plate % NO BID 3 NO BID
6¢. Side glass % NG BID % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Fumish all labor, materials. tools.
lequipment, transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in aceordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid all items , 7a, 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (includes pick-up and defivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cu/in 100,000 $0.0479 cu/in 100,000 $0.0500
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cu/in 100,000 $0.0479 cu/in 100,000 $0.0500
Dollar Dollar
(Estimated (Estimated
7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in "Transpro Catalogue” less the fTotal Total
following percentage discount. (Inciudes parts, labor. pick up and Expenditur Expenditur
delivery) e3) 20,000 4.10% ¢es) 20.000 14.00%
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Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name of Bidder:
Abraham Chevrolet Miami Inc. dba Maroone Chevrolet Miami

Name Of Bidder:

Arrow Muffler Co. Inc.

Description Of Item
Unit

Rate/Price Per} Discount
Unit (Minus)

Mark-up
{Plus)

Parts List name
and issue

Unit

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
(Minus}

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List
name and
issug

{. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and
dium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor’s facilities.

la. Labor rate Hr.

369

L. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor’s facilities.

Ia. Labor rate Hr.

NOBID

Hr.

NO BID

Motor Al Data

1. Discount on Parts %

NO BID

10%

Factory
Replacement or
Equivalent

1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Yo

15%

%

NOBID

Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 1a..

2. Specialized Repairs/Transmission Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars. light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's, To furnish
all labor, materials and parts as required. and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities.

2a. Labor rate Hr.

369

NOBID

2b. Discount on Parts Yo

NO BID

NO BID

2¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Yo

15%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a,

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish all labor, materials
and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
ieast one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or Hr.
more brand).

NG BID

Hr.

NO BID

3b. Whelen Engineering Co. Inc.

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or %

NO BID

NG BID

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) %

NO BID

NO BID

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c.1 Discount on Parts %

NO BID

%

NO BID

3¢.2 Mark-up on Pants (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) %

NO BID

%

NO BID

3d. Sound Off

Page 4 0124

Page 4 of 24




Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name of Bidder:
Abraham Chevrolet Miami Inc, dba Maroone Chevrolet Miami

Name Of Bidder:

Arrow Muffler Co. Inc.

Descripti Ity i
escription O [tem Unit Qty. Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up | Parts List name Unit Oty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up :::Z ::::
) Unit {Minus) (Plus) and issue - Unit (Minus) {Plus) .
issue
ST DISTOUTT O TS 2y oT % NO BID % NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
31, Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID Yo NO BID
3f.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars. light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
Imco, Walker
da. Labor rate Hr. 369 Hr. 365 & Supreme
Replacement or|
4b. Discount on Parts Y% NO BID % 20% Equivalent
4¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost pius only. Proof of cost may be required) % 15% % NOBID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities.
5a. Labor rate Hr. 369 Hr. 365 Motor All Data
Factory
Replacement or
5b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % 10% Equivalent
5¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr. NO BID
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO BID
5§, Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % 15% % NO BID
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Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach
Important Bid Notes Name of Bidder: Name Of Bidder:
WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000 Abraham Chevrolet Miami Ine. dba Maroone Chevrolet Miami Arrow Muffler Co. Inc.
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST
ipti Parts List
Description OF Item Unit aty Rate/Price Per{ Discount Mark-up | Parts List name Unit oty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up n:;z a:d
- Unit {Minus) {Plus) and issue - Unit (Minus) {Plus) issue
Note: Vendor must bid 5b. or 5c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's ete. On-site vehicle glass
repl repairs. Discount offered includes all charges (travel,
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid all sub-items (6a, 6b and
6c)
6a. Windshield Y% NO BID % NO BID
6b. Back plate Y% NO BID % NOBID
6e. Side glass % NO BiD % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor. materials, tools,
JUif transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid all items , 72, 7b and 7c to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) . cufin 100.000 NOBID cu/in 100,000{NO BiD
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cufin 100.000 NO BID cu/in 100,000[NO BID
Doltar Dolifxr
{Estimated {Estimate
7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in "Transpro Catalogue™ less the Total d Total
fotlowing percentage discount. (Includes parts. labor, pick up and Expenditure Expendit
delivery) s) 20.000 NO BID ures) 20,000 NO BID
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Bid #: 801-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.600
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

AutoNation Dodge of Pembroke Pines Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

Name of Bidder:
Beacon Auto Care

Description Of Item

3d. Sound Off

Unit Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up P::: :’:J Unit ot Rate/Price Per{ Discount Mark-up | Parts List name
Unit {Minus) (Plus) b issue - Unit (Minus) {Plus) and issue
1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
lon site at vendor's facilities,
ia, Labor rate Hr. 369 Hr. $69
1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor's facilities,
la. Labor rate Hr NO BID Hr, NO BID
1. Discount on Parts % 10% Y 15.00%
1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Yo 15% % 20.00%
Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item Ia..
2. Specialized Repairs/Ti ion Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV’s. To furnish
all labor, materials and parts as required. and equipment for repair
service at vendor’s facilities.
2a. Labor rate Hr. $69 Hr. 569
2b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % 15.00%
2c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % 13% % 20.00%
Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or Zc. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a.
3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish all labor, materials
land parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.
3Ja. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or He. He.
more brand). NO BID NO BID
3b. Whelen Engineering Co, Inc.
3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID Y% NO BID
3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID
3c. Federal Signal Corp.
3¢.1 Discount on Parts Y NO BID Y% NOBID
3¢.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) Y% NO BID % NO BID
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL Page § of 24
Bid #001-MM04

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach
Important Bid Notes Name Of Bidder: Name of Bidder:
WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000 AutoNation Dodge of Pembroke Pines Inc. Beacon Auto Care
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST
Description Of Item Unit Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up i:;:: ::; Unit oty Rate/Price Per] Discount Mark-up | Parts List name
Unit {Minus) (Plus) issue v Unit {Minus) {Plus) and issue

ST DISTORRT O PaTTS ATy or % NO BID % NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % 15%
3.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NOBID % 20%
31. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3{.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % 15%
3.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required), % NOBID % 20%
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 {any brand),
depending on how they will submit their bitling for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
4a. Labor rate Hr. $69 He. $69
4b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % 15%
4c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y 15% 15% 20%
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities.
Sa. Labor rate Hr. $69 Hr. $69
5b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % 15%
S¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % 20%
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr. NO BID
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO 8ID
5f. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % 5% % 15%
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL Page 9 of 24
Bid #001-MMO04

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Important Bid Notes

Name Of Bidder: Name of Bidder:
WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000 AutoNation Dodge of Pembroke Pines Inc. Beacon Auto Care
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Description Of Item . . Parts List
Unit Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up name and Unit oty.

Unit {Minus) (Plus) issue

Rate/Price Per{ Discount Mark-up } Parts List name
Unit (Minus) {Plus) and issue

Note: Vendor must bid 3b. or Sc. or both, depending on how they

will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.

6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, fight
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes alf charges {travel.
fabor glass and materials. Vendor must bid ali sub-items (6a. 6b and
6¢)

6a. Windshield % NC BID Y 10%

6b. Back plate % NOBID % 10%

6¢. Side glass % NO BID % . 10%

7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor. materials, tools.

f transportation and services necessary for motor vehicte
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid all items . 7a. 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):

7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cufin NO BID cu/in 160.000 NO BID

7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cufin NO BID . cu/in 100,000 NO BID

Dollar Dollar
(Estimated (Estimated
7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in “Transpro Catalogue” less the [Total Total
following percentage discount. (Includes parts. labor, pick up and Expenditu Expenditur
delivery) res) NO BID es) 20,000 NO BID
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Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:

Bull Motors LLC dba Maroone Ford Miami

Name Of Bidder:
Dana Safety Supply

Description Of Item

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
{Minus)

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List
name and
issue

Unit

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
{Minus)

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List
name and
issue

1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.

la. Labor rate

Hr.

$69

NOBID

1. Autormotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor’s facilities.

NQ BID

NO BID

la. Labor rate

Hr.

NO BID

Hr.

NO BID

1. Discount on Parts

NO BID

NO BID

tb.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

15%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid {. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item la..

2. Specialized Repairs/Transmission Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's. To furnish
all labor, materials and parts as required. and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities.

2a. Labor rate

Hr.

369

NO BID

2b. Discount on Parts

NO BID

NO BID

2¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

Y%

15%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a,

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish alt labor, materials
and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands fisted below and will require proof of factory
authorization.

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or
more brand).

NO BID

Hr.

NOBID

3b. Whelen Engineering Co, Inc.

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or

NO BID

%

NO BiD

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

%

NO BID

NO BID

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c¢.1 Discount on Parts

NO BID

NO BID

3.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

NO BID

NO BID

3d. Sound Off
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL Page | | of 24
Bid #001-MMO04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Bid #: 001-MMO4 (Format B)
Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach
Important Bid Notes Name Of Bidder: Name Of Bidder:
WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000 Bull Motors LLC dba Maroone Ford Miami Dana Safety Supply
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST
Description Of ftem Unit Qty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up ::::Z i‘:‘; Unit Oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up ::::Z :::;
i Unit (Minus) (Plus) . v Unit {Minus) {Plus) N
issue issue |
U T DISTOM O PAnS ST % NO BID % 20%
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost pius only. Proof of cost may be
required} % NO BID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO 81D % NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % 15%
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3f.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NOBID % NO BID
3.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost pius only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a,
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
4a. Labor rate Hr. $69 Hr. NO BID
4b. Discount on Parts Yo NO BID % NO BID
4. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % 13% NOBID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or dc. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans, SUV’s etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facitities.
Sa. Labor rate Hr. 369 Hr. NO BID
5b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % NO BID
5c¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID Y NO BID
Sd. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus, Hr. NO BID Hr. NO 81D
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO BID
5f. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % 5% % 13%
Page 11 of 24




Bid #: 001-MMU04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:

Bull Motors LLC dba Maroone Ford Miami

Name Of Bidder:
Dana Safety Supply

Description Of tem Unit Oty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up 5:;: ::'; Unit Oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up ::;: ::(;
) Unit {Minus) (Plus) | . Unit (Minus) (Plus) .
issue issue
Note: Vendor niust bid Sb, or Sc. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's ete. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes all charges (travel,
{abor glass and materials. Vendor must bid ali sub-items (6a. 6b and
6¢)
64. Windshield % NO BID % NO BID
6b. Back plate % NO BID % NO BiD
6c. Side glass % NO BID % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor, materials, tools,
equipment. transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid all items . 7a. 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair {Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except boit-ons (see item 7b) cu/in 100,000|NO BID culin 100,000{NO BID
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Inciudes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cu/in 100,000{NO BID cu/in 100,000(NC BID
Dollar Dotlar
(Estimate (Estimated
7c. Radiator recore at Sobber price in "Transpro Catalogue" less the [d Total Total
following percentage discount. (Includes parts, labor. pick up and Expendit Expenditu
delivery) ures) 20,000 NO BID res) 20,000 NO BID

Page 12 of 24
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Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MMO04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Page 13 of 24

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Diesel Power & Injection, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:
Elios Auto Electric, Inc.

Description Of Item

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
{Minus)

Mark-up
{Plus)

Parts List
name and
issue

Unit

Parts List
name and
issue

Rate/Price Per{ Discount Mark-up
Unit (Minus) (Plus)

I. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.

ta. Labor rate

$80

Hr.

340

1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor's facilities.

la. Labor rate

380

340

1. Discount on Parts

35%

%

15%

1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

20%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 1a.,

2. Specialized Repairs/T) ission Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's. To furnish
ail labor. materials and parts as required, and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities.

2a. Labor rate

Hr.

NO BID

Hr.

NO BID

2b. Discount on Parts

%

NO BID

Y

NO BID

2¢. Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

NO BiD

%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a,

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish all labor, materials
[and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facifities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or
more brand),

Hr.

NO BID

Hr.

NO BID

3b. Whelen Engineering Co. Inc.

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or

NO BID

NO BID

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

%

NO BID

NO BID

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c.1 Discount on Parts

NO BID

%

NO BID

3¢.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
reguired)

NO BID

Yo

NO BID

3d. Sound Off

Page 13 of 2




Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Diesel Power & Injection, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

Elios Auto Electric, Ine.

e i Parts List
Description Of Item Unit oty Rate/Price Per{ Discount Mark-up ::r:: ::dt Unit Qty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up -n:m: a:xsd
o ? Unit (Minus) (Plus) ! o Unit (Minus) (Plus) m
issue issue
U T DISTOTT DI P aTTS Andyor % NO BID Y% NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NOBID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) Y NO BID % NOBID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3f.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
312 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NG BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars. light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
da. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. NO BID
4b. Discount on Parts % NO BID Yo NO BID
4c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only, Proof of cost may be required) % NGO BID % NOBID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans. SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities.
5a. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. 340
5b. Discount on Parts Y% NO BID %% 15%
S¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y% NO BID % NO BID
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr, $50.00
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID %o 3%
Sf. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only, Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID

Page 14 of 24
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Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Diesel Power & Injection, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

Elios Auto Electric, Inc.

ipti i rts List
Description Of item Unit oty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up ::nr:i ::; Unit oty Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up ::mz a:xsd
< Unit {Minus) {Plus) . 7 Unit (Minus) (Plus) )
issue issue

Note: Vendor must bid 5b. or S¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item Sa.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes all charges (travel,
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid all sub-items (6a, 6b and
6c)
6a. Windshield % NO BID % NO BID
6b. Back plate % NOBID % NO BID
6. Side glass % NO BID % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor, materials, tools,

Juip transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
fotlows (Vendors must bid all items . 7a, 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cu/in 100,000|NO BID cu/in 100.000|NO BID
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cu/in 100,000{NO BID cu/in 100,000|NO BID

Dollar Dollar
{Estimate (Estimate

7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in "Transpro Catalogue” less the |d Total d Total
following percentage discount. (Includes parts, fabor, pick up and Expendit Expendit
delivery) ures) 20.000 NO BID ures) 20.000 NO BID
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL Page 16 of 24
Bid #001-MMO04

Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles
Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

Important Bid Notes

Name of Bidder: Name Of Bidder:
WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000 Grand Prize Chevrolet Maroone Chevrolet LLC DBA Maroone Auto Plaza
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Description Of Item Unit - Qty. Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up Parts List Parts List

. Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up
i i o d
Unit {Minus) {Plus) na.me and Unit Qty Unit (Minus) (Plus) na'me an:
issue issue

1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.

ta. Labor rate Hr. 382 Hr. $69
1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor's facilities.

la. Labor rate Hr. He. NO BID

1. Discount on Parts Y 25% % NO BID

1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y NO BiD Yo NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 1a..

2. Specialized Repairs/T ission Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's. To furnish
ali labor, materials and patts as required, and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities,

2a. Labor rate Hr. 382 Hr. 369

2b. Discount on Parts % 25% % 15%

2c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NOBID % NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a.

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School !
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish all labor, materials
and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or Hr. Hr.
more brand). NO BID NO BID

3b. Whelen Engineering Co, Inc.

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or Yo NO BID % NO BID

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c.1 Discount on Parts % NG BID % NO BID

3¢.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID

£ 24
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Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL

Bid #001-MMo04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name of Bidder:
Grand Prize Chevrolet

Name Of Bidder:
Maroone Chevrolet LLC DBA Maroone Auto Plaza

T = " = ” = . Parts List
Description Of Item Unit Qty Rate/ll;n.ce Per D;s;ount M;x;k up Parts L|sdt Vit o Rate/Price Per| Discount Mark-up n:mz I;:]sd
nit (Minus) (Plus) nafne an ni 1y, Unit (Minus) (Pius) T
issue issue
ST T DISCOTTIT O PATTS aTmror Y% NO BID % NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID Y% NO BID
3¢. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID Y% NO BID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3f.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
4a. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. 569
4b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % NO BID
4c. Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % 15%
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses. vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities,
Sa. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. NO BID
5b. Discount on Parts % NO BID % NO BID
5¢. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr, NO BID Hr. 69
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO BID
5t. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NOBID % NO BID
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Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL

Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name of Bidder:
Grand Prize Chevrolet

Name Of Bidder:
Maroone Chevrolet LLC DBA Maroone Auto Plaza

N m - - - Ak = >
P O T ity | " | vumees | omn | . [P re] ot | s | P
: : ¥ Unit (Minus) (Plus) !
issue issue
=
Note: Vendor must bid 5b. or 5¢. or both, depending on how they
witl submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes all charges {travel,
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid all sub-items (6a. 6b and
6¢)
6a. Windshield % NO BID % NO BID
6b. Back plate % NO BID % NO BID
6c. Side glass % NOBID % NOBID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor. materials, tools,
Juip trangportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows {Vendors must bid alf items , 7a, 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cu/in 100,000NO BID cufin 100,000{NO BID
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. cu/in 100,000{NO BID cu/in 100.000|NO BID
Doltar Doltar
{Estimated {Estimate
7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in “Transpro Catalogue” less the |Total d Total
following percentage discount. (Includes parts, labor, pick up and Expenditur Expendit
delivery) es) 20,000 NO BID ures) 20.060 NO BID
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Bid #: 901-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Aatomotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimetive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:

Piaza Auto Glass, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

R & J Automotive Services

Description Of Item Unit Oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up ::ur:: ::‘sd‘ Unit Oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up Parts List name
o o Unit (Minus) (Plus) issue - Unit {Minus} (Plus) and issue
1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.
{a. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. $50
1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site ¢ vendor's facilities.
ia. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. 360
1. Discount on Parts % NOBID % NO BID
15.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y% NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid 1. or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item la..
2. Specialized Repairs/T: ion Repair Service for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV's. To fumnish
all fabor, materials and parts as required, and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities.
2a. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. $50
2b. Discount on Parts % NOBID % NOBID
2c. Mﬁrk-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor mast bid 2b. or 2¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a,
3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish alf labor, materials
[and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization.
3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or Hr. Hr.
more brand). NO BID NO BID
3b. Whelen Engineering Co. Inc,
3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost pius only. Proof of cost may be
required} % NO BID % NO BID
3c. Federai Signal Corp. -
3c.1 Discount on Parts % NO BID % NO BID
3¢.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) Y% NO BID % NO BID
Page 19 bf 24
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Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12,000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:

Plaza Aute Glass, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

R & J Automotive Services

Description Of Item Unit oty Rate/Price Per { Discount Mark-up E::Z L:; Unit Qty. Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up | Parts List name
m - Unit {Minus) (Plus) iss“: 1y Unit {(Minus) (Plus) and issue

T D ISCO N DI ParTS na/oT % NO BID Yo NO BID
3d.2 Mark-up on Parts {Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NOBID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3e.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID Yo NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be

uired) % NO BID % NO BID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3f.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
31.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)| % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
da. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. $50
4b. Discount on Parts % NO BID Y NO BID
4c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4c. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicles: cars, light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses, vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities.
S5a. Labor rate Hr. NO BiD Hr. $50
5b. Discount on Parts Y NO BID Y% NO BID
5c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y% NOBID Y% NOBID
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr. 60
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO BID
5f. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y% NO BID % NO BiD
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Bid #: 001-MMO04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES. WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Plaza Aute Glass, Inc.

Name Of Bidder:

R & J Automotive Services

v rts List
Description Of Item Uait oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up ::mz Z‘:d Unit Oty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up Parts List name
- Unit {Minus) (Plus) issue : Unit (Minus) (Plus) and issue
Note: Vendor must bid 5b. or 5¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's ete. On-site vehicle glass
repk repairs. Discount offered includes all charges (travel,
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid all sub-items (6, 6b and
6c)
6a. Windshieid % 31% % NO BID
6b. Back plate % 31% % NO BID
6c. Side glass % 31% % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor, materials, tools,
equipment, transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid all items , 7a, 7b and 7¢ to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cu/in 100,000{NO BID cufin 160,000{$50/hr
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bojted top and bottom. cu/in {00,000(NO BID cw/in 100,000{NO BID
Dollar Doliar
(Estimate (Estimate
7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in “Transpro Catalogue® less the |d Total d Total
following percentage discount. {Includes parts, labor, pick up and Expendit Expendit
delivery) ures) 20,000 NO BID ures) 20.000 NO BID
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Bid #: 001-MM04 {Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MMo04

Autoimotive Repair Sérvice and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Rechtien International Trucks Inc.

Name Of Bidder:
Smutny & Ross

Description Of Item

Unit

Qty.

Rate/Price Per | Discount
Unit {Minus)

Parts List
name and issue|

Mark-up
{Plus)

Unit

Rate/Price Per
Unit

Discount
{Minus)

Mark-up
(Plus)

Parts List name
and issue

L. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light and
medium trucks vans and SUV's. Equipment for repair service must be
on site at vendor's facilities.

{a. Labor rate

Hr.

NOBID

Hr.

1. Automotive Repair Service for M-DCPS vehicles: medium and
heavy duty trucks and buses. Equipment for repair service must be on
site t vendor's facilities.

la. Labor rate

Hr.

$80

1. Discount on Parts

NOBID

%

NO BID

1b.. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

%

PL313CD from
Navistar

25%

NO BID

[Note: Vendor must bid 1, or 1b. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 1a..

2. Specialized Repairs/T: ion Repair Service for M-DCPS

hicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans and SUV’s. To furnish
all labor, materials and parts as required, and equipment for repair
service at vendor's facilities.

2a. Labor rate

NO BID

NO BID

2b. Discount on Parts

NOBID

NO BID

2. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required)

%

NO BID

%

NO BID

Note: Vendor must bid 2b. or 2c¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 2a.

3. Specialized Repairs/Emergency Equipment Lighting/Siren-School
Police Vehicles: cars, vans, SUV's etc. To furnish alf labor, materiais
and parts as required, and equipment for repair service at vendor's
facilities. Vendors must be authorized factory representatives for at
least one of the brands listed below and will require proof of factory
authorization,

3a. Labor rate for any of the brands listed offered by vendors (one or
more brand).

Hr.

NO BID

Hr.

NO BiD

3b, Whelen Engineering Co. tne,

3b.1 Discount on Parts and/or

NO BID

NO BID

3b.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

NO BID

NO BID

3c. Federal Signal Corp.

3c.1 Discount on Parts

NOBID

%

NO BiD

3c.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required)

NO BID

%

NO BID

3d. Sound Off
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Bid #: 601-MM®04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MM04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY. PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.000
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Rechtien Jnternational Trucks Inc.

Name Of Bidder:
Smutny & Ross

Description Of Item Unit Qty. Rate/Price Per | Discount | Mark-up Parts List Unit Qty. Rate/Price Per §| Discount | Mark-up | Parts List name
" - Unit (Minus) {Plus) |name and issue| ) Unit (Minus) (Plus) and issue
T TS O O PaTS I oT % NO BID % NO BID
[3d.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) % NO BID % NO BID
3e. Showme Equipment
3¢.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NO BID
3e.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be
required) Y% NO BID % NO BID
3f. Code 3 Public Safety Equipment
3f.1 Discount on Parts and/or % NO BID % NOBID~
3f.2 Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) Y NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid sub-items .1 and/or .2 (any brand),
depending on how they will submit their billing for parts, and
item 3a.
4. Specialized Repairs/Mufflers and Exhaust systems for M-DCPS
vehicles: cars, light and medium trucks, vans, SUV's e1c. Equipment
for repair service must be on site at vendor's facilities.
4a. Labor rate Hr. NO BID Hr. NO BID
4b. Discount on Parts % NO 8ID % NO BID
4c. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
Note: Vendor must bid 4b. or 4c, or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 4a.
5. Specialized Repairs/Air Conditioning systems and components for
M-DCPS vehicies: cars. light and medium and heavy duty trucks,
buses. vans, SUV's etc. Equipment for repair services must be on site
at vendor's facilities,
Sa. Labor rate Hr. NO BiD Hr. $40
5b. Discount on Parts % NOQ BID % NO BID
Sc. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
5d. Labor rate for heavy duty truck and bus. Hr. NO BID Hr. 50
Se. Discount on Parts heavy duty truck and bus. % NO BID % NO BID
51. Mark-up on Parts (Cost plus only. Proof of cost may be required) % NO BID % NO BID
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Bid #: 001-MM04 (Format B)

Title: Automotive, Truck, and Bus Repair Service and
Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Buyer Name: Harry Eschbach

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, FL
Bid #001-MMo04
Autoimotive Repair Service and Specialized Repairs for School Board Vehicles

Important Bid Notes

WARRANTY, PARTS AND LABOR ONE (1) YEAR OR 12.600
MILES, WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

Name Of Bidder:
Rechtien International Trucks Inc.

Name Of Bidder:
Smutny & Ross

Description Of Item

Unit Qty Rate/Price Per } Discount Mark-up Parts List Unit Qty Rate/Price Per | Discount Mark-up | Parts List name
- Unit {Minus) (Plus) }rame and issue| ) Unit {Minus) {Plus) and issue

Note: Vendor must bid 5b. or 5¢. or both, depending on how they
will submit their billing for parts, and item 5a.
6. Glass Replacement/repair service for M-DCPS vehicles: cars. light
and medium trucks, vans, SUV's etc. On-site vehicle glass
replacement/repairs. Discount offered includes alf charges (travel.
labor glass and materials. Vendor must bid ali sub-items (6a, 6b and
6c)
6a. Windshield % 31% % NO BID
6b. Back plate % 3% % NO BID
6. Side glass % 31% % NO BID
7. Specialized Repairs/Radiators. Furnish all labor, materials, tools,

3} transportation and services necessary for motor vehicle
radiator servicing, repair and replacement in accordance with the
Technical Specifications and provisions attached, for Automotive
Radiator Servicing and Repairs for Motor Vehicles and Equipment as
follows (Vendors must bid ali items . 7a. 7b and 7c to be considered
for award):
7a. Radiator Servicing and Repair {Includes pick-up and delivery).
All types except bolt-ons (see item 7b) cufin 100,000|NO BID cufin 100,000|NO BID
7b. Radiator Servicing and Repair (Includes pick-up and delivery).
Radiators are bolted top and bottom. ) cu/in 100,000{NO BiD cu/in 100.000{NO BID

Dollar Dollar
(Estimate (Estimate

7c. Radiator recore at Jobber price in "Transpro Catalogue” less the [d Total d Total
foliowing percentage discount. (Includes parts. fabor, pick up and Expenditu Expendit
delivery) res) 20,000 NOBID ures) 20,000 NO BID
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