The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) I
PLEASE COMPLETE

L : - ALL SHADED AREAS : N
Bid #005-MM06 NAME OF BIDDER: 4 g @/ 7(,

Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay lPrepared By. / Verified By:
Buyer: G. Jackson ) )

Austin Tupler Trucking Florida Silica Sand Co.

ESTIMATED

TeM | Dcps # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

IMPORTANT BID NOTES: INITIAL BID PRICE
SHALL BE EFFECTIVE FOR THREE MONTHS
FROM DATE OF AWARD. A REQUEST FOR
QUOTE (RFQ) WILL BE ISSUED TO THE
AWARDED VENDORS FOR EACH ITEM FOR
EACH ADDITIONAL THREE-MONTH PERIOD
DURING THE TERM OF THE BID.

BLK-0001
1 Sand, Screening (Limerock) 1003 Tons
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)

Pit Locations:

$13,690.95 $14.30 $14,342.90

BLK-0002
2 Sand, Lake 257 Tons

F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

$4.65 $1,195.05 $25.65 $6,592.05

BLK-0003
3 Sand, Lake Wales (Playground Sand) 5,621 Tons $26.85
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)

Pit Locations:

$149,237.55 $144,178.65

1
!
I
I
I
I
I
|

BLK-0004 $14.00 $3,080.00 $4,312.00

1

4 Sand, Mason 220 Tons {
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) 1
Pit Locations: 1
1

1

i

i

$13.65 $0.00 NO BID

5 BLK-0005 |[Rock, Ballast, Size #4 (Nominal size in 1-1/2 ) 4] Tons
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MMO6
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) H
i : PLEASE C
omphefe hemi 6f the. bidde ALL SHAD
Bid #005-MMO06 NAME OF
Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay
Buvyer: G. Jackson
SBi Quarry
ESTIMATED oo .
ITEM | DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF [TEM QUANTITY uniy || YnitPrice | Total Price
BLK-0006
6 Rock, Pea 229 Tons $8.00 $1,832.00
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
1.
2.
BLK-0007
7 Rock, 3/4 size # 5 120 Tons $10.50 $1.260.00
F.Q.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
I
2.
BLK-0008 |
8 Rock, Lime, Fine Crushed (Minimum 3/4") 1,135 TONS $14.00 § $15,890.00
F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) :
Pit Locations: i
i
: :
i
2. e ]
BLK-0009
9 Asphalt, 60/40 490 TONS NO BID
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
I
2,
10 ||BLK-0013  |[Mix, soil, 50/50 garden soil, sand constituency of 840 CUBIC
the mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 50% silica YARDS NO BID
quantz sand, 50% organic Florida peat F.0.B. Pit.
{Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:
1.
2,

T




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)

Lcornplete hame of the Biddert

Bid #005-MM08

Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

Buyer: G. Jackson

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS
NAME OF BIDDER:

IPrepared By:

Verified By:

ITEM

DCPS #

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

Austin Tupler Trucking

Florida Silica Sand Co.

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

11

BLK-0014

Mix, soil 70/30, 70% silica quartz sand, 30% organic
Florida peat, must pass through a #4 sieve, F.0.B. Pit.
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:

22,080

CUBIC
YARDS

$29.20

BLK-0015

Mix soil, 80/20, quartz sand, sand constituency of the
mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 20% organic Florida
peat F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:

1.

2100

CUBIC
YARDS

$644,736.00

NO BID

$59,220.00

NO BID

BLK-0016

Mix, soil 80/20 athletic, quartz sand, sand must pass thru
a #4 sicve. 20 organic peat moss spagnum. F.0.B. Pit.
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:

1090

CUBIC
YARDS

$37.50

BLK-0017

Mix, 70/30, Clay, native red, 70% silica sand 30% clay,
must pass thru a #4 sieve, vendor must deliver to job
sight throughout Miami Dade Co., freight must be
included in unit price. delivery upon request only. F.0.B.
Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:

1.

2.

850

TONS

$40,875.00

NO BiID

$53,550.00

NO BID

S—




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MMO06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

810 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) ]l
: i PLEASEC
<;zmplr|e hame. of the.bidd ALL SHAD
Bid #005-MMO06 NAME OF * Metro Trucking quaiified it's bid by limiting effective date to hoid prices.

{F¥

Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay
Buyer: G. Jackson

*Metro Trucking Pro-Grounds Products

ESTIMATED

TEM | DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

IMPORTANT BID NOTES: INITIAL BID PRICE
SHALL BE EFFECTIVE FOR THREE MONTHS
FROM DATE OF AWARD. A REQUEST FOR
QUOTE (RFQ) WILL BE ISSUED TO THE
AWARDED VENDORS FOR EACH ITEM FOR
EACH ADDITIONAL THREE-MONTH PERIOD
DURING THE TERM OF THE BID.

BLK-0001
. . $11.95 $11,985.85 $10.65
1 Sand, Screening (Limerock) 1003 Tons

F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

$10,681.95

2.
SO U—

BLK-0002

3.00 771.00 5.24 1,346.68
2 Sand, Lake 257 Tons $ $ $ ¥
F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

BLK-0003
3 Sand, Lake Wales (Playground Sand) 5,621 Tons $26.50 $148,956.50 $22.50 $126,472.50

F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

BLK-0004
4 Sand, Mason 220 Tons

F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)

i
: $3,685.00
f
Pit Locations: I
i
i
|
i

$12.00 $2,640.00 $18.75

I
1

$11.95 $0.00 $15.45 | $0.00 ®
f

5 BLK-0005 |[Rock, Ballast, Size #4 (Nominal size in 1-1/2) 0 Tons
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum {2-20 tons)
Pit Locations:




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

8ID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) ![
T:‘y b PLEASEC
oumptets hamie of the Bidd ALL SHAD
Bid #005-MM06 NAME OF * Metro Trucking qualified it's bid by limiting effective date to hold prices.
Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay
Buyer: G. Jackson
*Metro Trucking Pro-Grounds Products
ESTIMATED RN . - .
ITEM | DoPs# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY || uniy || UnitPrice | TotalPrice | UnitPrice |  Total Price
BLK-0006
6 Rock, Pea 229 Tons $11.95 $2,736.55 $1545 | $3,538.05
F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) :
Pit Locations: 1
1
1. !
i
2. I
[EEPSRE E—
BLK-0007 !
7 Rock, 3/4 size # § 120 Tons $11.95 $1,434.00 $15.45 1 $1,854.00
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) :
Pit Locations: {
i
: |
1
2. 1
T L T e B R T
BLK-0008 |
8 Rock, Lime, Fine Crushed (Minimum 3/4") 1,135 TONS NO BID $1065 | $12,087.75
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) :
Pit Locations: i
|
1. =
I
LA——— N N R N N {
BLK-0009
el Asphalt, 60/40 490 TONS $76.00 $37,240.00 NOBID
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
1
2.
——————— i
10 [BLK-0013 [Mix, soil, 50/50 garden soll, sand constituency of 840 CUBIC :
the mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 50% silica YARDS 45.50 38 220.00 25.08 21 0687.20
quantz sand, 50% organic Florida peat F.0.B. Pit. $45. $38.220. ' : $21,067.
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: 1
I
1 :
3 i
S S SN S N e




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) ﬂ
o (s bo PLEASE C
Lcarnplets na ALL SHAD
Bid #005-MM06 NAME OF * Metro Trucking qualified it's bid by limiting effective date to hold prices.
Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soif Mix and Clay
Buyer: G. Jackson
*Metro Trucking Pro-Grounds Products
ESTIMATED ‘o ; o ;
ITEM | DCPS & DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1L IBLK-0014  [IMix, soil 70/30, 70% silica quartz sand, 30% organic 22,080 CUBIC
Florida peat, must pass through a #4 sieve, F.O.B. Pit. YARDS
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: 41.65 $919,632.00 28.55 $630,384.00
N
12 BLK-0015 IMix soil, 80/20, quartz sand, sand constituency of the 2100 CUBIC ;
mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 20% organic Florida YARDS $40.00 $84,000.00 30.83 i $64,953.00
peat F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: |
i
1. i
I
i
2. I
_____ ] .
— T
13 |BLK-0016 |[Mix, soil 80/20 athletic, quartz sand, sand must pass thru 1090 CUBIC :
a ##4 sieve. 20 organic peat moss spagnum. F.O.B. Pit. YARDS NO BID 40.06 | $43,665.40
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: 1
i
]
I 1
|
2. |
_____ i
14 |IBLK-0017 [IMix, 70/30, Clay, native red, 70% silica sand 30% clay, 850 TONS
must pass thru a #4 sieve, vendor must deliver to job
sight throughout Miami Dade Co., freight must be NO BID 30.19 $25,661.50
included in unit price. defivery upon request only. F.Q.B.
Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:
1.
2.

i -




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

|

BiD PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

‘oriiplete hamve. of the Bidders -

PLEASEC
ALL SHAD

Bid #005-MM086

NAME OF

Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

Buyer: G. Jackson

ITEM

DCPS #

SDI Quarry

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY UNIT Unit Price Total Price

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

IMPORTANT BID NOTES: INITIAL BID PRICE
SHALL BE EFFECTIVE FOR THREE MONTHS
FROM DATE OF AWARD. A REQUEST FOR
QUOTE (RFQ) WILL BE ISSUED TO THE
AWARDED VENDORS FOR EACH ITEM FOR
EACH ADDITIONAL THREE-MONTH PERIOD
DURING THE TERM OF THE BID.

BLK-0001

Sand, Screening (Limerock)
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

I
2.

$10.00 $10,030.00
1003 Tons

BLK-0002

Sand, Lake
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

L

2.

NO BID
257 Tons

BLK-0003

Sand, Lake Wales (Playground Sand) ‘
F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

5,621 Tons NOBID

BLK-0004

Sand, Mason
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

220 Tons NO BID

BLK-0005

Rock, Ballast, Size #4 (Nominal size in 1-1/2)
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:

$10.50
0 Tons

¥
I3




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B} l
: PLEASE COMPLETE
knrplets hame of he Bidder! ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #005-MM06 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: G. Jackson
Austin Tupler Trucking Florida Silica Sand Co.
ESTIMATED e . e .
Tem! Dcps# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
BLK-0006
5 Rock, Pea 29 Tons $13.65 | 8312585 $23.30 $5,335.70
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) :
Pit Locations: ]
I
x- |
I
2. |
et o -
BLK-0007 ]
7 Rock, 3/4 size # 5 120 Tons $1 3'65 I $1.638.00 $23.30 $2,796.00
F.0.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) {
Pit Locations: :
1
i ]
I
f
2. i
BLK-0008
8 Rock, Lime, Fine Crushed (Minimum 3/4") 1135 TONS $8.30 $9.420.50 NO BiD
F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
1.
2.
BLK-0009
9 Asphalt, 60/40 490 TONS $80.00 $39,200.00 NOBID
F.Q.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons)
Pit Locations:
1
2.
I
10 [BLK-0013 [IMix, soil, 50/50 garden soil, sand constituency of . 840 CUBIC I
the mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 50% silica YARDS $23.00 : $19,320.00 15.05 $12.642.00
quantz sand, 50% organic Florida peat F.O.B. Pit. . i R ' '
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: i
1
1. I
I
2 i

e i e




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #005-MM06
Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) ]
[F PLEASE C
nahplete hime.of the.biddér? . . ALL SHAD
Bid #005-MM06 NAME OF
Title: Coarse Aggregates, Soil Mix and Clay
Buyer: G. Jackson
SDI Quarry
ESTIMATED \) e .
iTEM| pePs # DESCRIPTION OF [TEM QUANTITY || uniT | UnitPrice | - Total Price
11 [iBLK-0014  [IMix, soil 70/30, 70% silica quartz sand, 30% organic 22,080 CUBIC
Florida peat, must pass through a #4 sieve, F.O.B. Pit. YARDS
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations: NOBID
1.
12 [IBLK-0015 |Mix soil, 80/20, quartz sand, sand constituency of the 2100 CUBIC
mixture must pass thru a #4 sieve, 20% organic Florida YARDS NO BID
peat F.O.B. Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:
I
2.
13 ||BLK-0016 |Mix, soil 80/20 athletic, quartz sand, sand must pass thru 1050 CUBIC
a #4 sieve. 20 organic peat moss spagnum. F.O.B. Pit. YARDS NO BID
(Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:
1.
2.
14 IBLK-0017  {Mix, 70/30, Clay, native red, 70% silica sand 30% clay, 850 TONS
must pass thru a #4 sieve, vendor must deliver to job
sight throughout Miami Dade Co., freight must be NO BID
included in unit price. delivery upon request only. F.O.B.
Pit. (Minimum 12-20 tons) Pit Locations:
I
2.




