BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type'orprint i

$

-iBid #012-LLO1

Title: Vacuum Cleaners

Buyer: G. Jackson

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #012-L1.01
Vacuum Cleaners

4

Preparéd,By: ¥ /

|

Ver%ﬁed By:

‘Karcher North America (A)

Karcher North America {B)

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Vacuum cleaner, backpack type, commercial/industrial duty
with minimum 50' cord and attachments. Must include
High Efficiency Particulate Air Filter (HEPA). To be

No currently-approved brands under this category.

Minimum order ; I each

75

Each

$370.00

$27,750.00

Windsor VP68

NO BID

Vacuum cleaner, carpet upright, commercial/industrial
duty, 14" to 18" width, minimum 50' cord. All units to
include a shake-out bag. To be considered for award, the
product must have the Seal of Approval as a CRI Green
Label Vacuum under the commercial upright vacuum
category.

Approved Brands: No currently-approved brands under
this category.

Minimum order : 1 each

35

Each

$633.92

$22,187.20

V814

$820.40

$28,714.00

V518

Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial,
ergonomically-designed,minimum 16 to 20 gallon tank
with drain valve molded high-density polyethylene or
stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum 1.2 HP,
two stage, 115 velt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC continuous duty,
bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent overflow.
Kit accessories and minimum 23" front mounted squeegee
blade, dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet pick up
squeegee tool. Cloth bag/filter must not be part of the
filtration system for wet pick-up applications.

Approved Brands: Advance Sprite Air Scoop 16 with
front mount squeegee or equal
Minimum order: 1 each

75

Each

$767.20

$57,540.00

*Windsor
T720TP,
TSQ20
squeegee

$1,057.46

$79,309.50

Windsor
REC17 plus
squeegee

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #012-1.L01
Vacuum Cleaners

Rex Chemical {A) Rex Chemical (B} Rex Chemicat (C} Viper North America
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model § Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model i Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
Advance *Advance
$316.60 | $23,745.00 Adgiiity 6XP $310.65 | $23,298.75 Adgility NO BID NO BID
Advance
$195.00 $6,825.00 | Royal M1030 | $225.00 | $7,875.00 |Royal M1058] $259.80 $9,093.00 RelfiaVac NO BID
16HP
Advance
*Advance *Advance Sprite 16 Air “Viper
$450.00 | $36,750.00 | "WD3TSW lesng 00 | $38,100.00 |AWOSZOWE go54 00 | $71,550.00 | SPPW | gs1500 | $38625.00 | Shovelnose
front mount front mount front mount SN1BWD
squeeges squeegee squeegee
and tool kit

“ltem 1 - Rex Chemical (B) did not submit sample. *ltem 2 - Karcher North America (A) & (B} used correction fluid to correct

“ltem 3 - Rex Chemical (A), Viper North America and Karcher North-America (A) do not comply to specifications.

an error, item considered non-responsive.
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