for Purchase on CO|erB|d 033-KK11
Makel Model = i i Purchase" :

0.008804762
0.010119524
0.010242381
0.011526190

0.012400000
0,012523810
0.012882282
0.018084524
0.021340476
0.022609524
0.062569048
0.064585714

O.‘0053621 2‘]
G00ei03050




Bid 033-KK11

Class 3. |TGI -7 Lanier 040b 0.004832589
Class 3 -[lkon - . |Ricoh MP4000B 0.005166646
Class 3 {Ikon Ricoh MP5000B 0.005192826
Class 3 |lkon - Ricoh 4001SP - 0.005214160
Class 3. |Konica Minotta |Bizhub 363 0.005698532
Class 3- |Canon ImageRunner 2535 0.005747222
Class 3’ |Barlop Lanier/ Ricoh LD040B 0.005843452
Class 3" |Barlop. Lanier/ Ricoh LD150SP 0.005867163
Class:B Ba‘rlob‘.:,_.-_ - |Lanier! Ricoh LD140SP 0.005888591
Class3. Mnnerg- “. |Konica Minolta 363 0.009907110
o Ricoh4001 0.011060367

- |Toshiba E-Studio 355 0.014023611

: Canon Image Runner 2535 0.014937431

Ji o Xerox WorkCentre 5735P. 0.025287222

y..;|HP 9040 MFP - 0.029180340

" |HP Laserjet M9040 MFP 0.627932639

" |ImageRunner 5050N 0.003245278

- |Lanier LDO50b 0.003328042

7 |Ricoh MP6001 ~ 0.004261811

-2 |Lanier/ Ricoh LD360 0.004553333

- Lanier LD360 | 0.004603704

*|Laniet/ Ricoh LD370 0.004849630

“IRicoh MP5000B 0.005163507

~|Lanier Ricoh LDO50 . 0.005207778

~|Lanier/. R:coh LD1508P 0.005209630

lta |Bizhub 501 - 0.005289153
R:co,h.MPsoomp | 0.005365644

.~ |Konica M"ihol’ta 501. 0.007970817

* [Ricoh. 5001 0.008408836

Toshiba E- Studlc 555 0.013094537

] Canon Image Runner Advance 8055 0.015634312

‘_,'PC olutton |HP 9050 MFP 0.025742070

s 4 |Xerox . | {Xerox WorkCentre 5755PT 0.034250185

: ii?{q_'o_shaba, <. IHP Laserjet MO050 MFP 0.648843704




- 0:.002943775

|Ricon MP7001 0.003201456
Ricoh: ME_som ik 0.003274855
Lanier LD370" 0.003365196

|LanieriD3g0 = =

50 10.003443627
IRicoh MPoOOT ~ © 0.003952325
~ |Lanier/ Ricoh D370 0.003987598
“|Lanier! Ricoh LD380 0.003996931
ta |Bizhub 751 ©0.004788922
~“|Konica Mmolta 751 - 0.007928835
- IRicoh:7001 R - 0.008462647
Toshiba E- Studlo 755 0.012475833
Canon Image Runner Advance 6075 | . 0.014659657
| Xerox WorkCentre 5775PT o 10.033195588
y . |no bid " no bid
. |Lanier. LDBQO . 0.001676543
lmageRunner Advance 8085 7 0.001737352
Laniet Pro 907EX | - 0.001994691
| Lanierf Ricoh PR_o_go,TEx_ | 1 0.002229430

Ricdh"Pro‘ 907E‘x" B

©0.002302328

ta |Bizhub Pro 950 _ 0.002447148
{Lanier/ _Rlcoh PRO 1107[—:)( 0.002484615
Ricoh Pro 1107EX - | 0.002543764
Canon' Image Runner Advance 8085” 1. 0.003207222
- |Ricoh:9001 : L 0.008271877
~IToshiba E- Studio 855 © 0.010115111

5 Komca Mlnoita 950"

.0.016633490

0.035853333

PC Solutzon .

Xerox WorkCentre 5790PT
“lno bid - o

no bid




. 0.001817557

. 0.002097650

- 0.002175227

0.002227385

0.002294545

0.002377818

- 0.007604864

0.009130773

- 0.012667841

- 0.016649192

. 0.046539227

B “"no bid

" _no bid

" 0.004200445

©0.004210870

T 0.006220852

. 0.009227037

- 0.011316889

10011515519

T 0.012875296

17 0.016868333

1 0.018304775

':.; 0. 047955852

no bld

- " no bid




Ranking for 60 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

ImageR f e 0.001248463

07E S T 0,001409520

© 0.001412584

'Ricoh PRO 1107EX 0.001517682
Lanier/ Ricoh PRO 1357EX 0.001520318
|Bizhub Pro 10517~ = © 0.001648750
~IRicoh: 11 S 0.006711254

Toshiba E-Studio 101+~ 0.008371636
Canor © 0.011889250
~ 0.015986007
- 0.045618759
" nobid
= - nobid " .
1+ 0.002607056
0.002871019
- 0.002872622
.~ 0.003201839
~ 1. 0.004631533
"1 0.007411337
' 0.009686667
© 1 0013375554
1 0.016686835
1 L. 0.045646821
1 nobid.
. nobid-




_ Rankm for Purchase on Coner Bid 033-KK
Class_ Vendor o Makel Model

0.017430296
0.018346204
0.033860556
0.034890852
-.0.035061222
'0.038305185
0.040955778

- 0,042864074
0.044405556
0.055439583
0.008337963
13983570




n/a.

nla

nia

n/a

n/a.

‘n/a

nl/a

n/a

n/a

‘nfa

n/a

‘nfa

- n/a

- npla

no bid

1 0.002497146

0.002518763

0.002783157

S 0.002792045

1 0:002821061

10.002846970

- 0.002857071

| 0.003205808

| 0.003287879

- 0.004037660

| 0.004444621|

"+ |7 0.005083586

0.012039015

| 0028902803

| 0.622486086

© nobid




Rankmg for 36 Month Lease on Copler Bld 033 KK11

“Vendor. " Make/ Madel )Mo lease
Class 3 |TGI Lanier 040b 0.002366485
Class 3 |lkon Ricoh MP5000B 0.002563530
Class 3 |tkon Ricoh MP4000B 0.002687616
Class 3 |lkon Ricoh 4001SP 0.002690382
Class 3 |Barlop- Lanier/ Ricoh LDX150SP 0.002918099
Class' 3 B.ar[op Lanier/ Ricoh LD040B 0.003251313
Class 3 |Barlop Lanier/ Ricoh LD140SP 0.003253813
Class 3 |Konica Minolta |Bizhub 363 0.003740079
Class 3 {Canon ImageRunner 2535 0.003766620
Class 3 |Milner” Konica Minolta 363 0.007565400
Class 3 |Milner - |Ricoh 4001 . 0.007612738
Class 3 |Toshiba = |Toshiba E-Studio 355 0.011884155
Class 3 |Zeno Canon Image Runner 2535 0.012242118
Class 3 |Xerox © .- |Xerox WorkCentre 5735P 0.020580556
Class 3 |PC Solutian ~[HP 8040 MFP’ | 0.020903213
Class 3" .Toshlba S HP M9040 0.622431250
CIa‘sé’f4,, Canon '~ 1mageRunner 505ON 0.001690235
Class 4 |TGI - . |Lanier LDO50b 0.001816402
Class 4 |TGl ~|Lanier LD360 0.001958642
Class 4 |Barlop - .~ - .|Lanier/ Ricoh LD360 0.002184704
Class'4- |Barlop - = |Lanier/ Ricoh LD370 0.002200407
Class 4 {lkon - |Ricoh MP6001 0.002231265
Ciass 4 |Barlop .~ |Lanier/ Ricoh LDO50. 0.003575093
Class 4 B.éri'o'p " |Lanier/ Ricoh LD150SP . 0.003575586
Class 4’ |lkon |Ricoh MP5000B 0.003677216
Class 4 Konfca Mlnolta Bizhub 501 0.003782951
Class 4 |IKon: - {Ricoh MP5001SP - 0.003845562
Class 4 |Milner - |Konica Minolta Bizhub 501 0.006494504
Class 4 Mflner " |Ricoh MP5001 . 0.006504736
Class 4 T’o"sjh‘iba' - |Toshiba E-Studio 555 0.011016821
Class 4 |Zeno. . . = |Canon Image Runner Advance 6055 0.012139484
Class'4 - |PC So!utlon IHP 9050 MFP 0.020741167
- IClass 4 |Xerox- 'f o ‘Xerox WorkCentre 5755PT 0.031451623
Class 4 |Toshiba’ HP. M9050 - ' 0.622361728




Ranking for 36 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

'ImageRunner 6075

0.001437647

Lanier 370

0.001824346

{‘anier 380

0.001827941

- [Ricoh MP7001

0.001920495

* - |Ricoh MP8001

0.001933772

" |Ricoh MP9001

0.001943326

Lanier/ Ricoh LD380 0.002428023
- |Lanier/ Ricoh LD370 0.002479873
|Bizhub 751 0.003229363
w0 |Konica, Mmo!ta Bizhub 751 0.006359824
. |Ricoh Aficio MP7001 - 0.006374941
- :{Toshiba E-Studio 755 0.011139461
<:1Canon Image Runner Advance 6075 0.012331768
*|Xerox WorkCentre 5775PT 0.031403814

' no bid

Jnobia

~ JimageRunner 8085

0.001011086

- |Lanier LD390

0.001025761

< -|LanierPra 907EX 0.001040453
7 Lanier! Ricoh PRO 907EX 0.001399845
. {Lanier/ Ricoh PRO 1’!07EX 0.001400615
- |Ricoh Pro 907EX . 10.001404833

. “IRicoh Pro’ 1107Ex 0.001418901

;| Bizhub Pro 950 0.001624122
S _Canon Image Runner Advance 8085 0.002041641
 |Ricoh Aficio MP9001 - 0.005411288
Iqsh,lb_a‘.EStudio 855’ 0.009582963
Konica Minolta bizhub 950 0.015718663
Xerox WorkCentre 5790PT 0.034905317
o bid” 2 no bid




Rankmg for 36 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

i 0.00122361

1-0.001385068

“170.001392628

0.001487218

.. 0.001493788

0.001616751

"~ 0.006622070

~ 0.008341364

- 0.011832142

0.015889816

?-“:-0‘.04'55_100_66

no bid

T hobid

"n/a‘ .

“ . nla’

i nfa

S na

Cinfan

“ no.bid

1 nobid

— na

"~ na

T wa




Rank:ng for 36 Month Lease on Copler Bid 033-KK11

_033_5,54063

0.039575397

039592857

0.047160381

0.091084540

£0.104681508

0.014032586

-0.015668819

T 0.015715806

- 0.029901206

0.030775123

0.030794259

- 0.033409877

. 0.035579926

-0.035666519

70.039583333

- 0.049284898

-'0.091004642




Ranking for 60 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

b n/a .

Soonla

R

“.n/a

. < 'nla

n‘a

‘_n/a

nfa .

. 'n/a:': e

© . nja -

nla

nla .

nobid -

NPT

o 0 002822121

70:002893515

1 0:002902758

1 70.003192515]

1+ 0.003193591

] 0.003197167

| 0004532742

 0.004874809

0.005161333

: 0_ 012045455

0, 029401 227

0 622789394

no’ bid




Ranking for 60 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

Class 3 |TGl

Lanier 040b

0.002374256

Class 3 * |ikon

Ricoh MP5000B

0.002557500

Class 3 |ikon

Ricoh MP4000B

0.002687875

Class 3  {lkon

Ricoh 4001SP

0.002693278

Class 3 |Barlop

Lanier/ Ricoh LD150SP

0.003396045

Class 3 |Barlop

L aniet/ Ricoh LD04GB

0.003598952

Class 3 . .|Barlop

Lanier/ Ricoh LD140SP

0.003599959

Class 3. Konica Minolta

Bizhub 363

0.003806566

Class 3 |Canon

ImageRunner 2535

0.003842181

Class'3  |Milner

Kohica Minolta 363

0.007956985

Class 3 - [Milner

Ricoh 4001

0.007960617

Class3 Toshiba :

| Toshiba E-Studio 355

0.011942361

Class 3. |Zeno. =~

|Canon Image Runner 2535

0.012279319

Class 3 - |Xerox = .

Xerox WorkCentre 5735P

0.020632819

Ciass 3. |PC Solution

HP 9040 MFP._

0.021117438

Class 3" ‘|Toshiba -~

“|HP MOO040

0.622765872

Class 4 Gah,ofn ; |

ImageRunner 5050N

0.001701948

Class4 (TGl =+ = ..

Lanier LDO50b

0.001835079

Class4 |TGl .. .

Lanier LD360

0.001945185

Class 4 |lkon =

- |Ricoh MP6001

0.002233207

Class4 - [Barop

“|Lanier/ Ricoh LD360

0.002271893

Class4. |Barop -

‘|Lanier/ Ricoh LD370

0.002278204

clkon

" -|Ricoh MP5000B

0.003758000

Lanier/ Ricoh LD050

0.003810174

_ iLanier/ Ricoh LD150SP

0.003810370

Konica Minofia

Bizhub 501

0.003868298

| Ikon S

Ricoh MP5001SP

0.603931385

Mitner”

. |Ricoh 5001

0.006638399

|Milner = 7

{Konica Minolta 501

(0.006641688

Toshiba E-Studio 555

- 0.011042685

Zeno. -

7" 7|canon Image Runner Advance 8055

0.012147342

HP 9050 MFP

0.021040956

4 |PC Soiton|HPS
S IXerox WorkCentre 5755PT

0.031530315

HP M9050

0.622737407




Ranking for 60 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

imageRunnerﬁO?S -

0.001441494

_ Lamer 370

0.001842059

- |Lanier. 380,_ o)

1 0.001843431

il RidthPJOO"i’* :

0.001963909

" |Ricoh MP8001- =

0.002268696

Class5

kon

“IRicoh MP9001 -

0.002273122

Class’5

Barlopx.”-a- %

- ‘|Lanier/ Ricoh LD380

0.002568500

Class 5.

Barlop"}._ S

0.002626255

Milner: -

Lan;eri Ricoh: LDBTO

- Ricoh 7001

0.006491253

Class5

. |Konica Mmolta 751

0.006492408

| ~ |Toshiba E-Studio 755

0.011198186

- |{Canon Image Runner Advance 6075

0.012384055

0.031509333

- I Xerox WorkCentre 5775PT
- |Bizhub 751 s

nfa

o no bsd

no bid

T ImageRunner 8085

0.001024885

|Lanier LD390 ©..

0.001042840

-~ |Lanier Pro 9075}(5 o

0.001048173

~ |Ricoh Pro 907EX__ ~

0.001415134

~ |Lanier/ Ricoh PRO 907EX _

0.001415432

~|Lanier/. R!coh PRO 1107EX

~-0.001421180

~|Ricoh Pro: 1107EX

0.001422367

2 |Bizhub Pro 950

- 0.001654037

SR ICanon lmage Runner Advance 8085 '

~ 0.002081081

~’|Ricoh 9001

0.005477734

B Toshiba E- Studlo 855

0.009611333

i fKomca Minolta 950 -

- 0.015795087

o Xerox WorkCentre 5790PT

0.035016947

6 |PC Solution

no bid:

no bid




Ranking for 60 Month Lease on Copier Bid 033-KK11

0.001248463

RO 1 107EX

: R 0.001409520
RiGoh PRO 1357EX - 0.001412584
anier/. Ricoh PRO 1‘!07EX 0.001517682
{anier/ Ricoh PRO 13575)( 0.001520318

5 {Bizhub Pro 1051 0.001648750
~ IRicoh 1107EX" _ 0.006711254
{Toshiba E- Stud|o 1101 0.008371636
Canon image’ Runner Advance 8105 0.011889250

Konlca 'Mlnolta 1051

. 0.015986007

.. 0.045618759

_ no bid

.no bid

0.002607056

- 0.002871019

10.002872622

'0.003201839

- 0.004631533

10.007411337

- 0.009686667

L 0.013375554

- 0.016686835

: -01_0456‘46321

_ nobid-

“no bid




