Bidder
Price
Brand
Model
Price/unit

Bidder
Price
Brand
Model -
Price/unit

Bidder
Price
Brand
Model
Price/unit

Bidder
Price
Brand
Model
Price/unit

Bidder
Price
Brand
Model
Price/unit

Item 1

Bottled Water, Flavored

Item 2

8 0Z. 100% NAT SPG H20

Item 3

16.9 0Z.100% NAT SPG H20

Item 4 Item 5 Item 6
1-GAL 100% NAT SPG H20 BAGGED ICE, 10 POUNDS 3AGGED ICE, BULK PACKAGE

Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir.

NO BID

Food Concepts Ice LLC

NO BID

Nestle Waters of N. America

NO BID

Reddyice Corporation
NO BID

Tropic lce LLC
NO BID

Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir.

NO BID

Food Concepts Ice LLC

NO BID

Nestle Walers of N. America

$9.9900

Zephyrhills Spring- 48 Units
16

$0.2081

Reddyice Corporation
NO BID

Tropic lce LLC
NO BID

Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir,

NO BID

Food Concepts lce LLC

NO BID

Nestle Waters of N, America

$4.9900

Zephyrhills Spring- 24 Units

168
50.2079

Reddyice Corporation
NO BID

Tropic lce LLC
NO BID

Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir, Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir, Florida Water dba Mtn Valley Wir.
$1.4800 NO BID NO BID
Chrystal Hill
CLT1GAL
*Vendor did not hold pricing
Food Concepts Ice LLC

Food Concepts ice LLC Food Concepts ice LLC

NO BID $0.6390 $2.4900
Food Concepts lce Food Concepts Ice- 40 LB.
5 G

$0.6390 $0.0623

“Pricing is excessive
Nestle Waters of N. America  Nestle Waters of N, America  Nestle Waters of N. America

$14.7500 NO BID NO BID
Zephyrhills Spring- 6 Gallons
169
$2.4583
Reddyice Corporation Reddyice Corporation Reddyice Corporation
NO BID $0.8700 $3.4800
REDDYICE REDDYICE
10# bagged ice 40# bagged ice
$0.8700 $0.0870
Tropic lce LLC Tropic Ice LLC Tropic lce LLC
NO BID $1.0000 $4.0000
01 02 - 40 LB,
$1.0000 . - $0.10
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M-DCPS Bid 042-)J03 EVALUATION
Listing of Bidders, Prices, and Models

. i . ; *Item 15 not needed if *Item 16 not needed if
'ﬁ"};ﬂi’oﬁ°;édpi'§;'ﬂ,:: i; r ,J‘Z,"Zﬁ,ﬂ,‘,’,f,':,’,'},ZL',’,‘;’,",‘,’!,::Q",’;;,L *Does not comply *Does not comply *Does not comply | main item is not being main item is not being
and 14 did not meet specs. 14 did not mest spacs. with specifications. with specifications. with specifications. _|awarded awarded
ftem 7 item 8 Itemm 9 Item 13 Item 14 Item 15 Item 16
Bidder Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Beltran ET&S-Bid 1
Price $1,539.00 $1,704.00 $1,704.00 $586.00 $653.00 $126.00 $366.00
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc
Model - QY-0214A SY-0454A SY-0424A B-400/B-420 B-570 AR-10000 AR-40000
Bidder Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Beitran ET&S-Bid 2 Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Beltran ET&S-Bid 2
Price $1,539.00 $1,704.00 $1,704.00 $586.00 $653.00 $126.00 $366.00
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc
Model QY-0214A SY-0454A SY-0424A B-400/B-420 B-570 AR-10000 AR-40000
Bidder Belira &SER Balira &5.Bid Balira &SiBid He &G-Bid Beitrs A He &SIBId 5t 85:Rid
_Siatﬁ_ ) > A i L2 NLA A . 5 A\ [ A A 2N A A (2 A /A £ A
Price 000 1060800 $ 1. 68600 58600 yie $13 312644 ot DU
B_rind_ & MO A4 QWO g OWO 2 QWG a3 OWOo & QWO 3 OWo
Model (-0214A 04544 04245 2400 B570 ARZI0B00 AR:40000
Bidder Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE Hertiage Food SE
Price NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $201.19 $490.00
Brand Ice-O-Matic Jce-O-Matic
|Model IFQ1 IFQ2
Bidder e e e e e e & e e e e e e e
status 7 R AR DR AR DR AR PR AR DR AR DR AR PR AR
Price 97.58 $1,643.30 $1.646.9 $560.28 $616.8 5160.00 $390.00
Brand . e-0-Ma e-0O-Ma e-0O-Ma e-0O-Ma e-0-Ma e-0O-Ma e-0-Ma
Model DA 0400A 0520A B42P B55P Q
Bidder Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp. Reddyice Corp.
Status Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive
Reason | : No purchase price No purchase price No purchase price | No purchase price | No purchase price | No purchase price | No purchase price
Price $84.00 per month $92.00 per month $102.00 per month Incl. w/ machine Incl. w/ machine Incl. w/ machine Incl. w/ machine
Brand Hoshizaki Hoshizaki Hoshizaki Hoshizaki Hoshizaki Cuno Cuno
Model KM151-BAH KM515-BAH KM600-BAH B300-PF B500-PF 1X CFS8112/3M 2X CFS8112/3M
Item 10 - Extended Warranly - Item not needed if main item is not being awarded
) Itern 11 - Installation - Item not needed if main item is not being awarded . I e
Iitem 12 - Removal - Item not needed if main item is not being awardec

-epared by R. Johnson
sviewed by C. Saunders
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INERNAL USE ONLY

M-DCPS Bid 042-JJ03 EVALUATION
Listing of Bidders, Prices, and Models

*ltem 17 is a package item which contains items that do not meet specifications. *ltem 18 is a package item which contains items that do not meet specifications.
Bidder Sub-ltem Price Life Brand Model Bidder Sub-item Price Life Brand Model
ltem 17 | Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Ice Machine $1,539.00 Manitowoc | QY-0214A | ltem 18 | Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Ice Machine $1,704.00 Manitowoc | SY-0454A
Filter $126.00 |6 Mos.| Manitowoc | AR-10000 Filter $126.00 | 6 Mos.| Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $600.00 Instaliation $700.00
Removal $100.00 Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | NO BID Extended Warranty | NO BID
TOTAL . TOTAL
Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Ice Machine $1,530.00 Manitowoc | QY-0214A Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 Ice Machine $1,704.00 Manitowoc | SY-0454A
: Filter $126.00 | 6 Mos. | Manitowoc | AR-10000 Filter $126.00 | 6 Mos. | Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $600.00 Installation $700.00
Removal $100.00 Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | $0.00 Extended Warranty | $0.00
" TOTAL . TOTAL
Beltran ET&S-Bid 3 Ice Machine $1,539.00 Manitowoc | QY-0214A Beltran ET&S-Bid 3 Ice Machine $1,704.00 Manitowoc | SY-0454A
Filter $126.00 |6 Mos. | Manitowoc | AR-10000 Filter $126.00 |6 Mos. | Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $600.00 Installation $700.00
Removal $100.00 Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | NO BID Extended Warranty | NO BID
TOTAL TOTAL
Gulf Ice Systems Ice Machine $1,297.58 Ice-O-Matic | ICEU150A Gulf ice Systems Ice Machine $1,643.30 Ice-O-Matic | ICE0400A
Filter $160.00 | 6 Mos. | Ice-O-Matic IF21 Filter $160.00 | 6 Mos. | Ice-O-Matic IFQ1
installatior $350.00 Installatior $350.00
Removal $100.00 Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | $1,907.58 | 1Yr. Extended Warranty | $2,253.30 | 1Yr.
TOTAL TOTAL
epared by A. johnson 06/01/2010
wlewed by C. Saunders Page 2 of 3
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repared by R. Johnson
eviewed by C. Saunders

M-DCPS Bid 042-JJ03 EVALUATION
Listing of Bidders, Prices, and Models

*ltem 19 is a package item which contains items that do not meet specifications.

Bidder Sub-ltem Price Life Brand Model
Item 19 | Beltran ET&S-Bid 1 Ice Machine $1,704.00 Manitowoc | SY-0424A
Filter $126.00 |6 Mos.| Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $700.00
Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | NO BID
TOTAL
Beltran ET&S-Bid 2 lce Machine $1,688.00 Manitowoc | SY-0424A
) Filter $126.00 |6 Mos. | Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $700.00
Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | $0.00
TOTAL ]
Beltran ET&S-Bid 3 lce Machine $1,688.00 Manitowoc | SY-0454A
Filter $126.00 | 6 Mos.| Manitowoc | AR-10000
Installation $700.00
Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty [ NO BID ’>
TOTAL
Gulf Ice Systems Ice Machine $1,646.95 Ice-O-Matic | ICE0520A
Filter $160.00 |6 Mos. | Ice-O-Matic IFQ1
Installatior $350.00
Removal $100.00
Extended Warranty | $2,256.95 | 1 Yr.
TOTAL
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item 20 Iltem 21 Item 22 Item 23 Item 24 Item 25 Item 26 Item 27 Item 28 Iltem 29

Bidder ‘Nestle Walers of NA - Nestle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA  Neslle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA - Nestle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA  Nestle Waters of NA
Price $0.00 50.00 $2.09 $0.00 $44.75 $129.99 $129.99 52.09 $0.00 $44.75
Item 30 item 31 itemn 32 Item 33 ltem 34 Item 36 Item 36
Housing Fliter §8 Cartridge, 50 Micron Cagtridge, § Micron Slngle lce Head!Eliter Single Filter, {ce Bual jce Head/Filter Duaj Fijter, jee

Bidder Mertage Facd Sorv, Equip. Henitage Focd Setv. Equip. Henlapz F tv. Equipe Hentage Foud Serv. Baup . Hentage Feod Sorv. Equip. - Hertage Focd Sewv, Bqup. - Hentage MU Brand

Price $311.41 $11.13 ' $22.17 $183.70 $58.85 $96.93 $56.20 Mode! THRLL

Brand AQUA PURE CUNO CUNO EVERPURE EVERPURE AQUA PURE © AQUA PURE Price ACUA PURE EVERPURF AQUA PURE

Model S8T-1-HA 56212-05 55593-04 9324-01 9612-22 55289-01 46290-02 9324:01 €5289-01
Brand 4 EVERIUKE
Model 5621204 9612-22
Price 11, $58.05 556.20
Erand AQUA PURL
Model 5559304
Price
Est. QTY 48 . 74
Est, Value

(terns 30, 31 and 32 i {temns 33 and 34 ] {tems 35 and 36



