BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

[Type or print in this box the

icomplate name of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LLO6

Title: PAINT

Buyer: GREG JACKSON

PRIMARY

!ALTERNATE

Prepared

]

Verified By: bﬁm

ITEM

M-DCPS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.

ary. UNIT

Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring

Cloor Wheel Paint

unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Model

280-0307

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, YELLOW,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1
GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-3 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT '
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

601 CN

$10.66

$6,406.66

NOBID

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, WHITE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1

- JGL/ICN.

260-0315

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-8 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List)

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

192 CN

$9.10

$1,747.20

NO BID

260-0684

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, BLUE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1
GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-3 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then ‘Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

57 CN

$9.10

$518.70

NO 8ID

260-5929

PAINT, PRIMER COATING, LATEX CONDITIONER FOR
CHALKING EXTERIOR SURFACES, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-14 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-14 LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then '‘Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brands:

1. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TI-GARD 1250
2. CORONADO - 940-11

3. DURON PAINTS - 80-07511

4. PPG - UC80013

30 CN

$68.77

$2,063.10

$40.95

Color Whee! Tt

$1,228.50 GARD 1250

260-0161

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, EXTERIOR/INTERIOR,
PRIMER/SEALER, FLAT, WHITE, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-22 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24
CNS/PALLET MAX.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-22 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)

Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 1178-11
2. RICHARD'S - STAIN KILLER WHITE 7-44

208 CN

$72.50

$15,080.00

1178-11

NO BID

260-0102

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
METAL, BLACK, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-26
LATEST VERSION,1 GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-26 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brands:
1.CORONADO - RUST SCAT # 80-1
2. PPG - PITT-TECH # 90-374

3. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC B66W100

55 CN

$18.25

$1,058.75

80-1

NOBID
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

|Type or print in this box the

{lcomplete name of the bidder:

1 ——=
Bid No, 005-LL06 IALTERNATE R —;
Title: PAINT Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: GREG JACKSON
M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM o ) )
' (TEM # EST. UNIT Berry's Paint, Wallpaperv& Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint
] ! QTY.
{Unil Price Tolal Price Manuf & Mode!  §iUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Modei
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
METAL, OXFORD BROWN, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-26 LATEST VERSION,1 GL/CN.
7 260-5767 IAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-26 (LATEST VERSION) 38 CN $19.25 $731.50 80-1 NO BID
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select ‘FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)
Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - RUST SCAT # 80-1
2. PPG - PITT-TECH # 90-374
3. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC B66W100
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27925, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX. COLOR
8 | 260-1958 [APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION)| 284 CN | nosip $6245 | s17.73580 || WHEEL
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT S/G 320
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then ‘Approved Paint Product List')
= Approved Brands:
. 1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21WW171
v 2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100
3. MA. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501
"""""" 4. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10095WG
PAINT, ALKALI-RESISTANT STAIN BLOCK UNIVERSAL
PRIMER/SEALER, ACRYLIC-BASE, WHITE. FSPMA-
CERTIFIED UNDER MP-38 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN.
9 | 260-1583 APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-38 (LATEST VERSION)| 55 CN $80.00 | $4,400.00 Agj;;gg NO BID
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then ‘Approved Paint Product List')
Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - # 410-11
2. CORONADO - # 116-11
3. CORONADO - # AQ-0400
4. PPG - # 17-921
PAINT, WATER-REDUCIBLE, HIGH PERFORMANCE
RUST INHIBITIVE PRIMER, IRON OXIDE, FSPMA-
- CERTIFIED UNDER MP-53 LATEST VERSION, 1 GL/CN. INSLX COLOR
10 | 260-0463 [JAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-53 (LATEST VERSION) 80 CN $22.75 | $2,047.50 [ICORONADOJ $16.45 $1,480.50 Z,NV;:;E&B
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT DMP 915 PRIMER
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then ‘Approved Paint Product List')
Approved Brands:
1. INSL-X/ CORONADO - # WR-P811
= 2. ZINSSER - # 02001
- METAL SURFACE TREATMENT, CONDITIONER, 1 GL/CN.
11 594-3621 58 CN $19.16 | $1,911.28 $16.25 | $942.50 | SAK-PRIMR
Approved Brand:
OSPHO - 0S04 OR EQUAL
PAINT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, GREEN TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEN, 5 GL/CN
COLOR
12 |} 260-1214 30 CN $123.81 | $3,714.30 $87.45 | $2,623.50 |WHEEL PAINT
. 3800 SERIES
Approved Brand:
TUF-TOP - WC 10-XX OR EQUAL
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

[Type or print In this box the

{lcomplete nams of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LLO6

Title: PAINT

Buyer: GREG JACKSON

PRIMARY

Preeared Bz:

1

lALTERNATE i

Verified By:

! M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM . . .
# EST. Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint
ITEM UNIT
. QTY.
jUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  [[Unit Price Total Price Manul & Model
PAINT, SEALER/ PRIMER, STAIN KILLER, ALCOHOL
BASE,1 GL/CN, 4 PER CASE, MATERIAL VOID OF ZINSSER COLOR
MERCURY
COVER WHEEL PAINT
13 260-5694 102 CN $17.85 | $1,820.70 sTAn  $19.80 $2,019.60 )} coer BIN
03501 PRIMER
Approved Brand:
FIXALL 354 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SILICONIZED, FLAT, BLACK, HEAT RESISTANT
TO 1000 FAHRENHEIT OF HEAT, 1 QT/CN, 12 CN/CS,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
14 260-0404 50 QT $14.00 $700.00 5908 NO BID
Approved Brand:
SHEFFIELD 5906 OR EQUAL
SEALER, MASONARY PATCHING, KNIFE GRADE, MUST
BE MERCURY & LEAD FREE, 1 GL/CN .
BEN LIGHT HOUSE
a2 15 260-1133 403 CN $24.23 | $9,764.69 MOORE $16.89 $6,806.67 |[PRODUCT #L-
0530101 411
- Approved Brand:
SHERWIN WILLIAMS 733-1309 OR EQUAL
SEALER, PRIMER, STAIN BLOCK PIGMENTED, ALKYD,
FLAT, WHITE, 12 OZ SPRAY CN
16 260-0668 2469 CN $3.80 $9,382.20 [|SPRAY KILZ NO BID
Approved Brand:
SHERWIN WILLIAMS PROBLOCK PRIMER 141-1669 OR
SPACKLING COMPOUND, LIGHTWEIGHT, READY-MIXED
FILLER, 1 QT/CN
DAP FAST N LIGHT
17 2541131 50 QT $5.50 $275.00 FINAL $4.22  $211.00 WEIGHT-
LIGHTHOUSE
Approved Brand:
- LIGHTHOUSE L422-1 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, CHOCOLATE, GLOSS, 10-13 0Z
CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
3 RUST-
RUST-OLEUM
18 260-1222 86 CN $3.00 $258.00 OLEUM $2.99 $257.14 4249102
249102
B Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM 249102 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, CHROME ALUMINUM, 10-13 OZ
CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
RUST-OLEUM
19 260-1176 260 CN NO BID $2.99 $777.40 91915830
Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1307 OR EQUAL
3of15 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

iTyps or printin tf;ls box the PRIMARY :

complste nama of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LL06 IALTERNATE I {

Title: PAINT Preeared By: Verified By:

Buyer: GREG JACKSON
M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
#

EST. Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint

ITEM v oy, UNIT

Knit Price Total Price Manul & Model  {{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, GRAY, 10-13 OZ CN. MUST BE
MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

RUST-OLEUM
20 260-1168 205 CN NO BID $2.99 $612.85 #249088

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1315 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, LACQUER, GLOSS, RED, 10-13
OZ CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

21 260-1257 113 CN NO BID NO 8ID

Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM 2438268 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, PRIMER, RED, 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
RUST-OLEUM

222222 260-1231 613 CN NO BID $2.99 | $1,832.87 240088

£ Approved Brand:

FIXALL 1319 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, WHITE, GLOSS, 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

23 260-1249 648 CN

RUST-OLEUM

NO BID $2.99 $1,937.52 4187477

Approved Brand:
- FIXALL 1301 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, BLACK, GLOSS, 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
RUST-OLEUM

24 260-1192 889 CN NO BID $2.99 $2,658.11 #8778

Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM V2402 830 OR EQUAL
PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, DARK BLUE, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
RUST-OLEUM

25 2608-6186 67 CN NO BID $2.99 $200.33 #249114

Approved Brand:

FIXALL 1306 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, MEDIUM GRAY, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

26 260-5208 47 CN NO BID NO BID

Approved Brands:
1. FIXALL 1315
2. DERUSTO 51107 107, OR EQUAL.
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

[Type or print in this box the PRIMARY :

lcomplete name of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LL0O6 lALTERNATE I {

Title: PAINT : Prepared By: Verified By:

Buyer: . GREG JACKSON
M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
#

. Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Fiooring Cloor Wheel Paint
EST. UNIT

ITEM ary.

[Unit Prica Total Price Manuf & Modal  jiUnit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, RED OXIDE, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

27 260-6216 272 CN NO BID NO BID

Approved Brand:

FIXALL K1319 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, MARKING, FLOURESCENT ORANGE , 15
OZ CN.MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

28 260-0439 443 CN NO BID NO BID

Approved Brands:

1. RUST-OLEUM 2355

-l2. GRAINGER 6A378 OR EQUAL.

PAINT, SPRAY, ZINC-RICH, COLD GALVANIZING, 16 OZ
CN, 12 CN/CASE.

RUST-OLEUM

NO BID $6.25 $4,668.75 #7785

23 630-0154 747 CN

Approved Brand:

SPRAY ON 740 OR EQUAL

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,

FEDERAL COLOR # 27880, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER

MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX. COLOR

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION) WHEEL PAINT|
30 || 260-XXX1 | cERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT 100 CN - NoBiD $6245 | 8624500 | ‘rropicoat

- htip://materials.dadeschools.net (select ‘FSPMA Paint #320

Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List")

Approved Brands:
1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21WW171
2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100
3. M.A. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501
4. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10035WG
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
T FEDERAL COLOR # 27780, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX. COLOR
s APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION)
31 260-XXX2 CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT 100 CN NO BID $62.45 | $6,245.00 WHE#% (;:AINT
’ hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)

Approved Brands:
1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21TWW171
2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100
3. M.A. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501
4, COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10095WG
PAINT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, BLACK TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEN, 5 GL/CN
COLOR

32 260-XXX3 50 CN $123.81 $6,190.50 $87.45 $4,372.50 [WHEEL PAINT
#3800

Approved Brand:
TUF-TOP WC 10-XX_OR EQUAL

50f 15 FM-3738 Rev. (06«98)<




Sherwin Williams

MclLean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints
{TEM
fnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Modet fnit Price Yotal Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Modef fUnit Price Tolal Price Manul & Mode!l
|
I
|
CORONADO
<1 K sazo | s552020 |superkotel ssso | ssa4ss0 | 66156 $10.95 | sss8095 | CORONADDI 5 pp . NOBID
i 5000-66
w0056 |
|
i
I
1
s e e — — —— et . —— — L
I
i
CORONADO |
2§ 5787 | $1,511.04 |SUPERKOTE] $7.60 | $145920 |  66.101 $10.00 | $1,92000 | CORONADOH - o pp NO BID
5000-66
5000 #66 |
1
|
i
I
e o e e e e e §
I
I
coronapo |
i3 |s787 | sa4ss0 |supErkoTEl s7e0 | $433.20 66.518 $1000 | ss7o00 | CORONADOI yopip NO BID .
5000-66
5000 #66 |
® I -
|
I
]
e
CORONADO CORONADO . DURON
4 |ssoaa | s178320 | COFONA $57.50 | $1.72500 |  940.11 s7000 | $2,0000 | “OroNA NO BID $53.00 stse000 | L OURON
‘
I
I
I
CORONADO | CORONADO
5 | 56260 | $13,030.52 |SUPERKOTE| $60.60 |$12604.80 | 1178.11 | 7400 | $15392.00 NO BID NO BID
#1178-11
5000 #1178-11)
i
i
I
I
i
1
SRS SSPRNESYRY SY—.-
i
I
CORONADO | CORONADO PPG PITT- DTM ACRYLIC
6 |$1663 | $91465 | RUSTSCAT | §$16.10 | $88550 80.2 $19.70 | $1,083.50 PyA $19.80 | $1,00450 | TECH#g0- || $19.65 $1,080.75 GLOSS
#02 | 353 BLACK #BEEW1005
' I
I
]
I
I
|
1
T —— - U — M — o— — — L
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Mclean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
ITEM
fUnit Price | Tolal Price Manuf & Model [Unil Price Total Prics Manuf & Model [Unit Price Tolal Prica Manuf & Model funit Price Total Price. Manuf & Moded  |Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
I
coronapo | CORONADO PPG PITT- DTMACRYLIC
7 lsis63 | sesros | rustscar | stei0 | set1.80 80.178 $10.70 | $748.60 P $19.00 | $75620 | TECH#s0- || $19.65 $746.70 GLOSS
#80-1 ; 376 #BE6W100
I
i
I
I
I
]
I
I |
I !
I [
BENJAMIN FLEXBON |
8 |noBiD NO BID $118.00 | $3351200 | PERENE | NoBID ; $76.25 s2165500 | LU BON §
i I
] I
i I
I s |
I |
| |
1 I
=, I I
I I
I
| B
coronapo |
9 fsso21 | $380655 | #116-110R | $8970 | $4.93350 | 41011 $8200 | sast000 | CORONADOL coizs | gase125 | PPC#1™ | noso
AQ0400 921
#AQ-0400 |
i
i
I
I P
I g
- | e ¥
] 1§
i {
{
CORONADO || - CORONADO ZINSSER :
10 |Is1966 | s1760.40 | CRONAOON 1040 | st71900 | CTENIION ste0 | stvaoo | S s NOBID NO BID i
i i
I I SHERWIN ¢
i i THE WILLIAMS |
11 s1571 | sot1.18 |ospHo-oso4! s1400 | sese20 0S04 $2165 | $1,255.70 | SKYBRYTE || NOBID $16.80 sorado | (LS
I | CO OSPHO -
i i 3641
i i
I I
[ l i
1 |
SHERWIN. .
25856 TUF. WILLIAMS TUF
12 |INoBID $88.58 | $2,657.40 | WC10-XX || $118.00 | $3540.00 ol NO BID $89.90 $2,697.00 | TOPLATEX
GREEN #735.
3527
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McLean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama
ITEM

Porter Paints Sherwin Williams

{Unit Price [ Total Price Manuf & Model funit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Knit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model  jfUnit Price Total Price

WILLIAMS,

WHITE ™
NO BID NO BiD $17.35 $1,769.70 PIGMENTED

SHELLAC
PRIMER
#B49W8050

13 [NOoBID $22.00 ZINSSER-BIN

$2,244.00 0901

SHERWIN
| s
14 NO BID NO BID $18.60 $930.00 MAJESTIC NO BID $12.25 $612.50 HIGH HEAT
1300
BLACK #988-
5690

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
RICHARDS KOVER KRACK
P10 $17.85 $7,233.85 | PPG4-1000§ $13.75 $5,541.25 PATEH KNIEE
GRADE #126-
2063 .

2 15 NO BID NO BID - $21.00 $8,463.00

SHERWIN: -
. WILLIAMS .

ACE MASTECHEM S

16 $2.91 | $7,18479 | HARDWARE || NOBID

PROBLOCK
NO BID $1.75 $4,320.75
! PRIMAER
1071125 INDS #10004 El

SPRAY #141-
1669

$3.70 $9,135.30

SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
17 $2.85 $132.50 HARDWARE || NO BID $6.10 $305.00 DAP #12142 NO BID $2.35 $117.50
18952

SHRINK FREE
#151-0619

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS .
ACE ZYNOLYTE CONTROLS-
18 $2.30 $197.80 HARDWARE $2.45 $210.70 249102 $2.30 $197.80 #00012 NO BID $1.99 $171.14 RUST SPR‘A‘Y
17012 GLOSS
BROWN 140-
0563 %~

SHERWIN
ACE

WILLIAMS
ZYNOLYTE CONTROLS
18 $2.30 $598.00 HAI??OV\OIQRE NO BID $3.85 $1,001.00 00160 NO BID $1.99 $517.40 RUST SPRAY

ALUMINUM 1404
0530
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,
TRELL W v

Mclean & Ballard Hardware Paimetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinlurama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
ITEM ' :
fUnit Prica | Total Price Manuf & Model fUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Total Prics Manuf & Model fUnit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model  {Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
20 || $2.30 | $47150 | HARDWARE || NOBID $230 | sarts0 |FTNOLYTESY wopp $1.99 $407.95 CONTROLS
pietish 205 RUST SPRAY
GRAY #140-
0621
SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
21 {NoBID 5288 | $325.44 243826 NOBID NO BID $1.99 $224.87 CONTROLS |
RUST SPRAY
RED #140-0548
i
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
-+22 || $262 | $1.606.06 | HARDWARE || NOBID s250 | s1s3250 [FNOVYTEZY \omip $1.99 $121087 | CONTROLS
Mvibent 1704 RUST RED
PRIMER #140-
0589
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
23 || 5230 | $149040 | HARDWARE || NOBID 5230 | sta040 | YROTE N noBi $1.99 st20052 | CONROLS
17000 WHITE # 140-
0522
SHERWIN
ACE : WILLIAMS . 1
24 | $230 | $2.04470 | HARDWARE | $1.65 | $146685 | veaozsao | s230 | s2,044.70 ZY"S'?;(\;TE NO BID $1.99 $1,769.11 RCU%’“T‘T(?%SSS {
17004 BLACK #140-
0506 © £
ek
54.10 DwARE | NOBID $230 | s1sa10 | TNOYTE N o $1.99 $133.33 KRYLON:
25 | s230 | s154. HARD1 Al s . 108 K : SPRAY DK,
17140 BLUE #416-
8779
SHERWIN
AGE DERUSTO WILLIAMS
26 | $230 | $108.10 | HARDWARE || NOBID $2.85 | $133.95 107 NO BID $1.99 $93.53 CONTROLS
: 17021 RUST M. GRAY
#140-0621
g of 15 FM-3738 Rev. {06-98)




ITEM

Mclean & Ballard Hardware

Palmetio Hardware & Plumbing Supply

Pinturama

Porter Paints

Sherwin Williams

RJnit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mode!

fUnit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Prica

Tolal Price

Manuf & Model

[Jnit Price

Total Prica

*anuf & Model

[Unit Price Total Price

Manuf & Model ™",

27

$2.30

$625.60

ACE
HARDWARE
1037605

NO BID

$2.50

$680.00

ZYNOLYTE 2|
1706

NO BID

$1.88

$541.28

SHERWIN :
WILLIAMS:
CONTROLS
RUSTRED- -
OXIDE PRIMER
#140-0589 |

28

$3.38

$1,497.34

ACE
HARDWARE
1017565
(17 0z)

$3.98

$1,767.57

2355

$3.85

$1.705.55

ZYNOLYTE
1392

NO BiD

$1.89

$881.57

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
KRYLON
APWA BRIGHT
ORANGE #234-
6377

29

$4.78

$3,570.66

RUSTOLEUM
7785-830

NO BID

$7.80

$5,826.60

ZYNOLYTE
7007

NO BID

$2.99

$2,233.53

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS PRO
INDUSRRIAL
ZINC-CLAD
coLD
GALVANIZING

143-0285."

30

NO BID

NO BID

$118.00

$11,800.00

BENJAMIN
MOORE #170

NO BID

$76.25

|
I
I
1

31

NO BID

NO BID

$118.00

$11,800.00

BENJAMIN
MOORE #170

NO BIiD

$76.25

e e e e e e e e e e

32

NO BID

$88.58

$4,429.00

WC 10-XX

$111.50

$5,575.00

TUF TOP
#65738

NO BID

$89.00

e

$7,625.00

$7,625.00

$4,450.00

FLEX BON

PREMIUM -
ACRYLIC EXT.
SEMI-GLOSS
#CV10095WF

T
uv—n-‘

FLexson |
PREMIUM EXT.
ACRYLIC SEMH
GLOSS" |
#CVI0095WF |

P

o

preym——

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS TUF
TOP LATEX
GREEN #735-
3527 (5 GAL.)
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i
| Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
i iTEM
L
f [Unil Price ]Tolsl Price ]Menuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Tatal Price lManul & Model
i(
i
1"
i
i CORONADO CORONADG
g $9.75 $5859.75 SUPERKOTE|  $9.60 $5769.60 SUPER KOTE| NOBID
' 66-156 5000 #66.156
i
i
i
4
i
! CORONADO CORONADO
$8.75 $1.680.00 SUPERKOTE|  $8.20 $1,57440 SUPERKOTE[ NOBID
86-101 5000 #66.101
coronoo Sonowos
$8.75 $498.75 SUPERKOTE| $8.20 $467.40 £5000 NO I1BD
665180 466.5780
i
g : CORONADO
4 $5475  §164250 PPGUCB00I3) §61.99 $1,859.70 CONDITIONE||  74.49 $2,234.70 PPG UCB0013
- R 940-11
0 I
i !
. I
|
I
I
|
|
i
i
e
3 CORONADO
45 56395  $1330160 THrOS | $6399  $13,300.02 SUPERKOTE| NOBID
! 5000 #1178-11
)
i
B
i
; CORONADG
1 s s1725  sasrs CORONADON < in  so5700 RUSTSCAT | 2585  $142r25 _Lrotill
80-1 TECH 90-374
#80.2
;
i
i
*
|
i
H
?.
. 110f 15
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Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
{Unit Price }Tntzi Price ]Manu( & Modsl [Unit Price Total Price lManul & Model fJnit Price ]Total Prica }Manu{ & Model
CORONADO
-7 $17.25  ges550  CORONADON gi740  §e5120  RUSTSCAT || 2595 sessto Lol
80-1 TECH #90-374
#80.178
CORONADO
SEMI GLOSS
8 NO BID se800 1931200 SEMELOSSI Nomio
12.4
" CORONADO CORONADO
9 s7250  saeerse CQROMDO N sr200  sassnoo  COLTRA 995 $516725 PPG#T2]
I
I
snsser | CORONADO INSLX
10 | $1775  $159750  LSSER | §7200  $648000  INSLX 2078 $1871.10 CORONADO
i #DMP1S WR-PB11
I
f
i
I
I
]
11 $1325  $76850 OSPHO-0S04] $1850  $1,07300  OSPHO 2636 $1,52888  OSPHO
RICHARDS " TUFF TOP TUF-TOP-WC-
12 || sso0 s22s000 UK $9250 5277500 bl 11205 sasesso o0t
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Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
fUnit Price Totat Price Manul & Model Wit Price ITalal Price lManu1 & Modet Unit Prica Total Price Manul & Model
INSL-X (12-
13 $17.90  $182580 INSL-X6600 || $19.20  $1,95840 INSLXIL6S0O|| 27.25  $2,779.50 5600)
RUST-OLEUM SHEFFIELD
14 $11.25 $562.50 178502 $12.59 $629.50 <006 NO BID
RICHARDS LIGHTHOUSE LIGHTHOUSE
15 $16.35  $6,589.05 ba10 $17.95  §7.23385 O\ 0 1795 §7.20385 oo
ZINSEER MASTER ZINSSER
16 $325  $8,024.25 COLORSTAIN] $359  $8,863.71 CHEMKILZ 495  $12,22155
ODORLESS
3608 (1302)
ZINSEER
17 $4.25 $212.50 READY $4.10 $205.00 “G'CI;Z‘_):’SE 6,60 $33450 As‘;’:g'NAL
PATCH 04304
o RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM
18 $1.75 $150.50 T\ e $3.01 $258.86 o102 5.51 $550.85 RUST-OLEUM
' RUST-OLEUM MERIT PRO
19 $1.75 $465.00 e $2.42 $629.20 5050 456 $1,18560  FIXALL
13 0of 15
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Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
fUnit Price {Tula! Price jManuf & Model fUnit Prica 'Tolal Price Manuf & Model fonit Price Total Price IManuf & Model
20 $1.75 $358.75 RU:;'SOALO?M $3.30 §676.50 MAJIC 82011 4.56 $934.80 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM
21 $1.75 $197.75 V2407830 $3.40 $384.20 42435726 6.59 $744.67 RUST-OLEUM
RUST-OLEUM MERIT PRO
22 $1.75 $1,072.75 215405 $2.40 $1,471.20 8070 4.56 $2,795.28 FIXALL
. RUST-OLEUM DERUSTO
23 $1.75 $113400 0 a0 $1.72 $1.114.56 L ooiean 4.56 $2,954.88 FIXALL
| RUSTOLEUM
| PAINTER
24 $175  sisssys RUSTOLEUMy o9 048031  TOUCH 650  $5858.51 RUST-OLEUM
V2402830
i BLACK
I GLOSS
i
1
__1
REST-OLEUM . MERIT PRO
25 $1.75 $117.25 V2408830 $2.40 $160.80 8030 4.56 $305.52 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM DERUSTO
26 §1.75 $82.25 V2413830 sz\.7o $126.90 S1107 456 $214.32 FIXALL
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Stein Paint

The Paint Spot

Tropicotor Center

ITEM
{unit Price ]Tolal Prica ’Manul & Model {Unit Price JTo{al Prica IM:nuf & Model fUnit Price \’Tota! Prica [mnul & Model
RUST-OLEUM MERITT PRO
27 $1.75 $476.00 215405 $2.29 $622.88 8070 4.56 $1,240.32 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM SEYMOUR
28 $3.97 $1,758.71 2355838 $3.87 $1,625.81 203027 4.98 $2,206.14 INVERTED TIP|
RUSTOLEUM
RUST-OLEUM TOUCHN
-.29 $6.35 $4,743.45 V2185838 $5.17 $3,861.98 ZIN102§:;CH 229 $1,710.63 TONE
CORONADO
30 NO BID $68.20 $6,820.00 EXT SEMI NO BID
GLOSS 12.1
CORONADO
SEMI GLOSS
31 NO BID $68.00 $6,800.00 EXTERIOR NO BID
121
RICHARDS TUFF TOP
32 $89.75 $4,487.50 4510 BLACK $92.17 $4,608.50 GREEN 112.85 $5,647.50 TUF-TOP
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