BID PROPOSAL FORM [FORMAT B)

Bid #072-KKO06
Title: Lawn Equipment, Power
Buyer: G. Jackson

The School Board of Migmi-Dade County, Florida

PrepaW

bam

Verified By:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF [TEM

ESTIMATED)
QUANTITY

ACE LAWNMOWER

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS

UNIT

Unit Price

Totat Price Manuf & Modet

Unit Price

Tatal Prica

Manuf & Model

Edger, Power, Walk-Behind, Commercial, minimum engine|
displacement: 145 cc, minimum fuel capacity: 1750 cc, steel
base, 9" steel blade, ball bearing wheels, controls on the
handle, depth adjustment, blade guard. Minimum 2-year part|
and labor commercial warranty. Must pass satisfactorily a field|
performance test conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial
Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee to be
considered for award. Approved Brands: No currently approved,
brands for this category.

25 Each

$414.00

Gravely

$10,350.00 986101

$415.96

$10,399.00

Husqvarna LE475

Edger, Power, Handheld, Commercial, minimum engine|
displacement: 27 cc, minimum fuel capacity: 320 cc, maximum|
weight: 12 lb, curved shaft, approximately 7.5” steel blade, 9”
steel blade, blade guard, ball bearing wheels, controls on the|
handle, depth adjustment. Minimum 2-year part and labor
commercial warranty.  Must pass satisfactorily a field
performance test conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial
Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee to bel
considered for award. Approved Brands: No currently approved
brands for this category.

25 Each

$324.99

Kawasaki

$8,124.75 KEL2TA

$239.99

$5,999.75

Echo PEZ30

Hedge Trimmer, Extended Reach, Commerciat, Fixed (0 °
approximately 20 cutting attachment approximately 207
double-sided cutting blade and 26” shaft length, gas engine,
minimum engine displacement: 28.0 cc, maximum weight: 13
th. Minimum 2-year part and labor commercial warranty. Must
pass satisfactorily a field performance test conducted by the M-
DCPS Custodial Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee
to be considered for award.Approved Brands: No currently
approved brands for this category.

25 | Each

$429.99

Kawasaki
$10,749.75 | KCS600A-
Al

$268.56

$6,714.00

Stihl HL45

Blower, Leaf, Handheld, Commercial, gasoline engine,
minimum  engine displacement: 27.0 cc, minimum fuel
capacity: 14 oz, minimum air velocity: 130 mph @ round
nozzle, minimum air volume: 425 cfm @ round nozzle,
maximum weight: 10 b, maximum sound pressure rating
measured per ANSI B175.2: 70 dB(A). Minimum Z-year part and
labor commercial warranty. Must pass satisfactorily a field
performance test conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial
Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee to be
considered for award.Approved Brands: No currently approved
brands for this category.

25 Each

$199.99

Kawasaki

$4.999.75 KRH300A

$127.99

$3,199.75

Echo PB250

t(Blower, Leaf, Backpack, Commercial, gasoline engine,
minimum  engine displacement: 60.0 cc, minimum fuel
capacity: 45 oz, minimum air velocity: 190 mph @ round
nozzle, minimum air volume: 520 cfm @ round nozzle,
maximum weight: 26.5 |b, maximum sound pressure rating|
measured per ANSY B175.2: 74 dB(A). Minimum 2Z-year part and
labor commercial warranty. Must pass satisfactorily a field
performance test conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial
Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee to be]
considered for award.Approved Brands: No currently approved
brands for this category.

25 Each

$489.95

Kawasaki

$12.248.75 KRB7508

$239.99

$5,899.75

Husqvarna 350BT




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid #072-KK0B

Title: Lawn Equipment, Power

Buyer: G. Jackson

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

Prepared By:

Verified By:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF [TEM

ACE LAWNMOWER

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS

ESTIMATED) UNIT
QUANTITY

Unit Price

Totat Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Totat Price

Manuf & Model

Trimmer, Monofilament, Commercial, loop handle, gasoling|
engine, minimum engine disptacement: 25.4 c¢, minimum fuel]
capacity: 11 oz., maximum weight: 13.0 Ib, straight shaft, self-
feeding head. Minimum 2-year part and labor commercial
warranty., Must pass satisfactorily a field performance test
conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial Equipment, Supplies and
Standards Committee to be considered for award.Approved
Brands: No currently approved brands for this category.

25 Each

$279.99

$6,999.75

Kawasaki
KTF27A

$199.96

$4,999.00

Husgvarna 223L

Zero Turn Mower, 33" Cutting Deck, minimum 17 HP engine|
power; heavy-duty construction; padded seat; true zero degree
radius-turning; electric ignition; seat-actuated engine kill
system; built-in parking brake on handles; fixed deck;
adjustable cutting height: 1.0” - 1.5” to 3.5" - 4.0” in 0.5"
increments; transmission speed forward: 0 - 5.5 mph, reverse:
0 - 3.0 mph minimum; air filter; must be able to cut on a 15
degree bank; equipped with mulching kit. Minimurm 2-year part|
and labor residential warranty. Must pass satisfactorly a.field,
performance test conducted by the M-DCPS Custodial]
Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee to be
considered for award.Approved Brands: No currently approved|
brands for this category.

25 Each

$2,499.00

$62,475.00

Snapper
5C18533

$1,850.00

$46,250.00

Husqvarna RZ3016

Mulching Kit: for 33" zero turn mower

25 Each

$112.00

$2,800.00

7061255

$39.99

$998.75

Husqvarna
9670710025

Mower, Self-Propelied, Commercial, cutting swath: 21”;
minimum 5.5 HP engine power, transmission: 3-speed rear]
wheet drive; minimum ground speed range: 2.0 - 4.2 mph; steel,
wheels with ball bearings; mulching kit included; height of cut:
0.75” - 1.0” to 3.25” - 3.5" in 0.25” increments. Minimum 2-
year part and labor commercial warranty. Must pass|
satisfactorily a field performance test conducted by the M-
DCPS Custodial Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee
to be considered for award.Approved Brands: No currently|
approved brands for this category.

25 Each

$779.00

$19,475.00

Snapper
CRP216019
Kw

$409.00

$10,225.00

Snapper
RP217020BDV

10

Zero Turn Mower, Commercial, 36" Cutting Deck, minimum
17 HP engine power; heavy-duty construction; padded seat;
true’ zero degree radius-turning; electric ignition; seat-
actuated engine kill system; built-in parking brake on handles;
solid front tires; floating deck; adjustable cutting height: 1.0” -
1.5” to 4.5” - 5.0” in 0.25" increments; transmission speed
forward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0-4 mph minimum; canister-style
air filter; must be able to cut on a 15 degree bank. Minimum 2-
year part and labor commercial warranty. Must pass]
satisfactorily a field performance test conducted by the M-
DCPS Custodial Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee]
to be considered for award. Approved Brands: Snapper Pro $50X
model #S50XKAV1936 or Hustler FastTrak Super Duty modell
#928192 or equal.

20 Each

$3,539.00

$70,780.00

Snapper
S50XKAV20
36

$1.850.00

$37,000.00

Husqvama RZ3016

11

Mulching Kit: for 36" zero turn mower

20 Each

$74.16

$1,483.20

5600191

$39.99

$799.80

Husqvarna 960710025




BID PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)

lrempiete mams-of the bldderr

Bid #072-KK06

Title: Lawn Equipment, Power

Buyer: G. Jackson

The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Flonda
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

Prepared By:

Verified By:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF |ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

ACE LAWNMOWER

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS

UNIT

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modet

Zero Turn Mower, Commercial, 48" Cutting Deck,, minimum
23 HP engine power; heavy-duty construction; padded seat;
true zero degree radius-turning; electric ignition; seat-
actuated engine kill system; built-in parking brake on handles;
sotid front tires; floating deck; adjustable cutting height: 1.0” -
1.5” to 4.5" - 5.0” in 0.25" increments; transmission speed
forward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0-4 mph minimum; canister-style,
air filter; must be able to cut on a 15 degree bank. Minimum 2-
year part and labor commercial warranty. Must pass
satisfactorily a field performance test conducted by the M-
DCPS Custodial Equipment, Supplies and Standards Committee|
to be considered for award. Approved Brands: Snapper Pro S50X]
model #5S50XB2648 or Rustler FastTrak Super Duty model]
#928374 or equal.

15

Each

$3,900.00

$58,500.00

S50XB2648

$5,519.96

$82,799.40

Husqvarna 24821

13

Muiching Kit: for 48" zero turn mower

15

Each

$90.21

$1,353.15

5600014

$169.85

$2,549.25

539111351

*ltem 1 - Homestead Mower Center, Prince Lawnmower Sales and Service, Best Equipment and Repair and Joe Blair Garden Supply
does not comply. Item 2 - Degens Lawn and Garden and American Equipment Rental does not comply. ltem 3 - All Dade
Lawnmowers, Power Mower Sales and Green Thumb Lawn and Garden does not comply. item 4 - Homestaed Mower Center, All
Dade Lawnmower, Degens Lawn and Garden, American Equipment Rental, Best Equipment and Repair, Al's Lawnmower Sales and
‘Service, Power Mower Sales and Green Thumb Lawn and Garden does not comply. ltem 5 - All Dade Lawnmowers, Degens Lawn
and Garden, Homestead Mower Center, and Al's Lawnmower Sales and Service does not comply. ltem 6 - All Dade Lawnmowers
does not comply. ltems 7 & 8 - All Dade LawnmowerDegens Lawn and Garden and Green Thumb Lawn and Garden does not
comply. ltem 9 - All Dade Lawnmower and Homestead Mower Center does not comply. Items 10 & 11 - All Dade Lawnmower does
not comply. SEE MATERIAL TESTING AND EVALUATION REPORT # 9061.




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK08

Lawn Equipment, Power

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS

AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE

AMERICAN EQUIPMENT RENTAL

BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR

Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
ITEM
Power Trim
1 |
NO BID NO BID NO BID 342200 | $10550.00 | "O° T
2 | suess | ssoaa00 |SUFECTOC) g3s500 | 5330075 |EchoPe2so| $20536 | ssi3400 | SIN | 623696 | $5924.00 sl FO7OCE
3| sor190 | se7eers | B 1 NosiD 333176 | 820400 | S ) g33176 | $8.204.00 | StiniHLOOK
: 79975 1 shcazss ' 29400 Hisox ' 284
4| nosp $150.99 | $3999.75 | EchoPB250| §$157.96 | $3949.00 | BGS6CE | $197.46 | $493650 | St BG8S
5 | seease | seseers | MO | sasses | ssave7s | O | s3s066 | $8491.50 | BRSSO | $339.60 | $8,490.00 | Stihl BRSSO
: 598 PB500T ‘ 39975 | pag20sT : 491 ’




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florda
Bid #072-KK08

Lawn Equipment, Power

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS

AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE

AMERICAN EQUIPMENT RENTAL

BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR

Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mods! Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet
iTEM
6| s157.96 $3.940.00 |Stihl KM55R] $239.99 | $5.999.75 Fcho $22116 | $552000 |FS7ORC-E| $221.46 | $5536.50 Stibl
' 9. SRM265 : 529, ' 536, FS70RCE
7| w~oBD NO BID NO BID NO BID
g ! NosiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Snapper Snapper
o | ss3200 | $1330000 |RP216020k| NOBID NO BID $705.00 | $17.625.00 |CRP216019R
wv wv
Hustt Snapper
10| $334400 | $66880.00 | [ | NOBID NOBID $3.679.00 | $73,580.00 |S50XKAV1S3
8
111 NOBID NO BID NO BID $89.00 | $1,780.00




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

ALL DADE LAWNMOWERS AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE AMERICAN EQUIPMENT RENTAL BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Totai Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode! Unil Price Total Price Manuf & Mode!
{TEM
Husqvarna Snapper
12 § $3,599.95 £74824 NO BID NO BID $3,874.00 | $58,110.00 SEOXB648
I
13 NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.00 $1,035.00
*ltel
H
Dac¢
Se
ar
{
COl




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK08
Lawn Equipment, Power

BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR

DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN

GREEN THUMB LAWN AND GARDEN

rew Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modal Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model
1 $384.00 $9,600.00 | PT150 | $399.00 | $9,975.00 H“LSEQZ?;“B NO BID NO BID

21 NoBID $175.00 | $4,375.00 H“fg‘gaE’“a $280.00 | $7,000.00 H”;gé;”a $265.00 | $6,625.00 *f;a;jg'
3| w~osiD $445.00 | $11,125.00 g‘;‘gg;‘f NO BID $325.00 | $8,125.00 Eggé;g’:
4 | $150.96 $3,999.00 | BGS6CE | $128.00 | $3.200.00 H”f‘z‘g”a NO BID $195.00 | $4.875.00 E;gg;%‘i
5 NO BID $395.00 | $9,875.00 H;;ggga $250.00 | $6,250.00 | 350BT | $405.00 | $10,125.00 Eg‘g?gg’g




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN GREEN THUME LAWN AND GARDEN
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Modal Unit Price Total Price wanuf & Model
ITEM
. Husgvarna Kawasaki
6 $236.96 $5,924.00 FS90R $220.00 $5,500.00 2931 NO BID $210.00 $5,250.00 KTF27A
Husgvarna Snapper
7 NO BID $2,100.00 § $52,500.00 RZ3016 NO BID $2,194.00 | $54,850.00 SC18533
.8 NO BID $23.96 $599.00 Husgvarna NO BID $110.00 $2,750.00 7061255
Snapper Snapper
9 NO BID $685.00 | $17,375.00 | CRP216019 NO BID $635.00 $15,875.00 [CRP216019K
KWV w
Snapper
10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,434.00 | $68,680.00 | S50XKAVZ0
36
11 NO BID NO BID NO BID $85.00 $1,700.00 5600181




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK0&
Lawn Equipment, Power

BEST EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN DEGEN'S LAWN AND GARDEN GREEN THUMB LAWN AND GARDEN
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model
ITEM
Snapper
12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,820.00 $57,300.00 S50XR2648
13 NO BID NQO 8iID NO BID $105.00 $1,575.00 5600014
* Ite
Le
Dac
Se
ar




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER

JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY

JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY

PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE

Unit Price Total Prics Manuf & Modet Unit Price Totat Pﬁc; Manuf & Modsi Unit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manul & Modet
ITEM
Ariens Power Trim Power Trim Redhawk
1 $289.80 $7,245.00 986401 $385.00 $9,625.00 150 $385.00 $9,625.00 150 $329.00 $8,225.00 £40
2 | $276.46 $6,911.50 || StihlFCo0 | $236.00 | $5,900.00 [StinlFC70CE| $239.59 | $5999.75 | EchoPE230| $265.00 | $6,625.00 Klfaa‘zsfg'
) N Echo Kawasaki
3 $371.26 $9,281.50 Stihl HL100K] $331.00 $8,275.00 | Stiht HLAOK $319.00 $7.975.00 SHC225 $368.00 $9,200.00 KCLE00A
" . . Kawasaki
4 $118.46 $2,961.50 Stihi BG56 | $197.00 $4,925.00 | Stihi BGB6 $197.00 $4,925.00 | Stihi BG86 || $199.00 $4,975.00 KRH300A
- " N N Kawasaki
5 $276.46 $6,911.50 Stihi BR380 | $339.00 $8,475.00 | Stihl BR550 $339.00 $8,475.00 [ Stihl BR550 || $390.00 $9,750.00 KRB750R




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06

Lawn Equipment, Power

HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER

JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY

JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY

PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE

Unit Prica Tolal Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Yotat Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price tanuf & Model Unit Prics Total Price Manuf & Madel
ITEM
. Stihl Echo Kawasaki
8 $236.96 $5,824.00 Stinl FS90R | $220.00 $5,500.00 FSTORCE $223.99 $5,588.75 SRM230 $199.00 $4,975.00 KTERITA
Gravely Snapper Snapper Encore
7 | $4.189.68 | $104,742.00 991071 $2,189.00 | $54,975.00 SC18533 $2,199.00 | $54,975.00 SC18533 $3,700.00 | $92,500.00 E34KA5E
8 NO BID $84.00 $2,100.00 7061255 $84.00 $2,100.00 7061255 $145.00 $3,625.00 341004
Gravel Snapper
9 $632.88 $15,822.00 9;1278’ $940.00 | $23,500.00 § Toro 22197 $633.00 $15,825.00 [|[CRP216019K} $1,200.00 || $30,000.00 wY28B11BS
WV
Hustler Hustler Hustler Bobcat
10 || $4,157.30 $83,146.00 078192 $3,795.00 | $75.800.00 028192 $3,795.00 | $75,900.00 028192 $3,730.00 | $74,600.00 9429G7F
11 NO BID $95.00 $1,900.00 107654 $95.00 $1,900.00 107654 $130.00 $2.600.00 §70225




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power

HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES AND SERVICE
Unit Price Yotal Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Modet Uit Price Total Price Manuf & Moda! Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Modet
[TEM
12 | $4969.30 | $74.530.50 Hustler | ¢4 176 00 | se2.625.00 | Usier | g3650.00 | §54.750.00 | Toro 74830 | $3,.897.00 | sss4sso0 | Bobcat
1988 539, 928374 75, 625, 928374 :650. 790. ' ’ 942298
13 ] NoBID $110.00 | 3165000 | 108223 | $150.00 | $2.250.00 | 1193320 | $174.99 | $262485 | 970226
f iter
:
 Dac
Se
ar
i
col




POWER MOWER SALES

Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Model
ITEM
1 | s404.00 | $10,100.00 | POwer Trim
150
2 | $367.00 | $9,175.00 |Echo PE280
Echo
3 | s319.00 | $7875.00 | (A
4 || 315090 | $3,999.75 |Echo PB254
5 | $399.00 | $9,875.00 Echo

PB755T

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK08
Lawn Equipment, Power




POWER MOWER SALES

Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modal
ITEM
Echo

6 | $239.99 $5,999.75 SRM265
5 Snapper
7 $2,299.00 | $57,475.00 SC18533
8 $94.00 $2,350.00 7061255
Snapper
9 | $638.00 j§ $15,950.00 CRP2160
Snapper

10 | $3,539.00 | $70,780.00 | S50XKAV20

36

11 $74.00 $1,480.00 5600191

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK06
Lawn Equipment, Power




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #072-KK08
Lawn Equipment, Power

POWER MOWER SALES

Col

Unit Prics Tolal Price Manuf & Model
ITEM

Snapper

12 1$3,924.00 | $58,860.00 S50XB2648

13 § $89.00 $1,335.00 500014
* ltet
:
Dac
Se
ar




