Miami-Dade County Public Schools {M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 071-KK0O3 DELIVERED BAKERY PRODUCTS

& DCPS # De ptio A

1 - 24 OZ. PULLMAN LOAF, WHITE Loaves $1.50 NO BID | NOBD

2 - 24 0. PULLMAN LOAF, WHEAT Loaves $1.52 NO BID NO BID

5] 5251 |PANROLL WHOLE WHEAT Pan of 24 $3.95 $1.58 NO BID / NO BID

6l 5249  |4-INCH HAMBURGER BUNS, WHITE Packages of 12 $1.30 NO BID - NO BID

9 - FRANKFURTER ROLLS Packages of 12 $1.30 NO BID |  NOBID

10 - HOAGIE / STEAK-STYLE BUN, 6-INCH Packages of 6 $1.98 NO BID i | NOBD

11 - HOAGIE / STEAK-STYLE BUN, 7-INCH Packages of 6 $2.50 $1.85 NO BID NO BID

14] 5292 |KAISER / HARD ROLL Packages of 12 $3.85 $1.80 NO BID ,, NO BID

15 - SLIDER ROLL, WHOLE WHEAT Packages of 12 $2.09 $3.37 NO BID . NO BID

17 - CUBAN BREAD Packages of 2 $2.24 $2.30 NO BID | NOBDD

18 - Reject - MIDNIGHT/MEDIA NOCHE ROLL Packages of 6 $1.65 $4.72 $1.55 NO BID
19 - Reject - PITA BREAD Packages of 12 N/A NO BID NO BID
20 5299 |ENGLISH MUFFINS Packages of 12 $1.49 NO BID | NOBD

21 - Reject - FROZEN 24 OZ. PULLMAN LOAF, WHITE Loaves $1.89 $2.43 NO BID NO BID
22 - Reject - FROZEN 24 O7. PULLMAN LOAF, WHEAT Loaves $1.89 $2.49 NO BID NO BID
23 - Reject - FROZEN 24 OZ. PULLMAN LOAF, RYE Loaves $2.60 NO BID NO BID
24 - Reject - FROZEN HEARTY BREAD LOAF Loaves NO BID NO BID
25-Reject] 5251 |FROZEN PAN ROLL Pan of 24 $2.35 $3.03 NO BID NO BID
26 -Reject] 5249 |FROZEN 4-INCH HAMBURGER BUNS, WHITE Packages of 12 $1.92 NO BID NO BID
27 - Reject - FROZEN 4-INCH HAMBURGER BUNS, WHOLE WHEAT Packages of 12 $2.19 NO BID NO BID
28 - Reject - FROZEN FRANKFURTER BUNS, CONEY-STYLE Packages of 12 NO BID NO BID
29 - Reject - ROLL, CINNAMON Individual Rolls $0.43 NO BID NO BID
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