BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

[Type or print in this box the

complete name of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LL06

Title: PAINT

Buyer: GREG JACKSON

ITEM

M-DCPS

PRIMARY

Verified By: mﬁ%

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.

ary. UNIT

Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring

Cloor Whesl Paint

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

260-0307

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, YELLOW,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1
GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-9 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

601 CN

$10.66

$6,406.66

NOBID

260-0315

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, WHITE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1
GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-9 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

192 CN

$9.10

$1,747.20

NO BID

260-0684

PAINT, TRAFFIC, WATER EMULSION BASED, BLUE,
FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-9 LATEST VERSION, 1
GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-9 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brand:
CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 66

57 CN

$9.10

$518.70

NO BID

260-5929

PAINT, PRIMER COATING, LATEX CONDITIONER FOR
CHALKING EXTERIOR SURFACES, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-14 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-14 LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)

Approved Brands:

1. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TI-GARD 1250
2. CORONADO - 940-11

3. DURON PAINTS - 80-07511

4. PPG - UC80013

30 CN

$68.77

$2,063.10

$40.95

$1,228.50

Color Wheel TH
GARD 1250

260-0161

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, EXTERIOR/INTERIOR,
PRIMER/SEALER, FLAT, WHITE, FSPMA-CERTIFIED
UNDER MP-22 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24
CNS/PALLET MAX.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-22 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)

Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - SUPER KOTE 5000 # 1178-11
2. RICHARD'S - STAIN KILLER WHITE 7-44

208 CN

$72.50

$15,080.00

1178-11

NO BID

260-0102

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
METAL, BLACK, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER MP-26
LATEST VERSION, 1 GL/CN.

APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-26 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brands:
1.CORONADO - RUST SCAT # 80-1
2. PPG - PITT-TECH # 90-374

3. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC B66W100

55 CN

$18.25

$1,058.75

80-1

NOBID
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

[Type or print in this box the PRIMARY
complete name of the bidder:
) r—=—="
Bid No. 005-LL06 IALTERNATE i |
Title: PAINT Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: GREG JACKSON
M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
# EST. Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint
ITEM UNIT
QTY.
jnit Price Totai Price Manuf & Modei Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, ENAMEL, GLOSS, DIRECT-TO-
METAL, OXFORD BROWN, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-26 LATEST VERSION,1 GL/CN.
7 260-5767 JAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-26 (LATEST VERSION), 38 CN $19.25 $731.50 80-1 NO BID
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List’)
Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - RUST SCAT # 80-1
2. PPG - PITT-TECH # 90-374
3. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - DTM ACRYLIC B66W100
PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27925, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX. COLOR
8 || 260-1958 |APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION)| 284 CN NO BID s6245 | $17.735.80 || [ VHEEL
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT S/G 320
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List')
= Approved Brands:
1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21WW171
2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100
3. M.A. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501
) 4. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10095WG
PAINT, ALKALI-RESISTANT STAIN BLOCK UNIVERSAL
PRIMER/SEALER, ACRYLIC-BASE, WHITE. FSPMA-
CERTIFIED UNDER MP-38 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN.
9 | 260-1583 JAPPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-38 (LATEST VERSION)|| 55 CN $80.00 | $4,400.00 Ag_%j;o NO BID
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://imaterials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List')
Approved Brands:
1. CORONADO - # 410-11
2. CORONADO - # 116-11
3. CORONADO - # AQ-0400
4. PPG - # 17-921
PAINT, WATER-REDUCIBLE, HIGH PERFORMANCE
RUST INHIBITIVE PRIMER, IRON OXIDE, FSPMA-
CERTIFIED UNDER MP-53 LATEST VERSION, 1 GL/CN. INSLX COLOR
10 || 260-0463 [/APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-53 (LATEST VERSION)| g9 CN || s2275 | s2047.50 [lcoronaDo] $16.45 $1,480.50 ||, WHEEL
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT DMP 915 ZINSSER 123
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint PRIMER
Products' and then 'Approved Paint Product List')
Approved Brands:
1. INSL-X / CORONADO - # WR-P811
2. ZINSSER - # 02001
METAL SURFACE TREATMENT, CONDITIONER, 1 GL/CN.
11 594-3621 58 CN $19.16 | $1.111.28 $16.25 $942.50 | SAK-PRIMR
Approved Brand:
OSPHO - 0S04 OR EQUAL
PAINT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, GREEN TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEN, 5 GL/CN
COLOR
12 260-1214 30 CN $123.81 | $3,714.30 $87.45 | $2,623.50 |WHEEL PAINT
3800 SERIES
Approved Brand:
TUF-TOP - WC 10-XX OR EQUAL
20f15
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Type or print in this box the PRIMARY :

name of the bidder:

- | i |
Bid No. 005-LL06 IALTERNATE 1 ]

Title: PAINT Preeared Bx: Verified By:
Buyer: GREG JACKSON

M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM .
# EST. Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint
| ITEM iy UNIT

Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  JRnit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet

PAINT, SEALER/ PRIMER, STAIN KILLER, ALCOHOL
BASE,1 GL/CN, 4 PER CASE, MATERIAL VOID OF ZINSSER COLOR
MERCURY

| COVER WHEEL PAINT
13 260-5694 102 CN $17.85 | $1,820.70 sTan  $19.80 $2,019.60 ZINSSER BIN

03501 PRIMER

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 354 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SILICONIZED, FLAT, BLACK, HEAT RESISTANT
TO 1000 FAHRENHEIT OF HEAT, 1 QT/CN, 12 CN/CS,

MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.
14 260-0404 50 QT $14.00 $700.00 5908 NO BID

Approved Brand:
SHEFFIELD 5906 OR EQUAL

SEALER, MASONARY PATCHING, KNIFE GRADE, MUST
BE MERCURY & LEAD FREE, 1 GL/CN.

BEN LIGHT HOUSE
15 260-1133 403 CN $24.23 $9,764.69 MOORE  $16.8% $6,806.67 [|PRODUCT #L-
0530101 411

Approved Brand:
SHERWIN WILLIAMS 733-1309 OR EQUAL

SEALER, PRIMER, STAIN BLOCK PIGMENTED, ALKYD,
FLAT, WHITE, 12 OZ SPRAY CN

16 260-0668 2469 CN $3.80 $9,382.20 |ISPRAY KILZ NO BID

[Approved Brand:
SHERWIN WILLIAMS PROBLOCK PRIMER 141-1669 OR

SPACKLING COMPOUND, LIGHTWEIGHT, READY-MIXED
FILLER, 1 QT/CN

LIGHT
17 | 2541131 50 QT $5.50 | $275.00 DA;Z’Z‘T‘_TN $4.22  $211.00 | weiGHT-

LIGHTHOUSE

Approved Brand:
LIGHTHOUSE L422-1 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, CHOCOLATE, GLOSS, 10-13 0Z

CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

: RUST-
18 2601222 86 CN $3.00 $258.00 OLEUM $2.99 $257.14

249102

RUST-OLEUM
#249102

Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM 249102 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, CHROME ALUMINUM, 10-13 OZ
CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

RUST-OLEUM

19 260-1176 260 CN NO BiD $2.99 $777.40 #1915830

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1307 OR EQUAL
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

IType or print in this box the PRIMARY :

complete name of the bidder:

r
Bid No. 005-LL06 IALTERNATE | |

Titte: PAINT Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: GREG JACKSON

M-DCPS DESCRIPTION OF ITEM ) A .
# EST Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring Cloor Wheel Paint

ITEM aTy. UNIT

{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  §iUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, GRAY, 10-13 OZ CN. MUST BE
MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

RUST-OLEUM

20 260-1168 205 CN NO BID $2.99 $612.95 4249088

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1315 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, LACQUER, GLOSS, RED, 10-13
OZ CN. MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

21 260-1257 113 CN NO BID NO BID

Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM 243826 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, PRIMER, RED , 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

RUST-OLEUM

22 260-1231 613 CN NO BID $2.99 $1.832.87 4249086

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1319 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, WHITE, GLOSS, 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

23 260-1249 648 CN NO BID $209 | $193752 |RUST-OLEUM

#187477

Approved Brand:
FIXALL 1301 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY,ENAMEL, BLACK, GLOSS, 10-13 OZ CN.
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

24 || 260-1192 889 CN NO BID 5200 | s2.658.11 |RUST-OLEUM

#18776

Approved Brand:
RUST-OLEUM V2402 830 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, DARK BLUE, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

RUST-OLEUM

25 260-6186 67 CN NO BID $2.99 $200.33 1049114

Approved Brand:
- FiXALL 1306 OR EQUAL

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, MEDIUM GRAY, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

26 260-6208 47 CN NO BID NO BID

Approved Brands:
1. FIXALL 1315
2. DERUSTO 51107 107, OR EQUAL.
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

IType or printin this box the

name of the bidder:

Bid No. 005-LL06

Title: PAINT

Buyer. GREG JACKSON

PRIMARY

IALTERNATE

PreEared Bx:

Verified By:

ITEM

M-DCPS

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

EST.

aTy. UNIT

Berry's Paint, Wallpaper & Flooring

Cloor Wheel Paint

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Madel

Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Modet

27

260-6216

PAINT, SPRAY, ENAMEL, RED OXIDE, 10-13 OZ CN,
MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

Approved Brand:
FIXALL K1319 OR EQUAL

272 CN

NO BID

NO BID

28

260-0439

PAINT, SPRAY, MARKING, FLOURESCENT ORANGE , 15
OZ CN.MUST BE MERCURY AND LEAD FREE.

Approved Brands:
1. RUST-OLEUM 2355
2. GRAINGER 6A378 OR EQUAL.

443 CN

NO BID

NO BID

29

630-0154

PAINT, SPRAY, ZINC-RICH, COLD GALVANIZING, 16 OZ
CN, 12 CN/CASE.

Approved Brand:
SPRAY ON 740 OR EQUAL

747 CN

NO BID

$6.25

RUST-OLEUM

$4,668.75 #7785

30

260-XXX1

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27880, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX.
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION)
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
hitp://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products’ and then 'Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brands:

1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21WW171

2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100

3. M.A. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501

4. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10095WG

100 CN

NO BID

$62.45

COLOR
WHEEL PAINT
TROPICOAT
#320

$6,245.00

31

260-XXX2

PAINT, ACRYLIC-BASE, SEMI-GLOSS, EXTERIOR,
FEDERAL COLOR # 27780, FSPMA-CERTIFIED UNDER
MP-28 LATEST VERSION, 5 GL/CN, 24 CNS/PALLET MAX.
APPROVED BRANDS: FSPMA MP-28 (LATEST VERSION),
CERTIFIED BRANDS LISTED AT
http://materials.dadeschools.net (select 'FSPMA Paint
Products' and then ‘Approved Paint Product List')

Approved Brands:

1. SHERWIN-WILLIAMS - # B21WW171

2. ICI-GLIDDEN - # 2406-0100

3. M.A. BRUDER & SONS - # 024-1501

4. COLOR WHEEL PAINT - TROPICOAT S/G 320
5. FLEX BON PAINTS - CV10095WG

100 CN

NO BID

$62.45

COLOR
$6,245.00 [WHEEL PAINT)|
#320F

32

260-XXX3

PAINT, FLOOR, LATEX, WATER BASE, BLACK TUF TOP,
LATEX, GREEN, 5 GL/CN

Approved Brand:
TUF-TOP WC 10-XX OR EQUAL

50 CN

$123.81

$6,190.50

$87.45

COLOR
$4,372.50 |WHEEL PAINT]|
#3800
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McLean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
ITEM
[Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model IWnit Price  Total Price Manuf & Model ‘Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode!
}
. CORONADO
1 Fse2 SUPERKOTE! sso0 | $534800 | e6.156 $10.95 | s6.58005 | CORONADOI iy NO BID
5000466 | 5000-66
|
|
|
]
I
LI T I I R R —— }
I
I
CORONADO
2 | srer SUPER KOTE| $7.60 | $1.45020 |  66.101 $10.00 | s1.02000 | CROMOON nomp NO BID
5000 #66 | -
1
|
I
i
] B M S G A S M — — i
I
I
CORONADO
3 a7 sUPERKOTEl $7.60 | $433.20 66.518 $10.00 | 57000 | CORONADO I o mip NO BID
5000 #66 | 5000-66
|
]
i
I
CORONADO CORONADO DURON
4 | s59.44 et $5750 | $1,72500 |  o40.11 $7000 | s2.40000 | SO0V NO BID $53.00 s150000 |, OJRON
|
|
|
CORONADO
“5  se269 SUPER KOTE: 36060 | 51260480 | 117841 | $7400 | 1539200 | CORONADON noBID NO BID
5000 #1178-11)
1
i
I
I
i
I
- 1
|
I
CORONADO | CORONADO PPG PITT- DTM ACRYLIC
6 |s16.63 RUST SCAT | $16.10 | $885.50 80.2 s1970 | $1.08350 | CORON $1990 | $1,09450 | TECH#90- | $19.65 $1,080.75 GLOSS
#02 | 353 BLACK #BE6W100
]
1
I
I
I
I
!
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Mcl.ean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
ITEM
fUnit Price  {Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price. Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manif & Model
| 3
CORONADO : CORONADO PPG PITT- DTM ACRYLIC i
7 $16.83 | $631.94 | RUSTSCAT ! $16.10 $611.80 80.178 $19.70 $748.60 #8501 $19.90 $756.20 | TECH#90- || $19.65 $746.70 GLOSS
#80-1 : 376 #BE6W100
|
|
1
|
1
1
| 1
I I
| |
| |
BENJAMIN FLEX BON
8 NO BID NO BID $118.00 | $33,51200 | oot ool NOBID : $76.25 $21655.00 | LovitcewE :
| I
| I
| I
| |
| I
| I
| |
| I
| I
|
|
coronapo |
9 |see21 | s380655 | #1i6110R | $8970 | $493350 |  410.4% $82.00 | $451000 | CORONADOR oi75 | gase125 | "PC#7 I nosD
AQO400 921
#AQ-0400 |
|
|
I
|
|
|
|
CORONADO CORONADO ZINSSER
10 || $19.66 | $1,769.40 DMP915 $19.10 | $1,719.00 DMPS15 $19.70 | $1,773.00 402001 NO BID NO BID
1 |
| | SHERWIN
1 | THE WILLIAMS
11 $15.71 | $911.18 |OSPHO-0S04; $14.90 $864.20 0S04 $21.65 | $1,255.70 | SKYBRYTE NO BID $16.80 $974.40 OSPHO #482. 1
1 I CO OSPHO i
| | 3641
| |
| |
| |
| |
SHERWIN
25855 TUE- WILLIAMS TUF
12 |iNOBID $88.58 | $2,657.40 | WC10-XX || $118.00 | $3,540.00 ToP NO BID $17.80 $534.00 TOP LATEX
GREEN #735-
3527
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Mcl.ean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
ITEM
lunit Price | Total Price Manuf & Mode lUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model__[{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model __{{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model _|[Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
WHITE
13 |[INoBID 52200 | s224400 [ZNSSERBNI NogiD NO BID $17.35 $176970 | PIGMENTED
SHELLAC
PRIMER
#B49W8050
SHERWIN
s
14 NO BID NO BID $18.60 $930.00 MAJESTIC NO BID $12.25 $612.50
1300 HIGH HEAT
BLACK #988-
5690
SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
RICHARDS KOVER KRACK]
15 NO BID NOBID $21.00 $8,463.00 P810 $17.95 $7,233.85 | PPG 4-1000 $13.75 $5,541.25 PATEH KNIFE
GRADE #126-
2963
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
MASTECHEM PROBLOCK
16 $2.91 | $7,184.79 H/?ié?ﬁé;{E NO BID $3.70 $9,135.30 INDS #10004 NO BID $1.75 $4,320.75 PRIMAER
SPRAY #141-
1669
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
17 $2.65 $132.50 HARDWARE NO BID $6.10 $305.00 DAP #12142 NO BID $2.35 $117.50 SHRINK FREE
18952
#151-0619
SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
ACE ZYNOLYTE CONTROLS
18 $2.30 $197.80 HARDWARE || $2.45 $210.70 249102 $2.30 $197.80 # NO BID $1.99 $171.14 RUST SPRAY
09012
17012 GLOSS
BROWN 140-
0563
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
ZYNOLYTE CONTROLS
19 $2.30 $598.00 HAT*!/D(\)/g?RE NO BID $3.85 $1,001.00 00160 NO BID $1.99 $517.40 RUST SPRAY
ALUMINUM 140
0530
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Mclean & Ballard Hardware Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply Pinturama Porter Paints Sherwin Williams
iTEM
Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modetl [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
20 | $2.30 | $471.50 | HARDWARE | NOBID $230 | sar1s0 [PYNOLYTESY oo $1.99 $407.95 CONTROLS
17021 205 RUST SPRAY
GRAY #140-
0621
i
i
i
! SHERWIN
i WILLIAMS
i 21 |nosi $2.88 | $32544 243826 | NOBID NOBID $1.99 $224.87 CONTROLS
b RUST SPRAY
) RED #140-0548
)
i
I
i
! SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
222 | s262 | $1.606.06 | HARDWARE || NOBID s250 | 153250 |FNOTEZ nosip $1.99 st21987 | CONTROLS
1010073 70 RUST RED
PRIMER #140-
0589
SHERWIN
ACE WILLIAMS
23 || 5230 | $1,49040 | HARDWARE || NOBID $230 | $140040 | ENOYTE W oD $1.99 $1,280.52 | CONTROLS
A 5192 RUST GLESS
WHITE # 140-
0522 |
!
i SHERWIN
i - WILLIAMS
5 24 | s230 | $2.04470 | HARDWARE | $1.65 | $1466.85 | vodozs30 | s230 | 204470 | DNOVYTE L \omiD $1.99 $1760.11 | CONTROLS
i ro0s S190 RUST GLOSS
i BLACK #140-
0506
i
W
i SHERWIN
AcE WILLIAMS
25 | $2.30 | $154.10 | HARDWARE || NOBID $230 | sisat0 | ZNONYTEN wosip $1.99 $133.33 KRYLON
ot S198 SPRAY DK.
BLUE #416-
8779
! SHERWIN
i ACE DERUSTO WILLIAMS'
i 26 $2.30 | $108.10 | HARDWARE || NOBID $2.85 $133.95 51107 NO BID $1.99 $93.53 CONTROLS
b 17021 RUST M. GRAY|
" #140-0621
i
;
1
;
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Mcl.ean & Ballard Hardware

Palmetto Hardware & Plumbing Supply

Pinturama

Porter Paints

Sherwin Williams

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

[Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

[Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modet

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modet

Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Model

27

$2.30

$625.60

ACE
HARDWARE
1037605

NO BID

$2.50

$680.00

ZYNOLYTE 2-
1706

NO BID

$1.89

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
CONTROLS
RUST RED-
OXIDE PRIMER
#140-0589

$541.28

28

$3.38

$1,497.34

ACE
HARDWARE
1017565
(17 02)

$3.99

$1,767.57

2355

$3.85

$1,705.55

ZYNOLYTE
1392

NO BID

$1.99

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS
KRYLON
APWA BRIGHT]
ORANGE #234-
6377

$881.57

29

$4.78

$3,570.66

RUSTOLEUM
7785-830

NO BID

$7.80

$5,826.60

ZYNOLYTE
7007

NO BID

$2.99

30

NO BID

NO BID

$118.00

$11,800.00

BENJAMIN
MOORE #170

NO BID

$76.25

31

NO BID

NO BID

$118.00

$11,800.00

BENJAMIN
MOORE #170

NO BID

e e e e e e

$76.25

32

NO BID

$88.58

$4,429.00

WG 10-XX

$22.30

$1,115.00

TUF TOP
#65738

NO BID

$17.80

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS PRO
INDUSRRIAL
$2,233.53 ZINC-CLAD
coLb
GALVANIZING
143-0255

|

I
FLEXBON }
PREMIUM
$7.625.00 | ACRYLIC EXT.
SEMI-GLOSS
#CV10095WF

———— g

FLEXBON 1
pREMIUM ExT.1
$7,625.00 | ACRYLIC SEMI{

GLoss |
#CV10095WF |

SHERWIN
WILLIAMS TUF:
$890.00 TOP LATEX
GREEN #735-
3527 (5 GAL.)
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Stein Paint

The Paint Spot

Tropicolor Center

ITEM
[Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price [Manuf & Mode!
CORONADO CORONADO
1 $075  $5859.75 SUPERKOTE| $9.60  $5769.60 SUPERKOTE| NOBID
66-156 5000 #56.156
CORONADO CORONADO
2 $875  $1680.00 SUPERKOTE| $820 5157440 SUPERKOTE| NOBID
66-101 5000 #66.101
oo
3 $8.75 $498.75 SUPERKOTE|  $8.20 $467.40 e NO IBD
66-5180 #66.5780
I
: CORONADO
4 $5475  $164250 PPGUCEODI3| $6199  §185070 CONDITIONE| 7449  §$223470 PPGUCB0013
R 940-11
i
I
|
i
1
|
1
|
CORONADO
5 $63.95  $13,301.60 R'C;“:fDS $63.99  $13.300.92 SUPERKOTE| NOBID
) 5000 #1178-11
CORONADO
6 $17.25  soss7s CORONADO Il g0 40 95700 RUSTSCAT || 2505  $14a725 _EPGPITT:
80-1 TECH 90-374
#80.2
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Stein Paint

The Paint Spot

Tropicolor Center

ITEM
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
CORONADO
7 $17.25 $655.50 CORONADO $17.40 $661.20 RUST SCAT 25.95 $986.10 PPG-PITT-
80-1 TECH #90-374
#80.178
CORONADO
SEMI GLOSS
8 NO BID $68.00 $19,312.00 EXTERIOR NO BID
12.1
CORONADO CORONADO
¢] $72.50 $3,987.50 AQ-0400 $72.00 $3,960.00 #116-11 93.95 $5,167.25 PPG-#17-921
I
I
ZINSSER ] CORONADO INSL-X
10 $17.75 $1,597.50 #02001 1 $72.00 $6,480.00 INSL-X 20.79 $1,871.10 CORONADO
1 #DMP915 WR-P811
1
1
1
I
1
1
11 $13.25 $768.50 OSPHO -0S04 $18.50 $1,073.00 OSPHO 26.36 $1,528.88 OSPHO
RICHARDS TUFF TOP TUF-TOP-WC-
12 $75.00 $2,250.00 #4205 $92.50 $2,775.00 WC-10 112.95 $3,388.50 10XX
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‘ Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
{Unit Price Total Price 'Manuf & Model [Unit Price Total Price [Manuf & Madel Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
INSL-X (12-
13 $17.90 $1,825.80  INSL-X 6600 $19.20 $1,958.40 INSLX L6600  27.25 $2,779.50 5600)
RUST-OLEUM SHEFFIELD
14 $11.25 $562.50 7778502 $12.59 $629.50 5906 NO BID
RICHARDS LIGHTHOUSE LIGHTHOUSE
15 $16.35 $6,589.05 310 $17.95 $7,233.85 L4001 17.95 $7,233.85 G.E. L400
ZINSEER MASTER ZINSSER
16 $3.25 $8,024.25 COLORSTAIN|  $3.59 $8,863.71 CHEMKILZ 4.95 $12,221.85  (oocrees
3608 (1302}
ZINSEER \
17 $425  $21250  READY sa10  sas00 OTIHOUSEL g0 sageso  TASTRTINAL
PATCH 04304
RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM
18 $1.75 $150.50 V2411830 $3.01 $258.86 249102 6.51 $550.86  RUST-OLEUM
RUST-OLEUM MERIT PRO
19 $1.75 $455.00 V2412830 $2.42 $629.20 3060 4.56 $1,185.60 FIXALL
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Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
lUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Modei Unit Price Total Price ]Manu{ & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet
RUST-OLEUM MAJIC 8-2011]
20 $1.75 $358.75 #215400 $3.30 $676.50 N 4.56 $934.80 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM
21 $1.75 $197.75 V2407830 $3.40 $384.20 4243626 6.59 $744.67 RUST-OLEUM
RUST-OLEUM MERIT PRO
22 $1.75 $1,072.75 215405 $2.40 $1,471.20 3070 456 $2,795.28 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM DERUSTO
23 $1.75 $1,134.00 T Sa30 $1.72 $1114.56 o ea0 4.56 $2,954.88 FIXALL
: RUSTOLEUM
PAINTER
24 $1.75 $1,555.75 RUST'OLEUMI $2.79 $2,480.31 TOUCH 6.59 $5,858.51 RUST-OLEUM
V2402830
| BLACK
1 GLOSS
|
l
T — —— — — — I
REST-OLEUM MERIT PRO
25 $1.75 $117.25 V2408830 $2.40 $160.80 5030 4.56 $305.52 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM DERUSTO
26 $1.75 $82.25 V2413830 $2.70 $126.90 S1107 4.56 $214.32 FIXALL
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Stein Paint The Paint Spot Tropicolor Center
ITEM
jUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Modei Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model [Unit Price. Total Price Manuf & Model
RUST-OLEUM MERITT PRO
27 $1.75 $476.00 215408 $2.29 $622.88 8070 456 $1,240.32 FIXALL
RUST-OLEUM RUSTOLEUM SEYMOUR
28 $3.97 $1,758.71 2355838 $3.67 $1,625.81 203027 4.98 $2.206.14 | oo D TP
RUSTOLEUM
RUST-OLEUM TOUCHN
29 $6.35 $474345 T cnas $5.17 $3,861.99 21N102§310H 2.29 $1,710.63 TONE
CORONADO
30 NO BID $68.20 $6,820.00  EXT SEMI NO BID
GLOSS 12.1
CORONADO
SEMI GLOSS
31 NO BID $68.00 $6,800.00 L reoioRm NO BID
1241
RICHARDS TUFF TOP
32 $89.75 $448750 o 0n AcK $92.17 $4,608.50 GREEN 112,85 $5,647.50 TUF-TOP
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