The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed bb@

012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid ' Compieted by
Bid # 012-KKO1-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
P APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS, INC. CONTRAX FURNISHING. INC.
. . . Name/Effectiv . N E i
e Manufacturer % Disc. l;’;tz;ls:a‘ N°g‘§{§g§%§i:ﬁ: of 1o, Dise. iZ‘;,Z‘jZ& Déte of l e % Disc. ]Z“Sf%';; ngcft;f e
Catalog/Price List Catalog/Price
. [LHON
DESCRIPTION
, | ARICOBELL
DESCRIPTION
5 | VIRCO
DESCRIPTION
4 | LOGIFLEX 48% 45% 2010 PRICE LIST 55% 51%
DESCRIPTION
5 | SCHOOLSPECIALTY
DESCRIPTION
6 Global Industries
DESCRIPTION
5 | _NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION
. MARK PRODUCTS
DESCRIPTION
g | BUCKSTAFF
DESCRIPTION
1o |LKNOLL
DESCRIPTION
11 |ALLSTEEL
DESCRIPTION
12 ACADEMIA
DESCRIPTION
13 |_COMMUNITY PLAY THINGS
DESCRPTON oy
1+ |CoNEveORY O AT T TR
DESCRIPTION
15 |HERTZ FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION
16 |_DIVERSIFIED WOOD PRODUCTS L aB0% | 410%
DESCRIPTION

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98) 1




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid

Reviewed by
Completed by

Bid # 012-KKO1-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT

BiD

CORPORATE INTERIORS, INC.

DEMARIA HOLDING INC./MARK PRODUCT

ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES, INC,

ltem

Manufacturer

% Disc.

% Disc.
instalied

Name/Effective Date of
Catalog/Price List

% Disc.
installed

Name/Effective Date of

% Disc. Catalog/Price List

% Disc.

% Disc.
installed

Name/Effective Date of
Catalog/Price List

HON

59.5%

58%

1-Oct-09

61.93%

59.83%

DESCRIPTION

ARTCO BELL

DESCRIPTION

VIRCO

DESCRIPTION

LOGIFLEX

DESCRIPTION

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

DESCRIPTION

Global industries

DESCRIPTION

NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE

DESCRIPTION

MARK PRODUCTS

BS362913-2,B5364313-

25% | 3,BS365713-4 2010

DESCRIPTION

BOOK |
CASES

BUCK STAFF

DESCRIPTION

KNOLL

DESCRIPTION

ALL STEEL

DESCRIPTION

ACADEMIA

DESCRIPTION

COMMUNITY PLAY THINGS

DESCRIPTION

CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS

DESCRIPTION

HERTZ FURNITURE

DESCRIPTION

DIVERSIFED WOOD PRODUCTS

DESCRIPTION

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid

Reviewed by
Completed by

Bid # 012-KKO1-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT

b JC WHITE GALLOWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES GLOBAL INDUSTRIES, INC.
o m: Name/Effective o . o mi .
wone | e TTOR0ee oo v homuitecs ool o | 505, Topairectionae

. |HoN 64.5% |  645% 50% | 50%

| DESCRIPTION

, | ARTCO BELL R B T
DESCRIPTION

, |Yrco
DESCRIPTION

4 | LOGIFLEX
DESCRIPTION

5 |_SCHOOL SPECIALTY
DESCRIPTION

6 Global Industries 52% 42%
DESCRIPTION

;| NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION

4 | A< PRODUCTS
DESCRIPTION

o |_BUCKSTAFF
DESCRIPTION

1o |_KNOLL
DESCRIPTION

11 [ ALLSTEEL

" | DESCRIPTION

15 | ACADEMIA
DESCRIPTION

13 |_COMMUNITY PLAY THINGS
DESCRIPTION

4 |_CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS
DESCRIPTION

15 | HERTZ FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION

¢ |_DIVERSIFIED WOOD PRODUCTS
DESCRIPTION

FM-3738 Rev. {06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by

012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid Completed by
Bid # 012-KKO1-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
B OFFICE EXPRESS SUPPLY INC. SATCO SUPPLY
wone | e | aneain [0 ey | MemSratectve pae o
. LHoN NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
, | ARTCOBEL NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
5 [ VIRCO NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
4 | LOSIFLEX NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
5 | SCHOOL SPECIALTY NOBID | NO BID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBD
6 Global Industries NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NO BID
5 | NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
. MARK PRODUCTS NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NO BID
g | BUCKSTAFF NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
1o LKNOW NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
11 LLALL STEEL NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
1g |LACADEMIA NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
13 |_COMMUNITY PLAY THINGS NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
14 | CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
15 | HERTZ FURNITURE NOBID | NOBID
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID
16 |_DIVERSIFIED WOOD PRODUCTS 35% 33% 2010 45% | 39.50%
DESCRIPTION NOBID | NOBID

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98) a



FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
012-KK01-8chool Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid

Reviewed by
Completed by

Bid # 012-KK01-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT

8o SCHOOLHOUSE PRODUCT SCHOOL SPECIALTY INC.
ltem Manufacturer % Disc. % Disc. Ncme/Effecﬁv.e Dqte of % Disc. .% Disc. Ncme/Eﬁ'ecﬁv_e Dqte of
installed Catalog/Price List installed Catalog/Price List

| |HON 40% | 35%
pescrelON [ [ T

o o I M
DESCRIPTION

5 |VIRCO
DESCRIPTION

4 | LOSIFLEX 4% | 35%
DESCRIPTION _

5 |_SCHOOL SPECIALTY a0 | % | T :
DESCRIPTION _ i :

5 |_Global Industres 51% | 48% | THINK GLOBALJAN.2010 | 52.6% | 36.5%
DESCRIPTION

;| NATIONAL BUSINESS FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION

, | ARk PRODUCTS
DESCRIPTION

o | BUCKSTAFF
DESCRIPTION

1o LKNoLL
DESCRIPTION

11 AL STEEL
DESCRIPTION

15 | ACADEMIA
DESCRIPTION

13 |_COMMUNITY PLAY THINGS
DESCRIPTION

14 |_CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS
DESCRIPTION

s |_HERTZ FURNITURE
DESCRIPTION

16 |_DIVERSIFIED WOOD PRODUCTS 0% | 25% 45% | 35%
DESCRIPTION




FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewedby
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid Completed by
Bid # 012-KKG1-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
i
BP APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE CONTEMPORARY INTERIORS, INC. CONTRAX FURNISHING, INC.
o mien | % Disc. | Name/Effective Date of |, .. | %Disc. | ome/Efiective - % Disc. | ome/Effective
ltem Manufacturer % Disc. Installed Catalog/Price List % Disc. installed Date of % Disc. Installed Date of
1S : g Catalog/Price List Catglog/Price |
17 HERMAN MILLER
DESCRIPTION
18 INSTHUTIONAL PRODUCT
DESCRIPTIGN o
19 GEORGIA CHAIR 1 415 32.5
DESCRIPTION
' Pre-Approved Vendors: REFURBISHING OF
Y N
20 | FURNITURE YES NO YES NO ES 0]
X X X
Reconfiguration of furniture hourly tabor $70.00 §59.71
21
ITEMS 22 THROUGH 24 LOW UNIT MEASURE
Unit Cost
BOURCTSE, " SCVV AT3 T X O7 178 H, TIMICRK IXeq
g2 | shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak $280.00 NO BID
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or
Eriial
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 43 3/8'H, thick fixed
23 | shelves. Laminates :Mahogany, Oak and
Maple: Approved Brand HON 105533 or Equal $260.00 NO BID
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 29 5/8"H, thick fixed
24 shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Qak :
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or $230.00 NO BID
Equall. ‘




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida Reviewed by

012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid Completed by___
Bid # 012-KK01-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
8ID
CORPORATE INTERIORS, INC. DEMARIA HOLDING INC./MARK PRODUCT ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRISES, INC.
) o % Disc. | Name/Effective Dateof |, . % Disc. Name/Effective Date of | _ . % Disc. Name/Effective Date of
ftem Manufacturer % Disc instalied|  Catalog/Price List % DIsC- | jnstalled Catalog/Price List % Disc. | i stalled Catalog/Price List
17 HERMAN MILLER
DESCRIPTION
18 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT
DESCRIPTION
" GEORGIA CHAIR
DESCRIPTION
Pre-Approved Vendors: REFURBISHING OF
o0 | FURNITURE YES NO YES NO YES NO
X NO BID NO BID
Reconfiguration of furniture hourly labor 23.5 35
21
NO BID
ITEMS 22 THROUGH 24 LOW UNIT MEASURE
Unit Cost
BOORCTOSE,  SCVWWXATS U X377 173 'i‘l, IMICKHXeq
22 shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak 202.1 NEED MODEL NUMBERS $255.00 HON105532 $187.70 HON 105534
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or
Eowicl
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 43 3/8™H, thick fixed
23 | shelves. Laminates :Mahogany, Oak and
Maple: Approved Brand HON 105533 or Equa 171.32 NEED MODEL NUMBERS $280.50 HON105532 $159.10 HON 105534
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 29 5/8'H, thick fixed
24 shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or 132.44 NEED MODEL NUMBERS $292.50 HON105532 $123.00 HON 105532
Equal. ’

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98) -




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid

Reviewed by
Completed by

Bid # 012-KK01-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT

BID
JC WHITE GALLOWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES GLOBAL INDUSTRIES, INC.
. Name/Effective . . . .
-7 0 -]
we | oS | Deeol oo 10k NeTaiEeelie Bt of |, | 0 | Nomaitacive bt o
Catalog/Price List o
17 HERMAN MILLER
DESCRIPTION
18 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT
DESCRIPTION
19 GEORGIA CHAIR
DESCRIPTION
Pre-Approved Vendors: REFURBISHING OF
20 | FURNITURE YES NO YES NO YES NO
X X X
Reconfiguration of furniture hourly labor $45.00
21
ITEMS 22 THROUGH 24 LOW UNIT MEASURE
BOOKCTOSE, 30 VW XTS U X 07 178 1, TICR TIXeT
g | Shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak NO BID NO BID
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or
Equal
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 43 3/8"H, thick fixed
23 | shelves. Laminates :Mahogany, Oak and
Maple: Approved Brand HON 105533 or Equal. NO BID NO BID
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 29 5/8'H, thick fixed NO BID
24 shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or NO BID

Equal.

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewedby
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid Completed by___
Bid # 012-KK01-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
BID
OFFICE EXPRESS SUPPLY INC. SATCO SUPPLY
) % Disc. Name/Effective Date of . % Disc. Name/Effective Date of
L7 Q
ttom Manufacturer % Disc. | installed Catalog/Price List #Dise.| i stalied Catalog/Price List
17 HERMAN MILLER NQ BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION NO BID NO BID
is INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION NO BID NO BID
19 GEORGIA CHAIR NO BID NO BID
DESCRIPTION NO BID NO BID
Pre-Approved Vendors: REFURBISHING OF
20 | FURNITURE YES NO YES NO
X X
Reconfiguration of furniture hourly labor 79
21
[TEMS 22 THROUGH 24 LOW UNIT MEASURE
BOUKCORE, 30 VY XT3 X 07 178 T, TTCKTIRET
29 | Shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak NO BID
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or
Tl
Bookcase, 3¢'W X13'D X 43 3/8"H, thick fixed
23 | shelves. Laminates :Mahogany, Oak and
Maple: Approved Brand HON 105533 or Equal NO BID
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 29 5/8"H, thick fixed
24 shelves. Laminatfes colors: Mahogany, Qak
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or NO BID
Equal.

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




FM-3738 Rev. {06-98)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
012-KK01-School Office Furniture /Catalog Discount Bid

Reviewed by
Completed by

Bid # 012-KK01-SCHOOL OFFICE FURNITURE /CATALOG DISCOUNT
BID

SCHOOLHOUSE PRODUCT

SCHOOL SPECIALTY INC.,

ltem Manufacturer o Disc % Disc. Name/Effective Date of %, Disc % Disc. | Name/Effective Date of
° "1 installed Catalog/Price List ° "] installed Catalog/Price List
- HERMAN MILLER
DESCRIPTION
18 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT
DESCRIPTION
19 GEORGIA CHAIR 37% 35% 40% 1 35%
DESCRIPTION
Pre-Approved Vendors: REFURBISHING OF
20 | FURNITURE YES NO YES NO
X
Reconfiguration of furniture hourly iabor 1 NO BID
21
ITEMS 22 THROUGH 24 LOW UNIT MEASURE
DUOKCOSE, " SO VW XTSI DA T7 178 o, TICRTIRET
g9y | Shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak 232.44 CARILAMA 32523-001 324.35
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or
I Zalitall
Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 43 3/8"H, thick fixed
23 | shelves. Laminates :Mahogany, Oak and
Maple: Approved Brand HON 105533 or Equal. 219.49 CARILAMA 32523-002 274.95
- Bookcase, 36'W X13'D X 29 5/8"H, thick fixed
24 shelves. Laminates colors: Mahogany, Oak
and Maple: Approved Brand HON 105534 or 167 .44 CARILAMA 32523-003 212.55

Equal.




