Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

Bidders:

item

Specifications:

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

NOTE This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the b!d package as a file

SOLID WASTE CATEGORY: FORMAT B

(CD Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, B!DDER

MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS

WASTE

Description
Quantity

ESTIMATED |/

CHOICE SE RECYCLING - MANAGEMENT WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price : Ynit Price : Unit Price

Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Region 1

4.41000

PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites

PER CUBIC YARD

PER CUBIC YARD

to M-DCPS Site i

3.31000

to M-DCPS Site |

to M-DCPS Site

5.47000

PER CUBIC YARD

PER CUBIC YARD

Cubic PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP
. . Yards
Evaluation Unit:]PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 1 $3,677.94 N/A -NO BID $2,760.54 $4 561 98
2 Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Region 2 728 4.18000 $ 3.31000 5.73000
T » e PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
Specifications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites Cubic PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK.UP
. . Yards
Evaluation Unit;|PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 2 $3,043.04 N/A__-__NO BID $2,409.68 $4,171 44
3 Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Region3 832 4.55000 3.31000 5.58000
L i @ PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
Specifications: PER BID SPECXALvCONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites Cubic PER FICK-UP - PER PICK-UP PER PICK.UP PER PICK.UP
) ) ' Yards
Evaluation Unit:}PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 3 $3,785.60 N/A - NO BID $2,753.92 $4 642 56
4 Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Region 4 848 4.98000 | [$ 3.31000 5.87000
I i o PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
Specifications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites Cubic PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP
. . Yards
Evaluation Umt: PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 4 $4,223.04 N/A - NO BID $2,806.88 $4,977.76
5 Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: Region 5 588 7.72000 : $ 3.31000 5.97000
I e & PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
Specificalions: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT OS: District Sites Cubic PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP
. . Yards
Evaluation Unit:|PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 5 $4,539.36 N/A - NO BID $1,946.28 $3,510.36

Prepared by R. Johnsen -Pracurement Management
Reviewed by J. Diltard - Dept. of inspections, Operations, and Energy Management
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson
BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

P : LIV . REIELY ANTA J O * atio KD

Iack iibEon o Till n areas. It USing 3 Computer rint & Sriinal £ony 1o =0 SOLID WASTE CATEGORY: FORMAT B

Bid dg Snls as grtioneag LI pRditio Foald

2L geserve sHils O awara mnaivigual e Dr-one.g OIreC. Qroupd compiatio . 0DE erest o Bioys

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDER
MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

. . T : : WASTE
Bidders Name S5555s ; CHOICE SE RECYCLING | MANAGEMENT WASTE PRO
ttem Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

to M-DCPS Site i to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site

Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: ALL Regions 3,830 $ 5.39000
Specifications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND PER CUBIC YARD | Bl Joll]-1{eR7/Y 1)) PER CUBIC YARD
P " IATTACHMENT DS: District Sites PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP. PER PICK-UP
Cubic ; ’
Yards
SERVICING ALL REGIONS COMBINED (REGIONS
1-2:3:4-5) L —
Evaluation Unit]PER CUBIC YARD PER PICK-UP
TOTAL ITEM 6 N/A - NO BID $20,643.70
Comparison COMBINATION OF ITEMS 1 THROUGH 5 $19,268.98 N/A - NO BID $12,677.30 $21,864.10

Page 2 OF 18

Prepared by R. Johnson -Procurement Management 02/25/2010

Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of inspections, Operations, and Energy Management




Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS} Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT
PLEA S5 A ADED AW !

1+ A Rig o enis as < Ored ReGia ongitio

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

DFONe.o

RECYCLING CATEGORY: FORMAT B

ore group combinatio

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED

FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

0 B8 S

1 WASTE
CHOICE | SE RECYCLING|: B
g :) MANAGEMENT | WASTE PRO
tem Description ESTIMATED Unit Price Unit Price : Unit Price : Unit Price
Quantity to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site | to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
FOR ENTIRE . . . . N .
RECYCLING 90.85 Gallon TOTES BRAND Rehrig Pacific All Source Mfg. Rehrig Pacific Rehrig Pacific
CATEGORY Company Company Company
Specifications:  IpER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND
ATTATCHMENT DS: DISTRICT SITES.
This item shall meet or exceed requirements MODEL 95U 195-62-L8-720D 95NB ROC - 95NB

stated in Special Condtions #15!. and 15J.

All bid items In this category will be using the
tote listed herein and has no additional cost to
the district and shall be Included in the
vendor's bid submission.

Other Info:

- - 'GROUPRC: ITEMS7-11. . -
7 Recycling Pick-Up: Region 1 48] 175000 $|  2.50000 2.59000 3.25000
Specifications: |PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS District PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
o Sites YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK
AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites RECYCLED UpP up Up up
Includes 320 90-35 GALLON TOTES WITH LIDS £ 5 MATERIALS
to transfer material to receptacle. INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
14 Plastic, Metal, |:{$ 0.00000 ${ 40.00000 $L 0.00000 $L 10.00000
' ) Tons of and Glass |
Evaluation Unit: COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD Recycled Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rehate Per Ton of
& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material
TOTAL ITEM 7 $766.50 $550.38 $1,134.42

$1,287.35

Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Diltard - Dept. of Inspections, Operations, and Energy Management

Page 3 OF 18
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools {(M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

RECYCLING CATEGORY: FORMAT B

e group combinatio

e be

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED
FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

WASTE -

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

CHOICE | |SE RECYCLING| | wasTEPR
| MANAGEMENT || WASTEPRO
tem Description ESTIMATED UnitPrice | Unit Price Unit Price |/ Unit Price
Quantity ! to M-DCPS Site | to M-DCPS Site [ to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
8 Recycling Pick-Up: Region 2 73 $l 2.25000 $] 2.50000 $L 2.59000 $l 3.45000
Specifications: | PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS District " PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
Sites YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK
AND ATTACH DS: District Sit
ATTACHMENT istrict Sites , RECYCLED up up up up
includes 300 90-95 GALLON TOTES WITH LIDS [E2 i MATERIALS
to transfer material to receptacle. INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
14 Plastic, Metal, $| 0.00000 $|  40.00000 $  0.00000 $|  10.00000
] ) Tons of and Glass
Evaluation Unit: COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD Recycled Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of
Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material

TOTAL

ITEM 8

$985.50

| $550.38

[ $1,134.42

| $1,374.95

9 Recycling Pick-Up: Region 3

Specifications: |PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS

AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites

Includes 400 90-95 GALLON TOTES WITH LIDS | & 595
to transfer material to receptacle. :

Evaluation Unit:] COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

86

District
Sites

Tons of
Recycled
Material

RECYCLED
MATERIALS
INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
Plastic, Metal,
and Glass

| 225000 $L 2.50000 $|  2.59000 $| 325000
PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
YARD PER PICK| | YARD PER PICK| | YARD PER PICK|| YARD PER PICK
uP uP UP uP
$L 0.00000 $| 40.00000 $¥ 0.00000 $L 10.00000

Rebate Per Ton of
Recycled Material

Rebate Per Ton of
Recycled Material

Rebate Per Ton of
Recycled Material

Rebate Per Ton of
Recycled Material

TOTAL

ITEM 9

$1,161.00

$745.38

$1,336.44

$1,540.85

Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of Inspections, Operations, and Energy Management
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KKO03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

RECYCLING CATEGORY: FORMAT B

ne or mone group combmation(s), ifitisinthe best mterest of M-DCPS

FILE AND SUBMITIT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electromcally completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

G : WASTE :
CHOICE i SE RECYCLING|: 1 WASTEP
; | MANAGEMENT | RO
ttem Descrintion ESTIMATED Unit Price | Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price
Quantity to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site | to M-DCPS Site i:|  to M-DCPS Site
10 Recycling Pick-Up: Region 4 69 : $I 2,25000 $I 2.50000 $] 2.58000 $‘ 3.25000
Specifications: |PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS District PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
) Sites YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK
AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites RECYCLED Up Up UpP up
Includes 290 90-95 GALLON TOTES WITH LIDS MATERIALS
to transfer material to receptacle. INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
Plastic, Metal, $l 0.00000 $I 40.00000 $ 0.00000 $L 10.00000
) ) Tone of and Glass
Evaluation Unit) COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD Recycled Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of
Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material

Recycled Material

TOTAL

ITEM 10

| $945.00

I $505.38

[ s1,087.80

| $1,228.85

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

11 Recycling Pick-Up: Region 5 | 55 $I 3.50000 $| ~2.50000 ${ 2.59000 $L 3.45000
Specifications: [PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS District PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
) Sites YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK
AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites RECYCLED ur up up up
Includes 290 90-95 GALLON TOTES WITH LIDS MATERIALS
to transfer material to receptacie. INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
Plastic, Metal, |{$ 0.00000 $ 40.00000 $| 0.00000 $ 10.00000
) . Tons of and Glass
Evaluation Unit) COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD Recycled Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of
Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Material Recycled Materiai

TOTAL

ITEM 11

[ $1,155.00

$280.38

$854.70

$1,002.35

Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Depl. of Inspections, Operalions, and Energy Management
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Prepared by R, Joh

Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

RECYCLING CATEGORY: FORMAT B

FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED

Evaluation Unit:

COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC
YARD

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

TOTAL

Comparison

BRI ND

[TEM 12

COMBINATION OF ITEMS 7 THROUGH 11

$5,013.00

$2,631.92

paLic

pravided.

= : WASTE
H L CHOICE 2 SE RECYCLINGE :
Bidders: . e : | MANAGEMENT| WASTE PRO
ftem Descrintion ESTIMATED Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site | to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
D) »lim A
K1)
12 Recycling Pick-Up: ALL Regions 356 0000 $ 2.59000 $ 3.15000
Specifications: {PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS District PER B PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
Sites RDPER P YARD PER PICK YARD PER PICK
AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites P up upP
RECYCLED
Includes 1600 90-95 GALLON TOTES WITH MATERIALS
LIDS to transfer material to receptacie. INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
- "7 68.077 | Plastic, Metal, 20.00000 $ “000000 $L 11.00000
and Glass
Tons of
Recyc!ed R 0 Rebate Per Ton of Rebate Per Ton of
‘Material

Recycled Material

$5,547.78

BT
Zid Fic]

$5,547.78

Recycled Material

$5,998.45

#3

$6,434.33

Proc

Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of Inspections. Operations, and Energy Management
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SE‘E%VICES

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/5010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

COMPACTORS CATEGORY: FORMATB

natlon(s), |f lt is inthe best mterest of M-DCPS

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electromcany completed and submltted w1th the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Dnve etc.) HOWEVER BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE
COMPLETED FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

. ) WASTE
Bidders: 5 : CHOICE SE RECYCLING MANAGEMENT WASTE PRO
ltem Description ESTIMATED Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
t M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site

13 Regular C;;pactor Pick-Up:rllL Regions 1 $ -‘:1 3.27000
Specifications: gzisiictsgijtessPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: Container PER PICK-UP
SERVICING ALL REGIONS COMBINED (REGIONS 1-2-3-4-5) BRAND [ Marathon
6 CUBIC YARD VOLUME Verti-Pack
Approved Brand 1:MARATHON VERT-I-PACK OR Other Info

Approved Brand 2:]OTHER BRANDS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

Evaluation Unit]|PER PICK-UP

Prepared by R. Johnson-Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of Inspections, Operations, and Energy Management
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Miami-Dade County

Public Schools {M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

biac

xcel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submifted with the bid package as f
SUBMIT ITWITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

]

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

&file{CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND|

ALL REGIONS

NOQ Pick-UP Fee
PER MONTH

NO Pick-UP Fee
PER MONTH

TOTAL

$6,150.00

Prepared by R. Johnsorn-Procurement Management
Reviewed by J, Dillard - Dept, of i

Qperations, and Energy

COMBINATION OF ITEMS 14-15-16

: WASTE
E :
CHOICE SE RECYCLING MANAGEMENT]| WASTE PRO
item Descristion ESTIMATED ltem Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantjty FILL IN SHADED BOXES to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
BRAND: JUip i Equipcol ]
MODEL{S): ]
ROUM T = I R L =i B ={]3)» i KO W B 5 0
AVUARD
14 Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 1 $| 1600.00000 NO BID 0.00000
I PER B8ID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT OS: : PER DELIVERY AND PER OELIVERY AND > R D
Specifications: District Sites Container PICK-UP PICK-UP p
Evaluation Lnit:|PER 20 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY $ 150.00000 NO BID 00000
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee oP P Fee
ALLREGIONS PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MO
15 Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards 1 $| 2050.00000 NO BID 00000
et PER BID SPECIAL CONOITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: : PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND D R D
Specificatons: | LI B Container PICK-UP PICK-UP
Evaluation Unit;|PER 30 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY $ 4150.00000 NO BID NOO00
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee QP P Fee
ALLREsions PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MO
16 Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 40 Cubic Yards 1 $| 2500.00000 NO BID 00.00000
o PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTAGHMENT OS: . PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND p R D
Specifications: | ictrct Sites Container PICK-UP PICK-UP
Evaluation Unit:{PER 40 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY $ 150.00000 NO BID 00000

Page 8 OF 18
027252010




Prepared by R. Johnson-Procuremeant Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of ions, O i

Miami-Dade County Public Schools {M-DCPS]) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

dividual item(s) or one or more group

Item

17

Spacifications;

Evaluation Unit:

with the bid

is inthe best interest of M-DCPS.

SUBMIT T WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

Description

Roli-Off Receptacie Bin: 20 Cubic Yards

REGION 1 LOCATIONS

District Sites

COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY

AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH

PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

as a file(CD, Floppy Digk, Jumnp Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETE

B FILE AND|

ESTIMATED Item Description
Quantity FiLL IN SHADED BOXES

WASTE
CHOICE SE RECYCLING | MANAGEMENT| WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

to M-DCPS Site

185.00000

to M-DCPS Site

325.00000

to M-DCPS Site
TEMS IN THIS GROUP TO BE RESPONSIV

$| 450.00000

to M-DCPS Site

305.00000 °

Containers

I

No pick-up
Fee Per
Menth

PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK.UP AND PICK-UP
$[ 0.00000 $| 50.00000 $L 195.00000 $| o.00000
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH

18

Specifications.

Evaluation Unit:

Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards

REGION 1 LOCATIONS

District Sites

COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY

PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:

-

$] 220.00000

$l 415,00000

$[ 475.00000

$l 395.00000

Containers

I

PER DELIVERY AND

PER DELIVERY AND

PER DELIVERY AND

PER DELIVERY

PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
$1 50.00000 $1 §0.00000 $l 195.00000 $l 0.00000

No pick-up . " - -
e e B - BT
TOTAL COMBINATION QF ITEMS 17 AND 18 $2,075.00 $3,800.00 $5,015.00 $3,500.00

. and Energy A

Page ¢ OF 18
022512010




Miami-Dade County Public Schools {M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

if !tvlé mlhe !Sést:ihtéréét oM DCPS

NQTE: This Excel spi fca i with the bid package as a file{CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc;)’ HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND
SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

WASTE
- CHOICE z SE RECYCLING | MANAGEMENT : WASTE PRO
Iterm Description ESTIMATED ltem Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity EiLL IN SHADED BOXES to M-DCPS Site to MCS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
Roll-Off Receptacie Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 185.00000 325.00000 $| 450.00000 325.00000
N PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
REGION 2 LOCATIONS Containers PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
Speciheations: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT Ds:
District Sites
Evaluation Unit: [COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $ 0.00000 $ 50.00000 $ 185.00000 5[ 0.00000
No pick-up NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NG Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH F;::;f\' PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
20 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards [ 5 l $I 220.00000 $I 415.00000 $l 475.00000 $! 415.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND NO Pick-UP Fee
. REGION 2 LOCATIONS o Centainers o PICK-UP PICK-UP __PICK-up PER MONTH
Speciications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
District Sites
Evaluation Unit: [COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $! 50.00000 $[ 50.00000 $[ 4195.00000 $l 0.00600
No pick-up . . - -
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICICUP FEE PER MONTH F;z:;;’ PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
TOTAL COMBINATION OF ITEMS 19 AND 20 $2,075.00 $3,800.00 $5,015.00 $3,700.00
Prepared by R. Johnson-Pr Page 10 OF 18

Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of ions, O . and Enargy g 0212512010




Miami-Dade County Public Schools {M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R, Johnson
BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES
OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B
The District reserves the right to award individual itéin(s) or one or more group combination(s), if it is in the best interest of M.-DCPS,
r NOTE: Tis Excel spri i i with the bid package as a file{CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS:MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND -5
SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS,
o ' ' WASTE
Bidders: k ‘ CHOICE SE RECYCLING o MANAGEMENT| WASTE PRO
Hem Description ESTIMATED Item Description . Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity EILL IN SHADED BOXES to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
ER MUS? ! ROUP TO BE RESPONSIV
Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 185.00000 $ 450.00000 305.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
REGION 3 LOCATIONS Containers PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
i PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT 08:
Specifications: | bychrict Sites
Evaluation Unit: [COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $ 0.00000 $ $| 195.00000 $L 0.00000
: No pick-up " N . .
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
ANDNO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH Fh:z:;' PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
22 Roli-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards ! 5 ] $[ 220.00000 $l $l 475.00000 $L 395.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
o o REGION 3 LOCATIONS C°Efife"5 PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP _
Specifications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
District Sites
Evaluation Unit:[COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $I 50.00000 $[ $! 195.00000 $L 0.00000
AND O PICK.UP FEE PER MONTH N‘;:Eic::p NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
Month PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
TOTAL COMBINATION OF ITEMS 21 AND 22 $2,075.00 H#VALUE! $5,015.00 $3,500.00
s
Prepared by R. Johnson-Procurement Manasgement Page 11 OF 18

Reviewed by J. Diltard - Dept. of Inspections, Operations, and Energy Management 02/25/2010




Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

District reserves the right t award ind

Bidders:|

item Description

23 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards
REGION 4 LOCATIONS
Specifications: District Sites

Evaluation Unit:]COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

ESTIMATED
Quantity

idual item(s) or one or more aroup combination(s),

ltem Description
FILL iN SHADED BOXES

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

ifitis in the best interest of W-DCPS

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND
3 SUBMIT iT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.

to M-DCPS Site

185.00000

to M.DCPS it

325.00000

= WASTE
CHOICE = SE RECYCLING o MANAGEMENT]E WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

to M-DCPS §

$! 450.00000

ite to M-DCPS Site

FENS IN THIS GROUP TO BE RESPONSIVE

305.00000

Containers

PER DELIVERY AND
PICK-UP

PER DELIVERY AND
PICK-UP

PER DELIVERY AND

PICK-UP

PER DELIVERY AND
PICK-uP

$| o0.00000

$| 50.00000

$| 195.00000

${ 0.00000

No pick-up . N " .
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH Fn::::\r PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
24 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards l 5 l $I 220.00000 $l 415.00000 $l 475.00000 $| 395.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
REGION 4 LOCATIONS Containers PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
Smm;;‘: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
) District Sites
Evaluation Unit:[COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $[ 50.00000 $1 50.00000 $[ 195.00000 $l 0,00000
No pick-up NG Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH FI‘::::;’ PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
TOTAL COMBINATION OF ITEMS 23 AND 24 $2,075.00 $3,800.00 $5,015.00 $3,500.00

Prepared by R. Johnson-Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of Inspections, Operations, and Energy Management

Page 12 OF 18
0272512010




Miami-Dade County Public Schools {M-DCPS} Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

NOTE: This

Bidders:j .

item Description

ESTIMATED

Quantity

as a file(COxFloppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.} HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAP
SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

ER COPY OF THE GOMPLETED FILE AND

Item Description

FILL IN SHADED B ¢
 GROUP RO-5: ITEMS 25-26 WILL BE EVALUATED ON A TOTAL LOW BID BASIS. BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITENS IN THIS GROUP TO BE RESPON

S WASTE
CHOICE SE RECYCLING »E MANAGEMENT - WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

to M-DCPS Site

to M-DCPS Site

SIVE.

to M-DCPS Site

Prepared by R. Joh Py
Reviewed by J. Difiard - Dept. of

25 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 300.00000 325.00000 $| 450.00000 325.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
REGION 5 LOCATIONS Containers PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
fications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS
Specifications: District Sites
Evaluation Unit;]COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $ 0.00000 $l  50.00000 $| 195.00000 $|  40.00000
No pick-up . - . "
NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH ’j&z:t:' PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
26 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards [ 5 [ $l 400.00000 $! 415.00000 $l 475.00000 $l 415.00000
. PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY AND PER DELIVERY
__|REGION 5 LOCATIONS Containers PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-Up _AMND PICK-UP
Specifcations: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
. District Sites
Evaluation Unit:|cOMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY $L 50.00000 $[ 50.00000 ${ 195.00000 $L 40.00000
No pick-up NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP Fee NO Pick-UP
3 - -UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH i::znpt;’ PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH PER MONTH
TOTAL COMBINATION OF ITEMS 25 AND 26 $3,550.00 $3,800.00 $5,015.00 $3,780.00
. Operations, and Energy

Page 13 OF 18
0272512010




Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

hiat bhis

By a computer: print an oitginal £opy 1o subn ath hid dociimenisds

OTHER PICK-UPS CATEGORY: FORMAT B

NOTE: This Excel spreagsheet can be electronically completed and submitted with the bid package as a file(CD, Flopgy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND|
o SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.
N i : WASTE ‘
Bidders: e CHOICE L SE RECYCLING MANAGEMENT| WASTE PRO
Item Description ESTIMATED itern Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity EILL IN SHADED BOXES to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
27 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 25 325.00000 450.00000
. PER DELIVERY PER DELIVERY
ALL DISTRICT LOCATIONS Containers AND PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
Specifcations: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
) District Sites
Evaluation Unit: ]COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY 5 50.00000 195.00000
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH NOF pi‘:Pk-up NO Pick-UP Fee NG Pick-UP Fee
- s Per PER MONTH PER MONTH
Month
28 Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards 25 415.00000 475.00000
. PER DELIVERY PER DELIVERY
ALL DISTRICT LOCATIONS Containers AND PICK-UP AND PICK-UP
Spacifications: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS:
District Sites
Evaluation Unit: JCOMBINATION OF PRIGE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY 5 50.00000 195.00000
No pick-up NO Pick-UP Fee NG Pick-UP Fee
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH Fee Per PER MONTH PER MONTH
Month
TOTAL COMBINATION OF ITEMS 27 AND 28 $19,000.00 $25,075.00

N/A - Did not bid 525’075.00

all regions

$17,980.00

Prepared by R, Johnson-Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Dillard - Dept. of Inspactions, Operations, and Energy Management

Page 14 OF 18
02/2512010




biic Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

Description

Combination of ALL CATEGORIES ALL

28 Regions

Specifications:  {ALL REGIONS

COMBINATION of Groups SWA, RCA, CO, AR, and RO-15

(tems 6. 12,13, 14, 15, 16, 27, and 28)

PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT ODS:
District Sites

SERVICING ALL REGIONS COMBINED (REGIONS 1-2-3-4-5)

Total Evaluation|SUM TOTAL PRICE FOR ALL GROUPS
Unit:| LISTED BELOW

District Sites

SERVICING ALL REGIONS COMBINED {REGIONS 1.2-3-4-5}

Evaluation Unit:]PER CUBIC YARD

GROUIP RCA

This item shall meet or exceed requirements
stated in Special Condtions #151. and 15J.
All bid items in this category will be using the
tote listed herein and has no additional cost to
the district and shail be included in the
vendor's bid submission.

Includes 1600.90-85 GALL.ON TOTES WITH
LIDS to transfer material to receptacle.

Evaluation Unit:] COMBINATION OF PRICE PER CUBIC YARD

& REBATE PER TON: RECYCLED MATERIAL

Prepared by R. Joh P
Reviewed by J. Dilllard- Dept. of Inspections, Operains, and Energy Management

ALL SERVICE§CATEGORY: FORMAT B

AP

I

ESTIMATED ltem Description
Q FILL IN SHADED BOXES

S%T_?[;J\:Ii\g‘é Regular Solid Waste Pick-Up: ALL Regions 3,830
Specifications: |PER_ BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: oy varae

RECYCLING 90-95 Gallon TOTES
PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND
Specifications: ATTATCHMENT DS: DISTRICT SITES. District

Other Info:

RECYCLED
MATERIALS
INCLUDES:
Paper,
Cardboard,
Plastic, Metal,

Recycled and Glass

Material

CHOICE | SE RECYCLING :

Unit Price
to M-DCPS Si

Unit Price
to M-DCPS Site

$ 4.40
PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
YARD PER YARD PER
PICK-UP PICK-UP
$ 3.39 $ 2.50 $
PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
YARD PER YARD PER
PICK-UP PICK-UP
$ 0.00 $ 40.00 $
Rebate Per Ton Rebate Per Ton
of Recycled of Recycled
Material Material

WASTE :
| MANAGEMENT " WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price

to M-DCPS Site

BIDDER MUST BID ALL ITEMS IN
THIS GROUP TO BE RESPONSIVE.

to M-DCPS Site

PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
YARD PER YARD PER
PICK-UP PICK-UP
2,59 3.13
PER CUBIC PER CUBIC
YARD PER YARD PER
PICK-UP PICK-UP
0.00 11.00
Rebate Per Ton Rebate Per Ton
of Recycled of Recycled
Material Material

Page 15 OF 18
021282010




klic Schools {(M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

ftem Description

ESTIMATED

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

ALL SERVICES CATEGORY; FORMAT B

District Sites

SERVICING ALL REGIONS COMBINED (REGIONS 1-2-3-4-5)

6 CUBIC YARD VOLUME

Approved Brand 1:{MARATHON VERT--PACK OR

Approved Brand 2:]OTHER BRANDS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

Evaluation Unit:{PER PICK-UP

GROUP AR

OTHER PICK-UPS PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS

Spetifitations:  |AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites

Evaluation Unit: |AS STATED BELOW

Quantity
GROUP GO -~ .
Regular Compactor Pick-Up: ALL Regions 1
COMPACTORS | °9" P P 9
Speciﬁcations: PER BID SPECIAL CONDITIONS AND ATTACHMENT DS: Container MODEL

Other Info:

Prepared by R. John
Reviewed by J. Dillard- Dept. of inspections, Operains, and Energy Management

Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 1 BRAND
Evaluation Unit: PER 20 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY Container MODEL
ALL REGIONS Other Info:
Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards 1 BRAND
Evaluation Unit: PER 20 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY Container MODEL
ALL REGIONS Other Info:
Asbestos Receptacle Bin: 40 Cubic Yards t 1 l BRAND
Evatuation Unit: PER 20 CUBIC YARDS PICK-UP AND DELIVERY Container MODEL
ALL REGIONS Cther Info:

= WASTE
CHOICE .
‘ SE RECYCLING 4 MANAGEMENT | WASTE PRO
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
$ 54.75 $ 59.58 $ 99.87
PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP

$ 800.00 $ 450.00 $ 550.00
PER PER PER
DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY &
PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP
$i  900.00 $ 475.00 $ 650.00
PER PER PER
DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY &
PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP
$!  1000.00 3 500.00 $ 750.00
PER PER PER
DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY & DELIVERY &
PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP PICK-UP

Page 16 OF 18
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blic Schools (M-DC

PS) 8id Proposal Form

Bid No. 025-KK03 Buyer: R. Johnson

BIDS RECEIVED AS OF 03/25/2010 AT 2:00 pm EDT

RECYCLING AND SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICES

M "E 4 L) i3 I 3 ano S 1%
h bhybn ta il in areas sing a comp . GRV D ALL SERVICES CATEGORY: FORMAT B
1) 0 v * + a oro O 0 Oroup 0 D D 3 0 3 -
NOTE: This Excel spr can be ically leted and with the bid as a file(CD, Floppy Disk, Jump Drive, etc.) HOWEVER, BIDDERS MUST PRINT A PAPER COPY OF THE COMPLETED FILE AND SUBMIT IT WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS.
\ A WASTE
Bidders: ‘ CHOICE SE RECYCLING | MANAGEMENT WASTE PRO
ltem Description ESTIMATED Item Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity FILL IN SHADED BOXES to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site to M-DCPS Site
GROUP RO-15 |5ep g1 SPECIAL CONDITIONS
OTHER PICK-UPS
Specifications:  |AND ATTACHMENT DS: District Sites
Evaluation Unit: |AS STATED BELOW
Roli-Off Receptacle Bin: 20 Cubic Yards 25 $ 185.00 $ 325.00 $| 4s0.00 $|  300.00
ALL DISTRICT LOCATIONS Containers PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP
Evaluation Unlt: COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY Other Inf
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH l:l $ 0.00 $ 50.00 $ 195.00 $ 0.00
No Pick NO Pick-UP NO Pick-UP NO Pick-UP NO Pick-UP
o Pick-up
Fee Per Month Fee PER Fee PER Fee PER Fee PER
. NLO_N_TH MONTH MONTH MONTH
Roll-Off Receptacle Bin: 30 Cubic Yards 25 $ 220.00 $ 415.00 $ 475.00 $ 390.00
ALL DISTRICT LOCATIONS Containers PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP PER PICK-UP
Evaluation Unit COMBINATION OF PRICE PER PICK-UP & DELIVERY Other Info
AND NO PICK-UP FEE PER MONTH $ 50.00 $ 50.00 3 195.00 3 0.00
No Pick NG Pick-UP NO Pick-UP NO Pick-UP NO Pick-UP
o Pick-up
Fee Per Morth Fee PER Fee PER Fee PER Fee PER
MONTH MONTH MONTH MONTH

TOTAL FOR ITEM 29 with groups listed above:

Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management
Raviewed by J. Dilliard- Dept. of Inspections, Operains, and Energy Management

$ 3724343

6n-Resbénsive
ncomplete Bid

44784.66

46052.38

Page 17 OF 18
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EVALUATION OF Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid 025-KK03
Recycling and Solid Waste Collection Services

Choice of Awarding by Groups and Recommended Awardees
With Calculation of Estimated Expenditures

025-KK03 Grouping Per Pick-Up 025-KK03 Grouping Per Pick Up Per Pick Up

Individual Bid Items INDIVIDUAL GROUPS: ITEMS 6, 12, 14-15-16, 27-28 ITEM 29: COMBINED GROUPS
Best Bid Lowest Vendor CHOICE WM Waste Pro
Items 1-5 Group SW's $12,677.30 Waste Mgmt. GROUP SWA $16,852.00 $12,677.30 $20,796.90
items 7-11 Group RC's $2,631.92 SE Recycling GROUP RCA $7,261.38 $5,547.78 $6,704.46
item 13 Group CO $54.75 Choice GROUP CO $54.75 $59.58 $99.87
items 14-16 Group AR's $1,425.00 Waste Mgmt. GROUP AR $2,700.00 $1,425.00 $1,950.00
items 17-26 Group RO's $11,850.00 Choice GROUP RO-15 $10,375.00 $25,075.00 $17,250.00
TOTAL $28,638.97 VARIOUS ALL GROUPS $37,243.13 $44,784.66 $46,801.23

Annual Basis Annual Basis

025-KK03 Grouping Individual Bid ltems 025-KK03 Grouping ITEM 29: COMBINED GROUPS
Group Frequency Best Bid Lowest Vendor Group Frequency CHOICE WM Waste Pro
GROUP SW's 250 |$3,168,325.00 Waste Mgmt. GROUP SWA 250 $4,213,000.00 $3,169,325.00 $5,199,225.00
GROUP RC's 50} $131,596.00 SE Recycling GROUP RCA 50 $363,069.00 $277,389.00 $335,223.00
GROUP CO's 250 $13,687.50 Choice’ GROUP CO 250 $13,687.50 $14,895.00 $24,967.50
GROUP AR's 1 $1,425.00 Waste Mgmt. GROUP AR 1 $2,700.00 $1,425.00 $1,950.00
GROUP RO's 12| $142,200.00 Choice GROUP RO-15 12 $124,500.00  $300,900.00  $207,000.00
TOTAL $3,458,233.50 VARIOUS All Groups Combined $4,716,956.50 $3,763,934.00 $5,768,365.50

KEY TO Individual Bid item CATEGORIES: KEY TO Individual Group (All Regions Combined) CATEGORIES: KEY TO COMBINED Group CATEGORIES:

ITEM 29 13 A COMBINED BID OF THE FOLLOWING GROUPS:

Group SW: Solid Waste Group-items 1-5 GROUP SWA: Solid Waste Group (All Regions) - ltem 6 GROUP SWA: Solid Waste Group (All Regions) - ltem 6
Group RC: Recycling Group-items 7-11 GROUP RCA: Recycling Group (All Regions) - ltem 12 GROUP RCA: Recycling Group (All Regions) - Item 12
Group CO: Compactor Group-ltem 12 GROUP CO: Compactor Group-ltem 12 GROUP CO: Compactor Group-ftem 12

Group AR: Asbestos Roll-Off Group-items 14-16 GROUP AR: Asbestos Roll-Off Group-ltems 14-16 GROUP AR: Asbestos Roll-Off Group-ltems 14-16
Group RO: Roli-Off Group-items 17-26 GROUP RO-15: Roll-Off Group (All Regions) - liems 27-28 GROUP RO-15: Roll-Off Group (All Regions) - ltems 27-28

Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management
Reviewed by J. Diltard- DIOEM
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