Entered By R. Tyndall

@

The Schaool Board of Miaml-Dade County, Florida

Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 099-JJ02

i | = Second low bid meeting

| lspcciﬁcations
fpp——

h .
! !spcciﬁcaticns

Third low bid meeting

Bid #099-JJ02
Title:Plastic Can
Liners
Buyer: R. Tyndall
ITEMIDCPS # NESCRIPTION OF ITEl| EsT. AFP Industrles -A AFP Industries - B All American Poly Allled Paper Company
QTY {Unit Prica. Total Prica Manuf & Model Linit Price Tola Prics Manuf & Model {Unit Price | Tolal Prics Manuf & Model L\U__ﬁPdcs Total Prica Manuf & Modal
Aluf Plastics |
85-364-| Plastic Compactor Aluf Plastics 43529C- I GP Plastics
7 [j485-204- P 2,500 | $16.94  $42,350.00 Il $8.327 $20,800.00doesnot - |:$10.63 $26,575.00043524A | $12.65 $31,625.00{GF TP
0471 |Bag: 43 X 52 435233 ; Corp
meet specs - § - .
.9 mil
Aluf Plastics {
485-364-| Plastic Can Liner: Aluf Plastics 36609C- f GP Plastics
2 5,500 $16.36] $89,980.00] $8.23| $45,265.00{Does not :§10:25]  $56,375.00{3660AAP $12.24] $67,320.00]
0370 136 X 60 366038 SOl Corp
meet specs - [
9 mil
485-364{Plastic Can Linerd Aluf Plastics AlufPlastios | . 7 GP Plastics
3 0035 30X 37 20,000 $26.47, $529,400,00] 30371.5C $17.62] $352,400.00 3037.9C 1313.19 $263,800.00{3037AAP $15.45| $309,000.00 Corp
485-3644 Plastic Can Liner:40 Aluf Plastics Aluf Plastics § GP Plastics
4 0418 |xX 48. 80,000 $18.33] $1,466,400.00 40481.5C $12.19} $975,200.00 4048,9C 5911 $728,800.00/4043AAP $10.84 3867,?00.00 Corp
364-  |Plastic Can Liner Aluf Plastics , GP Plastics
5 0451 23 X 24. 10,000 $11.34 $113,400.00 232477C $0.00!No Bid $22.30] $223,000.00|2324AAP $13.25] $132,500,00 Comp
E Low bid meeting
specitications

Verified By J. Bradley

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Entsred By R, Tyndali

Bld #089-JJ02
et e )

Titie:Plastic Can
Liners

Buyer: R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 099-JJ02

= Low bid mecting
specifications

| 1 = Second low bid meeting
I !speciﬁcations
At et et o8

= Third low bid meeting
\Specifications

DCPS # ESCRIPTION OF ITE|] EST. Calico Industries - A Calico Industries - B Calico Industries - C
QTy Msanuf & Model TEIAI-_PI'l::i —n y-nlui‘&-h_d'oeui Unit Price Tolal Prica Manuf & Model Tolat Prica Manuf & Modst
Summit i
Plastics 1
y Flexsol H . Webster
486-364-|Plastlc Compactor |, 43X52,3 $30,85000{Packaging | $14.60] $36,500.00] % Plastics $13.96)  $34,000.00/Industies
0471 1Bag: 43 X 52 Mil -Vendor H 99107833
- Yendo #9910783F 9910783 W
qualified bid 1 :
delivery time: :
Summit | i
Plastics i H
. . . . Flexsol I . Webster
4os06e-|Plastic Can Liner: | o o, 36x60, 3 Mil, $65,450.00Packaging |  $14.04) $77,220.00 " Flastics $13.49) $74,195.00 Industies
0370 136 X 60 . - Vendor 9911132J
acor #99111132F » 9911132W
qualified bid | I
delivery time} R
Summit i i
Plastics i Fl ! ' Web.
. s i { €XS0. i o ebster
oss o S Hnerd 2,000 an LS $293,600.00 Packaging & $17.14] 532,800,005 1| 51733 5346,600.00{Industries
. ! #9910265F | 9910265W
qualified bid i
delivery time, .
: R S
1} H
Summit | i
Plastics i '
. i Flexsol | ; Webster
485 J . .
5364\ Plastic Can Liner:d0) o 00 4048, 15 $824,800.00{Packaging  }  $12.06| $964,300.00]'% Flastics $11.98] $958,400.00|Industrics
0418  1X 48, Mil - Vendor| | 9910503J
e #9910503F . 9910503 W
qualified bid | :
delivery times i
1.
Poly Plasti b Cali
. Ph\ ( i Oly rlas ics ¥y atico
5 gg:l 3 ;{t; . Can Linery 1 000 No Bid $104,300.00[9930019 - 59,74 $97,400.00/1mports $0.00{No Bid
‘ TieBid |, 9970080
5
I
I
]
P R |

Verified By J. Bradley

FM-3738 Rev. {06-36)




Entered By R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 099-JJ02

Bid #098-JJ02
Titie:Plastic Can
Liners
Buyer: R, Tyndall
ITEM|DCPS # JESCRIPTION OF ITE|l EST. Central Poly Corp. Dade Paper Davida Food Service District Healthcare - A
QTY {Unit Prica Total Price Manuf & Modsi  {[Unit Prics Totsl Price. Manuf & Modst  {RUnit Price Total Prics Manut & Model  [{Unit Prica Toinl Prics Manuf & Modsi
. Central GP Plastics
1 ||#85:984-|Plastic Compactor | , o) $13.65 $34,125.00|Poly $12.87  $32,175.00|special 2060, $74,000.00] 2% $12.85  $32,125.00{GP Special
0471 |Bag: 43 X 52 DW4352N
CP4352 order
. GP Plastics
485-364-{Plastle Can Liner: No Brand ) DB-
2 0370 |36 X 60, 5,500 $13.95 $76,725.00 Listed $12.46; $68,530.00 Z;:z:lal $28.58]  $157,190.00] DW3660N $12.65| $69,575.00{GP
GP Plastics
485-364{Plastic Can Liner: No Brand , DB-
3 0035 30 X 37 20,000 $16.30] $326,000.00 Listed $15.73) $314,600.00] ‘s);;;:lal $36.72)  $734,400.00) DW3037N $15.75 $315,000.00/GP
. GP Plastics
485-364{ Plastic Can Liner:4(f No Brand . DB-
4 0418 X 48, 80,000 $10.95] $876,000,00) Listed $11.03} $882,400.00] f);r:degxal $25.40) $2,032,000.00 DWA4048N $11.10] $888,000.00{GP
GP Plastics
364-  |Plastic Can Liner No Brand ) DB-
5 045] 23X 24. 10,000 $11.40{ $114,000.00 Listed $13.48] $134,800.00 Zie}:al $29.23)  $292,300.00 DW2324N $13.75| $137,500.00[GP
= Low bid meeting
specifications

—
| = Second low bid meeting
!spwiﬁc«ﬁom

-

? = Third fow bid meeting
(spectfications

Verifisd By J. Bradiey

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Entersd By R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 098-JJ02

Verified By J. Bradlsy

Bid #099-JJ02
Titie:Plastic Can
Liners
Buyer: R. Tyndalt
ITEMIDCPS # [JESCRIPTION OF ITEl| EsT. District Healthcare - Dyna Pak Corp Edward Don Company Epolystar, Inc.
QTy Unit Prica Tolal Price Manuf & Modsl  |{Unlt Prics  Total Price Manuf & Model | iUnlt Price Totel Price Manuf & Medet  JlUnlt Price Yolal Price Manuf & Model
. Webster
1 | 4o dos Plastic Compactor |\ ) oo | 160l sanso000/ChoR08 | g0 $46,375.00 72 PR 1061l 536,525.00|Phastics 1497 $37,425.00 §§'§l§§§§z
0471 Bag: 43X 52 ' ) " Plastics : 435238 ) T IMDC 4352 ) T e
3
Webster Epolystar
485-364-| Plastic Can Liner: Champion Dyna Pak Plastics ’
2 0370 |36 X 60 5,500 316.25 $89,375.00 Plastics $17.92 $98,560.00] 366038 $14.09] $77,495,00 MDC 3660 $14.49 $79,695.00 ?gl;(—)F%GO
3
Webster
g #5364 Plastic Can Linerdl o000 | s1925]  s385,00000/Co0mPion | g o0 $460,600.00 Y53 PE g0 ol g363,600,00/105HES $18.14)  $362,800.00 ﬁgﬁ%‘;
0035 130X37 ! ' U Plastics ' 3037158 ' TEIMDC 3037 : e )
1 15B250
Webster
4 |s85-364 Plastic Can Linersd®) g0 00 | g1373] s1,008,400.00/C28mPi0n | ¢ o $1,274,400.00| Y12 Pak $12.50 $1,000,000.00|F 25tics $12.74] $1,019,200.00 ?gﬁflﬁ:g
0418 [X 48, ' ' IR Plastics ’ e R 4048158 : ERTTNIMDC 4048 : i 15D 100 a
15
Webster
Plastics
s ot 300 Epolysie
364- |Plastic Can Liner Champion Dyna Pak PSL-
5 loasy |3 x 24, 10,000 $24.25]  $242,500.00 Plastics $20.25  $202,500.00 242308C $7.33]  $73,300.00|-does not $14.93 $149,300.00) 0~ "
meet specs
. 03C1000
requires
case of
1000
’ « Low bid meeting
specifications

| Second low bid meeting
specifications
-

= Third low bid meeting
specifications
4 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Entered By R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Plastic Can Liners
Bld # 099-JJ02

Bid #095-4J02
Title:Plastic Can
Liners
Buyer: R, Tyndall
Interboro Packaging - A - Non- Interboro Packaging - B -Non- Interboro Packaging - C - Non- || Interboro Packaging - D - Non-
ITEMIOCPS # [JESCRIPTION OF ITEl} EsT. responsive - quallfied bid responsiva - qualified bid responsive - qualified bid responsive - qualifisd bid
QTry {Unlt Prce Tolal Prica Manuf & Modsl  |Unill Prics Total Price Manuf & Model  [lUnll Price Total Prica Manuf & Model | finit Prics Tolal Prica Manuf & Model
Interboro Interboro lnterboro Interboro
1 |[#85364- Plastic Compactor | ) o0 | 10 0l 43.300.00(4352 - $15.34 $38,350.00 232 $13.32 $33,300,00/ 052 $1048]  $26,200.0014352 -
0471 |Bag: 43 X 52 Super Ex - Super Ex--
Super Tuff Super Exh
Ex-Hvy Hvy
Interboro Interboro laterboro Interboro
g |[#8364- Plastle CanLiner: | o s I gl 591 060.003660 . $15.48]  $85,140.00|3660 - $13.82 $76,010.00]560" SIL74] $64,570.0013660-Hvy -
0370 136 X 60 . Super Ex-
Super Tuff Super Tuff Super XXH
Ex -Hvy
Interboro
485-364{Plastic Can Liner! Interboro Interboro Interboro
3 0035 |30X 37 20,000 $20.94]  $418,800.00{3037 - $17.34] $346,800.00) 3037 - Exh $14.20] $284,000.00 3037-XH $12.34| 3246,800.00 3037-Hvy
Super Exh
. . Interboro
4 |485-364\Plastic Can LinersdQl o 000 |14 ol 51158 400.004045 - $11.84] $947,200.00/2icb0r0 $9.82] §785,600.00] Ricrboro $8.74] $699,200.00/ - 4048 -
0418 X 48, 4048 Exh 4048 Xt Hvy
Super Exh
364-  |Plastic. Can Liner Interboro Int 2424 - Int - 2424- Int- 2424 -
5 0451 123X 24, 10,000 $11.68]  $116,800.00 2424 reg $9.98]  $99,800.00 R $8.68] $86,800.00 R $8.68| $86,800.00) R

= Low bid meeting
specifications

| = Second tow bid meeting
|spwiﬂculiux\x
——

= Third low bid meeting

(Specifications

Verified By J. Bradiey

FM-3738 Rev. (06-08)




Entered By R, Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 099-4J02

Bid #099-0J02 ‘
Title:Plastic Can
Liners
Buver: R, Tyndall
Interboroc Packaging - E - Non- Interboro Packaging ~F - Non- Nesld Paper DBA Janitors Supply || Peninsular Paper Company of
ITEMIDCPS # NESCRIPTION OF ITE{| &sT. responsive - quallfied bid responsive - qualified bid Qutlet Central Florida
Qry (Unit Price Tetal Price Manuf & Medel  [[Unit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model  IUnit Price Total Prica Manuf & Modet ‘Uﬂ — lt:w_P‘ﬂ.c-a- — _'&nﬁ&iodi
] : I
Fortune :
485-364- Plastic Compactor Int-4352 INT - 4352 JR Plastics Plastics
1 0471 Bag 43X 52 2,500 $8.84]  $22,100.00] Exh $7.48] $18,700.00 XH $17.22 $43,050.00 4359BL $30,550.00 Custom }
43x52 I
I
e e e o
|
Fortune i
2 [[48s:s6e Plastlc Can Liner: o o) $954 520003660 §7.98 $43,800.00 2 | g1564  s01,520.00 % Flastios $64,790,00{18stios |
0370 136X 60 . ! ’ e § ' TTR13660 - Exh ’ TTT3660BL U i Custom |
Super Exh
36x60 I
i
et L N -1
|
Fortune )
485-364{Plastic Can Liner Interboro Interboro IR Plastics Plastics |
3 0035 |30 X 37 20,000 $9.84] $196,800.00; 3037-Med $8.32] $166,400.00 I037M $20.64; $412,300.00 3037 BL $287,200,00 Cusiom |
30x37 }
i T |
[
1
Fortune |
485-364{Plastic Can Liner:4(Q Int - 4048- Int 4048- JR Plastics Plastics |
4 0418 |X 48, 80,000 $7.48 $598,400.00 H $6.64] $531,200.00 Med $14.35| $1,148,000.00 4048 BL $805,600.00) Custom |
40x48 i
|
AR et v Mt | - P P l
AEP }
Industries 1
Custom  §
23x24-8 |
364- [Plastic Can Liner Int - 2424- . : imic-Tie |
5 0dst (23 X 24, 10,000 $8.68]  $86,800.00|Int-2424-R. $8.68] $86,800.00 R $0.00{No B,ld $104,300,00) Bid - Drug |
Free Work |
Place - !
Florida }
Vend
Yendor |
= Low bid meeling
fspecifications
i— - —l = Second low bid meeting
! lspeciﬁmions
: ; = Third low bid meeting
! !spcciﬁcatiom s

Verified By J. Bradiey

FM-3738 Rev. {06-98)




Entersd By R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Plastlc Can Liners
Bid # 099-JJ02

Verified By J. Bradley

Buyer: R. Tyndall
ITEMIDCPS # JESCRIPTION OF ITE| EST. Quality Chemical Rex Chemical Resource One, Inc, Southeastern Paper Group
Qrty KJnit Ptlos Total Prica Manuf & Maded  HUnit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model Ll,)n;l( Prics Tolal Price Manuf & Modet {[Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modsl
Aluf
No No . Plastics 43
1 | 485364 Plastic Compactor | o0 | 51705 544,875.00Manufac $17.85  $44,625.00Manufuc, | $17.55)  $43,875.00 R PSS o600 g0 aas00% 52
0471 1Bag: 43X 52 ; . 43x52BL Vendor
Specified Specified .
qualified
bid
Aluf
Plastics 36
485-364-| Plastic Can Liner: No No x 60 -
2 “ Il 5800 $1738)  $95,425.00{Manufac, $17.55  $96,525.00|Manufac, $0.00{No Bid $16.40]  $90,200.00
0370 136 X 60, ) : Vendor
Specified Specified )
qualified
bid
JAlf
No No Plastics 30
3 |#85-364 Plastic Can Liners) 5o 50 $28.10]  $562,000.00Manufac, $22.55  $451,000.00|Manufac, 52067 $433,400.00P R Plasties b oo ool 55310000037
0035 |30X37 . N 30x37BL Vendor
Specified Specified .
qualified
bid
Aluf
No No Plastics 40
4 |85-364|Plastic Can Liner:dW g0 o0 1| 519.43] §1.554.400.00 Manutac. $15.60) $1,248,000.00{Manufac, $15.11] $1,208,800.00 % Pastes b o0 1l 51 469,600,001 48 *
0418 |X 48, X X 40x48 BL Vendor
Specified Specified .
qualified
bid
Heritage
) . No No DH823RB
4 Pl L
5 ¢ astie Can Lineri 40000 $12.00 $120,000.00 Manutac, $12.45|  $124,500.00|Manufac. $0.00{No Bid $14.09  $140,900.00{Vendor
0451 123 X 24, X 5 -
Specified Specified qualified
bid

= Lowbid mesting
specifications

<
l [ = Second low bid meeting
I specifications

[y

= Third low bid meeting
specifications

| QU |

FM-3738 Rev. (06-88)




Entered By R, Tyndall

Bid #099-J102 |
Title:Plastic Can
Liners

Buyer: R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Plastic Can Liners
Bid # 099-JJ02

Tampa Janitorlal Supply DBA
ITEMIDCPS # JESCRIPTION OF ITE}  EsT. Tampa Vac & Supplies Unipak Corporation Unisource
QIY Unlt Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model  |1Unlt Price [Totad Price Manuf & Model  {|Unit Prica Tolal Price Manuf & Mode
1 [[#88-964- Plastlc Compactor | ) o) $17.09)  sazo7s.00f bastios ) oy ool s36,50000UPC 43523 s16.64]  s41.600.00 ?lirsr{)i'cs
0471 1Bag; 43 X 52 ' ’ T 43x52BL ' e ) e
' Custom
485-364- Plastic Can Liner; UPC 3660 Bery
2 ! 5,500 $16,10 $88,550.00{JR Plastics $14.40 $79,200.00] $16.07, $88,385.00| Plastics
0370 136X 60, 3
Custom -2
r
485.364{Plastic Can Liner . ) urc Berry
3 ‘Il 20,000 $20.50,  $410,000.00,JR Plastics $18.20]  $364,000.00) $20.09]  $401,800.00Plastics
0035 30X 37 303715
Custom - 3
485-364{ Plastic Can Liner:40 Berry
4 0418 |X 48 80,000 $14.35 $1,148,000.00JR Plastics $12.60{ $1,008,000.00{UPC 4815 $14.29| $1,143,200.00]Plastics
) ’ Custom 4
. Barry
White hall . A
5 32:1 g“;(“; ’ Can Linery o000 | s11.99  $119,900.00 products (6 $10.90]  $109,000.00/UPC 24R $I124)  $112,400.00 ilsa;“"s
months) 2325MLB
| = Low bid eeting
specitications
r - -i = Second low bid meeting
| |spcciﬂuati0m
: . Third low bid meeting
! Jspecifications 8

Verifled By J. Bradtey

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




