Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

ALLHIGHEIGHTED AREAS

,4{(’1“367

Bid No. 013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
TITLE: _SCIENGE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES COMPLETED BY: M\,ﬂ
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran VERIFIED BY: Y\( ;( %\
IF H B CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY
ESTIMA] PRICE OFFERING BENZ MICROSCOPE 810 COMPANY, INC 1 CAPITAL MICROSCOPE SERVICES | CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS- CO,
TED OTHER 0 0
QUANTH UNIT THAN Manuf & Manuf & I i
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF [TEM TY [[{UOM)] PER UNIT]| APPROVED |iUnit Price Total Price Model Unit Price _|[Tatal Price Model iUnit Price [ITotal Price Manuf & MocUnit Price __{[Total Prica Manuf & Modef|Unit Price {[Total Price Manut & Mod
: !
v s
I I
UALIFIED BID. H H
;w OF(IgERB'TZS 00 PER SHIPPING ALTERNATE VENDOR FOR GROUP Hl, ¢
WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty LOC’AT SHIP‘PIN(‘; CHARGES WILL QUALIFIED GROUP HI -BID ON LINE ,LINE ITEMS 4 & 5. {QUALIFIED GROUP IV, ITEMS 21
greater than one {1) year for each item as " ITEMS 15,16 & 19 ONLY. DID NOT BID ;BID GROUP |, LINE ITEMS 1-3 AND ) : BID ON ITEMS 1-3; OTHERS LEFT BLANK:
N . APPLY TO ORDERS UNDER $25.00. ITHROUGH 24, DID NOT BID ALL ITEMY
it applies, ITEMS LEFT BLANK: 6-31, 33, 35, 36. 38 lOTHER GROUPS. «GROUP [ LINE ITEMS 4 & 5. .
TETE TR |DID NOT BID OTHERS. 1
8 39 | I
H \
I 1
. .
—— 4 e v v e —— ——p——————
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items to be considered for award. items
1 through 3
MICROSCOPE,monocular, ultra fite cool
1 light, fluorescent iMumination systemy; with
4X, 10X, 40XR objectives; Stage: plain; SWIFT
Condenser: N.A. 0.65;. 404§ EA $244.00 | $98,576.00 [M3501DF $232.47 $93,917.88 [|AS SPEC $248.00 || $100,182.00 [j59-5517 $285.00 $115,140.00
Approved Brand:Swilt #M3501DF, Fisher
Scientific $19617-5 or Equal
MICROSCOPE, stereo, ultra lite illuminalion
2 with 1X, 3X objectives; W10XD, 23mm; SWIFT
iluminator: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen with| #SM85-8-
dimmer switch. 143 EA $412.00 $58,916.00 ||HF $402.57 $57,567.51 |AS SPEC $459.00 | $65,637.00 {|SPEC61882 $495.00 $70,785.00
Approved Brand: Swift #5M85-SMBOHF,
Fisher Scientific S352658 or Equal
MIGROSCOPE,stereo, ultra lite itfumination
3 wilh 1X, 2X objeclives; W10XD, 23mm; SWIFT
iluminator: Incident - 6V, 20W Ralogen with HSMSB1-
dimmer swilch 147 EA $412.00 $60,564.00 [|90HF $402.57 $59,177.79 §AS SPEC $459.00 $67.473.00 |SPECE1882 $495.00 $72,765.00
[Approved Brand: Swilt #SM31-SMIOHF,
Fisher Scientific $95265A or Equal
TOTAL ITEMS 1-3 $218,056.00 LEFT BLANK $210,663.18 $233,302.04 $258,690.00
GROUP H: I 1
. .
The following items will be awarded as a total] i i
low bid basls. Vendor must bid both items to a v
be awarded, ltems 4 and 5 i H
MICROSCOPE - Research Digita: y I
Microscope, 2.0 megapixel, 1,800 x 1,280 1 i
4 lresolution, true-color images with thig NATIONAL : : 59-1155
research-grade digital microscope. #DC5-183- 1 1 (591300
4 EA $1,190.00 $4.760.00 |[ASC . $990.00 $3,980.00 /AS SPEC ,  $925.00 $3,700.00 {|DISC)
Approved Brand: Wolfe Digivu/Carolina ! !
Biological #581300 or equal i H
[MICROSCOPE - Tomputet . :
sterectnicroscope, 2.0 megapixel, builtin INATIONAL i i
5 high-resolulion  camera  connects g #OCS- : :
compuer via USB 2.0, 7 EA $996.00 | $6,993.00 |[[420TH | $990.00 $8930.00 jAS SPEC | $1.245.00(  $8.715.00 59-2016
. '
Approved Brand: Woife DigiVu CM Carolina i i
Biclogical #592016 or equal H H
T T
: '
. h
TOTALITEMS 485 $6,993.00 LEFT BLANK i $10,890.00 1 $12,415.0Q LEFT BLANK
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 Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box: ALLHIGHIIGHTED AREAS

Bid No.  013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT 8)

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES: COMPLETED BY:

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran VERIFIED BY:

CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY]
CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS- CO.

iF M

ESTIMA PRICE || OFFERING BENZ MICROSCOPE BIO COMPANY, INC | caPITAL MICROSGOPE SERVICES
)
1

TED OTHER
QUANTH{| UNIT THAN Manufl & Maauf &
TEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY {UOM}i| PER UNIT /l APPROVED JiUnit Price Yotal Price Modet Unit Price {ITotal Price Model fUnit Price {[Total Price Manuf & Mo Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modej{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mog

GROUP HI:

The foliowing items will be awarded on QUALIFIED
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid atl GROUP, DID
items in Group to be awarded. Items & NOT BID ALL
through 20. [TEMS.

CHART - PERIODIC TABLE, Each efement]
displays [UPAC name, symbol, alomid
weight, oxidation states; densily, boiling and
melting points, number of naturalk
oceurring radioaclive isofopes and pertinen
information  for the most abundan -
radioactive isotope. 17 EA NB $40.95 $696.15 1157-9618

Approved Brands: Print Lab # LL1015,
Fisher Science #545525 or equal

CHART - ASTRONOMY/SOLARSYSTEM]
Colorful Complete Set: 12 EA NB NB

[Approved Brands: Denoyer Geppert #1940}
41, Fisher Science #S2401141 or equal NB

CHART - WEATHER SERIES pomplete set
of 6 {including Wealher Map) with

Charthead/Tripod. Dimensions: 44" x 36", 16 EA NB

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1230~
41, Fisher Science S2401041, or equal INB

9 CHART - ZOOLOGY SET 21 Multi Colored
Charts, Dimensions: 44" x 38" - completel
series on charthead with tripod stand. 4 EA NB NG

Approved Brand:  Denoyer Geppert #1994
41, Fisher Science $23151-41, or equal

CHART - LIFE SCIENGE SERIES
complete biology chart series that surveys
10 |land highlights the divesity of iife with more
than 300 illustrations.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Gepperl #1030-
41, Fisher Scientific #52305041 or Equal 8 EA NB INB

MAP-WEATHER MAP/PLOTTINGCHART
11 j|Double sided chanl helps students recar
and forecast weather conditions, 51 €A NB NB

[Approved Brand. Ameélican Equcatonar
Products #462. Fisher Science #545523 or

Equal

(MODEL - MAP PROJECTION, Has ihree
12 i(3) map projections: cylindrical, conical,
and azmuthal; 17 EA NB INB

Approved Brand: American Educalional
Products #6875, Fisher Science #S45065 or
Equal

13 [IGLOBE - HYDROGRAPHIC RELIEF
Depicts undersea geography and gealogy; 47 EA NB INB
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

FLEASE COMPLETE -

ALLHIGHLIGHTED AREAS

Bi0 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

COMPLETED BY:
VERIFIED BY:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT:
TY

UNIT
{(UOM}]

IF

PRICE || OFFERING

BENZ MICROSCOPE

BIO COMPANY, INC

CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS-

CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY:!

OTHER
THAN
APPROVED

PER UNIT Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf &
Modet

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf &
Model

1Unit Price

Total Price

1 €
! CAPITAL MICROSCOPE SERVICES i
c

Manuf & Modk

Unit Price Total Frice [Manuf & Modef

Unit Price Tota Price Manuf & Mo

TRDETOVED BIATd. ATETICAT EqUCatonar
Products #600, Fisher Science #545163 o)
Equal.

PLANETARIUM - ORBIIER,  Mode|
designed to show basic earth and moor|
molions.

‘Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #101, Fisher Science #S45169 or
Equal

EA

NB

$228.60 $2.514 .60 ||51-2260

MODEL - EARTHWORM Provides all th
materials needed to study the structures and
functions of the earthworm.

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #2756, Fisher Science #S17907F
or Equal

EA

511415

$1,369.80

NB

NB

MODEL - GRASSHOPPER - Aclivity Set
anatomical and ceflutar model,

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #2753, Fisher Science #517128 o]
Equal

EA

§114.18

$1.369.80

NB

NB

MODEL - SOLAR SYSTEM{apernican,
Base supports a 6 in. diameter sun
surroundad by nine planets.

Approved Brand: Amerncan taucationat
Products #200, Fisher Science #545193 or
Equal

EA

NB

NB

MODEL - ANIMAL CELL - colored plasti
organelles are translucent and transparent.
Approved Brand: Science Source #B-102,
Fisher Science #517129ND or Equal

EA

NB

NB

19

MODEL CRAYFISH, Aclivily Set

anatomical and cellular models
(AP UVEU O1atiU, ALIZHGAN CUUCauuia

Products #2752, Fisher Science #5171282)
or Equal

EA

$114.15

$1,389.80

NB

NB

20

GYROSCQPE, Single Form - illustrates the
principle of the gyroscope and rolational
inerlia.

97

EA

NB

$8.05 $780.85 ||75-2181

[Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #7-795, Fisher Science #340959
or Equal .

TOTAL ITEMS §-20

LEFT BLANK

QUALIFIED GRP. DIDNOT BID ALL

ITEMS.

NB

QUALIFIEC GROUFP. DID NGT|
BID ALL ITEMS.

LEFT BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

PLEASEICOMPLETE

ALLHIGHUIGHTED AREAS

Bid No. 013-1J05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

COMPLETED 8Y:
VERIFIED BY:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT!
TY

UNIT
(UOM)

IF

PRICE || OFFERING BENZ MICROSCOPE

BIO COMPANY, INC

:
| capirat microscope services |

CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS-

CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY
CO.

OTHER
THAN
APPROVED

Manu! &

PER UNIT, Unit Price Total Price Madel

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf &
Modei

Tt Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mod Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modej

Unit Price Total Price tAanuf & Mod

MODEL - HUMAN TORSU AND READ,

21

GRQUP [V:
The following iterns will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. lems 21
through 24.

(Sexless) Life size, Disseclible into 13 partg

[Approved Brand: Carolina Biclogical #56-
6610 or Equal

EA

$612.00

$4.284.00

56-8610

22

[WODEL, UNA - Molecular model enfargsc
100 milfion times.

Approved Brand: T&S Educational Products
#9-102, Fisher Science #825825 or Equal

EA

$134.10

$2,413.80

17-1058

23

MODEL, HUMAN SKELETON, Lie size

24

MODEL, HOMAN DIGESTIVE SYSTEM]
Life size - 5 parl plaslic repraduction of thé
alimentary tract.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Gepperl 0143
00, Fisher Science #S171592 or Equal

EA

NB

mounted on stand

Approved Brand: American 3B Scientific
#A10, Fisher Science #517133B or Equal

EA

$405.00

$5,265.00

24-6875

TOTAL ITEMS 21-24

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

QUALIFIED

NOT BiD ALL ITEMS.

GROUP. DID

LEFT BLANK

GROUP V:

The following items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid ali
items in Group to be awarded. items 25
through 30,

25

BALANCE Triple Beam, 610g capacily witi
0.1g readability,

Approved Brands: Qhaus 750-S0. Fisher
Science #340020 or equal

198

EA

NB

$139.50

$27.621.00

70-2150

28

BALANCE, top Ioading, capacity 200g
IApproved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scienlific
567074 or Equal

31

EA

NB

$300.60

$9.318.60

70-2441

27

SHIELD, safely, curved, three sided.
30"high, 3/16 in.

[Approved Brand: Bel-Ant Products #H24962
Fisher Science $51222 or Equal

EA

NB

$323.85

$5.507.15

64-6350

28

SHIELD, safely. curved, three sided,
36high, 3116 in.

Overall dimensions: 18 1/2W x 6 1/2D x
36in. H

Approved  Brand: Bel-Arl Producty
#H249640000, Fisher Science 551223 o
Equat

EA

NB

$369.00

$1,107.00

64-6355

28

HOTPLATE, high-visibilfy glass ceramic
top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200,
Fisher Science $50442HP or Equal

106

EA

N8B

$198.12

$21,106.72

70-1011A

30

STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramnic lop, surface area: 4 X 5",
tamperalure range 25 to 550 deg.
Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, Fishe
Science $50446HP or Equal

75

EA

INB

$379.19

$28,439.25

70-1012A

TOTAL ITEMS 25-30

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

NO 8iD

$93,098.74

LEFT BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

ALLHIGH

PLEASE COMPLETE
IGHTED AREAS

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER; Gladys Foraro-Beltran

BiD PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)

COMPLETED BY:
VERIFIED BY:

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF {TEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT
TY

UMt
(UOM)

PER UNIT

PRICE

IE
QFFERING

BENZ MICROSCOPE

BIO COMPANY, INC

CAPITAL MICROSCOPE SERVICES

CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS-

CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY|

OTHER
THAN
APPROVED

Manuf &
Model

Manuf &
Modz!

Tatal Price

Manuf & Mod Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Manut & Mo

GROUP VI:

The following items wiil be awarded on
an individual item basis. ftems 31
through 35.

31

'HORESIS, Equipmen]
Package, Package conlains enough
equipment for electrophoresis of 12 gels a!
one time.

Approved Brand: Carolina Biolegial
#213620 or equal

EA

$1.912.50

$7,650.00

33

[RIPFLE TANK “Disloriion-Iree, oplically

34

LIGHT BOX & OPTICAL SET - Includes
illustrated experiment manuat details 36
experiments perform in classroom.
Approved Brand: Industriat Equipment &
Controf #HL2060-001, Fisher Science
#542208

66

EA

$126.90

$8,375.40

clear plate glass bottom.

Approved Brand: Science Source #15430,
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equal

108

EA

$310.50

$32,913.00

36

AQUARIUMIreshwater sets, 30 gallon.
Approved Brand: Science Kit WW60214 M
08 or Equal

EA

NB

{TEMS 31, 33, 34, 36 INDIVIDUAL ITEM
BASIS

NO BID

LEFT BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 0130405 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FC
TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Farero-Beltran
IF EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC.
ESTIMA PRICE [} OFFERING FISHER SCIENCE FREY SCIENTIFIC PARA SCIENTIFIC
TED OTHER
QUANTH UNIT THAN Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY [ (UOM)| PER UNIT || APPROVED |[Unit Price |[Totat Price {{Manuf & MdiUnit Price |Total Price _[iManuf & Moc{Unit Price _ [{Total Price Model Unit Price | Totat Price Manuf & Model j{Unit Price_[{Total Price_ |Manuf @ Mog
PRIMARY FOR GROUP 1, LINE ITEMS L.OW BIDDER BUT SAMPLES NOT
1-3. LOW BIDDER FOR GROUP i, SUBMITTED AS FOLLOWS:
— . UALIFIED GRP V, BID ON X g
WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty il Q PRIMARY FOR GROUP I, LINE ITEMS ITEMS 6-20 BUT ITEM #6 DID NOT GROUP 1, LINE ITEMS 1-3,
s [TEMS 25, 26 ONLY. GROUP VI, IGROUPS I-V|, LINE [TEMS 1-37 485. PRIMARY FOR GROQUP i, LiNH
greater than one {1} year for each item as COMPLY. QUALIFIED GROUP V- ITEMS{|GROUP Hi, LINE ITEMS, 4 &5,
n . DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES FOR ILEFT BLANK. ITEMS 6-20. PRIMARY FOR GROUP
it applies. LINE ITEMS 34 & 36, W, LINE ITEMS 21.24 25-30, DID NOT BID ALL ITEMS. GROUP [V, LINES 21-24, LINE ITE.
. ' ) PRIMARY FOR GROUP VI, LINE ITEMS 31|[22. GROUP VILINE iTEMS 31 -37
AND 34, LEFY BLANK.
GROUP i:
0 a5 4 |
totat low bid basis. Vendor must bid alt
itemns to be considered for award. ltems
1 through 3
MICROSCOPE, monocular, ultra lite cool
1 light, fluorescent illumination system; wilh 4500439
4X, 10X, 40XR objectives; Stage: plain; APP'RD LaW
Condenser: N.A. 0.85.. 404 1l EA $225.50 || $91,102.00 |S19617-5 $274.93 || $111,071,72 |BRAND $106.16 || $42,888.64 IBRAND
[ALTERNATE:-
Approved Brand:Swilt #M35010DF, Fisher KENAVISION
Scientific $19617-5 or Equal $137.49 || $55.545.96 |[T1901
MICROSCOPE stereo, ufira lite iftumination
2 with 1X, 3X objectives; W10XD, 23mm;
lurninator: Incident - 8V, 20W Halogen witt] C&A
dimmer switch. 143 | EA §413.47 )| §59,126.21 [[S952658 $421.32 ||  $60,248.76 ||SM95-90HF $177.75 |} $25,418.25 [BRAND
ALTERNATE:
Approved Brand: Swift #SM95-SMSOHF, KENAVISION
Fisher Scienlific 5952658 or Equal $199.99 $28,598.57 [|T2200
MICROSCOPE stereo, ultra fite iltumination
3 with 1X, 2X objectives; W10XD, 23mm;
iluminator: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen with C&A
dimmer switch 147 || EA $413.47 ||  $60,780.08 [[S95265A $421.32 || $681,934.04 ISM91-90HF $177.34 || $26,088.98 [|[BRAND
Approvad Brand: Swift #SM91-SMOOHF, TOTAL
Fisher Scientific 895265A or Equal $233,254.52 {{TEMS 1-3
LEFT ALT TOTL
TOTAL ITEMS 1-3 BLANK $211,008.30 $146,078.57 |IITMS 1-3 $94,375.87
GROUP }:
The foliowing items will be awarded as a totalf
low bid basis. Vendor must bid both items lo
be awarded. ltems 4 and 5
MICROSCOPE - Research Digital
Microscope, 2.0 megapixel, 1,600 x 1,280 IWESTOVE
4 resolution, Irue-cofor images with lhig R DCS-163:
research-grade digital microscope SCIENTIFIC ASC NAT'L 18V
4 EA $950.95 $3.803.80 (15000098 { $1.069.99 $4,279.96 OPT $734,64 || $2,938.56 |BRANDI
Approved Brand: Wolfe Digivu/Carolina
Biological #591300 or equal
MICROSTOPE - ] Lomp.mei WESTOVE
stereomicroscope, 2.0 megapixel. builtin R DC5-420TH
5 high-resolulion  camera  connects  id SCIENTIFIC! NAT'L L&W
compuer via USB 2.0, 7 EA $938.95 56.572.85 [|S90015A $879.9 $6.159.83{0PTICAL $1,025.04 $7.175.28 [[BRAND
‘Approved Brand: Wolfe DigiVu CM Carolingl
Biological #5920186 or equal
LEFT
TOTAL ITEMS 4& 5 BLANK LEFT BLANK $10,376.45 $10,433.89 $10,113.84
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No.  013-1J0S

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (Ft

DESCRIPTION OF {TEM

EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS

FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC.

FISHER SCIENCE

FREY SCIENTIFIC

PARA SCIENTIFIC

Unit Price_{|Total Price  {[Manuf & Modunit Price

Manuf &
Mode!

Manuf & Model

Manuf & Moq

GROUP 1lJ;

The following items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group te be awarded. items 6§
through 20.

CHART - PERIODIC TABLE, Each element
displays IUPAC name, symbol, atomiq
weight, oxidation stales; density, boiling and
melting  points, number of patural

occurring radioactive isotopes and pertinen
information  for the most  abundani
radioactive isolope.

345525

RM IND.,INC
1777

SGT
IWELCH
#21417-
990

Approved Brands: Print Lab # LL1015,
Fisher Science #545525 or equal

CHART - ASTRONOMY/SOLARSYSTEM
(Coforful Complete Set:

S24011-41

Approved Brands: Denoyer Geppert #1940}
41, Fisher Science #S2401141 or equal

CHART - WEATHER SERIES pomplele sef
of 6 (including Weather Map) with
[Charthead/Tripod. Dimensions: 44" x 36",

524010-41

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1930-
41, Fisher Science S$2401041, or equal

CHART - ZOOLOGY SET 21 Muiti Colored
Charis. Dimensions: 44" x 36" - complete]
series on charthead wilh tripod stand.

Approved Brand:  Denoyer Geppert #1994
41, Fisher Science $23151-41, or equal

S23151-41

CHART - LIFE SCIENCE SERIES
complele biology charl series that surveys
and highlights the divesity of life with more
than 300 iliustrations.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1030-
41, Fisher Scientific #52305041 or Equal

823050-41

AppProved Brana. Amefican £adcatona

MAP-WEATHER MAP/PLOTTINGCHART|
Double sided chart helps students record
and forecast weather conditions,

545523

Products #4682, Fisher Science #S45523 or
Equal

MODEL - MAF PROJECTION, Has (hree
(3) map projections: cylindrical, conical,
and azmuthal;

545065

Approved Brand: American Educationat
Products #675, Fisher Science #545065 or
Equal

GLLOBE - HYDROGRAPHIC RELIEF]

Depicts undersea geography and geology:

ESTIMA
TED
QUANTE UNIT
TY _ji{uom)
17 EA
12 EA
18 EA
4 EA
8 EA
51 EA
17 EA
47 EA

845163




Type or print the complete

name of the bidder ina this box:

PLEASE.COMPLETE

ALL

iLIGHTE

Bid No. 013-4J65

TITLE: SCIENCE EQU!PMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Girdys Forero-Beitran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (F¢

iITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT!
TY

uNIT
{UoM)

PRICE

PER UNIT

iF
OFFERING
OTHER
THAN
APPROVED

EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS

FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC.

FISHER SCIENCE

FREY SCIENTIFIC

PARA SCIENTIFIC

Unil Price

Total Price Manuf & M

Unit Price  HTotal Price  |[Manuf & MoqUnit Price

Total Price

Manuf &
Model

Unit Price

Tota! Price Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Taotal Price

Manufl & Mod

FBTAT. AMGNCan EauCaonar
Products #5600, Fisher Science #545163 of
Equat.

PLANETARIOM - ORBITER,  Mode|
designed lo show basic earth and moon
motions.

Approved Brand: American Educationat
Products #101, Fisher Science #545169 or
Equat

EA

570.24

§772.64

545169

$133.67

$1,470.37

$124.14

$1,365.54

MODEL - EARTHWORM Provides all he
materials needed to study the structures and
functions of the earthworm.

EA

Approved Brand; American Educational
Products #2756, Fisher Science #S17907F
or Equal

$76.92

$923.04

S17907F

$74.96

$899.52

$105.50

$1,266.00

MODEL - GRASSHOPPER - Activity Set;
anatomical and celiufar model,

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #2753, Fisher Science #517128 or
Equat

EA

$71.43

$857.16

§517128

$74.98

$899.52

$98.07

$1,176.84

MODEL - SOLAR SYSTEMCopernican,
Base supports a 8 in. diameter sun
surrounded by nine planets.

Approvea wrand: Amencan caucatonai
Products #200, Fisher Science #545193 or
Equat

EA

$48.81

$683.34

545193

$68.18

SCIENCE
FIRST SOL-100i
$954.52 jirR)p.
[COPERNICAL
SOLAR

SYST.MDL

$80.88

$1.132.32

MODEL - ANIMAL CELL - colored plasli
organelies are translucent and transparent.
Approved Brand: Science Source #8-102,
Fisher Science #317129ND or Equal

EA

$335.23

$1.676.15

S17129ND

$341.04

$1.705.20

$591.55

$2.957.75

SGT
WELCH
#96011

MODEL™ - CRAYFISH Aclivity ~ Sef

anatomical and cellular models
[Rpptoves oidanu. VeI GULCEIL @

Producls #2752, Fisher Science #5171282,
or Equal

EA

$73.47

$878.04

517128-2

$74.96

$899.52

$104.92

$1.250.04

20

GYROSCOPE, Single Form - lilustrales the:
principle of the gyroscope and rotational
inaria.

97

EA

$8.24

$799.28

540859

S4.44

TEDCO INC
$430.68 [l00007

$11.56

$1,121.32

Approved Brand: American Educationat
Products #7-795. Fisher Science #540958
or Equal

TOTAL ITEMS 6-2¢

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

$28,147.45

$25,533.73

$34,031.21
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Type or print the camplete

name of the bidder in this box:

8id No, 013-JJ05

ITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

PLEASE CONPLETE
ALLHIGHLIGHTED AREA:

BID PROPOSAL FORM {FC

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT.
TY

uNIT
{uom)

IF

PRICE || OFFERING

EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS

FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC.

FISHER SCIENCE

FREY SCIENTIFIC

PARA SCIENTIFIC

OTHER
THAN

PER UNIT| APPROVED

Unit Price

Tota! Price Manuf & M

Unit Price | Total Price

Manuf & Moc]Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf &
Modet

Unit Prica Total Price Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Mo

21

|

|MODEL - HUMAN TORSO AND HEAD.

GROUP IV:
The following items wiil be awarded on
total iow bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. [tems 21
through 24.

(Sexless) Life size, Dissectible into 13 parts

Approved Brand: Carclina Biotogical #56-
6610 or Equal

EA

$336.47

$2,355.29

817150C
AMER. 38
B13

American 38

$953.33 $6,673.31 |[B17

$11.73

$82.11

- Molecufar model enfarged

100 mitlion times.

Approved Brand: T&S Educational Products
#9-102, Fisher Science #525825 or Equal

MODEL, HUMAN DIGESTIVE SYSTEM)
Life size - 5 pari plastic reproduction of {hel
i y tract.

HVIBBEf, AUMAN SRELE 5N, Lie size

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert 0143-
00, Fisher Science #5171532 or Equat

EA

$76.32

$1,373.76

525825

KEMTEC

3$74.17 $1,335.06 [j9-102

$77.63

SGTWLCH

$1,397.34 |[#¥61907-35

EA

$495.88

$1.083.44

$17159-2

$528.88 $2.115.52

$507.53

$2,030.12

mounted on stand

lApproved Brand: American 3B Scientific
#A10, Fisher Science #5171338 or Equal

EA

$155.63

$2,023.18

5171338

$169.99 $2,209.87

$268.59

$3.491.67

TOTAL ITEMS 21-24

LEFT
BLANK

LEFT
BLANK

$7,735.84

$12,333.7¢

$7,001.24

GROUP V:

The following items wilt be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. Items 25
through 30.

25

BALANCE Triple Beam, 610g capacily with
0.1 readability,

Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-80, Fisher
Science #540020 or equal

168

EA

$106.00

$20,988.00 {IBAL-310

$77.50

$15,345.00

540020

$95.18 $18.847.62

ALT: 1017514

$59.50 | $11,781.00 |iIFREY BRAND

$65.50

ADAM
EQUIP. TBS

$§12,969.00[610S

26

BALANCE, top loading, capacity 200g
Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific
S67074 or Equal

31

EA

$249.50

$7,734.50 |IBAL 310

$189.77

$5,882.87

567074

$208.68 $6,500.08 525770

$162.84

ADAM
EQUIP

$5,048.041CQT202

ALT: CQT202

$144.46 $4,478.26 JJADAM EQUP.

27

SHIELD, salely, curved, three sided,
30"high. 3/18 in.

IAppraved Brand: Bel-Art Products #H24962
Fisher Science 851222 or Equal

EA

$289.18

$4,815.72

$51222

$307.48 $5,227.16

$277.99

$4,725.83

28

SHIELD, safely, curved, three sided,

367high, 3/16 in.

Overall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 1/2D x
36in. H

Approved  Brand:  Bel-At  Producly
#H249640000, Fisher Science $51223 o
Equal

§326.75

$980.25

851223

NO PRICE NG PRICE H24964

83172

$935.16

29

HOTPLATE high-visibiliy glass ceramic
top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200.
Fisher Science S50442HP or Equal

106

EA

£A

$172.90

$18,327.40

S50442HP

$151.66 $16,075.86

$164.90

$17,479.40

30

STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic lop. surface area: 4 X 5",
temperature range 25 to 550 deg.
Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, Fishet
Science S50446HP or Equal

75

EA

$321.84

$24.123.00

S$50446HP

$277.88 $20,841,00 i[8795-220

$313.35

$23,501.25

TOTAL ITEMS 25-30

QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT
BID ALLITEMS,

LEFT BLANK

$69,574.24

QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT BID ALL
ITEMS.

$64,658.68
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Type or print the complete

name of the bldder in this box:

Bid No, 013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (F¢

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-8eltran

IF EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC.
ESTIMA; PRICE (| OFFERING FISHER SCIENCE FREY SCIENTIFIC PARA SCIENTIFIC

TED OTHER
QUANT{] UNIT THAN Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF {TEM TY {UOM)|i PER UNIT}| APPROVED liUnit Price || Totat Price Manuf & Mglunit Price  iTotal Price  YManuf & MoqUnit Price  {[Total Price Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modal flunit Price Total Price Manul & Mog

GROUP Vi:

The following items wilt be awarded on
an individual item basis, Items 31
through 35.

s Equipment
Package, Package conlains  enougl ;E;E;O;Ei

equipment for electrophoresis of 12 gels a 500, 6 EA 551140 LEFT

one time. 4 |l e $1.770.81 || S7,118.24 0 sa o ga] 94896 $3.795.84INEOSCI BLANK
588, 1 EA
Approved Brand: Carolina Biologial 552, 1 DNA
#213620 or equal SCIENCE

31

CIGHT BOX & OPTICAL SET - [nclides
illusirated experiment manual details 36
i ts perform in .
Approved Brand: Industrial Equipment &
(Control #HL2060-001, Fisher Science 30-1525 NEOJLEFT
#S42208 66 EA $102.08 $6,735.96 |[S42208 $58.36 $3,851,76 }iSCI BLANK

33

[RIPPLE TANK - Distorfien-free, oplicaily LEFT
ciear ptate glass boltom. 106 EA $248.81 $26,373.86 [|S520782 $219.99 $23.318.94 BLANK

[Approved Brand: Science Source #15430,
Fisher Science #8520782 or Equal

AQUARIUMIreshwater sets, 30 gallon.
Approved Brand: Science Kit WW6E0214 M LEFT
08 or Equal 8 EA NB NB BLANK

38

ITEMS 31, 33, 34, 36 INDIVIDUAL ITEM LEFT BLANH LEFT LEFT
BASIS BLANK BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

PLEASE COMPLETE.

ALL HIGHLIGHTED AREA!

8id No.  013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES:

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

BiD PROPOSAL FORM (F(

1ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT!

TY

uniT
(uom)

1

PRICE || OFFERING

PASCO SCIENTIFIC

PEPCO, ING

:
1 SARGENT-WELCHVWR i

SCIENCE KIT 3 BOREAL LABS

SEMPCO, INC

OTHER
THAN

Total Price

PER UNIT{| APPROVED [lUni Price

Manuf & Mo

Unit Price | Total Prig

Manut & hUnit Price

i I

Total Price Manuf & Model;

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modg

Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mo

WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty i
greater than one (1) year for each item as
it applies.

GROUPS i -V, NO BID. GROUP Vi,
LINE ITEMS 31 & 36 NO BID.

DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES s 15 10\ TTED. SAMPLE NOT SUBMITTEI QUALIFIED BID. GROUP PRICES ARE

IVALID UNTIL JULY 31, 2011,

FOR GROUPS I-Vi, LINE
ITEMS 1-37.

T
h H
H '
|ALTERNATE FOR GROUP IIl, ITEMS 620
JLOW BIDDER FOR GROUP #f, LINE |
[ITEMS 4 & 5 BUT SAMPLES WERE NOTI

IFOR GROUP 1V, LINE ITEM 22 AND

‘GROUP VI, LINE ITEM 33. GROUP Vi, 1
ILINE ITEM 36 REJECTED, SPECS CALU
FOR 30 GAL, BID 29 GAL SIZE.

GROUPS | -1V, LINE ITEMS 1-24 WERH
LEFT BLANK. QUALIFIED GROUP V,
LINE ITEMS 25 - 30, DID NOT BID ALL.
ITEMS. GROUP VI, LINE ITEMS 31,33 §
36 WERE LEFT BLANK.

GROUP |:

[TTTE TOROWINTG TT&TTTS WIT B8 aWaTaea 4as 4 |
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid ai}
items o be considered for award. ltems

1 through 3

MICRQOSCOPE, monocular, ultra lite cool
light, fiugrescent illumination system; with
4X, 10X, 40XR objectives; Stage: ptain;
Condenser: N.A, 0.65;.

Approved Brand:Swifl #M3501DF, Fisher
Scientific $19617-5 or Equal

404

EA

NQ BID

i),
4

[~

$234.95 $94,919.80

$332.10

$134,168.40

5532001

MICROSCOGPE,stereo, ultra fite iflumination
with 1X, 3X objectives; W10XD, 23mm;
iliuminator: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen witH
dimmer switch.

Approved Brand: Swift #SM95-SMI0RF,
Fisher Scientific $952658 or Equal

143

EA

NG 8ID

$407.95 $58,336.85

$575.1¢

$82,239.30

5540250

MICROSCOPE,stereo, ultra iite ilumination
with 1X, 2X objectives; W10XD, 23mm;
illuminator: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen with
dimmer swilch

Approved Brand: Swift #3M91-SMIOHF,
Fisher Scientific 895265A or Equal

147

EA

NO BID

$407.95 $59,968.65

$575.10

$84,539.70

1799-85

TOTAL ITEMS 1-3

NO BID

DIDNOT SUBMIT PAGES
FOR LINE {TEMS LISTED
ABOVE

$213,225.30

$300,947.40

LEFT BLANK

GROUP 1}:

The following itsms will be awarded as a total
iow bid basis. Vendor mus! bid both items to|
be awarded. ltems 4 and 5

MICRQSCOPE - Research Digita
Microscope, 2.0 megapixel, 1,600 x 1,280
resolution, true-color images with this
research-grade digital microscope.

Approved Brand: Wolfe DigiVu/Carolina
Binlogical #591300 or equal

EA

NO BID

NAT'L DC5-
163 WAL.S
48149-DG
PG5S89

$994.00 $3.976.00

$1.493.10

$5,972.40

1793-94 SEF
PG51

MICROSCOPE B Compule
siereomicroscepe, 2.0 megapixel, built in
high-resolution  camera  connecls g
compuer via USB 2.0.

Approved Brand: Wolle Digivu CM Caroling)
Biological #592016 or equal

EA

NO BID

NAT'L DC3-
420T
WLS48149-
DF PG590

$794.00 $5,588.00

$1.349.10

$9.443.70

57900-17
PG 55

TOTAL ITEMS 4 &5

NO BID

DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES
FOR LINE ITEMS LISTED
ABOVE

$9,534.00

$15,416.10

LEFT BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder In this box;

Bid No.  013-JJ0§

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER; Gladys Forero-Beltran

PLEASE-COMPLETE

AR

ACLFHIGHLI

BID PROPOSAL FORM (F(

DESCRIPTION OF {TEM

ESTiMA
TED
QUANT!
TY

UNIT
(UOM)

IF
PRICE || OFFERING

PASCO SCIENTIFIC

SARGENT-WELCH

SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS

SEMPCO, INC

OTHER
THAN

PER UNIT|| APPROVED Hunit Price

Total Price

Total Price

Manut & Madel ;Unit Price

Total Price

[Manuf & Modg

Totai Price

GROUP lil;

The following items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
itemns in Group to be awarded. ftems &
through 20,

CHART - PERIODIC TABLE. Each elemen
displays {UPAC name, symbol, atomi
weight, oxidation states; density, boiling and
melting  paints, number of naturalk

loceurring radioactive isotopes and pertinen
information for lhe most abundan
radioactive isotope,

EA

NO 81D

$601.63

$30.15

$512.55

61056-97

Approved Brands: Print Lab # 111015,
Fisher Science #545525 or equal

NO BID

CHART - ASTRONOMY/SOLARSYSTEM
Colorful Complete Set:

NQ BID

$3.071.52

$359.1Q

$4,308.2(

178119
PG447

Approved Brands: Denoyer Geppert #1940
41, Fisher Science #S2401141 or equat

CHART - WEATHER SERIES complete set
of 6 (including Weather Map) with
Chacthead/Tripod. Dimensions: 44" x 36".

16

EA

NO BID

$4,508.16

$391.5¢

$6,264.00

46341-00

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1930-
41, Fisher Science $2401041, or equal

NO B8iD

CHART - ZOOLOGY SET 21 Muiti Colored
Charts, Dimensions: 44" x 36" - complelg
series on charthead with tripod stand.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1394
41, Fisher Science $23151-41, or equai

EA

NO BID

NO BID

$2.089.52

$715.50

$2,862.00

SP1984-
41TEH

CHART - LIFE SCIENCE SERIES
complete biology charl series that surveys
and highlights the divesity of life with more
than 300 illustralions.

iApproved Brand: Oenoyer Geppert #1030-
41, Fisher Scientific #52305041 or Equal

EA

NO BIO

$2,483.84

$405.00)

$3,240.04

S0O1030-
41TEH

MAP-WEATHER MAP/PLOTTINGCHART)
Double sided chart helps sludents recor
and forecast weather condilions,

EA

NO BID

$2,494.41

$44.99

$2,294.48

DRY ERASE.
VERSION
[THE

[\BPTOVEd Brand: American Laucabonal
Products #462, Fisher Science #545523 or

Equal

MODEL - WMAP PROJECTION, Has three
(3) map projections: cylindrical, conical,
and azmuthal;

EA

NO BID

$1,302.88

$105.74

$1,797.74

64051

Approved Brand: American Educational
Producls #675, Fisher Science #545065 or
Equal

GLOBE - HYDROGRAPHIC RELIEF]
Depicts undersea geography and geclogy:

47

EA

NO BID

$5,486.31

$181.1(]

$7,571.74

63877-01

Page 12 '




Type or print the compiate

name of the bidder in this box:

PLEASE COMPLETE,

ALL HIGHUIGHTED AREA:

Bid No, 013-3J05

TITLE; SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Giadys Forero-Beltran

BiD PROPOSAL FORM (F(

iF T "
ESTIMA PRICE OFFERING PASCO SCIENTIFIC PEPCO, INC 1 SARGENT-WELCHVWR ! SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS SEMPCO, INC

TED OTHER H i
QUANTE UNIT THAN i |

ITEM DESCRIPTION GF {TEM TY {UOM)ii PER UNIT i APPROVED i{Unit Price {|Total Price Manuf & Moflunit Price || Total PridiManuf & 1 Unit Price Total Price Manuf & ModeldUnit Prics Total Price Manuf & Mode{|Unit Price Totat Price Manuf & Mo
RPETOVET BT8O, ATEITCAT EQUTanoTar i T
Products #8600, Fisher Science #S45163 ol : H
Equal, NO BID I 1
UM - ORBITER, - Mode] " T

14 j|designed to show basic earth and moo I |
motions. " EA NO BID V511364 $1.250.04 1 $156.83 $1.725.13 63873.01,
Approved Brand: American Educaticnal i i
Products #101, Fisher Science #S45168 or : H
Equal NO BID i i
MODEL - EARTHWORM Provides afl the . .

15 [imalerials needed to study the siruclures an i i
functions of the earthworm. 12 |l EA NO BID 59082  $1,089.84 ¢ 513925 $1,671.00 |lSPB1-4065
Approved Brand: American Educational ! '

Products #2756, Fisher Science #517907F 1 1
or Equal NO BID | i

46 |MODEL - GRASSHOPPER - Aclivily Sel i i
anatomical and cellular modet, 12 EA NO BID H $90.82 $1.080.84 H $139.24 $1,671.0{SP81-4067
/Approved Brand: American Educationat : H
Products #2753, Fisher Science #517128 or] ! !

Equat NG 8ID : )
MODEL - SOLAR SYSTEMCopernican, ' :

17 |iBase supports 2 6 in. diameter sun 1 1 63878-01
surrounded by nine planels. 14 EA NO BID N $74.514 $1,043.14 M $124.1d $1,738.24|PG457
Approved Brand; American coucatonal i 1
Products #200, Fisher Science #545193 or . i
Equal NO BID i 1

H .

18 MODEL - ANIMAL CELL - colored plasli I i
organelies are transiucent and Lransparent. 5 EA NO BID 1 $324.87 $1,624.35 1 $472.51 $2,362.50|67951-01
Approved Brand: Science Source #8-102, | i
Fisher Science #S17129ND or Equal NO BID H N
MODEL - CRAYFISH, Actvity Sel T T

19 analomicat and celiular models 12 EA NO BID H $20.82 $1.089.84 : $125.39 $1,503.96 {|68976-03
AL OVEL DI E I A IBULAI EUUCau 1 1
Products #2752, Fisher Science #S171282, H H
or Equal NO BID | 1

. GYROSCOPE, Single Form - ilustrates he H H

20 [lorinciple of the gyroscope and rotational _l !
inertia. 97 EA NO BID M $9.84 $954.48 . 38.99 $869.12 16202000
Approved Brand: American Educationai ! !

Products #7-795, Fisher Science #540959 . B
or Equal NO BID ! !
DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES  } H
TOTAL ITEMS 5-20 No BID FOR LINE ITems visTeD | $30,179.80 1 $40,392,64 LEFT BLANK

Page 13




Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

8id No,  013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES!

BUYER: Gladys Forero-8eltran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (Ft

iTEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA]
TED
QUANT!
TY

uNIT
{UoM};

PRICE

PER UNIT

IF
OFFERING

PASCO SCIENTIFIC

P

EPCO, INC |

SARGENT-WELCH/VWR

SCIENCE KiT & BOREAL LABS

SEMPCQ, INC

OTHER
THAN

APPROVED l|Unit Price

Total Price

Manul & Mo|

Unit Price

Totat Prig

Manul & KUnit Price

Total Price.

Manuf & Mode!

2Unit Price

Tolal Price

Manuf & Mode|

[Unit Price Tatal Price Manuf & Mo

21

GROUP 1V:
The foilowing items will be awarded on
totat low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. Items 21
through 24.

T HEAT,
(Sexless) Life size, Dissectible into 13 parls

Approved Brand: Carolina Biological #56-
6610 or Equal

EA

NQ BID

$344.53

$2.411.71

$1,935.04

$13,545.09

57935-01
PG 334

JODEL, DNA - Malecular model enlarge

100 miliion tlimes.

Approved Brand: T&S Educalional Products
#9-1G2, Fisher Science #325825 or Equal

EA

NO BID

$77.59

$1,396.62

SGT WELCH
WLS 61907~
32(360.05 &
WLS61907-
32P($17.54)

$134.94¢

$2,429.24

[56566.07
PG125

23

MODEL,” HUMAN SKELETON, Lie size

24

Life size - 5 pani plaslic reproduction of thg
alimentary tracl.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert 0143-
00, Fisher Science #5171592 or Equat

EA

NO BID

$501.45

$2,005.80

$378.0(

$1.512.04

[66724-43
PG A
IATTACHED

mounted on stand

Approved Brand: American 38 Scientific
#A10, Fisher Science #S171338 or Equal

EA

NO BID

TOTAL ITEMS 21-24

NO BID

DD NUT

ABOVE

FOR LINE ITEMS

$172.89

32,247.57

$620.1¢

$8,061.3(

67933-01

SUBMIT PAGES
LISTED

$8,061.7(

$25,547.54

LEFT BLANK

GROUP V;

The foliowing items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid afl
items in Group to be awarded, Items 25
through 30,

25

BALANCE Triple Beam, 610g capacity witt
0.1g readability.

[Approved Brands: Qhaus 750-80, Fisher
Science #540020 or equal

198

EA

NO BID

$85.20

$16.889.60

$139.5Q

$27,821.00

60375-00

AMERICAN]
SCIENFIC
BS5-2610

$62.00 $12,276.00

26

BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g
Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scieatific
S87074 or Equal

31

EA

NO BiID

$183.38

$5,684.78

$285.57

$8.852.67

47191-02

27

SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in.

‘Approved Brand: Bal-Art Products #H24962
Fisher Science $51222 or Equal

EA

NO BID

$292.74

$4.976.58

$324.0G

$5,508.01

68640-30

28

@HIELD, safety, curved, lhree sided,
36"high, 3/16 in.

Overall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 1/2D x
36in. H

[Approved Brand: Bel-Art Product:
#H249640000, Fisher Science 551223 of
Equal

EA

NO BID

$325.74

§977.22

$324.00

$972.04

58640-30
TEH PGE67

29

HOTPLATE high-visibiliy glass ceramic
lop. Approved Brand: Coming #6735-200.
Fisher Science S50442HP or Equal

106

EA

NO BID

$157.49

$16.693.94

$216.44

$22.943.7¢

62083-06

30

STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibilily glass
ceramic top, surface area: 4 X 5",
temperalure range 25 lo 550 deg.

Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, Fishes|
Science S50446HP or Equal

£A

NO 8i0

$299.94

$22.495.50

$410.81

$30.810.79

45113-00

TOTAL ITEMS 25-30

NO BID

DI NOT

ABOVE.

FOR LINE {TEMS LISTED

SUBWIT PAGES

$50,828.02

$96,708.14

QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT BID AL
ITEMS.
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box;

Bid No. 013-4J05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

8/D FROPOSAL FORM (F{

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA

QUANT!

TED

TY

PRICE

PER UNIT.

PASCO SCIENTIFIC PEPCO, INC

SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS

SEMPCO, INC

Totzl Price Manuf & MojiUnit Price | Totel Prig|Manuf & i} Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Modal iUnit Price

Manuf & Modajiunit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mog

GROUP Vi

The following items will be awarded on
an individual item basis, ltems 31
through 35.

31

equipment for electrophoresis of 12 gels a
one time.

(Approved Brand: Carolina Biologial
#213620 or equal

ELECTROPHURESTS, tqumeni
Package, Package conlains  enough

NO BID

$3.894.00

D
$15,576.00

LEFT
BLANK

33

34

LIGHT BOX & OFTICALSET - Tncludes
ilusirated experiment manual details 36

D perform in A
iApproved Brand: industrial Equipment &
Controf #HL2060-001, Fisher Science
#542208

66

PASCO
$42,573.30 ||0S-8500P

$92.95

$6,134.70

$210.24

68182-00
\W/68182.01
& 88182-02
PG813

RIPPLE TANK - Distortion-Tree, optically

clear plate glass bottom.

[Approved Brand: Science Source #15430,
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equal

108

CO
$70,389.30 [[WA-9899

$250.89

$26,584.34

$317.6¢

67310-85 PR

$23,451.44

[INST.
RH2401-A

36

AQUARIUMfreshwater sets, 30 gallon.
‘Approved Brand: Science Kit WWB0214 M
08 or Equal

NO BID

$158.87

$1,270.98

LEFT
BLANK

ITEMS 31, 33, 34, 36 INDIVIDUAL ITEM
BASIS

DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES
FOR LINE ITEMS LISTED
ABOVE.
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this hox;

Bid No. 013-4J03

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES:

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

PLEASE COMPLETE

ALL HIG

IGHYED AREA!

BID PROPOSAL FORM (F(

IF SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S
ESTIMA PRICE || OFFERING SUPPLY TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS NATURAL SGIENC
TED OTHER
QUANTH UNIT THAN
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY J{UOM)i PER UNIT|{ APPROVED [iUnit Price  {|Total Price Manuf & Mod|Unit Price [[Totat Price Manuf & Mog|Unit Price Total Price [Manuf & Model
QUALIFIED GROUPS | & li, LINE
\WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty i GROUPS I -V, LINEITEMS 4 {TEMS 1 -5, DID NOT BID ALL QUALIFIED BID. PRICES FIRM FOR 30
reater than 'one (1) year for aach itemyas THROUGH 30 WERE LEFT BLANK. ITEMS. DID NOT BID GROUPS DAYS, THROUGH OCT. 7, 2009. FREE
ﬁ appiies Y ) GROUP VI, LINE ITEMS 34, 33, 34 & jilll - V, LINE ITEMS 6 THROUGH 30ISHIPPING ON ORDERS TOTALING
ppies. 36 WERE LEFT BLANK. GROUP VI, DID NOT BID LINE  |$100.00 OR MORE.
ITEMS 31, 33, 34 & 386,
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items to be considered for award. ltems
1 through 3
MICRQSCOPE, monocular, ultra lite cool
1 light, fluorescent ilumination syslem; with KEN-A-
4X, 10X, 40XR objeclives; Stage: plain; ABCO MF- VISION
Condenser: N.A. 0.65;. 404 EA $144.00f $58.176.00[j0358 $177.0G1 $71,508.00 ||T1901 $339.99| $137,355.96125W6080
Appraved Brand:Swifl #M35010DF, Fisher
Scientific $19617-5 or Equal
MICROSCOPE,stereo, ullra fite illumination
2 with 1X, 3X objectives; W10XD, 23mm; KEN-A-
ituminalor: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen with ABCQ VISION
dimmaer switch, 143 EA $199.00] $28,457.00{{SMP13F $207.00| $29,601.00 |T2200
Approved Brand: Swilt #SM95-SMIO0HF,
Fisher Scientific $952658 or Equal
MICROSCOPE siereo, ultra fite illurninalion
3 {lwilh 1X, 2X objectives; W10XD, 23mm;
iluminaior: Incident - 6V, 20W Halogen wil ABCO
dirnmer switch | 147 EA $195.00f $29,233.00|SMP12F  |INO BID
[Approved Brand: Switt #8M31-SM80HF,
Fisher Scientific 395265A or Equal
QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT Bl QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT BID ALL
[TOTAL ITEMS 1-3 $115,886.00, ALL ITEMS. ITEMS.
GROUP if:
The following items will be awarded as a totall
low bid basis. Vendor must bid both items ta|
be awarded. Items 4 and 5
MICROSCOPE - Research Digita
Microscope, 2.0 megapixel, 1,600 x 1,280
4 resolulion, true-color images with thig KEN-A-
research-grade digital microscope. VISION T- BOREAL
4 EA $837.00 $3,348.00 {19841C $1,125.0( $4,500.00|24W0511
Approved Brand: Waife DigiVu/Carolina
Biological #591300 or equal
MICROSCOPE - Compufe]
stereomicroscope. 2.0 megapixel, builtin
5 high-resclution  camera  connects  t BOREAL
compuer via USB 2.0, 7 EA NO BID $1,150.00 $8,050.00 ||24W0513
Approved Brand: Wolfe Digivu CM Caroling|
Biological #592016 or equal
QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT Bt
TOTAL ITEMS 4 & 5 LEFT BLANK| ALL ITEMS. $12,550.04

Page 16




[Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

ALL HIGHLIGHTED'AREA

Bid No. 013-JJ0S

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (F(

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF {TEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT:
TY

unit
(uom)

PRICE i OFFERING

IF SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL

SUPPLY

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS

VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD’S
NATURAL SCIENC

OTHER
THAN
PER UNIT il APPROVED jUnit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mo

Unit Price

Tota} Price

Manuf & Modiunit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mode!

GROUP Iif:

The following items wili be awardad on
total law bid basis. Vendor must bid ajl
itermis in Group to be awarded. ltems 6
through 20.

NO BID

CHART - PERIODIC TABLE, Each element
displays IUPAC name, symbol, atomi
weight, oxidation states; density, boiting and
meiling  points, number of natural}

occurring radioactive isolopes and pertinent
information  for the most abundan(
ragioactive isotope.

EA

NO 8ID

Approved Brands: Print Lab #LL1015,
Fisher Science #545525 or equal

CHART - ASTRONOMY/SOLARSYSTEM
Caolorful Complele Set:

EA

INO BID

Approved Brands: Denoyer Geppest #1940
41, Fisher Science #52401141 or equal

CHART - WEATHER SERIES compiste sef|
of 8 (including Wealher Map) wilh
Charthead/Tripod. Dimensions: 44" x 36",

EA

NO BID

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1930-
41, Fisher Science 52401041, or equal

CHART - ZOOLOGY SET 21 Multi Colored
Charts, Dimensions: 44" x 38" - complels
series on charthead with tripod stand.

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1994
41, Fisher Science $S23151-41, or equal

EA

NO BID

CHART - LIFE SCIENCE SERIES
compiele biology chart series lhat surveys
and highlights the divesity of life wilh more
than 3Q0 illustrations,

Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert #1030«
41, Fisher Scientific #52305041 or Equal

EA

NO BID

(RPETOVEd Brand. American caucanona

MAP-WEATHER MAP/PLOTTINGCHART]
Double sided chart helps students record
and forecast weather conditions,

51

EA

NO BID

$68.06

$3,471.06

33W2280

Producls #462, Fisher Science #545523 or
Equal

MODEL - MAP PROJECTION, Has thrée
(3) map projections: cylindrical, conical,
and azmuthal;

EA

NO BID

$105.00

$1,785.00

80W6150

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #675, Fisher Science #545065 or
Equal

GLOBE - HYDROGRAPHIC RELIEF
Depicts undersea geography and geology;

EA

NO BID
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-4J05

[TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran

810 PROPOSAL FORM {F(

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
JED
QUANT!
TY

(UOM)

UNIT

PRICE

PER UNIT

SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL

SUPPLY

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS

VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S

NATURAL SCIENC

Total Price

Manuf & Mog|Unit Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Products #600, Fisher Science #545163 o1
Equal.

INO BID

PCANETBRIUM - ORBIER,  Wode
designed to show basic earth and moon
motions.

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #101, Fisher Science #S45169 or
Equal

EA

NO BID

$155.00

$1.705.00

80W8201

MODEL - EARTHWORM Provides all the
materials needed to study the structures and
functicns of the earthworm.

EA

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #2758, Fisher Science #S17907F
or Equal

INO BID

$125.00

$1,500.00

81W4085

MODEL - GRASSHOPPER - Activity Set
anatomical and celhutar model,

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #2753, Fisher Science #S17128 or|
Equat

EA

NO BiD

$126.00

$1,500.00

81W4087

MODEL - SOLAR SYSTEMCopernican,
Base supports a 6 in. diameter sun
surrounded by nine planets.

Approved Brang: Amencan aucatonal
Products #200, Fisher Science #545193 or
Equal

EA

NO BID

MODEL - ANIMAL CELL - colored plastid
organelles are transiucent and iransparent.
Approved Brand: Science Source #8-102,

Fisher Science #S17129ND or Equal

EA

INO BID

$445.00

$2.225.00

B81W4734

MODEL™ - CRAYFISH, Achvily Sel

anatomical and cellular models
AUPIUYEU DIgi. AIDE G GUUGE B

Products #2752, Fisher Science #5171282]
or Equal

EA

NO BiD

$124.00

$1,488.00

81W4066

20

GYROSCOPE, Single Form - Hlustrates thel
principle of the gyroscope and rotalional
inertia,

97

EA

NO BID

Approved Brand: American Educational
Products #7-795, Fisher Science #S40959
or Equal

TOTAL ITEMS 6-20

LEFT BLANK

QUALIFIED GROUP. DID |

ITEMS,
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

PLEASE COMPLETE.

ALLHIGHUIGHTED AREA!

Bid No.  013-JJ05

[TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran

BID PROPOSAL FORM {FC

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF {TEM

ESTIMA]
TED
QUANT:
TY.

UNIT
(uoM)]

PRICE || OFFERING

1 SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL

SUPPLY

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS

VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S

NMAYURAL SCIENC

OTHER
THAN
PER UNIT|] APPROVED ||Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Mog

Unit Price

[Total Price

[Manut & Mog|Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

21

GROUP 1V:
The foliowing items will be awarded on
total fow bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. Items 21
through 24,

- HUMAN TORSO AND HEAD,
(Sexiess) Life size, Dissectible into 13 parts|

/Approved Brand: Carolina Biological #56-
6610 or Equal

EA

NO BID

$489.08

$3.423.42

81W3090

MODEL, DNA -~ Molecular model enlargec

MODEL, HUMAN SRELETON, Ule size

100 million times.

Approved Brand: T&S Educational Products
#8-102, Fisher Science #525825 or Equal

EA

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

Life size - 5 part ptastic reproduction of the|
alimentary tract.

/Approved Brand: Denoyer Geppert 0143-
00, Fisher Science #5171592 or Equal

EA

NO BID

$647.10

$2,588.40

ISPECIAL D.G.
#0143-00

mounted on stand

Approved Brand: American 38 Scientific
#A10, Fisher Science #S17133B or Egual

EA

NG BID

$229.00

$2,977.00

82W3010

TOTAL ITEMS 21-24

LEFT BLANK]

NO BID

ITEMS.

QUALIFIED GROUP, DID NOT 81D ALL

GROUP V:

The following items wili be awarded on
totai low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. ltems 25
through 30.

INO BID

25

BALANCE Triple Beam, 610g capacity witf]
0,19 readability.

Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-80, Fisher
Science #540020 or equal

198

EA

NO BID

28

BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g
Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Etectronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scienlific
867074 or Equal

31

EA

NO BID

27

SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in.

Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products #H24962
Fisher Science $51222 or Equal

EA

NO BID

28

SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided.
367high, 3116 in.

Qverall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 1120 x
36in. H

Approved Brand: Bel-Art Producty
#H249640000. Fisher Science $51223 o
Equal

EA

INO BID

28

HOTPLATE high-visibilily glass ceramic
top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200,
Fisher Science S50442HP or Equal

106

EA

NO BID

30

STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic lop, surface area: 4 X 5",
temperature range 25 o 550 deg.
‘Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220. Fishey|
Science S50446HP or Equal

75

EA

NO BID

TOTAL ITEMS 25-30

LEFT BLAN

NO BID

LEFT BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box;

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

PLEASE COI

PLETE

Bi0 PROPOSAL FORM {F(

ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMA
TED
QUANT!

1Y iljuom)

UNIT

PRICE

PER UNIT

IF
OFFERING
OTHER
THAN
APPROVED

SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL

SUPPLY

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS

VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S

Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Mog

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & MaqgiUnit Price Total Price

NATURAL SCIENC

Manuf & Model

GROUP VI;

31

The following items wili be awarded on
an individual item basis. items 34
through 35.

|[ECECTROPHORESTS, Equipmen
Package, Package contains  enough
equipment for electrophoresis of 12 gels a
one lime.

Approved Brand: Carolina Biologial
#213620 or equal

EA

NO BID

LEFT
BLANK

33

LIGHT BOX & OPTICAL SET - Includes
illustrated experiment manual details 36
experiments perform in classroom.
Approved Brand: Industrial Equipment &
Control #HL2060-001, Fisher Science
1542208

66

EA

NO BID

LEFT
BLANK

34

RIPPLE TANK - Dislortion-Tree, oplically
ciear plate glass botlom.

Approved Brand: Science Source #15430,
Fisher Sclence #5520782 or Egual

106

NO BID

LEFT
BLANK

36

AQUARIUMfreshwater sels, 30 gallon.
Approved Brand: Science Kit WW60214 M
08 or Equal

EA

NO BID

LEFT BLANK

ITEMS 31, 33, 34, 36 INDIVIDUAL ITEM
BASIS

LEFT BLANK

NO BID
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