BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

behplels hame.df the Bidd

Bid #007-KK08

Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #007-KK06
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

)
Verified by: :

Buyer: G. Jackson

Dade Broward Supply Co.

Elan Lawn & Landscape Services

Florida Irrigation Supply

ITEM

DCPS #

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, iF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR

ltems 1 through 8 will be award on a total low bid basis.
Vendor must bid all items to be consldered for award.

559-0027

Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, 360 degree, full circle, 15' radius, 30
PSI. Approved Brand: Rainbird 15-F, 1800 series, no
substitute.

76

Each

$0.79

$60.04

Rainbird 15F

$1.21

$91.96

R/B 15F

$0.79

$60.04

15FRB

559-0108

Rotor, sprinkler, plastic, full circle, 5.0, Approved Brand:
Rainbird 5004-FC-8, no substitute.

66

Each

$5.59

$368.94

Rainbird 5004FC

$10.15

$669.90

R/B 5004
FC/5000 RC

$5.58

$368.28

5004 FC

559-0180

Spray, sprinkler, 4" stem, pop-up plastic, without nozzle,
Approved Brand: Rainbird 1804, no substitute.

127

Each

$1.19

$151.13

Rainbird 1804

$1.95

$247.65

R/B 1804R

$1.15

$146.05

1804

559-1422

Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, 90 degree, quarter circle, 15' radius,
30 PSI, Approved Brand: Rainbird 15-Q, 1800 series, no
substitute.

75

Each

$0.79

$59.25

Ralnbird 15Q

$1.21

$80.75

R/B 15Q

$0.79

$59.25

15Q RB

559-1431

Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, 180 degree, half circle, 15' radius,
30 PSI, Approved Brand: Rainbird 15-H, 1800 series, no
substitute.

424

Each

$0.79

$334.96

Rainbird 15H

$1.21

$513.04

R/B 16H

$0.79

$334.96

15HRB

559-1465

Spray, sprinkler, 3" stem, pop up, plastic, without nozzle,
Approved Brand: Rainbird 1803, no substitute.

103

Each

$1.71

$176.13

Rainbird 1803

$3.14

$323.42

R/B 1803R

$1.65

$169.95

1803

559-1481

Rotor, sprinkler, plastic, half circle, 180 degree, with #12
nozzle, Approved Brand: Rainbird 6504, Falcon series, no
substitute.

444

Each

$18.95

$8,413.80

Rainbird F4PC

$28.75

$12,765.00

R/B F4PC12

$18.55

$8,236.20

F4PCA

559-1511

Rotor, sprinkler, plastic, full circle, 360 degrees, with #12
nozzle, Approved Brand: Rainbird 6504, Falcon series, no
substitute.

331

Each

$18.95

$6,272.45

Rainbird F4FC

$28.75

$9,516.25

R/B FAFC12

$18.55

$6,140.05

F4FC1

TOTAL LOW

$15,836.70

$24,217.97

$15,514.78
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Bid #007-KK08

Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid #007-KK06
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

Buyer: G. Jackson

Hector Turf John Deere Landscapes

Lane Supply Services

ITEM{| DCPS #

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT

Unit Price

Total Price | Manuf & Model | Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Manuf & Model

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
'WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE YEAR

ltems 1 through 8 will be award on a total low bld basls.
Vendor must bid all ltems 1o be considered for award.

1 | 559-0027

Nozzle, sprinkier, plastic, 360 degree, full circle, 15’ radius, 30
P8I Approved Brand: Rainbird 15-F, 1800 series, no
substilute.

76

Each

NQO BID

$0.77 $58.52 R15F

$1.02

$77.52

AS SPECIFIED

2 11 559-0108

Rolor, sprinkler, plastic, full circle, 5.0, Approved Brand:
Rainbird 5004-FC-8, no substilute,

66

Each

NO BID

$5.59 $368.94 5004-FC

$6.92

$456,72

AS SPECIFIED

3 | 559-0180

Spray, sprinkler, 4" stem, pop-up plastic, without nozzle,
Approved Brand: Rainbird 1804, no substituts.

127

Each

NO BID

§1.18 $147.32 1804P

$1.70

$215.90

AS SPECIFIED

4 || 559-1422

Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, 80 degree, quarter circle, 15' radius,
30 P8I, Approved Brand: Rainbird 15-Q, 1800 series, no
substitute,

75

Each

NO BiD

$0.77 $57.75 R15Q

$1.02

$76.50

AS SPECIFIED

5 i 559-1431

Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, 180 degree, half circle, 15' radius,
30 PSI, Approved Brand: Rainbirg 15-H, 1800 series, no
substitute.

424

Each

NO BID

$0.77 $326.48 R15H

$1.02

$432.48

{AS SPECIFIED

& |l 659-1465

Spray, sprinkier, 3" stem, pop up, plastic, without nozzle,
Appraved Brand: Rainbird 1803, no substitute.

103

Each

NO BID

§1.65 $169.85 1803P

31.71

$176.13

AS SPECIFIED

7 |l 559-1481

Rotor, sprinkler, plastic, half circle, 180 degrae, with #12
nozzle, Approved Brand: Rainbird 6504, Falcon serles, no
substitute,

Each

NO BID

$18.15 $8,058.60 F4-PC

$24.90

$11,055.60

A8 SPECIFIED

8 |l 559-1511

Rotor, sprinkler, plastic, full circle, 360 degrees, with #12
nozzle, Approved Brand: Rainbird 6504, Falcon serles, no
substitute.

Each

NO BID

$18.15 $6,007.65 F4-FC

$24.90

$8,241.90

AS SPECIFIED

TOTAL LOW

$15,195.21

$20,732.75
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lcbhptets hamie.af the Bladd

Bid #007-KK08

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bld #007-KK086
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

'

Prepared by:

Verified by:

Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf
Dade Broward Supply Co. Elan Lawn & Landscape Services Florida Irrigation Supply
Buyer; G. Jackson -
ESTIMATED . . o . P .
ITEM|| DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT ¥ Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Modelif Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Model [{ Unit Price| Total Price | Manuf & Model
Iltems 9 through 16 will be awarded on a total low bid
hasis. Vendor must bid all items to be consldered for
award.
Rotor, ‘sprinkler, adj ARC, part circle, with 6.0 nozzle,
9 | 559-1279 Approved Brand: Toro TREOP series, no substitute, 808 Each } $8.85 $7,958.80 | Toro TR50P $16.34 | $13,202.72 | Toro RRSOP $9.64 $7,789.12 TR50P
Nozzle, sprinkler, 360 degree, full circle, Approved Brand: _ Toro 15F-NZ-
10 || 559-0205 Toro 15F-F 570 series, part # 89-1764, no substitute, 608 Each ] $0.98 $595.84 Toro 89-1764 $1.81 $1,100.48 WSCN $0.96 $583.68 15F
Spray, sprinkler, 4" stem, pop-up, without nozzle, Approved g
11 || 559-0264 Brand: Toro 570Z-4P, part # 83-3978, no subsfitute, 1288 Each§ $1.33 $1,713.04 | Toro 89-3978 $2.24 $2,885.12 | Toro 570Z-4P | $1.29 $1,661.52 57024P
Nozzle, sprinkler, 90 degrees, quarter circle - Approved Brand: -~ Toro
12 }| 559-0289 Tore 15Q-NZ, 570 serles, part # 85-1769, no substitute, 724 Each § $0.98 $709.52 Toro 89-1769 $1.81 $1,310.44 15QNZWSCN $0.96 $695.04 15Q
Nozzie, sprinkier, 180 degrees, Approved Brand: Toro 15H, . Toro
13 1t 559-0302 570 serles, part # 89-1767, no substitute. 1,508 Each § $0.98 $1,477.84 | Toro 89-1767 $1.81 $2,729.48 15HNZWSCN $0.96 $1,447.68 15H
Spray, sprinkler, 3" stem, pop up plastic, without nozzle,
14 || 859-0311 || Approved Brand: Toro 570Z-3P, Z serles, part # 89-3977, no 900 Each § $1.65 $1,485.00 | Toro 89-3977 $2.61 $2,348.00 | Toro 570Z 3P $1.60 $1,440.00 570Z3P
substitute.
15 | 5590141 | Valve: auick coupler, Approved Brand: Toro 473-00. no 13 Each | $24.00 | $31200 |Toro075-SLSC| $57.37 | $74581 | Tooum-00 | $2319 | $30147 47300
Key, quick coupler, Approved Brand: Toro 463-01, no .
16 || 559-0159 substitute (for above valve) 13 Each § $16.52 $214.76 | Toro 075-SLK || $53.62 $697.06 Toro 463-01 $15.97 $207.61 463-01
TOTAL LOow $14.,466.80 $25,020.11 $14,126.12
ltems 17 and 18 will be awarded on a total low bid basis.
Both items must be compatible and made by the same
manufacturer. Vendor must bid both items fo be
considered for award.
Vé!ve quick coulper, Approved Brand: Nelson 7642, no Signiture
17 i 559-0035 ' ' substitute . : 18 Each § $35.22 $633.96 Control Sys $44.92 $808.56 Nelson 7642 | $28.69 $516.42 7642
: 7642
Key, quick coupler, Approved Brand: Nelson 7641, no Signiture
18 ji 559-0051 substitute (for above valve), 15 Each § $25.18 $377.70 Cor;!;zlfys $37.78 $566.70 Nelson 7641 $24.12 $361.80 7641
TOTAL LOW $1,011.66 $1,375.26 $878.22
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Ty
leoshplets

b bidde

Bid #007-KK06

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid #007-KK06

Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

Title: Sprinkiers, Lawn and Turf
Hector Turf John Deere Landscapes Lane Supply Services
Buyer: G. Jackson
mEM|| DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM %%Tm?rﬁ:’ UNIT || Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Modet | Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Model | Unit Price | Total Price | Manur & Model
ltems 9 through 16 will be awarded on a total low bid
basis. Vendor must bid all items to be considered for
award,
9 | 5591279  Rotor sprinkler, ad] ARC, pant circle, with 8.0 nozzle, 808 Each| $11.31 | $9.13848 | ToroTRS0P || $965 | $7.767.20 TREOP $12.13 | $9.801.04 |AS SPECIFIED
Approved Brand: Toro TR50P series, no substitute.
g Nozzie, sprinkler, 360 degree, full circle, Approved Brand: 9 83.68 F 1.35 820.80 | AS SPECIFIED
10 1 858.0208 | 0 e ror Bty o ves B 608 Each| $1.13 | $687.04 | ToroB0-1764 | $0.96 | $58a. T15 $1. $
Spray, sprinkler, 4" stem, pop-up, without nozzle, Approved g 165 2.125.20 | AS SPECIFIED
118500284 | 0 eem, oer gy norai. hPDIO 1288 | Each) $1.81 | $2331.28 | Toro893978 | $1.20 | $1,661.52 5707-4P $1. $2,126.
y Nozzle, sprinkler, 90 degrees, quarter circle - Approved Brand: = 95.04 T 1.2¢ $933.96 | AS SPECIFIED
12 |1659:0208 0 S o e o 1oy, Hoproved B 724 Each| $1.13 | 881842 | Toro89=1760 | $0.96 | $695. 150 $1. )
13 || 550.0302 | NoZ2le, sprinkler, 180 degrees, Approved Brand: Toro 15H, 1508 [ Each| $1.43 | $1.704.04 | Toro89-1767 || $0.96 | $1.447.68 T15H $1.29 | $1,945.32 |AS SPECIFIED
§70 serles, part # 89-1767, no substitute.
Spray, sprinkier, 3" stem, pop up plastic, without nozzle,
14 | 559-0311 || Approved Brand: Toro 5702-3P, Z series, part # 89-3977, no 900 Each| $1.80 | $1,701.00 | Toro89-3977 | $1.60 | $1,440.00 5707-3P $2.10 | $1,890.00 | AS SPECIFIED
substitute.
15 | 550.0141 ||  Valve. quick coupler, AS’Z‘L';’:{&‘:EB“”“: Toro 473-00, no 13 Each || $31.25 | $406.25 | Toro473-00 | $2325 | $302.25 075-8LSC | $25.74 | $33462 |AS SPECIFIED
16 || 5500159 | @Y quick coupler, Approved Brand: Toro 463-01, no 13 Each| $21.90 | $284.70 | Toro463-01 | $1599 | $207.67 076-SLK $18.15 | $235.95 |AS SPECIFIED
substitute (for above valve)
TOTAL LOW $17,070.91 $14,135.24 $18,086.89
items 17 and 18 will be awarded on a total low bid basis.
Both items must be compatible and made by the same
manufacturer, Vendor must bid both items to be
consldered for award.
17 || 559-0035 || Vave. quick coulper, A:ft:;\ﬁeamd: Nelson 7642, no 18 Each | NOBID $2860 | $51642 | 784200V | $39.79 | $71622 |AS SPECIFIED
18 || 550-0051 | 1@ quick coupler, Approved Brand: Nelson 7641, no 15 Each| NOBID $24.15 | $362.25 7641P $28.50 | $427.50 |AS SPECIFIED
substitute {for above valve).
TOTAL LOW $878.67 $1,143.72
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BID PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B}

Cyie o i
letripleta hame.of the sldder;

Bid #007-KK08

The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Florida
Bid #007-KK06
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

Prepared by:

Verified by:

Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf
Dade Broward Supply Co. Elan Lawn & Landscape Services Florida Irrigation Supply
Buyer: G. Jackson
ESTIMATED . . R . . .
ITEM[I DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY UNIT § Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Model | Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Mode! || Unit Price| Total Price | Manuf & Model
ltems 19 through 29 wiil be awarded on a total low bid
basis. Vendor must bid al! items to be considered for
award.
Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, strip pattern, 4 x 30', 30 PSI. .
19 Approved Brand: Rainbird 15CTS, 1800 serlas. no substitute. 50 Each § $0.79 $39.50 |Rainbird 15CSTI| $1.21 $60.50 R/B 15CST $0.79 $39.50 15 CST
Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, rotary, 180 degree. Approved Brand: Rainbird
20 Ralnbird R17-24H, 1800 serles. no substitute. 30 Each | $2.54 $76.20 R1724H $3.98 $119.40 R/B R1724H $2.44 $73.20 R17-24H
Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, rotary, 90 degree. Approved Brand: Rainbird g
2 Rainbird R17-24Q, 1800 serles. no substitute. % Eechj $254 | 87620 | ik || 9398 | 811940 | mervaa | $244 | $73.20 Ri7240
Station, controller, expandable 8 zone, ESP L.X commercial Rainbird
2 exterior. Approved Brand: Ralnbird ESP LXM. no substitute. 10 Fach § $17200 | $1.72000 | popyxy | $26924 | $259240 | mmeseuor | §165.45 | §1,654.50 B8P
Statlon, module, controller, expandable plug in 8 zone Ralnbird RiB
23 module, ESP LX commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird ESP 20 Each | $62.61 | $1,252.20 $93.94 $1,878.80 $59.99 $1,198.80 | ESPLXM-SM8
ESPLXMSM8 ESPLXMSM8
LXMSMS. no substitute.
DTC cartridge, controller, IQ communication cartidge, ESP LX
24 commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird U-DTC-LXM-PR. no 10 Each | $401.40 | $4.014.00 | | RENOIC  goy 5 | sg205.50 |[RBUDTCLXMI cave oo | 4375000 | U-DTCAXMPR
N UDTCLXMPR PR
substitute.
Rotors, swing joint, flexible 3/4" PVC connection with pressure Rainbird
25 regulation, commercial, Approved Brand: Rainbird TSJ-075- 30 Each | $21.42 $642.60 $28.71 $861.30 |R/B TSJO75PRS] $18.33 $549.90 TSJ-075-PRS
N TSJO75PRS
PRS. no substitute.
Rotars, swing Joint, flexible 1" PVC connection with pressure Rainbird
28 regulation, commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird TSJ-100- 90 Each § $23.55 | $2,119.50 $31.52 $2,836.80 |R/B TSJ100PRS| $22.45 $2,020.50 TSJ100PRS
: TSJ100PRS
PRS. no substitute.
Automatic, valves, plastic 2" peb with solenoid, commercial. Rainbird
27 Approvad Brand: Rainbird 200-PEB. no substitute, 15 Each § $85.17 | $1,277.55 200PEB $127.77 | $1,916.55 R/B200 PEB | $81.59 | $1,223.85 200PEB
Automatic, valves, plastic/brass hybrid 3" BPE with solenold, Rainbird
28 commerclal. Approved Brand: Rainbird 300-BPE. no 12 Each § $186.10 | $2,233.20 3008PE $279.16 | $3,340.92 R/B 300 BPE || $178.27 | $2,139.24 300BPE
substitute,
Boxes, valves, plastic rectangular 21.8 x 16.6 x 12.0, with Rainbird
29 green lid marked irrigation, commercial. Approved Brand: 30 Each | $17.61 $528.30 $8.01 $240.30 R/BVBSTDL | $17.03 $510.90 VB-8TD
Co VBSTD
Rainbird VB-STD-L. no substituts.
TOTAL LOW $13,979.25 $20,180.87 $13,234.59
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid #007-KK06
Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}
176 b, the
wriplete hamb.df b Bidder? .
Bid #007-KK06
Title: Sprinklers, Lawn and Turf
Hector Turf John Deere Landscapes Lane Supply Services
Buyer: G. Jackson
em| DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM O T AMATED | UNIT |l UnitPrice | Total Prics | Manuf & Model | Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Modsi | Unit price | Total Price | Manuf & Model
Items 19 through 29 will be awarded on a total low bid
basis. Vendor must bid all items to be considered for
4
Nozzle, sprinkler, blastic, strip pattern, 4 x 30", 30 PSI.
19 Approved Brand: Rainbird 15GTS, 1800 series. no substitute. 50 Each § NO BID 50.77 $38.50 R15CST $1.02 $51.00 | AS SPECIFIED
Nozzle, sprinkier, plastic, rotary, 180 degree. Approved Brand:
20 Rainbird R17-24H, 1800 serfes. no substilute. 30 Each |l NOBID $2.45 $73.50 R17-24H $2.98 $89.40 | AS SPECIFIED
Nozzle, sprinkler, plastic, rotary, 90 degree. Approved Brand:
21 Rainbird R17-240, 1800 series. no substitute, 30 Each | NOBID $2.45 $73.50 R17-24Q $2.98 $89.40 | AS SPECIFIED
Station, controller, expandable 8 zone, ESP LX commercial
22 exterior, Approved Brand: Rainbird ESP LXM. no substitute. 10 E.ach NO BID $166.50 | $1,665.00 ESPLXM $197.52 | $1,975.20 | AS SPECIFIED
Station, module, controller, expandable plug in 8 zone
23 module, ESP LX commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird ESP 20 Each || NOBID $59.99 $1,199.80 ESPLXMSM8 $71.58 $1,431.80 | AS SPECIFIED
LXMSM8. no substitute,
DTC carfridge, controller, IQ communication cartidge, ESP LX
24 commercial, Approved Brand: Rainbird U-DTC-LXM-PR. no 10 Each i NOBID $415.00 | $4,150.00 | V-DTC-LXM-PR} $560.81 [ $5,608.10 | AS SPECIFIED
substitute.
Rotors, swing Joint, flexible 3/4" PVC connection with pressure.
25 regulation, commercial. Approved Brand: Ralnbird TSJ-075- 30 Each || NO BID $18.40 $652.00 TSJO75PRS $21.62 $648.60 | AS SPECIFIED
PRS. no substitute.
Rotars, swing joint, flexible 1" PVC connection with pressure .
26 regulation, commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird TSJ-100- 90 Each || NOBID $20.25 $1,822.50 TSJ100PRS $25.80 $2,322.00 | AS SPECIFIED
PRS. no substitute.
Automatic, vaives, plastic 2" peb with solenoid, commercial.
27 Approved Brand: Rainbird 200-PEB. no substitute, 15 Each || NOBID $81.75 $1,226.25 200PEB $104.08 | $1,561.20 |AS SPECIFIED
Automatle, valves, plastic/brass hybrid 3" BPE with solenoid,
28 commercial. Approved Brand: Rainbird 300-BPE. no 12 Each | NOBID $178.50 | $2,142,00 300BPE $282.92 | $3,395.04 | AS SPECIFIED
substitute.
Boxes, valves, plastic rectangular 21.8 x 16.6 x 12.0, with
29 green lid marked Irrigation, commercial. Approved Brand: 30 Each | NO BID $5.13 $153.90 VB-STD-L $16.40 $492.00 | AS SPECIFIED
Ralnblrd VB-STD-L. no substitute.
TOTAL LOW $13,096.95 $17,663.54
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