Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 0134405

: TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

81D PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid No.013-JJ05

%

hool Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
{CE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Cg(’o“\

Verified By: Y/
—— 2N
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran Date; 9 q
OTHER l !
THAN
APPROVED
BRAND, CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY BENZ MICROSCOPE BIO COMPANY, INC CAPITAL MICROSCOPE SERVICES CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS- co.
TED MANUFACTU
QUANTH! UNIT RER & Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY [{UOM)H| PER UNIT MODEL ||Unit Price Total Price Model Unit Price  i{Total Price Model Unit Price {iTotal Price Manuf & Modl{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode{iUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod|
o ) QUALIFIED BID. MiN. ORDER: $25.00 QUALIFIED LINE ITEMS 38, 38 & 40... NGy
WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty if PER SHIPPING LOCATION, SHIPPING,  BID ON LINE ITEM #38 OTHERS MIN. ORDER, HOWEVER, A $3.00
greater than one {1) year for each item CHARGES WILL APPLY T('D ORDERS LEFT BLANK’ DID NOT BID THESE LINE ITEMS HANDLING CHARGE WILL BE ADDED TO
as it applies. UNDER $25.00 ) SHIPMNTS TOTALING LESS THAN $25.00,
: EXCL. FREIGHT
GROUP V:
The following items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded, ltems 25
through 30.
25 BACANCE, Triple” Beam, 6109 capaci
with 0.1g readability. 198 EA
Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-S0, Fisher LEFT LEFT
Science #340020 or equal LEFT BLANK BLANK NO BID $139.50 327,621.00 70-2150 [iBLANK
BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g
26 Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific LEFT LEFT
S87074 or Equal 31 EA LEFT BLANK BLANK NOQ BID 3300.60 $9.318.60 |70-2441 BLANK
27 SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in, 17 EA
Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products LEFT LEFT
#H24962, Fisher Science $51222 or Equa LEFT BLANK BLANK NO BID $323.95 | $5.507.15 | 64-6350 [BLANK
SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
28 367high, 3/16 in.
Overall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 /2D x
36in. H
Approved  Brand:  Bel-Art  Productg
#H249640000, Fisher Science $51223 o LEFT LEFT
Equal 3 EA LEFT BLANY BLANK NO BID $369.00 $1,107.00 l64-6355 BLANK
HOTPLATE, high-visibilily glass ceramic
29 jtop. Approved Brand: Coming #6795-200, LEFT LEFT
Fisher Science $50442HP or Equal 106 EA LEFT BLANK BLANK NO BID $199.12 || $21,106.72170-1011A  |[BLANK
STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass '
ceramic top, surface area: 4 X 5%,
30 jjtemperature range 25 o 550 deg.
Approved Brand: Coming #6795-220, LEFT LEFT
Fisher Science S50446HP or Equal 75 EA LEFT BLANK BLANK NO BID $379.191 $28,439.25{|70-10124 ||BLANK
TOTAL ITEMS 25-30 LEFT BLANK| LEFT BLANK NO BID $93,099.72 LEFT BLANK
GROUP Vi:
The foliowing items will be awarded on
an individual item basis. Items 31
through 35.
STERILIZER, Porlable Sieam Pressure
32 Non-electric 11 EA
APProvea grana: Laronna oiiogial LEFT
#701696 or equal $279.00 $3,069.00 82981 NO BID $413.10 [ 54.544.10 | 70-1696 JIBLANK
PLETANK - Dislorlion-Tree, oplically
34 clear plate glass bottom, 106 EA
SCIENCE
Approved Brand: Science Source #15430 SOURCE LEFT
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equal $299.00 Ji $31.694.00 || #P111 NO BID $310.50 | $32.913.00 || 75-a170 [BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran

IGHLIGHTE

Moy

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Bid No.013-JJ05

OTHER FISHER SCIENCE
THAN PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR FREY SCIENTIFIC
APPROVED GROUP VI, ITEM 37. ALTERNATE FOR|  PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY EOR
BRAND, GROUP Vi, ITEM 32, AND ITEMS 38 || GROUP Vi, ITEM 34; ALTERNATE FOR]
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC. AND 39. GROUP VI, ITEM 37 PARA SCIENTIFIC
TED MANUFACT
QUANTIH UNIT RER & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Y {UOM}|| PER UNIT MODEL _ [iUnit Price || Total Price Manut & Md)Unit Price Total Price  JIManuf & Modl{Unit Price Total Price Model Uit Price Totai Price Manuf & Model JlUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
- N QUALIFIED GRP V, BID LINE
V‘;ﬁ;’rﬂ:n :::;3?:;?:;&2::?&: ITEMS 25 & 26 ONLY. BID ON ITEMS 38 THROUGH 40; QUALIFIED GROUP V-ITEMS 25:30. DID| b o o e
as it applies * DID NOT SUBMIT PAGE FOR OTHERS LEFT BLANK. NOT BID ALL ITEMS
* LINE ITEMS 34, 35,37 & 38,
GROUP V:
The following items will be awarded on
total fow bid basis. Vendor must bid ail
items in Group to be awarded. ltems 25
through 30,
BALANCE, Tfiple Beam, 6103 capadi OHAUS 750-

25 lwith 0.1 readabiliy. 198 || EA $95.19)| 518,847.62 |50 ADAM
Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-S0, Fisher $40020 ALT: 1017514 EQuIP.
Science #840020 or equal $106.00 | $20,988.00 || BAL-310 577.50 || $15.345.00 || FISHER || _ $59.50) - $11,781.00 [FREYBRAND || ss550 | 342.989.00(" BBO10S
BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g

28 Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202 ADAM
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific S67074 OHAUS EQUIP.
S67074 or Equal 31 EA $106.00] $3,286.00 [BAL 310 $188.77 )| $5.882.87 ||FISHER $209.68 )|  $6,500.08 [[SPE202 $182.84 ) 55,048.04#CQT202

ALTADAM
$144.46 $4,478.26 [[#CQT202

27 SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in. 17 EA
Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products 551222 BEL BEL ART
#H24962, Fisher Science §51222 or Equa $289.96 )| $491572 | FISHER || $307.48 | $5.227.16 |ART#24962 | $277.99 || $4.725.83 | #H24962
SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,

28 36"high, 3/16 in.

Overall dimensions; 19 1/2W x 6 1/2D x

36in. H

Approved  Brand:  Bel-Ant  Product

#H249640000, Fisher Science 554223 o $51223 LEFT BEL ART BEL ART
Equal 3 EA $326.75 $980.25 FISHER || BLANK l#H24964 $311.72 || 593516 || #H24964
HOTPLATE, high-visibility glass ceramic

29 |itop. Approved Brand: Corning #5795-200, S$50442HP CORNING CORNING
Fisher Science S50442HP or Equal 106 EA $172.90]] $18,327.40||FISHER $151.66| $16,075.96 ||#6795-200 $164.90 || $17,479.40/6795-200
STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic top, surface area: 4 X 5",

30 jemperature range 25 to 550 deg.

Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, S50446HP CORNING - ICORNING
Fisher Science S50448HP or Equal 75 EA 5321.641 $24,123.00 {FISHER $277.88]1 $20,841.00 l[#6795-220 $313.351| $23,501.2516795-220
QUALIFIED GROUP. DI NOT CEFT QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT BiD ALL
TOTAL ITEMS 25-30 BID ALL ITEM BLANK $69,574.24 ITEMS $64,658.68
GROUP Vi
The following items will be awarded on
an individual item basis. items 31
through 35.
STERILIZER, Poriable Sleam Pressure v H

32 Non-electric, 11 EA 1 WISCONSY
APPrOVEd orana: Laronna siologial LEFT N N ALUM \WISCONSIN LEFT
#701696 or equal BLANK LEFT BLANK 1526431 || 5290741 1825X | $287.44 | $3.151.84 |laLum 1925X _|BLANK
RIPFLE TANK - Distoriion-free, oplically

34 clear plate glass bottom. 106 EA H

SCIENCE
Approved Brand: Science Source #15430 “SEE SOURCE LEFT
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equai ABOVE LEFT BLANK $248.81 || $26.37386 || $520782 | 5219.991 $23.318.94]15430 BLANK
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Type or print the compiete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No.013-JJ05

hool Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
{CE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Bid No. 013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES Verified By:
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran Date:
OTHER
THAN
APPROVED
BRAND, CONNECTICUT VALLEY BIOLOGICAL SUPPLY
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY BENZ MICROSCOPE BIO COMPANY, INC CAPITAL MICROSCOPE SERVICES CAROLINA BIOLOGICALS- €O,
TED MANUFACTU
QUANTH UNIT RER & Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY [{{UOM)|| PER UNIT MODEL _{|Unit Price Total Price Model Unit Price i Total Price Model Unit Price _[{Total Price Manuf & Modl{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod
Laboratory chemicals will be awarded t
the vendor offering the highest
39 percentage discount off pre-printed
catalog or price list(s). Please provide
information below for item #39.
Ej
Fixed j|Effect
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG % ve
YEAR FOR ITEM #39 Discoufl Dates Exceptions
QUALIFIED LINE
ITEM. SEE
ABOVE. 20%
DISC. 2009-2010
SCIENCE CAT;
_% 20% HAZARD
Catalog 10% DISC. OFF OF PUBLISHED MATLS;
/ Price CATALOG. THESE ARE PUBLISHED SURCHARGE VIA
List LEFT BLANK NQ BID JANUARY OF EACH YEAR. uPS
Zﬁl},‘;j;ﬁ,":h?;‘,f,:;f :;dc:iimnate"a' Check one: Yes FREE FREIGHT ON ALL ITEMS
chemicals: Ne EXCEPT FOR GEMS, MATH-OUT-OF-
THE BOX, STC & STC/MS KITS,
REFURB. SETS & PRINTED MAT.
If yes, please list chemical{s) for which hazardous material charge will apply
(type or print legibly): FL, FS, CS,
TX, CM, OM, AM 011, AM 012,
DWW, CK, AM 02, AM 11, BR
OX,8CX, FX, 150C, BR 150D,
LEFT BLANK NQO BID CX B8R 180C, BR 1800
BALANCE QF LINE: Percentage discount off pre-printed catalog or price list(s) to
awarded vendors as primary and/for alternate. Additional Shipping Charges for
4p |Hazardous and Live Materials are to be noted in the exception column. Freight
and delivery charges for all other supplies and equipment should be factored into tH
% off list provided. No additional freight charges will be accepted on these items.
Single Fixe % || Effective
NAME OF CATALOG Discount (-) Dates  Exceptions
10% DISC. 2009-
QUALIFIED LINE ITEM #40- MIN. 2010 SCIENCE
% ORDER: §25 PER SHIP. LOC. & SHIP| 10% DISC. OFF OF PUBLISHED CAT. 1//09-
Catalog/Price CHARGES TO ORDERS UNDER $25. CATALOG. THESE ARE PUBLISHED 12/31/10- SEE
List DISC: 10% SEE BID COMMENTS LEFT BLANK NO BID JANUARY OF EACH YEAR. LTR.
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Type or print the complate The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

ame of the bidder n this box: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Bid No.013-JJ05

Bid No. 013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FQ

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

OTHER “FISHER'SCIENCE
THAN PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR FREY SCIENTIFIC
APPROVED GROUP VI, ITEM 37. ALTERNATE FOR|  PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
BRAND, GROUP VI, ITEM 32, AND ITEMS 38 || GROUP Vi, ITEM 34; ALTERNATE FOR|
ESTIMA, PRICE SPECIFY EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC. AND 39. GROUP VI, ITEM 37 PARA SCIENTIFIC
TED MANUFACT!
QUANTI|} UNIT RER & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY [[{UOM}]| PER UNIT MODEL _ [lunit Price [{Total Price Manuf & Md|Unit Price Total Price  |iManuf & Mod|iUnit Price Total Price Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode! fjunit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model;
- . . QUALIFIED GRP V, BID LINE
V;’:f;g“;:;‘ ° f:?;';g;i‘;":’g:':gr: ITEMS 25 & 26 ONLY. BID ON ITEMS 38 THROUGH 40; QUALIFIED GROUP V-ITEMS 26:30.0D) . 1oye oo oo
as it applies * DID NOT SUBMIT PAGE FOR OTHERS LEFT BLANK. NOT BID ALL ITEMS .
’ LINE {TEMS 34, 35,37 & 38,

GROUP V:

The following items will be awarded on

total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all

items in Group to be awarded. items 25]

through 30.
T - |BALEBNCE, Iriple Beam, 510§ capaoin OHAUS 750-

25 llwith 0.1 readability. 198 | Ea $95.19] $18,847.62 |80 ADAM
Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-S0, Fisher 840020 ALT: 1017514 EQuIP.
Science #540020 or equal $106.00 || $20,988.00 || BAL-310 $77.50 )| $15345.00 || FISHER $59.50) $11.781.00|FREYBRAND | $g5.50 | 512.969,00]" Co0 109
BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g

26 Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202 ADAM
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific S67074 OHAUS EQUIP,
S67074 or Equal 31 EA $106.00 || $3,285.00 |[BAL 310 $189.77 i $5,882.87 (FISHER $2089.68 1  $6,500.08 [[SPE202 $162.84 ] $5048.04#CQT202

ALT ADAM
$144.48 $4,478.26 1#CQT202

27 SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in. 17 EA
Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products $51222 BEL BEL ART
#H24962, Fisher Science 551222 or Equa $289.16 $4.915.72 | FISHER || $307.48 || $6227.16 ||ART#24962 || $277.99 | 54.725.83 | #H24962
SHIELD, safety. curved, three sided,

28 36"high, 3/16 in.

Overali dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 1/2D x

36in. H

Approved  Brand: Bel-Art  Productd

#H249640000, Fisher Science $51223 o 551223 LEFT BEL ART BEL ART
Equal 3 EA 832675 $980.25 FISHER || BLANK l#H24964 §311.72 )| $935.18 || #H24964
HOTPLATE, high-visibifity glass ceramic =~

29 |top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200, S50442HP CORNING CORNING
Fisher Science $50442HP or Equal 108 EA $172.90|1 $18,327.40|[FISHER $151.66| $16,075.96 |#6795-200 $164.90 || $17,479.40 16795-200
STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic top, surface area: 4 X 57,

30 |temperature range 25 to 550 deg.

Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, 850446HP CORNING CORNING
Fisher Science S50448HP or Equal 75 EA B $321.84 $24,123.00 IFISHER $277.88 |1 $20,841.00 ||#6795-220 $313.35 || $23,501.25 ||6795-220
QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT CEFT QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NOT BID ALL
TOTAL ITEMS 25-30 BID ALL [TEMS. BLANK. $69,574.24 ITEMS $64,658.68
GROUP Vi
The following items will be awarded on
an individual item basis. items 31
through 35.
STERILIZER,” Poriable  Sleam  Pressure H H

32 Non-electric. 11 EA { WISCONSY
APProven wrana: Laroina mogia LEFT . N ALUM WISCONSIN LEFT
#701696 or equal IBLANK LEFT BLANK 1 $264.31 $2,807.41 1925X_ | $287.44 || 53.161.84 llaLum 925X JBLANK

24 RIPPLE TANK - Dislorfion-Tree, oplically 'l
clear plate glass bottom. 108 EA

SCIENCE
Approved Brand: Science Source #15430 -SEE SOURCE LEFT
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equal ABOVE LEFT BLANK 5248.81 | $26.373.86 || 5520782} $219.99) $23.318.94[15430 BLANK
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Type or print the complete

ALL HIGHLIG)

HTED'AREAS

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

name of the bidder in this box:
Bid N0.013-JJ05
Bid No, 013-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO
TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran
OTHER FISHER SCIENCE
THAN PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR FREY SCIENTIFIC
APPROVED GROUP VI, ITEM 37. ALTERNATE FOR|  PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
BRAND, GROUP VI, ITEM 32, AND ITEMS 38 || GROUP VI, ITEM 34; ALTERNATE FOR|
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC. AND 38. GROUP V|, ITEM 37 PARA SCIENTIFIC
TED MANUFACTUY
QUANTI| UNIT RER & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY (UOM}|t PER UNIT MODEL __{|Unit Price {[Total Price Manuf & Md|Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod|{Unit Price Total Price Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model [iUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
ELECTROSTATICS SYSTEM - Basic,
35 {linlcudes all components for quantitive
investigation. 5 EA
Approved Brand: Pasco Scientific ES-9080) *SEE LEFT
or equal ABOVE LEFT BLANK NO BID _NOBID bvemeeem ol ooy . _BLANK
TERRARIA, Glass with Cover, Slan i v
top.Approx. Dimensions: 20"H X 12"W i i
» 21 | ea : :
Approved Brand: American Educational [ i
Praducts #44310, Fisher Science *SEE H AMERICAN 1LEFT
#S18451MF or Equal. ABOVE LEFT BLANK $181.88 || $3.819.48 315451M__F' 322842 || $4796.82 IEDUC.44310 JBLANK
Biology Laboratory Specimens will be I
awarded to the vendor offering the
28 highest percentage discount off pre-
printed catalog or price list(s).
Please provide information below for
item #38.
Fixed
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG %
YEAR FOR ITEM #38 Discouj Dates Exceptions
! !zs% DISC, 2009 FREY SCIENTIFIC CAT. 2008
M *FREY ELEMENTARY CAT.- 28% DIS, 2010
129.5% DIS. OFF OF THE FISHER FREY SCIENTIFIC CAT. 2010 FREY ELEM.
+SCIENCE EDUC. 2008 GEN. CAT  [caT, 28% DISC. 2011 FREY SCIENTIFIG CAT.
ITHRU 12/31/09. BEG. 1/1/10 DISC. 12011 FREY ELEMENTARY CAT. NO
10% DISC. JWILL BE OFF OF THE "THEN :DISCOUNT ON SCHOOL SPECIALTY
% FLINN |PUBLISHED LIST PRICES [SCIENCE EXCLUSIVE PRODUCTS W/PREFIX
Catalog CHEM. & H 1OF N. FREE SHIPPING ON ALL ITEMS
IPrice “SEE BIOLOGIC. i JEXCPT:LIVE SPECIMENS, HAZARDMAT.& ||, cr7
List ABOVE 2/09 : 1PRODUCTS SHIPPED BY MOTOR FREIGHT, BLANK
"..._...._.”_.._.._II._.--—-INOMIN‘ORDER
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: n
Type or print the complete The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
name of the bidder in this box: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Bid No.013-JJ05
Bid No. 013-JJ05 BI0 PROPOSAL FORM (FO
TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran
OTHER FISHER SCIENCE
THAN PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR FREY SCIENTIFIC
APPROVED GROUP VI, ITEM 37. ALTERNATE FOR| PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
BRAND, GROUP VI, ITEM 32, AND ITEMS 38 || GROUP VI, ITEM 34; ALTERNATE FOR|
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY EDUCATIONAL INNOVATIONS FLINN SCIENTIFIC, INC. AND 39. GROUP Vi, ITEM 37 PARA SCIENTIFIC
TED MANUFACTY
QUANTI| UNIT RER& Manuf &
iTEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY {UOM) |l PER UNIT MODEL _ |[Unit Price |iTotal Price Manuf & MdiUnit Price Total Price Manuf & MadliUnit Price Total Price Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model {Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
Laboratory chemicals will be awarded t
the vendor offering the highest
39 percentage discount off pre-printed
catalog or price list(s). Please provide
information below for item #39,
)
Fixed j|Effecti
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG Yo ve
YEAR FOR ITEM #38 Discouji Dates Exceptions
i 28% DISC. 2008 FREY SCIENTIFIC CATALQG,
h 2009 FREY ELEM. CATALOG. 28% DISC 2010
i FREY SCIENTIFIC CATALOG, 2010 FREY
. ELEM. CATALOG. 28% 2011 FREY
3 29%DISC. OFF OF THE FISHER [SCIENTIFIC CATALOG, 2011 FREY ELEM.
! SCIENCE EDU. 2009 GENERAL CAT/|lCATALOG, FREE SHIP. ON ALL ITEMS
v THU 12/31/08. BEG. 1/4/10, DISC. [[EXCPT LIVE SPECIMENS, HAZ, MAT &
bl BE OFF THE "THEN" CURRENT [[PRODUCTS THAT MUST SHIP MOTOR
10% DISC. N PUBLISHED LIST PRICES FREIGHT. THESE ITEMS ARE NOTED
% FLINN [ W/PREFIX L, H OR TIN 2003 CAT, MOTOR
Catalod CHEM. & H FRGHT ITEMS WILL INCUR A MIN. OF $75.00
/ Price LEFT BIOLOGIC. I FEE OR 12% OF THE LINE VALUE. ITEMS LEFT
List BLANK 2/08 : WIPREFIX L. OR H SEE CAT. FOR CHARGES. g ANK
< 2 o e e ]
I
:"_--—“—“_"—"_"_ :
Will there be any hazardous material i ]
N . Check one: Yes H N
charge for shipment of certain No 1 1
chemicals: :HAZARDOUS MATERIALS FEE OF §22.00 ,
‘PER ORDER WILL BE CHARGED WHERE * LEFT
+APPLICABLE. CHARGES APPLY ONLY TO |NO MIM. ORDERING. FREE SHIP, ON ALL  |BLANK
If yes, please list chemical(s) for which hazardous material charge wilt apply JORDERS WITH A CHEMICAL CLASSIFIED 1ITEMS EXCPT LIVE SPECIMENS, HAZ. MAT &
{type-or print legibly): 1BY THE US DOT AS A HAZARDOUS {PRODUCTS THAT MUST SHIP MOTOR
*MATERIAL, THERE IS ONLY ONE $22.00 1FREIGHT. THESE ITEMS ARE NOTED
A $17.50 HAZARD CHARGE PER [0 72 R0oUS MATERIAL GHARGE IW/PREFIX L, H OR T IN 2008 CAT. MOTOR
ORDER. CHEM W/ CAT, PRICE !ReGARDLESS OF HOW MANY \FRGHT ITEMS WILL INCUR A MIN. OF $75.00
LEFT ENDING "1" IS CONSIDERED  [MAZARDOUS MATERIALS ARE INCLUDED [FEE OR 12% OF THE LINE VALUE. ITEMs  |LEFT
BLANK HAZARDOUS. $ON THE ORDER. sWIPREFIX L OR H SEE CAT. FOR CHARGES, |BLANK
BALANCE OF LINE: Percentage discount off pre-printed catalog or price fist(s) to
awarded vendors as primary and/or alternate. Additional Shipping Charges for
40 {iHazardous and Live Materials are to be noted in the exception column. Freight
and delivery charges for all other supplies and equipment should be factored into tHe
% off list provided. No additional freight charges will be accepted on these items.
Single Fixe % || Effective 28% DISC, 2008 FREY SCIENTIFIC CAT. 2008
NAME OF CATALOG Discount (-) Dates  Exceptions FREY ELEMENTARY CAT. 28% DIS. 2010
FREY SCIENTIFIC CAT. 2010 FREY
ELEMENTARY CAT. 28% DISC. 2011 FREY
23% DISC. OFF OF THE FISHER SCIENCE |SCIENTIFIC CAT. 2011 FREY ELEMENTARY
7% DISC. EDUCATIONAL EDU. 2003 GENERAL CAT. THU 12/31/69. |CAT. NG MIN. ORDERING. FREE SHIP. ON
INNOVATIONS VOL. 22 - ?EG. 1,{1“0’ DISC. WILL BE OFF THE ALL ITEMS EXCPT LIVE SPECIMENS, HAZ.
PRESENT TO SEPT.09. THEN" CURRENT PUBLISHED LIST MAT & PRODUCTS THAT MUST SHIP MOTOR
. 10% DISC PRICES. A HAZARDOUS CHARGE OF FREIGHT. THESE ITEMS ARE NOTED
7% DISC EDUC. INNOV. VOL. 23 o DISC. $22.00 PER ORDER WILL BE CHARGED  JWIPREFIX L, H OR T IN 2008 GAT. MOTOR
— % SEP.09 TO JAN. 10. FLINN WHERE APPLICABLE. FREE SHIPPING ON JFRGHT ITEMS WILL INCUR A MIN. OF §75.00
Cataiog/Price 7% DISC. INNOV. VOL.24 - JAN. CHEM & ALL ORDERS ESC. LIVE, HAZARDOUS  |FEE OR 12% OF THE LINE VALUE, ITEMS  |LEFT
List 10 TO SEPT.10 81O 2/09 ITEMS. W/PREFIX L OR H SEE CAT. FOR CHARGES, |BLANK
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Type or print the complete

ALLHIGHLIGHTED AREAS

The School! _Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

name of the bidder in this box: .
Bid No.013-JJ05
8id No, 013-J05 8I0 PROPOSAL FORM {FO
[TITLE; SCIENGCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran
OTHER
THAN PASCO SCIENTIFIC  PARTIAL SARGENT-WELCHVWR
APPROVED|| AWARD-PRIMARY FOR GROUP Vi, PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
SRAND, ITEM 35 GROUP V, ITEMS 25-30; GROUP Vi ITEM 32
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY PEPCO, INC AND ITEMS 38, 38 AND 40 SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS SEMPCO, INC
TED MANUFACTU
QUANTI| UNIT RER &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY _Jl(UOM}|l PER UNIT|| MODEL {{Unit Price ||Total Price Manuf & MogUnit Price [[Total PrigiManuf & Unit Price || Total Price Manuf & Model! JUnit Price Tolal Price Manuf & Model{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod|
NOTE: LINE ITEM #40 QUALIFIED BID. GROUP PRICES ARE
WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty if WILL BE AWARDED VALID UNTIL JULY 31, 2011. $200.00 QUALIFIED GROUP V, LINE ITEMS 25
greater than one (1) year for each item ONLY TO THOSE MINIMUM CHARGE FOR FREE THROUGH 30, DID NOT BID ALL
as it applies. VENDORS RECEIVING A SHIPPING APPLICABLE FOR LINE ITEMS.
PRIMARY AND/OR ITEMS 38, 39 & 40.
ALTERNATE AWARD.
GROUP V:
The fallowing items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded. items 25|
through 30.
25 BALANCE  Triple Beam, 610g capaci
with 0.1g readability. 198 EA OHAUS 750- AMERICAN
Approved Brands: - Ohaus 750-80, Fisher SO, SCIENFIC
Science #340020 or equal NO BID $85.20 $16.869.80 WL 83455 $138.50 || $27.621.00 80375-00 $62.00 $12,276.00 /IBS-2610
BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g
26 Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202 SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific ELECTRONICY LEFT
$67074 or Equal 31 EA NO BID $183.38 $5,684.78 [[SCOUT PRO, $285.57 $8,852.6747191-02  |BLANK
WLS2647-
108
27 SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in. 17 EA BEL-ART
PRCDUC.
Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products #H24962, LEFT
#H24962, Fisher Science $51222 or Equa NO BID $292.74 $4,976.50/#13167-366 | 5324.00 | $5.508.00 || 68640.30 [|BLANK
SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
28 [|36°Nigh, 3/16 in.
Overall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 /2D x
36in.H BEL-ART
Approved  Brand:  Bel-Art  Productd PROD
#H249640000, Fisher Science $51223 o H249640000 LEFT
Equal 3 EA NO BID $325.74 $977.22#47750-422 | $324.00 $972.00 | 68640-30 [BLANK
HOTPLATE, ugh-visibilily glass ceramic ICORNING
29 |[top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200 #6795-200, LEFT
Fisher Science $50442HP or Equal 106 EA NO BID $157.49 $16,693.94 |WLS41000-A $216.44 $22,943.7062083-08 | BLANK
STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic top, suface area: 4 X 5",
30 |temperature range 25 to 550 deg. CORNING
Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, #6795-220, LEFT
Fisher Science $50448HP or Equal 75 EA NO BID $299.94 $22,495 50 [fWLS41001-A $410.8 $30,810.78451143-00 BLANK i
DIDN UBMIT FAGES QUALIFIED GROUP. DID NO T BID AL
TOTAL ITEMS 25.30 NO BID FOR LINE ITEMS ABOVE. $50,828.02 $96,708.12 ITEMS,
GROUP Vi:
The following items will be awarded on DID NOT SUBMIT PAGES
an individual item basis, Items 31 FOR LINE ITEMS 31 TO
through 35. 35 LISTED BELOW.
STERILIZER, Porlable Siéam  Pressure WISC. ALUM.
%2 Non-electric, 11 EA WLS 43665-
ADPrOvVea prana: Laronna wogial LEFT 10, USE LEFT
#701698 or equal BLANK $249,38 $2,743,1 ‘ 58515-000 ] $359.10 j| $3.950.10 || 65718-01 [[BLANK
a RIFPLE TANK - Tistortion-frée. oplically
4 clear plate glass bottom. 106 EA
SCIENCE EDUC.
Approved Brand: Science Source #15430 PASCO SQURCE INST
Fisher Science #5520782 or Equal §664.05 | $70.389.30 || WA-9899 $250.8 $26.594.34[15430 $317.66 i $33,671.96 [310-85 PG 7}l $22124 | $23.451.44 |RH2401.A
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in-this box:

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Bid No.013-JJ05

Bid No, 073-JJ05 BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO
TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran
OTHER
THAN PASCO SCIENTIFIC  PARTIAL SARGENT-WELCHVWR
APPROVED|] AWARD-PRIMARY FOR GROUP VI, PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
BRAND, ITEM 35 GROUP V, ITEMS 25-30; GROUP VI ITEM 32
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY PEPCO, INC AND ITEMS 38, 33 AND 40 SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS SEMPCD, INC
TED MANUFACTY
QUANTI| UNIT RER &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY {UOM){l PER UNIT MODEL  |[Unit Price |{Total Price Manuf & Mog|Unit Price ||Tota! PridiManuf & §Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model fUnit Price Total Price Manuf & ModeliUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod|
ELECTROSTATICS SYSTEM - Basic,
35 [linicudes all components for quantitive
investigation. 5 EA
Approved Brand: Pasca Scientific £8-8080 PASCO LEFT LEFT
of equal $787.55 | $3.937.75 |IES-9080 NO BID BLANK BLANK
TERRARIA, Glass with Cover, Slan
top.Approx. Dimensions: 20"H X 12"wW
18D 21 EA AMERICAN
Approved Brand: American Educational ED.44310,
Products #44310, Fisher Science LEET \WLS1038- 698703 10 |[LEFT
#S18451MF or Equal. BLANK $277.18 || $5.820.78 [l22TRK $418.50 || $8.788.50 _ji GAL-PG20g|BLANK
Biology Labaratory Specimens will be
awarded to the vendor offering the
a8 highest percentage discount off pre-
printed catalog or price list(s).
Please provide information below for
item #38,
Fixed |[Effect]
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG % ve .
'YEAR FOR ITEM #38 Discoy Dates"Excepﬁons
15% DISC. SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LAB
FREE SHIPPING TO ANY ITEM M/H CAT. AND K-6 CATALOG, EFFECT
PURCHASED OFF OF THE PASCO DATE 7/13/03- 1/10/10 PRICES WILL
CATALOG. AN ADDT'L 5% DISC. CHANGE WITH EACH NEW CAT. LIVE,
OFFERED AND FREE SHIPPING UPON PRESERVED, TELESCOPES ANY SPECIAL
—1 RECEIPT OF BID AWARD. 5% DISC. ORDERS, VERNIER PROBEWARE KODAK
—% PASCO PHYSICS 2008/2010 CAT, NO 31% DISC. SARGENT-WELCH 2009 fosupns, pasco ITEms, PUBLISHER 20%
Catalog DISG. ON PS.2008, PS2400, FS2401, (ANNUAL CAT. UPDATE IN JAN). KITS & THEIR REPLACEMENT PARTS ARE DISCOUNT.
/Price FREE SHIPNG. 5% DISC. PASCO K-12 EFFECTIVE DATE: MDCPS CONTRACT |excLUDED FROM THIS DISC. SEE NO
List SOLUTIONS CAT. NO DISC. ON PS TERM. NO EXCEPTIONS, FREIGHT INFO. BELOW EXCEPTIONS
2008, P5-2400 & PS 2401. FREE ‘ l u “ “
SHPNG.
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Yype or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

ALt HIGHLIGRTED AREAS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO

The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Bid No.013-JJ05

OTHER
THAN PASCO SCIENTIFIC PARTIAL. SARGENT-WELCHAVWR
APPROVED| AWARD-PRIMARY FOR GROUP VI, PARTIAL AWARD- PRIMARY FOR
BRAND, ITEM 35 GROUP V, ITEMS 25-30; GROUR VI ITEM 32
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY PEPCO, INC AND ITEMS 38, 33 AND 40 SCIENCE KIT & BOREAL LABS SEMPCO, INC
TED MANUFACTU
QUANTH| UNIT RER & .
ITEM DESCRIPTICN OF ITEM TY {UOM}It PER UNIT MODEL _ {lUnit Price ||Total Price Manuf & Mog|Unit Price ||Total Prid|Manuf & HUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model JUnit Price Total Price Manuf & ModeltUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Mod|
Laboratory chemicals will be awarded ¢
the vendor offering the highest
39 percentage discount off pre-printed
catalog or price list{s). Please provide
information below for item #39.
=
Fixed ||Effecti
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG % ve
YEAR FOR JTEM #39 Discou| Dates Exceptions
% 31% DISC. SARGENT-WELCH 2008 (ANNUAL 20%
Cataiog CAT. UPDATE IN JAN). EFFECTIVE DATE: DISCOUNT.
/ Price MDCPS CONTRACT TERM. NO EXCEPTIONS.| NO
List NO BID LEFT BLANK HAZARDOUS CHARGES WAIVED, EXCEPTION
SCIENCE KIT LLC WILL ABSORB ALL
SHIPPING CHARGES, WITHE EXCEP.OF
Will there be any hazardous material Check one: Yes LIVE MATERIALS, HAZARDOUS
charge for shipment of certain No HAZARDOUS CHARGES ARE WAIVED maTERIALS ITEMS REQUIRED TO SHIP VIA
chemicals: MOTOR FREIGHT, & ITEMS REQUESTED
FOR OVERNIGHT OR TWO-DAY DELIVERY
ON ORDERS OVER $200.00, PRICES WILL
If yes, please list chemical(s) for which hazardous material charge will apply CHANGE WITH EACH NEW CATALOG.
{type or print legibly):
BALANCE OF LINE: Percentage discount off pre-printed catalog or price fist(s) to
awarded vendors as primary and/for alternate. Additional Shipping Charges for
40 [Hazardous and Live Materials are to be noted in the exception column. Freight]
and delivery chargaes for all other supplies and equipment should be factored into the
% off list provided. No additional freight charges will be accepted on these items.
Single Fixe % || Effective
NAME OF CATALOG Discount {-) Dates Exceptiong
31% DISC. SARGENT-WELCH 2009 (ANNUAL
CAT. UPDATE IN JAN). EFFECTIVE DATE:
MDOCPS CONTRACT TERM. NO EXCEPTIONS, 20%
35% DISC. PEPCQ, INC.  |HAZARDOUS CHARGES WAIVED. NOTE: °
—_— % 2009-10 CAT. EFFECTIVE: |DISC. WILL NOT APPLY TO PASCO AND DISCOUNT.
Catalog/Price 8/1/09-12/3110. NO VERNIER PROBEWARE & MATERIALS NO
List NO BID EXCEPTIONS (ONLY EXCEPTION) EXCEPTION:
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-1J05

EDAREAS

S
BIJ PROPOSAL FORM {FO

o

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Bid No.013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES
BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran
OTHER
THAN
APPROVED
BRAND, SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY SUPPLY TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS NATURAL SCIENCE
TED MANUFACT!
QUANTIF UNIT RER & .
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY Jl(UoM)|| PER UNIT] MODEL Hunit Price  {[Totai Price Manuf & Mod|{Unit Price_|[Total Price Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
. . QUALIFIED BID. PRICES FIRM FOR 90
WARRANTY: Please indicate warranty if
greater than one (1) year for aach ith THESE LINE JTEMS WERE LEFT BID ONLY LINE [TEM #40 DAYS, THROUGH OCT. 7, 2009, FREE
as it applies. BLANK SHIPPING ON ORDERS TOTALING
$100.00 OR MORE
GROUP V:
The following items will be awarded on
total low bid basis. Vendor must bid all
items in Group to be awarded, ltems 25 LEFT
through 30, BLANK
1 B Iriple Beam, G10g capach,
2% liwith 0.1g readabilty. 198 || EA
Approved Brands: Ohaus 750-S0, Fisher LEFT LEFT
Science #S40020 or equal BLANK NO BID BLANK
BALANCE top loading, capacity 200g
26 Approved Brand: Ohaus #SPE202
Electronic Scout Pro, Fisher Scientific LEFT LEFT
S67074 or Equal 31 EA BLANK NO BID BLANK
27 SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
30"high, 3/16 in. 17 EA
Approved Brand: Bel-Art Products LEFT LEFT
#H24962, Fisher Sciénce 851222 or Equa BLANK NO BID BLANK
SHIELD, safety, curved, three sided,
28 36"high, 3/16 in.
Overall dimensions: 19 1/2W x 6 1/2D x
36in. H
Approved  Brand:  Bel-At  Productd
#H249840000, Fisher Science $51223 of LEFT LEFT
Equat . 3 EA BLANK NO BID BLANK
HOTPLATE, high-visibmly glass ceramic
29 ||top. Approved Brand: Corning #6795-200, LEFT LEFT
Fisher Science S50442HP or Equal 106 EA BLANK NO BID BLANK
STIRRER/HOTPLATE high-visibility glass
ceramic top, surface area; 4 X 5",
30 ftemperature range 25 to 550 deg.
Approved Brand: Corning #6795-220, LEFT LEFT
Fisher Science S50446HP or Equal 75 EA BLANK NO BID BLANK
TOTAL [TEMS 25-30 LEFT BLANK NO BID LEFT BLANK|
GROUP VI:
The following items will be awarded on
an individual item basis. ftems 31
through 35.
STERIUIZER, Porlable Sleam  Préssure
32 Non-glectric. 1 EA
ADDIOvVea orang: Laroina ploiogiat . LEFT
#701696 or equal BLANK NO BID $343.20 |l $377520 14W8001
RIPPLE TANK - Distorfion-free. opfically
34 clear plate glass bottorn 106 EA
Approved Brand: Science Source #15430 LEFT LEFT
Fisher Science #S520782 or Equal BLANK NO BID BLANK
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box:

Bid No. 013-4J05

TITLE: SCIENGE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beitran

ALL HIGHLIGHTED AREAS

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Bid No.013-JJ05

OTHER
THAN
APPROVED
BRAND, SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL VWR EDUCALTION,LLC DBA WARD'S
ESTIMA PRICE SPECIFY SUPPLY TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS NATURAL SCIENCE
TED MANUFACT
QUANTI| UNIT RER &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY_j(Uomjfl PERUNIT|l MODEL _[Unit Price  i{Total Price Manuf & Mod|{Unit Price_[|Total Price Manuf & Mod||Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
ELECTROSTATICS SYSTEM - Basic,
35 llinlcudes all components for quantitive
investigation. 5 EA
Approved Brand: Pasco Scientific ES-3080 LEFT LEFT
or equal BLANK NO BID BLANK
TERRARIA, Glass  with Cover, Sian
2 top.Approx. Dimensions: 20"H X 12"W
18"D 21 EA
Approved Brand: American Educationai
Products #44310, Fisher Science LEFT LEFT
#518451MF or Equal. BLANK NO BID BLANK
Biology Laboratory Specimens will be
awarded to the vendor offering the
38 highest percentage discount off pre-
printed catalog or price list(s).
Please provide information below for
item #38,
Fixed || Effect]
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG % ve
'YEAR FOR ITEM #38 Discou Dates|Exceptions
10% DISC. 2009 BIG/CHEM, 10%
DISC.GEOLOGY {OR CURRENT YEAR
CATALOG]). 10% DISC. (EXCEPT VERNIER
LABPRO, PROBES & SENSORS, PASCO
PASPORT, PROBES & SENSORS AND KODAK
DIGITAL PRODUCTS). FREE SHIPPING ON
ORDERS TOTALING $100.00 OR MORE
= EXCEPT LIVING/PERISHABLE MATERIAL,
p—_ HAZARDOUS MATERIAL AND MOTOR
Catalog FREIGHT SHIPMENTS). FO8 DESTINATION,
IPrice ROCHESTER NY DISCOUNT IS FOR ITEMS
List NO BID NOT ON THIS BID.
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Type or print the complete

name of the bidder in this box;

Bid No. 013-JJ05

TITLE: SCIENCE EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

BUYER: Gladys Forero-Beltran

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FQ

Bid No0.013-4J05

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
SCIENCE EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL

VWR EDUCALTION,LLG DBA WARD'S

ESTIMA SUPPLY TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS NATURAL SCIENCE
TED
QUANTY} UNIT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM TY |l wom) Total Price Unit Price_|iTotal Price Manuf & Mod|Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modei
Laboratory chemicals wiil be awarded t
the vendor offering the highest
39 percentage discount off pre-printed
catalog or price list{s). Please provide
information below for item #39.
£l
Fixed [[Effech
NAME OF CATALOG AND CATALOG % ve
YEAR FOR ITEM #39 Discouff Dates Exceptions
10% DISC. 2009 BIO/CHEM, 10%
DISC.GEQOLOGY (OR CURRENT YEAR
CATALOG). 10% DISC. (EXCEPT
VERNIER LABPRO, PROBES &
SENSORS, PASCO PASPORT, PROBES 8
SENSORS AND KODAK DIGITAL
PRODUCTS). FREE SHIPPING ON
ORDERS TOTALING $100.00 OR MORE
_% EXCEPT LIVING/PERISHABLE MATERIAL,|
Catalog HAZARDOUS MATERIAL AND MOTOR
/ Price FREIGHT SHIPMENTS). FOB DEST.
List NO BID ROCHESTER NY. DISCOUNT IS FOR
ITEMS NOT ON THIS BID.
Will there be any hazardous material Check one: :?;EO?)F::[)FF’{PBIAA(')GRQNE?(EE}E?S TOTALING
charge for shipment of certain No N (
chemicals: LIVING/PERISHABLE MATERIAL,
HAZARDOUS MATERIAL AND MOTOR
NO BID FREIGHT SHIPMENTS
If yes, please list chemical(s) for which hazardous material charge will apply
(type or print legibly):
BALANCE OF LINE: Percentage discount off pre-printed cataiog or price list(s) to
awarded vendors as primary and/or aiternate. Additional Shipping Charges for
40 |Hazardous and Live Materials are to be noted in the exception column. Fraight]

and delivery charges for all other supplies and equipment shouid be factorad into th
% off list provided. No additional freight charges will be accepted on these items.

10% DISC. 2009 BIO/CHEM, 10%
DISC.GEOLOGY {OR CURRENT YEAR

NAME OF CATALOG

Single Fixe %
Discount {-)

CATALOG). 10% DISC. (EXCEPT
VERNIER LABPRO, PROBES &

Catalog/Price

%

List

10% DISC. TROXELL GEN,

CATALOG(ANV)

SENSORS, PASCO PASPORT, PROBES &
SENSORS AND KODAK DIGITAL
PRODUCTS). FREE SHIPPING ON
ORDERS TOTALING $100.00 OR MORE
EXCEPT LIVING/PERISHABLE MATERIAL,
HAZARDOUS MATERIAL AND MOTOR
FREIGHT SHIPMENTS). FOB
DESTINATION, ROCHESTER NY
DISCOUNT IS FOR ITEMS NOT ON THIS

BID.
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