Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndait

Veritied by J. Bradley

AFP Industries Aliied Paper All Flarida Paper, inc. Calico industries
ESTIMATED
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY j|Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model! Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model |iUnit Price | Totai Price Manuf & Model  {[Unit Price| Total Price Manuf & Model
1 Bags, Paper
“filApproved Brands: Bagcraft Dubl-Wax® # 532 or equal
150 No Bid No Bid $51.82 $7,773.00 [Bagcraft 300535 No Bid
Pads, Carpet Scrubbing
Approved Brands: Tuway # C19-6, Wilen #N008019 or Wilen NOG7019 or
equal
Norton - Notan  jtiin s
60 $61.57 $3,694.20 |Wilen #NO0B01S No Bid $39.01 $2,340.60 |approved brand |["$56.34 $3,380.40 {Wilen NO07019
Pads, Comimercial, Soap Filled
Approved Brands: 3M Scotch-Brite™ Rescue™ Soap Pad #50 or equal.
100 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid $65.94 $6,584.00 [3M 50 AJs
Lid for 55 Gallon Receptacle, Continental 5501
Approved Brands: Venus Labs # 493 or GO JO # 1109 or equal.
26 No Bid No Bid No Bid $281.84 {Continental 5501
Can, Step-On, Disposat,
[ Approved Brands: Witt #2240 WH or Lawsen # 2240 or United # ST- 350W
United/Rubbermail United
. 300 $47.51 1 $14,253.00 |Witt #2240 WH No Bid $12,306,00 |d ST353PUWH $44.24 | $13,272,00 |ST3SEPLWH
6 Dotly, Bucket.
Approved Brands: Douglas Adjusto-Dolly #A-1 or equat
60 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
Doodle Bug
Approved Brands: Americo Octopus # 0-200 or Git #6472AB or, 3-M #6472
or ALL Star # 64724 or Bear Norton # 59417 or Tolco 208138 or equal Rubbermaid Tolco 2801278BL|
Amarico Octopus # Q31100 - Not 3 Glit 20868, Glit
1800 $5.83 | $10,494.00 {0-200 $25.45 $45,810.00 {As spacified $6.30 | $11,340.00 |approved brand $3.54 $6,372.00 122508
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental # 715 or Wilen # E609012 or Impact # 4212
or equal
1008 $2.14 $2,157.12 {Continental # 715 No Bid $2.70 $2,721.80 [impact ¥ 4212 $1,925.28 |Continental 715
Handle, for floor brush
: . Rubbermaid
Approved Brands: Zimco #141 (45268 ) or Abco 01116 or equal. 636400 - Not
1500 No Bid No Bid $2.56 $3,840.00 japproved brand No Bid
Squeegee, Floor: 18"
Approved Brands: Continental # 1800 or Impact #222-18 or Abac BH14001 Rubbermaid
or equal 9C3100 - Not
{ 288 $5.38 $1,549.44 | Continental # 1800 $4.25 $1,224.00 |As specified $10.20 $2,937.60 japproved brand $3.77 $1,085.76 |Aboc BH14001
Bucket, plastic: Approximately 10-12 quart capacity with imprint:
Approved Brands: Rubbermatd # 2963 or Continental # 8110RD or equal
Impact 5510 -
Continental # Not approved i
1,440 $4.13 $6,947.20 [8110RD No 8id $5.35 $7,704.00 {brand $3.61 $5,198.40 |Cont. 8110
Pads, Stripping: for 20" diameter floor machine. Pad shall be of single unit
Approved Brands: Glit # 20 Black 20014 or Americe # 400120 or Flexovil
1[[X1905 or 3M/Niagra 7200N or ACS/Scrubble #72-20 or Norton 54230 Glit # 20 Black
6,000 $565,200.00 (20014 $11.67 $70,020.00 |As specified $10.62 $63,720.00 {Norton $9.24 | $55,440.00 |Glit 20014
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Bid #098-4J02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

AFP Industries Allied Paper All Fiorida Paper, Inc. Calico Industries
ESTIMATED
ITEM . DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY |iUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price_{Total Price Manuf & Model |lUnit Price {Total Price Manut & Model  jiUnit Price| Total Price Manuf & Model
13 |[Handle, For Floor Drain Brush: 5' handle is non-absorbent plastic.
REJECT HlApproved Brands: Carlisle # 40238-00 or ACS/Scrubble #B1460 or equal -
REVISE SPECIFICATIONS REGARDING MALE OR FEMALE THREAD TYPE Carlisle # 40238- Carlisle 40236 -
d 72 $10.57 $761.04 [Carlisle # 40238-00 $10.75 $774.00 |As Specified $9.33 $671.76 |00 $9.84 $708.48 14023800
Waste Basket Continental 7 1NBK
Continental 71NBK or Witt 9640bl or Witt #4bkl or equal Drug free work
ptace, Miami-Dade Rubbermald
g . County minority WB2268K - Not Continental
L, 3,024 $6.11:] $18.478.64 jvendor No Bid $8.73 $26,399.52 {approved brand $6.12 | $18,506.88 |71NBK
16 |liBags, Vinyl
: Approved Brands: Dow Canvas # KR-560SV or Maybeck # 55RVM-BL or
equal, 120 No Bid No _Bid No Bid No Bid
Lid, for 20 galion plastic receptacle
. llApproved Brands: Continental # 2001 . No Substitute
Continentat #
72 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 $258.48 12001
Lid, for 44 galion plastic receptacle
‘fiApproved Brands: Continental # 4445 . No Substitute
. e Continental #
38 No Bid No Bid No Bid 87,80 $280.80 |4445
Gloves, Cleaning, Medium
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 { 212515 ) . Impact 8333M -
Not approved Ansell Edmont 8-
48 No 8id No Bid $43.62 $2,083.76 brand $49.24 $2,363.52 1352
Gloves, Cleaning, Large
i Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 { 212516 ) Size 9 or Safety Tdday Impact 8333L -
#9564 . Not approved Ansell Edmont 8-
24 No Bid No 8id $43.62 $1,046.88 [brand $49.24 $1,181.76 [352
Gloves, Cleaning, Extra Large
Approved Brands: Anseil Edmont # 8-354 { 212517 ) . Impact 8333L -
Not approved
s 24 No Bid No Bid $43.62 $1,046.88 brand $48.65 $1,167.60 | Anseil 8-354
21 HHandle, Wall Brush.
liapproved Brands Magnotia Brush B96 or Carlisle 3620058 or equal.
480 $7.29 $3,499.20 |Carlisle 3620058 $7.40 $3,552.00 {As specified $3,081.60 | Carliste 3620058 $6.44 $3.,091.20 |Carlisle 3620058,
Can, Garbage, Plastic
Approved Brands: Continental #2000 or Impact #7720 No Substiute
Continentat
! 800 $8,160.00 |Continental #2000 No Bid $15.50 $12,400.00 [lmpact 7720 $10.21 $8,168.00 #2000
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Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndait

Verified by J. Bradley

AFP Industries Allied Paper All Florida Paper, inc. Calico Industries
ESTIMATED
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY |Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manut & Model jUnit Price {Total Price Manuf & Model ||Unit Price| Total Price Manuf & Modei
23 Cart, Housekeeping
Gl Approved Brands: Impact #6850 or Continental #184 or equal
360 $70.24 | $25,286.40 | Continental #184 No Bid $79.58 | $28,652.40 |mpact #6850 $70.34 | $25,322.40 |Continental #184
Receptacle, Waste, 32 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continentat # 3200 or Impact # 7732
= Continental #
576 $12.97 $7,470.72 | Continental # 3200 No Bid $18.31 ] $10,548.56 | Impact # 7732 $12.22 $7,038.72 13200
Receptacle, Waste, 44 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #4444 or Impact #7744 No Substitute
Continental
432 $19.60 $8,467.20 | Continental #4444 No Bid $26.05 1 $11,253.60 | Impact #7744 $19.64 $8,484.48 | #4444
Receptacle, Waste, 55 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #5500 GY - No Substitute
Continental #5500 Continental
800 $36.91 | $29,528,00 |GY No Bid $66.70 | $53,360.00 |Impact 77585 $36.88 | $29,504.00 {#5500
Can, Trash
Approved Brands: Bennet Bilt #1300BGRN or United Metal # 130FDL or
United Receptacles # T1424ERBWH or equal.
Bennet 8ilt ! 5 Rubbermaid/Unite
100 $272.00 | $27,200.00 |#1300BGRN No Bid 1610123077 $10,130.00 |d T1424ERBW No Bid
Wringer, Small: Side squeeze, plastic.
Approved Brands: Continental #SW11YW or Impact #WH6000Y or
'WH6000G or equal Must fit Impact Buckets )
Continental Continental
578 $23.42 ] $13,489,92 [#SWI12YW NO BiD $23.46 | $13,512.96 {impact #WHB0OQY $23.44 | $13,501.44 [#SWI11YW
Pads, Scouring, Medium to Heavy Duty:
. impact 71358B -
Approved Brands: Americo 90-96 or GLIT/Micotron #96A or 3M #96 or Not approved
Glit/Disco MD69 or Calico KK810C or Hydra Sponge #6950 or ACS Ind. brand - Also did
Scrubble 5096 not indicate pads
per case as
600 $7.81 $4,686.00 [Glit 20941 $13.18 $7,908.00 |As specified $4.68 $2,808.00 irequired $8.44 $5,664.00 [Calico KK810C
Pads, Scouring
Approved Brands Calico 24KK463 or disco PP-80 or Americo 96-88
g 360 $9.88 $3,484.80 [Americo 96-88 $11.40 $4,104.00 |As specified No 8id $7.24 $2,606.40 {Calico 24KK463
Mop, Toilet Bowl
Approved Brands: All Star Dipper or ABCO # 02000 or Continental #790 or
Calico #280100 or Huntington #141228 or Impact #204 or Rex Johnny
Mop or Wilen #J51000 or ACS/Scrubble 5096 or Tolco 280100
8,000 $0.47 $3,760.00 [Wilen #J51000 $0.53 $4,240.00 JAs sp $0.47 $3,760.00 [impact #204 $0.39 $3,120.00 |Calico #280100
Sponges, Cellulose: approximately 6" X 4" X 1-3/8" Calico 81- Not
Approved Brands: Hydra Sponge W3PK or Calleo $3 or Spontex 7AU or approved model
equal impact 7704 - # - smaller size
Hydra Sponge Not approved than approved
500 $7.37 $3,686.00 {W3PK No Bid $8.12 $4,060.00 |brand $5.86 $2,930.00 |S3 model
33 [IPan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental 812 or Abco 00204-6 or Impact 2600 ar Wilen
£604000 or ACS/Scrubble 8542
2400 $5.14 | $12,336.00 |Continental 812 $7.25 As $5.86 | $14,064.00 |impact 2600 $5.15 | $12,380.00 ; Continental 812
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Bid #098-J402, Custodiai Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bragley

AFP Industries Allied Paper All Florida Paper, inc. Calico Industries
ESTIMATED
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY |Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model ||Unit Price |Total Price Manuf & Mode!l ||Unit Price| Total Price Manuf & Model
34 |IDolly, Conversion, Self-Locking
Approved Brands: Continental #3244 or Continental/Huskee 3255 or
Impact #7704 or equal Continental
900 $14.47 | $13,023.00 iContinental 3255 No 8id $17.85 $16,065.00 jlmpact 7704 $15.44 | $13,896.00 [#3244
Dispenser, Liquid Soap
| Approved Brands: Impact Deluxe Glow #4100 or equal
Cafico 16 oz
T R s0ap - Maets
1,200 $8.88 $10,656.00 | Impact #4100 No Bid $8.03 $9,638.00 |impact 4100 ‘$6.65 $7,860.00 ispecifications
Dispenser, Paper Towel
Approved Brands: Dash Metal GA 200 or Continental G500 or Continental ; X
#630W or impact 4030W or equal, . ) G Continental
1,400 $9.97.1 $13,958.00 {Continental #630W No Bid $16.79 $23,5086.00 |impact 4030 $9.96'1 $13,944.00 {#630W
Gum Remaver
Approved Brands: Inch F-178R, Orange-sol De-solve t® or
Compliance Orange Solv-it or Rex Magic Mover or Caesar Safe-T-Solv or Spartan 6445 -
Scot's Citrus Clean Remaver or equal. Not approved .
250 No Bid No Bid $34.60 $8,650.00 lbrand No Bid
Broom, Standard, Heavy Duty
Approved Brands: Carlisle 3688403 ar equal. . )
PP a 8000 $4.99 | $29,940.00 [Carlisle 3688403 $5.83 | $33.780.00 |As specified $5.44 [ $32,640.00 [Carlisle 3688403 $4.98 | $29,880.00 |Carlisle 3688403
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Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Fivera Consulting & Management Services
Dade Paper Company District Healthcare Faycroft Interior & Purchasing, Inc. Corp.
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manut &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {{Unit Price |Total Price Manuf & Modetltunit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Modef
! Bags, Paper
: -[iApproved Brands: Bagcraft Dubl-Wax® # 532 or equat Bagcraft Dubl-
180 $59.10 $8,865.00 (Wax® # 532 No Bid $64.06 $9,608.00 |As specified No Bid
«“HiPads, Carpet Scrubbing
Approved Brands: Tuway # C19-6, Wilen #N00O8019 or Wilen NO0O7019 or
equal
60 $80.00 $3,600.00 |Wilen NOO7019; No Bid $66.00 $3,900.00 {As specified No Bid
Pads, Commercial, Soap Filled
Approved Brands: 3M Scotch-Brite™ Rescue™ Soap Pad #50 or equal.
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lid for 55 Gallon Receptacle, Continental 5501
Approved Brands: Venus Labs # 493 or GO JO # 1109 or equal, Continental Rubbermaid 16
2 26 $11.85 $308.10 {5501 $17.98 $467.48 {RCP254 $13.50 $351.00_As specified No Bid
Can, Step-On, Disposal. Impact 12300
180T 11 1/4 x
Approved Brands: Witt #2240 WH or Lawsen # 2240 or United # ST- 350W 12 x 18" - Not
. spproved
. 300 $56.00 $16,800.00 |witt #2240 $39.90 $11,970.00 {brand $59.95 $17,985.00 iAs specified No Bid
Dolly, Bucket.
.-l Approved Brands: Douglas Adjuste-Dolly #A-1 or equal
80 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
Doodie Bug
Approved Brands: Americo Octopus # 0-200 or Glit #6472AB or, 3-M #6472
or ALL Star # 64724 or Bear Norton # 59417 or Tolco 208138 or equal
1800 $24.40 $43,920.00 [3-M #6472 $5.40 $9,720.00 |Tolco 208138 $26.90 $48,420.00 |As specified No Bid
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental # 715 or Wilen # E609012 or Impact # 4212
or equal Continental # . No Brand
1008 $2.00 $2,016.00 |718 $2.80 $2,822.40 {Impact 4212 $3.50 $3,528.00 |As $4.93 $4,969.44 |Specified
Handle, for floor brush
Approved Brands: Zimco #141 ( 45268 ) or Abco 01116 or equal,
1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Squeegee, Floor: 18" .
Approved Brands: Continental # 1800 or Impact #222-18 or Aboc BH14001
|llor equat Continental # : Abco
288 $5.02 $1,445.76 [1800 - 4376k $1,080.00 {BH14001 $6.28 $1,808.64 |As specified No 8id
Bucket, plastic: Approximately 10-12 quart capacity with imprint:
i Approved Brands: Rubbermaid # 2963 or Continental # 8110RD or equal
impact 5510 -
Continental # Not approved No Brand
1,440 $3.75 $5,400.00 {8110RD $4.83 $6,9565,20 |brand $4.95 $7.128.00 |As specified $8.75 | $12,600,00 [Specified
“{[Pads, Stripping: for 20" diameter floor machine. Pad shall be of single unit
Approved Brands: Glit # 20 Black 20014 or Americo # 400120 or Flexovil
X1905 or 3M/Niagra 7200N or ACS/Scrubble #72-20 or Norton 54230 Gt # 20 Black
6,000 $9.76 $58,560.00 (20014 $10.25 $61,500.00 {ACS 72-20 $11.50 $69,000.00 [As specified No Bid
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Bid #098-J402, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Fivera Consulting & Management Services
Dade Paper Company District Healthcare Faycroft Interior & Purchasing, Inc. Corp.
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {{Unit Price {Total Price Manuf & ModeljUnit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price  {Total Price Manuf & Model
13 |lHandte, For Floor Drain Brush: 5 handle is non-absorbent plastic.
BESECT i Approved Brands: Carlisle # 40238-00 or ACS/Scrubble #B1460 or equa -
24 |IREVISE SPECIFICATIONS REGARDING MALE OR FEMALE THREAD TYPE : Carlisle #
E 72 $9.86 $708.92 140238-00 $7.08 $507.60 |ACS B148Q $11.38 $819.36_[As ified No Bid
14 llWaste Basket .
g BiD | Continental 71NBK or Witt 9640bl or Witt #4bkl or equal
it Impact 1302 _
Continental Not approved
3,024 $6.48 $19,695.62 [71NBK $11.50 $34,776.00 jbrand $7.82 $23,647.88 |As specified No Bid
Bags, Vinyl
"liAppraved Brands: Dow Canvas # KR-560SV or Maybeck # 55RVM-BL or .
Jlequal. 120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lid, for 20 gallon plastic receptacle
2(|Approved Brands: Continental # 2001 . No Substitute Fs 1‘ Impact 7721 -
i Continental # Not approved No Brand
72 1. %$3.85 $256.60 (2001 $4.14 $298.08 |brand $4.75 $342.00 [As specified $7.50 $540.00 | Specified
Lid, for 44 gallon plastic receptacle
+[[Approved Brands: Continental # 4445 . No Substitute Impact 7745 -
Continental # Not approved No Brand
36 $8.25 $237.00 [4445 $8.70 $313.20 |brand $9.68 $348.48 {As specified $19.50 $702.00 |Specified
Gloves, Cleaning, Medium
“jitApproved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 (212515 ) . impact 8333m
Anseli Edmont Not approved
48 $56.00 $2,688,00 |# 8-354 $44.05 $2,114.40 jbrand $69.99 $2,879.52 jAs specified No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Large
v Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 { 212516 ) Size 9 or Safety Toda: impact 8333L
| #9564 , Ansell Edmont Not approved
24 $56.00 $1.344.00 {# 8-354 $44.05 $1,057.20 [brand $69.99 $1.439.76 | As specified No Bid
20 liGloves, Cleaning, Extra Large
. Impact
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 (212517 . 8333XL - Not
Ansell Edmont approved
24 $56.00 $1,344.00 | # 8-354 $44.05 $1,067.20 {brand $59.99 $1.439.76 As specified No Bid
Handle, Walt Brush.
i |lApproved Brands Magnotia Brush 896 or Carlisle 3620058 or equal,
g Carlisle
: : 480 $6.78 $3,254.40 [3620058 No Bid $8.50 $4,080.00 jAs specified No Bid
22 ilCan, Garbage, Plastic
"2l Approved Brands: Continental #2000 or Impact #7720 No Substiute
Continental No Brand
800 $10.82 $8,656.00 (20016 $14.65 |  $11,720.00 |mpact #7720 No Bid $22.62 | $18,016.00 | Specified
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Bid #098-4402, Custodial Cleaning Suppiies

Prepared

by R, Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradiey

Fivera Consulting & Management Services
Dade Paper Company District Healthcare Faycroft Interior & Purchasing, Inc. Corp.
ESTIMATED Manutf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {lUnit Price |Total Price Manuf & Modeljiunit Price | Total Price Modet Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
23 liCart, Housekeeping
Approved Brands: Impact #6850 or Continental #184 or equal
Continental
360 $74.50 $26,820.0Q i#184 $81.95 $28,502.00 |impact #8850 $80.50 $28,880.00 [As specified No Bid
Receptacle, Waste, 32 gallon capacity
Appraved Brands: Continental # 3200 or Impact # 7732
Continental # No Brand
576 $12.69 $7,309.44 |3200 $18.86 $10,815.20 |impact # 7732 No Bid $28.16 | $16,220.16 |Specified
Receptacle, Waste, 44 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #4444 or Impact #7744 No Substitute
Continentat No Brand
432 $20.79 $8.981.28 |#4444 $24.75 $10,692.00 {impact #7744 No Bid $41.25 | $17,820.00 |Specified
Receptacle, Waste, 55 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #5500 GY - No Substitute
Impact 7755 -
Continental Not approved No Brand
800 $39.16 $31,320.00 #5500 $63.50 $50,800.00 |brand No Bid $62.66 | $50,128.00 |Specified
Can, Trash
Approved Brands: Bennet Bilt #1300BGRN or United Metal # 130FDL or
United Receptacles # T1424ERBWH or equal.
100 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
‘Wringer, Small: Side squeeze, plastic,
Approved Brands: Continental #SW11YW or impact #WH6000Y or
'WH6000G or equal Must fit Impact Buckets i
Continental Impact
578 $24.84 $14,307.84 |#SWI2YW $24.25 $13,968.00 | #¥WHB000Y $27.50 $15,840.00 |Cont. $W124 No Bid
lPads, Scouring, Medium to Heavy Duty:
Approved Brands: Americo 90-96 or GLIT/Micotron #96A or 3M #96 or
Glit/Disco MD69 or Calico KK810C or Hydra Sponge #6950 or ACS Ind.
Scrubble 5096
600 $8.20 $4,920.00 |Glit 20941 $31.25 $18,750.00 |3M 96 $9.26 $5,550.00 |As specified No Bid
Pads, Scouring
|| approved Brands Catico 24KK463 or disco PP-80 or Americo 96-88
360 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 HiMop, Toilet Bowl
77 Wl Approved Brands: All Star Dipper or ABCO # 02000 or Continental #790 or
Calico #280100 or Huntington #141228 or Impact #204 or Rex Johnny
Mop or Wilen #J51000 or ACS/Scrubble S096 or Tolco 280100 Wilen
8,000 $0.43 $3,440.00 |#J51000 $0.45 $3,600.00 [!mpact 204 $0.50 $4,000.00 | As specified No Bid
32 iisponges, Cellulose: approximately 6" X 4" X 1-3/8"
i Approved Brands: Hydra Sponge W3PK or Calico 53 or Spontex 7AU or
equal
5 500 No Bid $18.35 $9,175.00 |Tolco No 8id No Bid
33 {lPan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental 812 or Abco 00204-6 or Impact 2600 or Wilen
E604000 or ACS/Scrubble B542
Continental No Brand
2400 $5.45 8912BK $6.15 $14.760.00 |impact 2600 $6.90 $16,560.00 |Cont 912-BK $15.33 | $36,792.00 |Specitied
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8id #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Fivera Consulting & Management Services
Dade Paper Company District Healthcare Faycroft Interior & Purchasing, Inc. Corp.
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY [[Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & ModellUnit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
34 IDotly, Conversion, Self-Locking
) Approved Brands: Conti | #3244 or Continental/Huskee 3255 or
Impact #7704 or equal Continental No Brand
900 $15.35 $13,815.00 [#3255 $18.37 $16.633.00 |Impact 7704 $17.26 $15,525.00 |As specified $48.50 | $43,850.00 ified
Dispenser, Liquid Soap
: Approved Brands: Impact Detuxe Glow #4100 or equal
1,200 $9.05 $10,860.00 |impact #4100 $8.42 $10,104.00 |Impact 4100 $10.60 $12,720.00 |As specified No Bid
Dispenser, Paper Towel
Approved Brands: Dash Metal GA 200 or Continental G500 or Continentat X
{1#630W or Impact 4030W or equal. Continental » ,
B 1,400 $10.68 $14,952.00 1830W $17.61 $24,654.00 |Impact 4030 $12.25 $17,180.00 |As specified No Bid
Gum Remover
Approved Brands: Inchemeo F-178R, Orange-sol De-solve t@ or
Compliance Orange Solv-it or Rex Magic Mover or Caesar Safe-T-Soly or
Scot's Citrus Clean Remover or equal.
250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Broom, Standard, Heavy Duty
| ds: Carlisle 36 L - ;
“||[Approved Brands: Carlisle 3688403 or equal 5000 $5.29 $31,740.00 |Carlisle 3688403 No Bid $6.50 | $39,000.00 |As specified No Bid
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Bid #098-J402, Custodiai Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndalt

Verified by J. Bradley

Glennys Service & Supply, Inc Genisis i, Ing. Glocerot LLC ideat Supply ace Food Service
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf & Manut &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY llunit Price | Total Price  |Model Unit Price | Total Prica Manuf & Model jUnit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model ||Unit Price | Total Price Model
1 Bags, Paper
BagCraft
“llApproved Brands: Bagcraft Dubi-Wax® # 532 or equal S 532 as
150 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid $50.97 $7,645.50 [specified
B Pads, Carpet Scrubbing Witen
Approved Brands: Tuway # C19-6, Wilen #NO0B01Y9 or Wilen NOO7019 or ENOO7019 -
Hilequat Listed price on
bid as $9.78 per
: 60 No Bid $73.92 $4,435.20 |As Specified No Bid $58.68 $3.520.80 ipad vs case No Bid
3 Pads, Commercial, Soap Filled .
Approved Brands: 3M Scotch-Brite™ Rescue™ Soap Pad #50 or equal.
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Lid for 55 Galion Receptacle, Continental 5501
o Approved Brands: Yenus Labs # 493 or GO JO # 1109 or equal. Continental
N 26 No 8id $12.07 $313.82 iAs Specified No Bid $11.98 $311.48 |5501 No Bid
5 Can, Step-On, Disposal.
" Hlapproved Brands: Witt #2240 WH or Lawsen # 2240 or United # ST- 350W
' Rubbermaid
300 No Bid $44.02 $13,206.00 [As Specified No Bid $41.39 | $12,417.00 {ST35EP4 White Na Bid
6 Dolly, Bucket.
Approved Brands: Douglas Adjusto-Dolly #A-1 or equal
. Douglas
Adjusto-
Dolly #A-1
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,893.20 |As specified
7 Doodle Bug
Approved Brands: Americo Octopus # 0-200 or Glit #6472AB or, 3-M #6472
or ALL Star # 6472A or Bear Norton # 59417 or Tolco 208138 or equal
. Glit 20972A8 -
1800 No Bid $4.43 $7.974.00 |As Specified No Bid $28.42 | $51,156.00 [4 kits per case No Bid
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental # 715 or Wilen # E609012 or Impact # 4212
“illor equal
3 1008 No Bid $2.41 $2,429.28 {As Specified $3.15 $3.175.20 }lmpact 4212 $1.92 $1,935.36 |As Specified $3.28 $3,316.32 [As specified
Handle, for floor brush
Better Brush
i Approved Brands: Zimco #141 ( 45268 ) or Abco 01116 or equal. 140472 - Not Carliste (Zimco)
S 1500 No Bid $3.31 $4,965.00 |approved brand No Bid $3,885.00 [45268 No Bid
10 ||Squeegee, Floor: 18" 4.95 for
N ABCO -
Approved Brands: Continentat # 1800 or Impact #222-18 or Aboc BH14001 $11.49 for
or equal Abco BH- impact 222-
288 No Bid $5.36 $1,543.68 |As Specified $4.15 14001 $3.89 $1,120.32 [As Specified $4.95 $1,425.60 118
" Bucket, plastic: Approximately 10-12 quart capacity with imprint: .
Approved Brands: Rubbermaid # 2963 or Continentat # 8110RD or equal
i 1,440 No Bid $4.04 $5,817.60 |As Specified No Bid $3.64 $5,241.60 {As Specified No Bid
2125 || Pads, Stripping: for 20" diameter floor machine. Pad shall be of single unit
TEBID | Approved Brands: Glit # 20 Black 20014 or Americo # 400120 or Flexovil
2+ {IX1905 or 3M/Niagra 7200N or ACS/Scrubble #72-20 or Narton 54230 ACS/Scrubble
6,000 $13.16 | $78,960.00 |#72-20 $10.58 | $63,360.00 |As Specified $11.17 { $67,020.00 {As Specified $9.27 | $65,620.00 |As Specified $9.93 | $58,580.00 jAs Specified

Page 9

FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Bid #098-1J02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradiey

Glennys Service & Supply, Inc Genisis )i, Inc. Glocerol LLC tdeal Supply ace Food Service
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf & Manuf &
{TEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY ||Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model |[Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model ||[Unit Price | Total Price Model
13 Handle, For Floor Drain Brush: 5" handle is non-absorbent plastic,
For ACS as
p N specified -
BEJECT WlApproved Brands: Carlisle # 40238-00 or ACS/Scrubbie #B1460 or equal - $11.96 for
“[[REVISE SPECIFICATIONS REGARDING MALE OR FEMALE THREAD TYPE ACS/Secrubble Carlisle as
: 72 $8.97 $645.84 [#B1460 $10.28 $738.72 | As Specified $7.60 $547.20 JACS B1460 $11.31 $814.32 {As specified $9.65 $694.80 |specified
14 |lWaste Basket
TiE BIb JlContinental 7ANBK or Witt 9640bl or Witt #4bkl or equat
3,024 No Bid $6.39 $19,323.36 |As Specified No Bid $6.21 | $18,779.04_|As Specified No Bid
15 |Bags, Vinyl
o Approved Brands: Dow Canvas # KR-5605V or Maybeck # 55RVM-BL or i Maybeck #
“ninflequal. 120 No 8id s11.42 $1.370.40 |55RVM-BL No Bid $11.51 $1,381.20 [As Specified No Bid
18 |lLid, for 20 gallon plastic receptacle
‘HlApproved Brands: Continental # 2001 . No Substitute
72 No Bid $4.89 $352.08 |As Specified No Bid $4.24 $305.28 |As Specified No Bid
17 jiLid, for 44 gailon plastic receptacte
2-||Approved Brands: Continental # 4445 . No Substitute
i X 36 No Bid $9.94 $367.84 |As Specified No Bid $9.56 $344,18 [As Specified No Bid
18 |iGloves, Cleaning, Medium
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 (212515) .
Ansell 8-354 as.
’ 48 No Bid $2,264.16 [specified No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Large
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # B-354 ( 212516 ) Size 9 o Safety Toda
#9564 . Ansell 8-354 as .
24 No Bid $1.132.08 |specified No 8id No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Extra Large
. Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 (212517) .,
; Ansell 8-354 as
24 No Bid $1,132.08 {specified Nao 8id No Bid Na Bid
Handle, Wall Brush.
Magnolia
“.liApproved Brands Magnolia Brush B96 or Carlisle 3620058 or equal. Brush or
: $9.17 for
480 No Bid $7.55 $3,624.00 [As Specified No Bid $6.70 $3,216.00 |As Specified $6.99 $3,355.20 |Carlisle
22 |lIlcan, Garbage, Plastic
Approved Brands: Continental #2000 or impact #7720 No Substiute
800 No Bid 510,47 $8,376.00 |As Specified $16.20 | $12,960.00 |As specified $10.39 | $8,312.00 |As Specified $14.42 | $11,536.00 |As specified
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Bid #088-J02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndalt

Verified by J. Bradley

Glennys Service & Supply, Inc Genisis |1, Inc. Glogerol LLC ideal Supply ace Food Service
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY [Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Modet |Unit Price [ Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model |{Unit Price | Total Price Model
23 lCart, Housekeeping
Approved Brands: lmpact #6850 or Continental #184 or equat
Tt Continental
360 No Bid $70.73 $25,462.80 |As Specified $86.00 | $30,960.00 |As specified $69.39 | $24,980.40 |#184 $80.65 | $29,034.00 |As specified
Receptacle, Waste, 32 gallon capacity :
. [lApproved Brands: Continental # 3200 or Impact # 7732
576 No Bid $12.28 $7,073.28 |As Specified $21,70 | $12,499.20 |As specified $12.66 | $7,234.56 |As Specified $18.56 | $10,690.56 JAs specified
25 liReceptacle, Waste, 44 gallon capacity
~[iApproved Brands: Continental #4444 or impact #7744 No Substitute
e ¢ Continental
432 No Bid $19.73 $8,523.36 [As Specified $26.00 | $11,232.00 {As specified || ©'§19.54 $8,441.28 | #4444 PL Grey $24.24 | $10,471.68 |As specified
26 JiReceptacle, Waste, 55 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #5500 GY - No Substitute
7 : Continental
800 No Bid $37.88 $30,304.00 [As Specified No Bid $36.80 | $29,440.00 #5500 PL GY No Bid
Can, Trash
Approved Brands: Bennet Bilt #1300BGRN or United Metal # 130FDL or
* [iUnited Receptacles # TI424ERBWH or equal.
100 No Bid $111.69 $11,169.00 {As Specified No 8id $103.28 | $10,328.00 |As Specified No Bid
Wringer, Small: Side squeeze, plastic.
Approved Brands: Continental #SW11YW or Impact ¥WH6000Y or
'WH6000G or equal Must fit Impact Buckets : X
impact S ! Continental
576 No Bid $24.18 $13,927.68 |As Specified $26.40 | $15,206.40 |WHB00Qy T $23.31° | $13,426.56 |#SW11Yw $23.78 | $13,697.28 |As specified
Pads, Scouring, Medium to Heavy Duty:
Approved Brands: Americo 90-96 or GLIT/Micotron #96A ar 3M #96 or
Glit/Disco MD69 or Calico KKB10C or Hydra Sponge #6950 or ACS ind.
Scrubble S096
il 600 No Bid $8.23 $4.838.00 |As Specified $12.00 $7,200.00 jAcs 5096 $7.79 $4.674.00 {As Specified $10.16 $6,096.00 {As specified
30 |iPads, Scouring
Approved Brands Calico 24KK463 or disco PP-80 or Americo 96-88
360 No Bid $9.86 $3,549.60 |As Specified No Bid $6.78 $2,440.80 [As Specified No Bid
3t Maop, Toflet Bowl
~i|llApproved Brands: Alf Star Dipper or ABCO # 02000 or Continental #790 or price for ©
Calico #280100 or Huntington #141228 or Impact #204 or Rex Johnny Impact or
“{iMop or Wilen #J51000 or ACS/Scrubble 5096 or Tolco 280100 ACS/Scrubble ABCO - $.62]
2 8,000 $0.72 $5,760.00 1S086. $0.49 $3,920.00 jAs Specified $0.50 $4,000.00 !As specified $0.45 $3,600.00_|As Specified $0.49 $3,920.00 |for ACS
32 HIspanges, Cellulose: approximately 6" X 4" X 1-3/8"
Approved Brands: Hydra Sponge W3PK or Calico $3 or Spontex 7AU or
equal Supply plus
1041 - Not
500 No Bid $9.12 $4,560.00 |specified brand No 8id No 8id No Bid
33 {lPan, Dust Price for
. Impact -
[iApproved Brands: Continentatl 812 or Abco 00204-6 or Impact 2600 or Wilen §5.46 for
* (|E604000 or ACS/Scrubble 8542 ABCO -
ACS/Scrubble i o $6.98 for
2400 $8.91 | $21,384.00 {8542 $5.28 $12,672.00 {As Specified $7.18 | $17,232.00 iAs specified $6.12 | $12,288.00 {Continental 8§12 $6.94 | $14,256.00 |ACS
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8id #098-JJ02, Custodial Clean&nb Supplies
Prepared by R, Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Glocero! LLC

Glennys Service & Supply, Inc Genisis 11, Inc. ideal Supply ace Food Service
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf & : Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY |Unit Prica | Total Price  |Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model [|Unit Price | Total Price Maodel Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model {|Unit Price | Total Price Model
34 {IDolly, Conversion, Self-Locking
Approved Brands: Continental #3244 or Continental/Huskee 3255 or
Impact #7704 or equal Continental
900 No Bid $14.72 $13,248.00 [As Specified $20.00 | $18,000.00 {As specified $12,987.00 [3255 $17.99 | $16,191.00 {As ified
35 |IDispenser, Liquid Soap Tolco 230116 -
“/|lApproved Brands: Impact Deluxe Glow #4100 or squal Doe§ not mest
i specifications -
product is
plastic instead
” 1,200 No Bid $5.29 $6,348.00 |of metat $9.50 § $11,400.00 [As specified $8.24 $9,888.00 [As Specified $8.12 $9,744.00 jAs specified
36 lbispenser, Paper Towel
Approved Brands: Dash Metal GA 200 or Continental G500 or Continental
3 § t 4030W i
|| #O30W or impac or equa 1,400 No Bid $10.24 | $14,336.00 [As Specified $20.00 | $28,000.00 |As specif $10.04 | 814,056.00 |As Specified $16.99 | $23,786.00 |As specified
37 |lGum Remover
i {iApproved Brands: inchemco F-178R, Orange-sol De-solve It® or
i/ [iCompliance Orange Salv-it or Rex Magic Mover or Caesar Safe-T-Solv or
HiScot’s Citrus Clean Remover or equal.
: 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.41 $9,102.50 {As Specified No Bid
38 ligroom, Standard, Heavy Duty Better Brush
: isle 36884 L. RN 430809 - meets| ) 3
7j|Approved Brands: Carlisle 3658403 or equa 6000 No Bid " '$4.88:  $27,480.00 |spacifications No Bid $4.97 | $29,820.00 |As Specified $4.89 | $29,940.00 |As specified
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8id #098-JJ02, Custodiat Cleaning Supplies

Prepared

by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradiey

Peninsular Paper Company Pride Enterprises Pyramid School Products Reliable Custodial
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY #Unit Price | Total Price Madel Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & ModeljiUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
1 Bags, Paper
Approved Brands: Bagcraft Dubl-Wax® # 532 or equal
150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pads, Carpet Scrubbing
Approved Brands: Tuway # C19-6, Witen #N008019 or Wilen NOO7019 or As Specified -
equal Quafified bid -
Min. order Wilen
80 $53.21 $3,192.60 [quantity No 8id $58.02 $3,481.20 [NOQ7019 No Bid
Pads, Commercial, Soap Filled
Approved Brands: 3M Scotch-Brite™ Rescue™ Soap Pad #50 or equal.
100 No Bid No Bid $5,478.00 |3M 60 No Bid
Lid for 55 Galion Receptacle, Continental 5501 Continental
: As Spegcified - 5501 - Vendor
Approved Brands: Venus Labs # 493 or GO JO # 1109 or equal. Quaiified bid - qualified bid -
3 26 $310.04 $261.04 | Order Quantit No Bid $10.10 $262.60 ] Order Quantity No Bid
Can, Step-On, Disposal.
Approved Brands: Witt #2240 WH or Lawsen # 2240 or United # ST- 350W
300 $47.52 $14,256.00 {As specified No Bid $47.99 $14,397.00 |Witt #2240 No Bid
Dolly, Bucket.
{lApproved Brands: Douglas Adjusto-Dolly #A-1 or equal
80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doadte Bug
Approved Brands: Americo Octopus # 0-200 or Glit #6472AB or, 3-M #6472
or ALL Star # 6472A or Bear Norton # 59417 or Tolco 208138 or equal
1800 $7.13 $12,834.00 {As Specified No Bid $5.31 $9,558.00 | Tolco 208138 No 8id
Pan, Dust Continental #
lapproved Brands: Continental # 715 or Wilen # £609012 or Impact # 4212 As Specified - 716 -Qualified
or equal Qualified bid - Impact bid - order
1008 $1.88 $1,874.88 [order guantity $3.07 $3,094.56 {4212 $1.87 $1,884.96 [quantity $2.84 $2,862.72 |Impact 4212
Handle, for floor brush
Approved Brands: Zimco #141 (45268 ) or Abco 01116 or equal. (é‘a"r‘lfl‘;e)
1500 No Bid No Bid $2.98 $4,440.00 |#45268 No Bid
Squeegee, Floor: 18"
“liApproved Brands: Continental # 1800 or Impact #222-18 or Aboc BH14001
or equal As Spagified - ABCO BH-
288 $4.84 $1,336.32 |Qualified bid $3.98 $1,146.24 114001 $3.99 $1,149.12 | Abco BH1400 $10.82 $3,116.16 {Impact 222-18
Bucket, plastic: Approximately 10-12 quart capacity with imprint:
N " Continental #
: Rubb d # 296 t
Approved Brands: Rubbermai 3 or Continentat # 8110RD or equal As Specified - 8110RD -
Qualified bid - qualified bid -
minimum order; minimum order
1,440 $3.51 $5,054.40 {guantity No Bid $3.52 $5,068.80 [quantity No Bid
Pads, Stripping: for 20" diameter floor machine. Pad shali be of single unit
+TIEBID M Approved Brands: Glit # 20 Black 20014 or Americo # 400120 or Flexovil
: X1905 or 3M/Niagra 7200N or ACS/Scrubble #72-20 or Norton 54230 ACS/Scrub Giit # 20 Black
8,000 $9.20 $55,200.00 |Glit 20014 $11.70 | $70,200.00 |ble #72-20 $9.31 $65,860.00 {20014 $10.39 | $62,340.00 |ACS72-20
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Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Peninsular Paper Company Pride Enterprises Pyramid School Products Reliable Custodial
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {lUnit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Modet Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & ModegljjUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
13 llHandle, For Fioor Drain Brush: 5'handle is non-absorbent plastic.
REJECT i Approved Brands: Carlisle # 40238-00 or ACS/Scrubble #B1460 or equal - ACS/Scrub
1 |[REVISE SPECIFICATIONS REGARDING MALE OR FEMALE THREAD TYPE As Specified - ble ACS/Scrubble
B 72 $8.13 $6857.36 |Qualiified bid $7.88 $574.56 {#B1460 $7.98 $574.58 [#B1460 $7.53 $542.16 JACS B1460
14 llwaste Basket As Specified
' fifContinental 71NBK or Witt 9640bL or Witt #4bkl or equal {Vendor
located in
Winter Park, Contingntal
3,024 $6.11 $18,476.64 {Fl} No Bid $6.18 $18,718.86 [71NBK No Bid
Bags, Vinyl
Approved Brands: Dow Canvas # KR-5605V or Maybeck # 55RVM-BL or Maybeck #
equal. 120 No Bid No Bid $13,42 $1,610.40 [55RVM-B No Bid
Lid, for 20 gallon plastic receptacle
As Specified - Continental #
Approved Brands: Continental # 2001 . No Substitute Qualified bid - 2001~ Qualitied
. minimum ordet bid - minimum
bl 72 $3.27 $235.44 [quantity No Bid $3.31 $238.32 |order guantity No Bid
17 gliid, for 44 gallon plastic receptacle Continental #
| . . As Specified - 4445 -
. Approved Brands: Continental # 4445 . No Substitute Quaiified bid - Qualified bid -
- minimum orde: Minimum order
36 $7.64 $275.04 |quantity No 8id $7.72 $277.92 |quantity No Bid
18 liGloves, Cleaning, Medium
‘il Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 ( 212515 ) .
: 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Large
L Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 ( 212516 ) Size 9 or Safety Today]
#9564 .
24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Extra Large
i|[Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 { 212517) .
24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Handle, Wall Brush.
As Specified -
i [1Approved Brands Magnolia Brush B96 or Carlisle 3620058 or equal. Qualified bid -
minimum ordet i Carlisle
A80 $6.29 $3,019.20 jquantity No Bid $6.98 $3,350.40 ]3620058 No 8id
22 jican, Garbage, Plastic
[|4pproved Brands: Continental #2000 or Impact #7720 No Substiute
Continental
800 $10.21 $8,168.00 |As Specified No Bid $10.32 $8,256.00 | #2000 $14.86 | $11,888.00 impact 7720
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Bid #098-1402, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndal}

Verified by J. Bradiey

Peninsutar Paper Company Pride Enterprises Pyramid School Products Reliable Custodial
ESTIMATED Marnwuf & Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY kUnit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model||Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
Cart, Housekeeping
- Approved Brands: tmpact #6850 or Continental #184 or equal
e As Continental
360 $70.24 $25,286.40 |As Specified $92.04 | $33,134.40 |specified $70.99 $25,556.40 1#184 $82.49 | $29,696.40 |Impact 6850
Receptacle, Waste, 32 gailon capacity
s+ fiApproved Brands: Continental # 3200 or Impact # 7732 As Specified -
. Qualified bid - Continental #
Minimum 3200 -
: 576 $11.97 $6,894.72 |order guantity No Bid $12.09 $6,963.84 |Qualified Bid $19.12 | $11,013.12 jImpact 7732
26 [IReceptacle, Waste, 44 gallon capacity
“iApproved Brands: Continental #4444 or Impact #7744 No Substitute
Continental
432 $19.58 $8.458.56 [Contico 4444 No Bid $19.83 $8,566.56 |#4444 $25.02 | $10,808.64 |Impact 7744
Receptacle, Waste, 55 gallon capacity
JliAppraved Brands: Continental #5500 GY - No Substitute
Continental
800 $36.88 $29,504.00 jAs Specified No Bid $37.33 $29,864.00 #5500 GY $64.16 | $51,328.00 |Impact 7755
Can, Trash
Approved Brands: Bennet Bilt #1300BGRN or United Metal # 130FDL ar
||United Receptacles # T1424ERBWH or equal. United
Receptacles #
100 No Bid No Bid $132.95 $13,295.00 | T1424ERBWH No Bid
Wringer, Small: Side squeeze, plastic.
Approved Brands: Continental #SW11YW or impact #WH6000Y or
:HIWH6000G or equal Must fit Impact Buckets .
As Continental
578 $23.42 $13,489.92 |As Specitied $27.14 $15.632.64 |Specified $23.88 $13,645.44 {#SW11YW $24.29 | $13,991.04 [impact WH 8000
Pads, Scouring, Medlum to Heavy Duty:
Approved Brands: Americo $0-96 or GLIT/Micotron #96A or 3M #96 or
Glit/Disco MD69 or Calico KKB10C or Hydra Sponge #6950 or ACS Ind.
|ISerubble s096
Glit 20947 as As GUT/Micotron -
600 $4.596.00 |specified $11.96 $7,176.00 |Specified $7.75 $4,650.00 |New #20891 No Bid
Pads, Scouring
(Approved Brands Calico 24KK463 or disco PP-80 or Americo 96-88
Glit/Disco disco PP-80 -
380 $2,239.20 120960 No Bid $6.34 $2,282.40 |20980 No Bid
Mop, Toilet Bow!
:liApproved Brands: All Star Dipper or ABCO # 02000 or Continentat #790 or As Specified -
Calico #280100 or Huntington #141228 or Impact #204 or Rex Johnny Quatified bid -
[[Mop or Wilen #151000 or ACS/Scrubble S096 or Tolco 280100 minimum orde: ABCO #
8,000 $0.40 $3,200.00 iquantity $0.49 $3,920.00_|02000 $0.40 $3,200.00 [Tolco 280100 $0.48 $3,840.00 {Impact 204
Sponges, Cellulose: approximately 6" X 4" X 1-3/8"
Approved Brands: Hydra Spange W3PK or Calico $3 or Spontex 7AU or
-flequal
3 Hydra Sponge
500 No Bid No Bid $6.59 $3,295.00 [W3PK No Bid
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental 812 or Abco 00204-6 or Impact 2600 or Wilen
E604000 or ACS/Scrubble B542 Continental
Contico . Abco 812 -New #
2400 $5.14 $12,336.00 19128BK $7.31 $17.544.00 100204-6 $5.23 $12,562.00 19128K $5.89 | $14,136.00 {Impact 2600
Page 15 FM-3738 Rev.

(08-98}




Bid #098-4J02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Peninsutar Pager Company Pride Enterprige: Pyramid Schoo! Products Reliable Custodial
ESTIMATED Manuf & Manuf &
TEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {iUnit Price | Total Price Modet Unit Price | Total Price Model Unit Price [ Total Price Manuf & MadelflUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
34 {lipolly, Conversion, Self-Locking
Approved Brands: Continental #3244 or Continental/Huskee 3255 or
impact #7704 or equal impact Continental
900 §$14.48 $13,032.00 |As Specified $20.70 | $18,630.00 |#7704 $314.65 $13,185.00 (3255 $18.62 | $16,758.00 |Impact 7704
Dispenser, Liquid Soap
Approved Brands: Impact Deluxe Glow #4100 or equal
ep P 9 Cwaco
CwB00P- Does
Impact not meet spec.

1,200 No Bid $9.29 | $11,148.00 {44100 $3.96 $4,752.00 Iplastic brackets| $8.37 | $10,044.00 |Impact 4100
Dispenser, Paper Towel
Approved Brands: Dash Metal GA 200 or Continental G500 or Continental _
#630W or Impact 4030W or equal. » Impact Continental

1,400 $9.98 $13,972.00 |As Spacified $19.45 | $27,230.00 [4030W $10.09 $14,126.00 |#630W $17.32 | $24,248.00 |Impact 4030W
Gum Removar
Approved Brands: Inch F-178R, Orangi D ive t® or
Compliance Orange Solv-it or Rex Magic Mover or Caesar $Safe-T-Solv or
Scot's Citrus Clean Remover or equal.

250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Broom, Standard, Heavy Duty

liApproved Brands: Carlisle 3688403 or equal. . . Carliste
6000 $4,99 $29,940.00 jAs Specified No Bid $5.05 $30,300.00 {3688403 $7.89 | $47,340.00 {Carisle 3688403
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Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R, Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Rex Chemical Unisource
ESTIMATED Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY [[Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model #Unit Price | Total Price Model
1 Bags, Paper
Approved Brands: Bageraft Dubl-Wax® # 532 or equal
150 No Bid No Bid
iflpads, Carpet Scrubbing
Approved Brands: Tuway # C19-6, Wilen #N008019 or Wilen N0OO7019 or
equal
60 No Bid No Bid
Pads, Commercial, Soap Filled
Approved Brands: 3M Scotch-Brite™ Rescue™ Soap Pad #50 or equat.
: 100 No Bid No Bid
Lid for 55 Gallon Receptacle, Continentat 5501
Approved Brands: Venus Labs # 493 or GO JO # 1109 or equal.
28 No Bid No Bid
Can, Step-On, Disposal,
Approved Brands: Witt #2240 WH or Lawsen # 2240 or United # ST- 350W
300 No Bid $51.87 | $15,561.00 {Witt 2240
Dolly, Bucket.
Approved Brands: Douglas Adjusto-Dolly #A-1 or equal
80 No Bid No 8id
Doodle Bug
Approved Brands: Americo Octopus # 0-200 or Glit #6472A8 or, 3-M #6472
or ALL Star # 6472A or Bear Norton # 59417 or Tolco 208138 or equal
1800 No Bid $6.08 | $10,944.00
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental # 715 or Wilen # E609012 or Impact # 4212
or equal tmpact
1008 No Bid $3.75 | $3.780.00 |4212
Handle, for floor brush
Approved Brands: Zimco #141 ( 45268 ) or Abco 01116 or equal.
1500 No Bid No Bid
Squeegee, Floor: 18"
(Approved Brands: Continental # 1800 or Impact #222-18 or Aboc BH14001
or equal
288 No Bid No Bid
Bucket, plastic: Approximately 10-12 quart capacity with imprint:
Approved Brands: Rubbermaid # 2963 or Continental # 8110RD or equal
1,440 No Bid No Bid
Pads, Stripping: for 20" diameter floor machine, Pad shall be of single unit
Approved Brands: Glit # 20 Black 20014 or Americo # 400120 or Flexovil
X1905 or 3M/Niagra 7200N or ACS/Scrubble #72-20 or Norton 54230 Americo
8,000 $17.30 [$103.800.00 |Niagra 7200N $10.95 | $65,700.00 |400120
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Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Rex Chemical Unisource
ESTIMATED Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY {{Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model [fUnit Price | Total Price Modei
13 liHandle, For Floor Drain Brush: 5 handle is non-absorbent plastic.
Approved Brands: Carliste # 40238-00 or ACS/Scrubble #B1460 or equal -
REVISE SPECIFICATIONS REGARDING MALE OR FEMALE THREAD TYPE
72 No Bid No Bid
Waste Basket
/llContinental 71NBK or Witt 9640bl or Witt #4bki or equal
3,024 No Bid $8.19 | $24,766.56 |Witt4BK
Bags, Vinyl
g Approved Brands: Dow Canvas # KR-5608V or Maybeck # 55RVM-BL or
jlequal. 120 No Bid No Bid
Lid, for 20 gailon plastic receptacle
. Approved Brands: Continental # 2001 . No Substitute
L 72 No Bid No Bid
7 fiLid, for 44 gallon plastic receptacle .
lapproved Brands: Continentat # 4445 . No Substitute
36 No Bid ' No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Medium ’
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 { 212515 ) .
48 Ng Bid } No Bid
Gloves, Cleaning, Large
Approved Brands: Ansell Edmont # 8-354 ( 212516 ) Size 9 or Safety Today|
#9564 .
24 No Bid No Bid
iGloves, Cleaning, Extra Large
Approved Brands: Anseil Edmont # 8-354 ( 212517) .
24 No Bid No Bid
Handle, Wall Brush.
Approved Brands Magnolia Brush B96 ar Carlisle 3620058 or equal.
480 No Bid No Bid
Can, Garbage, Plastic
Approved Brands: Continental #2000 or Impact #7720 No Substiute
Impact
800 No Bid $17.45 | $13,960.00 [7720

Page 18 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Bid #098-JJ02, Custodial Cleaning Suppiies
Prepared by R. Tyndall

Verified by J. Bradley

Rex Chemical Unisource
ESTIMATED Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY [lUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Mode!  |Unit Price | Total Price Model
23 iCart, Housekeeping
; Approved Brands: Impact #6850 or Continental #184 or equat
impact
360 $86.21 | $31,035.60 |Impact 6850 $115.563 | $41,590.80 16850
Receptacie, Waste, 32 gallon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental # 3200 or Impact # 7732
impact
576 No Bid $23.88 | $13,754.88 17732
Receptacle, Waste, 44 galion capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #4444 or impact #7744 No Substitute
mpact
432 No Bid $30.10 | $13,003.20 |7744
Receptacle, Waste, 55 gatlon capacity
Approved Brands: Continental #5500 GY - No Substitute
800 No Bid $53.86 | $43,088.00 |impack
Can, Trash
Approved Brands: Bennet Biit #1300BGRN or United Metal # 130FDL or
United Receptacies # T1424ERBWH or equal.
100 Mo Bid No Bid
(Wringer, Small: Side squeeze, plastic.
Approved Brands: Continental #SW11YW or Impact #WH6000Y or
WH6000G or equal Must fit Impact Buckets
Impact
576 $26.83 | $15,454.08 |Impact WH 8000 $37.40 | $21,542.40 [WH6000Y
Pads, Scouring, Medium to Heavy Duty: ;l‘agra r?:d- ot
Vi
Approved Brands: Amel:(co 90-96 or GLIT/Micatron #96A or 3M #36 or bianzp- Also case
Glit/Disco MD69 or Calico KK810C or Hydra Sponge #6950 or ACS Ind. pack is only 20
Scrubble 5096 instead of 60 -
price for 60 = Americo
600 $4.60 $2,760.00 [$14.04 $12.78 $7,656.00 |90-96
Pads, Scouring
Approved Brands Calico 24KK463 or disco PP-80 or Americo 96-88
Americo
360 No Bid $11.70 $4,212.00 {96-88
Mop, Tollet Bowl N
Approved Brands: All Star Dipper or ABCO # 02000 or Continentat #7590 or
|[Calico #280100 or Huntington #141228 or Impact #204 or Rex Johnny
Mop or Wilen #J51000 or ACS/Scrubble S096 or Tolco 280100
R 8,000 $0.55 $4,400.00 |Impact 204 $1.03 $8,240.00 |lmpact 204
ponges, Cellulose: approxi ly 6" X 4" X 1-3/8"
/ Approved Brands: Hydra Sponge W3PK or Calico $3 or Spontex 7AU or
equat
500 No Bid No 8id
Pan, Dust
Approved Brands: Continental 812 or Abco 00204-6 or Impact 2600 or Wilen
E604000 or ACS/Scrubble B542
Impact
2400 $6.70 } $16,080.00 |Impact 2300 $8.98 | $21,552.00 [2600
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Bid #098-1J02, Custodial Cleaning Supplies
Prepared by R. Tyndatfi

Verified by J. Bradley

Rex Chemical Unisource
ESTIMATED Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY lIUnit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model  #Unit Price [ Total Price Model
34 iiDolly, Conversion, Self-Locking
Approved Brands: Continental #3244 or Continental/Huskee 3255 or
impact #7704 or equal Impact
900 $20.40 | $18,360.00 [Impact 7704 $20.67 | $18,513.00 (7704
Dispenser, Liquid Soap
Approved Brands: Impact Deluxe Glow #4100 or equal
Impact
1,200 $8.17 1 $11,004.00 jlmpact 4100 $8.56 | $10,272.00 [4100
Dispenser, Paper Towel
Approved Brands: Dash Metal GA 200 or Continental G500 or Continental
#630W or Impact 4030W or equal, Impact
1,400 $17.28 | $24,182.00 |Impact 4030W $17.47 | $24,458.00 {4030
Gum Remover
Approved Brands: Inch F-178R, Orangt { D ive t® or
Compllance Orange Solv-it or Rex Magic Mover or Caesar Safe-T-Solv or
Scot’s Citrus Clean Remover or equal.
: 2850 $7.895.00 jRex Majic Mover No Bid
Broom, Standard, Heavy Duty
“HlApproved Brands: Carlisle 3688403 or equal. Carlisle368
PP q 6000 No Bid $5.40 | $32,400.00 |403
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