BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid No.: 086-JJ01

Title:  Circulation Desk and Components

Buyer: James Williams

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 088-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

NAME OF BIDDER: BRODART CO.

NAME OF BIDDER: CONTEMPORARY INTERIOR,

ITEM[ M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. ] UNIT | PRICE PER | EXTENDED PRICE |MANUFACTURER &] PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
UNIT MODEL # PRICE MODEL #
kltems 1through 2B, Will Be Awarded Tota! Low Group Price
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two
1 computers. Approximately* 60* W X 30 "D, sides and back pane!
shall be approximately 36" H.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 ] Each $825.00 $21,450.00167-782 $596.001 $15,496.00f  Contemporary
Interior inc. OM CS1
30 X 80 X36
1A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 |} Each $815.00] $40,750.00§67-782 $566.20 $28,310.00] Contemporary
Interior inc. OM C81
30 X 60 X36
1B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 | Each $805.00 $281,750.00§67-782 $536.40] $187,740.00] Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM CS1
30.X.60 %36
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two Contemporary
2 computers, Approximately* 80" W X 24 *D, sides and back panel Interior Inc. OM CS1
shall be approximately 36" 24 X 60 X38
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 Each $825.00 $21,450.00§67-782-MOD $566.00] $14,716.001 Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM CS1
. 24 X 60 X36
2A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 § Each $815.00 $40,750.00§67-782-MOD $537.70] $26,885.00f Contemporary
Interior inc. OM C81
24 X 80 %38
2B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 { Each $805.00 $281,750.00§67-782-MOD $509.40 $178,200.00f Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM CS1
— 24.X 60 X386
Total Low Group ltems 1 through 2B $687,900.00 $451,437.00)
iﬂems 3 through 3E, Wil Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Circulation Desk and Components Elementary and K-8: 5 Each $1,151.98] $5,759.90467-775,67-820- $602.305 $3,011.50  Contemporary
3 Single Pedestal, 42" X 30 D X 29"H. Please See Attachment 001,67-814 Interior inc. OM .
Specifications -3 pages 1-3. CDws2
3A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 29°H, 5 Each $664.30 $3,321.50{67-762 $394.25 $1,971.25E Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDWS51 30 X36X29
38 Triangular Corner Unit, 30W* x 30*H. 5 Each $432.10 $2,1 605&67-766 $384.75 $1 ,923.7?“ Contemporary
Interior inc. OM
CDCF2
3C Book Drop Unit 30'W x 30"D X 29'H. 5 Each $402.42 $2,012.1ae7-792 $403.75 $2,018.75]  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDBD 30X30X29
3D Depressible Book truck 30W" X 22H, 5 Each $577.52 $2,887.60J67-794 $561.45 $2,807.25]  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDRT 22¥anxos
3E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29"H. 5 Each $584.66 $2,923.30067-758 $460.75 $2,303.75  Contemporary
Interior inc. OM
CDCS 30X36X29
Totai Low Group ltems 3 through 3E $19,064.90] $14,036.25
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810 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

Prepared By.
Aeviswed By:

[Bid No.: 086-4301 NAME OF BIDDER: CONTRAX FURNISHINGS INC, NAME OF BIDDER: GAYLORD BROS. NAME OF BIDDER: JC WHITE OFFICE
Tiie: . Circiation Dask and Components FURNITURE
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM] M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | PRICE PER | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER | EXTENDED §MANUFACTURER &] PRICE PER | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT FPRICE MODEL #
ltems 1 through 2B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two
1 computers. Approximately* 60" W X 30 *D, sides and back panel
shall be approximately 36" H.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 $846.618  $22,011.86] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.00§ $17,550.00] ES-603039-MOD $665.00f  $17,290.00, DYNASTY
B3060CT NC FURNITURE
CUST
1A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $834.35] $41,717.50f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.00§ $33,750.00] ES-603039-MOD $631.25 $31,562.50) DYNASTY
B3060CT NC FURNITURE
CUSTOM
18 Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $822.26f $287,791.00f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.004 $236,250,057 ES-603039-MOD $600.00f $210,000.00 DYNASTY
B3060CT NC FURNITURE
CUSTOM
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two|
2 computers. Approximately* 60* W X 24 *D, sides and back panei
shall be approximately 36"
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 $766.21 $19,921.468f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.00f $17.550.00] ES-602439-MOD $656.25 $14,462.50)] DYNASTY
B2460CT NC FURNITURE
CUSTOM
2A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $754.948 $37,747.00] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.00f $33,750.00f ES-602439-MOD $527.50f  $26,375.00 DYNASTY
B2460CT NC FURNITURE
CUST
2B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $744.00f $260,400.00f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $675.00] $236,250.00] ES-602439-MOD $502.50f $175,875.00) DYNASTY
B2460CT NC FURNITURE
— CUSTOM
Total Low Group ltems 1 through 2B $669,588.82 $575,100.0ﬁ $475,565.00)
lltems 3 through 3E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Circulation Desk and Components Elementary and K-8: 5 $1,654.39 $8,271.95f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $1,292.00f  $6,460.00) GA3234NC $783.75 $3,918.75) DYNASTY
3 Single Pedestal, 42" X 30 D X 29"H. Piease See Attachment MCD-42D-28 W/WPB61222 FURNITURE
Speclfications -3 pages 1-3. SW & AAKT001B2460CT CUSTOM
3A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 29°H. 5 $1,181.55 $5,907.75 MCD-36KS-29 $766.00f  $3,830.00] GA3209-NC $671.25 $3,356.25 CUSTOM
3B Triangular Corner Unit, 30W" x 30*H. 5 $924.18 $4,620.90 MCD-30TCS-29 $700.00f $3,500.00) GA3228-NC $495.00) $2,475.00) CUSTOM
3C Book Drop Unit 30*W x 30*D X 29°H. 5 $814.03  $4,070.15 MCD-36BR-29 $650.00]  $3,250.00} GA3205-NC $598.75 $2,993.7§h CUSTOM
3D Depressibie Book truck 30W* X 22"H. 5 $1,003.70 $5,018.50 MCD-22DBT $740.00f $3,700.00f GAB7D32-NC $881.25 $4,406.25) CUSTOM
3E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29'H. 5 $1,154.69 $5,773.45 MCD-36CS-29 $925.00]  $4,625.00 GA3210-NC $756.25 $3,781.25 CUSTOM
“Total Low Group ltems 3 through 3E $33,662.70) $25,365.00] $20,931.25
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8I0 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Tha School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

Prepared By.
Reviewed By:

Bid No.: 086-JJ01

INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT INC

MARK PRODUCTS /Demaria Holding

MOULTRIE POST FORMS:

Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Williams
ITEM} M-DCPSNO. DESCRIPTION QTY. { PRICE PER | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED § MANUFACTURER §PRICE PER} EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
fltems 1 through 2B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two
1 computers. Approximately* 60" W X 30 *D, sides and back panel
shall be approximately 36” H.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 $457.001 $11,882.00 MFG-iPI i $760.00 $19,760.00; MC11/29-30 $395.00f $10,270.00 MPF3060CC
1
1
1A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $402.00f $20,100.00] MFG-IPI ; $725.004 $36,250.00 MC11/29-30 $360.00§ $18,000.00 MPF3060CC
i
I et ——
1B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $372.00] $130,200.00 MFG-iP} jl $690.00{ $241,500.004 MC11/29-30 $325.004 $113,750.00 MRF3060CC
I
1
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy fraestanding with two ‘g
2 computers. Approximately” 60" W X 24 "D, sides and back pane! i
shall be approximately 36" i
Minimum Order. 1-10 each 26 $408.00{ $10,608.00 MFG.IPI } $760.00 $19,760.004 MC11/29-24 $375.00; $9,750.00f MPF32460CC
2A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $356.00f $17,800.00 MFG.IPI $725.00 $36,250.00 MC11/2g-24 $340.00§ $17,000.00] MPF32460CC
2B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $326.00§ $114,100.00) MFG.IP! i $690.008 $241,500.00 MC11/2g-24 $305.00f $106,750.00] } MPF32460CC
!
Total Low Group ltems 1 through 2B $304,690.00 1 $595,020.00) $275,620.00f Does not meet
specifications1 1/4
counter top
U Y SR thickness
Ihems 3 through 3E, WIll Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Circulation Desk and Components Elementary and K.8: 5 $684.00 $3,420.00]  MFG.IPT | 3765.000 5383500 CD11/30 NO BID
3 Single Pedestal, 42" X 30 D X 29"H. Please See Attachment
Specitications -3 pages 1-3.
3A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30°D X 29"H. 5 $463.00) $2,315.00 MFG. 1Pt $515.00 $2,575.00] 1501KS NO BID
3B Triangular Comner Unit, 30W* x 30°H. 5 $350.00, $1,750.00 MFG. 1P $580.00 $2,900.00} 1501C8U NO BID
]
3C Book Drop Unit 30*W x 30°D X 29"H. 5 $314.004 $1,570.00) MFG. IPI $475.001 $2,375.00] 150BR NO BID
30 Depressible Book truck 30W" X 22"H. 5 $396.00 $1,980.00] MFG. IPI $665.00 $3,325.00 1501DBT NO BID
H
3E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29*H. 5 $355.00 $1,775.00 MFG. IPI 1 $490.00 $2,450.00 15018C NO BID
i
1
- 1
Total Low Group Items 3 through 3E $12,810.00 H $17,450.00 TNO BID
- — D — i vy —— W — oo 1
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Prepared By.

Bid No. 086-JJ01 Reviewed By:
Circulation Degks and Components
BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}
Bld No.: 086-JJ01 OSHKOSH INDUSTRIES INC/BUCK STAFE: RB INTERNATIONAL FURNITURE INC. SCHOOL SPECIALTY
Titie:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams
mle M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY.| PRICE 1 EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE PER | EXTENDED ] MANUFACTURER JPRICE PER] EXTENGED | MANCE AeTORER S
PERUNIT| _PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
jitems 1 through 2B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two,
1 computers, Approximately* 60" W X 30 *D, sides and back panel
shall be approximately 36" H.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 | $767.92] $19,965.02] BUCKSIAFF/A056139 $575.00  $14,950.00 f RBI06OCC |  $300.89]  $6.087.14] FLEETWOODIZ. 300
H 0.53141 H
] |
1A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $758.61 $37,930.50§ BUCKSTAFF/8056139 $545.00 $27,250.00 RB3060CC i $309.89f $15,494.50; FLEETWOOD12A3OOi
: 0.53142 :
I 1
iB Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $757.20 $265,(J20.-66t BUCKSTAFF/8056139 $520.00 $182,000.00 RB3060CC i $309.89f $108,461.50; FLEETWOOD12.300i
' 0.53143 :
i
Computer Carrels, two student occupancy freestanding with two l
2 computers. Approximately” 60° W X 24 *D, sides and back panel H H
shall be approximately 36 1
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 26 $728.22f $18,933.72f BUCKSTAFF/8056139 $475.00 $12,350.00 RB2460CC ﬁ| $294.52 $7,857 52] FLEETWOOD12.620
i 0.563141
2A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 50 $719.36] $35,968.00f BUCKSTAFF/8056139 $451.00 $22,550.00 RB2460CC i $204.520  $14,726.00] FLEETWOOD12.620i
: 0.53141 H
! ]
2B Minimum Order: 25 or more 350 $718.05§ $251,317.50f BUCKSTAFF/8056139 $430.00 $160,500.00 RB2460CC i $294.52] $108,082.00j FLEETWOOD12.620;
: 0.53141 :
]
Total Low Group Items 1 through 2B $629,135.64] $409,600.00 INon responsive- dids $257,478.66, Did not meet
not submit technical specifications, items
specifications. i are particle board.
'Items 3 through 3E, Wi Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Circulation Desk and Components E;mentary and K-8: 5 $904.91 $4,524.55] BUCKSTAFF/8015312 $625.00 $3,125.00 RB34229CD $1,078.72 $5,393.60f FLEETWOOD80.463
3 Singie Pedestal, 42" X 30 D X 29"H . Please See Attachment 2.5314180.0132.5314)
Specifications -3 pages 1-3. 1
3A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30D X 29*H. 5 $694.47 $3,472.35] BUCKSTAFF/8007308 $475.00 $2,375.00 RB303629RS $469.57, $2,347.85f FLEETWOOD80.463
2.5314180.0132.5314;
1
3B  Triangular Corner Unit, 30W™ x 30"H. 5 $770.70 $3,853.50§ BUCKSTAFF/8011119 $575.00 $2,875.00 RB303029TC $337.104 $1,685.50§ FLEETWOOD80.713
2.53141
3C Book Drop Unit 30"W x 30"D X 29*H. 5 $372.08] $1,860.25] BUCKSTAFF/8001300 $375.00 $1,875.00 RB3036298BD $365.48, $1,827 40l FLEETWOODB0.043
2.53141
3D Depressible Book truck 30W* X 22*H. 5 $794.13] $3,970.65f BUCKSTAFF/9527000 $450.00 $2,250.00 RB302222DB $669.45 $3,347.30§ FLEETWOODB0.022
8.53141
3E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29'H. 5 $709.56) $3,547.808 BUCKSTAFF/8004305 $450.00 $2,250.00 RB3036295C $513.33 $2,566.65) FLEETWOODB0.063
2.53141
Total Low Group Items 3 through 3E $21,228.10] $14,750.00 $17,168.30
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT 8)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

Bid No.: 086-JJ01 NAME OF BIDDER: BRODART CO. NAME OF BIDDER: CONTEMPORARY INTERIOR,
Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Williams
ITEMj M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY.] UNIT | PRICE PER | EXTENDED PRICE |MANUFACTURER &] PRICE PER UNIT | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
UNIT MODEL # PRICE MODEL #
jitems 4 through 4E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
4 Clrculation Desk and Components Elementary and K-8. 5 Each $1,687.00 $8,435.00§67-780,67-814 $887.75 $4,488,75{ Contemporary
Doubie -Pedestal, 60'W X 30 X29"H. Interior inc. OM
CDWS 3
4A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30°D X 29°H. 5 Each $664.30 $3,321.50¢67-762 $394.25 $1,971.258  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
~
4B Triangular Corner Unit, 30" x 30*H. 5 Each $432.10 $2,160.5067-766 $384.75 $1,923.75] Contemporary
interior Inc. OM
CDBD 30X30X29
4G Book Drop Unit 30"W x 30"D X 29'H. 5 Each $402.42 $2,012.10}67-792 $403.75 $2,018.75]  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDBDBT 22X30X22
2D Depressible Book truck 30° X 22" X 227, 5 | Each $577.52 $2.687.60]67-704 $561.45 $2,807.25]  Contemporary
Interlor Inc. OM
CDBT 22X30X22
4E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29"H. 5 Each $584.66| $2,923.30]67-758 $460.75 $2,303.75]  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDCS 30X36X29
Total Low Group ltems 4 through 4E $21,740.00 $15,513.50,
fltems 5 ?hrough SE, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
5 Circulation Desk - Single Pedestal, 42"W X 30" D X 39" H, 5 Each $1,151.98 $5,759.90 67-376.67-820-001. $659.30 $3,296.50F  Contemporary
Computer Unit, Middle and Senlor. 67-814 Interior inc. OM
CDWs54
5A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30*D X 39"H. 5 Each $683.53 $3,41 7.6367‘763 $432.25 $2,161.25§ Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDWSH1
— 30X36X3954
5B Triangutar Corner Unit, 30*'W X 30 X 3g*H. 8 Each $475.87 $3,806.96167-767 $422.75 $3,382.00f Contemporary
. Interior Inc. OM
CDCF3
5C Book Drop Unit 36'W X 30°D 39"H. 5 Each $435.43] $2,177.16§67-793 $443.65 $2,218.25 Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
5D Depressible Book truck 30°D X 22"D X 27°H. 5 Each $513.79] $2,568.95067-794 $569.05 $2,845.25f Contemporary
Interior Inc, OM
: GDBD 20X30X27
5E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39"H. 5 Each $658.38§ $3,291.9067-759 $5386.75) $2,683.75] Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
— LA —
Total Low Group ltems 5 through 5E $21,022.51 $16,587.00]
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid No. 086-JJ0%

Circulation Desks and Components

Prepared By.
Reviswed By:,

Bid No.: 086-JJ01 NAME OF BIDDER: CONTRAX FURNISHINGS INC. |[NAME OF BIDDER: GAYLORD BROS, NAME OF BIDDER: JC WHITE OFFICE
Title:  Clrculation Desk and Components FURNITURE
’-Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. | PRICE PER | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER | EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &f PRICE PER | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
{items 4 through 4E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
[ed EL alagLandKal o, $2.787.04] $13,935.20] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $1,780.00f  $8,950.00) GA3253-NC $990.00; $4,950.00] DYNASTY
Double -Pedestal, 60'W X 30 X29°H. MCD-80D-29W/WP561222- FURNITURE
SW & AAKTCO1 CUSTOM
4A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 29'H. § $1,181.55] $5,907.75] MCD-36KS-29 $766.00 $3,830.00] GA3209-NC $671.25 $3,356.25! CUSTOM
48 Triangular Corner Unit, 30* x 30"H. 5 $924.18 $4,620.90) MCD-30TCS-29 $700.00{  $3,500.00] GA3228-NC $495.004 $2,475.00 CUSTOM
4C Book Drop Unit 30"W x 30'D X 29"H. 5 $814.03 $4,070.15 MCD-36BR-29 $650.008  $3,250.00] GA3205-NC $598.75 $2,993.75 CUSTOM
4D Depressible Book truck 30" X 22" X 22°H, 5 $1,003.76 $5,018.504 MCD-22DBT $740.00f $3,700.00f GABTD32-NC $881.25 $4,406.25 CUSTOM
4E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29"H. 5 $1,154.69] $5,773.45i MCD-36CS-29 $925.00 $4,625.00 GA3210-NC $756.25 $3,781.25] CUSTOM
Total Low Group ltems 4 through 4E $39,325.95] $27,855.00] $21,962.50]
fitems 5 Through 5E, W'ITI Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
Clrculation Desk - Single Pedestal, 42"W X 30" D X 39" H, 5 $1,715.10] $8,575.50] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $1,577.00f $7,885.00] GA3834-NC $978.75 $4,893.75) DYNASTY
Computer Unit, Middle and Senior. WCD48D-39 W/WP661222- FURNITURE
SW & AAKT001 CUSTOM
S5A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 39*H. 5 $1,191.22 $5,956.10, MCD-36KS-39 $775.00 $3,875.00 GA3909-NC $808.75 $4,043.75] CUSTOM
58 Triangular Corner Unit, 30"W X 30 X 39"H. 8 $973.07 $7.784.56] MCD-30TCS-39 $725.00{  $5.800.00] GA3928-NC $645.00] $5,180.00] CUSTOM
sC Book Drop Unit 36"W X 30°D 39"H. 5 $863.46 $4,317.30] MCD-36BR-39 $675.00f $3,375.00] GA3805-NC $747.50] $3,737.50] CUSTOM
5D Depressible Book truck 30"D X 22D X 27°H. 5 $1,003.70f $5,018.50| MCD-22DBT $800.00f $4,000.00) GABTD35-NC $1,050.00 $5,250.00] CUSTOM
5E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39"H. 5 $1,166.51 $5,832.55 MCD-36CS-39 $950.00§  $4,750.00 GA3910-NC $945.004 $4,725.00 CUSTOM
Total Low Group ltems 5 through 5E $37,484.51 $29,685.00)
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Prepared By,

Bid No. 086-4J01 Reviewed By:
Circulation Desks and Comgonents
810 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}
Bid No.: 086-4J01 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT INC MARK PRODUCTS /Demaria Holding MOULTRIE POST FORMS:
Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM] M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | PRICE PER § EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER |PRICE PER§ EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
fitems 4 through 4E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
r fap? 3] Deand a8 Bow] | $081.00)  $4,008.00]  MFG.IPl 1 $960.00]  $4.800.00 1501CD NO BID
Double -Pedestal, 60'W X 30 X29"H. 1
i
4A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 28"H. 5 $463.00] $2,315.00 MFG. IPI $765.00 $3,825.00 1501KS NO BID
H I
1 1
48 Triangutar Corner Unit, 30* x 30*H, 5 $350.00;  $1,750.00 MFG. P! $580.00 $2,900.00 1601CSU NO BID
4C Book Drop Unit 30"W x 30"D X 29H. 5 $314.00; $1,570.00; MFG. 1Pt $475.00 $2,375.00 150BR NO BID
i
4D Depressible Book truck 30" X 22" X 22*H. 5 $396.00; $1,980.05' MFG. iPI $665.00 $3,325.00 15010BT NO BID
4E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 29"H. 5 $355.00; $1,775.00] MFG. IPI $490.00 $2,450.00] 1501SC NO BID
1
“Total Low Group ltems 4 through 4E $14,295.00 $19,675.00) NO BID
Jitems 5 Fhrough 5E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price R I A
5 Circulation Desk - Single Pedestal, 42°W X 30" D X 38" H, 5 §730.00]  $3.650.008 MFG.IPI T§765.00]  $3,825.00 CD11/39 NO BID
Computer Unit, Middle and Sentlor. 1
5A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30*D X 39"H. 5 $513.00 $2,565.00] MFG. 1P $515.00 $2,57‘5‘OO 1501KS-39 NO BID
5B Triangular Corner Unit, 30"W X 30 X 39"H. 8 $412.00 $3,296.00; MFG. IPI 1 $580.00 $4,640.00 1501CSU NO BID
i
1
5C Book Drop Unit 36'W X 30D 39"H. 5 $373.00 $1,865.00 M?E 1Pl $475.004 $2,375.00] 1501-BR NO BID
5D Depressible Book truck 30D X 22*D X 27*H. 5 $421.00 $2,105.00] MFG. IPt $700.00; $3,500.00] 1501DBT-39 NO BID
5E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39*H, 8 $388.00 $1,940406i MFG. IPI $490.00] $2,450.00, 1501-SC39 NO BID
Total Low Group ftems 5 through 5E $15,421.o<i $16,365.00 NO BID
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Prepared By.

Bid No. 086-Jd01 Feviewed By:,
Clrculation Desks and Components
BI0 PROFPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
{Bid No.: 086-JJ01 OSHKOSH INDUSTRIES INC/BUCK STAFF: RB INTERNATIONAL FURNITURE INC. SCHOOL SPECIALTY
Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM} M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY.§ PRICE } EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER | EXTENDED § MANUFACTURER [PRICE PER] EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
items 4 through 4E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
b Cloulation.Deskand. Componants Elamentanz and a8 5 $1,697.75 $8,488.75] BUCKSTAFF/8015312 $775.00 $3,875.00 RB306029CD $1,547.11 $7,735.55{ FLEETWOQD80.103
Double -Pedestal, 60'W X 30 X29"H. 2.53141
800932.53141
4A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30D X 29"H. 5 $6894.47 $3,472.35) BUCKSTAFF/8007308 $475.00 $2,375.00 RB303629RS $469.57]  $2,347.85] FLEETWOOD80.103
2.53141
4B Triangular Corner Unit, 30" x 30°H. 5 $770.70 $3,853.50f BUCKSTAFF/8011119 $575.00 $2,875.00 RB303029TC $337.10f  $1,685.50] FLEETWOODS0.713
2.53141
4C Book Drop Unit 30"W x 30°D X 29°H. 5 $372.05 $1.860.2gﬁ BUCKSTAFF/8001300 $375.00 $1,875.00 RB303629BD $365.481 $1,827.40] FLEETWOODS80.043
2.53141
4D Depressible Book truck 30" X 22* X 22°H. 5 $794.13f  $3,970.65] BUCKSTAFF/9527000 $450.00 $2,250.00 RB302222D8B $668.46f  $3,342.30] FLEETWOODS0.022
8.5314
4E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 20°H. 5 $709.58] $3,547.80] BUCKSTAFF/8004305 $450.00 $2,250.00 RB303629SC $513.33]  $2,566.65] FLEETWOODBS0.063
2.53141
- S—
Total Low Group ltems 4 through 4E $25,193.30] $15,500.00 $19,505.25
mems § Through 5E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
5 Clrculation Desk - Single Pedestal, 42"W X 30" D X 39" H, 5 $944.62 $4,723.10f BUCKSTAFF/8015312 $675.00 $3,375.00 RB30423900 $1,104.74]  $5,523.70f FLEETWOODBS0.153
[Computer Unit, Middle and Senior. 9.53141
80.01390XX.000
5A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30D X 39°H. 5 $734.17 $3,670.85] BUCKSTAFF/8007308 $525.00 $2,625.00 RB303639RS $487.31 $2,436.55{ FLEETWOODB0.153
9.53141
80.0139.53141
5B Triangular Corner Unit, 30"W X 30 X 39"H. 8 $810.41 $6,483.28{ BUCKSTAFF/8011119 $650.00 $5,200.00 RB303039TC $404.52) $3,236.16] FLEETWOODS80.713
9.5XX.000
5C Book Drap Unit 36"W X 30'D 39"H. 5 $411.78 $2,058.80f BUCKSTAFF/8001300 $425.00 $2,125.00 RB3036398D $462.47]  $2,312.35] FLEETWOQD80.043
9.5XX.000
5D Depressible Book truck 30"D X 22'D X 27'H. 5 $833.84 $4,169.20] BUCKSTAFF/9527000 $450.00 $2,250.00 RB302222DB $675.38]  $3,376.90{ FLEETWOOD#80.023
3XX.000
5E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39*H. 5 $749.26 $3,746.30] BUCKSTAFF/9527000 $510.00 $2,550.00 RB303639SC $668.28]  $3,341.40] FLEETWOODB80.063
95XX.000
Total Low Group Items 5 through 5E $24,861.53 $18,125.00 $20,227.06
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
IBid No.: 086-JJ01

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circutation Desks and Components

NAME OF BIDDER: BRODART CO.

NAME OF BIDDER: CONTEMPORARY INTERIOR,

Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM] M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY.§ UNIT | PRICE PER } EXTENDED PRICE {MANUFACTURER &} PRICE PER UNIT| EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &
UNIT MODEL # PRICE MODEL #
fitems 6 Through 6E, Wil Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
[ Circulation Desk - Double- Padestal, 66"W X 30" D X 38" H, 5 Each $1,546.00 $7,730.00467-781,67-820- $983.2ﬁ $4,916.25]  Contemporary
Computer Unit, Middle and Senlor. Please See Attached 001,67-814 interior inc. OM
{Specifications 4, for All Group Items, Pages 1-3. CDWSs
B6A Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 39'H. 5 Each $683.53¢ $3,417.8 87-763 $432.25 $2,161.25f  Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDW S1 30X38X39
6B Triangular Corner Unit, 30" W x 30 X 39*H. 8 Each $475.87 $3,806.Qa 87-767 $422.75 $3,382.00{ Contemporary
Interior Inc. OM
CDCF3
6C Book Drop Unit 36"W X 30D 39"H. 5 Each $435.43 52177158 67-793 $443.65] $2,218.25§  Contemporary
Interior inc. OM
CDBD 30X36X39
6D Depressible Baok truck 30" W X 22°D X 27°H. 5 Each $513.79] $2,668.95) 67-794 5155651‘0%r $2,845.25]  Contemporary
interior Inc. OM
CDBT 22X30X27
6E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39*H. 5 Each $658.38) $3,291.90 67-759 $536.75 $2,683.75q Contemporary
Interior inc. OM
— — 1. CDOS 30X36X39
Total Low Group ltems 6 through 6E $22,992.61 $18,206.75
Wltems TJ‘Fhrough 7B, W'ITI Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
7 Rectangular Table, Approximately 72"L x 36" D x 29" H. Contemporary
Please see Attachment Specifications - 5, Interior Inc. OT
RE125FBV
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 | Each $590.00 $5,900.00] LB3672 $533.52 $6,335.20f Contemporary
Interior Inc. OT
RE125FBY.
7A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 phg $580.00 $23,200.00, 1.B3672 $506.84 $20,273.60 Contemporary
Interior Inc. OT
RE125FBV
7B Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 § Each $577.00 $35,774.00] LB3672 $480.16 $29,789.92] Contemporary
Interior Inc. OT
RE125FBV
Total Low Group ltems 7 through 7B $64,874.00 $55,378.72
90! 16
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Reviewed By:
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81D PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B}

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

Prepared By.
Reviewed By:

Bid No.: 086-JJ01

NAME OF BIDDER: CONTRAX FURNISHINGS INC.

NAME OF BIDDER: GAYLORD BROS.

NAME OF BIDDER: JC WHITE OFFICE

'”T"Stie: Circuiation Desk and Components FURNITURE
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM] M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | PRICE PER | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER } EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &] PRICE PER | EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
{items 6 Through 6E, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
& HrotiorrDostmboiioniec GO e G B Gl & $2,841.31] $14,206.55] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $1,933.00§ $9,665.001 GA3853-NC $1,188.75 $5,943.75 DYNASTY
Computer Unit, Middle and Senlor. Please See Attached MCD-80D-39 W/WP661222 FURNITURE
{Specifications 4, for All Group items, Pages 1-3. SW & AAKT0O1 CUSTOM
BA Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30*D X 38"H. 5 $1,191.22 $5,956.10] MCD-36KS-39 $775.00 $3,875.00 GA3909-NC $808.75 $4,043.75 CUSTOM
68 Triangular Corner Unit, 30* W x 30 X 39"H, 8 $873.07, $7,TB4456 MCD-30TCS-39 $725.00{ $5.800.00, GA3928-NC $645.00 $5,160.00 CUSTOM
68C Book Drop Unit 36"W X 30°D 39"H. 5 $863.46 $4,317.30; MCD-36BR-39 $675.00f $3,375.00) GA3905-NC $747.504 $3,737.50 CUSTOM
8D Depressible Book truck 30" W X 22°D X 27*H. 5 $1,008.70] $5,018.50] MCD-22DBT $800.004 $4,000.00 GABTD39-NC $1,050.00] $5,250.00] CUSTOM
6E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39*H. 5 $1,166.51 $5,832.55 MCD-36CS-38 $950.00{ $4,750.00 GA3910-NC $945.00 $4,725.00 CUSTOM
Total Low Group ltems 6 through 6E $43,115.56] $31,465.00] $28,860.00}
[items 7 Through 78, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
7 Rectangular Table, Approximately 72"L x 36" D x 29" H.
Please see Attachment Specifications - 5.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 $668.42, $6,684.20f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $405.00 $4,060.00§ PS-294R02-NC  INO BID
B3672 -A-29
7A Minirnum Order: 11-24 each 40 $658.598 $26,343.60f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $405.00] $16,200.00{ PS-294R02-NC  §NO BID
B3672 -A-29
7B Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $649.04] $40,240.48f] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $405.00; $25.110.05‘ PS-294R02-NC  INO BID
B3672 -A-29
Total Low Group ltems 7 throuigh 7B $73,208.28 $45,360.00 NO BID
100t 16 FM-3738 Rev. (06-54)




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circutation Desks and Components

Prepared By.
Reviswed By:

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bld No.: 086-JJ01 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT INC MARK PRODUCTS /Demarla Holding MOULTRIE POST FORMS:

Title: . Circulation Desk and Components

Buyer: James Willlams

ITEM} M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. { PRICE PER | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED § MANUFACTURER JPRICE PERf EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
fitems 8 Through 6E, WIill Be Awarded Total Low Group Price

Ot OB et D OO oS e TS RGO NG OUeB B ety e—] §1.016.00] $5.080.00f MFG.WPI 1 5960.00]  $4.800.00]  GO/1188 - |NOBD

Computer Unit, Middle and Senior. Piease See Attached l

ISpecifications 4, for All Group ltems, Pages 1-3. i

6A Knee Space Unit 36-".W X 30"D X 39"H. 5 $513.00] $2,665.00 MFG. 1P ! $515.00 $2,575.004 1501KS-39 NO BID
;

6B Triangular Corner Unit, 30" W x 30 X 39"H. 8 $412.00 $3,296.00 MFG. IPi $680.00 $4,640.004 1801-CSU39 INO BID

6C Book Drop Unit 36"W X 30D 38°H. 5 $373.004 $1,865.00 MFG. iPI $475.001 $2,375.004 1501-BR-39 NO BID
!
‘ i

6D Depressible Book truck 30" W X 22*D X 27"H. 5 $421.00y $2,105.00] MFG. IPi i $700.00 $3,500.05‘ 1501-DBTH NO BID
!

2= Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39°H. 5 $388.00] $1,840.00 MFG. 1Pt 1 $490.00 $2,450.00 15018C-39 NO BID
i

Total Low Group items 6 through 6E $16,851.00 $20,340.00 NO BiD
jitems 7 Through 7B, Will Be Awarded Totai Low Group Price
7 Rectangular Table, Approximately 72"L x 36" D x 29" H.

Please see Attachment Specifications - 5.

Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 $512.00]  $5,120.00 MFG. IPT $360.00]  $3,60000) L1672 T $425.00]  $4,250.00]  MPFa67zAT
7A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 $466.00¢ $18,640.00 MFG. 1P $350.00 $14,000.00 LT-3672 $390.00{ $15,600.00f MPF3672RT
78 Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $455.00{ $28,210.00 MFG. IPI $340.00] $21,080.00] LT-3672 $355.008 $22,010.00; MPF3672RT

Total Low Group ltems 7 through 7B $51,070.00 $38,680.00 $41,560.00

110t 16
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The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Prepared By.
Bid No. 086-JJ01 Reviewed By:
Circulation Desks and Componsnts
810 PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B!

Bid No.: 086-JJ01 OSHKOSH INDUSTRIES INC/BUCK STAFF: RB INTERNATIONAL FURNITURE INC. SCHOOL SPECIALTY

Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams

ITEM§ M-DCPS NO. DESGRIPTION QTY.{ PRICE | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER |PRICE PER} EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT . PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #

Iltems & Through 6E, WIili Be Awarded Total Low Group Price

& irauiationrBDos—Botivioietoo it Silis}eg Bl-Puiadfinky & $1,737.46 $8,687.30§ BUCKSTAFF/8015312 $825.00 $4,125.00 § NOT SPECIFIED | $1,647.65 $8,238.25f FLEETWOOD80.483
Computer Unit, Middle and Senior. Please See Attached 9.53141
Specifications 4, for All Group items, Pages 1-3.
BA Knee Space Unit 36"W X 30"D X 39"H. 5 $734.17 $3,670.85] BUCKSTAFF/8007308 $525.00 $2,625.00 1 NOT SPECIFIED $487.31 $2,436.55} FLEETWOODS80.713
9.5XX.0004839.5314
1
6B Triangular Corner Unit, 30" W x 30 X 39"H. 8 $810.41 $6,483.28] BUCKSTAFF/80011119 $650.00 $6,200.00 ] NOT SPECIFIED $404.52 $3,236.16§ FLEETWOOD80.713
9.5XX.000
6C Book Drop Unit 36*'W X 30D 39"H. 5 $411.76 $2,068.80f BUCKSTAFF/8001300 $425.00 $2,125.00 { NOT SPECIFIED $462.47 $2,312.35] FLEETWOODS80.043
9.5XX.00
8D Depressible Book truck 30" W X 22°D X 27"H. 5 $833.84 $4.169.25‘1 BUCKSTAFF/952700 $450.00 $2,250.00 { NOT SPECIFIED $675.38§  $3,376.90§ FLEETWOODB80.023
3.1XX.000
6E Storage Cabinets, 36W X 30'D X 39*H. 5 $749.26 $3,746.30] BUCKSTAFF/8004305 $510.00 $2,550.00 § NOT SPECIFIED $668.28]  $3,341.40f FLEETWOODBS0.023
3.1XX.000
Total Low Group items 6 through 6E $28,815.73 $18,875.00 $22,941.61

fitems 7 ?hrough ‘-IE, Wil Be Awarded Total Low Group Price

7 Rectangular Table, Approximately 72"L x 36" D x 29 H.
Please see Attachment Specifications - 5.
Minirum Order: 1-10 each 10 $373.24 $3,732.40] BUCKSTAFF 80367201 $310.00 $3,100.00 } NOT SPECIFIED $377.82 $3,778.20f GEORGIA CHAIR
600 GP 3672-5
7A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 $368.71 $14,748.40§ BUCKSTAFF 80367201 $295.00 $11,800.00 § NOT SF;-E.C!F!ED $384.95] $14,598.00f GEORGIA CHAIR
600 GP 3672-5
78 Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $366.03] $22,603.86] BUCKSTAFF 80367201 $290.00 $17,980.00 § NOT SPECIFIED $354.83F $21,899.46f GEORGIA CHAIR
. 600 GP 3672-5
Total Low Group Items 7 through 78 $41,174.66] $32,880.00 | Non Responsive $40,375.66
vendor did submit
technical specs.

12 0f 18 #M-3738 Rev. {06-94)




BiD PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)

Bid No.: 086-JJ01

Tha Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Components

NAME OF BIDDER: BRODART CO.

NAME OF BIDDER: CONTEMPORARY INTERIOR,

Titie:  Circuiation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Wiillams
iITEM} M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | UNIT } PRICEPER |} EXTENDED PRICE JMANUFACTURER &§ PRICE PER UNIT} EXTENDED [MANUFACTURER &
UNIT MODEL # PRICE MODEL #
{items 8 Through 8B, Wil Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
8 End Table, Approximately 24"W x 20" D x 18" H, Please see
Attachment Specifications - 5,
Minimum Order: 1-5 each 5 Each $576.00 $2,880.00 Li2424 $211.08 $1,055.40f Contemporary
Interior inc. OT
RD128 END
8A Minimum Order: 6-15 each 5 Each $576.00 $2,880.00; Li2424 $200.53 $1,002.65] Contemporary
Interior Inc. OT
RD125 END
8B Minimum Order: 16 or more 20 { Each $566.004 $11,320.00 LI2424 $200.53 $4,010.60
Total Low Group Items 8 through 8B $17,080.00 $6,068.65{ Does not meet
specifications, sled
base.
Iltems g '?hrough 9B, Wil Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
g Round Table, Approximately 42" dlameter x 29" H. Please
ee Attachment Specifications. 5. .
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 § Each $522.00] $5,220A00|LB426R $509.29 $5,092.90f Contemporary
Interior Inc. OT
9A Minimum Order:. 11-24 each 40 § Each $513.00] $20,520‘00|LB420R $483.83) $19,363.20) Contemporary
fnterior Inc. OT
9B Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 | Each $811.00] $50.282.MLM20R $458.36 $28,418.32
Total Low Group Items 9 through 9B $76,022.00]
— — $52,864.4:
EALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: .
10
0% 5091
1301 16

Prepared By.
Reviewed By:
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81D PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT 8)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid No. 086-JJ01

Circulation Desks and Componants

Prepared By.
Reviewed By:

Bid No.: 088-JJ401 NAME OF BIDDER: CONTRAX FURNISHINGS INC. NAME OF BIDDER: GAYLORD BROS. NAME OF BIDDER: JC WHITE OFFICE
Title:  Circulation Desk and Components FURNITURE
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM] M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | PRICE PER | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER | EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER &§ PRICE PER | EXTENDED JMANUFAGCTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
Iltems 8 Through 8B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
" .. 1) Dlooro cop
Attachment Specifications - 5. _
Minimum Order: 1-5 each 5 $284.24] $1,421.20f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $350.00; $1,750.00] PS-242018-NC  [NOC BID
B2420T-A-18
8A Minimum Order: 6-15 each 5 $280.06 $1,400.30f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $350.00 $1.750.00-Jr PS-242018-NC  [NO BID
B2420T-A-18
8B Minimum Order: 16 or more 20 $276.00] $5,520.001 MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $350.00f $7,000.00] PS-242018-NC NOBID
B2420T-A-18 :
Total Low Group Items 8 through 8B $8,341.50)] $10,500.00 NO BID
jitems 8 Through 9B, WWBe Awarded Totai Low Group Price
Round Table, Approximateiy 42" diameter x 29" H, Please
see Attachment Specifications- 5.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 $618.45 $6,184.50§ MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $430.00§ $4,300.00f PS-29B42-NC  INO BID
BO042T-A-29
9A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 $609.351 $24,374.00] MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $430.00{ $17,200.00f§ PS-29B42-NC  INO BID
B00427-A-29
98 Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $600.52§ $37,232.24f MEDIA TECHNOLOGIES $430.00f $26,660.00] PS-28B42-NC  INO BID
_ B0042T-A-29
Total Low Group Items 9 through 98
— $67,790.74] $48,160.00% INO BID
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: .
10
459 25 NO BID
14 0of 16
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Prepared By.
Bid No. 086-JJ01 Reviewed By:
Circulation Desks and Componants
BID PROPOSAL FORM SFOHMAT B)
Bid No.: 086-JJ01 INSTITUTIONAL PRODUCT INC MARK PRODUCTS /Demaria Holding MOULTRIE POST FORMS:
Title:  Clrculation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams
ITEM§ M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. J PRICE PER} EXTENDED § MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED § MANUFACTURER JPRICE PER{ EXTENDED JMANUFACTURER §&]
UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MOD& # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
Iltems 8 Through 8B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
ALy 200 Dy 4R L DI saa
Attachment Specifications - 5. - I B,
Minimum Order: 1-5 each 5 $277.00; $1,385.00, MFG. IPI NO BID $285.00 $1,425.00| MPF2024ET
1
)
BA Minimurn Order: 6-15 each 5 $245.00 $1,225.00] MFG. P} NO BID $250.001 $1,250.00] MPF2024ET
|
8B Minimum Order: 16 or more 20 $241.00 $4,820.00T MFG. Pt NO BID $215.00 $4,300.00 MPF2024ET
Total Low Group Iltems 8 through 8B $7.430.00 NO BID $6,975.00{ Low bid meeting
i Specifications.
Iltems 9 ?hrough 98, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price B R R
9 Round Table, Approximately 42" diameter x 29" H. Please IR I
Attachment Speclitications- 5.
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 $441.00, $4,410.00 MFG. [P} $325.00; $3,250.00; LT42D $400.00 $4,000.00] MPF42RT
2
9A Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 $402.00f $16,080.00 MFG. IPi 1 $315.00 $12,600‘0(]5'l L.T42D } $365.00§ $14,600.00 MPF42RT
1 1
aB Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $392.00§ $24,304.00 MFG. IPI $305.00 $18,910.00] L.T42D } $330.004 $20,460.00 MPF42RT
—}
I
Total Low Group items 8 through 9B L ow bid mosting I
_ - $44.794.00) 1 $34,760.00]specifications. 1 $39,060.00
IIEALAN(:E OF LINE DISCOUNT: . 1
10 !
1 i
0% 25%} No BID
15018 FM-37238 Rev. {06-94)




The School Board of Mlami-Dade County, Florida Prepared By.,
Bid No. 086-4J01 Raviewed By:
Circuiation Desks and Compenents

5D PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT 8)
Bld No.: 086-J.J01 OSHKOSH INDUSTRIES INC/BUCK STAFF: RB INTERNATIONAL FURNITURE INC. SCHOOL SPECIALTY

Title:  Circulation Desk and Components
Buyer: James Willlams

ITEM§ M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY.§ PRICE } EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER } EXTENDED j MANUFACTURER JPRICE PER] EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE & MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #

items 8 Through 8B, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price

B, i 2 i 2SR 800

Attachment Speclfications . 5. - e eensemre e ad
Minimum Order: 1-5 each 5 $297.80] $1,489.00; 80303001 $175.00 $875.00 | NOT SPECIFIED 5;105.5&-":‘i $528.25] GEORGIA CHAIR

800 GP 2024-5

BA Minimum Order: 6-15 each 5 $294.19 $1,470.9§ﬁ 80303001 $166.00 $830.00 § NOT SPECIFIED $105.65 $528.25f GEORGIA CHAIR
600 GP 2024-5 &
:
8B Minimum Order: 16 or more 20 $293.64 $5,872.80! 80303001 $160.00 $3,200.00 § NOT SPECIFIED $94.57 $1,891.408 GEORGIA CHAIR E
- 800 GP 2024-5
Total Low Group ltems 8 through 8B $8,832.75 $4,905.00 [Non responsive- did $2,947.90f  Does not meet
not submit technical specifications, tapers
specifications. below our minimal
Specs.
iterns 8 Through 98, Will Be Awarded Total Low Group Price
g Round Table, Approximately 42" diameter x 29" H. Please
Isee Attachment Specifications- 5. e e e e e 0 s e m e
Minimum Order: 1-10 each 10 $375.28 $3,752.30) 80420001 $260.00 } $2,600.00 } NOT SPECIFIED |  $292.74 $2,927.401
SA Minimum Order: 11-24 each 40 $370.68§ $14.827.20 80420001 $250.00 $10,000.00 | NOT SPECIFIED $283.06f $11,322.40)
CE) Minimum Order: 25 or more 62 $360.00]  $22,030.36] 80420001 $240.00 $14,880.00 } NOT SPECIFIED $274.19f $16,999.78]
[Non responsive- did not
Total Low Group ltems 9 through 9B bt ool it not maet
S $41 ,518.?% w,m ifi 18 @@49_53 specifications.
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: .
10
0%, 50%4 27%
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