Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Bid 003-JJ11 Fire Alarm Components

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid # 003-JJ11 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Fire Alarm Components Diversifire Systems, Inc
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
WARRANTY: The warranty for équipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be 2 years or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater.
ITEM | MDCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Ay | UNIT | PRICEPER UNIT| TOTAL PRICE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Mfg Name: Nofifier
Detector, smoke, addressable.
] 916-0612 20 Eachi $ 50701 % 1,014.00 |Mfg Brand Name: Nofifier
Approved Brand: Notifier FSI 851, No Substitute. Mfg Product # FSI-851
Mfg Name: Nofifier
Detector. smoke, addressable. photo.
2 916-1261 20 Each| $ 49501 % 990.00 |Mfg Brand Name: Nofifier
Approved Brand: Noftifier FSP-851, No Substitute. Mfg Product # FSP-851
Mfg Name: Notifier
Module, control, addressable, for NAC applicafion.
3 916-0591 20 Eachi $ 5190 $ 1,038.00 |mifg Brand Name: Notifier
Approved Brand: Notifier FCM-1, No Substitufe. Mfg Product #: FCM-1
Mfg Name:
Detector, smoke, phofo.
4 | 916-0647 10 Each NO BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrotronics FP-11, No Substitute. Mig Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, heat, thermail.
5 216-0663 20 Each NO BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrofronics FPT-11, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Station, manual, pull.
3 916-0671 20 Each NO BID $ - Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrotronics MSI-108, No Substifute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Module, conirol, dual.
7 19160698 10 Each NO BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrofronics TRI-D, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfig Name:
Module, control, single.
8 916-0701 20 Each NO BID $ - [Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrofronics TRI-R, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Base, detector, universal.
9 916-0736 20 Each NO BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrofronics DB-3S, No Subsfitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Base, detector, assembly.
10 | 916-0744 70 Each NO BID $ - Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Pyrofronics DB-11, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Base, smoke, addressable.
H 916-0884 ' 50 Each NO BID 3 - Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9792, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, heat, 200F, R/R.
12 | 9160914 10 Each NO BID $ - Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 409&961 5. No Subsfifufe. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Base, heat.
13 | 916-0931 10 Each NO BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-7684, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mig Name:
Station, pull, addressable.
14 | 216-0949 20 Each NO BID 3 - [Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4099-2001, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
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BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Bid 003-JJ11 Fire Alarm Components

Bid # 003-JJ11 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Fire Alarm Components Diversifire Systems, Inc
Buyer: Vanessa Fores
WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be 2 years or manufacturer's wamranty, whichever is greater.
{TEM | MDCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Aty | UNIT | PRICE PERUNIT| TOTAL PRICE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
. Mifg Name:
Control, module, ZAM monitor, Class B.
15 | 916-0965 5 Each NO BID 3 Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 2190-9155, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Confrol. modute, ZAM signal, Class B.
16 | 9160973 10 Fach| NOBID |3 Mfg Brand Name:
App@ved Brands: Simplex Part # 2190-9141, No Mfg Product #
Substitute.
Mig Name:
Control, module, ZAM.
17 | 916-0981 10 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 2190-9163, No Substituie. Mfg Product #
Mig Name:
Module, addressable, IAM.
18 | 9140990 20 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4090-2001, No Substitute. Mig Product #
Mig Name:
Horn & strobe, audible, visual, surface, 110CD.
19 | 916-1007 10 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4903-2254, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mig Name:
Horn & strobe, audible, visual, semi-finish, 15CD.
20 | 916-1023 20 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4903-9252, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Strobe, visual, surface, 15CD.
21 | 916-1031 40 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4904-92176, No Subsfitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Strobe, visual, surface, 110CD.
22 | 916-1040 10 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4204-9175, No Substitute. Mifg Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, smoke, addressable, photo.
23 | 916-0868 150 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9714, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, heat, 135F R/R.
24 1 916-0892 10 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9613, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, heat, 135F fixed.
25 | 916-0906 5 Each NO BID $ Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9612, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Detector, heat, 200F R/R.
26 | 916-0922 5 Each NO BID 3 Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-24614, No Subsfitute. Mfg Product #
Mig Name:
Head, heat detector.
27 | 916-1350 10 Each NO BID 3 Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9733, No Subsfitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Board. Duct Detector.
28 | 916-1451 20 Each NO BID $ Mig Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 565-653, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Bid 003-JJ11 Fire Alarm Components

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid # 003-J411

Title: Fire Alarm Components

Buyer: Vanessa Flores

NAME OF BIDDER:

Diversifire Systems, Inc

WARRANTY: The warranly for equipment, after defivery and acceptance by the school or department, shall be 2 years or manufacturer's warranty, whichever is greater.
{TEM | MDCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Ay | UNIT | PRICE PER UNIT| TOTAL PRICE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Mfg Name:
Board, Duct Defector With Relay.
29 | 9146-1453 20 Each NO BID 3 - Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 565-654, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
Mfg Name:
Board, Signal Booster, Black Relay.
30 | 916-1455 20 Each NO BID 3 - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand : Simplex 565-545, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
. Mfg Name:
Board. Signal Booster, Yellow Relay.
31 | 916-1457 20 Each NO BID 3 - [Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand : Simplex 565-388, No Substitute. Mig Product #
Mfg Name:
Head, Smoke Detfector.
32 | 916-1459 20 Each NOQ BID $ - |Mfg Brand Name:
Approved Brand: Simplex 4098-9717, No Substitute. Mfg Product #
. Mig Name: Safety Technology
Cover, protective, flush, horn/strobe.
33 | 216-1201 20 Each| $ 2910 $ 58700 |Mfg Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology Internatfionat X
1210E, No Substitute. Mg Product #: STII210E
Detector smoke, testing spray for fire alarm system (2.5 Mig Name: Home Safeguard
z canj, UL Listed. E
34 | 9160108 |22 0N UL Lite 15 |Each]| $ 925|$ 13875 |Mig Brand Name: Home Safeguard
Approved Brand: Home Safeguard M25S or GE
#SM200, or equdl. Mfg Product # M25S
Duster, spray precision, for cleaning fire alarm smoke Mfg Name: Tech Spray
35 | 916-0116 |detector {i0 oz can) aerosol, Ut Listed. 470 Each| § 7151 % 3,360.50 |Mfg Brand Name: Tech Spray
Approved Brand: Tech Spray #1671-10s, or equal. Mfg Product #: 1671-10s
R Mfg Name: Wheelock
Horn, strobe, audio visudl, electronic, 15/75 CD,
36 | 916-1333 50 Each| $ 4035]% 2017.50 Mfg Brand Name: Wheelock
Approved Brand: Wheelock MT-24-1575-WFR, No . _ _
Substitute. Mfg Product #: MT24-1575W-FR
Station, manual pull, single contact, non-code . Mfg Name: Faraday
37 | 916-0183 |normailly open. 15 Each{ $ 2460 |3  369.00 |Mfg Brand Name: Faraday
Approved Brand: Faraday FI GT, No Substitute. Mfg Product #: FIGT
Cover, puli station, protector, clear & red UL listed, ultra Mig Name: Safety Technology
violet stabilized, 7" W X 10" H X 2-3/4" D, polycarbonate.
38 19160493 ‘ / pol 500 Each| $ 3930 | $  19.650.00 |Mfg Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology International R
$TI1200, No Substitute. Mig Product #: STI1200
Cover, pull station, conduit spacer, red. for use with Mfg Name: Safety Technology
STH1200, 7" W X 9" H X 2" D, acrylic. .
39 | 9160507 i 370 |Each| $ 1594 | $  5897.80 |Mfg Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology International i
STI3100, No Subsfitute. Mfg Product #: STI3100
Cover, horn/strobe, protector, clear UL listed, ultra Mig Name: Safety Technology
jolet stabilized, 3.5" W X 7" H X 3.5" D, polycarbonate.
40 | 9160515 0 AN POy 130 |Each|$  3500]$  4.563.00 |Mfg Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology Internationat X
mig Product #: STIT201D
12100, No Subsfitufe. g Product #: 3
Cover, horn/strobe, conduit spacer, clear for use with Mfg Name: Safety Technology
ST11210, 3.5"W X 7"H X 2' D, acrylic. .
4 916-0523 0.3 4 35 Each| $ 15651 % 547.75 mfg Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology International SUB- Mg Product #: SUB-06297D
062970, No Substitute. .
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools
Bid 003-JJ11 Fire Alarm Components

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

Bid # 003-JJ11 NAME OF BIDDER:
Title: Fire Alarm Components Diversifire Systems, Inc
Buyer: Vanessa Flores
WARRANTY: The warranty for equipment, after delivery and acceptance by the school or depariment, shall be 2 years or manufacturer’s warranty, whichever is greater.
ITEM | MDCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM e mre> | UNIT | PRICE PER UNIT| TOTAL PRICE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
Cover, sirobe. protector, clear UL listed, ultra violet Mfg Name: Safety Technology
fabilizer, 3.5" W X 7" H X 3.5" D, polycarb te. .
2 | 9160531 [F M polyeartona 35 |Each|$  3510|§ 1.228.50 |MfgBrand Name: Safely Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology Internationat .
1221D. No Substitute. Mfg Product #: STH1221D
Mig Name: Safety Technology
Kit, Enviro, for Horn/Strobe, Damage Stopper.
43 | 9161449 110 |Each| $ 750 | $ 82500 [Mig Brand Name: Safety Technology
Approved Brand: Safety Technology International SUB- . ~
121, No Substitute. Mig Product #: SUB-121
ltems 44 through 45 will be awarded on a total low bid basis. Vendor shall bid on all item:s.
Cable. fire alarm, wet location, 14 gauge 4 conductor, Mfg Name: West Penn
non shielded. solid, with water blocking tape - self
healing, meets UL article 724 and 760 type FPL,
44 916-0078 {10007FT Reel). 15 Reel $ 586.00 | $ 8.790.00 Mfg Brand Name: West Penn
Approved Brand: West Penn Aquaseal AQ 246 or or Mfg Product #: AQ-246
equal.
Cable fire alarm, wet location, 16 gauge 2 conductor, Mfg Name: West Penn
shielded, solid. with water blocking tape - seif healing,
45 | 916-0094 |meets UL article 724 and 760 type FPL, {1000/FT Reel). 15 Reel| $ 270.00 | $  4,050.00 |Mfg Brand Name: West Penn
AApproved Brand: West Penn Aquaseal AQ 294 or Mg Product #: AQ-294
equal.
TOTALS $ 126714 $ 55061.80

GROQUP {I: PERCENT DISCOUNT

l % DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG

NAME AND EFFECTIVE DATES OF CATALOG

‘ercentage discount off manufacturers price fist for purchases by schools and departments for fire alarm components other than those fines listed above.
rdicate discounts for the manufacturer on line provided. Submit a copy of the current price list with your bid, or weblink location of catalog. All discounts
ffered should be FOB delivered, and inclusive of packing, handling, freight, fuel, distribution, and inside delivery.

46

BRAND: Faraday

50 % Discount Off

- Faraday 2008 Prie Book - Dated 1-1-2008

47

BRAND: Home Safeguard

NO BID

48 |BRAND: Nofifier 45 % Discount Off : 2008 Confidential Price List - Dated 10-06-2008
49 |BRAND: Pyrotronics NO BID -

50 |BRAND: Safety Technology international 52 % Discount Off - From Notifier 2008 Price List - See Letter

51 [BRAND: Simplex NO BID y

52 [BRAND: West Penn NO 8ID -

53 |BRAND: Wheelock 52 % Discount Of ) Confidential Price List - Dated 01-13-2009
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