THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FL

Art Equipment
BID #015-JJ08

Item Number 1 2 3
Description Damp-Proof Cabinet Drying Cabinet Paper Rack unassembied
Quantity 30 30 20
Uom each 30.00 each
VENDOR(S) Unit $ Total § Mig & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod

AFP Industries, Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 30.00 NO BID $408.00 $8,160.00 | Bulman R370-RKD

Bailey Pottery

Equipment Corp. $2,199.00 $65,970.00 | DEBCOR 9100 $1,747.00 $52,410.00 DEBCOR 9200 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Brodart Co. $0.00 $0.00 NO BiD $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $375.00 $7,500.00 | Brodart 81429001

Comnercial Art Supply div.

C.A.S. Ind,, Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Cutlass Enterprises, Inc.

/Bennet Pottery Supply $2,200.00 $66,000.00 | DEBCOR 9100 $1,750.00 $52,500.00 DEBCOR 9200 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Cutlass Enterprises, Inc.

/Bennet Pottery Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith

Office & Computer

Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $440.00 $8,800.00 PACON 67780

GEO Type of South

Florida DBA Easel Art .

Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Laguna Clay Company $2,253.00 $67,590.00 | DEBCOR 9100 $1,746.00 $52,380.00 DEBCOR 9200 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

DEBCOR 9100
DOCK DEBCOR 9200 DOCK BULMAN R370-

NASCO $2,071.25 $62,137.50 | DELIVERY $1,585.81 $47,574.30 DELIVERY $403.91 $8,078.20 RKD

Nationwide Drafting and

Office Supply Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
BULMAN R370-

Pyramid School Products $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $409.00 $8,180.00 RKD

Pearl Artist and Craft

Supply Corp. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
BULMAN R370-

Sax Arts and Crafts $1,800.00 $54,000.00 { DEBCOR 9100 $1,400.00 $42,000.00 DEBCOR 9200 $540.00 $10,800.00 RKD
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FL

Item Number 4 5 6
Description Paper Rack assembled Mat cutter Portable paper cutter
Quantity 20 25 25
UoOM each each each

VENDOR(S) Unit § Total $ Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod
AFP Industries, Inc. $498.00 $9,960.00 Bulman R999 $338.00 $8,450.00 Logan 650 $147.58 | $3,689.50 Ingento 1162
Bailey Pottery
Equipment Corp. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Brodart Co. $489.67 $9,793.40 | Brodart 81428002 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $180.91 $4,522.75 | Brodart 42191004
Comunercial Art Supply div.
C.A.S. Ind., Inc. $0.00 $0.00 1 - NOBID $376.00 $9,400.00 Logan 650 $0.00 $0.00 NO BiD
Cutlass Enterprises, Inc.
/Bennet Pottery Supply $0.00 $0.00 ‘NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Cutlass Enterprises, Inc.
/Bennet Pottery Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer
Supply $549.00 $10,980.00 PACON 67770 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $140.00 | $3,500.00 | INGENTO 1162
GEO Type of South
Florida DBA Easel Art
Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $425.00 $10,625.00 | LOGAN 650 §250.00 | $6,250.00 | INGENTO 1162
Laguna Clay Company $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

BULMAN R999

NASCO $589.78 $11,795.60 | DOCK DELIVERY $401.38 $10,034.50 | LOGAN 650 $207.30 | $5,182.50 | INGENTO 1162
Nationwide Dratting and
Office Supply Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid School Products $549.00 $10,980.00 NO BID $419.00 $10,475.00 | LOGAN 650 $195.00 | $4,875.00 | INGENTO 1162
Pear! Artist and Craft i
Supply Corp. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $485.44 $12,136.00 | LOGAN 650 $0.00 $0.00 NOBID .
Sax Arts and Crafts $600.00 $12,000.00 | BULMAN R999 $500.00 $12,500.00 | LOGAN 650 $200.00 | $5,000.00 | INGENTO {162

Art Equipment
BID #015-JJ08

pg 2




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FL

Item Number 7 8. 9
Description Table model paper cutter 30" x 30" Table model paper cutter 36" x 36" Ceramic wares cart w/shelves
Quantity 20 25 10
UoM each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total $ Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mig & Mod

AFP Industries, Inc. $380.00 $7,600.00 | Ingento 1174 $497.00 $12,425.00 | Ingento 1184 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Bailey Pottery

Equipment Corp. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $743.00 $7,430.00 |Brent

Brodart Co. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Commercial Art Supply div.

C.A.S. Ind,, Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Cutlass Enterprises, Inc. : BRENT WARE

/Bennet Pottery Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $580.00 $5,800.00 | W/SHELVES

Cutlass Enterprises, Inc: .

/Bennet Pottery Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith

Office & Computer INGENTO

Supply $360.00 $7,200.00 1174 $440.00 $11,000.00 | INGENTO 1184 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

GEO Type of South

Florida DBA Easel Art INGENTO

Supply $670.00 $13,400.00 1174 $795.00 $19,875.00 | INGENTO 1184 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

. . BRENT AS

Laguna Clay Company $0.00 $0.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $684.00 $6,840.00 SPECIFIED
INGENTO

NASCO $611.21 $12,224.20 1174 $723.41 $18,085.23 | INGENTO 1184 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

Nationwide Drafting and

Office Supply Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NOBID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
INGENTO

Pyramid School Products $495.00 $9,900.00 1174 $595.00 $14,875.00 | INGENTO 1184 $649.00 $6,490.00 |AMACO 22832]

Pearl Artist and Craft

Supply Corp. $0.00 $0.00 | NOBID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

BRENT

INGENTO W/SHELVES

Sax Arts and Crafts $500.00 $10,000.00 1174 $600.00 $15,000.00 | INGENTO 1184 $600.00 $6,000.00 22832)

Art Equipment
BID #015-JJ08

pg 3




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FL

Art Equipment
BID #015-JJ08

Item Number 10 11 12
Description Kiln Furniture Kits Studio spray booth w/stand
Quantity 35 35 TOTAL LOW BID 15
UoOM each each Items 10 and 11 l each
VENDOR(S) Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod
AFP Industries, Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Bailey Pottery
Equipment Corp. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 £0.00 NO BID
Brodart Co. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NOBID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Comimercial Art Supply div.
C.A.S. Ind, Inc, $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Cutlass Enterprises, Inc. OLYMPIC MODEL AMACO
/Bennet Pottery Supply $1,854.00 $64,890.00 2327H $188.00 $6,580.00 | OLYMPIC KIT $71,470.00 $2,107.00 #VALUE! ITO14R/11053L
Cutlass Enterprises, Inc.
/Bennet Pottery Supply $2,477.00 $86,695.00 | SKUTTT MODEL 1027 $150.00 $5,250.00 SKUTT KIT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer
Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
GEO Type of South
Florida DBA Easel Art
Supply $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
CORDIRITE KILN
Laguna Clay Company $1,612.00 $56,420.00 | OLYMPIC 2327H $124.00 $4,340.00 |SHELVES $60,760.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
NASCO $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Nationwide Drafting and NOBID
Office Supply Inc. $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
AMACO EX- New #Amaco 11014R
Pyramid School Products $1,795.00 $62,825.00 365SF $299.00 $10,465.00 | AMACO 11455C $73,290.00 $1,895.00 $28,425.00 w1053L
Pearl Artist and Craft
Supply Corp. £0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID
SKUTTT MODEL AMACO I10IR AS
Sax Ats and Crafts $2,050.00 | $71,750.00 1027 $300.00 | $10,500.00 | AS SPECIFIED |  $82,250.00 $1,600.00 |  $24,000.00 | STECFEP
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-

DADE COUNTY, FL

Art Equipment

Item Number 13 (REJECT) 14 15
Description Portable Art Gallery Portable Art Gallery -2 panels Art and planning table 12+
Quantity 20 10 66
Uom each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod
) Hann A2-
AFP Industries, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 468.00]  $30,888.00
4260PLT
Bailey Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Cutlass Enterprises DBA
Bennett Pottery Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
GEOTYPE of South
Florida DBA Easeal Art 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Supply
Laguna Clay Company 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
NASCO 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Nationwide Drafting and
Offiuce suuply, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Pyramid School Products 0.00] . $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Peart Artist & Craft Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
ACCO Model
Sax Arts and Crafts 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 530.00 $5,300.00 | Brand VIN2 450.001" $29,700.00
Series 1300743705

BID #015-JJ08
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI- Art Equipment BID #015-JJ08
DADE COUNTY, FL

Item Number 15a 158 16 16A
Description Art and planning table 4 - 11 Art and planning table 1-3 Art and planning table top 1-3/4" thick Art and planning table 4 - 11
Quantity 100 18 66 100
UoM each each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit $ Total § Mfp & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod
. Hann A2- Hann A2- | Hann A2- Hann A2-
AFP Industries, Inc. 508.00f $50,800.00 4260PLT 530.00f $9,540.00 4260PLT 628.00] $41,448.00 4260MP 688.00] $68,800.00 4260MP
Bailey Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00} . $0.00 | NOBID
Cutlass Enterprises DBA
Bennett Pottery Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith :
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
GEOTYPE of South
Florida DBA Easeal Art 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Supply .
Laguna Clay Company 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
NASCO 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Nationwide Drafting and 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Offiuce suuply, Inc. ' ’ ! : ' : ! !
Pyramid School Products 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 1 NOBID
Pear| Artist & Craft Supply ' 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 ] NOBID
Mdel Model ” As
Sax Arts and Crafts 450.00f $45,000.00 1300743705 450.00 $8,100.00 1300743705 550.00] $36,300.00 | As specified 550.00{ $55,000.00 specified
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-

DADE COUNTY, FL

Art Equipment

BID #015-JJ08

Item Number 16B 17 18 19
Description Art and planning table 1 -3 TOTAL LOW BID Drafting table Four Statlon Work Bench Aluminum "Studio” Easel
Quantity 18 Items 15 and 16B 17 5 10
uom each each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit § Total § Mig & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod
. Hann A2- Smith Systems .
AFP Industries, Inc, 708.00! $12,744.00 4260MP $81,544.00 328.00 $5,576.00 273460 2088.00] $10,440.00 | Hann L4-OV 85.88 $858.80 | Testrite 600
Bailey Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 NOBID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NQ BID
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 92.29 $822.90 | Testrite 600
Cutlass Enterprises DBA :
Bennett Pottery Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NQ BID
Daboter, inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
GEOTYPE of South .
Florida DBA Easeal Art 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 101.00{ $1,010.00 | Testrite 600
Supply
L.aguna Clay Company 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID ' 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
NASCQ 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Nationwide Drafting and
Offiuce suuply, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
’ Smith Systems
Pyramid School Products 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 395.00 $6,715.00 | 273546 (Replaces 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 956.00 $950.00 | Testrite 600
27336)
Pearl Artist & Craft Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
" Shain/Shop DT o )

Sax Arts and Crafts 550.00] $9,900.00 | As specified $64,900.00 500.00 $8,500.00 605A 1650.00f  $8,250.00 | As specified 85.00 $850.00 | Testrite 500




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI- Art Equipment BID #015-JJ08
DADE COUNTY, FL
Item Number 20 21 22 23 _(REJECT)
Description Service Cart Heavy Duty all Steel drying racks 26 x 36 Heavy Duty all Steel drying racks 42x55 Etching press 13 x 26 x 1/3
Quantity 1040 10 10 4
UuoM each each each each
YENDOR(S) Unit § Total $ Mfg & Mod Unit $ Total $ Mig & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mig & Mod
: Continental AWT DR30- AWT DR55-
AFP Industries, lnc.} 198.00 $19,800.00 5805/5806 2198.00; $21,980.00 50 3148.00f $31,480.00 50 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Bailey Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Cutlass Enterprises DBA
Bennett Pottery Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
GEOTYPE of South
Florida DBA Easeal Art 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Supply
Rubbermaid
Laguna Clay Company 301.00/  $30.100.00 | 4520-88 and 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
4598.-88
NASCO 263.46 $26.346.00 1482.45| $14,924.50 DOCK 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
’ R ’ e DELIVERY ’ ) ' '
Nationwide Drafting and
Offiuce suuply, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID
Pyramid Schoo! Products 249.00)  $24,900.00 | Continental | 40 of o 3,950.00 | AWTDRIE- |10 00| 514,950,00 | AWT DRES- 0.00| $000| NOBID
5805/5806 50 50
Pearl Artist & Craft Supply 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Continental ” "

Sax Arts and Crafts 150.00{  $15,000.00 5805BE 1300.00] $13,000.00 | As specified 1990.00{ $19,900.00 | As specified 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
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THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI- Art Equipment BID #015-JJ08
DADE COUNTY, FL
Item Number 24 25 26 27
Description Slab Roller Potter's wheel 14" Potter's wheel 14" (Reject) Pottery tools
Quantity 4 5 5 20
UOM each each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit § Total 3 Mg & Mod Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mlg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod
AFP Industries, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Bailey Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NQ BID
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Cutlass Enterprises DBA Pacifica GT 400 Pacifica GT400
Bennett Pottery Supply 1864.00f $7,456.00 | Brent SR-20 846.00 $4,230.00 wlad seal 846.00{ $4,230.00 wiadj, seat 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 SG.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
GEOTYPE of South
Florida DBA Easeal Art 0.00 $C.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Supply
Axner M700 Axnar M700
Laguna Clay Company 2012.00| $8,048.00 | BrentT SR-20 849.00|  $4,245.00 | wisplash pan & 849.00| $4,245.00 | wisplash pan & 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
) Pwseat . pwseat
NASCO 2036.76 $8,147.04 | DBrentSR-20 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID
' T Dock Delivery : ‘ ! : : '
Nationwide Drafting and 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID
Offiuce suuply, Inc. ’ ’ . . . . . )
: BRENT SR-20 AMACO AMACO
Pyramid School Products 1795.00{ $7,180.00 (AMACO 999.00 $4,995.00 BRENT 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 59.00 $1,180.00
22621B) MODEL B 226367 -
Pearl Artist & Craft Supply 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Sax Arts and Crafts 1870.00] $7,480.00 | Brent SR-20 1020.00 $5,100.00 Brent "C* 230.00] $1,150.00 37.70 $754.00 443§¢§705




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF MIAMI-

DADE COUNTY, FL

Art Equipment

BID #015-JJ08

Item Number 28 29 30 31 32
Description Wedging board Waxmelter Pug Mill Drawer Flat File Vertical Rack
Quantity 4 5 10 30 15
UOM each each each each each
VENDOR(S) Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit $ Total § Mfg & Mod Unit$ Total § Mig & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod Unit § Total § Mfg & Mod
. SAFCO SAFCO
AFP Industries, Inc. 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 1038.00] $31,140.00 4996/4997 228.00; $3,420.00 3030
Balley Pottery Equipment 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
BRODART
Brodart Co. 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 898.77| $26,963.10 8717000 AND 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
87105000
Commercial Art Supply 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00| NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
Cutlass Enterprises DBA ] Shimp
Bennett Pottery Supply 305.00f $1,220.00 | Amaco 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 27439.00 $27,490.00 NRA-04 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 NO BID
Daboter, Inc. d/b/a Smith . SAFCO SAFCO 3030
Office & Computer Supply 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NO BID 950.00] $28,500.00 4996/4997 184.00f $2,760.00 gﬁ%?ﬂ
GEOTYPE of South SAFCO SAFCO
Florida DBA Easeal Art - 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 945.00{ $28,350.00 215.00] $3,225.00
Supply 4996/4997 3030
Ceramic
Supply Shi
Laguna Clay Company 139.00  $556.00 | V/edoing 0.00] $0.00 | NOBID | 2781.00{ $27.810.00 NR‘X“(’)Z 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID
0al = .
20'x24'x14.5 ’
Shrimpo
NASCO 184.42| $737.68 | Debeor 0.00  $0.00| NOBID | 2693.68| $26,936.80 | A% | 407007| g3210810 | DOk 316.79| $4,751.85| Do°k
9615 Dock Delivery Delivery
Delivary
Nationwide Drafting and SAFCO SAFCO
Offiuce suuply, Inc, 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 797.89] $23,936.70 4996/4997 189.98| $2,849.70 3030
. i AMACO
Pyramid School Products 395.00] $1,580.00 1711w 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00{, $0.00 NO BID
Pearl Artist & Craft Supply - 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 $0.00 | NOBID 0.00 30.00 | NOBID
Hamilton ‘
Cebcor Bch As As "
Sax Arts and Crafts 170.00 $680.00 9615 36.95| $184.75 33160 3000.00 $30,000.00 specified 800.00{ $24,000.00 specified 250.00{ $3,750.00 |As Specified
8 QL.

SAX ARTS AND CRAFTS ~ ltem 19, item does not meet specifications, the testrite 500 hold canvases up to 48” high. Bid requires that t

SAX ARTS AND CRAFTS - Item 30, vendor qualified terms and conditions of bid, vendor states ,
ineluded on bid) per delivery.

he easel holds canvases up to 57" high.

if a schools does not have a dock, the liftgate charge is $130.00 (price not
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