Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

R. Tyndall @
S

Prepared By:

J. Bradley W

Verified By:

AFP Industries All Florida Paper Bestway Industrial Supply
ESTIMATED
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY  |[lunit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Linit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode! Unit Price [ Total Price Manuf & Modet
1 364-1058 |[Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount. 660
‘ $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $44.45 $29,337.00 |As specified
2 : 365-0120 {| Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
’ 396
i $10.45 $4,138.20 |As specified $10.92 $4,324.32 [As specified $0.00 |No Bid
30 365-0677 }ISqueegee, Window
L 198 . .
i $4.97 $984.06 |As specified $6.12 $1,211.76 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid
4 365-0669 [{Squeegee, floor
132
S $11.15 $1,471.80 |As specified - $16.08 $2,122.56 [As specified $32.08 $4,234.56 |As specified
5 365-4354 {IBrush, Floor Drain
) 132 Carlisle 4014600
S i $14.71 $1,941.72 [As specified $6.29 $830.28 |as specified $0.00 |No Bid
L 365-0111 |[Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
: 132
$4.88 $644.16 | As specified $3.62 $477.84 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid
7 IF 365-0758 |Bowl, Plastic - Tie Bid 264
' $0.00 [No Bid $5.60 $1,478.40 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid
8.1 365-0600 {[Plunger, Toilet
S 675 . .
G $4.72 $3,186.00 |As specified $4.25 $2,868.75 JAs specified $5.32 $3,591.00 |As specified
Q. 365-0057 |[Brush, Counter
324
$3.08 $997,92 |As specified $2.77 $897.48 {As specified $3.55 $1,150.20 |As specified
365-0090 |IBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
240
Carliste 4026200
$5.38 $1,291.20 |As specified $4.85 $1,164.00 {as specified $12.69 $3,045.60 |As specified
365-0197 |Bucket, Plastic
990
: $19.93 | $19,730.70 |Continental 335-B $29.12 $28,828.80 |As specified $65.39 $64,736.10 |As specified
42} 365-0413 l[Handle, Floor Squeegee
132 . .
$2.77 $365.64 [As specified $2.29 $302.28 [As specified $0.00 {No Bid
13 365-0693 [{Pads, Stripping:
99 . .
$0.00 |{No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
1
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Bid # 076-4J02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

R. Tyndall

Prepared

By:

J. Bradley

Verified By:

AFP Industries

All Florida Paper

Bestway Industrial Supply

ESTIMATED
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY  {lunit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
14 365-0103 |{Brush, Floor, 24" Without Handle
475
$6.97 $3,310.75 As specified $0.00 |No Bid $11.68 $5,548.00 |As specified
A5 - f 365-0821 |{Broom, Lobby Plastic
: 2,059 $2.72 $5,600.48 |As specified $3.19 $6,568.21 |As specified $5.03 $10,356.77 |As specified
=182} 365-4346 {Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
= % $6.61 $2,617.56 }As specified $6.84 $2,708.64 |As specified $12.69 $5,025.24 [As specified
=17 365-0286 |{Toilet Tissue Dispenser
i 660 $4.14 $2,732.40 |As specified $4.89 $3,227,40 |As specified $7.19 $4,745.40 |As specified
18} 365-0715 ||Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
- 594 Cont SW 7YW as}
: $27.97 | $16,614.18 |specified $46.87 $27,840.78 |As specified $79.19 $47,038.86 |As specified
19 |[ 3650367 |[Pan, Dust
: 742 -
e $2.88 $2,136.96 |As specified $2.76 $2,047.92 {As specified $3.34 $2,478.28 |As specified
20| 365-0405 HHandle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
=l 990 Carlisle 45268 as
$2.92 $2,890.80 |As specified $2.59 $2,564.10 |specified $0.00 {No Bid
721+ || 365-0855 |[Pads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
e Glit 20" peach as
2310 specified - Tie bid
Dade County
o $9.29° |  $21,459.90 |minority vendor $0.00 |No Bid $35.00 $80,850.00 |As specified
2 2A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Helder 23"
30 $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $47.60 $14,280.00 JAs specified
228 Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
300 $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $38.90 $11,670.00 |As specified
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
400 $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $52.85 $21,140.00 |As specified
22D Easy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
400 $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $70.00 $28,000.00 |As specified
$0.00 $0.00 $75,090.00
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Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Calico Industries Cheney Brothers Dade Paper
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION QOF ITEM Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
1} 364-1058 Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount,
: $0.00 |No Bid $41.52 $27,403.20 |As specified $40.10 $26,466.00 |As specified
2 365-0120 || Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
= Wilen FO06024 as
$6.54 $2,589.84 |specified $0.00 [No Bid $11.50 $4,554.00 JAs specified
723 365-0677 ||Squeegee, Window
L $6.34 $1,255.32 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $6.60 $1.306.80 |As specified
sd -l 365-0669 |{Squeegee, floor
- $10.54 $1,391.28 |As specified $10.74 $1,417.68 |As specified $11.34 $1,496.88 |As specified
5 365-4354 |{Brush, Floor Drain .
$6.54 $863.28 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $13.72 $1,811.04 [As specified
6 i 365-0111 |{Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$3.49 $460.68 |As specified $3.60 $475.20 |As specified $3.82 $504.24 JAs specified
Continental #
40201280 as
7 365-0758 {[Bowl, Plastic - Tie Bid specified - Tie Bid
-out of State . .
$1.19 $314.16 | endor $1.20 $316.80 |As specified $1.30 $343.20 [As specified
“8i =l 365-0600 {iPlunger, Toilet
$3.44 $2,322.00 |As specified $5.62 $3,793.50 |As specified $4.84 $3,267.00 [As specified
365-0057 {{Brush, Counter
s $3.64 $1,179.36 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $2.87 $929.88 |As specified
e 365-0090 {IBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
e $5.08 $1,219.20 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $5.02 $1,204.80 |As specified
13+ | 365-0197 ||Bucket, Plastic
$19.94 $19,740.60 |As specified $22.24 $22,017,60 [As specified $21.14 $20,928,60 |As specified
12 365-0413 {|Handle, Floor Squeegee
$1.97 $260.04 |As specified $1.93 $254,76 }As specified $1.95 $257.40) |As specified
13 365-0693 {iPads, Stripping:
$6.84 $677.16 |As specified $7.08 $700.92 |As specified $6.98 $691.02 [As specified
3 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Calico Industries Cheney Brothers Dade Paper
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price  {Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Mode! Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
14 365-0103 [|Brush, Floor, 24" Without Handle Carlisle 36219224 -
: not approved mode!
number -Economy
$6.32 $3,002.00 |As specified $6.52 $3,007.00 |As specified $6.00 $2,850.00 |version
15 365-0821 )Broom, Lobby Plastic
‘ $1.69 $3,479.71 |As specified $1.75 $3,603.25 |As specified $1.67 $3,438.53 |As specified
16 365-4346 {iBrush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
: $2.34 $926.64 |As specified $2.37 $938.52 |As specified $2.33 $922.68 JAs specified
170 | 365-0286 [Toilet Tissue Dispenser
$3.84 $2,534.40 |As specified $3.99 $2,633.40 |As specified $3.86 $2,547.60 |As specified -
=18 365-0715 [{Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
$28.07 $16,673.58 {As specified $31.27 $18,574.38 |As specified $29.70 $17,641,80 |As specified
19| 365-0367 ||Pan, Dust
$2.44 $1,810.48 |As specified $2.51 $1,862.42 |As specified $2.43 $1,803.06 {As specified
365-0405 [{Handle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
. $2.68 $2,653.20 {As specified $0.00 {No Bid $2.68 $2,653.20 |As speeified
365-0855 |IPads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
$9.52 $21,991.20 ] As specified $10.37 $23,954.70 |As specified $9.59 $22,152.90 |As specified
22A Eusy Trap Dust Cloth Hoider 23"
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $36.81 $11,043,00 |As specified
228 Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47" ,
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $28.73 $8,619.00 {As specified
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Fy
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $39.19 $15,676.00 |As specitied
22D Kasy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
$0.00 [No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $50.62 $20,248.00 |As specified
$0.00 $0.00 $55,586.00
4 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Bid # 076-J4J02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Distruct Healthcare Faycroft Genesis II
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model lUnit Prica Total Price Manuf & Model
L Toleo 230114 -
o | 364-1058 |Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount. not specified
e $31.04 $20,486.40 |brand $41.15 $27,159.00 |As specified $38.94 $25,700.40 |As specified
2 365-0120 || Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
s Abco BHI2003 -
I Not specified
: $3.93 $1,556.28 [brand $13.11 $5,191.56 JAs specified $11.95 $4,732.20 | Weiler 42135
+3 |t 365-0677 {iSqueegee, Window
E Tolco - not
$8.10 $1,603.80 [specified brand $7.95 $1,574.10 |As specificd $5.07 $1,003.86 |As specified
365-0669 ||Squeegee, floor
Better Brush - Not
$12.61 $1,664.52 |As specified $12.95 $1,709.40 |As specified $8.59 $1,133.88 |an approved brand
5 - |t 365-4354 |IBrush, Floor Drain
$0.00 |No Bid $15.14 $1,998.48 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid
6 |l 365-0111 ||Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
= Abco BH12006 ag
" $3.33 $439.56 {specified $5.05 $666.60 |As specified $5.09 $671.88 {As specified
7 365-0758 ||Bowl, Plastic - Tic Bid Tolto - Not Continental
$4.32 $1,140.48 |specified brand $1.99 $525.36 |As specified $1.94 $512.16 |40201820
S8 i 365-0600 ||Plunger, Toilet
R Tolco 280174 as
$2.37 $1,599,75 |specified $5.05 $3,408.75 |As specified $2.78 $1,876.50 |As specified
365-0057 {IBrush, Counter
$3.56 $1,153.44 |Impact 37010 $3.99 $1,292,76 |As specified $2.78 $900.72 |As specified
365-0090 {iBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
Abco - Not
$3.50 $840.00 |specified brand $6.30 $1,512.00 |As specified $7.09 $1,701,60 |As specified
3635-0197 {iBucket, Plastic
Continental 335-
L $29.82 $29,521.80 |As specified $24.25 $24,007.50 |As specilied $20.06 $19,859.40 |3ywpl
12 365-0413 ||Handle, Floor Squeegee
Abco - Not Better Brush - Not|
$1.79 $236.28 |specified brand $2.99 $394,68 |As specified $3.28 $432,9¢6 Jan approved brand
13. || 365-0693 |[Pads, Stripping: ASSRRCIRT OO 392257~
Listed each price Not an approved
$7.65 $757.35 |at $1.53 each $8.35 $826.65 |As specified $8.17 $808.83 {brand

5
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Distruct Healthcare Faycroft Genesis 11
ITEM {| DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet
14 365-0103 {IBrush, Floor, 24" Without Handle
) Abco BH 11008 as Better Brush - Not
$6.03 $2,864.25 ispecified No Bid $6.62 $3,144.50 |an approved brand
15 365-0821 ||Broom, Lobby Plastic
S Better Brush - Not|
$3.15 $6,485.85 |As specified $1.96 $4,035.64 {As specified $2.03 $4,179.77 {an approved brand
5 16-"|| 365-4346 {Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only Magnolia 4UT0 - |f
) Abco 00026H -12 Not an approved
o $2.18 $863.28 |as specified $3.10 $1,227.60 |As specified $5.84 $2,312,64 [brand
17 365-0286 ||Toilet Tissue Dispenser
s $4.83 $3,187.80 |As specified $4.99 $3,293.40 As specified $4.19 $2,765.40 {As specified
18 365-0715 |\Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
. $47.25 $28,066.50 {As specified $33.26 $19,756.44 |As specified $28.21 $16,756.74 |As specified
19 365-0367 {|Pan, Dust .
Continental 715 as
L $2.73 $2,025.66 |As specified $3.60 $2,671.20 |As specified $2.00 $1,550.78 [specified
220 365-0405 j|Handle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
T Better Brush
: $0.00 [No Bid $3.82 $3,781.80 |As specified $2.72 $2,692.80 (140472 as equal
: 271} 365-0855 |iPads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid ACS -Not
T approved brand -
Listed each price
$10.00 $23,100.00 |°f 5200 $11.10 $25,641.00 |As specified $9.58 $22,129.80 |As specified
22A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23"
$35.15 $10,545.00 |As specified $40.75 $12,225.00 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid
22B Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
$28.87 $8,661.00 JAs specified $32.25 $9,675.00 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
$39.37 $15,748.00 {As specified $43.25 $17,300.00 [As specified $0.00 {No Bid
22D Kasy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125" .
$50.36 $20,144,00 |As specified $54.90 $21,960.00 |As specified $0,00 {No Bid
$55,098.00 $61,160.00 $0.00
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Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Industrial Cleaning Equipment and

Glocecol Supply Ideal Supply
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF {TEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
1 . )| 364-1058 |[Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount. Bobrick B4112 As
$46.80 $30,888.00 {As specified $67.89 $44,807.40 |As specified $37.56 $24,789.60 jspecified
2 365-0120 i} Brush, Fioor, Wire center, 24" without handle
v ‘ Abco - Not an
$4.46 $1,766.16 |approved brand $0.00 [No Bid $10.69 $4,233.24 |As specified
3 365-0677 |[Squeegee, Window
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $6.75 $1,336.50 |As specified
4 365-0669 ||Squeegee, floor
$14.40 $1,500.80 |As specified $17.95 $2,369.40 | As specified $12.51 $1,651.32 {As specified
o 365-4354 |IBrush, Floor Drain
. As specified -
Handle price
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $6.96 $918.72 {$7.43
B 365-0111 liBrush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$3.80 $501.60 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $4.29 $566.28 |As specified
7 365-0758 [iBowl, Plastic - Tie Bid
$6.34 $1,673.76 {Impact 4118LD $6.06 $1,599.84 {impact 4118LD $1.50 $396.00 |As specified
<787l 365-0600 {|Plunger, Toilet :
‘ $4.74 $3,199.50 |As specified $4.88 $3,294.00 jAs specified $4.41 $2,976.75 |As specificd
-9 365-0057 {|Brush, Counter
$4.19 $1,357.56 |As specified $3.99 $1,292.76 jImpact 37010 $3.85 $1,247.40 | As specified
2230 365-0090 ||Brush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
Impact - Not
: $3.10 $744.00 |approved brand $0.00 |No Bid $4.95 $1,188.00 {As specified
11 . || 365-0197 |[Bucket, Plastic
$33.40 $33,066.00 {As specified $32.99 $32,660.,10 |As specified $20.16 $19,958.40 |As specified
12 365-0413 |[Handle, Floor Squeegee
$2.09 $275.88 |As specified $0.00 [No Bid $2.11 $278.52 |As speciied
13 365-0693 ||Pads, Stripping:
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $9.16 $906.84 |As specified
7
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Industrial Cleaning Equipment and

Glocecol Supply Ideal Supply
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
14 365-0103 ||Brush, Floor, 24" Without Handle Carlisle 3685914 -|
Does not comply -
-t this is a lobby
$6.85 $3,253.75 |As specified $0.00 No Bid $5.84 $2,774.00 {broom
16 365-0821 |IBroom, Lobby Plastic
: $1.89 $3,891.51 |As specified $3.60 $7,412.40 $1.64 $3,376.76 |As specified
16 365-4346 ||Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
$2.48 $982.08 {As specified $10.69 $4,233.24 {As specified $2.23 $883.08 |As specified
17 365-0286 {{Toilet Tissue Dispenser
$5.68 $3,748.80 |As specified $5.52 $3,643.20 [As specified $3.69 $2,435.40 |As specified
18 365-0715 {{Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
; $54.10 $32,135.40 |As specified $54.00 $32,076.00 {As specified $28.39 $16,863.66 |As specified
19 365-0367 |[Pan, Dust
$3.15 $2,337.30 |As specified $3.12 $2,315.04 |As specified $2.37 $1,758.54 |As specified
20, 365-0405 |[Handle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
e $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $3.71 $3,672.90 |As specified
21 365-0855 ||Pads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 JNo Bid $9.38 $21,667.80 {As specified
22A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23"
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
22B Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No-Bid $0.00 |No Bid
22D Easy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
' $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 [No Bid $0.00 [No Bid
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
8
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Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Lace Food Service

Lace - Alternate

Neeld Paper & Supply / Janitors
Supply Outlet

ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
-1 364-1058 |[Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount. .
$39.64 $26,162.40 [As specified $0.00 |No Bid $51.31 $33,864.60 |As specified
2 365-0120 }i Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
$12.17 $4,819.32 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $12.08 $4,783.68 {As specified
3 365-0677 |iSqueegee, Window
S $7.16 $1,417.68 |As specified $5.64 $1,116,72 |As specified $7.20 $1,425.60 {As specified
4 -ff 365-0669 |[Squeegee, floor
$12.91 $1,704.12 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $11.11 $1,466.52 |As specified
5+ 365-4354 |[Brush, Floor Drain
: $7.42 $979.44 |As specified $0.00 [No Bid $7.39 $975.48 |As specified
6 365-0111 {iBrush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$3.66 $483.12 {As specified $0.00 |No Bid $4.76 $628.32 jAs specified
7 365-0758 |IBowl, Plastic - Tie Bid
$4.95 $1,306.80 |Impact 4118 $0.00 |No Bid $1.92 $506.88 |As specified
8. || 365-0600 }|Plunger, Toilet
$5.49 $3,705.75 | As specified $0.00 {No Bid $6.18 $4,171.50 |As specified
9 - | 365-0057 {{Brush, Counter
$3.60 $1,166.40 |Carlisle 3625903 $0.00 |No Bid $3.26 $1,056.24 |Carlisle 3625903
365-0090 [iBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
$6.31 $1,514.40 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $5.70 $1,368.00 |As specified
117§ 365-0197 {[Bucket, Plastic
$20.98 $29,680.20 {As specified $0.00 {No Bid $23.00 $22,770.00 |As specified
12 365-0413 {Handle, Floor Squeegee
$2.69 $355.08 |As specified $0.00 |{No Bid $2.70 $356.40 |As specified
13 365-0693 {iPads, Stripping:
$0.00 {No bid $0.00 |No Bid $1.76 $768.24 JAs specified
9
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Neeld Paper & Supply / Janitors
Lace Food Service Lace - Alternate Supply Outlet
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price | Total Price Manuf & Model
14 365-0103 |iBrush, Floor, 24" Without Handle
$6.23 $2,959.25 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $7.42 $3,524.50 |As specified
15 365-0821 ||Broom, Lobby Plastic
$1.84 $3,788.56 |As specified $0.00 [No Bid $3.34 $6,877.06 |As specified
167 ]| 365-4346 |[Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
$2.46 $974,16 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $8.03 $3,179.88 |As specified
17 365-0286 {{Toilet Tissue Dispenser
$5.59 $3,689,40 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $4.38 $2,860.80 |As specified
18 365-0715 |[Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
$46.99 $27,912.06 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $32.36 $19,221.84 |As specified
19 365-0367 |{Pan, Dust
' . $3.69 $2,737.98 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $2.78 $2,062.76 |As specified
20 365-0405 {{Handle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
$3.43 $3,395.70 {As specified $0.00 {No Bid $3.05 $3,019.50 |As specified
271+ || 365-0855 |{Pads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
: $0.00 |No bid $0.00 [No Bid $10.74 $24,809.40 |As specified
22A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23"
$0.00 {No bid $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 $0.00 {No Bid
228 Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
$0.00 {No bid $0.00 iNo Bid $0.00 $0.00 {No Bid
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
$0.00 iNo bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 $0.00 {No Bid
22D tasy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
. $0.00 |No bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 $0.00 {No Bid
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)




Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Pancar Industrial Supply PRIDE Pyramid School Products
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
1 364-1058 ||Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount,
; $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $37.73 $24,901.801 As specified
22771 365-0120 || Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
) $11.45 $4,534.20 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $6.85 $2,712.60;As specified
3 365-0677 {|Squeegee, Window
: $6.69 $1,324.62 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $6.22 $1,231.56| As specified
g 365-0669 ||Squeegee, floor
& Continental 3600
$15.19 $2,005.08 |As specified $14.05 $1,854.60 |As specified $9.94 $1,312.08as specified
[ 365-4354 {iBrush, Floor Drain
$6.72 $887.04 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $6.69 $883.08] As specified
6 365-0111 }|Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$3.99 $526.68 |As specified $3.71 $489.72 |As specified $3.59 $473.88| As specified
Continental G500
PR # 40201280 as
7 .| 365-0758 {iBowl, Plastic - Tie Bid specified Florida
$0.00 |No Bid $9.65 $2,547.60 |As specified $1.19 $314.16fvendor
8 365-0600 ||Plunger, Toilet
$0.00 {No Bid $5.35 $3,611.25 |As specified $2.43 $1,640.25|As specified
9.~ It 365-0057 {iBrush, Counter
Weiler 25251 as
$3.71 $1,202.04 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $2.42 $784.08]specified
365-0090 [iBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
$5.04 $1,257.60 JAs specified $0.00 {No Bid $5.45 $1,308.00 As specified
365-0197 ||Bucket, Plastic
$42.99 $42,560.10 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $20.06 $19,859.401 As specified
125§ 365-0413 HHandle, Floor Squeegee
$2.50 $341,88 |As specified $1.98 $261.36 |As specified 31.89 $249.48| As specified
365-0693 {|Pads, Stripping:
13 acs ppie Glit 20010 as
$8.95 $886.05 |As specified 39,10 $900.90 |As specified $6.61 $654.39 specified
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Pancar Industrial Supply PRIDE Pyramid School Products
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet Unit Prica Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Madet
14 365-0103 {{Brush, Floor, 24" Without Handle Weiler 25232 - no
the approved
model - economy
$6.59 $3,130.25 |As specified 36.72 $3,192.00 |As specified $5.63 $2,674.25}version
153 365-0821 HBroom, Lobby Plastic
: Abco BR102IMC
33.01 $6,197.59 |As specified $1.80 $3,706.20 |As specified $1.61 $3,314.9%as specified
18 365-4346 [[Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
$7.71 $3,053.16 |As specified $2.43 $962.28 | As specified $2.22 $879.12 As specified
17 365-0286 {Toilet Tissue Dispenser Continentat RT22
$6.15 $4,059.00 |As specified $6.40 $4,224.00 |As specified $3.66 $2,415.60fas specified
18 365-0715 [[Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
$76.15 $45,233.10 |As specified $45.32 $26,920.08 |As specified $28.06 $16,667.64] As specified
19| 365-0367 |[Pan, Dust
e $3.09 $2,292.78 $3.25 $2,411.50 {As specified $2.26 $1,676.92)As specified
20 )| 365-0405 |{Handle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
$3.34 $3,306.60 $5.82 $5,761.80 |As specified $2.98 $2,950.201 As specified
2717 || 365-0855 {[Pads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
Glit 20" Peach as
$12.05 $27,835.50 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $9.29 $21,459. 90 specified
22A asy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23" 3M 59247 as
. $0.00 |{No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $33.99 $10,197.00] specified
228 Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47" 3M 55937 as
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $27.89 $8,367.00{ specified
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft 3M 55654 as
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $38.24 $15,296.00| specified
22D Easy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125" : 3M 55655 as
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No 8id $49.25 $19,700.00{ specified
$0.00 $0.00 $53,560.00
12
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Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndalil

Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Quality Chemical Company

Quality Chemical - Alternate

Rex Chemical

ITEM | DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
-4 364-1058 {IDispenser, Soap, Surface Mount.
. $40.10 $26,466.00 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $38.36 $25,317.60 |As specified
. 2 J| 365-0120 |f Brush, Floor, Wire center, 24" without handle
. $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 {No Bid
~.o3 . | 365-0677 liSqueegee, Window Bener Brush
- : 260416 as
. $4.54 $898.92 |specified $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
g 365-0669 [I[Squeegee, floor
o Better Brush - Not
: $16.18 $2,135.76 |As specified $8.03 $1,059.96 [an approved brand $16.70 $2,204.40 |As specified
«"§.< || 365-4354 |[Brush, Floor Drain
) $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
6 365-0111 |{Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$4.28 $564.96 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
7 365-0758 {|Bowl, Plastic - Tie Bid
$5.64 $1,488.96 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $6.14 $1,620.96 |As specified
8 365-0600 |iPlunger, Toilet
$4.28 $2,889.00 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $4.42 $2,983.50 |As specified
.9 3635-0057 |[Brush, Counter
. Carolina Mop -
Not an approved
$3.63 $1,176.12 [As specified $3.20 $1,036.80 |brand $3.94 $1,276.56 |As specified
0.t 365-0090 [iBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
11 365-0197 [iBucket, Plastic
$30.39 $30,086. 10 {As specified $0.00 No Bid $31.38 $31,066.20 |As specified
12 || 365-0413 |{Handle, Floor Squeegee Caroing Mop -
Better Brush - Not Not an approved
$2.17 $286.44 |an approved brand| $2.08 $274.56 |brand $0.00 |No Bid
13 365-0693 {{Pads, Stripping:
$0.00 [No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $9.50 $940,50 As specified
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

Title: Custodial Supplies

Buyer: R. Tyndall

Quality Chemical Company

Quality Chemical - Alternate

Rex Chemical

Manuf & Model

ITEM [} DCPS # DESCRIPTION QOF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model Unit Price Total Price
14 365-0103 ||Brush, Floor, 24" Without Handle
Better Brush - Not
$6.60 $3,135.00 |an approved brand $0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid
=16 I 365-0821 |IBroom, Lobby Plastic
E Beuter Brush - Not|
$3.21 $6,609.39 |As specified $2.05 $4,220.95 jan approved brand $3.31 $6,815.29 |As specificd
164} 365-4346 |Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
) $9.55 $3,781.80 |As specified $0.00 {No Bid $9.85 $3,900.60 |As specified
1:7. || 365-0286 |[Toilet Tissue Dispenser
e $4.93 $3,253.80 | As specified $0.00 |No Bid $5.08 $3,352.80 {As specified
8 365-0715 {{Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
. $48.15 $28,601.10 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $49.21 $29,230.74 |As specified
“A9 [ 365-0367 Pan, Dust
i $2.79 $2,070.18 |As specified $0.00 |No Bid $2.87 $2,129.54
20 || 365-0405 {|Handie, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter Carolina Miop -
Not an approved
$1.86 $1,841.40 {brand $0.00 [No Bid $0.00 [No Bid
27 365-0855 {{Pads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid ’
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $25.70 $59,367.00 [As specified
22A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23"
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $35.20 $10,560.00 |As specified
22B Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $28.90 $8.670.00 |As specified
22C Easy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
$0.00 |No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $39.40 $15,760.00 JAs specified
22D Easy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
$0.00 {No Bid $0.00 |No Bid $50.90 $20,360.00 |As specified
$0.00 $0.00 $55,350.00
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02
Title: Custodial Supplies
Buyer: R. Tyndall
Reliable Custodial
ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode!
364-1058 }Dispenser, Soap, Surface Mount. :
$39.15 $25,839.00( As specified
365-0120 || Brush, Fioor, Wire center, 24" without handle
$10.97 $4,344.12 A5 specified
365-0677 |iSqueegee, Window
$6.75 $1,336.50 A specified
365-0669 ||Squeegee, Moor
$13.91 $1,836.12 A specified
365-4354 |{Brush, Floor Drain
] $6.39 $843.48) A5 specified
B 365-0111 [{Brush, Floor, Garage: 18" Without Handle
$3.97 $524.041 A< specified
257 | 365-0758 |[Bowl, Plastic - Tie Bid
$6.02 $1,589.28) A5 specified
365-0600 |[Plunger, Toilet
$4.89 $3,300.75| As specified
365-0057 |{Brush, Counter
$3.71 $1,202.04 As specified
365-0090 |iBrush, Floor, 14" Without Handle
$4.98 $1,195.20 A5 specified
365-0197 |{Bucket, Plastic
$30.56 $30,254.40f A specified
2212 365-0413 ({Handle, Floor Squeegee
. R Abco 01113 as
g $1.87 $246.84 specified
218 365-0693 ||Pads, Stripping: '
$16.38 $1,621.62| A5 specified
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Miami-Dade County Public Schools

Bid # 076-JJ02

W Title: Custodial Supplies
Buyer: R. Tyndall

Reliable Custodial

ITEM || DCPS # DESCRIPTION OF ITEM Unit Price

Total Price Manuf & Model

14} 365-0103 HBrush, Floor, 24" Without Handle

16

$6.20 $2,945.001 A5 specified
365-0821 |iBroom, Lobby Plastic
$1.66 $3,417.94| A5 specified
365-4346 ||Brush, Swivel Scrub: Head only
SR $2.24 $887.04 A specified
17 365-0286 ||Tollet Tissue Dispenser
) $4.95 $3,267.00| As specified
18 365-0715 [[Wringer, Mop, Large, Down Pressure: Plastic
$47.48 $28,203.12) As specified
365-0367 {{Pan, Dust
$2.79 $2,070.18
365-0405 |IHandle, Floor Brush, Threaded, 72" long, 5/16" diameter
$2.60 $2,574.00]
365-0855 liPads, High Speed Spray - Tie Bid
. $24.80 $57,288.00No Bid
22A Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 23"
$0.00|No Bid
228 Easy Trap Dust Cloth Holder 47"
$0.00|No Bid
22C asy Trap Dust Cloth 8"X125 Ft
$0.00{No Bid
22D Easy Trap Dust Cloth 5" X 125"
$0.00[No Bid
$0.00
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