Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS)
Evaluation of Bid 073-JJ03

School Beverage Vending
CORRECTION TO AWARD

Bidder>>> Bettoli CCE ABBEY | FDDS GILLY JAMADO | LORDS
ltem MINE
1 $58.00 $150.00 $100.00 $73.00 $20.00 $45.00
N NR-Qualify | NR-Qualify | Withdrew
| Bid Terms | Bid Sites Bid
2 $16.00 NO ENTRY | $50.00 $20.00 $28.50
NR-Qualify Withdrew
Bid Terms Bid
3 $26.00 $16.00 NO ENTRY } NO ENTRY $6.00 $20.00 $22.50
NR-Qualify
Bid Terms Bidder >> AR
4 $36.00 $44.00 NO ENTRY | $50.00 $6.00 $34.00 $31.75 Item #
NR-Qualify Withdrew # Machines
Bid Terms Bid 1-Voc/SHS 6.00
5 $21.00 $21.00 NO ENTRY | NO ENTRY $6.00 $25.00 -.$26.25 Est.# machines:
NR-Qualify PRIMARY 236
Bid Terms e e 2-MS 540.00
Est.# machine;
115
3-ES TL Onl 4.00
Bidder>>>] PROF. SRI SUPREME T&A PEPS! [VENDWAY] VENDING Est.# machines:
ltem VENDING DIST. BOTTLING](PELICAN)|SERV. SP. 49
1 $30.00 $788.00 | NO ENTRY 35% $98.27 NO ENTRY EEXyL X1 4 00
NR-No NR PRIMARY Est.# machines:
Insurance - : 192
2 $15.00 $414.00 ] NO ENTRY 35% NO BID | NO ENTRY E&3ELD] 5 g
NR-No NR PRIMARY Est # machines:
Insurance , 19
3 $15.00 $136.00 - 35% NO BID |NO ENTRY E EXCLAY |
NR-No NR TS  [TOTALEST.
Insurance . MONTHLY 40
4 $10.00 $40.00 $35.50 35% NO BID REVENUE
NR-No NR
Insurance
5 $10.00 $100.00 $25.75 35% NO BID
NR-No NR
Insurance
KEY:
NR = Non-Responsive
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