The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid No. 077-JJ06

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B) Fertilizer, Special Mix

Title: Fertilizer, Special Mix Verified By
Buyer: G. Jackson
AAA Tool and Supply Aflantic-FEC Fertilizer Lesco, Inc. Prince Lawnmow
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM esT.arv.l  uniT Government Sales PRIMARY ALTERNATE and Servi
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  |{Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode!  {fUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  [jUnit Price {Total Price

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR

Fertiilizer 16-0-8: Where the 16% nitrogen
1 Jconstituent will be comprised of no less than 8 6240 Bags NO BID $14.24 | $88,857.60 $14.80 | $92,352.00 NO BID
units of sulfur coated urea (polymer coated).

The micronutrient package will be comprised of
the following: No less than 4% Magnesium
(sulfate potash Magnesium), 0.05% copper, 1%
Manganese (Manganese sulfate), 1.05% Iron
{1.0% derived from iron Sulfate and no less
than 0.05% will be Chelated Iron).

The maximum Chlorine content will not exceed
6%.

The fertilizer will be packaged in sealed plastic
50 Ib. bags, 40 bags to a pallet.

Minimum order quantity: 1040 bags.
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BiD PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid No. 077-JJ06
Fertilizer, Special Mix

|Bid No.: 077-J406

u i itle: Fertilizer, Special Mix

Buyer: G. Jackson

Prepared By:

Verified

By:

AAA Tool and Supply Atlantic-FEC Fertilizer Lesco, Inc. Prince Lawnmoyver
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. QTY. UNIT Government Sales PRIMARY Sales and Service
fUnit Price Yotal Prica Manu! & Model KJnit Price Total Price  |Manul & Modef  [IUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Modsl  {Mnit Price | Total Prica Manuf & Mode!
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR
Fertilizer 15-3-15 w/ Ronstar: Where the 15%
2 nitrogen constituent will be comprised of no 4160 | Bags NO BID NO BID $28.43 | $118,268.80 NO BID

less than 3 units sulfur coated urea (polymer
coated).

The micronutrient package will be comprised of
the following: No less than 1% Magnesium
(sulfate potash Magnesium), 0.05% copper, 1%
Manganese (Manganese sulfate), 1.05% lron
(1,0% derived from Iron Sulfate and no less
than 0.05% will be Chelated Iron).

The Ronstar component will be comprised of
no less than 0.63% Oxadiazon [2-tert-butyl-r-
(2,4-dichloro-5-isopropoxyphenyl) 2-1, 3, 4-
oxadiazolin-5-one).

The maximum Chlorine content will not exceed
6%.

The fertilizer will be packaged in sealed plastic
50 Ib. bags, 40 bags to a pallet.

Minimum order quantity; 1040 bags.
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. The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
’ Bid No. 077-JJ06
BID PROPOSAL FORM_(FORMAT B) Fertilizer, Special Mix

Bid No.: 077-JJ06
Title: Fertilizer, Special Mix Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: G, Jackson

AAA Tool and Supply Atlantic-FEC Fertilizer Lesco, Inc. Prince Lawnmower Sales and
ITEM DESGRIPTION OF ITEM EsT.ary.] uNIT Government Sales SECOND ALTERNATE PRIMARY Service ALTERNATE
Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model  {fUnit Price Totat Price Manuf & Modet  [Rinit Price Totat Prico’ Manul & Model  HlUnit Price Total Price Manuf & Model

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR
Fertilizer 6-2-0 Milorganite classic: Where

0, 3 H 1 0,

3 fthe 6% nitrogen will be comprised of 0.75% 2080 || Bags | $11.80 | $24,544.00 $10.75 | $22,360.00 $8.60 |$17,888.00 $9.50 | $19,760.00

water soluble Nitrogen & 5.25% water
insoluable Nitrogen that is slowly available.

The package will include available Phosphate
of 2.0%, 4.0% lron and a maximum 1.0%
Chilorine.

The Nutrients are to be derived from Biosolids
(activated sewage sludge) US.

The fertilizer will be packaged in sealed plastic
50 Ib. bags, 40 bags to a pallet.

Minimum order quantity: 1040 bags.
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