723. School Beard of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #051-4J06

BiD) PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)
0 Lawm Equipment, Power

1y
(Eamplete B e Rldder: ALL SHADED Al
8id #051-.J06 INAME OF BIODER:

Title: Lawn Equipment, Power Prepared 8y: Varified By: /
Buyer: G. Jacksen

ArQuatity Mowsss, inc. ACE LAWNMOWER SERVICE AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE ALEC'S CAMPER GENTER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER

ESTMATED!

auanmTy | UNIT Unit Prica Totat Prics Manut & Mode! Unit Price Totai Frice Manuf & Modal Unit Prica Talal Prica Manut & Modet Unit Price. Total Price Manuf & Madet Unit Price Tolal Prics Manuf & Modat Unit Price Totat Prica Manuf & Modst

ITEL_Aj DESCRIPTION OF {TEM
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE

YEAR

Edger, Power, walk-behind, minimum engine
power: 3.5 HP, steel base, approximately 10" X 2
X 1/2" biade or 9" triple blade (3 tips), ball bearing
wheels, conlrols on the handle (adjusiment of
depth), blade guard. Approved brands: Powsr
Trim 200, Husqvarna LE 389 or squal.

Husquama
L475

HUSQVARNA POWER TRIM Power Ttim|
LE4TS $524.00 | $13,100.00 200 NO BID $407.00 } $10,175.00 200

HUSQVARNA
LE475

$415.90 | $10,397.50 $403.96 | $10,099.00

25 Each { $455.95 | $11,398.75

Hedge Trimmer, approximately 30" single-sided
n e, g o
gu;hHFg’ br’:iiir;'l?;ns jlr;gllzivezg'l’gr; Se?:ime pover SHINDAIWA SHINDAIWA REDMAX HTZ.

" L S . 25 Each | $339.70 | $8,492.50 $335.00 $8,375.00 NO BID §321.00 $8,025.00 2400 2 YR $331.09 | $8,277.25
electronic ignition, centrifugal clutch, Approved HT231-30 HT231-30 WARRANTY
brands: Shindaiwa HT231-30, Husqvarna
226HS75S or equal.

Blower, Leaf, hand-hsld, gasaline engine,
1 ic ignition, mini engine displ; :
25.4 cc, minimum air speed: 145 miles per hour, 50 Each) $13599 | $6,799.50 | ECHO PB25! $137.50 $6,875.00 ECHO PB251 5149.59 $7,479.50 | ECHOPB25L|l $119.00 $5950.00 | *REDMAX HB250| $135.96 $6,798.00 | Echo PB251] $118.46 $5,923.00 | *Stihl BGSS|
minimum average air volume: 340 cfm. Approved,
brands: Echo PB251 or squal.
Trimmer, monafilament, laop handle, gasoline
engine, minimum engine displacement: 25.4 cc, CUB CADET
maximum overall length: 75", minimum fuel SHINDAIWA N COMMERCIAL Eche T
capacity: 13,5 oz., maximum weight: 12.5 Ibs., 50 Each | $328.63 | $16,431.50 T272SFH $299.00 §14,950.00 | STIHL FSSOR NO BID $209.25 | $10,462.50 #ST26 2 YR $239.99 | $11,999.50 SRM265 $252.76 | $12,638.00 | Stihl FS80R|
straight shaft. Approved brands: Stihl FS80R, or WARRANTY
oqual.

Shindawa
HT231-30

Husquarna

$335.00 | $8,375.00 226HS75S

o

w

a

Mower, riding, cutfing width: 30%, minimum engine|

power: 12.5 HP, electric starting, overhead valve,

il mover dack i o e 3 sy SNAPPER

g 3 *

height positions, cutling heights approximately 1 50 Each | $1,524.99| §76,249.50 3012523BVE $1,389.00 | $69,450.00 SNAPPER NO BID $1,096.00 { $54,800.00 TROVBUILT
" M M WITH NINJA 3012523BVE LTPONY

1/2" 10 4", pneumalic lires front and rear, 12 volt MULCHING K17

battery, equipped with mulching kit. Approved

brands: Snapper 3012523BVE equipped with

Ninja® Mulching Kit or equal.

SNAPPER
$1,302.00 | $65,100.00 | 3012523BY NO BID
E

o

Mower, power, non-self propelied, minimum 5 HP
engine, push drive, oversized rear whesls
approximately 16" with bafl-bearings, front whesls SARLO 621-2 SARLO
approximately 8" diameter with balt bearings, 10 Each} $516.50 | $5,165.00 | SARLOG21-2 | $455.00 $4,550.00 | SARLO L621-2) $630.00 $6,300.00 | WITH MULCH NO BID $420.00 | $4,200.00 L6212 NOBID
culling swath 21" minimum, muiching kit included. KIT
[Approved brands: Sarto 1 621-2 with mulching kit
#1387 (not mounted) or equal.

Blower, back pack, minimum displacement 44 ce, *REDMAX

minimum air volume: 380 cfm, minimum air HUSQVARNA
velocity 172 mph. Approved brands: Echo 20 Each | $263.49 | $5,269.80 | ECHO PBAIIT | $240.00 $4,800.00 150BT $309.99 $6,199.80 | ECHO PBS00T] $228.00 $4,560.00 !if/}iswo:ﬂ\-’;{ 5247.99 | $4,959.80 PB4I3T $239.96 $4,799.20

PB413T, Husqvarna 15087 or equal.

o

Husquarna
350BT !

~

{
i
i
i



NAME GF BiDD!

PLEASE COMPLETE
ALL SHADED AREAS

Tha Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #051-1J06
Lawn Equipmant, Power

Tile: Lawn Equipment, Power Prepared By: Verifiad By
Buyer: G_Jackson
A—Ouiﬁy Mowery, Inc. ACE LAWNMOWER SERVICE AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE ALEC'S CAMPER CENTER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER
Earedl it | uecs | Tt price Mandt & Model Unit Price Total Prica Mant & Modet Unit Pric Totat Prica Manud &Model || Unit Prce Total Price Mant & Model Unit Prica Total Price | Manut & Modt | Unit Price TotaiPrice | Mamd & Modes
_IIE_MJ DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
Items 8 through 12 will be awarded on a total
low bid basls. items must be compatible and
made by the same manufacturer. Vendor must
bid all items.
Multi-Task Power Head for heavy-duty
professional applications, minimum 25.4 cc <
8 iengine displacement. To ba used with 10 | Eachs NO BID NO BID NOBID $239.00 | $2,390.00 ?Y%ngj;‘fr'; 521696 | 5236960 | ST sa48.00 | s2480.00 P:;'Z"gs
attachments described in Hlems #13 through #16.
Approved brands: Stihl KMSSR, KMYOR or equal.
Standard Trimmer Attachment compatibie with .
9 litem #12. Approved brands: Stihl FS 4137 227 10 | Each|s NO BID NO BID NO BID 57900 | sm000 |REDMAXEXPCH oo | sopaco | SHMABTE o) 0 572000 | Echo 99
YR WARRANTY 227-0000 4420540
0000 or squal.
Articulating Hedge Clipper Attachment compatible - - .
10 jwith item #12. Approved brands: Stihl HL 4230 10 Each is NOBID NO BID . NO BID $223.00 $2,230.00 REDMAX EX-LRT] $216.00 | $2,160.00 Echo 995- $186.21 $1,862.10 Stiht 4230-
2 YR WARRANT 44200595 7405001
740 5001 or equal.
Pruner Attachment compatible with item #12. " " .
. REDMAX EX-PS 2, Stihl 4182~ Echo 999-
kR .
255;7vsd brands: Stihi HT 4182 200 0035 or 1 Each {|$ NO BID NO BID NO'BID 5160.00 $1,600.00 YR WARRANTY $174.96 | 51,749.60 200-0070 §152.00 $1,520.00 44200532
Edger Attachment compalible with item #12. .
- o REDMAX EX-HE 2 Stihi 4137+ Echo 999-
12 ggg:;)ved brands: Stiht FCB 4137 740 5001 or 10 Each |[$ NO BID NO BID NO BID $112.00 $1,120.00 YR WARRANTY $77.50 $775.00 740-5001 $95.99 $959.90 44200470
TOTAL LOW $8,130.00 §7,828.80 $7,542.00




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dada County, Florida
Bid #051-1J06
PLEASE COMPLETE Lawn Equipment, Power
; ALL SHADED AREAS
Bid #051-JJ06 . NAME DF BIOBER:
Title: Lawn Equipment, Power Prepared By: Varified By:

Buyer: G. Jackson
A-Quaity Mawers, Ine, ACE LAWNMOWER SERVICE AL'S LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE ALEC'S CAMPER CENTER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER ALL DADE LAWNMOWER

UNIT | Unit Price Total Prica Manof & Modet Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Mode! Unil Prica Total Prica Manuf & Model Unit Price Totai Prics Manud & Mode! Unit Prica Tolal Pica | Manuf & Model Unit Prics Total Price Mand & Modal

i

ESTMATED]
QUANTITY

ﬂp DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

Zero turn mower, commercial, 36" culling deck,
minimum 17 HP engine power; heavy-duty
construction; padded seat; true zero degree radius HUSTLER
{urning; electric ignition; seat-actuated angina kill 928192
system; built-in parking brake on handles; solid SUPERDUT|
frant tires; floating deck; adjustable cutting height: *ENCORE Y

13 :f -15t0 4';’5‘23 f':rg:fd g‘f;‘;’n”;‘;”‘fé\mse: od 20 | Exchls NO BID $3,999.00 | $79,980.00 |S20% f;;’;‘“v NO BID $3,689.00 | §73,780.00 53: 1;15: ; ]}fyx $4,157.30 | $83,146.00 ";’G‘ST‘;‘Q;{
mph minimum; canister-style air filter; must be A KAWASA!
able fo cut on a 15 degree bank. Warranty: 2 year 1

part and labor commercial warranty. Approved R COMMER(
brands: Snapper Pro S50X modet AL
#S50XKAV1936 or Hustler FasiTrak Super Duty
model #928192 or equal.

NO BID

HUSTLER

338442 NO BID

14 IMulching Kit: for 36" zero turn mower 20 Each |$ NO BID $57.50 $1,150.00 5600191 NO BID $139.00 | $2,780.00 | ENCORE 341004 $61.10 §1,222.60

Zero turn mower, commercial, 48" cutting deck,
minimum 23 HP engine power; heavy-duty
construction; padded seat; true zero degree radius|
turning; electric ignition; seat-actuated engine kill
syslem; built-in parking brake on handles; sofid
front tires; floating deck; adjustable cutting height: CUB CADET
1.0-1.5t0 4.5 - 5.0 in 0.25" increments; - SNAPPER S50X *TORO COMMERCIAL
transmission speed forward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0.4] 20 | Each (S NO BID $3,900.00 | STRO0000 | T ommasas | SH9900 | se9.98000 | L S | sas2s.00 | 58850000 ENFORCER 54" 2
mph minimum; canister-style air filler; must be YR WARRANTY
able {o cut on a 15 degres bank. Warranly: 2 year
part and labor commercial warranty. Approved
brands: Snapper Pro $50X model #S50XB2648 o
Husller FastTrak Super Duty model #928374 or
equal.

HUSTLER

$4,829.30 | $96,586.00 928374

NO BID

CUP CADET
16 Muiching Kit: for 48" zero turn mower 20 Each §i$ NOBID £70.00 $1,400.00 5600014 $169.99 $3,399.80 | TORO 79312 | $139.00 | $2,780.00 COMMERCIAL SHE7.75 ¢+ $2,355.00
59A30010

HUSTLER

108223 NOBID




Bid #051-1)06
Title: Lawn Equipmant, Powar

Buyar: G. Jackson

The Schoof Board of Miami-Dada County, Florida

Bid #0581-406

Lawn Equipment, Power

30G, LLC Ditvs AMERICAN

QPT RENTAL

BEST EQUIPMENT & REPAIR

DEGENS LAWN & Ti

URF

GREEN THUMB LAWN & GARDEN

ESTIMATED

quanmiTy || UNT

ITEMH DESCRIPTION OF [TEM

Unit Prica.

Total Prica

Manuf & Model

Unit Prica

Totat Prica

Maruf & bodet

Unit Prica Tokat Price

Manuf & Model

Unit Prico

Total Prica

Manuf & Modet

HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER

Unit Prica

Total Price

Manuf & Modal

VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, If GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR

Edger, Power, walk-behind, minimum engine
power: 3.5 HP, sleel base, approximately 10" X 2"
X 1/2" blade or 9" triple blade {3 tips), ball bearing
wheels, controls on the handle {adjustment of
depth), blade guard. Approved brands: Power
Trim 200, Husqvarna LE 389 or equal.

25 Each

NO BID

$390.50

$9,762.50

POWER TRIM
PTI50

$360.00 $9,000.00

HUSQVARNA
LE389

$415.96

$10,399.00

HUSQVARNA
LE389

NO BID

Hedge Trimmer, approximately 30" single-sided
cutting blade, gas engine, minimum engine power;|
2 1.1 HP, minimum displacement; 22.5 cc,
slectronic ignition, centrifugat clutch. Approved
brands: Shindaiwa HT231-30, Husqvarna
226HS758 or equal.

25 Each

$394.96

59,874.00

STIHL
HS86T

$374.96

$9,374.00

STIHL HS81T-30

$350.00 58,750.00

HUSQVARNA
226HS758

$359.96

$8,999.00

HUSQVARNA
226HS75S

$394.96

$9,874.00

STIRL HSB6T

Blower, Leaf, hand-held, gasoline engine,
alectronic ignition, minimum engine displacement:
3 125.4 cc, minimum air speed: 145 miles per hour, 50 Each
minimum average air volume: 340 cfm. Approved|
brands: Echo PB251 or equal.

$189.56

$9,478.00

STIHL
BG86

$179.96

$8,998.00

STIHL BG8S

$165.00 $8,250.00

HUSQVARNA
258

$135.99

$6,799.50

ECHO PB251

$118.46

$5,923.00

"STiHL BGSS

Trimmer, monofitament, loop handle, gasoline
engine, minimum angine displacement; 25.4 cc,
4 |maximum overall length: 75, minimum fuel 50
capacity: 13.5 oz., maximum weight: 12.5 Ibs.,
straight shaft. Approved brands: Stihl FS80R, or
squal.

Each

$252.76

$12,638.00

STIHL
FS80R

$239.90

$11,995.00

STIHL FS80R

$215.00 $10,750.00

HUSQVARNA
281

$252.76

$12,638.00

STIHL FS80R

$276.46

$13.823.00

STIHL FS50-R

Mower, riding, cutling width: 30", minimum englne|
power: 12.5 HP, electric starling, overhead vaive,
transmission: 5 forward - 1 reverse speeds, all
steel mower deck, minimum of five (5) cutting

5 |[height positions, cutting heights approximately 1 50 Each
1/2" fo 4", pneumatic tires front and rear, 12 voit
battery, equipped with mulching kit. Approved
brands: Snapper 3012523BVE equipped with
Ninja® Muiching Kit or equal.

NOBID

$1,405.00

$70,250.00

SNAPPER
3012523BVE

$1,525.00 | $76,250.00

SNAPPER
3012523BVE

$1,632.60

$81,630.00

SNAPPER
3012523BVE
euipped w/ninja
mulching kit

NO 8ID

Mower, power, non-seif propalled, minimum 5 HP
engine, push drive, oversized rear wheels
approximately 16" with ball-bearings, fronl wheels
approximately 8” diameter with ball bearings, 10 Each
cutting swath 21" minimum, muiching kit included.
Approved brands: Sarlo L6821-2 with mulching kit
#1387 (not mounted) or equal.

o

NO BID

5280.00

$2,800.00

*SNAPPER
SPV22675HW

$325.00 $3,250.00

*SNAPPER
7800189

8651.62

$6,516.20

SARLO L621-2
wimulching kit
#1387

NO BID

Blower, back pack, minimum displacement 44 cc,
minimum air volume: 380 ¢fm, minimum air 2
velocity 172 mph. Approved brands: Echo
PB413T, Husqvarna 15087 or equal.

Each

$260.66

$5,213.20

STIHL
BR180

$260.66

$5,213.20

STIHL BR380

$255.00 $5,100.00

HUSQVARNA
150BT

$247.99

§4,959.80

ECHO PB413T

$2680.66

$5213.20

STIHL BR38O




Bid #051-1106

Tille: Lawn Equipment, Power
Buyer: G. Jackson

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #051-JJ06
Lawm Equipment, Power

306, LLC DAva AMERICAN EQPT RENTAL BEST EQUIPMENT & REPAIR DEGENS LAWN & TURF GREEN THUMB LAWN & GARDEN HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER
e
g’Jmﬁf’D UNIT [ Unit Prics TotalPrics | Manot & Modsl || Unit Price Yotal Price Manud & Model Unit Price Tetal Prica Mandd & Modet Unit Price Totat Price Manut & Modet Unit Prica Total Price Manut & Modet
1TEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
Items 8 through 12 will be awarded on a total
low bid basls Items must ba compatible and
made by the same manufacturer. Vendor must
bid alt items,
Multi-Task Power Head for heavy-duly
professional applications, minimum 25.4 cc STIHL
8 llengine dispiacement. To be used with 10 Eachji $150.06 | $1,500.60 KMSSR $150.00 $1,500.00 STIHL KM55R NO BID $236.96 $2,369.60 STIHL KM9SOR $150.06 $1,500.60 | STIHL KM55R
altachments described in items #13 through #16.
Approved brands: Stiht KM55R, KMIOR or equal.
Standard Trimmer Attachment compatible with
9 item #12. Approved brands: Stihl FS 4137 227 10 J Each|l s7495 | spgso [STHLANT) o0pop | ggpsgp | STIHL4137.227. NOBID so7.46 | serago |STHLESHU7270 (00 | sopigo | STHLKMES
227-0000 Q000 0000 4137 227 0000
0000 or squal,
Anticulating Hedge Clipper Attachment compatible
10 lwith item #12. Approved brands: Stihl HL 4230 10 | Eachy s195.78 | sio57.00 |STHLA200 00000 | 5206090 STIHL NO BID si7621 | si762.40 |STIHLHL 42307400 o0 o | grasaso | STHLKMHL
740-5001 5001 4230 740 5001
740 5001 or agqual.
Pruner Altachment compatible with lem #12.
) N STIHL 4182 STIHL 4182-200- STIHL HT 4182 200} STIRL KMHT
A3 /:g{l::))ved brands: Stihl HT 4182 200 0035 or i Eachj $183.28 | $1,832.80 200-0070 $189.70 $1,897.06 0000 NO BID $164.96 §1,649.60 0035 $173.76 $1,737.60 4182 200 0035
Edger Attachment compatible with item #12.
. o STIHL 4137 STIHL 4137-740- STIHL FCB 4137 STHL KMFCB
12 :ggarjwed brands: Stihf FCB 4137 740 5001 or 1o Each|| $74.95 $749.50 740-5001 $77.58 $775.80 001 NO BID $67.46 $674.60 240 5001 $63.16 $631.60 4137 740 5001
TOTAL LOW $6,790.20 $7,009.50 $7,130.50 $5,765.00




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #051-JJ06

Lawn Equipmant, Power
303G, LEC Dva AMERICAN EQPT RENTAL BEST EQUIPNENT[&EPMR DEGENS LAWN & TURF GREEN THUMB LAWN & GARDEN HOMESTEAD MOWER CENTER
e IOMESTEAD HOWERS
gs\m:l’;" UNIT || UnitPrics | TotalPrice | Manuf& Model |  Unit Price Tetal Prics Manof & Modai unit Price Tolat Prics Manut & Model Unit Price Totat Prics Manut & Model Unit Priea TollPrcs | Manut & Modet
ITE! DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
Zero turn mower, commercial, 36" cutling deck,
minimum 17 HP engine power; heavy-duly
i padded saal: inia zaz0 d rading)
furning; electric ignition; seal-actuated engine kill
system; built-in parking brake on handles; solid
front lires; floating dack; adjustable cutling height: HUSTLER
1.0-1.5t0 4.5-5.01in 0.25" increments; SNAPPER ENCORE FASTRAL
1 ransmission speed forward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0-4 20 Each NO BID §3,910.00 | $78,200.00 SSOXKAWD36 §4,300.00 | $86,000.00 E34K 18BS 34,899.99 | $97,999.80 | SCAG SFZ36-17KA| $4,409.00 | $89,980.00 SUPER DUTY
mph minimum; canister-style air filter; must be 387928182
able lo cut on a 15 degree bank. Warranty: 2 year
part and labor commercial warranly. Approved
brands: Snapper Pro S50X model
#S5OXIKAV1936 or Hustler FastTrak Super Duty
model #928192 or equal,
14 |Mulching Kit: for 36" zero turn mower 20 |f Each NO BID §7229 | $1,445.80 $160.00 | $3,200.00 341004 $58.33 | SHLIGGSO | SCAGSS206 | seers | suamse | HUSTLER
| Zero turn mower, commercial, 48" cutting deck,
minimum 23 HP engine power; heavy-duty
construction; padded seat; true zero degree radius|
turning; electric ignition; seat-actuated engine kilt
system; buill-in parking brake on handles; sofid
t;rcm ;irgs; ﬂogﬁng geclz); ;gju'stable cutting height: HUSTLER
0-1.514.5-5.0in 0.25" increments; SNAPPER ENCORE . FASTTRAK
1 transmission speed forward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0-4 20 Euzch NO BID $4,100.00 | $82,000.00 S50XB2648B $§5,200.00 | S$104,000.00 E48K 19F $5,179.99 1 $103,599.80 | SCAG SFZ48-26BS]| $5,380.00 | $107,600.00 SUPER DUTY
mph minimum; canister-style air filter; must be 487928374
able to cut on a 15 degree bank. Warranly: 2 year
part and labor commercial warranty. Approved
brands: Snapper Pro S50X model #550X32648 or
Hustler FastTrak Super Duty model #328374 or
equal.
16 [Mulching Kit: for 48" zero turm mower 20 | Each NO BID $89.95 | $1,799.00 $260.00 | $5,200.00 481018 $62.50 | $1,25000 | SCAG S9298 sos75 | siowsao | HUSTLER




The Schoot Board of Miami-Dada County, Florida
Bid #051-J006
Lawn Equipment, Power

Bid #051-JJ06
Tilte: Lawn Equipmenl, Power
Buyer; G. Jackson
HERTZ EQUIPMENT RENTAL JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY MSC PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE RICHARDS TRACTORS & IMPLEMENTS - TOOLS FOR A TIME
Zﬁm‘;fs’ UNIT || Ut Prics Totat Price Manuf & Modal Urit Price Tolal Prica Manul & Modsl || Unit Price TollPrice | Manuf & Modsl | Unit Prica ot Prics Manul & Mode! Unit frica Total Price Manuf & Maded fi  Unit Prics Total Prics Manuf & Model

HE) DESCRIPTION OF ITEM
VENDOR SHALL INDICATE MANUFACTURER'S
WARRANTY, [F GREATER THAN ONE

YEAR

Edger, Power, walk-behind, minimum engine
power: 3.5 HP, steel base, approximately 10" X 2|
X 112" blade or 8" triple blade (3 tips), ball bearing POWER TRiM REDHAWK 10,575.00 | HUSQVARNA
1 Wheels, controls on the handis (adjustment of 25 Enchi $569.00 | $14,22500 LE475 $422.00 510,550.00 200 NO 8iD 3315.00 | $7,875.00 EOGER £40 $423.00 $10,575. LE475 $399.95 | $9.99875 | MCLANE 28RC
depih), blade guard. Approved brands: Power
Trim 200, Husqvarna LE 388 or equal.

Hedge Trimmer, approximately 30" single-sided
cutting blade, gas engine, minimum engine power; '
HUSQVARNA SHINDAIWA KAWASAK| $367.00 so.17500 | HUSQUARNA | (o oo $6,500.75 | SHINDAIWA

1.1 HP, minimum displacement; 22.5 cc,
2 eleciranic ignition, centrifugal clutch, Approved 25 Each| $381.00 $9,525.00 226MS755 3332.00 $8,300.00 HT231-36 NO BID $315.00 §7.875.00 KHS7508 226H5758 HT231-30
brands: Shindaiwa HT231-30, Husgvarna
226HS75S or equal.
Blower, Leaf, hand-held, gasoline enging;
R ) ine di .
electronic ignition, minimum engine displacement; KAWASAKE SHINDAIWA

3 125.4 cc, minimum air speed: 145 mifes per hour, 50 Eachj $135.99 $6,792.50 | ECHO PB251 $135.97 $6,798.50 ECHO PB251 NO 81D 5175.00 $8,750.00 NO BID $231.99 | $11,599.50
> ” KRH300A £83410

minimum average air volume: 340 cfm. Approved|
brands: Echo PB251 or equal.
Trimmer, monofilament, loop handle, gascline
engine, minimum engine displacement: 25.4 cc,

maximum overall length: 757, minimum fusl KAWASAKI SHINDAIWA

’ X z . .00 THL F NO 230, 11,500.00 NO BID g 389,

4 capacity: 13.5 oz., maximum weight: 12.5 lbs., 50 Each|l $254.00 | $12,700.00 | STIHLFSSOR | $252.76 $12,638. STIHL FSE0R aio $230.00 | $11,500. KIF27A §327.99 | $16,209.50 262
straight shaft. Approved brands: Stihl FS80R, or
equal.

Mower, riding, culting width: 30", minimum engine
power: 12.5 HP, elactric starting, overhead valve,
transmission: § forward - 1 reverse speeds, all
sleel mower deck, minimum of five (5) cutting

§ [height positions, cutling heighis approximately 1 50 | Bachy sussaoo | s7ees000 | SMAPPER i is000 | 57450000 33‘”‘2’;;;;75 NO BID 5293500 | §146,750.00 | 90909702 DIXON NOBID $160900 | Sgmm50 | SHAPPER
1/2" to 4*, pneumatic tires front and rear, 12 volt
battery, equipped with mulching kit. Approved
brands: Snapper 3012523BVE equipped with
Ninja® Muiching Kit or equal.
Mower, power, non-self propetled, minimum 5 HP
engine, push drive, oversized rear whesls
approximately 16 with ball-bearings, front wheels ;égf::vﬁvi
& |lapproximately 8" diameter with ball bearings, o Each | $504.95 $5,049.50 $495.00 $4,950.00 | SARLOLE21-2]f $562.88 $5.628.80 LE21-2 $365.00 $3,650.00 EQUIPMENT 22¢ NO BID $499.99 $4,993.90 | SARLO 1621-2
cutting swath 21" minimum, mulching kit included. CuT
Approved brands: Sarlo L621-2 with mulching kit
#1387 (not mounted) or equal.
Blower, back pack, minimum dispiacement 44 cc,
7 jminimum air volume: 380 cim, minimum air 20 | Enchj s2sace | ssteoco | FUSTARNA | gesny | s5.00000 | EGHO PBATIT NO BID $32500 | $6,500.00 i $245.00 sto00 | PUSIVARNA Y cr0100 | s7mane0 A

velocily 172 mph. Approved brands: Echo
PB413T, Husqvarna 15087 or equal.
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Bid #051-JJ06

Title: Lawn Equipment, Power
Buyer: G. Jackson

Tha School Board of Miami-Dade County, Floida
Bid #051-JJ06

Lawn Equipment, Power

HERTZ EQUIPMENT RENTAL JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY MSC PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE. RICHARDS TRACTORS & IMPLEMENTS TOOLS FOR A TiME
ALUENENT REN S LAWHMOWER 2 L SICHARDS TRACTORS
Z§m§° UNIT || Unit Prica Total Prica Manut & Model f . Unit Price Total Frics Manuf & Modet || Unit Prics YotalPrica | Manuf & Modat || Unit Prics Total Prics Manut & Model U Prics Totai Price Manuf & Model || UntPrice |  Totai Price Manut & Model
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF {TEM
Items 8 through 12 will be awarded on a total
el i0M DI hasis ltems must e compati

made by the same manufacturer. Vendor must

bid all items.

Multi-Task Power Head for heavy-duty

professional applications, minimum 25.4 cc REDMAX SHINDAIWA
8 llengine displacement. To be used with 10 Each|| $260.73 $2,697.30 | STIHLKMI1OR || $150.06 §1,500.80 | STIHL KM55R NO BID $245.00 $2,450.00 EX224018 NO BID $279.99 | $2.799.90 M2510

attachments described in itams #13 through #16.

Approvad brands: Stihl KMS5R, KMIOR or equal.

Standard Trimmer Attachment compatible with STHL PS 4137 STHL 4137 SHINDAW,
9 litem #12, Approved brands: Stihi FS 4137 227 0 Eachl 84085 340850 740 5005 $72.00 $720.00 297 0000 NO 8D 377.49 $774.90 [ REDMAX EX-BC2 NO BID $79.99 $799.90 r:aoo 1 A

Q000 or equal.

Aticutating Hedge Clipper Attachment compatible STIHL 4230 74 STIHL 4230 SHINDAY
10 with item #12. Approved brands: Stihl HL 4230 (0 [ Each| s174s | suzsso [STHLAZOTG gpg00 | g as000 bis NO BID $220.99 | $2299.90 | REDMAX EX-LRT NO BID s1990 | sigago | SHEDAWA

740 5001 or equal.

Pruner Attachment compalible with tlem #12.
11 | Approved brands: Stihl HT 4182 200 0035 or 10 ) Bach| sisaos | s1seeso [STHLASZ200 500 | 5170000 e NO 81D $18549 | $1,85490 | REDMAXEX-PS NO BID 17279 | srranso | SHEDAWA

oqual.

Edger Aitachment compalible with item #12. STHL FCB STIHL 4137 SHINDAIWA
12 App/;wed brands: Stihl FCB 4137 740 5001 or to Each| $73.13 $731.30 1 4o 740 5001 $75.00 $§750.00 740 5001 NO BID $124.99 $1.24990 | REDMAX EX-HE NO BID $107.19 | $1,071.90 65010

equal,

TOTAL LOW $7,185.10 $6,620.60 $8,629.60 $8,399.50




The School Board of Miami-Dads Counly, Florida
Bid #051-JJ06
Lawn Equipment, Power

itle: Lawn Equipment, Power
Buyer: G, Jackson
B HERTZ EQUIPMENY RENTAL JOE BLAIR GARDEN SUPPLY MSC PRINCE LAWNMOWER SALES & SERVICE RICHARDS TRAGTORS & IMPLEMENTS TOOLS FOR A TIME

BiD PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAY B}

(ERAS M

ESTMATED)

auanTiTy || UNIT Unit Price Total Prics Manuf & Model Unit Prica Totat Price Manuf & Model I Unit Prics. Total Price Mam & Modet | Unit Price. Total Prics Manuf & Modet Unit Prica Total Price Manuf & Modei || Unit Price. Tolat Prics Manut & Modal

LLEQ DESCRIPTION OF iTEM

Zero lurn mower, commarcial, 36" cutting deck,
minimum 17 HP engine power; heavy-duty
constoiction: naddad saai- inia 7ae0 denr fadiusl
turning; eleciric ignition; seat-actuated engine kill
system; built-in parking brake on handies; solid
front tires; floating deck; adjustable cutting height:
1.0-1.5104.5- 5.0in 0.25" increments;
transmission speed farward: 0-8 mph, reverse: 0-4j
mph minimum; canister-style air filter; must be
able to cut on a 15 degree bank. Warranty: 2 year
part and labor commercial warranty, Approved
brands: Snapper Pro S50X model
#S50XKAV1936 or Husller FastTrak Super Duty
model #928182 or equal.

EXMARK
NO BID $5,327.99 | 5106.559.80 | PHZ19KA343 2
YR WARRANTY

HUSTLER
928192

. HUSTLER BOBCAT FASTCAT|
20 Each | 34.463.00 $89,260.00 $3,795.00 $75,900.00 928192 NG 8ID §3,835.00 | $77,900.00 BRO 942291F

MULCH KIT/80B
CAT 970225

EXMARK
MK343

IS

Mulching Kit: for 36" zero lurn mower 20 Eachj $135.00 $2,700.00 KIT 36 595.00 $1,800.00 $107,654.00 NO BID $119.99 $2,399.80 NO BID $159.99 | $3,199.80

Zerc urn mower, commercial, 48" cutting deck,
minimum 23 HP engine power; heavy-duty
construction; padded seat; true zero degree radius|
turning; electric ignition; seat-actuated engine kill
syslem; built-in parking brake on handles; solid
front tires; floaling deck; adjustable cutling height: ExvARK
:r':n;;‘iss ;ﬁ):;;ei‘g ;gn%:i: 'Dr‘_%'(:n'?:‘"‘tféversm o4 20 | Bach| sszsaco | ssosssoce | MUSTER ) gr00500 | s7000000 HUSTER NO BID $4,150.00 | $83,000.00 BO::OA;F;;;[FCAT NO BID $7.519.99 | $150,399.80 KA
mph minimum; canister-style air filter; must be
able to cut on a 15 degree bank. Warranly: 2 year
part and labor commercial warranty, Approved
brands: Snapper Pro S50X modeal #550XB2648 or
Hustler FastTrak Super Duty model #928374 or
equal.

BOBCAT/MULCH
KIT 970226

EXMARK

NO BiD $199.99 $3,990.80 MKA486

16 |Mulching Kil: for 48* zera turn mower 20 Eachjl $137.95 $2,759.00 48" KIT $135.00 $2,700.00 108223 NO BIO $174.99 $3,499.80

*NOTES: Item 3 - All Dade Lawnmower and Homestead Mower Center: Stihi BG55 does not comply because air speed is 130 mph and a minimum of 145 mph is required. Alec's Camper Center - Redmax
HB250 does not comply because alr speed Is 127 mph and a minimim of 145 is required. item 5 - Alec's Camper Genter: Troybuilt LT Pony does not comply because vendor submitted a 42" riding mower
and the specifications raquired a 30" riding mower, mower Is to large. item 6 - Best Equipment and Repalr: Snapper SPV22675HW does not comply because rear wheel size Is 12" and speclfications
require 16", Degen's Lawn and Turf: Snapper 7800189 does not comply because rear wheel size Is 8" and specifications require 16", item 7 - Alec's Camper Center: Redmax EBZ5100 does not comply
because the maximum air speed is 171 mph and the specifications require a minimum air speed of 172 mph. ltem 13 - Alec’'s Camper Center: Encore E341318F does not comply because the mower sizes
are 34", 42 and 48" and the specifications require a 36", ltem 15 - Al's Lawnmower: Toro Z5030 does not comply because the mower size is 50" and the specifications require a 48",




