Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS)

Recommended Award of Bid 037-JJ03 FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

Bidder>>> AGE All-Amer. Poly 1 All Fla. Paper] Berk Ent. | Calico Ind. | Dade Paper| Dade Paper} Interboro Lace SFSS Wallace
Price i
Item
item No. Bid 2
Bid ltem> 1 $15.80 6 NG BID $23.44 NO ENTRY
l ltem>>> | Apvd.Brand? NR PRIMAR NR
Est. Qty.> 360 Corr.Fluid Awardee Qual. Bid-DL.
2 $12.98 $13.28 NO BID $14.35 $18.70 NO ENTRY
Apvd.Brand?| DNMS DNMS :PRIMARY NR
2400 Size< spec. Size< spec. " vAwardee Qual. Bid-D1.
3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $131.98
Apvd.Brand?| No Alt. Award
60 Price Excess.
4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SRR
Apvd.Brand? &lfars
30 arde
5 NOC BID $26.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID (054
Apvd.Brand? All-Am.Poly Sfe
1080 688  Avardes
6 $14.70 $13.87 jpoasxeria | $13.97 $12.49 $14.48 $12.74 NO BID NO ENTRY 5 B
Apvd.Brand? } Jet Plastica NR o Jet DNMS Jet Plastica NR PRIVIAR
55000 EDKITAS Qual. Bid-Pr.p ioieints | EDKITAS | <2 Strawsipk. | EDKITAS Qual.Bid-Pk. | d
7 $25.90 $10.42 piav $24.70 $10.9 $21.95 $13.51 NO ENTRY| $16.00
Apvd.Brand? yes DNMS | EFA yes PRIMAR I Pack Sol. NR Wallace
360 Wt.<Spec. te Awardee 176035 Qual. Bid-DI. 3760
8 $25.90 $1042 | B $24.70 $10.9 $8.34 $21.95 $13.51 NO ENTRY| $16.00
Apvd.Brand? yes DNMS - ernale. yes PRIMAR NR | Pack Sol. NR Wallace
480 Wt.< Spec. 2iiee ; de Qual.Bid-Min.| 176033 |Qual. Bid-DI. 3760
9 $11.98 $14.08 NO BID 07 $19.79 NO ENTRY
Apvd.Brand? Ba: R yes ale NR
720 Award ¢ Awardap Qual. Bid-DI.
10 NO BID NO ENTRY| NOBID NO BID NO BID 1
Apvd.Brand? ate
240 | Auardes
T1 | NO ENTRY $8.97 NO BID 574 $3.80 NO ENTRY
Apvd.Brand? PRIMARY s NR
600 Awardee e Qual. Bid-DI.
KEY TO CHART ABOVE:
DNMS Bid ltem Submitted Does Not Meet Specifications
NR Corr. Fluid- Non-Responsive due to correction fluid being used on bid item.
NR Qual.Bid-Pr. Non-Responsive due to qualifying bid with pricing for LTL (less than truckload) quantity.
NR' Qual.Bid-Min. Non-Responsive due to qualifying bid with pricing for minimum order.
NR Qual.Bid-Pk. Non-Responsive due to qualifying bid with pricing for truckload quantity (packsize) only.
NR Qual.Bid-DI. Non-Responsive due to qualifying bid with terms for delivery (warehouse only)
Prepared by R. Johnson
Reviewed by G. Lee - Stores and Mail Distribution Procurement Management 04/14/2009




