BID 088-HH02 BENCHMARKING

M-DCPS BROWARD COUNTY SCHOOLS
ITEM #1 Portable Back Pack Vacuum $ 259.68 $ 287.48
ITEM #2 -14 to 18" Upright $147.51 $431.40
ITEM #5 - Wet/Dry Vacuum $491.15 $645.00
ITEM # 6- 14" Upright, metal housing, heavy duty $205.56 $431.40

Note: Broward County vacuums include magnetic bar and accessories. M-DCPS bid does not require accessories.
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A-1_All Make Vacuum & Sewing A Plus Vacuum Corp. AllBright Cleaning & JSanotorial Supply
ESTIMATED |[Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model ||Unit Price  [Total Price [Manuf & Model |Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY
1 Vacuum cleaner, backpack rype, commercial/industrial duty with 75 5329.0(1 324,675.0(1 CFR with Hepa 5299.0(1 $22,425.00{ Powr Flite PF300 $299.00¢ szz.azs.oq Power Flite
AWARD ||minimum 50' cord and attachments. Must include High Filter 8p PF300 BP
Efficiency Particulate Air Filter (HEPA).
Advance BackVacuum XP or equal.
4 Wel/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 12 to 50 $674.001 $33,700.00{ Clarke Summit $489.00  $24,450.00{Powr Flite PF54 50,0q
AWARD (15 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density polyethylene SQ 13 as specified
or stairdess steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum 1.2 HP, two
stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC continuous dury,
bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent overflow. Kit
accessories and minimum 23" front mounted squeegee blade,
dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet pick up squeegee
tool.
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 12 with front mount squeegee or
Clarke Summit SQ 13 or equal
1
5 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 16 to 75 $749.00¢ 556,175,04Clarke Summit SQ $659.00 349,425.0J Powr Flite PF 57 $0.0(J
AWARD |20 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density 20 - as specified

polyethylene or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum
1.2 HP, two stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC
continuous duty, bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent
overflow. Kit accessories and minimum 23" front mounted
squeegee blade, dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet
pick up squeegee tool.

Clarke Summit SQ 20 with front mount squeegee or

Advance Sprite Air Scoop 16 with front mount squeegee or equal
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AllBright Cleaning & Janatorial Supply

Alternate 1

AlBright Cleaning & Janotorial Supply

Aliernate 2 Dade Paper Ideal Supply.
ESTIMATED |[Unit Price Total Price  |Manuf & Modeqml Price |Total Price  |Manuf& Unit Price | Total Price  [Manuf & Model[Unit Price | Total Price | Manuf & Model
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY Madel
i Vacuum cleaner, backpack type, commercial/industrial duty with 75 $0.00 No Bid $0.001 No Bid $259.58  $19,468.50{ Clarke Comfort $286.000  $21,450.00{Proteam 106577
AWARD (minimum 50" cord and attachments. Must include High ;‘;‘(‘){fﬂ‘)’g‘;’;[’“ S‘Pa Supes Quarte
Efficiency Particulate Air Filter (HEPA). Moots ac
specifications
Advance BackVacuum XP or equal.
4 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 12 to 50 $0.001No Bid $0.00{ No Bid $441.95|  $22,097.50 Clarke 135Q as $339.000  $16,950.001Kent 9058912010
AWARD (15 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density polyethylene specified EWD;ZO \:1/24'
or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum 1.2 HP, two S:)::e'g::un
stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC continuous duty, Failed
bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent overflow. Kit performance test -
accessories and minimum 23" front mounted squeegee blade, problems with
dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet pick up squeegee squecgee
tool lattachment
$0.00
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 12 with front mount squeegee or
Clarke Summit SQ 13 or equal
5 ‘Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 16 to 75 $0.00No Bid $0.00/No Bid $491.15]  $36,836.25[Clarke 20SQ as $356.95|  $26.771.25[Kent 9058912010
AWARD |20 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density specified fWD 320 Wi24”
polyethylene or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum s;‘:}z;;‘:"ﬁ(
1.2 HP, two stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC Faited
continuous duty, bypass moior, with automatic shutoff to prevent performance lest -
overflow. Kit accessories and minimum 23" front mounted problems with
squeegee blade, dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet squeegee
pick up squeegee tool. attachment
Clarke Summit 5Q 20 with front mount squeegee or
Advance Sprite Alr Scoop 16 with front mount squeegee or equal J J
2 FM-3738 Rev. (06-98)
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Reliable Custodial Maintenance &

ldeal Supply Alternate Supplies Rex Chemical Rex Chemical - Alterrnate one
ESTIMATED {[Unit Total Price  [Manuf & Unit Price|Tatal Price |Manuf & Unit Price | Total Price  [Manuf & Madel Unit Price  [Total Price [Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY |Price Model Model Model |
1 Yacuum cleaner, backpack type, commercial/industrial duty with 75 $265. $19.875.001 Clacke $0.00No Bid £442 8, $33.214.50| Advance XP as $260.88  $19,566.00{ Pacific
AWARD | minimum 50° cord and attachments. Must include High 2060?10‘;“1 specified l’)\”:w ?;’fk
Efficiency Particulate Air Filier (HEPA). omion P ack -
6 Cocd as
required?
Advance BackVacuum XP or equal.
4 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 12 to 50 $431.55 $2i,577.50Clarke 13 $0.00No Bid $544.4 $27,220.000 Advance Awd-315 $0.001No Bid
AWARD (/15 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density polyethylene 5Q -as 4 Wifrant mounted
or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum 1.2 HP, two specifie Sdueegee
stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC continuous duty,
bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent overflow. Kit
accessories and minimum 23" front mounted squeegee blade,
dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet pick up squeegee
tool.
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 12 with front mount squeegee or
Clarke Summit SQ 13 or equal
—
5 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 16 to 75 $0.00{ No Bid $0.00{No Bid $587.000  $44,025.000 Advance AWD-320 $430.68! SJ?.JOL(XJ Viper
AWARD |20 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density W/front mounted (Slel SS‘ZD ’]3
polyethylene or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum squeegee st'e ) OD‘:;S
1.2 HP, two stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC not have UL,
continuous duty, bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent CSA or ETL
overflow. Kit accessories and minimum 23" front mounted approval as
squeegee blade, dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet required
pick up squeegee tool.
. 50.
Clarke Summit SQ 20 with front mount squeegee or
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 16 with front mount squeegee or equal J J
3
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Wholesale Vacuum Connection Windsor Industries MWGG Corp
ESTIMATED {Unit Price” [Total Price  [Manuf & Model{[Unit Price Total Price’  |Manuf & Unit Price |Total Price | Manuf &
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUANTITY Model Model
T [
1 Vacuum cleaner, backpack type, commercial/industrial duty with 75 $197.500  $14,812.50/ Dust Care Jet 8308.7ﬁ 523.1540(1 Windsor §284.95 $21,371.25|Rubbermaid
AWARD |minimum 50 cord and attachments. Must include High Z“k - V’:d"" &22354 HE ?’BHO i
H H H : oes not have Ommercia
Efficiency Particulate Air Filter (HEPA). an anthorized Filier BackPAck
repair facility
in Dade or
Broward
County as $0
required. 0(1
Advance BackVacuum XP or equal.
4 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 12 to 50 $0.00| No Bid $705.42)  $35.271.00Windsor $595.45)  $29.772.50)Rubbermaid
AWARD ||15 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density polyethylene 1\’7;[65 6 9WDI16
or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum {.2 HP, two squccgl
stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC continuous duty,
bypass motor, with automatic shutoff 1o prevent overflow. Kit
accessories and minimum 23" front mounted squeegee blade,
dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet pick up squeegee
tool.
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 12 with front mount squeegee or
Clarke Summit 5Q 13 or equal
5 Wet/Dry vacuum cleaner, commercial/industrial, minimum 16 to 75 $0.00(No Bid $705.42)  $52,906.50, Windsor $733.45] $55,008.75|Puliman Holt
| AWARD 20 gallon tank with drain valve molded high-density ’{\/7/'11‘65 16 Pulevacll-20
“Iipolyethylene or stainless steel tank, rugged, rust proof, minimum Squecgee
1.2 HP, two stage, 115 or 230 volt, 50/60 HZ, AC/DC
continuous duty, bypass motor, with automatic shutoff to prevent
overflow. Kit accessories and minimum 23" front mounted
squecgee blade, dry filter, wand, hose, dry pick up tools, wet
pick up squeegee tool.
i 50.
Clarke Summit 85Q 20 with front mount squeegee or 01
Advance Sprite Air Scoop 16 with front mount squeegee or equal
4
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