Dade Co Pub 0Q DCP Bid Proposal Fo afeteria Compa Bid N0.065-HH(
PLEASE COMPLETE ALL SHADED AREAS. If writing in information, use Ink or black ribbon to filt in areas. BUYER:R. Johnsan 1 N?IE: T}:Ifs Exce:]s,r"ea:;fhget will d
ITEMS 1,2,3 ARE TO BE AWARDED ON A TOTAL LOW BID BASIS. BIDDER(S) MUST BID ALL ITEMS TO BE e g c2icviate outlor each item the L.ases an
CONSIDERED FOR AWARD AND ALL ITEMS BIDDED MUST BE FROM SAME MANUFACTURER AND TO BE , d Total Estimated Quantity Price below IF
COMPLETELY COMPATIBLE WITH EACH OTHER IN FIT. Addendum 208/14/2008 | this form is filled out electronically and is
? 5 oy PRAEET] E : : TRAYS AND LIDS submitted with the bid package as a file.
BIDDER: Bldsrecelved aS Of 8/21 /2008 at2.00 PM EDT L 4 CATEGORY ltems 1-3
All products bid for items shall comply with Federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act and all applicable food additive regulations as
they relate to the use of the product in direct contact with food.
All products bid shall be 100% recyclable and manufactured with no fluorocarbons (CFC's) or hydro chioroflucrocarbons (HGFC's) of any kind,
The product shall be capable of handiing temperatures up fo 200 degrees F. Product bid shall be a minimum . 1407 gauge polystyrene construction.
ltem Description ESTIMATED Detait of hem Description Detail of Item Deseription Detait of Item Description
ADDENDUM 2 CHANGES ARE in highlighted text boxes Quantity
. Cairo Distributi d
All Florida Paper a “S,u slzls goon.an Cheney Brothers inc.
1 Tray, One Compartment 1500 Price NO BID NO BID NO BID J
M-DCPS No.;|452-1153 Cases of Information: 1
PM Internal No.:|058-G28 250 units Brand: J |
Specificalions]One Comparntment, Polystyrene, Insulated Base Code Number:
Color=Black, Units per case
Approximately 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x 1-1/4™, # Cases:. \
Pack Size;|Case of 250 RECOMMENDED Total Case Weight {Ib):
Minimum Order: 200 cases Other Info:
SAMPLES |Sample: 20 each.
Approved Brand 1] Genpak # 50010-3L
Approved Brand 2| OR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit]{ CASE of 250
2 Tray, 3-compartment 1500 Price NO BID NO BID NO BID J
M-DCPS No.:[452-1145 Cases of' Information: J
PM Internal No.:| 058-G27 12501 bnits Brand:
Specifications ] Tray, 3-compartment Polys(yrene. !nsulatad Base s Code Number:
Color= BLACK. : =" n Units per case
APPROXIMATELY B-7/8" X ’10-515“ x 1 1!-5 ¥ Cases:.
Pack Size{Case of 260 RECOMMENDED . Total Case Weight {Ib):
minimum order 200 cases Other Info:
SAMPLES:| Samplie required: 12 each
Approved Brand 1}Genpak 50310-3 =
Approved Brand 2|OR O(her Brands maetlng speclfcanons and pack slze
Unit; CASE of 250 ! |
3 Lid, Clear 3000 Price NO BID NO BID NO BID
M-DCPS No.:(452-1161 e Information:
PM Internal No.{ 058-G29 250 units Brand:
Specifications{Clear, fits ltem #1 and #2. Code Number: { |
Appraximately: 9-3/8" x 7-3/8" x 1-1/4", Units per case \ J
Pack Size]Case of 250 RECOMMENDED # Cases:. J
Minimum Order: 200 cases Total Case Weight {Ib}:
SAMPLES:| Sample 20 each. Other Info:
Approved Brand 1| Genpak # 94500 Clear Lid
Aporaoved Brand 2| OR Olher Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit: CASE of 250
U L M R I 0 iONng D a pe D a pa v D orb
Reviewed by G, Lee-Stores and Di Bid Evaiuation 09/11/2008
Reviewed by 1. Holmbmg-Depanmem of Food and Nutrition ADDENDUM 2 08/14/2008
repared by R Services Page t ol4 07/17/2008




Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

PLEASE COMPLETE ALL SHADED AREAS. if writing in information, use Ink or black ribbon to fill in areas.

ITEMS 1,2,3 ARE TO BE AWARDED ON A TOTAL LOW BID BASIS. BIDDER(S) MUST BID ALL ITEMS TO BE
CONSIDERED FOR AWARD AND ALL ITEMS BIDDED MUST BE FROM SAME MANUFACTURER AND TO BE
COMPLETELY COMPATIBLE WITH EACH OTHER IN FIT.

Cafeteria Compartment Trays Bid No.065-HHO03

Addendum 2-08/14/2008

BIDDER:| Bids received as of 8/21/2008 at 2:00 PM EDT

All products bid for items shall comply with Federal Food, Drug ang Cosmetic Act and ail applicable food additive regulations asilf

TRAYS AND LIDS

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet will calculate out for each item the
Cases and Total Estimated Quantity Price below IF this form is filled|
out electronically and is submitted with the bid package as a file.

they relate to the use of the product in direct contact with food.
Al products bid shall bo 100% recyclable and manufactured with no fluorocarbons (CFC's) or hydro chiorofluorocarbons (HCFC's) of any kind. PRI MA RY AWARDEE
The praduct shall ke capabie of handling termperatures up ta 200 degrees F. Product bid shall be a minimum .140° qauge polystyiene eonstruction. T 3 .>I‘>' L4 |
ftem Description ESTIMATED Detail of tem Description  Est. Totai Price Detail of Jtem Deseription ~ Est. Total Price Deail of ltem D
ADDENDUM 2 CHANGES ARE in highlighted text boxes | Quantity to M-DCPS to M-DCPS
o=
Dade Paper and Bag Co. J Edward Don & Company US Foodservice
1 Tray, One Compartment 1500 . $47,100.00 $30.51000 $45,765.00 NO BID
Pricef—
M-DCPS No.|452-4153 Cases of Information:|: | Total Estimated Price PER CASE Pnz:‘i‘lfi‘a'[‘;jl‘:i ;
PM Int I No.:{058-G28 : " will calculate if filled
nierna M Brand:| out electronicalty Genpak es;m\edr\.(i)(l:“a}&s
Specifications] One Compartment, Polystyrene. Insutated Base Code Number: 50010-3L ciro 4
Color=Black. Units per case 250
Approximatety 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x 1-1/4". # Cases:.| 1500
Pack Size|Case of 250 RECOMMENDED Totai Case Weight (1b): 6.2
Minimum Order: 200 cases Other Info: |/ =
SAMPLES:|Sample: 20 each. i
roved Brand 1| Genpak # 50010-3L
roved Brand 2|OR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit| CASE of 250
2 Tray, 3-compartment 1500 : $47,100.00 $30.58000 $45,870.00 NOQ BID
— Price|
M-DCPS No.:|452-1145 Cases of Information: | Total Estimated Price PER CASE pnj;zli’:ifzg:zj‘:i ”
. . [ i will calculale if filled
PM Internal No.:{058-G27 » v 250 units Brand:|" % out elactronically Genpak i eﬁélsgn?:;”
Specifications{ Tray, 3-compartment, Polystyrene, Insulated Base Code Number:| 50310-3L Y
Color= BLACK Units per case 200
APPROXIMATELY 8-7/8" x 10-5/8" x 1-1/4” '/ # Cases:.| 1500
Pack Size{Case of 250 RECOMMENDED Total Case Weight (ib): | 6.2
minimum order 200 cases Other info:
SAMPLES:|Sample required: 12 each
Approved Brand 1|Genpak 50310-3L
Approved Brand 2| OR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit|CASE of 250
3 Lid, Clear 3000 . $132,600.00 $42,95000 $128,850.00 NO BID
: - Price
M-DCPS No.:|452-1161 Cases of: Information:f* Tolal Estimated Price PER CASE p&‘:i’}_jgg“:g )
PM Internal No.{058-G29 ) i : will calculate if filled
250 units Brand: oul electronically Genpak lﬁll[ed ci:m“
Specifications] Clear. fits ltem #1 and #2. Code Number:|’ 94500 eiectronicaily
Approximately: 9-3/8" x 7-3/8" x 1-1)4", Units per casel 250
Pack Size] Case of 250 RECOMMENDED # Cases:. 3000
Minimum Order: 200 cases Total Case Weight (Ib):{i 10.5
SAMPLES: Sample 20 each. Other Info: ! Wrong Case Pak
Approved Brand 1/Genpak # 94500 Clear Lid Buyer's Note: Case Pack was
Approved Brand 2| OR Other Brands meeting spacifications and pack size Corrected Addendum 2
Unit: CASE of 250
Reviewed by G. Leo-Stores and Distribution Bid Evaluation 09/11/2008
Reviewed by T. Holmberg-Department of Food and Nutrition ADDENDUM 2 0811472008
pored by R. Joh M Services Page2of4 07/17/2008




Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

ITEMS 4 THROUGH & IN THIS CATEGORY IS AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY.

Cafeteria Compartment Trays
PLEASE COMPLETE ALL SHADED AREAS. If writing in information, use ink or black ribbon to fill in areas.

Al products bid for items shall comply with Federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act and all applicable food additive regulations as
All products bid shall be 100% recyclable and manufactured with no fluorocarbons {CFC's) or hydro chiorofluorocarbons (HCFC's) of any kind.
The product shall be capatle ol handling lemperatures up lo 200 degtees F. Product bid shall be a minimum 440" gavge pofyslyrens construction,

Item Description ESTIMATED

Quanti

Bid 065-HH03

| oy = > .
{ FORMATB |
| Addendum 2-
. Dad2008

Speciaity Trays
CATEGORY- items

NOTE: This Excel spreadsheet will calculate out for each item the Cases
and Total Estimated Quantity Price below IF this form is filled out
efectronically and is submitted with the bid package as a file.

Oetall of tom Description

Detaii of Hem Description

ALL FLORIDA PAPER Cairo Distribution and Supples Corp. Cheney Brothers [nc,
4 Dish Tray 700 Brand:| $34.02000 $23,814.00 $19.80000 $13,860.00 NO BID
Total Estmatad Tolal Estmated ~ | TowlEstmated |
M-DCPS No.:(452-0211 Cases of ) PER CASE | Price will cajculate ] PER CASE | Price will calculate if Price will calculate if
Price filled out filled out filed out
PM Internai No.: 058-G03 2000 units Information:|  Cryovac siectronically Pactiv electronically electronically
Spacifications:| Polystyrene construction, square, overall length and width Brand:| 100072233 TF1-0010
approximately 4", not to exceed 4-1/2". Color = White. Code Number: 2000 1
Pack Size:|2000 per case RECOMMENDED Units per case 4
Minimum Order: 100 # Cases:. 5
SAMPLES:|Sample required: 12each Total Case Weight (ib)
Other Info:
Approved Brand 1| Genpak 1001
Approved Brand 2 OR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit:] CASE of 2000
5 Tray, no compartment . $13.23000 J $6,615.00 $16.05000 $8,025.00 $13.93000 $6,965.00
Price Totwl Estimated | TotE! Estmaled Tolal Estimated |
M-DCPS No.3452-1021 Cases of Information:| PER CASE | price will calculate iff PER CASE | Price will calcutale if Darnel Price will calculate If
filted out filled out filled out
PM Internal No.j058-G26 200 units Brand: Darnel electronically Pactiv electronically Darnel electronically
Specifications | Polyslyrene foam, no compartment, Medium, w/Hinged lid. Code Number: Q-1 TD1-8801 Q1/DU405101
To be used for hot or cold items. Units per case 200
Approximately 9 1/2" x 8 3/4" # Cases:| 500
Pack Size1200 per case RECOMMENDED Total Case Welight {Ib)
Minimum Order: 100 cases Other Info:

Polystyrene with a minimum .140" gauge
Approximately weight 10.2 grams per tray.
Packed in cardboard cartons.

Packed 500 per case RECOMMENDED
Minimum order: 648 cases per truckload
Sample required: 1 case

Pack Size

SAMPLES;

Approved Brand {PACTIVE CTH 10500

Approved Brand 40R Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit{ CASE of 500
NOTE: MANUFACTURER NUMBER: If the manufacturer number is:

a) no longer available and has been replaced with an updated number, or
b) incorrect, the bidder should indicate the corrected manufacturer number on in the spaces provided.

Revi St

by G. L and Di i
Reviewed by. T. Holmberg-Oept. of Food and Nutsition
Prepared by R. Johnsan-Procurement Management Services

Units per case
# Cases:.
Total Case Weight {Ib}

Other Info:

PRIMARY
AWARDEE

Page3 of 4

SAMPLES:|Samples: 20 each.
Approved Brand jGen Pak SN240 -
Approved Brand 40R Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size ITEM U N DE R EVALUA-l ION
Unit] CASE of 200 | | [
6 TRAYS: 5 compartment 137700 Pri $15.95000  $2,196,315.00 JEENCEELN] $2,530,926.00 | $16.38000 l $2,255,526.00
rice Tolal Estimated ~ TolalEstimaled Tofal Estmated
M-DCPS No.452-0505 Cases of Information: S = X ol.V:] R SIPAWTPRIINY]  PER CASE | Price will caiculate il PER CASE | Price will calculate if
. filled out filed out filed out
PM Internal No.1058-G308 500 units Brand: Darnel electronically Pactiv electronically Darnel electronically
Specifications|5 compariment, approximalely 10" x 8" x 1", Code Number: [ ITVOXFEliK] DU2014501

137,700 cases

1920915%
I

Bid Evaluation 09/11/2008
07/17/2008



Miami-Dade County Public Schools (M-DCPS) Bid Proposal Form

Cafeteria Compartment Trays

All products bid for items shall comply with Federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act and all applicable food additive regulations as
All products bid shall be 100% recyclable and manufactured with no flucrocarbons [CFC's) or hydre chlorofluorocarbans (HCFC's) of any kind.
The product shall be eapable of handling lemperatures up to 200 deqrees F. Product bid shall be a minkmum 140" qauge palystyrene construction

Itemn

Description

Bid 065-HHO03

Specialty Trays
CATEGORY- ltems
4-6

Detall of ftem Description
ALTERNATE BID

Detall of Hem Description

NQTE: This Excel spreadsheet will calculate out for each item the Cases and Total
: Estimated Quantity Price below IF this form is filled out electronically and is
submitted with the bid package as a file.

Oetail of tem Description

Dade Pa

ar and Bag Co.

Dade Paper and Bag Co.

Edward Don & Compan

US Foodservice

SAMPLES;
Approved Brand
roved Brand
unit|

Reviewed by
Reviewed by
Prepared by

Sample required; 1 case

PACTIVE CTH 10500

OR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
CASE of 500

G. Lee-Stores and Distribution
. T. Hoimbesg-Dept. of Food and Nutrition
R Johnson-Procurement Management Services

J

Paged of 4

157 ETT
4 Dish Tray Brand: [t 3 LR g8 00 NO BID 08000 656.00 NO BID
= ¥ 2 BlOT EAlmaET Total Estimated 0 ~TotalEstimated”
M-DCPS No.:|452-0211 Cases of P PER CASE ¢ ol PER CASE | Price will calculale if R CA Price will 2 PER CASE |Price wil calculate it
PM Intemal No.:(058-G03 . yiee ; oiie fited out do filed out
ntemal No.: 2000 units information:| SR eT] v 80 setrotically - electronically P2 J electronically
Specifications:| Polystyrene construction, square, overall length and width Brand: [F SRt 7 00
approximately 4", not to exceed 4-1/2". Color = White. Code Number: 000 000
Pack Size:|2000 per case RECOMMENDED Units per case VR 400
Minimum Order; 100 # Cases:}] " G = B B 0
SAMPLES:)Sample required: 12each Total Case Weight [Ib){ S8 S S E i 3 Pa ¢ Ad
Other Info:i A & s b I A K
Approved Brand 1| Genpak 1001 2
Approved Brand jOR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size B - AU . ARL
Unit:[CASE of 2000
5 Tray, no compartment 500 . $14.35000 $7,175.00 NO BID $14.58000 $7,290.00 [ NO BID
Price Total Estimated Tofal Estimated Total Estmated Total Esbmated
M-DCPS No.3452-1021 Cases of Information:] PER CASE |Price will caleutate iff PER CASE | Price will calculate ] PER CASE | Price will caicutate | PER CASE | Price will calculate if
PM Internat No.{058-G26 i ] filled out filled qu( filed out filed Qu(
. 200 units Brand: EC Pack electronically electronically Genpak electronically electronically
Specifications|Polystyrene foam, no compardment, Medium, w/iHinged lid. Code Number: 81200 SN240 !
To be used for hot or cold items. Units per case
. Approximately © 1/2" x 8 3/4" # Cases:. m_
Pack Size]1200 per case RECOMMENDED Total Case Walght {Ib) 7.8 8
Minimum Order: 100 cases Other Info:
SAMPLES: Samples: 20 sach.
Approved Brand {Gen Pak SN240 ITEM UN DER EVALUA-I ION
Assroved Brand jOR Other Brands meeting specifications and pack size
Unit] CASE of 200 ﬁ !
Hi T
6 TRAYS: 5 compartment 137700 . $17.01000 l szsaz,znooj $16.38000 $2,255,526.00 | $18.04000 J $2,484,108.00 | $16.58000 $2,263,066.00
Price Tolal Estmated “~Total Estmated Total Estimated Total Estmated.
M-DCPS No.3452-0505 Cases of information:] PER CASE | Price wil calcuiate iff PER CASE | Price will calcutate iff PER CASE | Price will calcuiate it  PER CASE | Price will calculate if
filled out filed out | filled out filted out
PM Internal No.1058-G30B 500 units Brand: Pactive electronically Pactive electronically Pactiv electronically electronically
Specifications|5 compariment, approximately 10" x 8" x 1", Code Number:{ TH1-0500 TH1-0500L 10500
Polystyrene with a minimum .140" gauge Units per case 500 500
Approximately weight 10,2 grams per tray. # Cases:. 137700 137700
Pack Size{Packed in cardboard cartons. Total Case Weight (b} 12.5 | . 46
Packed 500 per case RECOMMENDED Other Info: See 4.84 Cubic
Minimum order: 648 cases per truckload Alternate ltem
1

Bid Evaluation 09/1172008

0711772008





