'
The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by,
Bid No. 058-HH Prepared by

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

AFP INDUSTRIES, LCC APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | UNIT PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR .
1 items 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with plastic top
approximately 30 "W X 48 "L..
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 113 each 700 Each NO BiD Y | $353.00 | $247,100.00 | ABCO ETD3048FM
1A Minimum order: 120 or more 1186 Each NO BID sl ~ | $350.00 | $415,100.00 | ABCO ETD3048FM
BALANCE Sk e
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $662,200.00
2 items 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4320 |Computer table, approximately 30 "W X 60 "L,
2 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each NO BID il o 1 NO BID i
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 | Each NO BID NO BID
BALANCE i :
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Items 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all lems.
516-4338 |Computer table, approximately 30"W X 72-L,
3 BALANCE| Minimum order: 1-49 each 50 Each NO BIO NO BID
3A Minimum order: 50 or more 350 | Each NO BID NO BID i
BALANCE ki
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID

10t 30 FAb3738 Pav. (06-94]



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HHO1t

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tabies, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

AFP INDUSTRIES, LCC APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. {UNIT PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED [ MANUFACTURER &
MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
4 Items 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4346 |Computer workstation, approximately 30* X 36" X 26-
1/2.
4 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-199 each 200 Each NO BID $133.75 $26,750.00 | ABCOCFM30366MS
’ H30
4A Minimum arder: 200 or more 1300 | Each NO BID 4 iy o $129.99 | $168,987.00 | ABCOCFM30366MS
BALANCE s O H30
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BIiD $195,737.00
5 items 5 through 5B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bldder must bid atl items.
516-4354 |Technology center, computer table, approximately 48*W
X 30°D.
5 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 26 Each NO BID NO BID %
S5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each NO BID NO B8ID
BALANCE
58 Minimum Order: 25 or more 600 Each NO BID NO BID e
BALANCE i
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO B8ID
6 item 6, will be awarded as a Low Unit Price.
Typing table, approximately 24" X 36°L.
& BALANCE Minimum Order: 1 each 25 Each NO BID 1 NO BID . =
LOW UNIT PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 items 7 through 7B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all tems.
Student table, rectangular approximately 48"W X 24"0.
7 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 20 Each NO BID ;. $98.90 $1,978.00 ABCOATART2448
7A Minimum Order: 6-24 each 50 Each NO BID ¥ $95.00 $4,750.00 ABCOATART2448
BALANCE
78 Minimum Order: 25 or mare 200 | Each NO BID A $91.08 | $18,216.00 | ABCOATART2448
BALANCE .y
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID $24,944.00 | Non- responsive/ no
samples
20f 30
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HHO1

Liprary/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

AFP INDUSTRIES, L.CC

APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FUBNITURE

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION Qry. |UNIT PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
8 itemns 8 through 9B, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chalr, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-19 each 80 Each $97.72 $7.817.60 JASPER CHAIR 43 NOBID T
8A Minimum Qrder: 20-89 each 650 Each $93.33 $60,664.50 JASPER CHAIR 43 NOBID
BALANCE
88 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each $91.43 $18,286.00 JASPER CHAIR 43 NOBID Y
BALANCE . T
9 Chair, library, solid wood, tour posts. o
9 BALANCE| Minimum Order: 6-19 each 80 Each $120.28 $8,622.40 JASPER CHAIR 43UBS NOBID v
9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each $115.88 $75,322.00 JASPER CHAIR 43UBS NOBID ¥
BALANCE
9B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each $114.00 $22,800.00 JASPER CHAIR 43UBS NOBID
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $194,512.50 ! NO BID
i
300

Reviewed by
Prepared by

FM 3738 Pl (06-34)



The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HHO01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

AFP INDUSTRIES, LCC

APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
10 Items 10 through 13C will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
I
PARTIAL Chalr, stacking type, 12".
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each NO BID ) NO BID
PARTIAL [t
10A Minimum Order: 51-89 each 100 Each NO BiD NO BID
PARTIAL
108 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each NO BID NO BID
PARTIAL
11 Chair, stacking type, 14",
11 Minimum Qrder. 20-50 sach 100 | Each NO BiD NO BID i ey,
PARTIAL
11A Minimum Order. 51-99 each 200 Each NO BID NO BID
PARTIAL
118 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each NO 8ID NO BID
PARTIAL
11C Minimum Order: 500 or more 3,200 | Each NO BID NO BID -
PARTIAL -
12 Chair, stacking type, 16*,
12 Minimum Order. 20-50 each 70 Each NO BiD NO BID ]
PARTIAL
1248 Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each NO BID NO BID
PARTIAL i
12C Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each NO BID . NO BID :
PARTIAL = .
12D Minimum Order: 500 or more 8,500 | Each NO BID NO BID
PARTIAL )
13 Chalr, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each NO BID NO BID - <
PARTIAL bl
13A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 | Each NO BID NO BID
PARTIAL hi
138 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each NO BID NOBID
PARTIAL
13C Minimum Order: 500 or more 13,500 | Each NO BID NO BID 2
PARTIAL s
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID
4030

Reviewed by
Prepared by
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The Schaol Board ol Miami-Dade County, Florlda

Bld No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

AFP INDUSTRIES, LCC

APRICOT OFFICE SUPPLIES & FURNITURE

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED PRICE MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
ltems 14 through 15B, will be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chair, teacher, height adjustable from approximately 15*
14 10 20",
14 Minimum Order: 100 each 2,000 | Each NO BID NO BID ’
BALANGE ) ek
Chalr, task/teacher, pneumalic height, adjustable from
15 approximately 15% to 20 *, Fabric Grades should include
fitand (V!
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each NO BID NO BID
BALANCE
15A Minimum Order: 51-89 each 300 Each NO BID NO BID
158 Minimum Order: 100 or more 1500 | Each NO BID NO BID
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: 50%
16
501 30

Reviewed by
Prepared by
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorlda
Bid No. 058-HHO1
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC Alternate-CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC CARITAN HOSPITALITY, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION Qry. [UNITY PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL &
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR .
4 items 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with piastic top
approximately 30 "W X 48 "L..
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 118 each 700 Each {NO BID INO BID \ NO BID
ol
1A Minimum order: 120 or more 1186 | Each [NO BID NO BID ' NO BID
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 items 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4320 |Computer table, approximately 30 *W X 60 "L,
2 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each $95.23] $19,046.00 CP3060 CT $90.72, $18,144.00 CP3060 CT! $158.90] $31,780.00} VIRCO 873060
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 | Each $92.03] $276,090.00] CP3060 CT $89.72] $268,160.00] CP3060 CTH $158.90 $476,700.00] VIRCO 873060
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $295,136.00) $287,304.00| Does not meet Specs. $508.480.00
3 ltems 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4338 |Computer table, approximately 30"W X 72°L,
3 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-49 each 50 Each $103.74 $5,187.00] CP3072CT $101.97 $5,098.50 CP3072 CTI $258.90| $12,945.00( VIRCO 873072
W/TWMP72
3A Minimum order: 50 or more 350 Each $102.74] $35,959.00] CP3072CT $99.97 $34,989.50 CP3072 CT!H $258.90 $90,615.00[ VIRCO 873072
BALANCE W/TWMP72
TOTAL LOW GROUP $41,146.00 DOoes not meet $40,088.00 Does not meet $103,560.00
specilicaions specifications
60130
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HHO01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tabies, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC Alternate-CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC CARITAN HOSPITALITY, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED [ MANUFACTURER & | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL #
Wtems 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
F Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4346 |Computer workstation, approximately 30* X 36" X 26-
12t
4 BALANCE Minimum order; 1-199 each 200 |Each| $68.031 §13.606.00]  CP3036 WS |  $68.03| $13,606.00 CP3036WS1  [NO BID
4A Minimum order: 200 or mare 1300 Each $67.03; $87,139.00 CP3036 WS $67.03 $87,139.00, CP3036 W51 NO BIiD
BALANCE -
TOTAL LOW GROUP $100,745.00 DID NOT MEET $100,745.00 DID NOT MEET NO BID
SPECIFICATIONS SPECIFICATIONS
5 Items 5 through 5B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all ltems.
516-4354 Technology center, computer tabje, approximately 48™W
X 30°D.
5 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 26 Each $76.45 $1,987.70 CP3048 CT $76.95 $2,000.70| CP3048 CT1 $143.17 $3,722.42| VIRCO 873048
5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each $75.45 $3,772.50 CP3048 CT $75.45 $3,772.50 CP3048 CT1 $143.47 $7,158.50] VIRCO 873048
BALANCE
58 Minimum Order: 25 or mare 600 Each $74.45) $44,670.00 CP3048 CT $74.45] $44,670.00] CP3048 CT1 $143.17 $85,902.00| VIRCO 873048
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $50,430.20, Does not meet $50,443.20 Does not meet $96,782.92
specifications. specifications.
5 item 6, will be awarded as a Low Unit Price.
Tyoing table, approximately 24" X 36°L.
6 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1 each 25 Each $62.23 $1,555.75 CP2436 TY $62.23 $1,5585.75 CP2436 TY1 $1168.25 $2.806.25] VIRCO 872436
LOW UNIT PRICE $1,555.75 Does not meet $1,555.75 Does not meet $2,906.25|
specifications. specifications.
7 Items 7 through 7B wiil be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bld all items.
Student table, rectangular approximately 48"W X 24"D.
7 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 20 Each $69.95 $1,399.00 CP2448 ST $69.95 $1,399.00 CP2448 ST1 NO BID
7A Minimum Order: 6-24 each 50 Each $69.05 $3,452.50 CP2448 ST $69.05 $3,452.50| CP2448 ST1 NO BID
BALANCE
78 Minimum Order: 25 or more 200 Each $68.55 $13,710.00 CP2448 ST $68.55 $13,710.00) CP2448 ST1 NO BID ey
BALANCE L
TOTAL LOW GROUP $18,561.50| Non- responsive/ no $18,561.50| Non- responsive/ no NG B8ID
samples samples
7030
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The Schooi Board of Miami-Dade County, Florlda

Reviewed by,

Bid No. 058-HH01 Prepared by
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs
CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC Alternate-CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC CARITAN HOSPITALITY, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL #
b items 8 through 98, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all tems.
Chair, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE] Minimum Order: 1-19 each 80 Each |[NO BID A1 INO BID “INO BID

8A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each |[NO BID NO BID i SINOQ BID
BALANCE i) e

8B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each [NO BID 4NO BID NO BID
BALANCE

9 Chair, library, solid wood, four posts.
9 BALANCE Minimum Order: 6-19 each 80 Each NO BID NO BID : ~INO BID o)

9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each NO BID . INO BID NO BID
BALANCE ;

98 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each NOBID {NO BID NO BID
BALANCE

TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID

M 3738 Prerv. (06-94)



The School Board of Miaml-Dade County, Flarida Reviewed by
Bid No. 058-HHO1 Prepared by
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tabies, Desks, and Chalrs
CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC Alterngte-CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC CARITAN HOSPITALITY, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL #
0 items 10 through 13C will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
PARTIAL Chalr, stacking type, 12",
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each [NO BID NO BID i $21.89 $1,632.30, VIRCO 9012
PARTIAL :
10A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 100 Each {NO BID . {NO BID $21.89 $2,189.00] VIRCO 9012
PARTIAL o
108 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each [NO BID 2 {NO BID g $21.89 $4,378.00 VIRCO 9012
PARTIAL 1 '
11 Chair, stacking type, 14",
1 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 100 Each [NO BID - INOBID it ~ s $22.89) $2,289.00 VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL Y < gl
1A Minimum Order; 51-99 each 200 Each |NO BID ~ |[NOBID 7 - $22.89 $4,578.00] VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL ] -
1 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 600 Each |[NO BID NO BID $22.89 $13,734.00] VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL
11C Minimum Order: 500 or more 3,200 | Each |NO BID ‘INO BID $22.89] $73.248.00 VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL ‘s
© 2 Chalr, stacking type, 16",
12 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |[NO BID NO BID $26.99 $1,889.30) VIRCO 9016 T
PARTIAL
12A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |[NO BID NO BID $26.99 $5,398.00 VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL
12C Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each [NO BID NQ 8i0 $26.99 $21,5692.00 VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL
12D Minimum Order: 500 or more 8,500 |{ Each {NO 81D NO BID $26.99] $229,415.00 VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL
13 Chalr, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimum Qrder: 20-50 each 70 Each |NO BID NO BID : $29.99 $2,099.30 VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL
13A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |NO BID ‘|NO BID $29.99 $5,998.00 VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL
138 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each [NO BID NO BIiD $29.99 $23,992.00 VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL ¢
13C Minimum Order: 500 or more 13,500 | Each [NO BID ALY |[NO BID $29.99 $404,865.00 VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL -
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NQ BID $797,196.90)

Fa4 3738 Rav. (06-54)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by
Bid No. 058-HHO1 Prepared by
Llbrary/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs
CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC Alternate-CAPITOLINE PRODUCT, INC CARITAN HOSPITALITY, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL #
Items 14 through 15B, will be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid ail items.
Chalr, teacher, height adjustable from approximately 15*
14 N
to 20*,
14 Minimum Order: 100 each 2,000 | Each |[NO BID 4{NO BID $93.90, $187,800.00[ VIRCO 9260PGC
BALANCE ]
Chalr, task/teacher, pneumatic heignt, adjustable from
15 approximately 15" to 20 °, Fabric Grades should include
il and IV:
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each |NO BID . INOBID Eiar _|NO BID 1
BALANCE 3
15A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 300 | Each (NOBID NO BID ™ o ‘ NO BID
158 Minimurm Order: 100 or more 1500 | Each INO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: 0% 0% 10%
16

100t 30
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The School Board of Mlami-Dade County, Florlda
Bid No. 058-HH01
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNIHINGS ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRIZES, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QrTy. UNIT| PRICE PER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &| PRICE PER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR
1 ltems 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with plastic top
approximately 30 "W X 48 L.
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 118 each 700 Each INO BiD $222.90] $156,030.00] HON 88251R
1A Minimum order: 120 or more 1186 | Each [NO BID $222.90 $264,359.40 HON 88251R
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $420,389.40
2 Items 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid ali items.
6516-4320 Computer table, approximately 30 "W X 60 "L,
2 BALANCE] Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each [NO BID $299.70] $59,940.00] HON ED
3060GULPE0
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 | Each [NO BID $299.70 $899,100.00| HON ED
BALANCE 3060GULPE0
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $959,040.00
3 ltems 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bldder must bid all Items.
516-4338 [Computer table, approximately 30"W X 72°L,
3 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-49 each 50 Each |[NO BID $345.10 $17,255.00 HON
ED3072GULP72
3A Minimum order. 50 or more 350 Each [INO BID $345.10 $120,785.00) HON
BALANCE ED3072GULP72
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $138,040.00

110630

Reviewed by
Prepared by,
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The School Board of Mlaml-Dade County, Florida

Bid N

0. 058-HHO1

Library/Classroom Furniture; Tables, Desks, and Chairs

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNIHINGS ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRIZES, INC,
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. | UNIT| PRICEPER EXTENDED [MANUFACTURER &| PRICE PER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
h lterns 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4346 JComputer workstation, approximately 30* X 36" X 26-
12",
4 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-199 each 200 Each $136.96 $27,392.00] ABCO $133.60 $26,720.00] HON
ED3036NCAST152
4A Minimum order: 200 or more 1300 | Each $124.83 $162,279.00] ABCO $133.60 $173,680.00 HON
BALANCE ED3036NCAST152
TOTAL LOW GROUP $189,671.00, $200,400.00
5 ltems 5 through 5B wili be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4354 |Technology center, computer table, approximately 48"W
X 30"D.
5 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 26 Each [NO BID $125.00 $3,250.00] HON ED3048N
5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each [NQ BID $125.00 $6,250.00f HON ED3048N
BALANCE
5B Minimum Order: 25 or more 600 Each |NO BID $125.00 $75,000.00f HON ED3048N
BALANCE ‘
TOTAL LOW GROUP $84,500.00
6 itern 6, wlll be awarded as a Low Unlt Price.
Typing table, approximately 24" X 36°L.
6 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1 each 25 Each [NO BID i $128.10 $3,202.50] HON
1 ED2436NCAST152
LOW UNIT PRICE NO BID $3.202.50
7 tems 7 through 7B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all ltems.
Student table, rectangular approximately 48'W X 24*D.
7 BALANCE, Minimum Order: 1-5 each 20 Each (NO BID $118.70 $2,374.00 HON ED2448N
7A Minimum Order. 6-24 each 50 Each [NQ BID = J $118.70 $5,935.00] HON ED2448N
BALANCE
7B Minimum Order: 25 or more 200 Each [NO BID $118.70 $23,740.00] HON ED2448N
BALANCE e v
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $32,049.00,

120030

Reviewed by
Prepared by

343738 Pev. (05-94)



The School Board of Mlami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by
Bid No. 058-HHO01 Prepared by
Library/Classroom Furnlture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNIHINGS ERNIE MORBRIS ENT%. INC.
{TEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT|] PRICEPER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &| PRICE PER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
3 Hemns 8 through 9B, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chailr, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-19 each 80 Each |[NON ] [NO BID
RESPONSIVE i
-BA Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each [NON ~|NO BID
BALANCE RESPONSIVE
88 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 | Each |[NON . |[NO BID
BALANCE RESPONSIVE ,
g Chalr, library, solid wood, four posts.
9 BALANCE Minimum Order: 6-19 each 80 Each |NON NO BID
RESPONSIVE
9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each [NON NO BID
BALANCE RESPONSIVE
9B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 | Each [NON - [NOBID
BALANCE RESPONSIVE =5 + 1
TOTAL LOW GROUP NON NO BID
RESPONSIVE

130130 FIAI738 ey, (06-94)



The Schooi Board of Miami-Dade County, Florlda Reviewed by
Bid No. 058-HH01 Preparedby
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNIHINGS ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRIZES, INC.
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT] PRICEPER EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &) PRICE PER EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
0 items 10 through 13C will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
PARTIAL Chair, stacking type, 12" j
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 | Each [NO BID e s INO BID :
PARTIAL R g :
10A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 100 Each [NO BID . T INOBID
PARTIAL 5 Frar o
108 Minimurm Order: 100 or more 200 | Each |[NO BID SR SRR EINO BID 1
PARTIAL NGy
11 Chair, stacking type, 14",
" Minimum Order: 20-50 each 100 Each [NO BID Faafaisid sl SARINO BID s
PARTIAL ki T $
11A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |[NO BID NO BID 3
11B Minimum Order: 100-499 each 600 Each |[NO BID “INO BID
PARTIAL : ol i =
110 Minimum Order: 500 or more 3.200 | Each |[NOBID s AR INO BID o B
PARTIAL b : hoic il
12 Chair, stacking type, 16%,
12 Minimum QOrder: 20-50 each 70 Each |NO BID : ‘INO BID
PARTIAL e ;
12A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |NO BID AN s NO BID
PARTIAL i . .
12C Minimum Order: 100-499 each ‘ 800 | Each |NO BID P - NOBID
PARTIAL - —
12D Minimum Order: 500 or more 8,600 | Each [NO BID NQ BID
PARTIAL . .
13 Chair, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 | Each [NO BID R “INnoBID
PARTIAI - Il
13A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |[NO BIiD NG BID
PARTIAL
138 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each |[NO BID ~|NOBID
PARTIAL
13C Minimum Order: 500 or more 13,500 | Each |[NO BID NG BID
PARTIAL it ¢ el
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID

140l 30 FI$3738 Pev (06-34)



The School Board of Mlami-Dade County, Florida
Bid No. 058-HHO01
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

COMMERCIAL CONCEPTS & FURNIHINGS ERNIE MORRIS ENTERPRIZES, INC.
ITEM M-OCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT] PRICE PER EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &| PRICE PER EXTENDED [MANUFACTURER &
UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL #
Iltems 14 through 15B, will be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid all ltems.
Chair, teacher, height adjustable from approximately 15*
14 -
to 20"
14 Minimum Order: 100 each 2,000 | Each $104.63 $209,260.00 COMFORTEK $66.90) $133,800.00| HON TS2 GRADE 2
BALANCE EFS210
Chair, task/teacher, pneumatic height, adjustable from
15 approximalely 157 to 20 *, Fabric Grades should include
iiland iV:
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each |NO BID $79. $15,800.00 HON 5301
BALANGE
15A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 300 Each |[NO BID 579,0(1 $23,700.00 HON 5301
158 Minimum Order: 100 or more 1500 | Each [NO BID $79.01 $118,500.00 HON 5301
TOTAL LOW GROUP Did not meet $291,800.00% Not meeting
specifications- specifications
Did not bid all
items 14-15A
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: NO BIiD 58.30%
16

1504 30

Reviewed by
Prepared by

FM3738 Rev (06-94)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

GALLAWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES HERTZ MOULTRIE POST
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER PRICE MODEL &
UNIT
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR .
ol
1 ltems 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with plastic top
approximately 30 "W X 48 °L..
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 119 each 700 Each $259.00 $181,300.00] Hon 84251 $285.85] $200,095.00 ACAD-ETAIA_HTZ- NO BID i
1A Minimum order; 120 or mare 1186 | Each| $259.00] $307.174.00 Hon 84251 $285.85| $339,018.10] 'ACAD_ETMAHTZ-'-_ NO BID
BALANCE LT E0ABCTT
TOTAL LOW GROUP $488,474.00] $539,113.10] NO BID
2 Items 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all tems.
516-4320 |Computer table, approximately 30 "W X 60 'L,
2 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each [NO BID $127.36] $25,472.00| ACADEMIA 873060 $93.53 $18,706.00 MPF3060CT
1 WITH 87WMP-60
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 | Each [NOBID $124.79] $374,370.00{ ACADEMIA 873060, $89.797 $269,370.00) MPF3060CT
BALANCE WITH B7WMP-60
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $399,842.00 $288,076.00 Totat Low bid
meeting
specifications
3 items 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid ail items.
516-4338 |Computer table, approximately 30'W X 72,
3 BALANCE] Minimum order: 1-49 each 50 Each |[NO BID = {4 $150.73] $7,536.50 ACADEMIA $105.86| $5,293.00 MPF3072
8§73072WITH
87WMP.72
3A Minimum order: 50 or more 350 Each |NG BID $148.15 $51,852.50 ACADEMIA $102.98 $36,043.00 MPF3072
BALANCE 873072WITH
B87WMP-72
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BiD $59,389.00] Does nat meet $41,336.00] Total LOW BID
specifications MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS

16 0f 30

Fab 2738 Rev. (06-64)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

GALLAWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES HERTZ MOULTRIE POST
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
Hems 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
F Group. Bldder must bid all items.
516-4346 |Computer workstation, approximately 30" X 36" X 26-
172"
4 BALANGE Minimum order: 1-199 each 200 Each INO BID 4 " 'INO BID o . INOBID 2
4A Minimum order: 200 or more 1300 | Each [NO BID -~ INO BID NO BiD
BALANCE :
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NQ BID NO BID
5 Iltems 5 through 5B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4354 |Technology center, computer table, approximately 48"W
X 30°D.
5 BALANCE Minimum Order. 1-5 each 26 Each [NO BID $84.40] $2,194.40| ACADEMIA 873048 |NO BID n
5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each |[NO BID $84.40, $4,220.00| ACADEMIA 873048 |[NO BID
BALANCE
58 Minimum Order: 25 or more 600 Each |[NO BID | S $81.82 $49,092.00| ACADEMIA 873048 |[NO BID M *
BALANCE + H
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $55,506.40] NO BID
6 item 6 , will be awarded as a Low Unit Price.
Typing table, approximately 24* X 36°L.
6 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1 each 25 Each [NO BID -~ {NOBID : NO BID %
LOW UNIT PRICE NQ BID NO BID NO BID
7 Items 7 through 7B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bldder must bid all items.
Student table, rectangular approximately 48"W X 24'D.
7 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 20 Each [NO BID $73.75] $1,475.00] ACADEMIA 872448 $69.99 $1,399.80 MPF2448ST
7A Minimum Order: 6-24 each 50 Each [NO BID $73.75 $3,687.50| ACADEMIA 872448 $69.23 $3.461.50 MPF2448ST
BALANCE :
78 Minimum Order: 25 or more 200 Each [NO BID §71.17 $14,234.00] ACADEMIA 872448 $68.16! $13,632.00 MPF24488T
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $19,396.50] Low bid meeting $18,493.30 Did not meet
specifications | specifications

176430

3738 Rev. (06-94)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HHO1

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

GALLAWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES HERTZ MOULTRIE POST
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION Qry. UNIT} PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
b Items 8 through 98, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chair, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE Minirum QOrder: 1-19 each 80 Each |NO BID ~ - INOBID INOC BID » A
8A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each |[NO BID . NO BID ~INO BID
BALANCE ‘ i
8B Minimum Order; 100 or more 200 Each [NO BID NO BID INO BID
BALANCE ]
9 Chair, library, solid wood, tour posts.
9 BALANGE| Minimum Order: 6-19 each 80 Each [NO BID : 'INO BID 1 NO BID e
9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each [NO BID NO BID r ~ INO BID
BALANCE i e
9B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each |[NO BID = NO BID - [NO BID
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID NO BID

180t 30

FM-3738 Py [06-94)



The Schooi Board ot Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Libracy/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

GALLAWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES HERTZ MOULTRIE POST
[ TeEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER UNIT| PRICE & MODEL # PER PRICE MODEL #
\ UNIT
0 ltems 10 through 13C will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bldder must bid all items.
PARTIAL Chair, stacking type, 12",
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |[NO BID =] $19.59 $1,371.30] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 122
T 10a Minimum Order: 51-99 each 100 [ Each [NOBID $19.59] $1,959.00] ACADEMIA ACD- [NO BID
PARTIAL 122
108 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each |[NO 8ID $19.59 $3,918.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 122
1 11 Chalr, stacking type, 14",
! 11 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 100 Each |NO BID $19.81 $1,981.00 ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID T N
| PARTIAL i 124 v i
]‘ 1A Minimum Order: 51-39 each 200 Each |[NO BID i $19.81 $3,962.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 124 >
! 118 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 600 Each |NO BID $19.81 $11,886.00f ACADEMIA ACD- [NO BID
PARTIAL 124 g ST :
11C Minimum Order: 500 or more 3,200 | Each |[NO BID ' $19.81 $63,392.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |[NO BID : LA )
PARTIAL 124 ¢ :
12 Chair, stacking type, 16",
“ 12 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |NO BID $23.38 $1,636.60] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
. PARTIAL 126
! 128 Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |[NO BID $23.38 $4,676.00 ACADEMIA ACD- INO BID
PARTIAL 126 :
i2C Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each |NO BID $23.38 $18,704.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 126
120 Minimum Order: 500 or more 8,500 | Each |[NG BID $23.38| $198,730.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 126
13 Chalr, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |NO BID $23.67 $1,656.90] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 128
13A Minimum Qrder: 51-99 each 200 Each |NO BID $23.67 $4,734.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL i 128
13B Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each {NO BID $23.67] $18,936.00] ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
PARTIAL 128
13C Minimum Order: 500 or more 13,500 | Each |[NC BID $23.67| $319,545.00] ACADEMIA ACD- [NO BID
PARTIAL 128
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $657,087.80] NQ BID

90130

F143738 Fev. (06-94)



The Schoot Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bld No. 058-HHO1

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

GALLAWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES HERTZ MOULTRIE POST
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTy. UNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER | PRICE | EXTENDED |MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE & MODEL # PER PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
ltems 14 through 15B, will be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chalir, teacher, height adjustable from approximately 15*
14 to 20",
14 Minimum Order: 100 each 2,000 | Each $142.50] $285,000.00] VIRCO 9260PG C $46.34 $92,680.00) ACADEMIA ACD- |NO BID
BALANCE 158P
Chair, task/teacher, pneumatic height, adjustable from
15 approximately 15" to 20 °, Fabric Grades shouid include
Il and IV:
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each $89.95 $17,990.00; HON 5901 $104.27| $20,854.00 OFM 105 NO BID £
BALANCE
15A Minimum Order: 51-39 each 300 Each $89.95 $26,985.00] HON 58901 $102.87 $30,861.00] OFM 105 NO BID
158 Minimum Order: 100 or more 1500 | Each $89.95 $134,925.00 HON 5901 $101.60| $152.400.0 OFM 105 NO BID
TOTAL LOW GROUP $464,900.00 $296,795.00 NO BID
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: 40% 66.80% 0%
16

200 30
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by,
8id No. 058-HHO1 Prepared by ,
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

PRIDE ENTERPRISES SCHOOL HOUSE PRODUCT
ITEM M-OCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. [UNIT] PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
WARRANTY, IF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR .
1 Iltems 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with plastic top
approximatety 30 "W X 48 °L..
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 119 each 700 Each |[NO BID . NG 8ID
1A Minimum order: 120 or more 1186 | Each |[NO BID ~|NO BID .
BALANCE e =
TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID
—
2 ltems 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4320 [Computer table, approximately 30 *W X 60 "L,
2 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each [NO BID $152.25 $30,450.00 ARTCOBELL
CTB0WMPS
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 | Each [NO BID $147.00] $441.000.00 ARTCOBELL
BALANCE ’ CT60WMPS
i TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BiD $471,450.00
[ 3 ltems 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all Items.
6516-4338 |Computer table, approximately 30"W X 72°L,
3 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-49 each 50 Each |[NO BID ] $163.80 $8,190.00] ARTCO BELL CT72
/ WMP6
3A Minimum order: 50 or more 350 Each |[NOC BID ; $158.55 $55,492.50] ARTCO BELLCT72
BALANCE i WMP6
I TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $63,682.50

210030 FM 3730 Fiov (0694}



The School Board o Mlami-Dade County, Florida Reviewed by
Bid No. 058-HHO1 Prepared by
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

PRIDE ENTERPRISES SCHOOL HOUSE PRODUCT
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT{ PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED [ MANUFACTURER &
PER PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
s Items 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4346 |Computer workstation, approximately 30" X 36" X 26-
172"
4 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-199 each 200 Each | $147.00 $28,400.00] PRIDE 416W130 $120.75 $24,150.00 ARTCO BELL
WITH 4167336SHELF CD36SHO03
4A Minimum order: 200 or more 1300 | Each| $147.00] $191,100.00| PRIDE 416W130 $115.50] $150,150.00 ARTCO BELL
BALANCE WITH 4167336SHELF CD368H03
TOTAL LOW GROUP $220,500.00 $174,300.00 Total Low Bid
Meeting
Specifications
5 items 5 through 5B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all ltems.
516-4354 |Technology center, computer table, approximately 48"W
X 30°D.
5 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 26 Each |[NO BID Tt [¥g,4 NO BID
5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each [NO BID T, NO BID
BALANCE A yeedi
5B Minimum Order: 25 or more 600 Each |NO BID [ ~qNO BID
BALANCE B i dete ot ]
| TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID
6 Item & , will be awarded as a Low Unit Price.
Typing table, approximately 24" X 36°L.
6 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1 each 25 Each [NO BID A NO BID
| LOW UNIT PRICE NO BID NO BID
!
! 7 tems 7 through 7B will be awarded as a Total Low
| Group. Bidder must bid all items.
\ Student table, rectangular approximately 48°W X 24"D.
'7 BALANCE] Minimum Order. 1-5 each 20 Each {NO BID NO BID
7A Minimum Order: 6-24 each 50 Each |[NO BID B NO BID
BALANCE b
78 Minimum Order: 25 or more 200 Each |NO BID R ~ [NOBID
BALANCE s e - b’
’ TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID NO BID

220130 P4 3738 Pov. (06-94)



The School Board of Mlami-Dade Caunty, Florida

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Bld No. 058-HHO1

PRIDE ENTERPRISES

SCHOOL HOUSE PRODUCT

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. [ UNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
b ltems 8 through 9B, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Chalr, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE Minimum Qrder: 1-19 each 80 Each | $103.00 $8,240.00] 2LCSS NO BID
14,2LCSS16,2LCSS18
8A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each| $101.00] $65,650.00 2LCSS NO BID
BALANCE 14,2L.CSS16,2LCSS18
8B Minimum Order: 100 ar more 200 Each $99.00] $19,800.00] 2LCSS NO BID
BALANCE 14,21.C55816,2LCSS18
9 Chalr, library, solid wood, tour posts.
3 BALANCE Minimurmn Order: 6-19 each 80 Each| $124.00] $9,920.00] 4LCSS15, 4LCS17 |NO BID
9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each| $122.00 $79.300.00] 4LCSS15,4LCS17 |NOBID
BALANCE
g8 Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each | $120.00 $24,000.00] 4LCSS15,4LCS17 [NOBID
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $206,910.00 NO BID

Do d

Reviewed by
Prepared by_

F)A 3738 Rev. (06-34)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorlda

Bld No. 058-HHO1

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

PRIOE ENTERPRISES

SCHOOL HOUSE PRODUCT

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
0 Items 10 through 13C wili be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
PARTIAL Chair, stacking type, 12".
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |NO BID $15.25] $1,067.50|ARTCO BELL 7101
PARTIAL
10A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 100 Eacn |NO BID $15.25 $1,525.00]ARTCO BELL 7101
PARTIAL
10B Minirmum Order: 100 or more 200 Each |NO BID $15.25 $3,050.00{ARTCO BELL 7101
PARTIAL
11 Chair, stacking type. 14",
11 Minimurn Order: 20-50 each 100 Each |[NO BID $15.25] $1,525.00|ARTCO BELL 7103
PARTIAL
1A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |[NO BID $15.25] $3,050.00|ARTCO BELL 7103
PARTIAL
118 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 600 Each |[NO BID $16.25 $9,150.00|ARTCO BELL 7103
PARTIAL
11C Minimum Order: 500 or more 3,200 [ Each |NO BID $15.25 $48,800.00[ARTCO BELL 7103
PARTIAL
12 Chair, stacking type, 16",
12 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |[NO BID $18.59 $1,301.30] ARTCO BELL 7105
PARTIAL =
12A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each |NO BID $18.59 $3,718.00] ARTCO BELL 7105
PARTIAL
12C Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each |[NO BID $18.59 $14,872.00] ARTCO BELL 7105
PARTIAL
12D Minimum Order: 500 or more 8,600 [ Each [NO BID $18.50] $158,015.00] ARTCO BELL 7105
PART) 2
13 Chair, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each |[NO BID - $21.55 $1,508.50] ARTCO BELL 7107
PARTIAL J
13A Minlmum Order: 51-99 each 200 £ach [NO BID i $21.55 $4,310.00| ARTCO BELL 7107
PARTIAI :
138 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each |[NO BID $21.55 $17,240.00| ARTCO BELL 7107
PARTIAL 1l
13C Minimum Order: 500 ar more 13,500 | Each INO BID $21.55] $290,925.00| ARTCO BELL 7107
PARTIAL
‘ TOTAL LOW GROUP NO BID $560,057.30,

2800 30

Reviewed by,
Prepared by

F15.3738 Farr (06-94)



The Schoaol Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid No. 058-HH01
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

PRIDE ENTERPRISES SCHOOL HOUSE PRODUCT

ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. |UNIT| PRICE | EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &
PER PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
UNIT
Items 14 through 15B, will be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid ail items.
Chair, teacher, height adjustable trom approximately 15~
14 .
to 20"
14 Minimum Order. 100 each 2,000 | Each |NO BID St i $79.77] $159,540.00] ARTCO BELL
BALANCE TR e 7PQOP
Chalr, task/teacher, pneumatic height, adjustable from
15 approximately 15" to 20 *, Fabric Grades should include
Wi and IV:
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each| $118.00 $23,600.00] PRIDE 441MWPV $65.00] $13,000.00|GLOBAL OTG 11650
BALANCE
15A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 300 Each | $116.00 $34,800.00] PRIDE 441MWPV $65.00 $19,500.00]GLOBAL OTG116508|
158 Minimum Order: 100 or more 1500 Each | $114.00| $171,000.00] PRIDE 441MWPV $65.00 $97,500.00|GLOBAL OTG116508
TOTAL LOW GROUP Did not meet $289,540.00 Does nol meet
specifications- Specifications
Did not bid all
Hems 14-15A
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: 58% GLOBAL
50% AND
16 Artco Bell
56%

2501 30

Reviewed by
Prepared by
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Fiorida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by.
Prepared by

SCHOOL SPECIALTY SKAGSETH BRYANT INC VIRCO
ITEM t4-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT] PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
WARRANTY, iF GREATER THAN ONE
YEAR .
1 ftemg 1 AND 1A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid booth items.
516-0545 |Teacher's desk, single pedestal, metal with plastic top
aporoximately 30 "W X 48 °L,.
1 BALANCE Minimum order: 1- 119 each 700 Each $261.65 $183,155.00] ORNA METAL TD- $221.21 $154,847.00, 88251H HON $246.88| $172,816.00] VIRCO 543
30485P BGOK
1A Minimum order: 120 or more 1186 Each $248.88 $295,171.68] ORNA METAL TD- $221.21 $262,355.06, 88251R HON $246.88] $292,799.68 VIRCO 543
BALANCE 30485P BGOK
TOTAL LOW GROUP $478,326.68 $417,202.06 $465,615.68
2 ltems 2 through 2A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4320 |Computer table, approximately 30 "W X 60 "L,
2 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-99 each 200 Each $131.15 $26,230.00] AMTAB AA305PW |NO BID : $161.43 $32,286.00| VIRCO 873060/ TWMP60
2A Minimum order: 100 or more 3000 Each $127.75 $383,250.00] AMTAB AA305PW |NO BID $161.43[ $484,290.00] VIRCO 873060/TWMPE0
BALANCE 7
TOTAL LOW GROUP $409,480.00 NO 8ID $516,576.00
3 items 3 through 3A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4338 |Computer table, approximately 30'W X 727L,
3 BALANCE Minimum order. 1-49 each 50 Each $143.31 $7,165.50] AMTAB AA306PW [NO BID $188.13 $9,406.50| VIRCO 873072/TWMP72
3A Minimum order: 50 or more 350 Each $138.94 $48,629.00{ AMTAB AA306PW |NO BID $188.13 $65,845.50] VIRCO 873072/TWMP72
BALANCE z
TOTAL LOW GROUP $55,794.50 NO BID $75,252.00]
6ot X

F143738 e, (06-34)



The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by__

SCHOOL SPECIALTY SKAGSETH BRYANT INC VIRCO
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
A Items 4 through 4A will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bldder must bid ait hems.
516-4346 |[Computer warkstatlon, approximately 30” X 36™ X 26-
1/2x
4 BALANCE Minimum order: 1-199 each 200 Each $119.29 $23,858.001 ABCO CFM 30366- |NC BID ~ INOBID &
MSH 36 =
4A Minimum order: 200 or more 1300 | Each $119.29[  $155,077.00] ABCO CFM 30366- [NO BID - [NO BID
BALANCE MSH 36 % :
TOTAL LOW GROUP $178,335.00! NG BIO NO 8ID
—
5 ltems 5 through 5B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
516-4354 [|Technology center, computer table, approximately 48°W T
X 30°D.
S5 BALANCE] Minimum Order: 1-5 each 26 Each $85.22 $2,216.72| ALLIED 753048 :NOBID 5 $92.28 $2,399.28 VIRCO 873048
5A Minimum Order: 6-24 50 Each $80.28 $4,014.00 ALLIED T53048 ;NO BID $92.28 $4,614.00 VIRCO 873048
BALANCE
5B Minimum Order: 25 or more 600 Each $79.04 $47,424.00] ALLIED T53048 [INOBID $92.28 $55,368.00 VIRCO 873048
BALANCE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $53,653.72) Total Low bid meeting NGO BID $62,381.28
specifications
6 item 6, will be awarded as a Low Unlt Price.
Typing table, approximately 24" X 367L.
6 BALANCE Minimum Qrder: 1 each 25 Each $79.03 $1,975.75| ALLIED T52436C |NOBID $95.84 $2,396.00| VIRCO 872436/U87CAST
LOW UNIT PRICE $1,975.75| Non responsive tor NO BID $2,396.00 Low bidder meeting
sample request specifications.
7 items 7 through 7B will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid all items.
Student table, rectangular approximately 48"W X 24'D.
7 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-5 each 20 Each $81.11 $1,622.20] AMTAB AA244P |NO BID $47.77 $955.40 VIRCO 482448
TA Minimum Qrder: 6-24 each 50 Each $72.10 $3,605.00] AMTAB AA244P  |INO BID $47.77 $2,388.50 VIRCO 482448
BALANCE
7B Minimum Order: 25 ar more 200 Each $70.09 $14,018.00] AMTAB AA244P INO BID $47.77 $9,554.00 VIRCO 482448
BALANCE i A
TOTAL LOW GROUP $19,245.20) Non-Responsive/no NO BID $12,897.90) Non-responsive/no samples
samples !
270030
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Liprary/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

SCHOOL SPECIALTY SKAGSETH BRYANT INC VIRCO
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. JUNIT] PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE PER EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & | PRICE | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT! PRICE MODEL #
items 8 through 9B, will be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid ail items.
Chair, library, solid wood, two posts.
8 BALANCE Minimum Order: 1-19 each 80 Each $111.65 $8,932.00] GEORGIA CHAIR [NOBID ) NO BID <
348 ;
8A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each $108.61 $70,596.50} GEORGIA CHAIR |NO BID F NO BID
BALANCE 348 .
8B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each $106.58 $21.316.00] GEORGIA CHAIR |NO BID NO BID
BALANCE 348
9 Chair, library, solid wood, four posts.
9 BALANCE Minimum Order: 6-19 each 80 Each $129.60 $10,368.00] Georgia Chair 503- fNO BID ; “INO BID
R18UBUS it
9A Minimum Order: 20-99 each 650 Each $127.20 $82,680.00( Georgia Chair 503- |NO BID z NO BID
BALANCE R18UBUS :
9B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each $124.80 $24,960.00| Georgia Chair 503- [NO BID -‘|[NO 8iD
BALANCE R18UBUS
TOTAL LOW GROUP $218.852.50 NO BID NO BID
2830 FA 3738 Rav. (06-94)




The School Board of Mlaml-Dade County, Fiorida Reviewed by
Bid No., 058-HHO1 Prepared by
Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chairs

SCHOOL SPECIALTY SKAGSETH BRYANT INC VIRCO
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT| PRICE EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER &} PRICE PER EXTENDED | MANUFACTURER & ] PRICE | EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
0 items 10 through 13C wiil be awarded as a Total Low
Group. Bidder must bid ail items.
PARTIAL Chair, stacking type, 12".
10 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 70 Each $20.97 $1,467.90] SCHOLAR CRAFT $18.83 $1,318.10 H1012Y HON $16.00 $1,120.00 VIRCO 9012
L PARTIAL SC121
10A Minimum Order: 51-89 each 100 Each $20.68 $2,068.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $18.83 $1,883.00) H1012Y HON $16.00 $1,600.00 VIRCO 9012
PARTIAL SC121
10B Minimum Order: 100 or more 200 Each $19.98 $3,996.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $18.83 $3,766.00 H1012Y HON $16.00 $3,200.00] VIRCO 9012
PARTIAL SC121
11 Chair, stacking type, 14",
11 Minimum Order: 20-50 each 100 Each $21.30 $2,130.00 SCHOLAR CRAFT $19.59 $1,959.00) H1014Y HON $16.00) $1.600.00 VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL SC123
1A Minimum Order: 51-39 each 200 Each $20.90 $4,180.00 SCHOLAR CRAFT $19.59] $3,918.00 H1014Y HON $16.00 $3,200.00] VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL S2123
1B Minimum Order: 100-499 each 600 Each $20.24 $12,144.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $19.59 $11,754.00 H1014Y HON $16.00 $9,600.00] VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL SC123
11C Minimumn Order: 500 or more 3,200 | Each $19.10 $61,120.00f SCHOLAR CRAFT $19.59 $62,688.00 H1014Y HON $16.00] $51,200.00 VIRCO 9014
PARTIAL SC123
12 Chair, stacking type, 16",
12 Minimum Order. 20-50 each 70 Each $25.85 $1,808.50] SCHOLAR CRAFT $22.88 $1,601.60) H1016Y HON $17.80 $1,246.00, VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL SC125
12A Minimum Order: 51-39 each 200 Each $24.68 $4,936.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $22.88 $4,576.00 H1016Y HON $17.80] $3,560.00) VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL SC125
12C Minimum Order; 100-499 each 800 Each $23.97 $19,176.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $22.88) $18,304.00 H1016Y HON $17.80] $14,240.00 VIRCO 9016
PARTIAL SC125
12D _ |Minimum Order. 500 or more ’ 8,500 | Each $23.27] ~ $197,795.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $22.88 $194,480.00 H1016Y HON $17.80| $151,300.00 VIRCO 9016
_PARTIAL SC128
13 Chair, stacking type, 18",
13 Minimurn Order: 20-50 each 70 Each $26.64 $1,864.80] SCHOLAR CRAFT $25.31 $1,771.70 H1018Y HON $18.99, $1,329.30) VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL SC127
13A Minimum Order: 51-99 each 200 Each $25.57 $5,114.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $25.31 $5,062.00 H1018Y HON $18.99 $3,798.00 VIRCO 8018
PARTIAL SC127
138 Minimum Order: 100-499 each 800 Each $24.82 $19,856.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $25.31 $20,248.00 H1018Y HON $18.99] $15,192.00) VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL sC127
13C Minimum Order: 500 or more 13,500 | Each $24.14]  $325,890.00] SCHOLAR CRAFT $25.31 $341,685.00 H1018Y HON $18.99 $256,365.00 VIRCO 9018
PARTIAL SC127
TOTAL LOW GROUP $663,547.20 $675,014.40] $518,550.30
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The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid No. 058-HH01

Library/Classroom Furniture: Tables, Desks, and Chalrs

Reviewed by
Prepared by

SCHOOL SPECIALTY SKAGSETH BRYANT INC VIRCO
ITEM M-DCPS NO. DESCRIPTION QY. UNITY PRICE EXTENOED | MANUFACTURER & PRICE PER EXTENDED MANUFACTURER & | PRICE EXTENDED MANUFACTURER &
PER UNIT PRICE MODEL # UNIT PRICE MODEL # PER UNIT PRICE MODEL #
/ tems 14 through 158, wili be awarded as a TOTAL
Low Group. Bidder must bid all lems.
Chalr, teacher, height adjustable from approximately 15
14 10 20",
14 Minimum Order: 100 each 2,000 | Each $96.90 $193,800.00f SCHOLAR CRAFT $62.68 $125,360.00 TS2 HON $74.48] $148,960.00 VIRCO 9260PGC
BALANCE SC110P
Chair, task/teacher, pneumatic height, adjustable from
15 approximatety 15° to 20 *, Fabric Grades should include
Iitand IV:
15 Minimum Order: 1-50 each 200 Each $91.80 $18.360.00/GLOBAL GOAL 2239-[NON 5901 Grade 3and 4 | $103.72, $20,744.00) VIRCO 4300
BALANCE 8 RESPONSIVE
15A Minimum Qrder: 51-89 each 300 Each $91.80] $27,540.00[GLOBAL GOAL 2239-|NON $103.72 $31,116.00] VIRCO 4300
6 RESPONSIVE
158 Minimum Order: 100 or more 1500 Each $84.66 $126,990.00|GLOBAL GOAL 2239-|[NON $103.72| $155,580.00] VIRCO 4300
[ RESPONSIVE
TOTAL LOW GROUP $366,690.00] Non-responsive/no NON $356,400.00] Non responsive/ no samples
samples RESPONSIVE submitted
BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT: 48% 61.11% 65%
16
! !
J p— .I
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