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Reviewed Byll3 \'J_ =

Prepared By_ Y. S

AFP INDUSTRIES, INC. D & H DISTRIBUTING
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. JUNIT} Unit Price EXTENDED | Manufacturer's and| UnitPrice | EXTENDED | Manufacturers
PRICE Model Number PRICE and Model
Number
QTY.
Group 1: tems 1 through 17, Awarded AS Low
Unit Measure.
1 |State approved calculator, GED 2002 exam,
Casio model FX260, or egual 150 | Each|NO BID $7.89 $1,183.50)Casio FX260HA
LOW UNIT MEASURE
2 [State approved calculator, FCAT exam, Casio H
mode HS-10S, or equal 150 Each] NOBID $2.58 $387.00|CASIO HS1054!
i
LOWUNTMEASURE | | | A ST B $387.00) .. :
3 |Graphing Calculator: ' ] T TEXAS TEXAS
Texas Instruments T1-84 Plus, or equal t INSTRUMENT Ti - INSTRUMENTS
1250 |Eachi $9s28 s 119400.00 |84 PLUS $95.32 $119,150,00§T1 84 PLUS
1
LOW UNIT MEASURE ] $..mgt10000) _
4 iGraphing Calculator: Teacher kit Includes: 10 ' H
TI84PLUS graphing calcutators, 10 unit to unit ! ‘
cables, 10 manuals, 1 teacher guide, 1 i I TEXAS
transparency and 1 poster."For TIB4PLUS unit i TEXAS i INSTRUMENTS
specifications please refer to specification under : INSTRUMENTS T!-: TI 84
the TIB4PLUS. 48 Set! $95280 |$ 457344084 PLUSTK | $953.20 $45,753.60)PLUSTKYCL
I f
LOW UNIT MEASURE i $__as73a40) i
5 {Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: includes*1
TIB4PLUSTK-TI84 PLUS Teacher Kit.Teacher Kit
includes: 10 TIB4PLUS graphing calculators, 1-
TI84PLUS Poster, 1-transparency, 10-guidebooks |
& 10 unit to unit link cables. TI8B4PLUSSLVRSSII-
View screen Package for the TI84PLUS Silver
Edition, 1-12HP Hard Case that holds 12 TEXAS
T184PLUS Graphing Calculators, TEXAS INSTRUMENTS
TIB4PLUSALG1WKB Workbook Activities in INSTRUMENTS Ti- TI 84-
Algebra for TI84PLUS 25 Set | $1,388.00 f$  34,700.00 |84 PLUSBUND 2 $1,348.94 $33,723.50|BUND2DADE
LOWUNITMEASURE ¢ (| e R
6 [Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: Includes : I TEXAS
Teacher pack of 10 TI84PLUS Silver Edition 1 TEXAS : INSTRUMENTS
Graphing Calculators Texas Instruments i INSTRUMENTS I T184-
TI84PLSILVERTP, or equal 22 siiﬁ,ms,oo $  24,992.00 |TIB4PLSIVER TP $1430.19 $31.464.18|SILVBUND
LOW UNIT MEASURE S _J $ ___2_4_.9293‘991 _____________ 4
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FREY SCIEBTIFIC, A DIVISION OF

FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION DELTA EDUCATION
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price EXTENDED [ Manufacturer's fUnit Price] EXTENDED [ Manufacturer's and
PRICE and Mode! PRICE Modet Number
Number
QTY.
Group 1: ltems 1 through 17, Awarded AS Low
Unit Measure.
1 |State approved calculator, GED 2002 exam,
Casio mode! FX260, or equal 150 NO 8ID NQ BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
2 [State approved calculator,FCAT exam, Casio
mode HS5-10S, or equal 150 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
3 )Graphing Calculator: TEXAS
Texas Instruments Ti-84 Pius, or equal 568601 Tl INSTRUMENTS TI
1250 $116.73 $145,912.50]84PLUS $126.41 $158,012.50|84 PL
LOW UNIT MEASURE
4 |Graphing Calculator: Teacher kit Includes: 10
T184PLUS graphing calcutators, 10 unit to unit
cables, 10 manuals, 1 teacher guide, 1 568601EZ TI
transparency and 1 poster.‘For TIB4PLUS unit 84 PLEZ
specifications piease refer to specification under SPOT
the TIB4PLUS. 48 $1,229.04 $58,993.92{84PL/TPK/1L1 | NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
5 [JOverhead Graphing Calculator Set: includes*1
TIB4PLUSTK-TI84 PLUS Teacher Kit.Teacher Kit
includes: 10 TIB4PLUS graphing calculators, 1-
TiBAPLUS Poster, 1-transparency, 10-guidebooks,
& 10 unit to unit link cables. TIB4PLUSSLVRSSII-
View screen Package for the TIB4PLUS Sitver
Edition, 1-12HP Hard Case that holds 12
TI84PLUS Graphing Calculators,
TIB4PLUSALG1WKB Workbook Activities in
Algebra for TI84PLUS 25 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
8 )Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: Includes
Teacher pack of 10 TIB4PLUS Silver Edition
Graphing Calculators Texas Instruments
TIB4PLSILVERTP, or equal 22 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
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. R - - | . Prepared By.
GALLOWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES OM OFFICE INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. | Unit Price | EXTENDED | Manufacturer's | Unit Price | EXTENDED | Manufacturer's
PRICE and Mode! PRICE and Model
Number Number
QTy.
Group 1: ltems 1 through 17, Awarded AS Low
Unit Measwre. | 4y 4y 4} P S ] _____._..__..J
1 [State approved calculator, GED 2002 exam, H ) I
Casio model FX260, or equal 150 $10.00 $1,500.00fCasio ! $7.65 $1,147.50|Casio FX260
1 i
LOW UNIT MEASURE P _ . Svarsol H
2 fState approved calculator,FCAT exam, Casio
mode HS-10S, or equal 150 $5.00 $750.00]CASIO $7.65 $1,147.50|CASIO HS-10S
LOW UNIT MEASURE
3 |Graphing Calculator: TEXAS
Texas Instruments TI-84 Plus, or equal TEXAS INSTRUMENTS
1250 | $125.00 | $156,250.00§INSTRUMENTS $99.00 $123,750.00|T1 84 PLUS
LOW UNIT MEASURE
4 {Graphing Calculator: Teacher kit includes: 10
TI84PLUS graphing calculators, 10 unit to unit
cables, 10 manuals, 1 teacher guide, 1
transparency and 1 poster.*For TI84PLUS unit TEXAS
specifications please refer to specification under TEXAS INSTRUMENTS
the TIBAPLUS. 48 $1,239.00 $59,472.00)INSTRUMENTS $990.00 $47,520.00|T! 84 PLUSTK
LOW UNIT MEASURE R e [ P
5 1Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: Includes*1 I
TI84PLUSTK-TI84 PLUS Teacher Kit. Teacher Kit '
includes: 10 TIB4PLUS graphing calculators, 1- I
TI84PLUS Poster, 1-transparency, 10-guidebooks | i
& 10 unit to unit link cables. TIB4PLUSSLVRSSII- H
View screen Package for the TIB4PLUS Silver !
Edition, 1-12HP Hard Case that holds 12 i
TI84PLUS Graphing Calculators, | TEXAS
TIB4PLUSALGIWKB Workbook Activities in TEXAS H INSTRUMENTS
Algebra for TIB4PLUS 25 | $1,10000] $27,500.00/INSTRUMENTS ! $1,348.00 $33,700.00|T1 84-BUND2
1
LOW UNIT MEASURE o) 27550000} ... e
6 Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: Includes
Teacher pack of 10 Ti84PLUS Silver Edition Tl
Graphing Calculators Texas Instruments TEXAS TIB4PLUSSILV
TiIB4PLSILVERTP, or equal 22 $1,475.00| $32,450.00[INSTRUMENTS $1,250.00 $27,500.00|ERTP
LOW UNIT MEASURE
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ITEM

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

SCHOOL SPECIALTY

SCIENCE KIT.LLC

EST.

Unit Price

EXTENDED
PRICE

Manufacturer's
and Model
Number

Unit Price

EXTENDED
PRICE

Manufacturer'
s and Model
Number

QTYy.

Group 1: tems 1 through 17, Awarded AS Low
Unit Measure.

State approved calculator, GED 2002 exam,
Casio model FX260, or equal

150

NO BiD

Casio FX260HA

NO BID

LOW UNIT MEASURE

State approved calculator,FCAT exam, Casio
mode HS-10S, or equal

150

NO BID

CASIO H510S

NO BID

LOW UNIT MEASURE

Graphing Calculator:
Texas Instruments Tt-84 Plus, or equal

1250

$115.33

$144,162.50

T! 84 PLUS
84PL/CLM121/

$123.75

T) 84-48595-
$154,687.50{09

LOW UNIT MEASURE

Graphing Calculator: Teacher kit Includes: 10
TIB4PLUS graphing calculators, 10 unit to unit
cables, 10 manuals, 1 teacher guids, 1
transparency and 1 poster.’For TI84PLUS unit
specifications please refer to specitication under
the TI84PLUS.

48

NO BID

NO BID

LOW UNIT MEASURE

Overhead Graphing Caiculator Set: Includes®1
TIBAPLUSTK-TI84 PLUS Teacher Kit. Teacher Kit
includes: 10 TI84PLUS graphing caiculators, 1-

& 10 unit to unit link cables. TIB4PLUSSLVRSSIl-
View screen Package for the TIB4PLUS Silver
Edition, 1-12HP Hard Case that holds 12
TI84PLUS Graphing Calculators,
TI84PLUSALG1WKB Workbook Activilies in
Algebra for TIB4PLUS

TI84PLUS Poster, 1-transparency, 10-quidebooks,|

25

NO BID

NO BID

LOW UNIT MEASURE

Overhead Graphing Calculator Set: Includes
Teacher pack of 10 TI84PLUS Silver Edition
Graphing Calcuiators Texas Instruments
TIB4PLSILVERTP, or equal

22

NO BID

NO BID

LOW UNIT MEASURE
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AFP INDUSTRIES,INC. D & H DISTRIBUTING
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. UNIT} Unit Price EXTENDED |Manufacturer's and| Unit Price EXTENDED | Manufacturer's
PRICE Model Number PRICE and Mode!
Number
QTY.
7 |Graphing Calculator: 1 |
; TEXAS : TEXAS
: INSTRUMENTS Ti- & INSTRUMENTS
250 Eachl $122.72 | § 30,680.00 |89 TIANIUM 1 $122.95 $30,737.50|T1 89 TITANIUM
i ]
LOW UNIT MEASURE i . 1s _sosso00y . [ I T [
8 ITI89 Titanium Starter Classroom Bundles TEXAS H
TEXAS INSTRUMENTS |
INSTRUMENT T189 Ti 89- i
55 Set | $1,728.00 | $ 95,040.00 |TITANIUM BUND2 $1,679.3¢ $92,366.45|BUND2DADE
1
LOWUNITMEASURE | | | | I i _89236645) i
9 [Calculator-Based Laboratory: ' TEXAS
! INSTRUMENTS TI-
593 Eachi $144.44 $ 85,652.92 |CBL2 $144.64 $85,771.52
LOW UNIT MEASURE i _Is esgs2e2)
Calculator-Based Ranger: TEXAS i
INSTRUMENTS Ti- H
10 66 |cach| $81.48 |s 5,377.68 |CBE2 $81.08 $5,351.28 [
]
LOW UNIT MEASURE S | _.ssaste8l ;
Graph Link: Includes interface and software for '
11 |both Windows and Macintosh Platforms 44 Each |[NO BID DISCONTINUED
LOW UNIT MEASURE s i [ I
Biology: Accessory Laboratory Package for T184 VERNIER BIO-C2- I I
12 |Plus 24  |Each| $1,770.00 | $  42,480.00 |BLK i $58325 $13,998.00 H
i i
i i
i i
LOW UNIT MEASURE l I i B I T |
1
Physics: Accessory Laboratory Package for T184 H |
13 |Plus 24 Each| $947.00 | $ 22,728.00 |[VEBNIER PHY-CZ-[’ $525.45 $12,610.80 .
] i
i i
i i
LOW UNIT MEASURE | _st2t080) i
Chemistry: Accessory Package for TI84 Plus ' '
14 jcalculator 24 Each| $668.00 |$ 16,032.00 [VERNIER CH-C2-D1  $582.50 $13,980.00] |
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FREY SCIEBTIFIC, A DIVISION OF

FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION DELTA EDUCATION
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price EXTENDED [ Manufacturer's JUnit Price] EXTENDED | Manufacturer's and
PRICE and Mode! PRICE Model Number
Number
QTY.
7 JGraphing Calculator:
250 $150.72 $37,680.00|T! 89T 568603 | NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
8 |Ti89 Titanlum Starter Classroom Bundles
55 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
9 [Calculator-Based Laboratory:
593 $176.94 $104,925.42]565338CBL2 | NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Calculator-Based Ranger:
10 66 $109.50 $7,227.00]548889A NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Graph Link: includes interface and software for
11 |both Windows and Macintosh Platforms 44 NO BID NQ B!D
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Blology: Accessory Laboratory Package tor T184
i2 |Plus 24 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Physics: Accessory Laboratory Package for TI84
13 JPlus . 24 NO BID NO BiD
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Chemistry: Accessory Package for T184 Plus
14 |calculator 24 NO BID NO BID
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GALLOWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES

OM OFFICE INC.

ITEM DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price | EXTENDED | Manufacturer's Unit Price EXTENDED [ Manufacturer's
PRICE and Model PRICE and Model
Number Number
QTY.
7 ]Graphing Calculator:
TEXAS
250 $156.00 $39,000.00]INSTRUMENTS $127.50 $31,875.00]TI T 89T/CLM
LOW UNIT MEASURE
8 |TI89 Titanium Starter Classroom Bundies
TEXAS .
55 $2,100.00 | $115,500.00{INSTRUMENTS $1,680.00 $92,400.00{T! TI 83-BUND2
LOW UNIT MEASURE
9 [Calculator-Based Laboratory:
TEXAS
593 $183.00 $108,519.00|INSTRUMENTS $150.00 $88,950.00] Tt CBL2/PWB
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Calculator-Based Ranger:
TEXAS
10 66 $100.00 $6,600.004INSTRUMENTS $84.00 $5,544.00[TI CBL2/PWB
LOW UNIT MEASURE R s I
Graph Link: Inciudes interface and software for TEXAS
11 |both Windows and Macintosh Platforms 44 INSTRUMENTS $858.00 Tl TIGLINKUSB
LOWUNITMEASURE | IS $660.0C
Blology: Accessory Laboratory Package for T184 TEXAS
12 |Plus 24 $823.00 $19,752 00|INSTRUMENTS $157.00 $3,768.00]TI CBL 2DEL
NON
RESPONSIVE
DID NOT BID
Low un mEsURE ariems|  sazenool | J
Physics: Accessory Laboratory Package for T184 TEXAS |
13 |Plus 24 $785.00 $18,840.00{INSTRUMENTS $157.00 $3,768.00|TI CBL2DEL .
[}
NON i
RESPONSIVE I
DID NOT BID :
LOW UNIT MEASURE ALLKITITEMS|  $3,768001 .. _._.. 4
i
Chemistry: Accessory Package for T184 Plus TEXAS :
14 |calculator 24 $975.00 $23,400.00]INSTRUMENTS $157.00 $3,768.00]T| CBL2DEL 1
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SCHOOL SPECIALTY

SCIENCE KIT.LLC

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price| EXTENDED | Manufacturer's | Unit Price | EXTENDED | Manufacturer’
PRICE and Model PRICE s and Model
Number Number
QTY.
7 |Graphing Calculator:
250 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
8 |TI89 Titanium Starter Classroom Bundles
55 NG BID NQ BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
9 |Calculator-Based Laboratory: Tl
CBL2/456840
593 NO BID $170.00 | $100,810.00]7PWB
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Calculator-Based Ranger;
TI CBR2
10 66 NO BID $112.00 $7,392.00]46191-00L2
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Graph Link: includes intertace and software tor
11 jboth Windows and Macintosh Piatforms 44 NO BID NQ BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Biology: Accessory Laboratory Package for 7184
12 |Plus 24 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Physics: Accessory Laboratory Package for T184
13 |Plus 24 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Chemistry: Accessory Package for T184 Plus
14 jcalculator 24 NO BID NO BID
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AFP INDUSTRIES,INC. D & H DISTRIBUTING
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. JUNIT{ Unit Price EXTENDED | Manufacturer's and| Unit Price EXTENDED { Manufacturer's
PRICE Model Number PRICE and Model
Number
QTY.
! !
i s
i i
cowunrmeasure L 1 4 . i ] S1398000L i
! TEXAS
i INSTRUMENTS Ti-
15 |Texas Instrument-TI-Nspire hand held 1000 E@f $120.33 |$ 120,330.00 [NSPIRE $120.36 $120,360.00]
LOW UNIT MEASURE i $  120,330.00 1
.......... R A MRttt ettty by i
Ti-Nspire TM with computer Algebra System INSTRUMENTS Ti- h
16 |(CAS): 500 Each| $123.33 |§ 61,665.00 |[NSPIRE CAS $122.95 $61,475.00 !
I
LOW UNIT MEASURE . | _setarsoof . H
AR H :
INSTRUMENTS i
17 |Ti-Nspire View Screen 100 Each| $3169.88 |$% 16,988.00 NSVSH/CBKX/2LL: $168.75 $16,875.00 |
i TEXAS i
H INSTRUMENT
LOW UNIT MEASURE !_ ________ _|._516,875.00 T[\{S_E_I_FSE\{_SE__!
GROUP Il: AWARDED to one vendor-Per
Manfacturer's offering the highest percentage
discounts off Manfacluere's Retail Suggested
accessories not listed in Group 1.
18 |Brand: Caslo % Off List NO BID 1%, S&D CATALOG
Did not meet
specs, no
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
Y Y - Did not meet
i specs, no
H TEXAS MSRP
19 [Brand: Texas Instrument % Off List ' 33.00%| INSTRUMENTS 1%] submitted S&D CATALOG
|l
LLOW UNIT MEASURE i 33%
""""""" R I Did not meet
specs, no
MSRP
20 {Brand: Sharp % Off List NO BID 1%|submitted S&D CATALOG
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Did not meet
specs, no
MSRP
21 jBrand: Hewitee Packard % Off List NO BID 1%jsubmitied S&D CATALOG
LOW UNIT MEASURE — | P R _
A h ; Did not meet
: H specs, No
! I MSRP
22 |Brand: Energizer % Off List ] 33.00%] ENERGINER N 1%]|submitted S&D CATALOG
i i
i i
LOW UNIT MEASURE i e J ______________ i
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FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION

FREY SCIEBTIFIC, A DIVISION OF
DELTA EDUCATION

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price EXTENDED [ Manufacturer’s JUnit Price] EXTENDED | Manufacturer's and
PRICE and Modet PRICE Model Number
Number
QTY.
LOW UNIT MEASURE
596891 T!
NSPIRE
15 |Texas Instrument-TI-Nspire hand held 1000 $150.01 $150,010.00|NS/CLM/1L1/A | NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Ti-Nspire TM with computer Algebra System
16_}(CAS): 500 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
17 ITI-Nspire View Screen 100 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
GROUP Il: AWARDED 1o one vendor-Per
Manfacturer's offering the highest percentage
discounts off Manfactuere's Retail Suggested
accessories not listed in Group 1.
18 |Brand: Casio % Off List |[NO 8ID NO BiD
LOW UNIT MEASURE
19 |Brand: Texas Instrument % Off List [NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
20 [Brand: Sharp % Off List [NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
21 |Brand: Hewitee Packard % Off List [NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
22 (Brand: Energizer % Off List JNO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
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3 - bl Prepared By_
GALLOWAY OFFICE SUPPLIES OM OFFICE INC.
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price | EXTENDED | Manutacturer's Unit Price EXTENDED | Manufacturer's
PRICE and Model PRICE and Model
Number Number
QTY.
1
NON l
RESPONSIVE :
DID NOT BID !
LOW UNIT MEASURE AELK_lT'IEM_S ..83,768.000 ... H
Tl
TEXAS NSCAS/CUM2L
15 jTexas Instrument-TI-Nspire hand heid 1000 $153.00 | $153.000.00|INSTRUMENTS $125.00 $125,000.00}1
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Ti-Nsplre TM with computer Algebra System TEXAS
16_}{CAS): 500 $155.00 $77,500.00{INSTRUMENTS $127.50 $63,750.00) TI NS/CLM/2L 1
LOW UNIT MEASURE
TEXAS
17 |TI-Nspire View Screen 100 $214.00 $21,400.00|INSTRUMENTS $175.00 $17,500.00|NSUSH/CBX/2L
LOW UNIT MEASURE
GROUP I: AWARDED to one vendor-Per
Manfacturer's offering the highest percentage
discounts off Manfactuere's Retail Suggested
accessories not listed in Group 1.
18 f{Brand: Casio % O List 25%, 5%
Did not meet Did not meet
specs, no specs, no
MSRP MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted submitied
tg |Brand: Texas Instrument % Off List 20% 5%
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Did not meet
'specs, no
MSRP
20 |Brand: Sharp % Off List 33%|submitted 5%
Did not meet
specs, no
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
21 {Brand: Hewitee Packard % Off List 10%| 5%
LOW UNIT MEASURE
22 @Brand: Energizer % Off List 40% 5%
Did not meet
Specs, no
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
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SCHOOL SPECIALTY SCIENCE KIT.LLC
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM EST. Unit Price [ EXTENDED | Manufacturer's | Unit Price | EXTENDED [Manutfacturer'
PRICE and Model PRICE s and Mode!
Number Number
QTy.
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Ti NSPIRE
15 [Texas Instrument-T|-Nspire hand held 1000 NO BID $156.25 | $156,250.00]1761-40
LOW UNIT MEASURE
Ti-Nspire TM with computer Algebra System
16 |(CAS): 500 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
17 |TI-Nspire View Screen 100 NO BID NO BID
LOW UNIT MEASURE
GROUP if: AWARDED to one vendor-Per
Manfacturer's offering the highest percentage
discounts off Manfactuere's Retail Suggested
accessories not listed in Group 1.
18 [Brand: Casio % Off List [NO BID 15%)
Did not meet
specs, No
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
19 |Brand: Texas Instrument % Of List INO BID 15%)
LOW UNIT MEASURE
20 {Brand: Sharp % Off List INO BID 15%
Did not meet
specs, no
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
21 |Brand: Hewitee Packard % Off List |[NO BID 15%
Did not meet
specs, NO
MSRP
LOW UNIT MEASURE submitted
22 \Brand: Energizer % Off List [NO BID 15%)
LOW UNIT MEASURE
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