Bid ltems 1-12: Category Evaluation and Partial Award of M-DCPS Bid No. 054-JJ03 (MARCH 2009 - Agenda item E-143)

Est. Lace
BID ITEM/CATEGORY Qty. Foodservice

ABC Rest. Dade Rest. Edward Don FESCO Great Lakes Kamran & Co. Lee Equipment

2670 & 4670 $2,490.00

$1,977.64 . $2,714.00
Primary Awa;dee 7
| -$1,668.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 N/B $1,822.00 N/B $2,008.00 $2,290.00
Primary AWardee
. $1 ,794.50 $0.00 $0.00 N/B $1,953.00 N/B $2,140.00 $2,390.00
Primary Awardée

ltem 7

ltem 8

Item 9 Awarded to Vendors 6-7-8 ~Awardee © .
ltem 9E $200.00. $0.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00 $200.00 $216.00
ltem OF $200.00 . $85.00 $0.00

$3 410 OO $0.00 $15.3 $13,485.00 $14,067.00 $12,356.00 $11,570.00

~

-

. Item 11
11 A-E-F Awarded to Low Bid #11

. ~ITEM 11 IS UNDER EVALUATION AND WILL BE AWARDED AT A FUTURE BOARD MEETING :
ltem 11A $671 .OO $800.00 $231.00 $1,095.00 $9286.00 $748.44
Item 11E[ 1 $450.00 $175.00 $575.00 $1,050.00 $0.00 $676.00
item 11F| 1 $250.00 $300.00 $180.00 $75.00 $350.00

em 16 $3,451.00 . $3,327.00 N/B $3,616.00 N/B

ltem 17| 10 $819.00 $0.00 $860.00 N/B $1,005.00 N/B $795.00 $815.00
ltem 18| 15 $290.00 $0.00 $356.00 N/B $485.00 N/B $283.00 $320.00
Item 19 Awarded to Vendors 16-17-18 6-19 AR DER A ATION AND WILL BE AWARDED AT A FUTURE BOAR
ltem 19E 1 $200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ltem 18F $35 OO $1OO 00 $0.00

a
%ﬁ
|

N 2 S

“ltem 20-Hourly al

ltem 20A
ltem 20B

$0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $95.00 $95.00
$75.00 $0.00 $95.00 $0.00 $95.00 $85.00

$95.00
e ~

10-50%

e SRR 3 YR R e S BTN
NO ENTRY Bid item left Blank - PRIMARY
NR-No ID  [Non-Responsive: Sample received, but not properly identified - $31,200.00
NR-No Sample|Non-Responsive: No Sample submitted for alternate item PRIMARY  ALTE
NR-Qual Bid |Non-Responsive: Qualified bid with terms contrary to Special Conditions AWARDEE AWARDEE
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Bid Items 22-23: Individual Item Evaluation and Partial Award of M-DCPS Bid No. 054-JJ03 (MARCH 2009 - Agenda Item E-1 43)
Est. - Lace .
BID ITEM/CATEGORY Qy. ABC Rest. Dade Rest. Edward Don FESCO Great Lakes Kamran & Co. Foodservice Lee Equipment
ltem 22| 2 $2,598.00 $4,628.00 | g5 300,00 9.00 $4.505.00 | $2365.00 | g5 39999
Itern 22E-22F Award to Low Bid #22 (e
item 22E] 1 $0.00 $0.00 $164.22 $0.10 $400.00 $161.00 $0.00 $0.00
ltem 22F| 1 $100.00 $150.00 $75.00 $50.00 5100.00 $150.QO v $85.00 $0.00 _
' ltem 23] 1 NOBID |  $0.00 BSXITYT NO BID $3,062.00 $2,930.00 | $2.953.00 | $2.99500
Item 23E.23F Award to Low Bid #23 . Awardee
ltem 23E 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item 23F| 1 . NO BID $150.00 00 $100.00 $150.00 $85.00 $0.00
N SR % RN AR % 3 3 2 AR A 3 SRR X R S R R R N R T R S R O TR e
ltem 24| 5 $9,373.00 $0.00 $12,632.00 $8,6830.00 $8,369.00 $13,856.00 00 $8,910.00
ltem 24E-24F Award to Low Bid #24 ardec
ltem 24E| 1 $0.00 $170.00 $450.00 $0.00 $0.00
ltem 24F] 1 $100.00 $300.00 $75.00 $200.00 $400.00 $85.00 $0.00
N s S B BTy O N I e ey O VAU A o e TN N A T T 5 Rt D D
Item 25 1 NO BID $0.00 528.00 NO BID $12,601.00 $11,258.00 $11,235.00 $11,240.00
ltem 25E-25F Award to Low Bid #25 Awardee
ltem 25E] 1 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ltem 25F| 1 NO BID $300.00 DO $300.00 $400.00 - $85.00 $0.00
% % 1 X S 5 % 3 AN SRS DA DNANIEAE SR X R S SR B g D A Y SN
item 26] 25 $5,025.00 $0.00 $5,138.24 $3,872.00 $3,811.00 $4,875.00 $4,026.00 $4,710.00
Item 26E-26F Award to Low Bid #26 : DER ALUATION AND B ARDED AT.A RE BOARD
ltem 26E] 1 $0.00 $0.00 $330.00 $1.00 $400.00 $310.00 $0.00 $0.00
Item 26F $100.00 $100.00 $75.00 $200.00 $80.00 $85.00 $0.00
RGN A L R TR T ISR AR SRR R RN SRS
ftem 27-Preparation Equipment B ' 0.30 Awardee - RSN
Discount off MSRP listed price 50%
e e A § =
KEY TO TABLE; == PRIMARY.
Non-Responsive: Sample received, but not properly identified £.$31,200.00
NR-No Sample|Non-Responsive: No Sample submitted for alternate item PRIMARY ALTERNATE
NR-Qual Bid |Non-Responsive: ualiﬁd .‘ with terms contrary to Specil Conditions AWARDEE AWARDEE
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