Prepared By: R. Tyndall

Verified By: J. Br%

M-0CPS

Bid# 046-J402
Custodiat Cleanina Eauioment

Est | A Plus Vacuum Corp. [ Dade Paper Ideal Supgly It RP.S_ Corporation 1l o Ghromical
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA| UNIT|fops s Yo Pree a8 wosss untpree o P ot 8 votss o pres ot proe et & et oot pocs o preo a3 vooni_
e T ing, polishing and carpet shampoo machine with 207 pad size.
... . Clark. Advance Pacesetter
1 125 | Eaen| sti2rso s140937.500° T MO gpnean snismooqiie, $1,050.00  $131,250.00 fCFP2000DS 30.00NO BID $928.79 $116,087.5020TS with
he Part #01430A Atachments
Approved Brands: F10-20
Powr Flite PSY00
BC wit
battery/charger- WINDSOR Tomcat walk 4\;];:::;,;;/;5—102248
2 |[Walk behind sweeper, battery powered, self-propelied, 5 | Each $3,099.00 $15,495.00 Does not meet $5,252.66  $26,263.3Q 1.351-114.0 $0.00No Bid $4,758.51 $23,792.55| behind $3.985.30¢ $19.929.1 wibatieries and on
specs. - No e sweeper 34 board charger
OSHA approved 8
certification
Advance Terrs 132B or Kent -Euroclean/ Kent Biue 32 equal.
[Sweeper, manual, push powered, sweeps approximately 26-inch swath, adjustable 'WINDSOR Advance Select
broom with side brush. Minimum 1.4 cubic f. bin/hopper capacity Equipmment to be 10 || Each $499.00 $4,990.00 Powr Flite PS 200| $523.94 $5,239Asq 1517-104 $0.00{ No Bid 30.00|NO BiD $586.27 $5,862. 7 Sweep
el - and 517-
’ Advance Select Sweep or Kent Select Sweep 27"or Tennant 110 or egual
- Powr Flite PAS Clarke C!.arke 05331A) Adva.m.:e Adfinity
¥lIScrubber, floor. 30 || Each|| $4,499, $134,970.001 20 BABC $3,063.75  $91,912.5 053314 - $3,415.00  $102,450.00 With Pad $3,352.9¢ $100,588.80 $3,380.¢ $101,400.00(20st with prolene
i Driver And brush,
Prolie Brush Tom Cat
Mini 20d Wh
Scrubber
[Advance Automatic Scrubber Model BA-5321 or Kent Razor 20B equal.
B Clarke I
. N Powr Flite PFX Clarke 56266000C]ean| Advance Aquaciean
. 5+||Carpet extractor, self-contained 20 || BEach|| $1,699.00 $33,980.00 9005 $1,367.06  $27,341.20 156266000 - $1,525.00 $30,500.00 Track 16 W $0.00/NO BID SL&IL”‘ $32,243.4 65T
pad driver
Advance Model Aquaclean 16ST or Windsor Admirat or
Minuteman Ambassador or equal
Clarke Focus Tomeat
Clarke 1053914 Magnum Advasice
; oDsjegs 1;\0 : :;;m padd ror ?fﬂgcmbbzr 1 Convertamatic 28-D
B ; iver and Pol o Browart ; .
6 |scruber, industrial. s || Bacn| sosvad 3000007 FHPAS | gsgaasq 520,72 50kmeerspecs | $6.470.00)  $32,350.00 Brushss. - $5850.10  $29,250.50 or Dade $6.869.47 $34.347.39 ‘c“hf“:;ef ‘;‘agi‘::l‘e "
26" cleaning Does not meet County '
th. Bid - and 2 prolene
path. Bi R specs - 26 approved brushes #56-505-804
requires 28’ cleaning path. Service
Bid requires Facility listed
28" as required
Advance Convertamatic 28D or equal
Clarke
014004 - Clacke CFP
Powr Flite M201 Does not 2000 #01400A Advance 01460A
7 ||Floor machite, rotary, general purpose. 25 || Eachl| $1,150.00 $28,750.00 30 : $511.92)  $12,798.0(|meet specs $650. $16,250.00 Does pot meet $0.00 NO BID $677.50 $16,937.50 Pacesetter 20SD
N 1.5 HP, bid spocs 1.5 HP, w/Pad bolder
Tequires bid requites
1.758P L7SHP
(Advance Pacesetter 2008D or equal.
Pacific Mini Pacific Mini O(J Pacific Mini Edger
8 [[Base Board Scrubbing Machine, eleetric 50 |Each|  $799.00  $39.950.00Powr Fliic P1313]  $237.60  $11.880.00) 15, $320.00  $16,000.00 Edger as $0.00 NO BID $370. $18,500,00 ME-6 #515451 w/
specified brush & pad holdet
Pacific Mini Edger or Equal J
"No Touch” Restraom Cleaning System to include ruinimum 50* power cord, minimum
25' vacuum hose, spray gun with minimum 50' spray line, squeegee tool. vacuum
wand, blower with blower hose and nozzle tool, dmin dump hose, minimum 19 gallon )
g |[recovery tank. Equipment to be defivered unpacked and demonstrated. 25 | Each .00 NO BID $2,607.75  $65.193.79 YVO‘I(‘)‘;*;; so| $319000  879.750.00 Kaivas 1750 $0.00NO BID $3,050.1 §76,252.5 éxi:::c: Reel
|Pressure
hose only
[Must be capable of using M-DCPS approved chemieals. Minimum one year warranty = lfmg’ Bﬁ
requires 50"
(parts aud labor)
Kaivac No Touch Cleaning System or Advance Reel Cleaner or Equal
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M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02

Custodial Cieanina Eauioment

EST. L Quality Chemicat 1 Cosarave Enterprises I Minuteatan ilernalions Il Gloaning Equipmat Suply
OESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA UNIT |funt s orm Pce it 5 Moder _|[uns Proa ot e Josnut & ot prea ot e o 8 Mot _JJune P ovs e a3 o
»iMul 7 bbing, polishing and carpet shampoo machine with 20" pad size.
L Minuteman
8 . . Int. Advance
l 125 || Bach $0.00 No Bid 500(1 No Bid $1,266.25]  $158,281.25) FR20L15.25 $2,600.000  $325,000.00 Manador
Phas
- attachments
/Approved Brands: F10-20
Miputeman
OJ ‘XJ int KS25W -
y : y Advance . Does not Advance
2 || Walk behind sweeper, battery powered, self-propelled, 5 | Each| 4,300, $24,500.00' 11 $0.00{ No Bid $1,137.5 35.687.50 20% e $5.50000  $27.300.00( VT
cleaning
path is only
25" - bid
requires 32"
Advance Terra 132B or Kent -Euroclean/ Kent Blue 32 equal.
Sweeper, manual, push powered, sweeps approximately 26-inch swath, adjustable j (xJ Mizuterazn Advanee
g P o ) L N . .
3 br?_om w,nh sxde‘ bl?xsa:\d l.'f cubic ft. capacity o be 10 | Bach $725. $7,250.00) Advance $0.00 No Bid $437.50 $4,375.00 Int HM27M $820. $8,200.00 Select Swe"ﬂ
[Advance Select Sweep or Kent Select Sweep 27"or Tennant 110 or equal
Advance Kent Razor x:ﬂ e Kent Razor
||Scrubber, floor. 30 || Each $5.080.001 $152,400.00 Adfinity $3,497.000  $13,988.00 $3,555.001  $106,650.004 $5.300.000  $159,000.00)
20 E20BDQP 20B/T
X20C
plus brushes
Advance Autematic Scrubber Model BA-5321 or Kent Razor 208 equal,
. st Admocs
5 || Carpet extractor, selfcontained 20 || Eack $1,800.00 $36,000.00 Advance $0.00 No Bid $1,627.00 $32,540.00 Int C46000~ $2,400.00 $48,000.00 Aquaclean
0 16ST
Advance Model Aquaclean 165T or Windsor Admiral or
Minnteman Ambassador or equal
E EI0QP with Advance
6 ||Scrubber, industrial. 5 || Each $7,300.00 $36,500.001 Advance $0.0( No Bid $7,083.75 $35,418.75) brushes : $9,600.001 $48,000.00 Convertamat
. ic 28D
Advance Convertamatic 28D or equal
Minuteman
FR20115 -
Does not Advance
7 |[Floor machine, rotary, general purpose. 25 || Bach $925. $23,125.00 Advance $0.00No Bid $672. 316.800.0& meet specs - $1,200.00 $30,000.00 Paceswiter
1.5 ¥P, bid 208D
requires
1.75HP
Advance Pacesetter 2008D or equal.
" N " " - Pacific Mini
8 Base Board Scrubbing Machine, electric 50 [ Each $0.000NC BID $0.00{ No Bid 30.0(1 No Bid $315.00) $15,750.001 Gdger
Pacific Mini Edger or Equal J
"No Touch” Restroom Cleaning System to include minimum 50° power cord, minimum
25" vacuum hose, spray gun with minimum 50" spray line, squeegee tool, vacuum Kaivac N
wand, blower with blower bose and nozzle tool, drain dump hose, minimum 19 gatlon KV2150 - Minuteman
9 [[recavery tank, Equipment (o be delivered unpacked and demonsirated. 25 ||Bach]  $3.300.00  $82.500.00 $2.789.00  $69,725.00 Vendor shi000  $78,250.00"% $4.000.00 100,000,000V
TRS14115Q Reel Cleans)
could not ‘1
P
honot
warranty
Must be capable of using M-DCPS$ approved chemicals. Minimum one year warrenty requirements|
(pants and labor)
[Kalvac No Touch Cleaning System or Advance Reel Cleaner or Equal
L0
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