Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02
Custodial Cleaning Equipment

EST. A Plus Vacuum Corp, Dade Paper
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA UNIT lunit price Totad Price Menut & Model lunit Price Total Price [Manut & Model it Prics ot Price Manuf & Model
Multipurpose scrubbing, polishing and carpel shampoo machine with 20" pad size. -
TEST
Powr Flite M202 Clarke Clark
1 125 | Eachjj $1,127.50] $140,937.50 $934.48) $116,810.00 $1,050.00, #CFP2000DS
3 ! 01430A
Part #01430A
Approved Brands: F10-20
Powr Flite PS900
BC wit
battery/charger- WIND SOR
Walk behind sweeper, battery powered, self-propelled - AWARD 5 [lEachfi $3,099.00{  $15,495.00|Does not meet 35,252.66;  $26,263.30) 1.351-114.0 No Bid
specs. - No . :
OSHA approved
certification
Advance Terra 132B or Kent -Euroclean/ Kent Biue 32 equal,
. WINDSOR .
3 |ISweeper, manual, push powered - TEST 10 || Each $499.00) 3$4,990.00| Powr Flite PS 200} $523.98] $5,239.80 1.517-104 No Bid
Advance Select Sweep or Kent Select Sweep 27"or Tennant 110 or equal
. ' Clarke Clarke 053314
. Powr Flite PAS iy
4 JIScrubber, floor. - TEST 30 |iEachll $4,499.000 $134,970.00) $3,063.75]  $91,912.50105331A - $3,415.00 With Pad
20 BABC - ;
TEST Driver And
Proline Brush
Advance Automatic Scrubber Model BA-5321 or Kent Razor 208 equal.
Powr Flite PFX Clarke ?égrél?ooom
§ |[Carpet extractor, self-contained 20 [{Eachll $1,699.00,  $33,980.00 $1,367.06]  $27,341.20156266000 - $1,525.00 ea
9005 TEST n Track 16 w
- pad driver
Advance Model Aquaclean 16ST or Windsor Admiral or
Minuteman Ambassador or equal
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Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02
Custodial Cleaning Equipment

EST. A Plus Vacuum Corp, Dade Paper Ideal Supply
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUAUNITjusit prce Total Prico Manuf & Model Uit Price Yotat Price M & Model lunit Price Total Price Manuf & Modet
Clarke Focus
Powr Flite PAS Clarke 1 05391A
6 [iScrubber, industrial. - TEST 5 | Each| $6,999.00  $34,995.00 $5,834.50,  $29,172.50[05391A - $6,470.00f  $32,350.00| With pad
28BxBc N
TEST driver and
Poly Brushes
Advance Convertamatic 28D or equal
Powr Flite M201- J Clarke Clarke CEP
7 IFloor machine, rotary, general purpose. - TEST 25 [ Eachjl $1,150.00 $28,750.00 $511.92)  $12,798.0001400A - $650.00,  $16,250.00} 2"
3 IPEST 2000 #01400A
Advance Pacesetter 200SD or equal.
. . . . Pacific Mini
ase Board Scrubbing Machine, electric - AWARD 50 |{ Each $799.00;  $39,950.00{Powr Elite P131-3 $237.60] $ll,880.0q . . $320.00  $16,000.00
Pacific Mini Edger as
515451 specified
Pacific Mini Edger or Equal
"No Touch” Restroom Cleaning System - AWARD
Windsor
25 || Each $0.00|NO BID $2,607.75|  $65,193.791-:007-056.0- g3 190,00/  $79,750.00|Kaivac 1750
UL CSA
Approved??
Does not
- meet specs
Must be capable of using M-DCPS approved chemicals. Minimum one year warranty 25" pressure
(parts and labor) hose, specs
: . requires0’
Kaivac No Touch Cleaning System or Advance Reel Cleaner or Equal
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M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02
Custodial Cleaning Equipment

Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

EST. R.P.S. Corporation Rex Chemical Quality Chemical
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA || UNIT [luntt Prico Total Price Manut & Model __lunit Price Total Price Manuf & Modat Unit Price Total Price Manuf & Model

 S—
ﬁ-“-Multipurpose scrubbing, polishing and carpet shampoo machine with 20" pad size. -
TEST

Advance Pacesetter
1 125 || Each $0.00{NO BID $928.70) $116,087.50|20TS with $0.00jNo Bid
Attachments -TEST

Approved Brands: F10-20

Advance #56~
: Tomeat wal 102248 Terra 1328 Advance
Walk behind sweeper, battery powered, self-propelled - AWARD 5 | Each $4,758.51 $23,792.55|behind $3,985.80 $19,929.00) wibatteries and on $4,300.00, $21,500.00 132B
sweeper #34
board charger
Advance Terra 132B or Kent -Euroclean/ Kent Blue 32 equal.
3 |lSweeper, manual, push powered - TEST 10 | Bach $0.00]NO BID $586.27 $5.862.70 g“g;’:;‘“ Select §725.00  $7,250.00{Advance
Advance Select Sweep or Kent Select Sweep 27"or Tennant 110 or equal
Advance Adfinity Advance
4 IScrubber, floor. - TEST 30 || Each $3,352.96]  $100,588.80) Tom Cat $3,380.004 $101,400.00{20st with prolene $5,080.00f  $152,400.00}Adfinity
Mini 20d brush. - X20C
Wb
Scrubber
Advance Autematic Scrubber Model BA-5321 or Kent Razor 20B equal.
5 |Carpet extractor, self-contained - TEST 20 | Bach $0.00{NO BID $1,612.17 $32,243.d0f feanee Aduackean | gy eo0 00| $36,000.00Advance
Advance Model Aquaclean 16ST or Windsor Admiral or
Minuteman Ambassador or equal
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Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02
Custodial Cleaning Equipment

EST,| R.P.S. Corporation Rex Chemical Quality Chemical
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA JUNIT|lunit rice Total Price Manut & Model __[lurnit Price Tota Price Manut & Modsl funit Price Totet Price Manuf & Model
Advance
Convertamatic 28-D
Tomcat . .
Magnum includes batteries,
6 |[Scrubber, industrial, - TEST 5 [ Each $5,850.10 $29,250.50 30DgScrubbe $6.869.47 $34,347.35|charger, pad holders| $7,300.00 $36,500.00 Advance
r ' and 2 prolene
brushes #56-505-
804
Advance Convertamatic 28D or equal
Advance 01460A
7 |{Floor machine, rotary, general purpose. - TEST 25 || Each $0.00|NO BID $677.50) $16,937.50{ Pacesetter 208D $925.00{ - $23,125.00} Advance
w/Pad holder
Advance Pacesetter 200SD or equal.
Pacific Mini Edger
Base Board Scrubbing Machine, electric - AWARD 50 |f Each $0.00|NO BID $370.00f $18,500.00{ME-6 #515451 w/ $0.00{NO BID
: brush & pad holder
Pacific Mini Edger or Equal
_||"No Touch" Restroom Cleaning System - AWARD
Advance Reel
25 | Each $0.00{NO BID $3,050. 10 $76,252.50) $3,300.00 $82,500.00
Cleaner
“Must be capable of using M-DCPS approved chemicals. Minimum one year warranty
(parts and labor)
|[Kaivac No Touch Cleaning System or Advance Reel Cleaner or Equat
?
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Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02

Custodial Cleaning Equipment

EST| Cosgrove Enterprises Minuteman international Cleaning Equipmnt Supply
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA | UNIT]luni price Total Prics Manut & Model lunit Price Yotal Prics Manuf & Model __{lunit Price Totst Price Manuf & Modol
_-"Mullipurpose scrubbing, polishing and carpet shampoo machine with 20" pad size. -
TEST Minuteman
Int, Advance
1 125 {| Each $0.00{No Bid $1,266.25| $158,281.25[FR20115-25]] $2,600.00) $325,000.00
Plus Matador
attachments
Approved Brands: F10-20
; Minuteman
Int KS25W -
Does not
) . meet specs- Advance
Walk behind sweeper, battery powered, self-propelled - AWARD 5 |i Each $0.00|No Bid $1,137.50 $5,687.50 cleaning $5,500.00 $27,500.00, Terra 132B
path is only
25" - bid
requires
32"
B Advance Terra 132B or Kent -Euroclean/ Kent Bhue 32 equal.
Minuteman . Advance
3 jSweeper, manual, push powered - TEST 10 |i Bach $0.00{No Bid $437.50] $4,375.00{Int HM27TM $820.00) $8,200.00|Select
TEST Sweep
Advance Select Sweep or Kent Select Sweep 27"or Tennant 110 or equal
Minuteman
4 |Scrubber, floor. - TEST 30 [|Eachli $3,497.00] $13,988.00|Kent Razor 20 $3,555.00 $106,650.00/™ $5,300.00{  $159,000.00]Kent Razor
’ ’ B T et TN E20BDQP e TTT208/T
plus brushes
Advance Automatic Scrubber Model BA-5321 or Kent Razor 20B equal.
Minuteman ac(l)\(/;x;ce
5 liCarpet extractor, self-contained - TEST 20 | Each $0.00{No Bid $1,627.00[  $32,540.00{Int C46000- || $2,400.00 $48,000.00] Aquac]
00 quaclean
165T
Advance Model Aquaclean 16ST or Windsor Admiral or ‘
Minuteman Ambassador or equal
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Prepared By: R. Tyndall
Verified By: J. Bradley

M-DCPS
Bid# 046-JJ02

Custodial Cleaning Equipment

EST, Cosgrove Enterprises Minuteman International Cleaning Equipmnit Supply
DESCRIPTION OF ITEM QUA I UNIT flunit price Yolas Price Manuf & Model it Price Total Price Manuf & Model _flunit price Totat Price Manuf & Modet
E30QP with ' Advance
6 ||Scrubber, industrial. - TEST 5 | Each $0.00{No Bid $7,083.75] $35,418.75 brushes $9,600.00 $48,000.00{ Convertamal|
- e 28D
Advance Convertamatic 28D or equal
Minuteman
o e
7 lIFloor machine, rotary, general purpose. - TEST 25§ Bach $0.00{No Bid $788.25) $19,706.25 $672 $1,200.00 $30,000.00f Pacesetter
s 208D
Without
Attachments
Advance Pacesetter 200SD or equal.
. . . ’ . . Pacific Mini
Base Board Scrubbing Machine, electric - AWARD 50 §j Each $0.00|No Bid $0.00{No Bid $315.00} $15,750.00 Edger
Pacific Mini Edger or Equal
.+ J|"No Touch” Restroom Cleaning System - AWARD
% Kaivac
KV2150 - Minuteman
e Does not meet, Int Advance
9: 25 {{Eachy $2,789.00| $69,725.00|spec. Vendor $3,130.00]  $78,250.00 TRS14115Q 3$4,000.00 $100,000.00] Ree! Cleaner
cannot honor P
warranty
requirements
[Must be capable of using M-DCPS approved chemicals. Minimum one year warranty
(parts and labor)
Kaivac No Touch Cleaning System or Advance Reel Cleaner or Equal
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