Bid Items 1-12: Category Evaluation and Award of M-DCPS Bid No. 039-HH03

- Est. All Florida Calico Dade Paper & Interboro Lace Shore
BID ITEM/CATEGORY Qty. AGE Paper Paper Industries Bag Cpo. Packaging Foodservice Sam Tell Distribution
16 oz. Drink Cup- Item 1| 2000 $36.60 $30.53 NO BID $46.80 NO BID $37.08 NO BID NO BID
16 oz. Plastic Lid- Item 2 800 $33.99 $48.42 NO BID $43.67 NO BID $34.59 NO BID NO BID
8 oz. Drink Cup-ltem 3 600 $37.56 $41.68 NO BID $48.13 NO BID $37.84 NO BID NO BID
8 oz. Plastic Lid-ltem 4 300 $54.90 $20.40 NO BID $74.83 NO BID $55.05 NO BID NO BID
Cups Category- Items 1 to 4| TOTAL Under Evaluation-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meetmg
Total Est. § of items 14 >>>| BID | $139,398.00 | $130,924.00 | - ] $179863.00 | ] $141,051.00 | )
4 o0z. Plastic Container-Item 5| 9000 $31.68 $32.11 NO BID $34.80 $62.67 NO BID NO BID
4 oz. Plastic Lid-Item 6] 7500 $24.10 $24.40 NO BID $26.44 $47.90 NO BID NO BID
5 oz. Plastic Container-ltem 7| 7000 $38.38 $38.83 NO BID $42.08 $79.78 NO BID NO BID
5 oz. Plastic Lid-ltem 8| 7000 $27.55 $30.06 $51.88 NO BID NO BID
Containers Cat.- items 5 to 8] TOTAL ZHIT\331 = % ' NOBID | NOBID
Total Est. $ of Items 5-8 >>>| BID 1 $1,016,480.00 1 $1,844,900.00 S
Oblong Pan-2.25 Ib.- ltem 8| 400 $62.90 $48.68 NO BID $57.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.46
Oblong Heavy Lid- Item 10| 400 $23.60 $17.99 NO BID $21.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.62
Pans Cat. - Items 9 and 10 B E NR-QualBid | NO'BID: PRIMAR NO. NO: ' NR-No ID
Total Est. § of items 9-10 >>> $26,668.00 L 62000 ¢ e i $32,832.00
Medium Disposable Gloves-Item 11 2000 $42.98 $35.27 NO BID $58.10 $3.50 $12.54 $28.50 NO BID
Large Disposable Gioves-ltem 12| 3500 $42.98 $35.27 NO BID $58.10 $3.30 $12.54 $27.50 NO BID
Gloves Cat.- items 11 and 12| TOTAL Under Evaluatlon-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meeting.
Total Est. $ of ltems 11-12>>>] BID | $236,390.00 | $193,985. 00 | : 1 $319,550.00 | $18,550.00 | $68,970.00 | $153,250.00 |

KEY TO TABLE:

NO Bid

NR-No ID

NR-No Sample

NR-Qual Bid

Reviewed by G. Lee- Dept. Stores and Distribution
Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management Services
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| Bid Item left blank or no bid submitted for item
Non-Responsive: Sample received, but not properly identified
Non-Responsive: No Sample submitted for alternate item

Non-Responsive: Qualified bid with terms contrary to Special Conditions

PRIMARY
$31,200.00
PRIMARY
AWARDEE

“ALTERNATE
AWARDEE

Bid Evaluation 09/11/2008
Summary




Bid Items 13-23: Individual Item Evaluation and Award of M-DCPS Bid No. 039-HH03

ITEM 18: TIE BID >>

Reviewed by G. Lee- Dept. Stores and Distribution
Prepared by R. Johnson- Procurement Management Services

NR-Qual Bid

Est. All Florida Calico Dade Paper & Interboro Lace Shore
BID ITEM/CATEGORY Qty. AGE Paper Paper Industries Bag CF:) Packaging Foodservice Sam Tell Distribution
Food Pail- Item 13 Under Evaluatlon-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meeting.
Price per Evaluation Unit $69.98 $32 26 | i $3024 | i pE G el
Smoothie Cup- ltem 14 150 PRIMAR ACTERNAT NO BID NQ BID NQ BID NO BlD NO BID
Price per Evaluation Unit $50.4 bgj $56.00
Lunch Bag- ltem 15 700 PRIMAR Alternate Under Evaluation- Awardee to be determined and recommended at a future board meeting.
Price per Evaluation Unit B( $36.42 | S J $40.48 [ D F $37.36 J J
Aluminium Foil- ltem 16| -, Under Evaluatlon-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meetlng
Price per Evaluation Unit $31.80 l $34.68 I $42.04 r $15.50 J """ ] $31.45 J f $41.80
12" Roll Plastic Wrap- ltem 17} Under Evaluation-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meeting.
Price per Evaluation Unit $11.89 $11.70 $12.91 $13.32 GrEen $11.89 $13.99 $15.17
18" Roll Plastic Wrap- Item 18 2000 TACTERNATE] NO BID PRIMARY
Price per Evaluation Unit $7.99 $8.23 $8.85 $8.88 $7.99 $11.25 $12.48
Pan Liner- Item 19} .00 Under Evaluation-Awardee(s) to be determined and recommended at future board meeting.
Price per Evaluation Unit $43.52 $45.64 J $32.24 I $47.70 J ] $45.48 J $37.50 I
Dry/Waxed Paper- ltem 20 600 PRIMARY Alternate Under Eva/uat/on Awardee to be determ/ned and recommended at a future board meet/ng
Price per Evaluation Unit $41.60 : a $4663 | i
Small Napkin- ltem 21 800 NO BID PRIMARY NO BID NO BID
Price per Evaluation Unit $36.34 $30.89
Wiper Cloth- Item 22 2000 NO BID PRIMARY NGO BID NO BID
Price per Evaluation Unit A ‘ $29.84 $11.90 $31.88
Balance of Line- ltem 23 o, NO ENTRY NO ENTRY | Calico Catalog| No Brand Listed Int NO BID NO ENTRY Durable
Discount off MSRP listed price] 0% 0% 0% (Crossed-thru) TBD
KEY TO TABLE: NO Bid/Entry |Bid Item left blank or no bid submitted for item PRIMARY
NR-No ID |Non-Responsive: Sample received, but not properly identified $41.60 hd4.
NR-No Sample| Non-Responsive: No Sample submitted for alternate item PRIMARY  ALTERNATE

Non-Responsive: Qualified bid with terms contrary to-Special Conditions AWARDEE AWARDEE

Primary AWARD given to Lace Foodeservice Corp., in accordance with Board Rule for Identical Prices, Priorities for Award.
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Summary
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