Prepared by H. Eschbach

Vesifiod by E. Gifiam €.

BID PROPOSAL FORM (FO T B
B Harry Eschbach

The Schoot Board of hums-Dade County, Flonaa

B Mo, 018- 104
Networt Connectivity

NETWORK CONNECTIVITY DEVICES

ATC inter,

“AT&Y CORP.

*Computer Asset Managemaent,

(NO-RESPONSIVE Inc. (NON- Digital '""'L'“'"“ Sysiems Graybar Insight Public Sector, Inc. JOL Technologles, Inc.
3 ) RESPONSIVE} orp.
Comments or Comments or Comments or Commantsa or Comments or Commants or Commenis or
Manutacturer/Part Number Unil Price Manufacturer || Unit Price| Manufacturer Unit Prica | Manufscturer Unit Price | Manufacturer | Unit Price | Manufacturer | Unit Price | Manufachirer | Unlt Price | Manufacturer
Part g Part ¥ Part® Part ¥ Part# Part % Part #
*AT&T Corp.(NON- | *Computar Asset Ma n Digital Intellegence Systams 7
Group 1 item 1a and 1b will ba used to datarmine vendor ranking and ATC INTER. RESPOn sr(vz) ln:"(NBN_R‘ESPD":g;'E’)' t Li c.:m. Graybar Insight Public Sector, Inc. JDL Technologies, Inc.
wrad.
1 APC
a APC BK 500 BACK-UPS CS $28.29 $99.00 BKS00 Sl Na:Eic 110,93 BKS00 NaBid No i
n APC Sman-UPS 1000VA 85012 $408, # SUA1000 et Mo, B SUA 1000 Ha'Sid No B
Tolal [ No Bi No Bi
*Computer Asset Management, |
*ATLT CORP, Digital Intellegenca Systems »
Group 2 ltem 2a tivough 2) will bo sed to determine vendor ranking {NON RESPONSIVE) Inc. (NON- Dail Marketing, L.P. A c‘:m ey Graybar Inaight Public Sector, nc. JOL Technologies, Inc.
[and award. RESPONSIVE)
1 CISCO SYSTEMS
1,571.85 4,390.88| CiCSO2651:m No Bid| 1.500.48 1,691.05 1,472.05 No Bid
2a CISCO2611
i CISCO2821 74536 No Bid o Bid 2,356.48 253591 2.798.05 No Bid
630.00 No 8id 605,00 677.78 590.00) Mo Bid
l2e WIC-1D8U-T1.V2 676.00
A No Big| 2.900.98 2.820.08 No Bid|
N 7504850
2 WS-CI5606-24T5-§ 4,728.68 groptecamenn; 3,249.91
_J_u'z_aa t A No Bid 4,836.98 4,717.05 No Bid|
20 WS-CIS0G4ETS-S * = 267.26| ws-Gsesam 5.418.87
097.50 A wscasoares | No Bid 3,626.98 4.063.27) 3,577.05, No Bid
2 WS-CIS60E-24TD-§ 569.92| ciscoezr
azas00|' ; 941.65 No Bid o Bidt opads|  X21OCEL 508 852.05 Mo Bid|
29 X2-10G8-LRM 3 - - Ve :
3 ) WS-CI750G- y
1 Eca7506.24T-8 2.167.50 3,775.85 No Bid| o Bid| 4.534.48] Serss] 408127 3,537.08, o Bid
A No Bid| 7,256 98 7,077.05 No Bid
2 ‘WSrCJSGO-A&TD-S 237.12| PvR-282-51-AC% 8,129.94)
A o Bid 7.253.95, 7.074.10 No Bid
WS-CI560G48TSE o Bid| 8,126.56
Total 335,785.80| $39,072.83 $34,011.50 J




Prepared by H. Eschbach

The 50h00i Bossd of Maami-Dade County, Flonas
Verified by E. Gifiam

Bad Mo, D13 1304
Network Concactivity Devices

*Computer Asset Management,
. P. hal Intelt Symt
Group 3 lem 38 tivough 36 wil ba ured 1o daiemine vendor ranking ATC INTER. (No:-‘n‘r-:tsigzs:m nc. (NON- Dol Markating, Lp, | DiohaInte e Symiems Graybar Inaight Public Sector, inc. |  JDL Technologlas, In.
o award RESPONSIVE) -
3 FORTINET 1 4]
a ) 065 Na BIJ No Bi No Bi No Bid No BI% No Bﬁ No Bid
w Softwars (8o Part & No Bl No 55 No Bid No 8id| Noﬁ No B% Mo Bid
No Bid Ne aic{ No Bid No Bid No El% No By
3¢ Software (No Part
i | ] 1 | 1
"Computer Asset Management, ;
*AT&T CORP. Hegence
Group 4 lem 4a tvough 4 will ba Lsed to datemine vendor ranking ATC INTER. (NON-RESPONSIVE} Inc. (NON- Dell Markating, Lp, | D'@italInte! iy Systema Graybar Insight Public Sector, Inc. JDL Technologles, Inc.
and award, RESPONSIVE] N
4 HEWLETT PACKARD —‘
i Ciia 943.75 No Bid 80184 an No ud No B No Bid No bid 672.00
2,368.74 No 8 1,736.80) No bid| ) No Bid Nobid 1455,
4b 148208 J48208 No Bi
iiia 296.25 No Bé 80184 00010 N bid] o B No Bid No bi 672,00
4d 145488 5.% No B‘A% 5,053.36 48488 Na did| No aid No Bkt No bid 4,361.00
] j4888C - - - J4858B 1S
o Ty 150.7:4 No BA 269.5974% No bid| o Bid No Bid No bidt 26700 150 e
) J9064A -
i N 148375 No i 2198560 0 ot No bid No Bid No Bid No bid 3.199.00
liasa 1,025.00 No gid 05692 oo No bid| No 8 No Bid No bid 734.09
an 148634 85250 No Bid T peaa No bd| No Bi No Bid No bid 611.00
ai 18788 $1,300. No 8id 52759 L4788 No bid| No B No Bid Na bt 795.00
. 11,532.4° No Bid No bid| No Bid No bid 8,124.1
4 148898 discontinued No Bi ° ° |
$25,034.97| 320,890,
Touwl
*Computer Asset Management, .
“ATAT CORP. Lol
[Group 5 llem 5a and 50 will ba used 1o dotermine vendor ranking and ATC INTER. (NOP?—RES‘;DNSNE) Inc. (NON- Deil Markating, Lp, | Oigitalinte gance Systems Graybar insight Public Sector, Inc. JOL Technologlas, Inc.
aveart RESPONSIVE) P
s Dneac J7
e oni500xAU-Sh4 5.181.25 1.148.70 No i No 8id| No Bid PP No Bid No Bi
i One0OXA SIS 1,687,500 800.58 No B No Bid No Bid 04 No Bid No Bid
Total 74 1 5,71




Prepared by H. Eschbach

The Schoo! Bosed of Muami-Dade Courty, Florida
. o Bid No. 18- 304
Verified by E. Gilliam Pioiiis
. "Computer Asset Management,
ATC INTER. AT&T CORP. Inc. (NON- Dell Marketing, Lp, | Oigital Inteliegence Syatema Graybar Inaight Public Sactor, Inc. JOL Technologles, Inc.
(NON-RESPONSIVE) ™ sesponsve) Corp.
0 TOOLSISPECIALYY TOOLS
HITK5100
PC Repair Kit for computor repair lechniclans and fieid BLK, $442-950,
service porsonnel, This kit provides ail tha necessary lool H200-495, #4064
and supplies foc installing, maintaining and troubleshooling Mo 41 34
PCs, workstationa ond servars in » ballistic nylon Zipper (226.83) | PLEASE SEE
casa tiwh two pallats of tools, a Digilel Mulli Meter pouch, Wom#2 | ATTACHED
Uvae exiomal Velcro pockals end padded dual web handia (849.41) |SPEC. SHEETS )
Ba g7ips. included at a minlmum are nuldriver biades plus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Horm 53 FoR Na B-q No Bid
slotted, Phillips and Torx screwdriver bladas, [ong nose ang (41.67) VERIFICATION|
culling pilers, rechargable cordiess pivoling screwdriver, ltom 84 TEMS
iecirical outlel recapincio analyzer, two-part Screen Prep (2257 £D Wi
wipes to clean monitors, keyboards and oplical giass and Soioas |SUCTEDWILL
Minl Mag-Lite. Passive foota shall carry lifetime wananties) - MEET
Ibe Case shall have & one year wamanty. REQUIREMEN
TS,
FIKT-2100W
Telocom Inataliation Kit for leiephone equipment Instaliers | #424-010
This kit provides all necessary lools and isst squiprient ‘Yankee Dill
riquired to install alactronic Ielephons sysioms. All the PLEASE SEE
100ls and squipment ara assembied and packaged in a
Cordusa zippor 100l casa that fealures specially designed ITEM - | ATTACHED
lpockets for a digital voltmetsr, Bneman's tast set and & pusi {687.53) | SPEC SHEETS,
5o drill. At & minumam, 1o0ls Inciude 8 harrs Drocon 66 and No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid TEM 2- FOR o Bid No Bid
110 typa puch-gown Lool, 8 haavyduty push drill with (30.78) | VERIFICATION|
[assoried bits, a selection of basic hand tools including wira =718.31 ITEMS
strippor, diagonal cutting plier pius a range of fixed-handla 2
scrowdrivers, & 77HP Torw Tracer, & Hamis Y530 inoman's QUOTED WL,
tast sat and 200EP Lioe Aid. Passive looks shal have 3 MEET
ilstime warranty. The case shail have a 0ne-year warmanty REQUIREMEMN
s
A high -lorque 100t combing the functions of & hammerdril, J
50 ﬂ"":;;'::"‘""" “;g ”“‘:‘Lﬁ‘x‘xﬁ:”m No Bid No B No Bid No Bid| No B 242.07] ch;NoeAﬂ No Bid No Bl
least 2 axiondad run-lime batledss.
$1,900.86
Tolal




Prepared by H. Eachbach

Verified by E. Gilliam

Tha Schoot Boarg of Miams-Deds County. Florda
B Mo 8- J304

MNatworr
“Computer Assel Management,
“ATAT CORP. Digltal Intallegence Systems
Groun 7 tiem 7a throught 71 wal ba ussd to detormmine vendor ranking ATC INTER. (NON-RESPONSIVE] tne. {HON- Dl Marksting, L.P. Corm. Graybar Inaight Public Sector, inc. JOL Technologles, nc.
and award. RESPONSIVE)
TS OFVS2 o 3116257 GOLD PRODUGT ELPRORT 4.041.2§ No Bid No Big No Bid 3239, No Bid
7a SERVICES. OPTIVIEW SERIES 2. B 3076.32 No 8id
842. No Bﬂ No Bi No Bi 673.61 No Bi No Bii
™ el OPVS2-B° Tem 2134834 EXTERNAL BATTERY PACK 641
40,500.001 No Bl No Bid Na Bi 33,445.00 No Bi No Bit
ot OPVSF-GIGIPSVSW Nlem 7823281 OPTIVIEW SERIES Il
Tc “SIGABIT Sv§ SUITE w1 TH WIRELESS OPTION 35.798.!
14,000.00 No NJ No Bid No Bit 11,475.00 No S'J Na 8¢
octat QPYSS-wiss Tarm ZAZAZEG OFY-WHAS wah INTAIRAAP D OPVS3;
7d LANALYZEAIR 11,800. WLESi
i i . N N
CZEAR nom 1563778 ANALYZEAIR w161 4.716.25 N Bid No B) No Br 2,639.88 o Bid o B
Ta ANALYZER 3,900
4,007.! No Bid No Bi No 84 3.093.22 No Bid Na Bid
il INTAIR-LAS 2533088 INTERPRE TAIR, WLAN SURVEY SOFTWARE 3,365,
\C T 8613700 — 1 —




Propared by H. Eachbach
Vaxified by E. Gilham

Tha Behoot Board of Mam-Osos
B3 4o, 018- 1J04

County. Flonda

Networs
*Computar Asset Management,
“AT2T CORP. Digital Intellegance Systems
Group 8 llem B through Be will be ussd Lo datermine vendar ranking ATC INTER. (NON-RESPONSIVE) inc. (NON- Dell Marketing, L.P. Corp, Graybar Insight Public Sector, Inc. JOL Technologles, inc.
and award RESPONSIVE}
8 AIRMAGNET
No Big No 8id No B No Bid No Bid 322333 No Bid No Bd
Model A4030 AirMagrret Analyzer
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,893.15 No Bid Na 8id
Modei A1354 AlrMagnel Laptop-SurvPro Bundle
Na Bid No Bid No 8id Na 8id Na Bid 9,665.37 No Big No Big
net WifFl Bundla
No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id 1,223.33 No Bid No Bid
Model A1150 AirMagnet Laptop PRO
No 8d No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id 254.90 No 8id No Bid
Model € 1060 NA B0Z.1 1a/bigih PC Card -9 ' " ]
Olal i 22,261,
“Computer Asset Management, 2
“ATE&T Corp. (NON- Digital Intellegance Systems :
Group 9 Nlema Ba through 5 wil ba used 1o datenmine Vendor ranking ATC IHTER. RESPONSIVE) . {HON- Deil Marketing, L.P. Corm. Graybar Insight Public Sector, inc. JOL Technologies, inc.
o b RESPONSIVE)
9 AIRWAVE | I
L
. , . | .
AWMS-Pra AirWave 1 Sulte Licaass 1 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bi No 8id
9a Server
No Bid No 8id No Bid No Big No Big Na Bid No Bid No 8id
96 Modol SA1-AWMS-PRO Support for AWMS-PRO 1 Year
Ne Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bi No Bid No Bid No Bi
9¢ Model SA3-AWMS-PRO Support for AWMS-PRO 2 Year
No aid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bi
9d Model SA3 -AWMS-PRO Suppont for AWMS-PRO 3 Year
Tolal




Prepared by 1. Esthbach
Verified by E. Giliam

The el Boaxd ot Moars-Dade County, Fiorida

2 Mo, 018- 1104
Fotmot, Connecintty

*SOUTHERN ELEGTRIC SUPPL
. ) . o
NETWORK CONNECTIVITY DEVICES Managad Secviess (NON Onaac P.M.E.INC. Prosys Informational Systems) (AKA REXEL) (NON. | "STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY | o, epor (NON-RESPONSVE) |  United Data Technologias
RESPONSIVE) AESPONSIVE) {NON RESPONSIVE)
Commenis or Commente ar Commants of Comventis of Commants oF] Comments o Ciinmants o Comments or
Manufacturer/Part Number Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price | Manufacturer |  Unit Prica | Manufacturer Unit Price Unit Price d: Unit Prica Manufacturar Part # Unit Prica | Manufacturer
Pant Part® Part® Part ¥ Part s Part® Part ¥
anaoe Servioes (O "SOUTHERN ELECTRY SUPPLY
Group 1 lem 1a arxt 1b will be used o datermine vendor ranking and mrgss:olnsf\;::)l - Oneac P.M.E. INC. Prosys informalional Systems|  (AKA REXEL) (NON- | STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY | “TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE). | United Data Tachnologles
awrad, RESPONSIVE
| APC _=-_‘_—)
! 100y 108,00
i i BK 500 BAGK.UPS C8 118.99) BKS00 No Bid 86.00 BKS00 104.99 120.00 98.88 BK500 s K500 et
4
i iPC SmaiiiBa VA 550.66] SUA1000J8 NoB 272@ SC1000 <3600 ¢ ioon 440,00 69,48 SUA1000 $269.74 51000 39100 ¢ aro00
Torol Nopd R e
*SOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPLY]|
*Managed Services (NON- *STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY
Group 2 item 2 tivough 2} wit be used to detenine vandor racking :ESPONSWE)‘ Oneac P.M.E. INC. Prosys Informational Systemsi (AKA REXEL) (NON- (NON RESPONSIVE) “TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE) |  Unlted Dala Technologias
award. RESPONSIVE)
2 CISCO SYSTEMS
4,329,588 oo 28 M) 1,731.00) 2,442.60) o i 2.798.00 DISCONTINUED
22 cisco281y No Bid
zn CiSCOzez) 2.873.22] ¢IC502821 | No Bid 279500 2.323.35 No Bid 695.00 _DISCONTINUED
722,00| WIC-10SU-T- 680.00 596.50 No Bid 605.00 661.29| WIC-1DSU-T1-V2 570.00
2 WIC-1DSU-T1-V2 No Bid
346022 lvﬁvi;—s 3,310.00 2.860.20] No Bid| 3,389.00| 3,419.09 WS-C3560-48TS-5 2,733.00|
29 WS-CIS60G 24758 No g
o Jws
5,774.33] ‘mm 5,430.00 4,769.00 No 8id 260.00 261.22| WS-G5483= 4,557.00
20 W5-CIS60G48TS-S No Big
4,926.88| WS CISH0E- 4031.00 3,576.00 No Bid| 592.00 577.74| WS-C2940-8TF-5 3.417.00
2 WS-C3560E-24TD-8 24705 No 8id
X2-10G8-
b he2-1068-LAM 1.070.88| X2 1t o B 999.99 891.76 No id 2.22200 2.575.63| ciscozaat 852.00
WS-C37506- - NCLUGED WiTH
= WS-CITS0G.24T-5 5.413.22) 10 o 8 4,100.00] 2,576.00 No 8id 1,632,001 TEN 20 3,417.00
8,663.22 ‘V:TSI;?SJSGOE- 8,040.00| 7.155.00 No Bid| 269.00 243.14| FWR-2821-51-AC= 6,587.001
2 WS- C3560-48TD-5 No Bid
WS-C3560G- INCLUDED WITH
8,658.77| 48TS.E 8,200.00| 7,152.00 No Bid| 391.00] ITEM 2 6,700.00
WS-C3560G-487S-€ No Bid
$39,916.99 3534240 32,869
Total




Prepared by H.

Eschbach

Verified by E. Gilliam

Tra School Board of Miame-Deds County, Flonda
Bid Mo, 018 JA04

“SOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPLY R
*Managed Services (NON- *STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY gy
Group 3 liem 3 tvough 36 will ba Used 1o deleming vendor ranking AEsPonvE) Oneac PM.E. INC. Prosys informational Systema|| (AKA REXEL) {NON- HON RESPONSIVES “TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE | Unfiad Dita Trehnologies
st award, RESPONSIVE) ;
3 FORTINET
- FC-10-03600- FG-3000-B0L
No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id 29,986.00 NO BID) 41,102.00 " SO0 E
3 FC-10-03600-065 ° No Bid ° o B ° 020-2036 s
FL-10008-
i No Bid No Bid No B 11.288.00 FC1003600 No BiDd 8,234.00
» Softwara [No Part & No Biq No Bid o B o 8 ° EMU0T-US
- FCX21003600- d . FC10-00032;
Mo Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid 24,228,000 NO B 14,908.09 FC1
3¢ Sofowara (N Part #) No Bid il B 10201036 + 1070212
332,
Tolal | J 362,332.00
*SOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPL
*Maneged Sarvices (NON- *STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY )
Group 4 ftom 43 through 4] will ba usad o determine vendo ranking ESPONSIVE) Oneac Prosys Informational Systemal (AKA REXEL) (NON- (NON FEBACNENE) TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE] | United Data Technologies
2 awaed, RESPONSIVE)
HEWLETT PACKARD !
W
=i - ; 745, o s72.09
i iisaon 6425 SAME |, S No Bid No Bid 9.00 76304 Lercn 2.
e 1,778, 1.651.75 1,237.09
o aion visesy  SAME | 102610 No Bid No Bid 779,00 ST on
2 Sag21B ) REPLACED
s xann 7880 savE | oo 1000 No Bid No Bid 760.00 (LT - 572,00 v reanin
i i . 707.
" oasase 5METY  SAME |\ o No Bid No Bid 4.960.00 4407 e 3.707.00
g - - REPLACED
i . 3050 SAME | a0 ‘ No Bid No Bid 185.00 29088 e 21,00 1 oA e
. REPLACED BY REPLACED
L  idn 43088 SAME |0 No Bid No Bid 3.520.00 2.365.44{ 57 167300 g e
<aesp0 i i X 4 :
" iiiion s02d  saME | o seapd | No Bid No Bid 79%0.00 a2an | oo 623,59
e samina 74025 SAME | o g No Bid Na Bid 575.00 69361 Jia61a 519.50
4 148788 974.25 SAME No Bid No Bid Na 8id 890.000 1.9 48788 675"
1040700  SAME f No Bid Na Bid 9,999.00 DISCONTINUED] 7.100.09
4 148808 No Bid
TR $16,897.50
(Totak ) i o
N r TSOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPLY] .,
roup 3 ltem 5a and 5 will bs usad lo determine vendor ranking anct| Tan2ged Services (NON- Oneac - - P.M.E. INC. Prosys Informational Systems| (AKA REXEL) (NON. | STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY | ypoyy nepor (NON-RESPONSIVE) |  United Data Technologies
Oroup § RESPONSIVE) : EaPaNaVE) {NON RESPONSIVE)
5 Onoac T
ON1500XAU- T E . . .
5 ON1500XAU-SN4 4,490.00 )y 3,252 60 No Bid No Bid 1,400.00 No Bid No Bi No Bid
- A B00XAWENKS 737,00 ONEGO4AG-SE] 231420 No Bi No Bid 2,700.00 No Bid No i No Bid
Tolal I B




Prepared by H. Eschbach Tha Schoal nm;undnrmc«m. Frooda
Verifiad by E, Gitliam

I —
- # - *SOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPL a
Managed Services (NON- Oneac . PMEINC. | Prosys informational Systems] (AKA REXEL) (NON- | "STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY | 1o oo (NON-RESPONSIVE) |  Unitsd Data Technologles
RESPONSIVE) - ICo e {NON RESPONSIVE)

6 TOOLS/SPECIALTY TOOLS

PC Repair Kit for computer repair lechnicians and field
#acvice porzonnel, This kil provides all the necassary tool &R
3G suppies for installing. maintaining and troubleshooting| L
PCs, workslations and servers in a ballistic nylon 2ipper a .
Case lowh two paliata of tools, a Dighat Mull Meter pouch, g L] =
Moo sxtemal Volcro pockets and padded dual web handis! :
Ga aripa. Included at 8 minimum are nutdrver biades plus NIA No 8id
siotied, PTulllps acd Torx acrewdriver biades, long nose and
Eutting pilers, ] cordisss pivoling .
Wectrical oullat recaptacie analyzer, two-part Scroen Prap
wipss 1o clean monitors, keyboards and oplical giass and 4 _ 5
Mint Mag-Lile. Pansive lools ahall carmy lifelime wamantios] 3 L) e 2
The cass shall have a one year warranty, . 4

. i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Big No Bid

Telncom Installation Kit foc telephona squipment installers
This kit prowides all necassary 1ools and tesl quipment
roquired 1o insLail elactronit: Isiephona systems. All the
100is and equipment are assembied and packaged in a
‘Cotdura Zpper tool casa thal features spacially designad
pockets for  digital voitmator, Eneman's tost set and a push| &
5o rill. At a minumum, 100ls includa a hais Dracon 66 and No Bid Ll
110 typa puch-gown tool, a heavyduty push drll with
s3s0ried bits, a selection of basic hand (oofs Inchuding wirel
slripper, diagonal cutling plier plua a range of fixad-handis
scrowdrivers, a 77HP Tons Tracer, » Hams T530 kinerman
188t 3a1 and 200EP Line Ald. Passive iocls shall have a
ifotima warranty. Tho case shall have B one-ysar warranty.

78 0q| FLUKE i i Bid No Bid
aod S o No Bid N Bid No o Bi

No Bid

A high -torqua 1oot combing the funclions of a hamimerddl,
5c il and screwdriver with adjustable ciuich, keyless chuch NA
lock multiple spoeds, AC powersd battary charger and at

No Bid No No Bid No Big No Bt
lnast 2 axlended run-tma batierias. B‘T

No Bid

. 3
otal




Prepared by H. Eachbach
Verified by E. Giliam

Tha Saroat Bosrd of Mams-Deds County, Fionos

Bar Mo, 18- 2304
Hotwoek Connectry

*SOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPL
“Managed Services (NON- : *STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY
Groun 7 ltem 7a trought 71 will be usad 1o deteamine vendor ranking REsPONScl:';)( Oneac Prosys Informational Systesms! (AKA REXEL) (NON- (NON RESPONSIVE) “TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE) |  Unlted Data Technologles
and award, RESPONSIVE)
[ I
SO i 3116257 GOLD PRODUCT SUPPORT 4,200.00| SAME No Bid No Bid 3,234, No Bi No Bid No Bid
Ta SERVICES. OPTIVEW SERES 2.
625,00 SAME No Bid No Bid 880.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ki) [Moser OPVS2.8P lem 2934834 EXTERMAL BATTERY PACK
33,445.00( SAME No Bid No Bid 36,000.00 Ko Bid No Bid No Bid
Modet OPVEL-GIGIPSVE/W fem 2273281 OPTIVIEW BERIES 1y
Te (GIGABIT SVS SUITE WITH WIRELESS OPTION
12,495.00 SAME No Bid No Bid 12,240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mcrat OPVSI-want ) Hem 2823280 OPVAWHAY wity INTAJR-LAP AND
1d [ANALYZEAIR
I % haom 2583778 ANALYZEAIR W1 SPES 3.805.00 SAME No Bid No Bid 3,800.00) No Bid No 8id No Bid
] IANALYZER
3,305.00 SAME No Bi 3,200.00 No
tid IHTAIR-LAP I535888 INTERPRE TAIR. YWLAN SURVEY SOFTWARE.
Tolst




Prepared by M. Eschbach
Verified by E. Gilliam

Tha Serool Bourd of

Maarme-Dace County, Flora
84 o, 012 1004

Hatwork Connactivty Dences

Sarvices (NON-

*“SOUTHERN ELECTRIC 8UPPL’

' *STORSOFT TECHNOLOGY y
Group § item B thvough 86 wil ba used to delemine vendor ranking RESPONSIVE) Oneac P.M.E. INC. Prosys Informational symm.w {AKA REXEL) (NON- (NON RESPONSIVE) “TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE) | United Dats Tactinologies
and award. RESPONSIVE) ! g
S—
8 AIRMAGNET T ] \7 T
3,196.00( SAME No Bid 3,054,000 AA03Q 3.201.99 No Bid No Bid J,\B.OJ O30 3,148.97)
Modal A4030 Airtagnet Spectrum Anglyzer
—
seu. SAME 2,450,000 A1354 5,854, No B No Bid 5.200.56 A1354 2,488,421
Modal A1154 ArMagnet Leptap-SurvPra Bundie
8.500.00 SAME 9.156.00( A1356 8.916. No Bid No 8iq B.G”ﬁ A1356 9,295.71
Model A 1356 AlrMagnal WUFL Bundia
a,wemy SAME 3.054.00 A1150 3,201.90 heipid No Bi 2.899.76 A1150 313.12
Model A1150 AirMagnet Leptop PRO Y
. .. 1 160.. ' &
i C1060 NA 802,118 PE Card zssoo{sme 213.99 C1060 60.30 No Bid Nnﬂ 182.83 €1060 189,55
‘olal § T79.280.98 T 21358 $18,355.77
—
“BOUTHERN ELECTRIC SUPPL
*Managed Services (NON- *8TORSOFT TECHNOLOGY
Group 9 items 83 though 8 will be used to delermine Vendor ranki RESPONSIVE) Onesc £.M.E. INC. Prosys Informational Systems| (AKA REXEL) (NON- {HON RESPONSIVE) *TECH DEPOT (NON-RESPONSIVE] |  United Data Technologles
nd svecac, RESPONSIVE)
N—
] AIRWAVE = .
AWMS-Pro Aliave « Suite Liconsa 4 No Bi No Bi No Bi Ne Bid No Bid Mo Bi NO BiDf No Bi
Server
No 8l Ne Bi No i No aq No Bid No Bid NO BiDY No 5.4
Model SA1-AWMS-PRO Sm} for AWMS-PRO 1 Year
No 8 No BiJ No Bid No B No Bid NO BiD) No B
9c Model SAY-AWMS-PRO Support for AWMS-PRO 2 Year
No Bi No Bid No Bil No B4 No Biq No Bid No B|J No Bi
o Modol SA3 -AWMS-PRO Support for AWMS-PRO 3 Year
o L | | J |






