BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAY B)

Type or print totriple te nante of hidder tn this box:

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #011-JJ05
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

NOTE: IF BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED. COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGRBRAND NAME & PRODUCT # WiLL NOT REFLECT

APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION, |F MORE THAN ONE ARAROVED

RAND.

3/9/2009

)
NUjE! RO »S
Bid No. 011-JJ05 PLEASE P ”44570 e \ i
Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER Prepared By: Verified By
Buyer: Gladys Forero-Belfran
MAT
£D ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS GO. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
auA AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 3 & 4) [ (PRIMARY FOR 1TEMS 32 To azan [ LLiorEL SoRire PO ITRS SCHOOL SPECIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY STANDARD STATIGNARY
4370 45).
ITEM|| DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM NTIT||UNIT]
*QUALIFIED BID: MIN. ORDER, .
GROUP{: items 1 and 2 are to be awarded on a total low QUALIFIED GROS"S 1% & X-MIN, ORDER PRICE PROTECTION THROUGH QUALIFIED BID; MNIMUM ORDERS
bid basis. Vendor must bid sil Hems in this Group, REQUIREMENTS 10/09; SHIPPINGMANDL. CHARGES| FOR ALL GROUPS;
\olerance. (500 @ 24° x 36") (00%‘sulphi\e 50% recycled r \ ’7 MFGR/BRAND
y N : A MFSRERAN MFGRBRANG SRERANL
content. 50 sheets per package. Aporoved Brands: Pacon Try MESABRANG HatE o PAVIE & MFORERALC TANE S 1IAVE & o £ PRGTC1 NAME &
Ray* Sulphite or equal. T PRCE PROCOCT ¥ 45T PRICE PROTVCT® ||t price] PROCVCT # T PACE PRODUGTY |} gy price 4 1 PRICE ‘ PRODUCT #
/62500 MIN. GRDER. ANY
ICOMBINATION OF GROUP 1, GROUP
[ (38.4), GROUP 1ii AND GROUP V.
[CONSTRUCTION & OTHER PAPER MIN, ORDER: PACON
[TO &€ ORDERED IN CASE $3100: APC $10.500 FULL
QUANTITY. CASES ONLY
1q ‘ ‘ Gonstruction Paper: 12 x 187, 25 pkq per case
I Pacon Tru-Ray® Sulphite
‘ [Eefor Color # Brand
’ | 275 || © GROUP | $11.756.25 TRU-RAY
876-0056 |[Black 575C 103024 % sa218) 51150050 LEFTBUANK|| 54275 o 545,50 $12.512.50/#054150 $43.50)  §11,96250 $42.84 $11,80850
GROUP 1 TRU-RAY
0 !
876-0081_||Sky Blue 2s¢ 103016 20 | Case|l 1763 ss.2res0 LEFT BLANK || s3g.00| %26000 $40.75|  $8,865.00|#054108 $30.00 sa,sso.oo‘ $38.30||  $8.426.00
GROUP1 | TRU-RAY
25 || c 11.550.00
876-0111 |[Blue 3sC 103022 3% s41.57] 51143175 CEFT BLANK | 34200 * 54475 $12.306.25)#054120 $42.00 sn,azs.no‘ $4332)| $11.913.00
GROUP 1 | TRU-RAY
)
876-0145 [|Dark Brown s0sc 103024 20 Casel sis0m| sto.1a7.0 LEFT BLANK || sa5 75| $10-28500 | 54078  $10.045.00/#054135 s47.00]  $10.34000 54691 $10.32020
\
55 || case! i GROUPT | $2.208.25 TRU-RAY
576-0180 |[State 555C 103028 S41,13]  $2,26215 LEFTBLANK|| se1.75] "~ $44.50|  $2.447.50(#054147 $4.00|  $2,365.00 sé1.88|  $2303.40
GROUP | TRU-RAY
876-0210 |Turquoise 8SC 103007 185 1Case)| qum|  s7aeres r LEFT BLANK || 544 75| 3738375 s47.75|  $7.876.75|#054078 $45.75|  §7,548.75 $45.04)  $7,431.60
‘ .
GROUP | TRU-RAY
8750260 |[Brilant Lime tosc 103423 220 1 Case || oo 07| si0135.40 LEFT BLANK || 345.75| ¥'0:28500 $40.75  $10,045.00/#054084 $47.00|  $10.340.00 Nosio
GROUP | TRU-RAY ]
) 275 REL .
5760203 [[Festive Green 75¢ 103008 Case| c1727] 1209928 LEFTBLANK || ga7 75] 1Y $5100]  $14,025.00(#054075 $40.00)  $13.475.00 $48.13)| $13,235.75 |
I s
GROUP 1 RAY#05406 !
75 | © 13
375-0323 ||Orange 1sc 103802 78 ||Case) (0 12| s1208m00 - LEFT BLANK 547.75‘ S $51.00|  $1402500)3 $49.00  $13,475.00 $47.98| $13,194.50
GROUP | | ’ TRU-RAY
q
‘amuasa Light Red 135¢C 103014 20 Case) o n20|  snssnmo LEFTBLANK | sa0.75] 086500 $43.50]  $9.570.00|#054093 s41.00| _ $9,020.00 s41.03]  50.027.04
GROUP | TRU-RAY
10 [ ¢
L‘/s-uaﬂz Festve Red 83sC 103431 2| sea87]  $14.807.40 LEFTBLANK | sas.s0| $15019%0 $48.50)  S15.00500/#054651 || §46.00  $15.180.00 se5.72| s15.087.60
GROUP | TRU.RAY
) 165 | cas 425,
‘575.0412 |Ivialet 1se 103009 i T $7,334.25 LEFY BLANK || $45.00 $7:425.00 $48.00 $7.920 00| #054087 $46.00 $7.590.00 $45.27||  §$7.469.55
GROUP | TRU-RAY
) 110 || case $12.540 00
‘876-0447 ‘\Nhne 535¢C 103028 $37.62| $12414.60 LEFT BEANK 1| $38.00 $4050| $13.365.00(#054141 ‘ $38.00  $12,540.00 $38.30/ $12.639.00
|
! 220 || case GROUP | $8.745.00 RAYH05410 |
a76-0472 |[Light Yellow 175C 103014 $39.26|  $8.637.20 LEFTBLANK|| $3075| ' $42.50|  $8.350.00[2 L s41.00]  $0.02000 $30.99/  $8.705.60
) 110 || Cass GROUP $5.307 50 TRU-RAY \
876-1168_||Shocking Pink 155C 193013 | s47.78| 525060 LEFT BLANK || $48.25 $51.50]  $5,665.00/#054000 §$50.00]  $5.500.00 $48.63)  $534930
\ . 165 || Case ‘ GROUP | $7.005.00 TRU-RAY
i876-1176 | Goid 48sC 102097 $4257]  §7,024.05 LEFTBLANK || $43.00 846,00  57.590.00/K054405 $44.00)  §7,26000 543.3¢) §7.151.10




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida 3/9/2008
Bid #011-JJ0S
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

[BID PROPOSAL FORM {F ORMAT B)
Typ# of prinf tomplers nanie of Bidder In this box: i NOTE: If BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED. COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGREBRAND NAME & PRODUCT # WILL HOT REFLECT
NUTE: APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION. IF MORE THAN ONE APPROVED BRAND
Bld No. 011-JJ05 P EASE
Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer:  Gladys Forero-Beltran
MAT ART & EDUCAT, MATERIALS €O
cAT, .
ED AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 3 & 2) | [PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 32 TG 42 AND PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS SCHOOL SPECIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY STANDARD STATIONARY
QUA 4370 45) { PRIMARY FORITEMS 47 TO 24)
ITEM| DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM NTIT| UNIT]
=
2 Construction Papar: 187 x 247, 15 pkg per case 1 i ]
Pacon TruRay® Sulphite \ .
Calor Color # Brand 1D # L_
110 || Case GROUP ) $5.667.50 TRU-RAY
876-0048 |Black 575C 193093 $54.20)  $5,062.00 LEFT BLANK || $54.25] ° $50.35)  $6,418.50 #054030 $56.00|  $6.160.00 5518) $6.069.80
55 || case BROUP ! $2.747.25 TRU-RAY
576-0072_||Sky Blue 21sc 103048 $49.32)  §2.712.80 LEFT BLANK || $49.95 $53.10)  $2,92050)#055239 $51.00)  $2.805.00 5024| $2.763.20
[
55 | Case GROUPI $2.01225 TRU-RAY
876-0102_|Blue 33sc 103086 || 85245] $2,884.75 LEFT BLANK || $52.95 $5§.55| _$3,110.25¥054927 $54.00)  $2.970.00 §3.41| $2.93755
28 || Case GROUPH $1.659.00 TRU-RAY
876-0137 ||Dark Brown SasC 103088 $58.65)  $1.642.20 | LEFT BLANK || $58.25 $61.15 $1,768.20|#055248 $61 00 $1.700.00 59.72| $1,672.18
GROUP Y TRU-RAY
28 ||c 1.428.00
b76.0162 |Gray 355C 103081 || ss0.48]  $1.41344 1 LEFT BUANK || s5100| *280 $54450  §152460#601337 §5200|  $145600 51.4| 3143020
GRUUFPT THU-RAY T
76-0196 | Turquoise 8sc 103071 ‘ 28 || Case|| o515 51,573.04 LEFT BLANK || ss5.70| $1:587.60 ’ 55090 $1.705.20|#8012.83 $58.00  $1,624.00 57.21] $1.601.68
o 2 || case GROUP $1.675.60 TRU-RAY
576-0251 ||Brilliant Lime 10SC 103427 $50 24| $1.658.72 LEFT BLANK || s50.85 $63.90| $1,789.20 #801289 $61.06)  $1.70600 60.32) $1,688.95
. W 55 || Case GROUP | §3.242.26 TRU-RAY
876-0285 |[Festive Green 75C 103070 | | $56 30 $3,206 50 LEFT BLANK || $58.05 §62.85 $3.456.75| 2054524 $61.00 $3.355.00 52.36| $3,264.80
T o ’ Case GROUP | s131850 TRU-RA
876-0315 || Orange s 103058 | $5065)  $3280.75 LEFT BLANK || $60.30 $54.20|  $3.531.00#054036 || se200  g3410a0 60.74] $3,340.70 |
‘ 55 Cnse‘ ‘ GROUP | $2.937.60 TRU-RAY
576-0350 || Pink 1450 103012 $52.80  $2,904.00 LEFT BLANK || $53.40 $55.85|  $3,12675/#011145 $55.00]  $3.025.00 53.77| $2,857.35
28 |l Case GROUP [ 3150180 TRU.RAY
576.0374 ||Festive Red Basc 103433 $56.30 $1.576.40 LEFT BLANK || %5685 $60.80 51,606 80| #054945 $58.00 $1.652.00 57.33| $1.605.24
|
N 28 | Case GROUP | $1.586 00 TRU-RAY
B76-0404_|[Violet 1isc 103073 $56.42)  $1,579.76 LEFT BLANK || $57.00 ||_ss0.60[ _$1.696.80#801292 $50.00  51.652.00 57.45) §1,608.60
165 || case GROUP1 $8.192.25 TRU-RAY
876-0439 |[White 535¢C 103080 | $40.18| 3811140 LEFTBLANK || $40.55 $52.95)  $8,736.75 2054918 $51.00]  $8.415.00 50 05| $8.258 2%
55 | Cosel ‘ GROUP 5202050 TRU-RAY
876.0453 ||Light Yellow 178C 103078 £52 60 $2,693.00 | LEFT BLANK || ¢53 10 s $56.85 $3.126.75|#801307 854 50 $2,097.50 55 56| 33,055.80 |
TOTAL $192,833.36 $105,044.95 J $208.123.05 $168,058.75 $186,415.63
GROUP Il: tems 3 and 4 are to be awarded on » total Jow J i r
bid basis. Vendor must bid all items in this Group. I i
i PYRAMID §CHOOL PRODUCTS - LOW l GROUP I, ITEMS 3 & 4 ARE
AFP INDUSTRIES- PRIMARY FOR ITEMS ,BIDDER FOR ITEMS 3 & 4 BUT WAS NON-, QUALIFIED AS ITEM 4 WAS BID
3AND 4 | | COMPLIANT 1 INCORRECTLY.
Construction Paper, custom color assortment 187 x 227,15 . ! l_ NO BID
nackages per case Approved Brands: Pacon Peacock’ 65 | Case GROUP It i PACON TRU-RAY 1 TRU-RAY PACON
876.0438 ||Sulphite Assorted # P6518 {18 % 24%) of equal. 356.58|  $0.352.20 [LEFT BLANK + $52.80 $6.712.00{ SULPHITE #1030854  $56.25|  $8.281.25 | #054833 §5450)  $8.082 504103095
2 e



[BID PROPOSAL FORM {FORMAT B)

“rnm ar print complete nrme of hidder In this bow:

Bld No. 011-4J05

Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

Buyer. Gladys Forero-Beitran

NUiE:
PLEASF

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

NOTE: {f BIDDING ON THE ONLY APP!
DESIGNATED MFGR/BRAND NAME
APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION. IF

Prepared By

Bid #011-JJ05

ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

ROVED BRANO PROVIDED. COLUMN
& PRODUCT # WILL NOT REFLECT
MORE THAN ONE APPROVED BRAND

Verified By

3192009

liTem

DCPs#

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

MAT

QUA
NTIT]

UNIT]

AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR {TEMS 3 & 4}

ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS €O.
(PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 32 TO 42 AND
43 70O 45).

PYRAMID SCHOOL PROBUCTS
{ PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24)

SCHOOL SRECIALTY

SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY

STANDARD STATIONARY

876-0502

Construction Paper, custom color assoriment, 127 x 18° 25
packages per case. Approved Brands: Pacon Peacock’
ISulphite Assorted # P6512 (12 x 18") or equal

275

Case

$4512| $12.408.00

GROUP 1
LEFT BLANK

$45.00

$12,375.00

TRU-RAY

49.25 13543.75 #054156

l

54400‘ $12,100.00

45.49| $12.509.75

Custom Golor Assortment
Five {5) Sheets of each color as follows

Pacon Peacock” Sulphite Assorted

Color:

Red

Black

—“ Qrange

1

Pink
\Blue

T,rﬁmwn
|

\’E_kz Blue

‘ Holiday Green

[[Yellow

| BRI

I
|
|

1LY

K]
3
=
o

A

‘ TOTAL

ITGROUP TIT: ems 3 through 11 are ta be awarded ofi a tolal|
‘ fow bid basis. These items may be mixed in any color

icombination for minimum order requirement. Vendor must
bid all items In this Graup,

$21,760.20

Art Paper shall be in 50 Ib. Rolts 36" wide x 1000" tong. (50 Ib
basis weight minus 5% tolerance, (500 @ 24" x 16%)

|, _s21.087.00

$22,825.00

$21.092.50

DID NOT BID

876-1043 ‘

Art Paper, Brite Green. Approved Brands: Pacon Spectra®
AdKr28® #A7131 nr equal

Ralt

$39.69)  $8,731.80

$42.52 ‘ $9.354.48

$40.32

$8.870.40

SPECTRA
BT

$44.04 $9.696 60

$41.00 $9.020.00

$41.90|  $9.218.00|APC #58G

876-0034 {

Art Paper, White. Approved Brands: Pacon Spectra®

Aadlfuad® W canns .

220

Rolt

$20.95 $6.569.00

$32.58 ‘ $7,167.60 |

$30.43

$6,694.80

SPECTRA
REETAE

$32.89 $7,235.80

$31.00 $6.820.00

$34.74]  $7,642.80 |APC #5WH

876-1051 |

Art Paper, Aqua. Approved Brands: Pacon Spectra®
Kraft* # 67161 0f eoual

Roll

$36.58 $6,047.60

i $39.34 $8,654.80 J

$37.15|

$8,173.00

SPECTRA

$40.59 $6,929.80 |w75443

$38.00

$8,360.00

$40.99) $5.017.80 ‘APC #5LBL

876-1060

|41t Paper, Black. Approved Brands: Pacon Spectra®
Az LA

220

Rolt

$30.78 $6,771.60

‘ §33.40 $7.348.00 ‘

$31.25

$6,875.00

SPECTRA

$33.79 $7.43380 Mz

$32.00)  §7.040.00 ‘

$38.44| $8.455.80 |APC #58K

876-1078

Art Paper, Canary Agproved Brands: Pacon Spectra®
AriKra % # RINRY ar equial

220

Roll

$35.21 $7,750.60

$37.96 $8,351.20

$35.78

$7,871.60

SPECTRA
2O

$38.69 $8.,511.80

$36.50 $8,030.00

$41.45]  $9.119.00 APC #5YL

§76-1086

IArt Paper, Flame, Appraved Brands: Pacon Spectm*
s

220

Rolf

$43.12 $9.486.40
[

$46.02 | $10,124.40

$43.80

$9,636.00

SPECTRA
BO0S243

$47.39 | $10,425.80

$45.00 $9,900.00 ‘

$43.07| $9,475.40 APC #5PRD

(7 Tjgwm1\nim m‘

876-1094

|Art Paper, Orange. Approved Brands: Pacon Speclra"
ArtKraR® # 67101, or equal.

Roll

$39.73 $6,555.45

$42.58 $7,022.40

$40.36

SPECTRA

$43.69 |  $7,208.85 M2

$41.00|  $6,765.00

$41.46)  $6,940.90 [APC #50R

TOTAL

$53,932.45

‘ $58,022.80

!
$6,650.40 {
|

$54.760.00

$50.434 65

§55,935.00

$59.770.70

GROUP [V: ltems 12 and 13 are to be awarded on a total
low bid basis,

| |

(]

876-0660

Manita Orawing Paper shall be 18" X 24", (50 lb. Basis weight|
minus 5% toferance, 500 @ 24" X 36"). 500 sheets per ream
securely wrapped and labeled Packaged 2 reams per case
‘Approved Brands: American Paper Converters /#SIBM.
Roselle/Roseart #MD-50 or equal

Case

ROSELLE/ROSE|
ART #MD-50-
2RMS/CS-
(31535 RM)

$32.70 $7,184.00

PACON
418
TRM/CS-
(§15.15 RM)

$30.30 $6,666.00

526 23‘

AMERICAN PAPER
#518M -1RM/CS-

$6.221.60/($14.14/RM)

APC

$31.54 $6.938.80 |#085552

PACON #4118
IRM/CS-
(314.50 RM)

$29.00 $6,380 00

APC #518M
tRM/CS

$29.84| $6.564.80 |(514.92RM)

13

876-0668

Manila Drawing Paper, same as item #12 except 12" X 18"
Package 4 reams per case. Appraved Brands: American
‘ Paper Converters # 512M. Roselle/Raoseart #MD-50. or equal.

Case

ROSELLE/ROSE|

$32.42 5354562,DO‘ART #MD-50

PACON
#4112
(EQUAL)

$25.85

$25.04

AMERICAN PAPER
#512m

$27.544 00

ApC

$31.48 | $34,828.00 |#083549

PACON #4112

$25.75|  $28,325.00 |(EQUAL)

APC #512U

$29.80| $32.780.00

\ TOTAL

$42,856.00|
T

$29.535.00

| $36.201.00

‘ $33 765.60‘

$41,566.80

( $34.705.00

$30,344.80

GROUP V: ltems 14 through 16 are to be awarded on a total
low bid basis. These items may be mixed in any combination|

for minimum order requirements, Veador must bid alf items

|

T




|[BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

[Type or prind complete name of blgder In {lis hox:

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida

Bid #011-JJ05

ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

NOTE: IF BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED. COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGR/BRAND NAME & PRODUCT # WILL NOT REFLECT

APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION

IF MORE THAN ONE APPROVED BRAND

3/9/2009

NUE!
Bid No, 011-JJ05 IpLEASE
Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER ‘ ‘ Prepared By: Verified By.
Buyer.  Gladys Forero-Beltran |
‘ [ MAT
ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS CO.
ED AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR {TEMS 3 & 4) | (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 32 TO 42 AND PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS SCHOOL SPECIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY|  STANDARD STATIONARY
QUA 43 TO 48), { PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24)
ITEM|| DCPS# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM [INTIT | UNIT]
Drawing Paper shail be White. Bleached Sulphite, (80 Ib. basis ! ! T f T
| weight minus 5% tolerance, (500 @ 24" X 367), 500 sheets per
ream, 1 reamicase, securely wrapped and labeled.
Minimum order: 200 cases
Hd 876-0676 Mh\le Orawing Paper, 24" X 36 Packaged | ream per case.
Approved Brands: American Paper # 824W, Pacon Bright 8 c PACON BRIGHT] PACON AMERICAN PAPER PACON
While Sulfite #4824 or equal ase
‘ | $50.47 $4.189.01| WHITE #4824 $54.43 $4.517.69 |#4824 $47.70 $3.959.10(#824W $25.61 | $2,125.63 |#081432 $5225 $4.336.75 |PACON #4824 $50.56| $4,196.48 |APC #824W
15 || B76-0684 White Drawing Paper, 18° X 24", Packaged 2 reams per case. PACON BRIGHT PACON : PACON
np nds: i . i
%&"éi&i'@ e B1BW. Pacon Bright 385 || ase WHITE #4818 #4818X- AMERICAN PAPER PACON #4818, APC #818W
N $22.68 $8.731.80 (1RM/CS) $24.50 $9.432.50 |(1RM/CS) $22.99|  $17.702 30[#818W (IRM/CS) $48.24 | $18,957.40 [#053949 || $23.50|  $9.047.50|(1RM/CS) $25.20| $19,473.30 (1RMICS)
16 || 876-0662 |White Drawing Papar, 12" X 18" Packaged 3 reams per case. PAGON BRIGHT PACON AMERICAN PAPER ‘
Approved Brands: Amencan Paper # 812W, Pacon Brighte 1,100 Gl I PACON
While Sulfite  # 4812 or equat Case|| s3p78| s536.050.00 WHITE #4812 || 53542 | s538.952.00 | #4812 $33,00|  $36.300.00/#812W $36.75 | $40.425.00 |#053946 $34.00  $37.400.00 PACOM #4812 $37.92| $41,712.00 APC #812W
| T
TOTAL [ $48.976.83 $52,912.19 $57.9681 J $61.508.03 $50.784.25 $65.381.78
‘ GROUP Vi: items 17 through 24 are fo be awarded an a
total low bid basis, These items may be mixed in any color
combination for minimum order requirements. Vendor ‘
Railroad Board Paper shall be 6 ply, colored both sides, 22" X | \
128", 100 sheels per package. H L ‘
Samples required for festing upon Buyer's written request:
Minimum 2 sheets of each color with color chart and | ! ‘
ART & EBUCATIONAL MATERIALS [ !
‘ LOW BIDDER FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24 QUALIFIED fv’:g‘l":EXn'SD'D NOT BID
] BUT NON-COMPLIANT
ST = = - — .- —_ oo
e A’::r:le::anBP;:redr'#i'aRZBKAor ::::ld e P GROUPVI | F BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER ‘ SMART PACON
i i ges LEFTBLANK  « $20.08 $2.307.80 |#6150 $21.05 $2,315 50| #RR6BK 56.81 $749.10|#085406 $22.00 $2,420.00 | #5482 $23.31| $2,564.10 |APC RRGBK
18 876-0802 ||Raifroad Board, Azure Blue. Approved Brands; Pacon# packa ! SCHOOL
5485, American Paper #RR6AZ, or equal 55 GROUP VI BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER SMART
‘ 9es CEFTBLANK | so0es | s1.1530 |#6600 $21.05|  $1.157.75/#RR6AZ 56.81 $374 55/4085415 $22.00  $1.21000|PACON #5485| s23.31| $1.282.05|APC RREAZ
19 876-0811 ||Railroad Board, Buff. Approved Brands: Pacon # 5450, I Packa GROUP I | - BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER ?Mi(;?L
\American Paper #RR6BF, or equal 110 M
L ges B LEFTBLANK 1 52098 | $2.307.0 |#6610 $21.05 $2,315 50[#RREBF $6.81 $749.10/#085539 NOBID $23.31|  $2.564,10 APC RR6BF
20 || 876-0829 |[Railroad Board Kelly Green. Approved Brands: Pacon# H Packs SROUP VI ] I SEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER ;;:;)?L
5456, Amencan Paper ERR6KGR or equal 55 H
ges LEFTBLARK | $2098 $1.153.60 #6210 $21.05 $1,157.75/#RR6KGR $6.81 $374.55/#085540 $22.00 $1 210 00| PACON #5456|| $23.31|  $1.282.05 |APC RREKGR
21 876-0837 |Railroad Board, Red. Approved Brands: Pacon # 5475, Packa i SCHOOL
American Paper #RR6RD, or equat 110 GROUP VI BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER] SMART
\ ges LEFTBLANK 3 $2008 |  $2.307.80 |#6240 $21.05 $2.315.50 #RR6RD $6.81 $749.10/#085408 $22.00|  $2.420.00| PACON #5476| $23.31| $2,564.10|APC RRERD
22 || B75-0845 |[Railroad Board, White. Approved Brands: Pacon # 5461, Packa GROUP VI ' SEVERIDGE AMERIGAN PAPER g;xg?‘-
lAmerican Paper #RR6WH or equal 385 | MER
) ges LEFTBLANK + $17.95 |  $6.910.75 |#8WC15 $18.8¢ $7.272.65/#RREWH §6.08 $2.344.65#085407 $22.00 $8.470.00| PACON #5461/ $1916| $7.388.15|APC RR6WH
23 876-1108 ||Railroad Board, Coral. Approved Brands: Pacon #5491 1 SCHOOL
. Packa ®
American Paper #RRECR. or equal 28 o5 GROUR Vi i BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER SMART
L g LEFT BLANK $20.98 $587.44 | #5630 $21.05 5589.40/ #RR6CR $6.81 $190.68|#085413 NOBID $23 31 $652.68| APC RRECR
24 876-1027 (|Railroad Board, Canary. Approved Brands: Pacon #5457, || Packal GROUP VI ] BEVERIDGE AMERICAN PAPER ;‘A‘II;‘;TL ‘
#RRECN or equal 55 H
Amencan Paper orequa ‘ ges LEFTBIANK | s0.e8 | s1453.00 #8170 s20.05| 115775/ #RRCN 6,91 5374.55|#085404 $22.00|  $1.210.00|PACON #5457 s233¢|  §1.282.05| APC RRECN
1 — T
TOTAL ‘ |
| | st.aaz_zgj $18.281 80 $5.906.28 $16.940.00 | $19,579.28




BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B}

Type or print complete nuue af bidder i this box:

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #011-4J05
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

NOTE: IF BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED. COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGR/BRAND NAME & PRODUGT # WILL NOT REFLECT
APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION. IF MORE THAN ONE APPROVED BRAND

3/8/2009

NUIE
Bid No. 011-JJ05 PLEASE
Title:  ART AND SPECJALTY PAPER Prepared By: Verified By:
Buyer: Gladys Forero-8eltran
MAT ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS CO,
ED . " PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
QUA AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 3 & 4) | (PRIMARY Fozl}fgl‘lg)ﬂ TO 42 AND ( PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24) SCHOOL SPECIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY STANDARD STATIONARY
ITEM| DCPSH# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM NTIT|UNIT]
GROUP ViI: Items 25 and 26 are to be awarded on a total -
Tow bid basis. These items may be mixed in any combinatior|
for minimum order requirements. Vendor must bid both
items in this Group.
25 B76-0862 |[Tag Board shall be White (150 Ib. basis weight minus 5%
tolerance,(S00 @ 24" X 36%) 12* X 18", 100 sheets per package,|
6 packages per case, Appraved Brands: American Paper 330 || Case SCHOOL
Converters #1512WP. Pacon # 5214, Roselle/Roseart #WT-150 | PACON AMERICAN PAPER| SMART
or equal. $23.71|  $7.824.30 | Pacon #5214 $25.61 |  $8.451.30 |#5214 $23.94 $7,800.20 #1512Wp $26.16 | $8.632.80 |#085497 $24.50)  $8085.00|PACON #5214|| $27.89| 58.203.70 |APC #1512WP
26 876.08B71 {[Tag Board shalt be White, same as item #25 except 18° X 24", ~
100 sheets per package, 5 packages per case. Approved PACON AMERICAN PAPER| SCHOOL
Bianis Amafcn P Comurr etONT, pacan sz s suaar
i ) $9.50)  §1.870.00|PKG/CS) $9.18 | $2,014.60 |( {PKCICS) $8.59 $1,888.80|(1PKGICS) $43.60 | $9,502.00 |085498 $8.80)  $1,936.00|1PKICS $46.83] $10,302.66|APC #151BWC
T
TOTAL { $9,694.30 $10,470.80 $9,780.00 $18,224.80 $10,021.00 $19.508.30
[GROUP VIII: Hems 27 through 37 will be awarded onan ‘ T T
|individual line basis, Vendor does not need bid all jtems in |
27 §76-0889 |Tissue Paper shall be 20 assorted colors, 20° X 30, 100 sheels] |
per package, & pack per case. Approved Brands: Pacon | 300 | Case PACON
#5851-8,0r equal. $30.04 $9,102.00| PACON #5851-8|| $32.7% $9.825.00 $30.68 $9,198.00 | PACON #5851-6 $32.70 $9,810.00 |#006180 $32.00 $9,600,00 NO 8D
28 876-0300 |Watercolor Paper, White, acid free, rough surface, 25% rag BIC: ONAFFRE: -
(140 Ib, basis weight minus 5% tolerance, 500 @ 22" x 30%) 19" Packal BRANG PRICE OF) *Canson
X 24", 25 sheets per package _Approved Brands: Canson 550 ges ;L‘;;“.;‘Z““ .| #205451
#70615. or equal. LEFT BLANK $74.95 | $20,611.25 [$3748PKs NO BID $5.52 $5.236.00 | (90#) NO BID NO BID
‘ I REJECTED LUE )
TO E(CESSIVE
J PRCE
29 876-0926 |Brown Kraft Wrapping, in rolls 36" wide X 1000’ fong {50 ib.
basis weight, minus 5% tolerance, 500 @ 24" X 36%). One roll SCHOOL
per carton. Approved Brands: American Paper 220 | Rolls PACON SMART
Converter # 5036BK, Pacon # 5836, or equal. Minimum order: $22.39 $4,923.60 |PACON #5836 $29.95 | $6,589.00 |#5836 $22.50 $4,950.80 |PACON #5836 $26.73 $5.880.60 |#085467 $22.95 $5,049.00 [ PACON #5836 $29.05|  $6,391.00|APC #5036BK
‘ \
30 | 876-0757 |White Newsprint, smooth, 12° X 18" (30 b, basis weight, minus
5% tolerance, (500 @ 24" X 36, 500 sheets per ream, 5 reams |
per case. Approved Brands: American Paper Converlers 850 | Case
#312, Pacon # 3409, Roselie/Roseart # WNP-30-P, or equal. ROSELLE/ROS PACON AMERICAN PAPER| ROSELLE
$18.28)  $10,054.00 [ART #WNP-30-P| $24.50 | $13,475.00 #3402 $18.25| $10,007.50/#312 $18.10 |  §9,955.00 |#0B5597 $18.70|  $10,28500|PACON #3408\ $22 49| $12,369.50|APC #312
3 876-0021 |Matbaard, shali be pebble embossed. 4 ply, white on one side. |
cream on the other side, clear of all waltermarks on both sides,
30" X 40", 25 sheets per pack. completely wrapped, packaged 275 Packa
separately. Approved Brands: Crescent #34.11, or equal. ges
LEFT BLANK 399.05 | $27.486.25 ‘ $77.95 $21,436.28 L ‘NO 8i0 ‘ NO BID NO BID
1
TOTAL ‘ ‘ T
\ ’7 $24,079.60 I $77.986.50 ’ i $45,621.75 | $30.88160 | L $24,934.00 $18.760 50




[BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)

[Type or print complete pame of hidder In this hox:

The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #011-JJ05
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

NOTE: IF BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED, COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGR/BRAND NAME & PRODUCT # WILL NOT REFLECT
APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION, IF MORE THAN ONE APPRQOVED BRAND

31972008

= NI E:
Bid No. 011-JJ05 PLEASE
Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER lPrepared By: Verified By:
Buyer. Gladys Forero-Beitran
MAT
ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS CO.
ED PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
QUA AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 3 & 4} | (PRIMARY FOQI;E}‘;I:).’?Z TO 42 AND (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24) SCHOOL SPECIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY STANDARD STATIONARY
ITEM|| DCPSH# DESCRIPTION OF ITEM NTIT ||UNIT]
(GROUP IX: Items 32 through 42 are to be awarded on a tota) [ I
low bid basis. Vendor must bid all items in this Group. ‘
U S
Paper shall be White newsprint, { 30 ib. basis welght minus 5% H H
tolerance ( 500 @ 24'x 36" ) Sixe: 8 X 10-1/2". Fackaged 500 A B e TEMS 2 v GROUPS
sheets per ream, 10 reams per case , TO D CoTﬁPdleAN‘; WAS NON- a AmmEODRDZgL::EQISI:g%N?r\SJE o
ARSI PSP Aot SO —
32 875-0705 |[Paper, Manuscript, First Grade, Grovelon Ruled, ruled both M4 (
sides iong way, 1" between major green lines, subdivided inta !
thrae equat divisions by two pink, light guide fines. Top margin 110 || case ROSELLE #RWN
1*, start ruling with two pink, light guide iines. Approved Brandsy . 815 SPEC {MIN. ORDER 50
American Paper # ARN1045, or equal. I s16.98|  $1867.80(EQUAL) $20.86 | $3.284.60 $26.72|  $2,038.20|CASES) NO BID $28.13|  $3.094.30)
33 || 876-0713 ||Paper, Manuscript, Second Grade, Groveton Ruled, ruled both T
sides long way, 3/4” between major green lines, subdivided into .
three equal divisions by two pink, light guide lines. Top with two |
pink, light guide lines. Top margin 1%, start ruling with two pink, || 99 || Case i ROSELLE #RVWN
light guide lines. Approved Brands: American Paper # ! 8541 SPEC (MIN. ORDER 55
ARN1026. or equal. J_$19.10]  $1.05050 [(EQUAL) $29.44 |  $1,619.20 $26.50]  $1,457.50|CASES) NO BiD No BID $27.73| $1525.15
34 || 876-0721 ||Paper, Manuscript, First Grade, Zaner Bloser Ruled. ruled both M
sides long way 1" between major blue lines, subdivided into two !
equal 1/2" divisions by a blue, light guide line; top margin ¥* 28 ||case ROSELL
|Approved Brands: American Papey # 71-B. or equal. . #RWNZB1
. ! $16.98 $475.44 [(EQUAL) $23.72 $664.16 $21.50 $802.00 NO BID NO BiD $22.34 $625.52
35 i B76-0730 ||Paper, Manuscript, Second Grade, Zaner Bloser Ruled. ruled H
both sides long way. 3/4” between major bive lines, subdivided .
into two equal 3/8" divisions by a blue, light guide line; top margin|| 28 || Case | ROSELLE
1*, Approved Brands ; American Paper # 72-9. or equal. i #RWNZB2Z
» $16.98 $475.44 [{(EQUAL) 323.72 $664.16 $21.50 $602.00 NO BID NOBID $22.34 3$625.52
36 || 876-0051 ||Paper, Manuschpt. Kindergarten, Zaner Bloser Ruled. 1-3/4" ! I
ruling on both sides; 7/8" midline, red baseline, 7/8" descender 55 || casel ROSELLE
space. Approved Brands: American Paper # 1-A. or equal. H #RWNZBOO
) 3’6.98\ $933.90 (EQUALY $23.92 $1.315.60 $21.80 $1,108.00 NO BID NG BID $22.54|  $1.239.70
37 876-0969 |Paper. Manuscript, First Grade, Zaner Bloser Ruled, 7/8" rulings i
on both sides: 7/16" midline, red basetine, 7/ 6™ descender 185 || ¢ H ROSELLE
space. Approved Brands: American Paper # GR1R+B, or ase | #RWNZB1
equal + $16.98 $2,801.70|(EQUAL) $23.92 $3.046.80 $21.80 $3,597.00 NO BID NO BID $22.54|  $3.719.10
38 876-0877 |Paper, Manuserip!, Second Grade, Zaner Bloser ruled, 3/4” !
ruling on both sides; 3/8" midline. red baseline, 3/8” descender o e 1 ROSELLE
space. Approved Brands; American Paper # GR2R+B, or ase, #RWNZB2
equal. | | 31698  $1.867.80|(EQUAL) §23.92 | $2.631.20 $21.80 $2.388.00 NO BID NO BID $22.54| $2.479.40




The School Board of Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #011-JJ05
ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER

3/8/2009

|[BID PROPOSAL FORM (FORMAT B)
|[Type oF pront complel tatne of bldder In thds hov: NOTE: i BIDDING ON THE ONLY APPROVED BRAND PROVIDED, COLUMN
DESIGNATED MFGR/BRAND NAME & PRODUGT # WILL NOT REFLECT
APPROVED BRAND INFORMATION IF MORE THAN ONE APPROVED BRAND
nute!
Bid No. 011-JJ05 PLEASE
—
Title:  ART AND SPECIALTY PAPER Prepared By Verified By
Buyer.  Gladys Farerg-Beltran
- [maT
ED ART & EDUCAT. MATERIALS CO. PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
QUA AFP IND. (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 3 & 4} | (PRIMARY FOEI;EN‘:;?Z TO 42 AND (PRIMARY FOR ITEMS 17 TO 24) SCHOOU $PEGIALTY SMITH OFFICE & COMPUTER SUPPLY STANDARD STATIONARY
ITEM|| DCPSH DESCRIPTION OF ITEM INTIT|UNIT]
k1 876-0985 ||Paper, Maauscript, Third Grade, Zaner Bioser Ruled. 1/2* rulings| H ROSELLE —] T
on both sides; 1/4" midtine, red basating, 1/4” descender space. || 110 || Case] #RWNZB3
Approved Brands: Amencan Paper # GRIR +B. or equal. ! $16.98 $1.867.80|(EQUAL) §23.92 ‘ $2,631.20 $21.80 $2,358 00 NO 81D NO BID $22.54| $2.478.40
40 878-0893 | Paper, Manuscrpt, Fourth Grade, Zaner Bloser ruled, 3/8 niling ‘_
an both sides; 3/16" midline, red baseline, 3/16* descender 55 | casel ROSELLE
space. Approved Brands: American Paper # GR4R+8, or « #RWNZB4 (MIN. ORDER 50
equal. | sts.08 $933.90 | (EQUAL) $23.92 $1.315.60 $23.35 §1,284.25/CASES) NO BIO NO BID $22.54]  $1,239.70
41 876-0896 [Paper, Transition, Third Grade, Zaner Bloser Ruled, ruled both i
sides; long way. one side 1/2° between biue lings, the sther side .
1/2" between major biue lines, subdivided into two equal pants by|| 28 || Gase ! ROSELLE |
2 bluc?, light guide line, tap margin 1*. Approved Brands: i #RWNES11SPEC | (MIN. ORDER 28 \
American Paper # ARN1045, or equal + §19.10 _ $534.80 (FQUAL) $26.68 | 574704 | $23.95 $670.60/ CASES) [no si0 |NO BID §25.14)  $703.82
42 || 876-0748 ||Paper, Picture Story, top half biank, bottom half ruled 7/8" x I ‘ |
7/16* allernate broken, reverse side niled complate 7/8" x 71167 M ROSELLE | |
\ altemate broken  Approved Brands: American Paper # 440 CBSE! SRWNQ1276678 (MIN. ORDER 50
RWNB, or equal. | s2188|  $9,627.20/7PS (EQUAL) | 2630 | $11572.00 523‘15‘ $10.186.00| CASES) NOBID NOBID $23.84) $10,489.60
T T
TOTAL | | sezm28| | 53039156 | 92733355 NQ 81D | NO BID f $28,221.3
\ ! 1
IGROUP X: items 43 through 45 are to be awarded on a tota T
low bid basis. Vendor must bid all items in this Group. |
! Paper shall be Grade D tablet paper, size 8° X 10-1/2". (16 b , T
basis weight mints 5% tolerance. (500 @ 17" X 227) packaged QUALIFIED GRCUP X DUE TO MINIMUM
500 sheets peryeam, 10 reams per case, REQUIREMENTS
43 |[ 976-0763 |[Paper, P Tined 5/16". Approved Brands: American I ROSELE
Paper #ARS0808, ar equal, 165 || Case #915516 {MIN. ORDER &0
! $23.32| _ §3,647.80 {EQUAL) $31.00 | 35,115.00 $26.66|  34,728.90/CASES) NO BID ‘NO BID $29.23] $4,822.95
44 || 876-0772 ||Paper, Penmanship, lined 3/8" Approved Brands: American ‘ ROSELLE r
Paper # 700, or equat. 165 || Case H#RWCE1638
- ! $23.32 $1.847 80 ‘ (EQUAL) $25 50 $4,207.50 $20.20 $3,333.00 NO BID NO BiD $24.04| $3,365.60
45 || 876-0761 ||Paper, Penmanship, lined 1/2°. Approved Brands : Amencan | RUSELLE 1 ( |
Paper # 150, or equal. 165 || Casej #RWEBISS (MiN. ORDER 168
| s23.32]  sa,847.0|(QUAL) $29.44 | $4,857.60 $26.40 $4,356.00| CASES) NO BID NO BID J $27.73]  $4,57545
I [} I
TOTAL . ___L__s‘ﬂ_,_sfs_mJ_.__.____ ‘ $14.180.10 $12.417.80 NO BID _ leo 8ID H $13,365.00 J\

NOTE: PLEASE DO NOT SEND SAMPLES OR TECHNICAL

SPECIFICATIONS UNLESS REQUESTED BY BUYER IN
WRITING UNDER A SEPARATE COVER.






