
Date: 05/25/04

Prepared by: R. Tyndall

The School Board of Miami-Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #063-DD02M/WBE

CUSTODIAL FLOOR MACHINES Verified by: R. Tyndall

Item #/Description:

Bidder's Name Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr.

Relible Custodial 
Maintenance & Supply 125 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 6 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 10 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Rex Chemical Corporation 125 $1,621.00 $202,625.00
Advance Matador AP20 
#56172600 - As Spec. 6 $3,189.00 $19,134.00

Advance Terra 132B (New 
model name & number for 
Advance SW850 as 
specified) 10 $497.00 $4,970.00

Advance Select Sweep - 
As Spec.

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 1 125 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 6 $2,739.00 $16,434.00

Advance Terra 128B - 
Sweeping path width 
does not meet 
specifications 10 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 2 125 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 6 $3,400.00 $20,400.00 Clarke SPS28B #795422 10 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Total Connection, Inc. 125 $1,828.00 $228,500.00
Advance Matador AP20 - As 
Spec. 6 $3,603.00 $21,618.00 Advance as specified 10 $606.00 $0.00 Advance as specified

Total Connection, Inc - 
Alternate 1 125 $1,828.00 $228,500.00

Advance Matador AP20 - As 
Spec. 6 $3,527.00 $21,162.00

#795422 SP28B Space 
Sweeper 10 $655.00 $6,550.00

Kent #56-100-874, Select 
Sweeper

 = LOW BID MEETING SPECIFICATIONS

Item 2:  Sweeper, Light Duty                            
Unit = Each

Item 1:  Scrubbing and Polishing Machine                  
Unit = Each 

Item 3: Sweeper, Automatic                          
Unit = Each 
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The School Board of Miami-Miami-Dade County, Florida
Bid #063-DD02M/WBE

CUSTODIAL FLOOR MACHINES Verified by: R. Tyndall

Item #/Description:

Bidder's Name

Relible Custodial 
Maintenance & Supply

Rex Chemical Corporation

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 1

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 2

Total Connection, Inc. 

Total Connection, Inc - 
Alternate 1

Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr. Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr.

35 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 20 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

35 $3,310.00 $115,850.00 Advance BA5321 - As Spec. 20 $1,320.00 $26,400.00
Advance Aquaclean 
Classic - As Spec. 5 $6,200.00 $31,000.00

Advance Convertamax 28 ST -
As Spec. 

35 $3,225.00 $112,875.00 Clarke Encore S20 20 $1,365.00 $27,300.00
Clarke #04110B Image 16i 
Self Contained Extractor 5 $5,285.00 $26,425.00

Clarke Encore L-30 - Does 
not meet specifications 
solution tank is only 20 
gallons instead of 24.

35 $0.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

35 $3,716.00 $130,060.00 Advance as specified 20 $1,499.00 $29,980.00 Advance as specified 5 $6,549.00 $32,745.00
Advance Convertamax 28 - As 
Spec. 

35 $3,043.00 $106,505.00

Encore S20" with pad driver & 
51447D Polypropele Brush - 
Does meet specifications 
per MT&E Report #8853 20 $1,400.00 $28,000.00

Clarke #04110B Image 16i 
Self Contained Extractor 5 $4,970.00 $24,850.00

Clarke Encore L-30 - Does 
not meet specifications 
solution tank is only 20 
gallons instead of 24.

Item 6:  Scrubber, Industrial                               
Unit = Each 

Item 4: Scrubber, Floor                                  
Unit = Each 

Item 5: Carpet Extractor, Self-contained-               
Unit = Each
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Item #/Description:

Bidder's Name

Relible Custodial 
Maintenance & Supply

Rex Chemical Corporation

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 1

Rex Chemical Corporation - 
Alternate 2

Total Connection, Inc. 

Total Connection, Inc - 
Alternate 1

Qty. Price Total Brand & nbr.

25 $692.30 $17,307.50

Pullman-Holt B320E-
Does not meet 
specifications- 
motor is only 1 HP 
vs specifications 
require 1.75 HP

25 $715.00 $17,875.00

Advance Pacesetter 
200 HD #56107003 - 
Meets 
Specifications per 
MT& E Report 
#8853

25 $695.00 $17,375.00

Clarke C2K-2000 - 
Does not meet 
specifications - unit 
is 1.5 HP, 
specifications 
require 1.75 HP

25 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

25 $931.00 $23,275.00 No Brand Specified

25 $773.00 $19,325.00 01201x-C2K2000

Item 7: Floor Machine, General Purpose                 
Unit = Each
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